
Porterville Unified School District Bid Solicitation 2021-2022 Solicitation is for Non Commodity Pricing Only

SUPPLIES 1

Supplies Bid# SN-22-04
Vendor Name: GOLD STAR FOODS Vendor Name: P&R Paper Supply Company, Inc. Vendor Name: PCI Vendor Name: Sysco Vendor Name: Unipak Corp.

Description

*Estimated 
Usage Grain

M/
MA Bulk IW

Acceptabl
e Brands Brand Pack SizePrice Per Serving Case Price Vendor ID# Pack Size Price Per Serving Case Price Brand Vendor ID# Pack Size Case Price Brand Vendor ID# Pack Size Price Per Serving Case Price Brand Vendor ID# Pack Size Price Per Serving

1
APRONS, DISPOSABLE

5 X
GOLDMAX INDUSTRIES 1000CT $0.05 $53.86 LIG-2442 1000/CS $0.03 $34.95 SYS CLS 303764613 5 #VALUE! 36.44

2
APRONS, BIB, CLOTH

25 X
NO BID WIN-BA-3226BK 1/EA $6.50 $6.50 SYSCO BIAWH-6PS 1 /6 CT 5.79 34.76

3
BAG, FOIL PLAIN, SANDWICH

10 X
BROWN PAPER GOODS 1000CT $0.03 $33.60 PPC-300533 1000/CS $0.03 $30.90 MCNAIRN 321601 1000 /EA #VALUE! 72.13

4
BAG, FRENCH FRY

10 X
CALIFORNIA PAPER BAG CO 2000CT $0.01 $15.18 CLB-6SB 2000/CS $0.01 $13.10 MCNAIRN 320272 1 /2000CT #VALUE! 38.94

5
BAG, HOT DOG, PLAIN WHITE

10 X
CALIFORNIA PAPER BAG CO 2000CT $0.01 $23.58 PPC-450009 2000/CS $0.01 $13.05 MCNAIRN 321351 1 /1000CT #VALUE! 100.53

6
BAG, HOT DOG, FOIL

10 X
BAGCRAFT 1000CT $0.05 $46.07 PPC-300456 1000/CS $0.03 $30.95 MCNAIRN 321164 2 /1000CT 0.01 31.81

7
BAG, LUNCH SACK

10 X
NO BID AJM-6LB 500/BD $0.03 $12.90 ERTHPLS 17807SYS 1 /500 CT 0.02 10.94

8
BAG, SANDWICH

10 X
HANDGARDS 2000CT $0.02 $36.48 CLB-19SB 2000/CS $0.01 $18.95 MCNAIRN 320245 2000 /#19 #VALUE! 43.4

9
BAR TOWELS

10 X
NO BID PEM-T58220 150/CS $0.32 $47.50 SYSCO BMR-24PS 24 /16X19 #VALUE! 31.21

10
BEARD COVERS

10 X
NO BID CEL-BP-400R 1000/CS $0.04 $36.95 HANGARD 305113550 10 /100CT 0.02 28.67

11
BOWL, FOAM 22 OUNCE

10 X Pactive
NO BID MBL-TH1-0022 500/CS $0.07 $33.35 PACTIV 0TH100220000 6 /84 CT #VALUE! 40.53

12
BOWL, FOAM 22 OUNCE, LID

10 X PactivE
NO BID SPK-CDL06S 504/CS $0.08 $39.00 PACTIV YCI800120000 6 /84CT #VALUE! 49.26must be compatible with line 11

13
BOX, PIZZA

10 X
NO BID WIN-16PIZWH 50/BD $0.48 $24.10 AREZCLS SYAZ2BK-16W1 50 /16X16 #VALUE! 20.99

14
BUN RACK COVER

10 X
NO BID USP-BPC5280 50/CS $0.25 $12.50 SYS CLS 303679973 50 /52X80" #VALUE! 11.01

15
CONTAINER, FOAM

10 X Dart 
NO BID DRT-4J6 1000/CS $0.03 $30.40 DART 4J6 1000 /4OZ #VALUE! 23.764 oz

16
CONTAINER, FOAM, LID

10 X Dart 
NO BID DRT-6JL 1000/CS $0.02 $18.65 DART 6JL 10 /100CT #VALUE! 13.874 oz, must be compatible with line 15

17
CONTAINER, PLASTIC

10 X
NO BID DLK-HP400 2500/CS $0.01 $33.75 SYS REL YS300SYSA 15 /200 CT #VALUE! 89.273.25 oz

18
CONTAINER, PLASTIC, LID

10 X
NO BID DLK-HPLID345 2500/CS $0.01 $30.85 SYS IMP YLS3FRSYS 20 /120CT #VALUE! 45.213.25 oz, must be compatible with line 17

19
CONTAINER, PLASTIC

10 X
NO BID DLK-HP550 2500/CS $0.02 $43.05 SYS REL YS550SYSA 8 /250 CT #VALUE! 82.75.5 oz

20
CONTAINER, PLASTIC, LID

10 X
NO BID DLK-HPLID345 2500/CS $0.01 $30.85 SYS IMP YLS5FRSYS 25 /100 CT #VALUE! 43.175.5 oz must be compatible with line 19

21
CONTAINER, FOAM

10 X Dart 4J6
NO BID DRT-12SJ20 1000/CS $0.03 $30.95 SYSCO SY12SJ20 500 /12OZ #VALUE! 24.6912 oz

22
CONTAINER, FOAM, LID

10 X Dart 4J6
NO BID DRT-20JL 1000/CS $0.03 $30.06 DART 20JL 10 /100CT #VALUE! 23.9312 oz, must be compatible with line 26

23
CONTAINER, FOAM, HINGED

10 X
NO BID RPP-71433 200/CS $0.09 $17.45 SYSTRNZ YHLB09S1ADEC 150 /9X9X3 #VALUE! 22.541 compartment

24
CONTAINER, FOAM, HINGED

10 X
NO BID RPP-71594 200/CS $0.09 $17.45 SYSTRNZ YHLB09S3ADEC 1 /150 CT #VALUE! 27.933 compartment

25
CONTAINER, HINGED, SALAD, LARGE

10 X
NO BID PCA-YCI8-1110 200/CS $0.21 $42.85 SYS CLS YCI82S200000 2 /100CT #VALUE! 50.34

26
CONTAINER, HINGED, CLEAR

10 X Genpak 
NO BID GPK-AD12 200/CS $0.13 $26.50 GENPAK 200 /12 OZ #VALUE! 42.62

27
CONTAINER, HINGED, CLEAR

10 X Genpak 
NO BID GPK-AD08 200/CS $0.12 $24.50 GENPAK AD08 200 /8 OZ #VALUE! 40.81

28
CONTAINER, LARGE SALAD, PLATTER

10 X Polar Pak 
NO BID PAR-21611 250/CS $0.22 $53.95 / #VALUE! NO BID

29
CONTAINER, LARGE SALAD, PLATTER, LID

10 X Polar Pak 
NO BID PAR-21611 250/CS $0.22 $53.95 / #VALUE! NO BID

30
CUP, HOT, PAPER

10 X
NO BID IMV-12PCW 1000/CS $0.04 $39.50 SYS CLS 63522 15 /42 CT #VALUE! 94.3512 oz

31
CUP, WATER, PAPER

10 X
NO BID GPK-W450F 2500/CS $0.02 $42.50 SOLO 450-2050 50 /100 CT #VALUE! NO BID3.5 oz

32
CUP, PLASTIC, CLEAR

10 X
NO BID EES-PTC14 100/CS $0.36 $36.25 SYS IMP YP1412CSYS 10 /70 CT #VALUE! 48.3712/16 oz

33
FOIL, HEAVY DUTY

10 X
DURABLE PACKAGING 1RL $86.50 $86.50 COB-51808-VB 1/RL $21.95 $21.95 SYS CLS W69328 1 /18 IN #VALUE! 45.5718x1000

34
FOIL, SHEETS

10 X HFA 
REYNOLDS PACKAGING 6/500CT $0.03 $91.24 HFA-JIF-8960 3000/CS $0.02 $55.95 HFA 51210 6 /500 CT #VALUE! 86.1512x10.75

35
FORK, MEDIUM, WHITE, PLASTIC

10 X
LOLLICUP USA INC. 10/100CT $0.01 $8.54 NTR-3640 1000/CS $0.01 $6.25 SYS CLS YMWFWSYS 1 /1000CT #VALUE! 36.19

36
FORK, HEAVY, EBONY, PLASTIC

10 X
NO BID GOL-20651 1000/CS $0.02 $15.60 SYS CLS YMWFESYS 1 /1000CT #VALUE! 35.76

37
GLOVE, NITRILE, POT AND PAN

100 X
NO BID ANS-37185-7 2/PR $4.45 $8.90 HANGARD 303400403 12 /12 IN #VALUE! 18.35

38
GLOVES, VINYL, POWDER FREE, EXTRA LARGE

100 X
GOLDMAX INDUSTRIES 1000CT $0.06 $55.34 NET-01254 2000/CS $0.02 $43.50 SYS CLS 304362814 10 /100 CT #VALUE! 83.56 UPC GENERIC VPF-XL 1000 0.0335

39
GLOVES, VINYL, POWDER FREE, LARGE

100 X
GOLDMAX INDUSTRIES 1000CT $0.06 $55.34 NET-01253 2000/CS $0.02 $43.50 SYS CLS 304362813 10 /100 CT #VALUE! 83.56 UPC GENERIC VPF-L 1000 0.0335

40
GLOVES, VINYL, POWDER FREE, MEDIUM

100 X
GOLDMAX INDUSTRIES 1000CT $0.06 $55.34 NET-01252 2000/CS $0.02 $43.50 SYS CLS 304362812 10 /100 CT #VALUE! 83.56 UPC GENERIC VPF-M 1000 0.0335



Porterville Unified School District Bid Solicitation 2021-2022 Solicitation is for Non Commodity Pricing Only

SUPPLIES 2

41
GLOVES, VINYL, POWDER FREE, SMALL

100 X
HANDGARDS 4/100CT $0.14 $57.14 NET-01251 2000/CS $0.02 $43.50 SYS CLS 304362811 10 /100 CT #VALUE! 83.56 UPC GENERIC VPF-S 1000 0.0335

42
HAIRNETS

10 X
GOLDMAX INDUSTRIES 144CT $0.09 $12.40 CEL-HN400BK 1440/CASE $0.06 $84.55 SYS CLS 305113001 10 /144CT #VALUE! 125.57

43
MASK, FACE, DISPOSABLE

100 X
NO BID GWE-MASK-50 50/BX $0.11 $5.55 SYS CLS 305113003 10 /144CT 0.08 124.25 UPC FMA 2000 0.03

44
NAPKIN, BEVERAGE

10 X
NO BID PAT-1123000-0500 3000/CS $0.01 $23.60 PACKER CON/7126692 1 /50 CT #VALUE! 28.952 PLY

45
NAPKIN, LOW FOLD, DISPENSER

10 X
NO BID NAT-01255 8000/CS $0.00 $26.50 TORKADV DX600 12 /500CT 0.005 35.45

46
NAPKIN, TALL FOLD

10 X
NO BID TET-HS713. 10000/CS $0.00 $24.25 TORKADV DX900 12 /500 CT 0.008 51.33

47
PAN, FOIL, FULL PAN

10 X
NO BID COB-VBFDSP 50/CS $0.70 $35.00 SYS CLS Y6050XHSYS 40 /FULL #VALUE! 38.29

48
PAN, FOIL< HALF PAN

10 X
NO BID COB-VBHSDP 100/CS $0.23 $23.45 SYS CLS Y6132XHSYS 100 /HALF #VALUE! 48.7

49
PAN LINERS

100 X
NO BID PAT-2405161-0000 1000/CS $0.03 $27.40 SYSCO 019010SYS 1 /1000CT #VALUE! 55.53

50
PAPER PLACEMATS

200 X
NO BID HOF-PM32052 1000/CS $0.02 $19.00 SYS CLS 355204 1000 /10X14 #VALUE! 17.5

51
PLATE, FOAM

10 X
NO BID RPP-71631 500/CS $0.04 $17.50 SYSCO 355200 1000 /10X14" #VALUE! 17.499 Inch

52
PVC, ROLL

10 X
NO BID ANC-307007 1/RL $23.50 $23.50 SYS CLS 9065 1 /18IN #VALUE! 37.633000 Feet

53
PVC, SHEETS

10 X
NO BID ANC-E151010 1/RL $12.25 $12.25 REYNOLD 926 1 /1900CT #VALUE! 24.6810X10

54
PVC, SHEETS

10 X
NO BID ANC-E151212 1/RL $15.80 $15.80 REYNOLD 926 1 /1900CT #VALUE! 24.6812X12

55
PVC, SHEETS

10 X
NO BID ANC-E151414 1/RL $14.70 $14.70 REYNOLD 937S 1 /1200CT #VALUE! 24.5514X14

56
SPOONS, MEDIUM, WHITE

10 X
LOLLICUP USA INC. 10/100CT $0.01 $8.74 NTR-3642 1000/CS $0.01 $6.25 SYS CLS YMWSSWSYS 1 /1000CT #VALUE! 35.81

57
SPOONS, HEAVY, EBONY

10 X
NO BID GOL-20661 1000/CS $0.02 $15.60 SYS CLS YMWSWSYS 1 /1000CT #VALUE! 25.01

58
SPORKS KIT, MEDIUM

2500 X
DOWELL 1000 CT $0.02 $16.25 PRP-414021 1000/CS $0.01 $11.95 DAXWELL A10000961 1 /1000CT #VALUE! 15.99

59
THERMOMETER, PROBE

10 X
NO BID DMW-F2449PKT 1000/CS $0.02 $20.50 SYSCO DT300-S-1 1 /EACH #VALUE! 12.77with adjustable knot

60
THERMOMETER, REFRIGERATOR

10 X
NO BID WIN-TMT-RF2 1/EA $4.25 $4.25 SYSCO DFP450W-S-1 1 /EACH #VALUE! 22.48

61
THERMOMETER, WIPES

10 X
NO BID CPA-9150-0-8 200/BOX $0.05 $10.95 COOPER 9150-0-8 1 /200 CT #VALUE! 12.41

62
THERMOMETER, DIGITAL PROBE

10 X
NO BID WIN-TMT-DG4 1/EA $12.50 $12.50 SYSCO DFP450W-S-1 1 /EACH #VALUE! 22.48

63
THERMOMETER, OVEN

10 X
NO BID WIN-TMT-OV2 1/EA $4.00 $4.00 SYSCO 24HP-01S-1 1 /EACH #VALUE! 6.31

64
TRAY, STYROFOAM

10 X
NO BID RPP-71440 500/CS $0.05 $22.90 PACTIV YTHB0500SGBX 4 /125CT #VALUE! 25.475 compartment

65
TRAY, FOIL, WITH LID

10 X HFA 
NO BID HFA-2045-35-250WL 250/CS $0.25 $63.50 SYS CLS Y7139TPSYS 200 /EA #VALUE! 94.053 compartment

66
TRAY, PAPER, CARRYOUT SNAP

10 X
NO BID SOU-0122 500/CS $0.06 $28.50 BONITA 500 /8 5/8 #VALUE! 37.34

67
TRAY, PLASTIC, 2 COMPARTMENT, BLACK

250 X Oliver 
NO BID No Quote - - - OLIVER 61798 560 /EA #VALUE! NO BIDheat resistance up to 500deg

68
TRAY, PLASTIC, 3 COMPARTMENT, BLACK

500 X Oliver 
NO BID No Quote - - - OLIVER 61230 560 /8.625" #VALUE! NO BIDheat resistance up to 500deg

69
FILM< LAYOVER, PLASTIC

250 Oliver 
NO BID No Quote - - - PCI.5 MIL 8.75" W PET FILM TYPE 5GAC 3" ID X 370 LF/RL = 1.5LBS/RL250RLS/SKID $3,867.50 OLIVER 70305 1 /ROLL #VALUE! NO BID8.75" 370' 500CLF

*estimated usage= annual projected usage subject to change without notice


