FIS Outdoor Helena Agri Nutrien Solutions Red River Specialties Target Specialty Products
REQUESTED
ITEM # DESCRIPTION MEASURE PRICE notes MEASUREMENT PRICE Notes MEASUREMENT PRICE Notes MEASUREMENT PRICE Note MEASUREMENT PRICE Notes
2-4-D DIMETHYLAMINE / Per Gl. 2-4-D
DIMETHYLAMINE salt of 2-4-D, 4-pound
acid equivalent, bid price per gallon in 2.5 12.75/
, .75/gal $11.20/g 12.04/ga .
1 i ing i 2.5 GAL 34.83 2.5 GAL Weeder 64 2.5 GAL Plat 2.5 GAL 2.5 GAL No Bid
gI_. containers. Must be capable of using in 31.875 /2.5 gal eeder $28.00/2.5 gal atoon 30.10 per 2.5g 0 bi
winds of 10mph or less. For Aquatic use.
REWARD / Bid price per gallon / 1 gallon
or 2.5 gal containers. 1 GAL 58 1 GAL 95.00 Reward 1 GAL $88.20 1 GAL $42.15 Diquant SPC 2L 1 GAL 45.00
Generic Diquat Reward
2
2.5 GAL 134 2.5 GAL 40.75/gal Tribune 2.5 GAL 41.80/ 2.5 GAL $105.38 container 2.5 GAL 111.39
' ' 101.88/2.5¢ ' ) ‘ ' ' '
Generic Diquat Tribune
ARSENAL / Per Gallon / 2.5 gallon
i 50./gal
3  |containers. 2.5 GAL 138.92 2.5 GAL 125/5; . Polaris 2.5 GAL 52.10/g 2.5 GAL $135.05 container 2.5 GAL 393.16
Gen. Ecomazapyr 2 SL
RODEO / Per Gl. RODEO or equivalent
53.8% Glyphosate, N—(Phosphonomethyl)
4  |Glycine, in the form of its Isopropylamine 2.5 GAL 59.85 2.5 GAL A Roundup 2.5 GAL 18.007g Imitator 2.5 GAL 21.11/ga container 2.5 GAL 50.65
salt. Bid price per 2.5 gal. containers. 47.75/2.5 ga Custom 45/2.5 ga 52.75/2.5ga
Generic Rodeo
SONAR SRP AQUATIC HERBICIDE / Per _
5 Pound LB LB 1,411/pail LB 35.28/# LB $35.28 LB 35.28
Cannot get Sonar SRP Agency
SONAR QUICK RELEASE ACQUATIC _
6 HERBICIDE / Per pound LB 48.57 LB 1,400./per pail LB 35.00/# LB $35.00 LB 35.00
Sonar Q Agency
KAMMO / Per Gallon (NO 28.50 /gal
7  |SUBSTITUTES) 2.5 gallon containers 2.5 GAL 2.5 GAL Bageot _f,a | KammoPlus 2.5 GAL 2.5 GAL No Bid 2.5 GAL No Bid
Helena Prod. Cant bid ' =l
ROUNDUP or equivalent of 41% 13./gal 12.90/ 32.25/ R b
8  |Glyphosate./ Bid price per gallon / 2.5 gal. 2.5 GAL 35 2.5 GAL /82 2.5 GAL IU88 242 R anger Pro 2.5 GAL $34.95 anger Fro 2.5 GAL 36.72
containers 32.50/ 2.5 ga 2.5ga container
Glyphosate 41% Ranger Pro Ranger
F-239 CLEANER / Per Gallon _ .
(55 gallon containers) 1 GAL 29 Generic Tank Cleaner 1GAL No Bid 1GAL 13.10/g 1 GAL $14.76 1 GAL No Bid
9
14. I 11.90 654.50
55 GAL 1495 55 GAL /&2 55 GAL /g3 . 55 GAL $770.00 55 GAL No Bid
Generic Tank Cleaner 770/55ga F239 Cleaner /55dr
AQUATHOL SUPER-K GRANULES / Per
10 Pound LB 23.45 LB LB 19.30/1b LB $31.25 LB No Bid
Aguathol Super K
AQUATHOL K/ Bid price per gallon /2.5
llon containers 74.75/g . 181.67 /2.5 ga
11 |92 2.5 GAL 219. 2.5 GAL 2.5 GAL 2.5 GAL 253, 2.5 GAL
5G 9.88 5G 5G 186.875/2.5 ga 5G $253.93 container 5G 72.668/ga
Aquathol K
AQUATHOL SUPER-K / Bid price per 30 74.75/g
12 30 GAL 2638 30 GAL No Bid 30 GAL i 30 GAL No Bid 30 GAL No Bid
gallon drum o BI 2242.50/30g o Bi o BI
ACCURACY / Per quart (NO
13  [SUBSTITUTES) QT QT 12.25 QT QT No Bid QT No Bid
Helena Prod Cant Bid Accuracy
HABITATE / Bid price per gallon. 2.5
14  |gallon containers 2.5 GAL 2.5 GAL >0- /gal 2.5 GAL 49.10/¢ Polaris 2.5 GAL $291.95 container 2.5 GAL 303.97
125/2.5 ga 122.75/2.5g
Cannot Purchase Polaris 121.588 gallon
15 gﬁiﬁignfalmiipme per galon. 25 2.5 GAL 42.78/g3 2.5 GAL 49.72/gal 2.5 GAL 44.90/g Element 3 2.5 GAL 40/ga container 2.5 GAL 155.00
106.5/2.5g 124.30/2.5 ga Garlon 3 100/2.5 ga 62.00 gal
MONUMENT / Bid price per packet
16 P perp PKT 304.87 PKT 250.00 PKT $10.00/Box agency PKT No Bid PKT 250.00
5x5 Gram Monument 5 x 5 gram packet
SPREADER STICKER / Bid price per
17 gallon GAL 14 GAL 14.50 GAL 11.40/g Brewer 90/10 GAL $8.76 GAL 12532.00
Inlet TF-Halo 80




FERTILIZER 18-0-10 WITH 1.15
19 EE&L‘L'ZER 10 -20 - 20/Bid price per LB 20.73 LB No Bid LB NB LB No Bid LB No Bid
20 EEuRan'L'ZER 21-0-0/1Bid price per LB 14 LB No Bid LB $0.24/1b LB No Bid LB 0.22
FERTILIZER 15-2—-15 with Ronstar / Bid
21 price per pound LB 34.38 15-2-15 w Oxadiazon LB No Bid LB NB LB No Bid LB 0.58
(Generic Ronstar)
ORTHENE Bid price per pound
22 LB 9.38 46.90 for 5 |b LB 9.50 LB 15.10/Ib LB $6.00 LB 7.25 504907 Acuphare 10
Accephate Acephate 97UP # Bag
TRIMEC CLASSIC / Bid price per gallon ;
23 GAL 38.1 GAL 42.00 GAL $43.26/g Triplet Lo Odor GAL $33.56 Triplet SF GAL 42.588
Trimec Classic 2.5g gallon
TRIBUTE TOTAL / Bid price per oz. 60/0z
24 oz Bayer Prod we cant oz 1 B s oz $60.00 oz No Bid oz 60.00
get / 6 oz bot Tribute Total Agency Agency
TAL STAR / Bid price per pound ) )
25 LB 0.73  |Bifenthrin Granular LB 0.54 Upstart Gold 25 LB s122/lp | ostarExtra LB $0.65 LB 0.26
$18.20 per 25 Ib # bag Verge
CLIPPER (active ingredient flumioxazin)
26 price in 5 Ib. containers. (NO LB LB 45.00 LB 42.00/# LB $41.45 LB No Bid
SUBSTITUTES) Cannot Purchase Clipper
TRACKER DYE (BLUE) 16-OUNCE
PINT) BOTTLES . RRSI IVM Marking
27 |(PINT) PT 60 PT No Bid PT 12.00/qt  |Aquamark S PT $7.14 oye Quart PT 694  |1F pacific Blue
Colorant Super Blue High13.88 Quart
BIFENTHRIN INSECTICIDE (LIQUID)
28 GALLON JUG GAL 36.59 GAL 35.56 Talak GAL $39.90/g Bisect GAL $45.16 GAL 36.62
RESOLUTE OR EQUIVALENT- 9.571b 47.85/ .
29 GRANULAR 5LB JUG 5 GAL 49.99 Prodiamine Generic 5 GAL S Ibs Resolute 65 WG 5 GAL $11.30/Ib Resolute 5 GAL $77.25 jug 5 GAL 50.21 5 # bag
REGIMAX PGR OR EQUIVALENT Trin Pac Eth (Gen ) )
30 (LIQUID) GALLONS GAL 130 i) GAL No Bid GAL NB GAL No Bid GAL 128.97 311.06 2.5 gallon
SIMAZINE 4L (LIQUID) 2.5 GALLON 21.5/ga $15.76/g i
1 2. L 2 2. L . 2. L 1.2 2. L 2
31 lucs > GA > > GA 53.75/2.5ga |Pricep 4L 2.5 GAL 39.40/2.5 ga > GA »41.25 container > GA e
20-0-10 FERTILIZER WITH FOLLOWING
BLEND FOR 2000 POUNDS (ONE
32 PALLET) NO SUBSTITUTES TO THIS
FORMULATION 925 LBS AMMONIUM
SULFATE
(21-0-0) FERTILIZER 526 LBS SULFUR
COATED UREA (SCU) 333 LBS
32a |MURIATE OF POTASH (KCL) 189 LBS
FILLER (BIO-SOLIDS-ACTIVATED
SLUDGE)
CLEAR CAST (LIQUID) 1 GAL or2.5 1 GAL 416.22 1 GAL 230.00 1GAL 284.89 1 GAL $284.89 1 GAL 284.29
GALLON Castaway
33 . $265.00/g . . AgencY also
2.5 GAL 1040.55 2.5 GAL No Bid 2.5 GAL 2.5 GAL No Bid 2.5 GAL No Bid available in 15 gal
662.50/2.5 ga .
Imox mini drum
RODEO 30 GAL DRUM 17. 20.
34 30 GAL DRUM 718.2 30 GAL DRUM 18./gal  |Roundup 30 GAL DRUM 7Ll Rup Custom 30 GAL DRUM 0.93/ga 30 GAL DRUM 629.19
Custom 537/30¢ 628.5/30ga  |drum Round Up Custom
Cl 1
35 |CHIPPER 1B BAG 45 1B BAG 42.75 11B BAG NB 1B BAG No Bid 1B BAG 133.00 ose out 10 bags
Semra left
TRIPLE CROWN EPA #279-3456 :
36 1GAL 265 1GAL 265.00  |Triple crown 1GAL $260.00/g  |Agency 1GAL No Bid 1GAL 265.00  |rgency
MANUSCRIPT EPA #100-1626
37
IMIDACLOPEID EPA #89442-19 Imidacloprid @
38 1 GAL 49.85 1GAL 54.00 F 1GAL NB 1 GAL $75.93 1 GAL 51.05
Min Order-1 case Min Order 5300
Delivery 2-4 days Delivery 2-5 FROP Delivery 5 cal. days Delivery 4-5 days
Red Quanties reflects amount for comparison No fee w/ Pcard No fee w/ Pcard No Fees w/ P card

NOTE: Items 32, 32a and 37 are not being awarded on this solicitation.



