Porterville Unified School District Bid Solicitation 2022-2023 School Year Solicitation is for COMMERCIAL PRICING

Frozen Bid School Year 2022-2023 Bid# SN-23-02
Vendor Name: Edna's Bakery ePalet, nc. GOLD STAR FOODS La Tapatia Tortileria, Inc. VALLEY FOOD SERVICE
ITEM NAME DESCRIPTION ST Contribuions refferedBrand Brand Vendor ID o servhe e Lose Sering_{__price Cue___seing | Price Case | Sendng | P e e
Usage Grain M/MA or equivelent Price inCase | Perserving |Brand Vendor ID Price incase | per serving |Brand Vendor ID | price inCase | Per Serving Brand Vendor ID Price inCase | Per Serving Vendor ID price inCase PerServing. Brand Vendor ID inCase Per Serving
1 [avocapo, cups W, 20z, cup s- NoBid _|NoBid s #DIV/0!_|sIMPLOT, 36/202 305574 s22.82 36 $0.63 | Nosid $ #01V/0! $ #0IV/0!_|CALAVO 5370269| DISC 48| #VALUE!
2 | AVOCADO, PULP, FROZEN BULK, 2 Ib. pouch, 8 per case 10\071179032397 NoBid _|NoBid #DIV/0! NOBID H#VALUE! | No Bid #DIV/O! S- #DIV/0! | CASAIMP 337503 61.49 8 7.69
3 | BACON, HARDWOOD, SMOKED f;"a'ft i:;i’k”zr’;;'ﬁf“ not need to be NoBid | Nosid soivjol NO BID WVALUE! | No Bid #DIV/0! s #DIV/0! | SUNYVAL 207435 75.26 3| 2509
@ | BAGEL, BREAKFAST SAUSAGE 1 wholegrin,beeforurey sousoge | 100 | 1 | 1 |G Sehwan eacen NoBid _|Nosid #DIV/OL_| TONY', #67625, 96/2.8307 410049 $69.19 % $072 | Nogid #DIV/0!_|Tony's 67625| $6852 9|  $071|ARDELLA 825745 90| #VALUE!
5 _|BAGEL, PLAIN BULK, whole grain, 3", sliced 5|2 NoBid _|NoBid #DIV/0! | TONY ROBERTS, #19322, 72/30Z 134083 $27.64 72 $0.38 |NosBid #DIV/0! S #DIV/0! | BKRSCLS 25.54 12 213
L W, whole grain, 2430z, heat and serve | 100 | 2 Pillsoury NoBid | NoBid #DIV/O!_ | PILLSBURY, #38413, 72/2.4302 134813 $35.58 7 5049 |NoBid #0IV/0! Pillsbury 38413 s3679| 7 5051 | PILLSBY 3282800 3435 n| 048
7| BAR, Apple, Breakfast lcf;:ﬁ::mm' Soutelupfut o | 2 Dave's NoBid_|NoBid #DIV/0! | DAVES, #4014, 64/302 139651 sa1.25 6 s064|Nosid e s #0v/0l_| DAVE'S 2832857 | DISC 64| HVALUE!
8 | BAR, BENEFIT, CHOCOLATE CHIP w 1500 | 2 NoBid _|Nosid #DIV/OL_|) & ) SNACK FOODS, #40401, 48/2.50Z 113232 $1930 48 $0.40 | Nosid #DIV/0!_|38J Snacks 40401| $1875 48| $039|READIBK 8550417 19.64 48 0.41
9 | BAR, HONEY WHEAT IW, 2.80z, whole grain 100 | 2 Sky Blue No Bid No Bid #DIV/0! | SKY BLUE FOODS, #HWBS172, 72/2.80Z 102242 $36.02 72 $0.50 | No Bid #DIV/0! | Sky Blue HWB5172 $38.04 72 $0.53| SIMBLUE 6846135 37.23 72 0.52
10 |BEEF, ALL AMERICAN BURGER IW, whole grain, beef patty 100 | 2 2 |Integrated No Bid No Bid #DIV/0! | INTEGRATED, #470007, 50/4.250Z 100980 $52.34 50 $1.05 | NoBid #DIV/0! _|Integrated 470007| $51.09 50 $1.02|1FS 7834272 5174 50 1.03
11 | BEEF, MINI TWINS 1W, whole grain, beef patty w00 2 | 2 NoBid | NoBid #DIV/OL_| ADVANCE PIERRE, 80/4.8602 _|T8D $104.85 80 5131 |Nosid #0IV/0!_|integrated 470220 $85.76 75| $114|HOTOFFG 1766472 83.09 75| 111
12 |BEEF, PATTY BULK, low sodium >280mg 100 L et Nogid |Nosid HDIV/0!_| DON LEE FARMS, HCN152253, 240/2.2502 139370 s17269 | 240 072 |Nosid #DIV/0! | integrated N322258 $84.24 40| $0.60|HOTOFFG 3422811 | DIsc 105| #VALUE!
13 | BEEF, PHILLY STEAK IW, 2.5 0z, 192 per case, 3.5 g sat fat Tyson 10000097868 NoBid | Nosid HDIV/OL_| ADVANCE PIERRE, 308 406438 $22084 | 192 $120 | NoBid V0! $- #DIV/0!_| ADVPRFD 7054328] 21948 192 114
14 | BEEF, PHILLY STEAK IW, 2.5 oz, 192 per case, 4.5 g sat fat Tyson 10000097870 NoBid _|NoBid #DIV/OL_| ADVANCE PIERRE, ,192/2.502__|141095 $17752 | 192 5092 |Nosid #0v/o1_|Tyson $167.98 12|  $0.87| ADVANCE 7044724 16978 1| 169.78
15 | BEER RIBBQUE BULK, Patty w/sauce 00 2 JPT‘:?;;MngﬁlEd, pance No Bid No Bid #DIV/O! _| ADVANCE PIERRE, 100/3.250Z_|401372 $65.49 100 $0.65 | NoBid #DIV/0! S #DIV/0! | HOTOFFG 7135152| DISC 148 | #VALUE!
16 | BEEF, RIB B QUE W/BUN IW, 4.71 0z, w/sauce, whole grain, bun |1000 | 2 | 2 |integrated NoBid _|Nosid HDIV/O1_|INTEGRATED, #460007, 75/4.3602 8D $80.72 75 $108 | Nosid #DIV/0!_|Integrated 460007| $80.00 75| $1.07|HOTOFFG 2018043] 6071 75 081
17 BERRY, PULL APART IW, heat and serve 1000 2 NoBid | NoBid #DIV/0! NO BID HVALUE! | No Bid #DIV/0! s #DIV/0!_| ARDELLA 7141998 | DISC 32| #VALUE!
18 | BISCUIT & SAUSAGE :’:;:;:ivr:”bkefmmﬂq& vrelearen B ! No Bid No Bid #DIV/0! | INTEGRATED, #990118, 100/3.10Z 140949 $73.97 100 $0.74__| No Bid #DIV/0! S #DIV/0! | USDA 1056704| DISC 100 | #VALUE!
19 [BISCUIT, HONEY WHEAT 1w, whole grain, , fully boked 2 Bridgford 62677 NoBid | NoBid #DIV/0!_| BRIDGFORD, #6267, 100/20Z 140106 $29.88 100 $0.30 |Nosid #DIV/0!_|Bridgford 6267| $3130 00| $0.31|BRDGFRD 8385807| 3054 100] 031
20 | BITES, BREAKFAST, CHI BULK, turkey or chi 25 2 No Bid No Bid #DIV/0! NO BID #VALUE! | No Bid #DIV/0! $- #DIV/0! | RICHS 5135136 39.18 384 0.10
21 | BITES, NACHO, BITES BULK, whole grain corn flour, gluten free | 25 | 2 2 |The Fathers Table No Bid No Bid #DIV/0! | FATHERS TABLE, #77044, 8/2.2518 406545 $56.20 72 $0.78 | NoBid #DIV/O! $- #DIV/0! | FATHTBL 4155648 48.77 8 6.10
22 [BREAD, CINNAMON ROLL 1W, 202, whole grain 1000] 2 Edna’s, Shannon's Edna's 1595 $3650 | 60 061 [skyBlue swas17s 51892 7 5065 | pILLSBURY, 133686, 72/2.0907 113361 53558 » 5049 |NoBid s 4DIV/O1_|Super Bakery s070| $36.90 72| sos1|sanNON 7064450 | DISC 0| #VALUE!
23 | BREAD, CORN MUFFIN 1W, 20z, whole grain 25 | 2 | 2 [MuffinTown NoBid _|Nosid #DIV/OL_| MUFFIN TOWN, #02665, 96/202 8D $30.44 % 5032 |Nosid #DIV/0!_| Muffin Town 2665| $29.57 9| 5031 MUENTWN 7010654] 2925 9| 030
24 | BREAD, DINNER ROLL BULK, whole grain 01 Edna's 1829 $23.00 120 $0.19 No Bid #DIV/0! | SHANNONS, #5B-220, 192/10Z 133930 $32.58 192 $0.17 | NoBid #DIV/0! S #DIV/0! | SHANNON 1670191 3222 8 4.03
25 | BREAD, GARLIC CHEESE BULK, 20z, whole grain 25 |2 2 |Schwan's No Bid No Bid #DIV/0! | TONY ROBERTS, #66256, 60/4.30Z 403807 $58.25 60 $0.97 | No Bid #DIV/0! _|Schwans 78359| $52.62 60 $0.88| TONYS 56641 | NO BID 60| #VALUE!
26 | BREAD, HAMBURGER, BUN BULK, WHOLE GRAIN 100 | 2 Edna's 1806 $3.20 12 $0.27 No Bid #DIV/0! | GOLD STAR FOODS, #2176, 144CT 112952 $32.20 144 $0.22 | NosBid #DIV/0! $- #DIV/0! | SHANNON 360234 35.14 144 0.24
27_|BREAD, HOAGIE ROLL BULK, whole grain % |2 Edna's 1808 $255 6 5043 |NoBid #DIV/0! | GOLD STAR FOODS, #348, 120/207 133049 $19.81 120 $0.17_|Nosid #Iv/o1 s- #DIV/0!_| SHANNON 8965725 3060 144) 028
28 | BREAD, HONEY WHEAT BULK, w/oats. Artisan, sliced 10 Max's Edna's 1534 3.5 1 5315 |Nosid HDIV/O!_| WHEAT MONTANA, #5816, 12/2707 140897 $34.60 12 5288 |NoBid o0 s- #DIV/0!_| MAX BRD 182065| 2708 6| 451
29 | BREAD, LOAF, BANANA W, 54-4 0z 2 Integrated Foods IF9104 NoBid | NoBid #DIV/0!_| INTEGRATED, #G59104, 54/40Z 130413 $38.06 54 $0.70_|NoBid #DIV/0! | Super Bakery 7056| $49.84 10| 50.42|SUPBKRY 1359902| 4163 70| 059
30 BREAD, TELERA ROLL BULK, whole grain, 12 EA Bag 0 2 Shannor No Bid No Bid #DIV/0! | SHANNONS, #5B-490, 144/20Z 138912 MEG DISC #VALUE! |No Bid #DIV/0! S- #DIV/0! | SHANNON 3767458 | DISC 12| #VALUE!
31 | BREADSTICK BULK, whole grain 0 ]2 No Bid No Bid H#DIV/0! _| BAKE CRAFTERS, #5011, 240/10Z 133962 $38.09 240 $0.16 | NoBid #DIV/0! $- #DIV/0! | BONSTCF 807996 6438 200 0.32
32 | BREADSTICK, CHEESE STUFFED B g il M I Nobid | Nosid #DIV/0!_| BOSCOS, #17020111120, 144CT 405626 $54.95 104 5038 |NoBid #0V/0!_[Bosco 73338] $65.45 200|  s033|BOSCOS 3175953 anos 1| 4198
33 | BREADSTICK, CHEESE STUFFED IW, 3.860z, whole grain, NO substitutions | 1000 | 2 2 |The Max, Max Stick No Bid No Bid #DIV/0! | THE MAX, #77387-: 192/1.9302 404813 $53.51 192 $0.28 | NoBid #DIV/0! | The Max 7738712602| $58.15 192 $0.30| THE MAX. 9065749 | DISC. 84| #VALUE!
34| BREADSTICK, SOURDOUGH o j:;i:"f"’;‘;’,,",’,:f” ot need o be NoBid | Noid soivjol NO BID #VALUE! | NoBid soIv/o! s- #0Iv/0l_|RICHS 1451087 3245 a0 010
35 | BURRITO, BEAN & CHEESE BULK, whole grain 000 | 2 2 NoBid | NoBid #DIV/0! | MCI FOODS/LOS CABOS, #67576, 48/5.2002 | 403420 $35.45 a8 $0.74 | NoBid #DIV/0! S- #DIV/0! | ARDELLA 7135154| DISC 54| #VALUE!
36 | BURRITO, BEAN & CHEESE W, whole grain 000 | 2 2 No Bid No Bid #DIV/0! | MCI FOODS/LOS CABOS, #97576, 96/5.200Z | 403406 $72.62 96 $0.76 | No Bid #DIV/0! S- #DIV/0! | FIESTA 1572540 592 60 0.99
I |antinsaver et WM wroppedin o 450z, 80per cose 2| 2 |Michael®sPeo1s NoBid |Nogid HDIV/0!_| MICHAEL B'S BESTWAY, 498614, 80/5.2502 | TBD s11s89 | 80 $145 | Nosid 4DIV/0!_| Michael B's PB614 $99.63 s0|  s12s|miciLp 3001673] 10346 so| 129
38 | BURRITO, TURKEY CARNITAS IW, 6.04 0z, 80 per case 2 2 |Michael B's TB614 No Bid No Bid #DIV/0! | MICHAEL B'S BESTWAY, #TB614, 80/6.860Z T8D $115.33 80 $1.44 | NoBid #DIV/0! | Michael B's TB614 $95.96 80 $1.20 9999999 | DISC. H#VALUE!
39 | CAKE, CINNAMON CRUMBLE, COFFEE IW, whole grain, , 3.4 0z, 72 per case 2 Buena Vista No Bid No Bid #DIV/0! | SKY BLUE FOODS, #CRC272, 72/30Z 138924 $34.03 72 $0.47 | NoBid #DIV/0! | Buena Vista 90029| $41.30 72 $0.57| BUENVST 2460612 5157 72 0.72
40 | CAKE, CINNAMON CRUMBLE, COFFEE | BULK, 4.75 Ib, 4 bags per case 2 Buena Vista NoBid _|NoBid #IV/01 MIFG DISC HVALUE! | No Bid #DIV/0!_|Buena vista 30013| $6033 #DIV/0!_| BUENVST 7007318 43.02 7 0.60
41 | CHEESE BITES w 2 2 |Wwild Mike's 11113 No Bid No Bid #DIV/0! | WILD MIKE'S, #11113, 60/40Z 409781 $78.95 60 $132 | NoBid #DIV/0! s #DIV/0! | WLDMIKE 7155843 75.02 60 1.25
42 | CHEESE BITES, JALAPENO w 2 2 | Wild Mike's 11003 No Bid No Bid #DIV/0! | WILD MIKE'S, #11118, 60/40Z 410052 $80.41 60 5134 |NoBid #DIV/0! $- #DIV/0! | WLDMIKE 7013429 67.96 240 0.28
43 | CHEESE SAUCE, POUCH BULK, 136 02, 6 bags per case. Land O Lakes 39940 NoBid _|Nosid #DIV/0!_|LAND O LAKES, #39945, 6/10602 410080 $73.89 212 $0.35 |Nosid $ #o/or_|imm 5705| $66.49 #ov/01_|LOL 229355| DISC 6| #VALUE!
44 | CHEESE SAUCE, CUPS IW, 30z cups, 140 per case 2 |Land O Lakes 39911 No Bid No Bid #DIV/0! | LAND O LAKES, #39911, 140/30Z 403651 $74.60 140 $0.53 | No Bid #DIV/0! $- #DIV/0! | LOL 7000927 70.14 140 0.50
45 | CHEESE, CUPS W, 40z, low sodium 1000 2 NoBid | Noid #DV/0! #9848, 96/3.6501 406899 $81.00 % $0.84 | Nosid #DIV/01 $- #oV/0!_|GEH 29500 DISC 48| #VALUE!
46 | CHEESE, PULL APART W, whole grain 00| 2 | 2 NoBid | General Mills / Pillsbury | 112317000 $80.49 7 $1.12 | PILLSBURY, #12317, 72/3.8802 143752 $58.01 7 $0.81 _|NoBid #DIV/0! $- #DIV/0! | ARDELLA 9910626] 9694 108 0.90
47 | CHEESE, QUESADILLA, BREAKFAST w, 000 1| 2 NoBid _|Nosid #DIV/01_| ROSE & SHORE, #W24072, 72/2.207 406705 $53.40 n $0.74 | Nosid #DIV/0!_|integrated 364000| $5830 10| $0.58| HOTOFFG 3058823| 5586 | 056
48 | CHEESE, QUESADILLA, GREEN SAUCE | W, low sodium w00 2 | 2 NoBid | NoBid #DIV/OL_| MCI FOODS/LOS CABOS, #45227, 48/4.402__| 403966 $5215 a8 $1.09 |Nosid #DIV/0! $- #DIV/0!_|LOSCABO 741|557 4| 105
49 CHICKEN, BONE IN, WINGS OF FIRE BULK Tyson 10135410928 NoBid |NoBid #01v/01_|TYson, , 2/518 80 ssaa1 | @ $130 |Nosid /o s- #o1v/0! | Tvson 0780|6862 3| 2287
S50 | CHICKEN, CHUNKS, NASHVILLE, SPICY BULK 1 2 |Tyson No Bid No Bid #DIV/0! | TYSON, 112/4.4402 406492 $129.96 112 $1.16 | NoBid #DIV/O! $- #DIV/0! | TYSON 2155929 8836 4 22.09
51 | CHICKEN, DUMPLINGS BULK 2 2 |Schwan's No Bid No Bid #DIV/0! | SCHWANS FOOD SERVICE INC, #60585, 8/2.5LB | 141458 $63.10 400 $0.16 | No Bid #DIV/0! _|Schwan's 60585| $64.58 HDIV/( CHEFONE 7111727] 58.89 384 0.15
52 | CHICKEN, DRUMSTICK, BREADED BULK, light or dark meat 1000 2 |Tyson NoBid _|Nosid #DIV/0L_|TYSON, 92/4.402 405424 $97.71 2 $1.06 | Nosid #0IV/0! $- #DIV/0!_|TYSON 2746405| 9186 1| 9186
53 | CHICKEN, FAJITA BREAST MEAT BULK, two 5lb bag John Soules 16686 No Bid No Bid #DIV/0! | TYSON, 8/4.99L8 401586 $158.23 228 $0.69 | No Bid #DIV/0! $- #DIV/0! 3006616 15033 8 18.79
54 | CHICKEN, MANDARIN ORANGE BULK, low sodium, with sauce 25 2 |Yang's No Bid No Bid #DIV/0! | YANGS, #8-52724-15552-4, 1/43.5L8 403631 $161.38 192 $0.84 | No Bid #DIV/0! $- #DIV/O! 2819973 14248 6 23.75
55 | CHICKEN, MEATBALLS BULK, 2 2 NoBid | Noid HDIV/OL_| TYSON, #10197770328, 2/5L8 403441 $37.95 58 $0.65 | NoBid #DIV/0! $- #DIV/0! | TYSON 1541871 3645 2| 1823
56_| CHICKEN, NUGGETS BULK, white meat, whole grain breading | 100 | 2 | 2 |lntegrated NoBid _|Nosid #DIV/0L_|TYSON, , 328118 04689 $90.61 175 $0.52_|Nosid #DIV/01 $- #DIV/0! | TYSONRL 8412780] 2607 2| 13.04
BULK, whole grain,, breaded home-style,

57 |CHICKEN, NUGGETS, MENGA MINIS, NAE | whole muscle, chunks, 2.5 oz, 192 1| 2 |Tyson 10269760928
portions per case No Bid No Bid #DIV/0! | TYSON, , 1125/.4302 406452 $128.76 112 $1.15 | NoBid #DIV/0! $- #DIV/0! | TYSON 7039014 122.34 1| 12234
| 58 | CHICKEN, PATTIES, BREADED, CRISPY BULK, white meat, whole grain breading | 100 2 |Tyson, Gold Kist, John Soule's No Bid No Bid #DIV/O! | TYSON, #10703040928, 175/3.002 404679 $91.82 172 $0.53 | NoBid #DIV/0! $- #DIV/0! | TYSON 5316627 79.83 4 19.96
59 |Gy Y BREADED BULK,white meat, whole grain breading | 100 2 |Tvson, Gold Kist, John Soule's NoBid | NoBid #DIV/0L_|TYSON, 173/302 404680 $91.87 173 $0.53 | Nosid #oIV/0! $ #DIV/0!_| TYSON 3009919| 9371 4 2343
©0_| CHICKEN, PATTY, BREADED, SPICY 5%’;3315;: v wheleme 272 1| 2 |Tveon 10703120928 NoBid | NoBid H#DIV/OL_| TYSON, #10703120928, 4/7.7218 03682 su779 | 132 $0.89 | NoBid #IV/0! $- #DIV/0!_| TYSON 2194474 11191 4 2798
CHICKEN, SANDWICH, MAPLE 1w, whole grain bun Integrated NoBid _|Nosid #DIV/O!_|INTEGRATED, #809055, 75/50Z 141204 |TemP pisc HVALUE! | No Bid #oIV/0! $- #DIV/0! | HOTOFFG 7174249 | DISC 75| #VALUE!
CHICKEN, SLIDERS W, whole grain bun No Bid No Bid H#DIV/O! | INTEGRATED, #809055, 75/50Z 141294 TEMP DISC #VALUE! | No Bid #DIV/0! $- #DIV/0! | HOTOFFG 7174249 | DISC 75| #VALUE!
63 | CHICKEN, STRIPS, BREADED o e e holemisae 130 t| 2 |Tsont7033220928 Nobid | Nosid #DIV/0!_| TYSON, #17033220928, 330/1.507 406172 $12435 | 330 5038 |NoBid #DIV/0! $ #DV/0!_| TYSON 4335889 11815 6| 19.69
©4 | CHICKEN, SWEET CHILI THAI o peenutfes it » 2 |Yene Nogid _|Noeid HDIV/O! | VANGS, #8-52724-15550-0, 1/43.518 404027 s16138 | 192 5084 |NoBid $ #DIV/0! $ HDIV/0!_| VANGS 38u612| 14798 6| 2466
65 | CHICKEN, TENDERLOINS, BREADED 5%;::32’: i, whole misce 141 2 |Tyson 10703320928 NoBid |NoBid #DIV/OL | TYSON, , 240/2.702 404684 $12058 | 240 $0.50 | NoBid #DIV/01 s #DIV/0! | TYSON 2188045 114.56 4| 2864
SO} CHICKEN: TENDERLOINS, BREADED g”ﬁx’:ﬁﬂ: e il NoBid _|NoBid #DIV/0!_| GOLD KIST, #7572, 110/4.3502 406240 MG DISC AVALUE! | No Bid #oIv/o! $- #DIV/0!_| GLDKIST 7054931 | DISC 10| #VALUE!
67_| CHICKEN, TENDERS, CRISPY BULK, whole grain breading w00 |2 | 2 NoBid _|Nosid #DIV/OL_| TYSON, , 4/7.9658 403508 $82.50 150 $0.55 | Nosid #0IV/0! $- #DIV/0!_| TYSONRL 8496913| 4915 2| 2458
68 | CHICKEN, TENDERS, Spicy, CRISPY BULK, whole grain breading 100 2 |Yang's NoBid | Nogid HDIV/OL_| TYSON, #10703440928, 31.8618 404688 $86.66 148 $0.59 |NoBid #DIv/0! $- #DIV/0! | TYSON 2189201 11817 4| 2954
69_| CHICKEN, TERIYAKI AND BROWN RICE | IW, whole grain rice, low sodium sauce {1000 | 1.5 | 2 |Posada NoBid _|Nosid #DIV/O! | YANGS, #8-52724-16667-4, 36/90Z 409702 $73.08 36 $2.03 |Nosid #DIV/01 $- #DIV/0!_| VAN 7135002| DIsC 36| #VALUE!
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70 | CHIMICHANGA, BEEF BULK, 50z, Smart Snack Compliant 25 | 2 | 2 [ElMonterey NoBid _|Nosid #DIV/01 MG DisC #VALE! | No Bid #DIV/0!_|El Monterey 15723 $20.83 20| $1.03|POSADA 6183960 282 2 118
72 | CINNAMON ROLL, APPLE CINNAMON, [ L 0| 2 ] ] .

BEAR PAW NoBid _|NoBid #DIV/O1_| SHANNONS, #5B-70055, 72/302 141018 $42.99 n $0.60 | Nosid #DIV/0!_|Shannon's 5B-70055 $4120 72| $057|sHANNON 7064448| 4135 7 0.57
73 | CINNAMON ROLL, BREAKFAST SQUARE | 1w, 30z, whole grain w0 | 2 Shannon's NoBid | NoBid #DIV/OL_| SHANNONS, #58:70045, 60/30Z 141017 $36.00 60 $0.60 | Nosid #DIV/0!_|Sky Blue swes175 $37.25 75| $0.50|SHANNON 7093036| DISC 72| #VALUE!
74| CINNAMON, APPLE NADA, TASTY NADA | IW, 4oz, whole grain 1000 | 2 NoBid _|NoBid #DIV/0! | BELLTASTY, #CAS700W, 60/40Z 142074 $46.67 60 $0.78 _|NoBid #IV/0! $ #DIV/0!_| BELLTSY 2005892 | DISC 60| #VALUE!
75 | CINNAMON, CRUMB CAKE W, 3 0z whole grain 000 | 2 Shannon's NoBid _|skyBlue CRC272 $52.38 72 $0.73 | BUENA VISTA, #90029, 72/2.90Z 406525 $41.98 72 $0.58 | No Bid #DIV/0! | Sky Blue CRC272 $34.80 72 $0.48| BUENVST 7135336 4132 72 0.57
7 | COOKIE, GOURMET, M&M CHOCOLATE | BULK, catering item, does not need to be

cHUN smart snack compliant NoBid _|Nosid #DIV/O1_| FAT CAT BAKERY, #WGCCC192-15, 192/1.302 _|139816 $46.26 192 $0.24 |Nosid #oIV/0! $ BKRSCLS 106033 355 48 0.74
78 | cooKis, GouRMET, cocoLaTe chp | 2% Eiil"i'm‘fﬁaff s rotneedtobe NoBid |Nosid HDIV/OL | BUENA VISTA, #79015, 120/1.502 134668 sa7.02 120 $0.39 |NoBid #DIV/0! OTSPKMY 1412659 7438 240|031
79 | COOKIES, GOURMET, CHOCOLATE BULK, catering item, does not need o be

CHUNK WITH PECANS smart snack compliant NoBid | No Bid #DIV/0! NO BID HVALUE! | No Bid #DIV/0! s BKRSIMP 7123901 5261 150 035
50 | COOKIES, GOURMET,PEANUT BUTTER | 2L% ﬁ:ﬂ"‘iﬁfﬁaff s ot needtobe NoBid |Nosid #oVj0! NOBID HVALUE! | No Bid #DIV/0! s RICHS a274124] 6563 20| 031
1 | COOKIES, GOURMET, WHITE CHOCOLATE | BULK, catering item, does not need to be

MACADAMIA smart snack compliant No Bid No Bid #DIV/O! NO BID #VALUE! | No Bid #DIV/0! s RICHS 4274736 69.61 210 033
#2 |cooues counmer swiorerooonis |0 SRS P st 00 nosia|nosie iowjo,_|suenavist, 915, 120/1.502 e | ssso | 10 | soss o oo s sonor_|escis soos| om| | oas
83 | CORN DOG, CHICKEN BULK, whole grain breading 500 | 2 2 NoBid _|NoBid #DIV/O! | FOSTER FARMS, #95150, 72/40Z 409658 $36.27 72 $0.50 | No Bid #DIV/O! | Foster Farms 96103| $33.83 7 $0.47| FOSTRFM 1604289 3549 72 0.49
84| CORN DOG, CHICKEN W, whole grain breading 500 | 2 | 2 NoBid | NoBid HDIV/OL_| DON LEE FARMS, #CN34072WWG, 72/40Z 134372 $61.37 b3 $0.85 | NoBid #DIV/0!_| Foster Farms 9a124| $53.41 23| $232|FOSTREM 205043] 221 9% 0.54
85 | CORN DOG, CHICKEN, MINI BULK, whole grain breading 500 [ 2 [ 2 [Farmland NoBid _|NoBid #DIV/01 | TYSON, #10270240928, 3018 406484 $90.93 120 $0.76 | NoBid #DIV/0!_| Foster Farms 96124 $30.87 #DIV/0!_| FOSTREM 5310361 2617 2| 13.09
86| DELI MEAT, HONEY HAM, BUFFET BULK, 20 pound case 5 NoBid | Noid #DIV/0! NOBID AVALUE! | No Bid #0IV/0! $- #DIV/0! | SMITHFLD 6186399 489 2 2.45
87_| DELI MEAT, TURKEY BOLOGNA BULK 10 Butterball NoBid _|Nosid #DIV/0!_|BUTTERBALL, 12/218 410039 su3g0 | 114 $1.00 | Nosid #DIV/01 $- #DIV/0! | CAROLIN 8944910 219 2 110
88 | DELI MEAT, TURKEY BREAST, SMOKED | BULK, 10 NoBid | NoBid #DIV/O!_| JENNIE O, #257412, 6/218 406495 $65.56 116 $0.57 | Nosid #DIV/0! $- #DIV/0! | BTRBALL 3293438 48 2 240
89 | DELI MEAT, TURKEY, BREAST, SLICED BULK, 10 NoBid | NoBid HDIV/O!_| JENNIE 0, #209903, 12/118 400966 $a5.27 64 $0.71_|NoBid #DIV/0! $- BBRLCLS 7094635 7934 4| 1984
90 | DELI MEAT, TURKEY, HAM BULK, 10 NoBid _|Nosid #DIV/0!_|JENNIE O, #813030, 3/1018 401016 $10917 | 159 $0.69 |Nosid #OIV/0! $- FOSTRFM 1507870 361 181
91| PELI MEAT, TURKEY, HAM, SLICED, Sk o

EXTRA LEAN . NoBid _|NoBid #DIV/0! | JENNIE O, #256503, 12/1L8 400974 $48.63 62 $0.78 | No Bid #DIV/0! $- JENNIEO 1126184] 46.71 12 3.89
92 | DOUGH, COOKIE, CHOCOLATE CHIP BULK, 1.5 oz. puck 10 NoBid _|Nosid #DIv/0!_|ois s #5680, 240/1.502 110793 $50.19 240 $021 |Nosid #OIV/0! $- #0IV/01_| OTSPKMY 1412659 7438 240 031
93 | DOUGH, COOKIE, MACADAMIAN BULK, 1.5 0z. puck 10 No Bid No Bid #DIV/O! NO BID HVALUE! | No Bid #DIV/0! $- #DIV/0! | RICHS 4274736 69.61 210 0.33
94 DOUGH, COOKIE, OATMEAL CRANBERRY  BULK, 1.5 o. puck 10 NoBid _|Nosid #DIV/01 NoBID #VALUE! | No Bid #DIV/01 $- #DIV/0! | BKRSIMP 1326301 | NO BID 240| #VALUE!
95 | DOUGH, COOKIE, OATMEL RAISIN BULK, 1.5 oz. puck 10 NoBid _|Noid #Dv/0!_|ois s #5683, 240/1.502 110794 $50.15 240 $021 _|NoBid #DIV/0! $- #DIV/0! | BKRSCLS 1628652 NO BID 216| #VALUE!
96 | DOUGH, COOKIE, 58-12 BULK, 1.5 oz. puck 10 NoBid | NoBid #DIV/0!_|OTis SP #5683, 240/1.502 110794 $54.67 240 5023 |Nosid #Dv/0! $- #DIV/0! 9999999 | DISC HVALUE!
97 | DOUGH, COOKIE, SUGAR BULK, 1.5 oz. puck 10 NoBid | Noid #Dv/0!_| oS sP #5684, 240/1.502 110791 $54.67 240 $0.23 |NoBid #DIV/0! $- #DIV/0!_| OTSPKMY 1412642 7518 240 031
98 | DOUGHNUT, BAR w, 2 Sky Blue NoBid | NoBid #DIV/OL_| SKY BLUE FOODS, #HWB5172, 72/2.802 102202 $33.24 7 $0.46 | NoBid #DIV/0! $- #DIV/0!_| SIMBLUE 5216920 3896 7 0.54
99 | DOUGHNUT, PULL APARTS w, 2 Sky Blue NoBid | NoBid #OV/01 NoBID #VALUE! | No Bid #DIV/0!_|Sky Blue weBC272 $4027 72| $0.56SKVBLUE 7027228) 3941 7 0.55
100 | EGGS, PRE COOKED CURDS Trasmm ’Zg: i e pre cooked Papetti's 460258587700 NoBid _|NoBid HDIV/OL_| SUNNY FRESH, 141927, 4/58 09765 6183 320 $0.19 |NoBid #Iv/0! $- #DIV/0!_| ABBTSFD 9904645| 5726 12 4.77
101 | EGGS, PATTY, PRE COOKED BULK, 10 1 NoBid__|NoBid #DIV/O! | SUNNY FRESH, #41710, 369/1.2502 409758 $80.85 369 $0.22 | NosBid #DIV/0! $- #DIV/0! | ABBTSFD 5064183 31.51 120 0.26
102 | ENCHILADAS, CHEESE W, whole grain 25 | 2 2 No Bid No Bid #DIV/0! NO BID HVALUE! | No Bid #DIV/0! $- #DIV/0! | HOTOFFG 2902072 52.37 1 52.37
103 | ENCHILADAS, CHEESE, RED SAUCE W, whole grain 000 | 2 2 No Bid No Bid #DIV/0! | MICHAEL B'S BESTWAY, #CCE12, 35/70Z 406591 $48.53 35 $1.39  |NoBid #DIV/0!_|Integrated 809044| $59.99 42 $1.43| HOTOFFG. 7162301 57.69 4 1.37
104 | FRENCH TOAST, STICKS W, whole grain, , 30z, 88 per case 2 Bake Crafters 449 NoBid | Noid HDIV/OL_| BAKE CRAFTERS, #449, 88/30Z 113685 $57.40 88 $0.65 | NoBid #DIV/0! $- 3816893) 5538 88 0.63
105 | FRITATA, CORN AND JALAPENO W,3.75 02 2 [ 2 [ave's Baking NoBid _|NoBid #DIV/01 | DAVES, #5900, 60/3.802 181202 $51.50 60 $0.85 | Nosid #DIvV/0! s- 9999999 47.87(3.7502 | #VALUE!
106 | FRITATA, CORN AND JALAPENO BULK, 3.75 oz, 60 per case 2 | 2 |Dave's Baking 5900 NoBid _|Noid #DIV/0!_| DAVES, #5900, 60/3.802 8D $51.50 60 $0.86 | NoBid #IV/0! $- #DIV/0! 9999999| 4787|3750z |HVALUE!
107 | FRITATA, EGG AND CHEESE W, 3.402 1 | 1 |pave’s Baking NoBid | NoBid #oIv/ol MFG DISC VALUE! | No Bid so1v/o! s- #oIv/ol 9999999| 4149|3407 | HVALUE!
108 | FRITATA, EGG AND CHEESE BULK, 3.4 07, 60 per case 1 | 1 |Dave’sBaking 5700 NoBid__|NoBid #DIV/0!_| DAVES, #5700, 60/3.7502 8D $51.50 60 5086 |Nosid #oIv/o1 $- #ov/01 9999999| 4149|3407  |HVALUE!
109 | FRUDEL, APPLE, STICK IW, 2.290z, whole grain 500 | 2 Pillsbury NoBid | General Mills/Pillsbury | 127852000 $5139 n 5071 | PILLSBURY, #127852, 72/2.2902 112999 $35.58 ” 5049 | Nosid #oIv/o! s- #DIv/01 8162673 3435 7 0.48
110 | FRUDEL, CHERRY, STICK W, 2.2902, whole grain 500 | 2 NoBid | General Mills / Pillsbury 127851000 $51.39 72 $0.71 | PILLSBURY, #27851, 72/2.2902 113000 $35.58 72 $0.49 | No Bid #DIV/0! S- #DIV/0! | PILLSBY 8162665 3435 7 0.48
111 [FRUIT, MIXED BERRY, CUPS IW, 40z, 1/2 cup fruit equivalent, 100% | 10 NoBid | NoBid #DIV/OI | WAWONA, #59600-00, 96/402 141561 $58.46 9% $0.61 | Nosid #0V/01 |18 Snacks 23060025| $31.25 9| 033/ wAWONA 7135158 589 % 061
112 | FRUIT, STRAWBERRIES, CUPS W, 402, 1/2 cup fruit equivalent, 200% | 10 NoBid _|NoBid #DIV/0! | WAWONA, #5968/5598, 96/4.502 102760 $70.97 9% $0.74_|NoBid HDIV/O!_|18J Snacks 23060005| $31.25 9% 50.33| WAWONA 5865243 7144 9 0.74
113 | FRUIT, FROZEN CUPS, VARIOUS ", Rosetti lce NoBid | NoBid #DIV/OL_| ROSATI, 90/4.40Z 140872 $33.02 % $0.37_|NoBid #oIvjo1 $- #OIV/0!_|LUIGIS 243215 3745 7 0.52
114 | JUICE, PEACH, CUPS. IW, /2 cup fruit equivalent, 100% fruit 10 NoBid | NoBid #DIV/O! | WAWONA, #55375/5950, 96/4.402 133761 $56.02 96 $0.58 | No Bid #DIV/0! S- #DIV/0! | WAWONA 7066201 5542 9. 0.58
115 [JUICE, SORBET, CUPS W, 1/2 cup fruit equivalent, 100% fruit | 10 NoBid | NoBid #DIV/OL_|) & ) SNACK FOODS, 96/4.402 141549 $3196 9% 5033 |Nosid #0V/01 |18 Snacks Various $3125 96| so33|Luicis 1650026 203 9% 031
116 | MUFFIN, BANANA IW, 30z, whole grain 1000 [ 2 Dave's No Bid Sky Blue WMBAN248 $38.54 48 50.80 | DAVES, #WG828, 60/3.150Z 113420 $34.03 60 5057 | NoBid #DIV/0! | Buena Vista 60226| $54.67 120 $0.46| DAVE'S 2384240 3251 60 0.54
117 | MUFFIN, CHERRY 1W, 30z, whole grain 1000 | 2 NoBid _|Nosid #DIV/O!_| BUENA VISTA, #60425, 120/307 406306 $55.75 120 $0.46 | Nosid #DIV/0!_|Buena Vista 60425| $54.67 10| $0.46| BUENVS 7059170 5137 120 0.43
118 | MUFFIN, DOUBLE CHOCOLATE IW, 3.10z, whole grain 1000 | 2 No Bid Sky Blue WMDC248 $38.54 a8 $0.80 | DAVES, #WG845, 60/3.150Z 134237 $34.03 60 $0.57 | NoBid #DIV/0! | Buena Vista 60941| $52.72 100 $0.53| DAVE'S 2384222 34.16 60 0.57
119 | MUFFINS, ASSORTED, GOURMET o ﬁ:;i:"f,,’:m:,‘m ot need o be NoBid | Noid soivjol NO BID #VALUE! | NoBid soIv/o! s #01v/0!_| OTSPKMY s068163| 2599 24| 108
120 | PANCAKE, BOWL IW, 3.8 0z, whole grain 1000 | 2 De Wafflebakkers No Bid No Bid #DIV/0! | BUENA VISTA, 72/3.80Z 406448 $61.75 72 50.86 | NoBid #DIV/0! | Buena Vista 94020-94030-94040 | $60.50 72 $0.84| BUENVST 7093425 | DISC 72| #VALUE!
121 | PANCAKE, MINI PANCAKES 1W, 302, whole grain 100 | 2 Integrated NoBid _|Nosid #DIV/0! | EGGO, #38000-92562, 72/3.0302 134287 $31.12 b3 $0.43 | Nosid #0Iv/o1 $- #DIV/0L_|PILLSBY 4386712 3113 7 043
122 | PANCAKE, MINI SAUSAGE BITES BULK, whole grain, , .850z, 190 per case 1 1 |Leon's Texas Cuisine 20040 No Bid No Bid #4DIV/0! | FOSTER FARMS, #96169, 2/5L8 100716 $32.01 60 $0.53 | NoBid #DIV/0! S$- #DIV/0! | LEONS 1409705 | NO BID 190 | #VALUE!
123 | PANCAKE, SANDWICH, BEEF SAUSAGE | W, whole grain, 2.60Z 100 [125] 1 NoBid__|NoBid #DIV/O!_|INTEGRATED, #990120, 100/2.6107 8D 57663 100 $077 | Nosid #DIV/0!_|Integrated 990120| $76.02 100]  $0.76|INTEGRA 7078583 76.84 100 0.77
124 | PANCAKE, SAUSAGE ON A STICK IW, turkey or chicken, whole grain 1000 | 1 1 |Foster Farms No Bid No Bid #DIV/0! | FOSTER FARMS, #95127, 68/2.850Z 100760 $33.48 68 $0.49 | NoBid #DIV/0! $- #DIV/0! | FOSTRFM 4684498 311 68 0.46
125 | PANCAKE, WRAPS, MINI MAPLE, TURKEY |IW, 2550z, whole grain w1 | 1 NoBid_|NoBid #DIV/0! | FOSTER FARMS, #95127, 68/2.8502 100760 $33.48 8 $0.49  |NoBid #oIv/o! s- #DV/0!_| FOSTREM 8015109| DISC 56| #VALUE!
126 | PASTA, CHEESEBURGER, MACARONI AND [ O N

CHEESE NoBid | NoBid #DIV/OL_|JTM, #CP5151, 6/518 401061 $86.13 100 $0.86 | Nosid #oIvjo1 $ #DIV/0!_|USDA FP 1000361 100 0.56
127 | PASTA, MACARONI AND CHEESE 5}:’:(' e T e NoBid | NoBid HDIV/OL_| LAND O LAKES, #43277, 6/5L8 401923 $61.58 80 $077__|NoBid #DIV/0! $- #0IV/01 | TV 2350611 58.4 6 9.73
128 | PASTA, MACARONI AND CHEESE W, whole grain, low sodium 5|1 2 NoBid _|NoBid #DIV/0!_|JTM, #5781, 30/60Z 404724 $41.15 30 $1.37 | NoBid #DIV/O! $- #DIV/0! | ROSNSHR 3973391 67.81 45 151
120 | PASTA, PENNE, PRE COOKED, THAW AND | BULK, fully cooked noodles, thaw and w0 | 2 ™

HEAT heat NoBid _|NoBid #DIV/O! | ITM, #5783, 30/60Z 409710 $41.49 30 $1.38 | NoBid #DIV/O!_|iTM 5764| $61.10 80 50.76 | ROSINA 7040430 21.57 3 7.19
130 | PASTA, ROTINI, WITH ALFREDO SAUCE %’in featandsene backt/2, Wl | g0 | 5 | 2 | NoBid | Nogid #DV/0! NO BID HVALUE! | No Bid v/ |im s783| $4027 30| si3alorm 7091566] 3853 30| 128
131 |pASTa, ROTION, with AT auce | 1Ch OB st s beck 97| o 2 NoBid _|Nosid HDIV/O!_| T, #CPSS91, 6/5L8 401076 ss1ea | 6 128 |Nosid o/ cpsso1 $57.36 20| siofstm o34555| 385 30| 128
132 | PASTA, SPAGHETTI, WITH MEAT SAUCE ;w;iuz, featandserv,Blck ey whole | 1000 2 |LandOLakes NoBid |NoBid #DIV/01_|ITM, #5502CE, 30/802 141274 $52.10 30 $178 | NoBid #ov/or_[itm cpss02 $55.02 30 s18s[T™ 1634908 | DISC 40| HVALUE!
133 | PASTRIES, ASSORTED, GOURMET o i:’;:”;,’;f,?a:f“ notneed to be NoBd | Nosid ool NO BID suALE! | No Bid oo s- #DV/0!_| OTSPKMY 9563156) 5313 9| 055
134 | PEPPERONI, SLICED, TURKEY BULK No Bid No Bid #DIV/0! | JENNIE O, #213008, 8/2-2.5L8. 406278 $118.91 233 $0.51 | NoBid #DIV/0! $ #DIV/0! | AREZCLS 3914439 11136 2 55.68
135 | P, 167 ROUND,PeppERoN! peppron T R nosis_[nosia wono s onoors,sesssz, 251302 wma | s | m | soss [noms sonor[sigoaes o5 sonms v |viLarm soen| sl o 13
136 | PIZZA, BELL TASTY NADA| W, whole grain, turkey and cheese 0] 2 2 |Tony's No Bid No Bid #DIV/0! | BELL TASTY, #6BTP375W, 60/40Z 101770 $44.29 60 $0.74__ | No Bid #DIV/0! $ #DIV/0! | BELLTSY 1710368 51.13 60 0.85
137 | PIZZA, BREAKFAST, TURKEY SAUSAGE | BULK, whole grain, pre sliced 25 |1 | 1 |fonys NoBid | NoBid HDIV/OL_| TONY'S, #63913, 100/3.670Z 403948 $59.34 100 $059 | NoBid #oN/01_|Tony's 63912| $50.55 18]  50.39| TONYS 656094|  49.61 1| 4961
138 | PIZZA, CALZONE, PRETZEL, NACHO W, 46902, whole grain, low sodium 25 |2 | 2 |Glrdi NoBid _|Nosid #DIV/O!_| BUENA VISTA, #50821, 80/5.502 406728 $89.51 80 $112 | Nosid #DV/01_|The Max 7738712584 | $56.85 9|  $059|GILARDI 4073187 5591 0 0.93
139 | PIZZA, CHEESE BULK, 4.50z, whole grain, low sodium 1000 | 2 | 2 NoBid _|Noid #DIV/OL_| TONY'S, #78697, 96/4.502 403177 $52.9 % $0.55 | No Bid #o/0!_|Tony's 72580 $49.35 60|  s082|TONYS s415069| 5236 9% 0.55
140 | PIZZA, PINWHEEL, CHEESE BULK, 4.690z, whole grain, low sodium 25 | 2 2 |Tony's NoBid _|NoBid #DIV/0! | EASTSIDE ENTREES, /25401, 96/4.107 406802 $89.87 96 $0.94 | No Bid #DIV/0! S- #DIV/0! | EASTSID 4564876 82.78 9 0.86
141 | PIzZA, ROUND, CHEESE, 6" BULK, 4.6902, whole grain, lowsodium | 25 | 2 | 2 NoBid | Nosid #DIV/O!_| TONY'S, #72671, 60/5.502 403565 $54.49 60 $0.91 | Nosid #oIvjor s #DIV/0!_| GILARDI 4060261 5785 60 0.96
142 | PIZZA, SANDWICH, PEPPERONI 5,":5;2:.5 o wholeren rkey N NoBid _|NoBid #DIV/0!_|BIG DADDY', #5293, 48/4.460Z 409853 $42.87 8 5089 |Nogid #DIV/0!_|Big Daddy s5203| $a2.42 48] s088|BGDADDY si786) 3432 48 0.72
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143 | PIZZA, TURKEY PEPPERONI BULK, 4.6902, whole grain, low sodium {1000 | 2 | 2 |Tony's NoBid _|Nosid #DIV/0I_| TONY'S, #78369, 60/4.9802 403557 $59.00 60 $0.98 |Nosid #o/01_|Tony's 78369| $57.37 60|  s0.96|uspa 2085308 NO BID 96| #VALUE!
144 | PIZZA, TURKEY PEPPERONI BULK, 5", whole grain, low sodium 25 | 2 | 2 |BigDaddy's NoBid | NoBid #DIV/0!_| TONY'S, #72581, 60/4.8802 405460 $5138 60 $0.86 | Nosid #o/0!_|Tony's 72581| $5143 60|  s0.86|LC/TONY 1676675 | NO BID 54| #VALUE!
145 | POTATO, FRIES, CRINKLE CUT BULK, low sodum, >200mg EE NoBid _|NoBid HDIV/01_| MCCAIN FOODS INC, #OIF00055A, 6/5LB. 401206 $29.16 203 $0.12_|NoBid #DIV/0!_|simplot 10071179221227| $23.18 #DIV/0 | SYS REL 1994294 2926 6 4.88
146 | POTATO, FRIES, SPICY, SEASONED BULK, low sodium, >200mg % |2 NoBid _|NoBid #DIV/0!_| MICCAIN FOODS INC, #MCLO3622, 6/4L8 401258 $32.22 179 $0.18 | Nosid #0V/01_|simplot 1007179036715 $28.40 #OV/0!_|SYS IMP 7132388 3799 6 6.33
147 [POTATO, ROUNDS, TATER TOTTS BULK, low sodlum, >200mg s | 2 McCain NoBid | NoBid HDIV/01_| MCCAIN FOODS INC, #OIF00215A, 6/5LB. 01214 $3339 190 $0.18 _|NoBid $ #DIV/0!_| simplot 1007179004189 | $27.42 #DIV/0!_| MCCAIN 5100938| 4814 6 8.02
148 | POTATO, ROUNDS,wedges BULK, low sodium, >200mg % |2 NoBid _|Nosid #DV/01 INC, 6/5t8 403701 $3864 165 $0.23 |Nosid #0V/01_|simplot 1007179036722 $29.71 #OV/0!_|sYS IMP 2000812) 4641 6 7.74
149 [ POTATO, HASHBROWN, PATTY BULK, low sodium 20 |1 NoBid_|NoBid #DIV/0!_| MCCAIN FOODS ING, 6/518 406308 $43.76 189 $023 | NoBid #DV/0! s #ov/01_|sys iMp 5021210 5235 12 4.36
150 | POTATO, CURLY FRIES BULK, low sodium, >200mg % |2 NoBid _|Nosid #DIV/01 NO BID HVALUE! | No Bid #0V/01_|simplot 10071179042860| $33.62 #oV/01_|svs ivp 1999006| 44,97 6 7.50
151 | PRETZEL DOG, 2 OZ BEEF FRANK %:fnﬁrg;g:n';z“;/%:a e 2 | 2 |Michael®sPOBALS NoBid _|NoBid HDIV/OL_| MICHAEL B'S BESTWAY, #PDBA46, 60/4.4602 | 134464 $85.65 2 $143 | Nogid HDV/0!_| Michael B's PDBA4E $83.70 60|  $139|MICHLB 7027496| 7021 60 117
52 st oo azozasssenank | CHREORR, L 0P e 2 | 2 [wicnaelmsposses Nosia_|nosia s |wichast s aestway seomses, sosscor ueons | ssozs | w0 | 100 [nowm #0901 _|ihaet s Pouses sr| oo i/ wenie s wm| @l 117
153 | PUPUSA, BEAN AND CHEESE BULK, 2 2 |DelReal No Bid No Bid #DIV/0! | DEL REAL, #705, 8/5CT 303556 $50.14 40 $1.25 | NoBid #DIV/0! | Del Real 705| $49.23 80 $0.62| DELREAL 3346691 51.61 8 6.45
154 | PUPUSA, CHORIZO AND CHEESE BULK, 2 | 2 |DelReal NoBid _|NoBid #DIV/0!_| DEL REAL, 1748, 8/5CT 149262 $50.71 a0 $137 | Nosid #DV/0!_| el Real 748| $53.66 80|  $067|GRUPO 3690718 NO BID 48| #VALUE!
155 | PUPUSA, CHICKEN AND CHEESE BULK, 2 | 2 |DelReal NoBid | NoBid #DIV/0! | DEL REAL, #749, 8/1.6607 8D $55.65 8 $696 | Nogid #DIV/0! | Del Real 749 $54.58 80|  $068|GRUPO 3687128 7073 48 147
156 ROLL, BAVARIAN PRETZEL W, 51% whole gr¢ 00 per case 2 Bavarian Bakery 9549 No Bid No Bid #DIV/0! NO BID HVALUE! | No Bid #DIV/0! S #DIV/0! | J&) SNK 7098144 | DISC 100 | #VALUE!
157 |t BEEEAND W, whole grain, W w2 NoBid__|NoBid 4DIV/0!_| TASTY BRANDS, #70076, 72/4.602 405590 485,83 7 5119 |NoBid so1v/0! $ #o1v/0!_| kS 406957 6474 00| 065
158 st e | wholegran 1000) 2 | 2 |integrated NoBid | NoBid HDIV/0!_| INTEGRATED, #134000, 72/4.190Z 406532 $61.10 7 $0.85 | NoBid #DIV/0!_|Integrated 134000| $60.96 72| $0.85|HOTOFFG 8836296 59 7 0.82
159 | SANDWICH, ITALIAN 1w, whole grain 002 | 2 NoBid _|Nosid #DIV/OL_| TASTY BRANDS, #70014, 72/4.50Z 403862 $86.75 7 $1.20 |Nosid #0V/01 | Tasty Brand 70014| $84.22 7 $1.17| TASTY B 2713092| 8662 7 1.20
160 | SANDWICH, PANCAKE AND SAUSAGE | W, whole grain, , 2.5 oz, 120 per case 1 | 1 [BakeCrafters 1224 NoBid |NoBid HDIV/O!_| BAKE CRAFTERS, #9125, 168/2.5 137923 51333 | 168 $0.85 | NoBid #DIV/0! s #DIV/0!_|BAKCRFT 3119003 137.95 168 0.82
161 | SANDWICH, PEANUT BUTTER W/JELLY | IW, whole grain, strawberry, thow &serve | 100 | 1 | 1 _|Smuckers, Advanced Pierre NoBid__|NosBid #DIV/OL_| SMUCKERS, 72/2.602 404615 $48.13 7 $0.67 | NoBid #0V/01_|smuckers 150006961| $46.73 7 $0.65| SMUCKER 203465| 4519 7 0.63
162 | SANDWICH, PEANUT BUTTER W/JELLY | W, whole grain, grape, thaw & serve 100 | 1 Albies NoBid | NoBid HDIV/OL_| SMUCKERS, 72/2.602 404614 $46.10 7 $0.64 | No Bid #DIV/0!_|smuckers $44.76 72| 5062| SMUCKER mms3| 4317 7 0.60
163 | SANDWICH, SOYBUTTER W/JELLY 1W, whoe grain, 2.402, thaw & serve 00| 1| 1 NoBid _|Nosid #DIV/OL_| ALBIES FOODS, #607, 72/2.407 134543 $56.42 n 5078 |NoBid #0IV/0!_|sunwise 12258 $75.50 9|  $079| ALBIES 7154794] 4489 40 112
164 mm‘é‘s T SO [ e e e Integrated NoBid | Noid #ov/0! NO BID HVALUE! | No Bid #oivjol s #DIV/0!_| BAKCRFT 7028433 | DISC 48| #VALUE!
165 | SANDWICH, TURKEY AND CHEESE Kfif o Lo owolan ol gyt NoBid _|Nosid #DIV/O!_|INTEGRATED, #130018, 100/3.102 405420 $75.50 100 $0.76 | Nosid #0IV/0!_|integrated 130018| $74.97 100|  $0.75| HOTOFFG 3975673 72.81 100 0.73
166 tpge e W, whole grain, M, wedge wojz )2 NoBid _|NoBid HDIV/OL_| TASTY BRANDS, #70013, 72/4.50Z 404020 $84.50 7 $117 | Nogid #DV/0!_| Tasty Brand 70013| $82.12 7 $1.14| TASTY B 2805687 7 111
167 | SAUCE, ALFREDO BULK 300 Foothill Farms NoBid _|Nosid #DIV/OL_|JTM, #5722, 6/51B 03777 $66.19 262 $025 | Nogid s/l |iTm 5722| $64.26 262 $0.25| AREZIMP 6525117 4 1548
168 | SAUCE, GENERAL TSO BULK, boilin a bag 300 ™ NoBid | NoBid #DIV/OL_| 1T, #73450, 6/518 113337 $64.27 480 013 |NoBid s/ |im 73850 $55.25 480|  s012|MINOR 6031741 59.15 4| 1479
169 [ SAUCE, SWEET TERIVAKI BULK, boil in a bag 100 No Bid No Bid #DIV/O! | ITM, #73470, 6/5L8 113340 $64.90 480 $0.14 | NoBid #DIV/0!_[1TM 73470| $60.40 480 $0.13| KIKOMAN 4232682 4523 6 7.54
170 | SAUSAGE, ITALIAN, GROUND, SPICY o ;:;ec:’i”;;’z;:f” rotneedtobe NoBid__|NoBid #DIV/0! NO BID VALUE! | No Bid o0 s #DIV/0!_[SILVA 3157217) 4096 2| 2048

BULK, fully cooked, smoked flavor, mini
171 | SAUSAGE, LINKS, PORK AND BEEF links, serving not to exceed 200 calories, 2 | 2 |TysonHillshire 10000031196

low sodium NoBid | NoBid HDIV/O!_| HILLSHIRE FARMS, #31196/417241, 4/3L8 130134 MFG DISC AVALUE! | No Bid #DIV/0!_| Tyson Hilshire 100000031196 $25.83 23| $112| HLSHIRE 1223734 2528 4 6.32
172 | SCONES, BLUEBERRY BULK, 3.7502, 96 each per case 10 NoBid | NoBid DIV/OL_| FAT CAT BAKER 268, 96/302 140682 $50.56 9% $0.53 | Nosid #ov/o1 $- #DIV/0!_|PILLSBY 779330] 6524 9% 0.68
173 | SCONES, CHOCOLATE CHUNK BULK, 3.750z, 96 each per case 10 No Bid No Bid HDIV/O! _| FAT CAT BAKERY, #WGCC96-2GB, 96/30Z 140683 $50.56 9% $0.53 | NoBid #DIV/0! $- #DIV/O! | PILLSBY 4696: 81.89 96 0.85
174 | SCONES, CINNAMON BULK, 3.7502, 96 each per case 10 NoBid _|Nosid #DIV/OL_| FAT CAT BAKER 196-268, 96/302 140677 $50.56 % $0.53 | Nosid #0Iv/o1 $- #DIV/OL_|PILLSBY 774992 6448 % 0.67
175 | SCONES, CRANBERRY BULK, 3.750z, 96 each per case 10 NoBid | NoBid HDIV/OL_| FAT CAT BAKERY, #WGCRNS6-2GB, 96/30Z | 140678 $50.56 9% $0.53 _|NoBid #DIV/0! $- #DIV/0!_|PILLSBY 76328 6572 96 0.68
176 | SCONES, LEMON BULK, 3.7502, 96 each per case 10 Bakers Crafters NoBid _|Nosid #DIV/OL_| FAT CAT BAKER 268, 96/302 | 140679 $50.56 % $0.53 | Nosid V01 $- #DIV/0!_|PILLSBY 5285073 648 % 0.67
177 | SPAGHETTI, MEAT SAUCE, CHEESE BULK, whole grain pasta 000 2 | 2 NoBid _|NoBid HDIV/OL_|JTM, #CP5590, 6/518. 401074 $8151 64 $1.27 _|Nosid #oIv/o1 s- #oV/0L_IT™ 1634908 | DISC 40| #VALUE!
178 | SWEET BREAD, CONCHA IW, 2.250z, whole grain 1000 | 2 No Bid No Bid #DIV/0! | LUPITAS, #1450, 84/2.250Z 133841 $43.43 84 $0.52 | No Bid #DIV/0! $- #DIV/0! | MICHL B 7117347 4295 85 0.51
179 | TACO STICK, CHICKEN, CHILI BULK, whole grain, 2 | 2 |[Tyson, Statefair 10245690821 NoBid__|NoBid #DIV/0! | TYSON, #10245690821, 72/3.4507 140061 MFG DISC HVALUE! | No Bid #ovjor $- #DIV/0!_|ST FAIR 2962452 35.11 7 0.49
180 | TACO STICK, BEEF BULK, whole grain, beef and cheese 1000 [ 2 Integrated No Bid No Bid #DIV/0! | INTEGRATED , #C45019, 50/4.60Z 400946 $43.46 50 50.87 | NoBid #DIV/0! _|Integrated 270019 $47.83 50 $0.96| IFS 6453908 36.33 50 0.73
181 | TAMALE, CHICKEN, GREEN SAUCE BULK, must meet 2g & 2 m/ma 25 | 2 2 |Michael B's, Posada No Bid No Bid #DIV/0! | MICHAEL B'S BESTWAY, #TAC30, 72/5.50Z TBD. $91.28 72 $1.27 | NoBid #DIV/0! | Michael B's TAC30 $78.46 72 $1.09| MICHL B 7135695 87.85 72 122
182 | TAMALE, BEEF, RED SAUCE BULK, must meet 2g & 2 m/ma 25 | 2 | 2 |MichaelB', Posada NoBid | Nogid HDIV/0! | MICHAEL B'S BESTWAY, #TAC32, 72/5.502 404391 $91.28 ” $127 | Nosgid #DIV/0! | Michael B's A2 $78.46 72| s109|MicHLB 3901727 8333 7 116
15 | HOMORNDw 2d0n wholegron B L] L |Poseda NoBid__|NoBid #DIV/O! | INTEGRATED, #180021, 100/2.40Z 406514 56242 100 5062 |NoBid #01V/0!_|Posada 46580011 | $53.90 40| $039|pOsADA 4897373 |NO BID 4| #VALUE!
184 | TAQUITO, CHICKEN AND CHEESE BULK, 4.40z, whole grain, fully cooked 1000 | 2 | 2 |Ruiz NoBid _|NoBid #DIV/O!_| RUIZ, #86747, 144/2.7902 141065 $89.67 128 $0.62_|NoBid #DV/0!_|Ruiz 86737| $1685 24| s0.70| MICHLB 7027487| 6037 s0 121
185 | TEXAS TOAST, GARLIC BULK, whole grain, , 1.31 0z 1 Bake Crafters 1605 NoBid _|Nosid #DIV/O!_| BAKE CRAFTERS, #1605, 120/1.3107 134558 53371 120 5028 |Nosid #0Iv/o1 s #DIV/0_| BAKCRET 7838026 120 0.28
186 | TORNDADO, CHICKEN BULK No Bid No Bid #DIV/0! | RUIZ, #86737, 24/302 T8D $19.02 24 $0.79 | NoBid #DIV/0! | Ruiz 86737| $16.85 24 $0.70| RUIZ 7055609 144 0.64
187 | TORNADO, BEEF RANCHERO BULK NoBid _|NoBid #DIV/0!_|RUIZ, #86390, 24/302 8D $19.02 2 $079 | Nogid #0V/01_|Ruiz 86390| $16.85 2| s070|RUIZ 7055606 144 0.64
188 | TORTILLA, FLOUR, 8' BULK, 2 NoBid | NoBid HDIV/OL_| PAPAPITA BAKERY, #5594, 12/24CT 144582 $25.74 288 $0.09|La Tapatia Tortillera, Inc. | 8"Flour Tortila #882522 $18.00|9 pghs./20|  $2.00 $- #DIV/0!_|CASACLS 2386142 1 156
189 | TORTILLA, FLOUR, 8 BULK, WG 2 No Bid No Bid #DIV/0! | PAPAPITA BAKERY, #5594, 12/24CT 144582 $25.74 288 50.09 _|La Tapatia Tortilleria, Inc. | 8" Whole Wheat Tortilla #882702 $25.20 |18 pgks./ 1( $1.40 $- #DIV/0! | MISSION 2593846 24 1.70
190 | TORTILLA, CORN, 8" BULK 2 NoBid _|NoBid #DIV/0! NO BID HVALUE! | No Bid HDIV/O! $- #DIV/0!_| LA BAND 986457 6 3.35
191 | VEGETABLE, CALIFORNIA BLEND BULK, 10 No Bid No Bid #DIV/0!__| READY FIX, #606, 1/20LB 101476 $26.86 106 $0.25 | NoBid #DIV/0! $- #DIV/0! | SYS IMP 1333178 6 5.65
192 | WAFFLE, DUTCH 1W,51% whole grain, 2 81 Snack Foods 4521 NoBid _|NoBid #DIV/OL_|J & J SNACK FOODS, #4521, 48/2.902 134761 $26.02 48 $0.54 | No Bid #DIV/O! _|J8J Snacks $25.27 a8 $0.53| J&J SNK. 3120252 2932 1 29.32
193 | WAFFLES, MINI IW, whole grain, heat in bag 100 | 2 Kellogg's No Bid No Bid #DIV/0! | EGGO, #38000-92315, 72/2.650Z 134285 $31.12 72 5043 |NoBid #DIV/0! | Kelloggs $30.22 72 $0.42| PILLSBY 2173379, 0.93 72 0.43
194 |YOGURT, FROZEN IW, 4oz, 48 per case, various flavors Menchie's, NoBid _|Nosid #DIV/0! | MENCHIES, 48/402 8D $35.46 8 $0.74_|Nosid #0Iv/o1 $ #DIV/0!_| DANNON 8653952 123 48 0.23
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