TABULATION FOR BIDS
#23-DES-ITB-164

BIDS were opened by Rebecca Kirby, Procurement Officer, at
11:00 A.M. on October 26, 2022

BIDDER NAMES

Tech?\ooll‘t:?iles of Techizl:::iles of Econolite Control] Econolite Control Gener.al Traffic Gener‘al Traffic MoboTrex MoboTrex Traffic Systems Traffic Systems LLC
Central FL, Inc. | Central FL, Inc. Products Products Equipment Equipment LLC
SECTION | - Testing Services & Equipment SECTION | - Testing Services & Equipment

Test Equipment ESTQTY| UNIT Test Equipment
1 Cabinet Test Display 10 EA NO BID NO BID $ 1,185.00 [ $ 11,850.00 | NO BID NO BID $ 740.00 | $ 7,400.00 | NO BID NO BID
2 Handheld Loop Test Kit 5 EA NO BID NO BID $ 4,177.00 [ $ 20,885.00 | NO BID NO BID $ 3,200.00| $ 16,000.00 | NO BID NO BID
3 BIU Tester with Carrying Case 2 EA NO BID NO BID $ 8,008.00 (% 16,016.00 | NO BID NO BID $ 6,200.00 | $ 12,400.00 | NO BID NO BID
4 |Tester Carrying Case 2 EA NO BID NO BID RS 52100 (5% 704.00 [ NO BID NO BID $ 300.00 | $ 600.00 [ NO BID NO BID
5 [Virtual Test Cabinet 5 EA NO BID NO BID $ 4,309.00 [ $ 21,545.00 | NO BID NO BID $ 3,300.00| $ 16,500.00 | NO BID NO BID

Testing Services Testing Services
6 Re-certifiction of Conflict Monitor Tester 2 EA NO BID NO BID $ 850.00 [$ 1,700.00 [ NO BID NO BID $ 805.00 | $ 1,610.00 | NO BID NO BID
7 Re-certification of High Density Switch Pack Tester 2 EA NO BID NO BID $ 555.00 [$ 1,110.00 [ NO BID NO BID $ 515.00 | $ 1,030.00 | NO BID NO BID
8 Re-certifiction of BIU Tester 1 EA NO BID NO BID $ 520.00 | $ 520.00 [ NO BID NO BID $ 485.00 | $ 485.00 [ NO BID NO BID

Support Services Support Services
9 [Technical Support 30 HR NO BID NO BID $ 80.00 [ $ 2,400.00 [ NO BID NO BID $ 125.00 | $ 3,750.00 | NO BID NO BID

BID TOTALS FOR SECTION $76,730.00] $59,775.00)
SECTION Il - Cabinet Components and Replacement Parts SECTION Il - Cabinet Components and Replacement Parts
Cabinet Components and Parts Cabinet Components and Parts
1 Shelf Mount TS-2 Power Supply 50 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 570.00 | $ 28,500.00 | NO BID NO BID
2 Din Rail Mount Power Supply 100 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 725.00 |$ 72,500.00 | NO BID NO BID
3 EDI BIU 700 100 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 340.00 | $ 34,000.00 | NO BID NO BID
4 16 Channel TS2 Smart MMU with ethernet 10 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 1,155.00| $ 11,550.00 | NO BID NO BID
5 6 Channel TS1 Conflict Monitor with ethernet 10 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 1,040.00 | $ 10,400.00 | NO BID NO BID
6 3 Channel TS1 Conflict Monitor 10 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 730.00 | $ 7,300.00 [ NO BID NO BID
7 MMU Program Card 100 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 80.00 | $ 8,000.00 [ NO BID NO BID
8 MMU Program Card with dip switches for testing purposes 20 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 260.00 | $ 5,200.00 [ NO BID NO BID
9 Load Switch /O style 100 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 32.00 [ $ 3,200.00 [ NO BID NO BID
10 [Flash Transfer Relay with power LED 100 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 30.00 | $ 3,000.00 [ NO BID NO BID
11 Flasher 100 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 40.00 | $ 4,000.00 | NO BID NO BID
12 |[Loop Surge Suppressor 50 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 15.00 | § 750.00 | NO BID NO BID
13 [INXT120NL000-1 Line Filter 50 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 45.00 | $ 2,250.00 [ NO BID NO BID
14 |[LF60X Line Filter 50 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 35.00 [ $ 1,750.00 | NO BID NO BID
15 |LF60 Line Filter 50 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 48.00 | $ 2,400.00 [ NO BID NO BID
16 |HE1750 Surge Suppressor ( with socket) 50 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 160.00 | $ 8,000.00 [ NO BID NO BID
17 |HE1750 Surge Suppressor ( without socket) 50 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 120.00 | § 6,000.00 [ NO BID NO BID
18 |ACP-340 Surge Suppressor 50 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 80.00 | $ 4,000.00 | NO BID NO BID
19 |SHP300-10 Surge Suppressor 50 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 43.00 | $ 2,150.00 [ NO BID NO BID
20 |Solid State Load Relay 50 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 58.00 [ $ 2,900.00 [ NO BID NO BID
21 |16-Channel Detector Rack _ 50 EA |NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 15500 |$  7,750.00 | NOBID NO BID
(includes 2 additional slots for preemption)
22 |Cabinet Drawer Shelf 50 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 180.00 | $ 9,000.00 | NO BID NO BID
23 |Power Strip for Top Cabinet Shelf 40" with 10' cord 50 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 115.00 | $ 5,750.00 | NO BID NO BID
24 |Cabinet Handle with Integrated Lock 5 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 550.00 | $ 2,750.00 | NO BID NO BID
25 |Power Strip for Top Cabinet Shelf 30" with 6' cord 50 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 115.00 | $ 5,750.00 | NO BID NO BID
26 |Generator Plug 50 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 70.00 [ $ 3,500.00 | NO BID NO BID
27 |Police Switch (RJ45) 50 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 80.00 | $ 4,000.00 | NO BID NO BID
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TABULATION FOR BIDS
#23-DES-ITB-164

BIDS were opened by Rebecca Kirby, Procurement Officer, at
11:00 A.M. on October 26, 2022

BIDDER NAMES
Tech?\ooll‘t:?iles of Techizl:::iles of Econolite Control] Econolite Control Gener'al Traffic Gener.al Traffic MoboTrex MoboTrex Traffic Systems Traffic Systems LLC
Central FL, Inc. | Central FL, Inc. Products Products Equipment Equipment LLC
28 |Plexiglass Power Panel Cover A 50 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 50.00 | $ 2,500.00 | NO BID NO BID
29 |Plexiglass Power Panel Cover B 50 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 50.00 [ $ 2,500.00 | NO BID NO BID
30 |Plexiglass Power Panel Cover C 50 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 50.00 [ $ 2,500.00 | NO BID NO BID
31 |Plexiglass Power Panel Cover D 50 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 50.00 [ $ 2,500.00 | NO BID NO BID
32 |8 Position SDLC Hub 25 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 112.00 | $ 2,800.00 | NO BID NO BID
33 |6' SDLC Cable (Clips on both ends) 100 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 70.00 [ $ 7,000.00 | NO BID NO BID
34 |6' SDLC Cable (Clips on one end screws on opposite end) 100 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 70.00 [ $ 7,000.00 | NO BID NO BID
35 |Pack of 50 Cabinet Spring Nuts 20 EA__|NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 130.00 |$  2,600.00 | NO BID NO BID
GRAND TOTAL FOR SECTION $285,750.00)
SECTION lil - Lead Acid Battery Backup System SECTION lil - Lead Acid Battery Backup System
Lead Acid UPS Assembly
1 (includes mounting rack,automatic transfer switch, RBMS, cables ,and batteries) 20 EA $4,940.00 $98,800.00| NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2 UPS Module 20 EA $1,410.00f  $28,200.00{ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3 UPS Battery Package (4 pack) 20 EA $1,492.00f $29,840.00| NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
4 Remote Battery Management System 100 EA $755.00] $75,500.00] NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
5 Network Card 20 EA $168.00 $3,360.00( NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
6 Cable Assembly 20 EA $261.00 $5,220.00f NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
7 Generator Transfer Switch 20 EA $265.00 $5,300.00f NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
8 |Automatic Transfer Switch 20 EA $327.00 $6,540.00( NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
9 |ATS Mounting Rack (19" Rack) 100 EA $103.00] $10,300.00] NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
10 [UPS Module Mounting Kit. 25 EA $50.00 $1,250.00( NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
11 [Temperature Sensor 20 EA $52.00 $1,040.00{ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
12 [Battery Tester 10 EA $3,560.00/ $35,600.00( NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
13 [Cabinet Enclosure 20 EA $2,700.00f $54,000.00f NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Support Services Support Services
14 [Technical Support 30 HR $175.00 $5,250.00] NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
GRAND TOTAL FOR SECTION $360,200.00]
SECTION IV - Nickel Zinc Battery Backup System SECTION IV - Nickel Zinc Battery Backup System
Nickel Zinc UPS Assembly
1 (includes UPS Module, mounting rack, Power interface module, Intelligent 20 EA NO BID NO BID $ 11,170.00 | $223,400.00 | NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 13,097.50 $261,950.00
Management System, cables ,and 4 batteries)
Nickel Zinc Compact UPS Assembly
2 (includes UPS module, mounting rack, Power interface module, cables 20 EA NO BID NO BID $ 10,460.00 | $209,200.00 | NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 12,408.50 $248,170.00|
,and two (500 watt) batteries)
3 UPS module 10 EA NO BID NO BID $ 3,557.00 [ $ 35,570.00 | NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 3,633.50 $36,335.00)
4 Intelligent Management System 10 EA NO BID NO BID $ 3,794.00 [ $ 37,940.00 [ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $  3,588.00 $35,880.00)
5 Nickel Zinc 1kw Battery Package (4 pack) 10 EA NO BID NO BID $ 4,739.00 [ $ 47,390.00 | NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $  4,927.00 $49,270.00)
6 Nickel Zinc 500 watt shelf mount battery 10 EA NO BID NO BID $ 3,731.00 [ $ 37,310.00 [ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 3,815.50 $38,155.00)
7 Nickel Zinc 500 watt panel battery 10 EA NO BID NO BID $ 3,731.00 [ $ 37,310.00 [ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 3,815.50 $38,155.00)
8 Battery charger cable 10 EA NO BID NO BID $ 30.64 [ $ 306.40 | NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 71.50 $715.00
9 Spacer bar 10 EA NO BID NO BID $ 18.56 | $ 185.60 | NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 52.00 $520.00
10 [Speedy Sleeve 10 EA NO BID NO BID $ 29.13 | $ 291.30 | NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 65.00 $650.00
11 [Battery Tester 10 EA NO BID NO BID $ 2509 | $ 250.90 | NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 71.50 $715.00
12 [Cable Assembly 10 EA NO BID NO BID $ 53.26 [ $ 532.60 [ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 416.00 $4,160.00
Support Services Support Services
13 [Technical Support 30 HR [ NOBID NO BID $ 80.00 | $ 2,400.00 | NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 130.00 $390.00
GRAND TOTAL FOR SECTION $632,086.80) $715,065.00
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BIDS were opened by Rebecca Kirby, Procurement Officer, at

TABULATION FOR BIDS
#23-DES-ITB-164

11:00 A.M. on October 26, 2022

BIDDER NAMES

Tech?\ooll‘t:?iles of Techizl:::iles of Econolite Control] Econolite Control Gener'al Traffic Gener.al Traffic MoboTrex MoboTrex Traffic Systems Traffic Systems LLC
Central FL, Inc. | Central FL, Inc. Products Products Equipment Equipment LLC
SECTION V - Medeco Intelligent Key Systems SECTION V - Medeco Intelligent Key Systems
1 Medeco XT Slimline B Key 20 EA $ 243.00 [$ 4,860.00 [ NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2 Medeco XT Traffic Cabinet Lock 100 EA $ 390.00 [ $ 39,000.00 [ NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3 Medeco XT Traffic Cabinet Lock Core 50 EA $ 380.00 | $ 19,000.00 | NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
4 Medeco XT Cam Lock 15 EA $ 334.00 | $ 5,010.00 | NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
5 Medeco XT Rim & Mortise Cylinder 3 EA $ 325.00 [$ 975.00 [ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
6 Medeco XT Padlock 100 EA $ 485.00 [ $ 48,500.00 [ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
7 Medeco XT Intelligent Key Cabinet 2 EA $ 24,640.00 | $ 49,280.00 | NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
8 Medeco XT Remote Programming Device 100 EA $ 1,711.00 | $171,100.00 | NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
9 USB Desktop Programming Station 5 EA $ 382.00 |$ 1,910.00 | NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
10 |Annual Cloud Maintenance 1 EA $ 3,380.00|$ 3,380.00 | NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Support Services Support Services
11 |Technical Support | 30 HR 8§ 17800 |8 526000 | NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
GRAND TOTAL FOR SECTION $348,265.00]
SECTION VI - Traffic Signals and Mounting Equipment SECTION VI - Traffic Signals and Mounting Equipment
Signals Signals

1 |3Section Red-Yellow-Green Signal 50 EA |NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 37200 |$ 1860000 |$ 575.00 |$  28,750.00 | NOBID NO BID

(incl. housing and LED modules)

4-Section Flashing Yellow Arrow Signal
2 (incl. housing andgLED modules) 9 50 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 469.00 | $ 23,450.00 ($ 750.00 | $ 37,500.00 | NO BID NO BID

HAWK Signal
3 ) . 20 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 689.00 ($ 13,780.00 [ $ 1,060.00|$ 21,200.00 | NO BID NO BID

(incl. housing and LED modules)
4 |3 Section Programmable Visibility Signal (includes housing, 5 EA |NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 340000 ($ 17,000.00 |$ 350000|$ 17,500.00 | NOBID NO BID

LED's, and lenses)
5 |5-Section (Dog House/Cluster Style) Signal 10 EA |NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 849.00 [$ 8490.00 |$ 1,200.00($  12,000.00 | NOBID NO BID

(incl. housing, hardware, and LED modules)
6 5 Section Inline Signal head. (incl. housing and LED modules) 10 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 659.00 |$ 6,590.00 | $ 925.00 | $ 9,250.00 | NO BID NO BID
7 Aeroflex High Visibility Backplate for 3-Section head 200 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ - 13 - |$ 162.00 [$  32,400.00 [ NO BID NO BID
8 Aeroflex High Visibility Backplate for 4-Section head 100 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ - |3 - |$ 183.00 [$  18,300.00 [ NO BID NO BID
9 Aeroflex High Visibility Backplate for 5-Section head 100 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ - 1% - $ 190.00 | $ 19,000.00 | NO BID NO BID
10 [12" LED Red Signal module 400 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 29.00 | $ 11,600.00 | $ 65.00 | $ 26,000.00 | NO BID NO BID
11 12" LED Yellow Signal module (Energy Efficient) 400 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 29.00 | $ 11,600.00 | $ 65.00 | $  26,000.00 | NO BID NO BID
12 [12" LED Green Signal module (Energy Efficient) 400 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 29.00 | $ 11,600.00 | $ 65.00 | $  26,000.00 | NO BID NO BID
13 [12" LED Red Arrow Signal module (Energy Efficient) 150 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 3250 [$ 4,875.00 | $ 65.00 | $ 9,750.00 | NO BID NO BID
14 [12" LED Yellow Arrow Signal module (Energy Efficient) 150 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 3250 [$ 4,875.00 | $ 65.00 | $ 9,750.00 | NO BID NO BID
15 [12" LED Green Arrow Signal module (Energy Efficient) 150 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 3250 |$ 4,875.00 [ $ 65.00 | $ 9,750.00 | NO BID NO BID
16 [12" LED Transit Stop Signal module (Energy Efficient) 150 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 165.00 | $ 24,750.00 | $ 65.00 | $ 9,750.00 | NO BID NO BID
17 |[12" LED Transit Yellow Arrow Signal module (Energy Efficient) 150 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 165.00 | $ 24,750.00 | $ 65.00 | $ 9,750.00 | NO BID NO BID
18 [12" LED Green Arrow Signal module (Energy Efficient) 150 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 3250 [ $ 4,875.00 | $ 65.00 | $ 9,750.00 | NO BID NO BID
19 (8" LED Red Signal module (Energy Efficient) 25 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 3250 [ $ 812.50 [ $ 50.00 [ $ 1,250.00 | NO BID NO BID
20 |8" LED Yellow Signal module (Energy Efficient) 25 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 3250 | $ 812.50 | $ 50.00 [ $ 1,250.00 [ NO BID NO BID
21 8" LED Green Signal module (Energy Efficient) 25 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 3250 | $ 812.50 | $ 50.00 [ $ 1,250.00 | NO BID NO BID
22 |Programmable visibility Red LED module (Energy Efficient) 20 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 85.00 [ $ 1,700.00 | $ 95.00 [ $ 1,900.00 | NO BID NO BID
23 |Programmable visibility Yellow LED module (Energy Efficient) 20 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 85.00 [$ 1,700.00 [ $ 95.00 [ $ 1,900.00 | NO BID NO BID
24 |Programmable visibility Green LED module (Energy Efficient) 20 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 85.00 | $ 1,700.00 [ $ 95.00 [ $ 1,900.00 [ NO BID NO BID
25 |3 bolt head connector set 100 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 10.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 15.00 | $ 1,500.00 | NO BID NO BID
26 |5 Position Terminal Bar 100 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 8.00 | $ 800.00 | $ 25.00 | $ 2,500.00 | NO BID NO BID
27 |Signal Visor 50 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 20.00 [ $ 1,000.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 1,000.00 | NO BID NO BID
28 |Louvers with visor 50 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 120.00 [$ 6,000.00 [$ 200.00 | $ 10,000.00 | NO BID NO BID
29 |Backplate Screws (Pack of 25) 25 Pack | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 4.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 15.00 | $ 375.00 | NO BID NO BID
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TABULATION FOR BIDS
#23-DES-ITB-164

BIDS were opened by Rebecca Kirby, Procurement Officer, at
11:00 A.M. on October 26, 2022

BIDDER NAMES
Control Control " " " " 3
Technologles of | Technologies of Econolite Control] Econolite Control Gener'al Traffic Gener.al Traffic MoboTrex MoboTrex Traffic Systems Traffic Systems LLC
Products Products Equipment Equipment LLC
Central FL, Inc. | Central FL, Inc.

30 |Tunnel Visor Screws ( pack of 25) 25 | Pack |NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 400 |$ 100.00|$ 1500 |$ 375.00 | NO BID NO BID
31 |Pedestrian Signal (including countdown LED Module) 100 EA | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 272.00 | $ 27,200.00 [$ 450.00 [ $ 45,000.00 | NO BID NO BID
32 E;ge;t::;;'g"a' with clamshell mount (including countdown 100 EA |NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $  306.00 |$ 30,600.00 |$ 460.00 |$  46,000.00 | NO BID NO BID
33 |Ped Head Egg Crate Visor 100 EA |NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 3200 |$ 320000|% 2200 |$  2,200.00 | NOBID NO BID
34 |16" Pedestrian LED module (Countdown) 100 EA |NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $  122.00 | $ 12,200.00 |$  190.00 |$ _ 19,000.00 | NO BID NO BID
35 |Audible Pedestrian Cuckoo Signal (US Traffic APS10 or Equal) 10 EA | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 43500 |$ 4,350.00 |$  430.00 |$ _ 4,300.00 | NO BID NO BID
36 |Programmable Visibility Signal Masking Kit 10 EA_|NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ B - |[$  300.00 [$  3000.00 | NOBID NO BID

SUB-TOTAL $285,797.50 $477,100.00

Mounting Equipment Mounting Equipment

37 |Spanwire Signal Mounting Hardware 50 EA |NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 8500 |$ 425000 % 127.00 |$  6,350.00 | NO BID NO BID
38 |Mast Arm Mount for 3-Section Signal Head 100 EA | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $  128.00 | $ 12,800.00 |$  250.00 | $ _ 25,000.00 | NO BID NO BID
39 |Mast Arm Mount for 4-Section Signal Head 50 EA | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $  150.00 |$ 7,500.00 |$  270.00 | $  13,500.00 | NO BID NO BID
40 |Mast Arm Mount for HAWK Signal Head 50 EA | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $  318.00 | $ 15900.00 |$  370.00 | $  18,500.00 | NO BID NO BID
41 |Mast Arm Mount for 5-Section Doghouse/Cluster Signal Head 50 EA | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $  246.00 | $ 12,300.00 |$  375.00 |$  18,750.00 | NO BID NO BID
42 gg;x?:’n:/:;')de Signal Mount (Post Mount with Terminal 50 EA |NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 186.00 [$ 9,300.00 |$ 250.00 |$  12,500.00 | NO BID NO BID
43 g:em.x?ny::tl)de Signal Mount (Post Mount without Terminal 50 EA |NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 4500 |$ 2250.00 |$ 22000 [$  11,000.00 | NO BID NO BID
44 (T;‘;":le{m\ﬁ:;c'e Signal Mount (Side Mount with Terminal 50 EA |NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 36500 |$ 1840000 |$ 333.00 |$  16,650.00 | NOBID NO BID
45 Z‘Z;’:)’:’:tymve‘::;c'e Signal Mount (Side Mount without Terminal 50 EA |NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 186.00 |$ 9,300.00 |$ 265.00 |$ 13,250.00 | NO BID NO BID
46 S:;;’:ft‘:n':ﬁ)es"'a" Signal Mount (Post Mount with terminal 50 EA |NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 176.00 [$ 880000 |$ 220.00 |$  11,000.00 | NOBID NO BID
47 Ix’n‘:;)v:;‘r’n::)es"'a" Signal Mount (Post Mount with terminal 50 EA |NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 358.00 |$ 17,900.00 |$ 400.00 |$  20,000.00 | NO BID NO BID
48 S:;;’:ft‘:n':ﬁ)es"'a" Signal Mount (Post Mount without terminal | EA |NOBID NO BID NOBID  |NOBID $ 4500 |$ 225000 7000 |$  3,500.00 | NOBID NO BID
49 Ix’n‘:;)v:;‘r’n::)es"'a" Signal Mount (Post Mount without terminal 50 EA |NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 176.00 |$ 8800.00 |$ 240.00 |$ 12,000.00 | NO BID NO BID
50 S:;;’:ft‘:n':ﬁ)es"'a" Signal Mount (Side Mount with terminal 150 | EA |NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 286.00 |$ 4290000 |$ 225.00 |$  33,750.00 | NOBID NO BID
51 Ix’n‘:;)v:;‘r’n::)es"'a" Signal Mount (Side Mount with terminal 150 EA |NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 35200 |$ 52,800.00 |$ 380.00 |$ 57,000.00 | NO BID NO BID
52 |One-Way Pedestrian Signal Mount (Side Mount without terminal 50 EA |NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 8600 |$ 430000|$ 12000 |$  6,000.00 | NOBID NO BID

compartment)
53 Ix’n‘:;)v:;‘r’n::)es"'a" Signal Mount (Side Mount without terminal 50 EA |NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 228.00 |$ 11,400.00 |$ 22500 |$  11,250.00 | NO BID NO BID
54 |Post Top Slip Fitter Assembly, 1-way wi2 side ports 50 EA | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 8500 |$ 4,250.00 |$ 11000 |$ _ 5,500.00 | NO BID NO BID
55 |Post Top Signal Mounting Kit 50 EA | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 3800 |$ 190000 [$  38.00 [$ _ 1,900.00 | NO BID NO BID
56 |30" Paddle and Bracket for Sign Mounting 100 EA | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $  140.00 | $ 14,000.00 |$ _ 155.00 | $ _ 15,500.00 | NO BID NO BID
57 |36" Paddle and Bracket for Sign Mounting 100 EA | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $  150.00 | $ 15,000.00 |$  165.00 | $  16,500.00 | NO BID NO BID
58 |Band & Buckle Assembly (Black color) 100 EA | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ B - |$ 5000 [$ _ 5000.00 | NOBID NO BID
50 |Span Wire 2" Cable Ring 3000 | EA | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ B - [$  40.00 |$ 120,000.00 | NO BID NO BID
60 |Spanwire Sign Mounting Hardware 50 EA | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $  128.00 |$ 6,400.00 |$  100.00 | $ _ 5,000.00 | NO BID NO BID
g1 |LED Quick Change Kit (GBI QCK) 300 EA |NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 2600 |$ 7,80000|$ 3500 |$ 10,500.00 | NO BID NO BID

(3-Section head kit containing 12 clips and screws) 7 Vi i R

SUB-TOTAL $290,500.00 $469,900.00

GRAND TOTAL FOR SECTION $576,297.50] $947,000.00
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TABULATION FOR BIDS
#23-DES-ITB-164

BIDS were opened by Rebecca Kirby, Procurement Officer, at
11:00 A.M. on October 26, 2022

BIDDER NAMES
Control Control " " " " 3
Technologles of | Technologies of Econolite Control] Econolite Control Gener'al Traffic Gener.al Traffic MoboTrex MoboTrex Traffic Systems Traffic Systems LLC
Products Products Equipment Equipment LLC
Central FL, Inc. | Central FL, Inc.
SECTION VII - Pedestrian Pushbutton Systems SECTION VII - Pedestrian Pushbutton Systems

1 |APS System(includes 8 APS units, CCU, interace board, SDLC 40 EA |NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 6,985.00|$ 279,400.00 | NO BID NO BID

cable, PLC cable, logic ground cable, and power cable)
2 ﬁ::w‘;’a"rz()'"c'“des 9"x15" R10-3e sign, adapter plate, and 50 EA |NOBID NO BID NOBID  |NOBID NO BID NO BID $ 55500 |$  27,750.00 | NOBID NO BID

Shelf mount CCU( includes SDLC cable, power cable, PLC cable,
3 | ogic ground, and interface board) 20 EA |NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 2,650.00|$ 53,000.00 | NO BID NO BID
4 |RackMount CCU(includes SDLC cable, power cable, PLC cable, | 4, EA |NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 2,540.00|$  76,200.00 | NO BID NO BID

logic ground, and interface board)
5 |Interface Board 25 EA | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 9500 |$  2,375.00 | NO BID NO BID
6 |SDLC Cable with Ground 5 EA | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $  105.00 | $ 525.00 | NO BID NO BID
7 |PLC Cable 25 EA | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $  27.00 |$ 675.00 | NO BID NO BID
8 |CCU power cable 25 EA | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 3000 % 750.00 | NO BID NO BID
9 |9x15 adapter plate (includes hardware and R10-3e sign) 55 EA | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 130.00 |$ _ 7,150.00 | NO BID NO BID
10 |Logic Ground cable 20 EA | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 2500 % 500.00 | NO BID NO BID
11 |Adapter for two APS with 9x15 sign on 4.5 OD pole 5 EA | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 11500 | $ 575.00 | NO BID NO BID
12 |Fluted pole Monting Adapter 25 EA | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 8500 |$  2,125.00 | NO BID NO BID
13 |APS Mounting Extender (Black) 20 EA | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 180.00 |$ _ 3,600.00 | NO BID NO BID
14 |APS height reducing mounting extender (Black) 20 EA | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 22500 |$ _ 4,500.00 | NO BID NO BID
15 |Bi-directional Button Assembly 20 EA | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $  46.00 | $ 920.00 | NO BID NO BID
16 |Non Arrow Button Assembly 20 EA | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $  46.00 | $ 920.00 | NO BID NO BID
17 |APS Replacement Speaker 20 EA | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 4200 |$ 840.00 | NO BID NO BID
18 |Universal 90 degree adapter for APS (Black) 50 EA | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $  200.00 |$  10,000.00 | NO BID NO BID
19 |Mechnical Button 100 EA | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 10500 |$  10,500.00 | NO BID NO BID

Mechanical Button Mounting plate( includes 9x15 R10-3e sign and
20 h:r‘;;:r':; utton Mounting plate( includes 9x esiananti 400 | Ea |NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 13000 |$  13,000.00 | NOBID NO BID
21 |Technical Support 10 HR | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 12500 |$  1,250.00

GRAND TOTAL FOR SECTION $496,555.00
SECTION VIII - Beacons and Roadside Indicators SECTION VIl - Beacons and Roadside Indicators
School Beacons School Beacons

1 |School Flasher Assembly (AC Power) 5 EA | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 7,400.00] $ _ 37,000.00 | NO BID NO BID
2 |School Flasher Assembly (Solar Power) 10 EA | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 7,950.00|$  79,500.00 | NO BID NO BID
3 |Remote Monitoring Field Device 15 EA |NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 2,500.00|$ 37,500.00 | NO BID NO BID

(includes 5-years communications)
4 |Replacement Solar Panel 15 EA |NOBID NO BID NOBID  |NOBID NO BID NO BID $ 26000 |$  3,900.00 | NOBID NO BID

(includes mounting hardware)
5 |Replacement Battery 20 EA | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 35000 |$ _ 7,000.00 | NO BID NO BID
¢ |Replacement Control Box 10 EA |NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 220000|$ 22,000.00 [ NO BID NO BID

(includes mounting hardware)
7 |Replacement Single 12" LED Signal Housing (12V DC) 15 EA | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 220.00 |$ 3,300.00 | NO BID NO BID

SUB-TOTAL $190,200.00

Speed Feedback Indicators Speed Feedback Indicators

8 |Speed Feedback Assembly (Solar Power) (Al included) 8 EA_|NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 10,525.00] $__ 84,200.00 | NO BID NO BID
9 |Speed Feedback Assembly (AC Power) (Al included) 4 EA_|NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 9,475.00|$  37,900.00 | NO BID NO BID
10 |Replacement Solar Panel 10 EA |NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 37000 |$  3,700.00 | NO BID NO BID

(includes mounting hardware)
11 |Replacement Battery 10 EA | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 25000 |$ _ 3,500.00 | NO BID NO BID
12 |Replacement Control Box 5 EA |NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 2,730.00|$  13,650.00 | NO BID NO BID

(includes mounting hardware)
13 |Replacement Speed Radar Blank-out Assembly 5 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 3,850.00 | $ 19,250.00 | NO BID NO BID

SUB-TOTAL $162,200.00)
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TABULATION FOR BIDS
#23-DES-ITB-164

BIDS were opened by Rebecca Kirby, Procurement Officer, at
11:00 A.M. on October 26, 2022

BIDDER NAMES

Tech?\ooll‘;?iles of Techizl::;’iles of Eco:tg;euitosntrol Eco:tg;euitosntrol GeEr;eJia;;:ftﬁc GEEIE?;’::TC MoboTrex MoboTrex Traffi(l:féstems Traffic Systems LLC
Central FL, Inc. | Central FL, Inc.
Pedestrian Activated Rapid Flash Beacons (RRFB) Pedestrian Activated Rapid Flash Beacons (RRFB)
14 m’l’::j:'“h Beacon Assembly (AC Power, Double Sided) Al 10 EA |NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 7,050.00|$  70,500.00 | NO BID NO BID
15 Eac’l’l'l‘;:c'fs“ Beacon Assembly (Solar Power, Double Sided) Al 10 EA |NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 7,600.00|$  76,000.00 [ NO BID NO BID
46 |Smaller Factor Remote Monitoring Field Device 5 EA |NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 1,100.00|$  5,500.00 | NO BID NO BID
(includes 5-years communications)
17 |Replacement Solar Panel 10 EA |NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 28500 [$  2,850.00 | NO BID NO BID
18 |Replacement Battery 15 EA [NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 350.00 [$  5,250.00 [ NO BID NO BID
19 |Replacement Control Box 10 EA |NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 2,350.00|$  23,500.00 [ NO BID NO BID
(includes mounting hardware)
20 |Replacement Rectangular Rapid Flasher 15 EA [NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 770.00 [$ 11,550.00 [ NO BID NO BID
21 |ADA Pushbutton 15 EA | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $  695.00 |$ 10,425.00 [ NO BID NO BID
Technical Support Technical Support
22 |Technical Support 30 HR | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 12500 |$  3,750.00 | NO BID NO BID
SUB-TOTAL $209,325.00
GRAND TOTAL FOR SECTION $561,725.00
SECTION IX - Pedestal Poles SECTION IX - Pedestal Poles
Aluminum Pedestal Poles Aluminum Pedestal Poles
1 |11 Pedestal Pole 20 EA | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 97500 |$ 19,500.00 [ NO BID NO BID
2 [15' Pedestal Pole (Schedule 80) 75 EA | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 1,150.00 | $  86,250.00 [ NO BID NO BID
Replacement Parts Replacement Parts
3 |Pelco Pole Base 50 EA [NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 240.00 |$ 12,000.00 [ NO BID NO BID
4 |4"Pole Cap 50 EA [NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 3000 ($ 1,500.00 | NO BID NO BID
5 |Base Collar 50 EA [NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 105.00 |$  5,250.00 | NO BID NO BID
6 |Pole Base Coverplate (composite plastic) 100 EA [NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 4500 |$  4,500.00 [ NOBID NO BID
7 |Universal Signal pole Hand hole cover (Small) 100 EA [NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 4500 |$  4,500.00 [ NO BID NO BID
8 |Universal signal pole Hand hole cover (Large) 100 EA [NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 50.00 |$  5,000.00 | NOBID NO BID
9 |Replacement signal pole cap for pole outer Diameter 6"-7" 50 EA [NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 51.00 |$  2,550.00 | NOBID NO BID
10 |Replacement signal pole cap for pole outer Diameter 7"-8" 100 EA [NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 53.00 |$  5,300.00 | NOBID NO BID
11 |Replacement signal pole cap for pole outer Diameter 8"-9" 100 EA [NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 5500 |$  5,500.00 [ NOBID NO BID
12 |Replacement signal pole cap for pole outer Diameter 9"-10" 100 EA | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 57.00 |$  5,700.00 | NOBID NO BID
13 [Replacement signal pole cap for pole outer Diameter 10"-11" 50 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 123.00 | $ 6,150.00 | NO BID NO BID
14 |Replacement signal pole cap for pole outer Diameter 11"-12" 25 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 135.00 | $ 3,375.00 | NO BID NO BID
GRAND TOTAL FOR SECTION $167,075.00
SECTION X - Blank-out LED Sign SECTION X - Blank-out LED Sign
1 [36" x 36" R3-1 or R3-2 LED Blank Out Sign 10 EA [NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 3,500.00[$ 35,000.00 [$ 5,258.50 $52,585.00)
2 30" x 36" BUS LANE ONLY LED Blank Out Sign 10 EA [NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 3,450.00[$ 34,500.00 [$ 7,988.50 $79,885.00)
3 |30" x 30" Lane Control LED Sign (Red 'X'/Green Arrow) 10 EA [NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 3,650.00[$ 36,500.00 [$ 3,438.50 $34,385.00)
4 36" x 36" Custom LED Sign 10 EA |NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 6,600.00|$ 66,000.00 [$ 9,678.50 $96,785.00)
5 [30" x 36" Custom LED Sign 10 EA | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 5900.00[$ 59,000.00 |$ 7,338.50 $73,385.00)
GRAND TOTAL FOR SECTION $231,000.00 $337,025.00
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TABULATION FOR BIDS
#23-DES-ITB-164

BIDS were opened by Rebecca Kirby, Procurement Officer, at
11:00 A.M. on October 26, 2022

BIDDER NAMES
Tech?\ooll‘t:?iles of Techizl:::iles of Econolite Control] Econolite Control Gener'al Traffic Gener.al Traffic MoboTrex MoboTrex Traffic Systems Traffic Systems LLC
Central FL, Inc. | Central FL, Inc. Products Products Equipment Equipment LLC
SECTION XI - Bluetooth Travel Time Data Collection Equipment SECTION XI - Bluetooth Travel Time Data Collection Equipment
1 Bluetooth Antenna 15 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 125.00 | $ 1,875.00 | NO BID NO BID
2 |Bluetooth USB Adapter 15 EA |NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 7000 |$  1,050.00 | NOBID NO BID
3  [Bluetooth Wireless Modem 10 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 1,900.00|$ 19,000.00 | NO BID NO BID
4 |Rack mounted Iteris Velocity Bluetooth Data Collection Unit 15 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 3,900.00|$ 58,500.00 | NO BID NO BID
5 Point to Point Data Relay (low frequency) 2 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 2,600.00 | $ 5,200.00 [ NO BID NO BID
6 Point to Point Data Relay (high frequency) 2 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 2,400.00 | $ 4,800.00 | NO BID NO BID
Technical Support Technical Support
7 |Technical Support | 300 | HR NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 125.00 [$ 37,500.00 |
GRAND TOTAL FOR SECTION $127,925.00] $0.00] $0.00
Section XII- LED Street Name Signs Section XlI- LED Street Name Signs
1 8' LED Streetname Sign (Single Sided) 20 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2 |10' LED Streetname Sign (Single Sided) 20 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3 [12' LED Streetname Sign (Single Sided) 20 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
4  |6' LED Streetname Sign (Double Sided) 5 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
5 |8’ LED Streetname Sign (Double Sided) 5 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
6 |10' LED Streetname Sign (Double Sided) 5 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
7 |12' LED Streetname Sign (Double Sided) 5 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
8 |6' Replacement LED Tube 20 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
9 |8 Replacement LED Tube 20 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
10 |10’ Replacement LED Tube 20 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
11 |12’ Replacement LED Tube 20 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
GRAND TOTAL FOR SECTION
GRAND TOTAL $708,465.00 $708,816.80| $576,297.50) $2,876,805.00) $1,052,090.00
NOTES:

1) Bidder must complete each Section bidding on or it will be considered incomplete.

2) The County prefers that the specific equipment listed in Section VI, #s 10-24, and #33 be Energy Efficient.

3) This is a Fixed Unit-Price, Indefinite Quantity Contract and the quantities above are estimates based on a 12-month period. The quantities may exceed or be less than the estimated amounts and will be determined upon actual services
provided during the term of the contract. During the term of the contract the County has the right to add equipment to a Section in the Price Schedule as needed and obtain a quote from the Contractor.

4) This Price Schedule is not all inclusive and Bidders should use all documents included in this ITB in conjunction with the Price Schedule to complete the task.
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