

ITB 190025 - Parking Lot, Ag Center, Jackson County

Date of Closing: October 30, 2019 at 10:00 AM

Company Name and Address	Bid bond?	Base bid #1/2/3/4
Allied Paving, P.O. Box 509, Pendegras, GA 30567	yes	*\$562,167.50 / *\$366,183.50 / \$715,000 / \$625,000
Baldwin Paving, 1014 Hemmill Dr, Marietta, GA 30060	yes	*\$550,000 / *\$396,000 / No Bid / No Bid
Stewart Pros., 2480 Pleasantdale Rd, Doraville, GA 30340	yes	*\$550,352.50 / *\$373,924.85 / No Bid / No Bid
East Coast Grading, P.O. Box 579, Rutledge, GA 30063	yes	*\$548,475.60 / 371,991.60 / \$879,869.50 /
ER Snell, P.O. Box 306, Snellville, GA 30078	yes	*\$479,568.00 / *\$359,078.00 / No Bid / \$773,625
Garrett Paving, 1195 Winterville Rd, Athens, GA 30605	yes	*\$569,625.00 / *\$385,900.00 / No Bid / No Bid
Pi Human Const., 1487 Farmers Rd, Conyers, GA 30012	yes	*\$528,237.60 / \$314,179.22 / \$1,059,430.32 / \$926,464.40
Base bid #1 - Asphalt w/base		
Base bid #2 - Asphalt w/GAB by others		
Base bid #3 - Concrete w/base		
Base bid #4 - Concrete w/GAB by others		