Robertson County Finance Department Bid Tab #1324

Projectors and RF System Equipment / Schools - Technology

April 28,2016 / 10:00 AM

Technology
Express PCS, Inc.
Item Description Price Each Price Each
Group |
Projectors and Install Kits
Install Kit Complete (No Projector, no Speakers) 329.00 222.00
Install Kit #1 Complete (Includes Classroom Projector 1 & Speakers) 1,403.38 917.00
Install Kit #2 Complete (Includes Classroom Projector 2 & Speakers) 1,580.01 971.00
Classroom Projector 1 829.44 665.00
Classroom Projector 2 1,006.07 719.00
Large Venue Projector 1 no bid 4,968.00
Warranty - Epson Preferred Plus Warranty - ESA 3 Years Parts & Labor 151.57 | included
Projector Accessories
Speakers 244.94 234.00
Screen & Mount 127.61 120.00
Group Il
Document Camera - EImo no bid 629.00
DVD/ VCR combo with tuner no bid no bid
Group Il
elnstruction - Mobi
Mobi no bid no bid
Mobi View no bid no bid
elnstruction - Student Resonse RF System
28 Pad Set no bid no bid
32 Pad Set no bid no bid

Robertson County Finance
523 South Brown St
Springfield, TN 37172
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		Robertson County Finance Department Bid #1324

		Projectors and RF System Equipment / Schools - Technology

		April 28, 2016 / 10:00 AM

		Please provide a price based on the attached specifications. All prices shall remain valid for a period of twelve (12) calendar months from the date of bid opening.



		Item Description						Price Each



		Group I

		Projectors and Install Kits

				Install Kit Complete (No Projector, no Speakers)

				Install Kit #1 Complete (Includes Classroom Projector 1 & Speakers)

				Install Kit #2 Complete (Includes Classroom Projector 2 & Speakers)

				Classroom Projector 1

				Classroom Projector 2

				Large Venue Projector 1

				Warranty - Epson Preferred Plus Warranty - ESA 3 Years Parts & Labor

		Projector Accessories

				Speakers

				Screen & Mount



		Group II

				Document Camera - Elmo

				DVD/ VCR combo with tuner



		Group III

		eInstruction - Mobi

				Mobi

				Mobi View

		eInstruction - Student Resonse RF System

				28 Pad Set

				32 Pad Set

		AWARD:  Pricing as bid shall be effective May 1, 2016 through April 30, 2017. Each Group shall be awarded as a whole. Each award shall be for a one year period with the option to renew the award for up to a total of (3) three consecutive years subject to the availability of funds.



		ROBERTSON COUNTY, TENNESSEE - NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT TO ACCOMPANY BID: The agent of the bidding firm hereby certifies to the best of his/her knowledge and belief that this bid proposal to Robertson County, Tennessee has not been prepared in collusion with any other seller of similar products.  The agent also certifies that the prices, terms and conditions of said bid proposal have not been communicated by the undersigned, nor by any employee or agent of the bidding firm, to any other seller of similar products and will not be communicated to any such seller prior to the official opening of said bid.  The agent further states that no official or employee of Robertson County Government has promised any personal financial or other beneficial interest, either directly or indirectly in order to influence award of this bid.

		COOPERATIVE PURCHASING  AGREEMENT:  It   _________ (is / is not) permissible for other Local Governments in Tennessee to purchase these items or services at the bid/same price. Freight charges may be adjusted to reflect differences in delivery cost. Indicate any additional delivery charges or minimum orders for purchases by other entities:   ____________________________________________. 





Robertson County Finance
523 South Brown St
Springfield, TN 37172	&P of &N


Authorized Signature & Title   ________________________________________ Date______________

Printed Name___________________________________

Company Name __________________________________________________________________

Mailing Address  __________________________________________________________________ 
   
Telephone Number _____________________ Fax Number ________________________________

Email Address: _____________________________________________________________________
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		Robertson County Finance Department Bid Tab #1324

		Projectors and RF System Equipment / Schools - Technology

		April 28, 2016 / 10:00 AM

								Technology Express		PCS, Inc.

		Item Description						Price Each		Price Each



		Group I

		Projectors and Install Kits

				Install Kit Complete (No Projector, no Speakers)				329.00		222.00

				Install Kit #1 Complete (Includes Classroom Projector 1 & Speakers)				1,403.38		917.00

				Install Kit #2 Complete (Includes Classroom Projector 2 & Speakers)				1,580.01		971.00

				Classroom Projector 1				829.44		665.00

				Classroom Projector 2				1,006.07		719.00

				Large Venue Projector 1				no bid 		4,968.00

				Warranty - Epson Preferred Plus Warranty - ESA 3 Years Parts & Labor				151.57		included

		Projector Accessories

				Speakers				244.94		234.00

				Screen & Mount				127.61		120.00

		Group II

				Document Camera - Elmo				no bid 		629.00

				DVD/ VCR combo with tuner				no bid 		no bid

		Group III

		eInstruction - Mobi

				Mobi				no bid 		no bid

				Mobi View				no bid 		no bid

		eInstruction - Student Resonse RF System

				28 Pad Set				no bid 		no bid

				32 Pad Set				no bid 		no bid
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