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OFFICE OF THE PURCHASING AGENT

CITY OF KNOXVILLE, TENNESSEE

BID TABULATION FORM

DATE: May 6, 2022

DEPARTMENT: Knoxville Police Department

TITLE: ITB - Ammunition

: : Non- Iran DBE DBE
BIDDERS Bid Form/Price Col!uann Divestment Form Option A
Affidavit or B?

Ammunition Bid Price v v
Elmer Arms South, LLC 1. 45 ACP (Practice) $ No Bid

2. 45 ACP (Duty) $ 9,500.00

3..308 Win, (Duty) $ 14,800.00

4. 9mm (Practice) $ 40,000.00

5. 9mm (Duty) $ 11,850.00

6. 40 S&W (Duty) $2,000.00

7. 38 Special (Practice) | $ No Bid

8. 12 Guage (Duty) $ No Bid

9. .357 Magnum (Duty) | $ No Bid

10. .338 Lapua (Duty) $ 7,500.00

1. 45 ACP (Practice) $ 66,600.00 v 7 B v B
Gulf States Distributors 2. 45 ACP (Duty) $ No Bid

3..308 Win, (Duty) $ No Bid

4. 9mm (Practice) $ 24,500.00

5. 9mm (Duty) $ No Bid

6. 40 S&W (Duty) $ 818.00

7. 38 Special (Practice) | $ 1,245.00

8. 12 Guage (Duty) $1,790.00

9. .357 Magnum (Duty) | $ 650.00

10. .338 Lapua (Duty) $ No Bid

Continued on Page 2




Non-

DBE

BIDDERS Bid Form/Price Collusion I B el Option A
Ammunition Bid Price v v v B
Precision Delta Corporation | 1- 45 ACP (Practice) $ 59,220.00
2. 45 ACP (Duty) $ No Bid
3..308 Win, (Duty) $ No Bid
4. 9mm (Practice) $ 23,800.00
5. 9mm (Duty) $ No Bid
6. 40 S&W (Duty) $ 798.00
7. 38 Special (Practice) | $ 775.00
8. 12 Guage (Duty) $ No Bid
9. .357 Magnum (Duty) | $ 435.00
10. .338 Lapua (Duty) $ No Bid

| CERTIFY THAT THIS IS A TRUE AND ACCURATE TABULATION OF THE PROPOSALS THAT WERE RECEIVED.




