
Item Description Qty
Unit
Price Freight

Unit
Price Freight

Unit
Price Freight

Unit
Price Freight

Unit
Price Freight

1

Digital Xray System 1 $58,814.65 $43,888.89 $2,439.25 $9,800.00 $48.944.00

X Ray                                    
Option 1 - $53,950.00          add 

on to Option 1 $1,950.0 
Option2 - $32,920.00             

Imaging Table (Separate)        
Option 1 - $13,585.00      Option 

2 - $10,725.00

2
UV-C Air Purification System 
w/Light

5  No Bid $7,773.90  No Bid $8,300.00 No Bid

3
Mounting Box 5  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid $2,665.00 No Bid

4

UV-C Air Purification System w/o 
Light

5  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid $6,315.00

Portable Air Disinfection Device                                   
Option 1  - $3,995.00 

Accessories - $975.00 & 
$150.00                                  

Option 2 -   $2,995.00  
Accessories -  $675.00

5
Ultrasound System 1  No Bid $6,000.00 $3,180.00 $5,019.00

Option 1 - $10,335.00     Option 
2 - $6,300.00

6

Dental Station 1  No Bid $4,511.37 $5,900.00 $5,497.00

Product - Price                      
5355C - $3,810.17                 

0017-603-GRY-$199.85          
266040 - $1,465.45                 
266064 - $471.17                        
264563 - $994.28
(Total $6940.92)

7
Veternary ECG Monitor 1  No Bid $5,593.00 $1,000.00 $5,993.00 $3,684.80

8
CO2 Leads 1  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid $1,991.00 No Bid

$58,814.65 -$                     $67,767.16 $2,439.25 $19,880.00 -$               $35,780.00 $0.00 $0.00

Remain firm throught the 
award of the bid

30 days

Medline Industries LP

TBD

Valid until 9/28/23 Freight tax
added at time of purchase

Did not state

Midwest Veterinary Supply, 
Inc

2-6 weeks depending
on item size

Awarded Vendors

Item 1 from Technology International Inc. was not awarded due to the Xray machine not meeting specification - Submitted Digital Portable x-Ray ZPXR-A10. Machine does not have table or monitor.  This would require 
a separate screen to be purchased to view images.

Item from 4 Medline Industries LP submitted a Portable Air Disinfection Device and not what was requested, an Air Purification mounted in the ceiling is required.

Total:

McKesson Medical-Surgical 
Government Souutions

MWI Veterinary Supply 
Co.

Technology International, 
Inc.

Lead Time:
2-4 weeks after
receipt of order

 TBD 
 Aprox. 20 weeks after order 

and approval 

Quote Expiration Date: 12/29/23

Quote Tabulation
Date:  11/07/2023

ITB 2024-841, Medical & Surgical Equipment for Animal Shelter
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Quote Tabulation
Date:  11/07/2023

ITB 2024-841, Medical & Surgical Equipment for Animal Shelter

Item 7 from Medline Industries LP did not meet specifications.  Bid specified touchscreen, wireless networking, able to generate excel and pdf reports, remote access and measures ECG, SpO2, BP and temperature.  
Item submitted by Medline doesn't not meet all the above specks.

Item 5 from Technology International Inc. did not meet specifications.  Bid specified wireless, portable hand held unit, able to pair across multiple devices.  Quoted item (Ultrasound System ZUS-A2) is a portable device 
larger than a hand held unit and is not wireless and has 2 transducer probe connectors. 

Item 5 from Midwest Veterinary Supply Inc. submitted model that is not wireless and can only be view on Apple tablet or iphone with iOS8.0 or higher.

Item 6 from Medline Industries:  Product 5355C is a only a cart with three handpieces.  Product 0017-603-GRY is oxygen tubing.  Product 266040 and 266064 are individual handpiece dental tools. Product 264563 is an 
individual hygiene handpiece.  Dental station items submitted total $6940.92. 
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