
HIGHLANDS COUNTY
BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
Purchasing Department

AWARD TABULATION OF SEALED BIDS

ITS 17-024

BASIC UFE SUPPORT 5UPPUES

Bid opening: 3/15/17

SASE FOR

AWARD
UNITI

PRICE PER CAS'NUM DESCRIPTION ITEM" BASE FOR
PACK

PRICE PER CASE RANK
UNIT

1 r Conforming Stretch Gauze Bandage

1 AWARD

Midwest Medical Supply OYN3103 1- Each $0.1006 9' $9.66 1
Nashville Med. & EMS 440003 Each $0.1197 9' $11.49 2
Bound Tree Medical Each $0.1200 12 $1.44 3
Quadmed EFA-l00S Each $0.1833 9' $17.60 4
Henry SChein, Inc. 8907242 Each $0.2800 12 $3.36 5
Moore Medical 73979 'oeh $0.3017 9' $28.96 ,

2 1- hypo-a~eniccloth tape ,
Nashville Med. & EMS I 705211 'oeh $0.5490 I 144 $79.06 1
Henry SChein, Inc. 4990655 Each $0.6100 12 $7.32 2
Quadmed EFA-1l5001 Each $0.6250 144 $90.00 3

Midwest Medical Supply DYN3562 Each $0.6600 144 $95.04 4
Bound Tree Medical Each $0.6600 12 $7.92 4
Moore Medical 17530 Each $0.9000 120 $108.00 5, r hypo-allergenk cloth tape

Quadmed EFA-1l5002 J. Each $1.2500 72 $90.00 1
Nashville Med. & EMS 705213 Each $1.6250 48 $78.00 2
Henry SChein, Inc. 4990699 Each $1.8200 4 $7.28 3
Bound Tree Medical Each $1.9700 4 $7.88 4
Midwest Medical Supply DYN3564 Each $1.9800 48 $95.04 5
Moore Medical 74281 Each $3.3500 40 $134.00 ,

• I" Band·Aids

Bound Tree Medical 'oeh $0.0100 100 $1.00 1
Midwest Medical Supply A.SOCBOZ019-012-OQO 'oeh $0.0113 1200 $13.56 2
Quadmed EFA-ll01 'oeh $0.0120 2400 $28.80 3
Nashville Meet & EMS 880113 'oeh $0.0124 100 $1.24 4
Moore Medical 68181 Each $0.0213 1200 $25.56 5
Henry Schein, Inc. 5554970 Each $0.0400 100 $4.00 ,

5 r 8and-Aids

Moore Medical ~83 Each $0.0321 1200 $38.52 1
Midwest Medical Supply ASOC802016-(l1HlOl Each $0.0420 600 $25.20 2
Nashville Med. & EMS 88124 Each $0.0478 50 $2.39 3

--

Quadmed EFA-11Ol Each $0.0598 1200 $71.76 4-
Bound Tree Medical Each $0.0600 50 $3.00 5
Henry Schein, Inc. 5550446 Each $0.1100 50 $5.50 ,
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• S"x9" sterile ABO pads I
Moore Medical 13876 Each $0.0688 400 $27.52 1
Midwest Medical Supply DYN3501 Each $0.0790 400 $31.60 2

Nashville Med. & EMS 777590 Each $0.0860 400 $34.40 3
80und Tree Medical Each $0.0900 25 $2.25 4

Quadmed EFA-I060 Each $0.1150 400 $46.00 5
Henry Schein, Inc. 1202048 Each $0.1300 25 $3.25 •

7 4"x4", 4-ply sterile sponges 1

Midwest Medical Supply EMPH44421 Each $0.0260 1200 $31.20 1
Nashville Med. & EMS 251444 Each $0.0291 1200 $34.92 2
Henry Schein, Inc. 1048665 Each $0.0300 50 $1.50 3
Moore Medical 67081 Each $0.0444 1200 $53.28 4

Bound Tree Medical Each $0.0500 800 $40.00 5
Quadmed EFA-I023 Each $0.0760 600 $45.60 •

8 4"x4", S-ply unsterile sponges

Quadmed EFA-1021 I Each $0.0063 4000 $25.20 1

Midwest Medical 5upply EMPGA44820 Each $0.0084 4000 $33.60 2
Bound Tree Medical Each $0.0100 20 $0.20 3
Nashville Med. & EMS 888111 I Each $0.0106 4000 $42.40 4
Moore Medical 12278 Each $0.0160 4000 $64.00 5
Henry Schein, Inc. 1048194 Each $0.0200 200 $4.00 6

• 2" x 2", 12 ply sterile gauze pads
,

Henry Schein, Inc. 1004380 Each $0.0200 100 $2.00 1

Bound Tree Medical Each $0.0200 100 $2.00 1
Nashville Med. & EMS 221201 Each $0.0208 2400 $49.92 2
Midwest Medical Supply DYN3352 Each $0.0208 2400 $49.92 2
Moore Medical 08250 Each $0.0257 2400 $61.68 3
Quadmed EFA-1029 Each $0.0265 2400 $63.60 4,. Triangular bandages-indiY. Wrapped

Midwest Medical Supply M50MS-11050 I Each $0.1900 240 $45.60 1

Moore Medical 92750 Each $0.2100 240 $50.40 2
Quadmed EFA-109010 Each $0.2292 240 $55.Q1 3
Bound Tree Medical Each $0.2400 240 $57.60 4
Nashville Med. & EM5 404056 Each $0.2590 240 $62.16 5
Henry Schein, Inc. 1209201 I Each $0.3500 1 $0.35 6

11 Adult multlgrip head Immobilizer No substitutIons

Bound Tree Medical Each $3.5000 20 $70.00 1
Henry Schein, Inc. 8653602 Each $3.7000 1 $3.70 2
Moore Medical 71443 Each $3.8500 50 $192.50 3
Midwest Medical Supply ITEl01 Each $4.3000 50 $215.00 4
Quadmed EHI-14800 Each $4.5400 50 $227.00 5
Nashville Med. & EMS NO bid

12 Child multlgrip head immobilizer No substitutions

80und Tree Medical Each $3.5000 50 $175.00 1
Henry Schein, Inc. 8655190 _~_ach $3.7000 1 $3.70 2
Moore Medical 76588 Each $3.8500 50 $192.50 3
Midwest Medical Supoly ITEl02 Each $4.3000 50 $215.00 4
Quadmed EHI~1481 Each $4.5400 50 $227.00 5
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Nashville Med. & EMS Nobid

13 7 ft. OXVIen cannula· adult)with curved tip

Henry Schein, Inc. 9007036 I Each $0.1800 SO $9.00 1
Nashville Med. & EMS 999308 Each $0.2410 SO $12.05 2

Midwest Medical Supply VENI007 Each $0.2500 SO $12.50 3
Moore Medical 15046 Each $0.2600 SO $13.00 4

Quadmed EAW-2000 Each $0.2700 SO $13.50 5
Bound Tree Medical ~ $0.2700 SO $13.50 5

1. 7 ft. Oxygen cannula· pediatric with curved tip

Henry Schein, Inc. 9007034 Each $0.1800 SO $9.00 1

Nashville Med. & EMS 999312 Each $0.2590 SO $12.95 2

Bound Tree Medical Each $0.2700 SO $13.50 3
Moore Medical 15047 Each $0.2800 SO $14.00 4
Midwest Medical Supply VEN1207 Each $0.3500 SO $17.50 5
Quadmed EAW-2oo1 Each $0.3700 SO $IB.50 6

15 7 ft. Non-rebreathlng mask }¥ith check valve· adult

Nashville Med. & EMS 999107 Each $0.6290 SO $31.45 1
Midwest Medical Supply VEN2101 Each $0.6300 SO $31.50 2

c

Henry Schein, Inc. 4996737 Each $0.6400 1 $0.64 3
Bound Tree Medical Each $0.6900 SO $34.50 4

Quadmed EAW-2011 Each $0.7200 SO $36.00 5
Moore Medical 50799 Each $0.9300 SO $46.50 6

16 Single use restraint straps; ~ piece 2" )( S' ,

Nashville Med. & EMS 293305 Each $1.3900 72 $100.08 1

Quadmed EST-1390-BK Each $1.5900 144 $228.96 2

Bound Tree Medical Each $1.9300 1 $1.93 3
Henry SChein, Inc. 4997057 Each $2.0000 3 $6.00 4
Midwest Medical Supply DKM47152 Each $3.0400 1 $3.04 5
Moore Medical 48333 Each $4.3700 36 $157.32 6

17 Disposable fitted sheets for stretcher; white; 30")(72" No sbustltutlons

Bound Tree Medical
±f.~h

$0.7200 SO $36.00 1
Henry SChein, Inc. Each $0.8200 SO $41.00 2

Midwest Medical Supply AlCEF600 Each $0.9300 SO $46.50 3
Nashville Med. & EMS No bid

Quadmed Nobid

Moore Medical +-- No bid,. Fluid resistant flat sheets; dark blue

Bound Tree Medical Each $0.3500 SO $17.50 1
Moore Medical 77016 Each $0.3840 SO $19.20 2
Nashville Med. & EMS 407201 Each $0.4500 SO $22.50 3
Henry Schein, Inc. 4677310 Each $0.6000 SO $30.00 4
Midwest Medical Supply GRA652320 Each $0.9000 SO $45.00 5
Quadmed EIC·1875 i Each $1.0530 SO $52.65 6

" Multl·trauma dressln, 10)(39

Moore Medical 13874 Each $0.3500 2S $8.75 1
Nashville Med. & EMS 771030 Each $0.6300 SO $31.50 2
Quadmed fFA-1l75 Each $0.7200 SO $36.00 3
Midwest Medical Supply MSOMS-G2M001 I Each $0.7500 2S $18.75 4
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Bound Tree Medical Each $0.9700 50 $48.50 5
Henry SChein, Inc. 7438027 I Each $1.4400 1 $1.44 •

20 Resulator Brass w/2 SOpsi pprts 1-25 Ipm LSP Rhino

Midwest Medical Supply
fl:".....nl:..::JQ·/OCl- I Each $29.5800 $29.581 1

Nashville Med. & EMS 870A2CV258 Each $34.6900 1 $34.69 2
Quadmed EAW-2806 I Each $42.5000 1 $42.50 3
Moore Medical 95188 I Each $73.5100 1 $73.51 4
Henry Schein, Inc. 611·4342 Each $164.9400 1 $164.94 5
Bound Tree Medical Each $194.9400 1 $194.94 •

21 7 ft. non-rebreathins mask with check valve - child

Nashville Med. & EMS 999110 Each $0.6450 50 $32.25 1
Midwest Medical Supply VEN2201 Each $0.6800 50 $34.00 2
Bound Tree Medical Each $0.6900 50 $34.50 3
Quadmed EAW-l009 Each $0.8200 50 $41.00 4
Moore Medical 50808 Each $0.9300 50 $46.50 5
Henry Schein, Inc. 4996154 Each $1.5900 1 $1.59 •

22 7 ft. oxygen mask - hiSh concentration infant

Nashville Med. & EMS 999120 Each $0.6900 50 $34.50 1
Moore Medical 83031 Each $0.7900 50 $39.50 2
Quadmed EAW-2oo8 Each $0.9200 50 $46.00 3
Bound Tree Medical Each $0.9400 50 $47.00 4
Midwest Medical Supply TEl395497 Each $3.4100 50 $170.50 5
Henry SChein, Inc. 8269995 Each $4.3200 1 $4.32 •

23 Ambu-Spur II resuscitator mask, adult No substitutions

Bound Tree Medical Each $9.0300 1 $9.03 1
Henry Schein, Inc. 4793940 Each $9.1100 1 $9.11 2
Moore Medical 81050 Each $9.3200 12 $111.84 3
Nashville Med. & EMS 520-211-000 Each $10.1900 1 $10.19 4
Midwest Medical Supply AMBS2()..211·0Q00 Each $11.2100 12 $134.52 5
Quadmed 520-211-000 Each $11.9500 12 $143.40 •

24 Ambu-Spur II resuscitator mask, infant/child No substitutions

Henry SChein, Inc. 4996431 ---J Each $12.0800 1 $12.08 1
Moore Medical 81051 Each $12.4000 12 $148.80 2
Bound Tree Medical Each $12.5000 1 $12.50 3
Quadmed 530-212-000 Each $13.6800 12 $164.16 4
Midwest Medical Supply AMBS3()"212-0000 Each $14.1400 12 $169.68 5
Nashville Med. & EMS No bid

25 Disposable economical blan~et

Midwest Medical Supply GRA652320 Each $1.0200 25 $25.50 1
Quadmed 3519 Each $1.4800 50 $74.00 2
Bound Tree Medical Each $1.9000 24 $45.60 3
Henry Schein, Inc. 4990413 Each $2.8400 1 $2.84 4
Moore Medical 17570 Each $3.S900 18 $64.62 5
Nashville Med. & EMS Nobid

2. Disposable suction canister5;. 1200 CC No substitutions

Bound Tree Medical Each $2.7200 48 $130.56 1
Midwest Medical Supply BEM484410

I Each $2.8300 48 $135.84 2
Henry SChein, Inc. 1169264 Each $2.8500 48 $136.80 3
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Nashville Med. & EMS 484410 Each $2.8900 48 $138.72 4
Moore Medical 53554 Each $2.9000 48 $139.20 5
Quadmed 484410 I Each $3.1200 48 $149.76 6

27 Untversal suction tubinll/4" .. 100'

Bound Tree Medical Each $0.2800 400 $112.00 1
Quadmed EAW-22lO Each $0.8100 SO $40.50 2
Midwest Medical5uppiV CON004826O Each $10.7100 1 $10.71 3
Henry Schein, Inc. I 8900941 Each $11.7100 1 $11.71 4
Nashville Med. & EMS 993334 Each $18.9900 1 $18.99 5
Moore Medical No bid

28 Larp-bof'e suction catheter with thumb control - Yankaur only

Midwest Medical Supply DYN4690 Each $0.3500 SO $17.50 1
Nashville Med. & EMS 887722 Each $0.3900 SO $19.50 2
Bound Tree Medical Each $0.5400 SO $27.00 3
Quadmed EAW-221302 Each $1.4200 SO $71.00 4
Henry Schein, Inc. 1064698 Each $1.9600 1 $1.96 5
Moore Medical I No bid

29 Cokt lNcb

Moore Medical 81854 Each $0.1500 24 $3.60 1
Henry Schein, Inc. 1126145 Each $0.1800 24 $4.32 2
Bound Tree Medical Each $0.2700 24 $6.48 3
Quadmed EFA-4200 I Each $0.3813 24 $9.15 4
Midwest Medical Supply DYN4512 Each $0.3900 24 $9.36 5
Nashville Med. & EMS S61111 Each $0.4900 24 $11.76 6

30 late..-free Toum~uets

Midwest Medical Supply G/F4109-LF Each $0.0660 250 $16.50

Nashville Med. & EMS 901100 Each $0.0840 100 $8.40

Quadmed 10921 Each $0.0799 100 $7.99

Bound Tree Medical Each $0.0800 100 $8.00
Henry Schein, Inc. 8370006 Each $0.1600 250 $40.00

Moore Medical 90037 Each $0.1500 500 $75.00

31 Plastic urinals I

Midwest Medical Supply ACTH140-01 Each $0.3400 SO $17.00

Henrv Schein, Inc. 1004606 Each $0.4700 1 $0.47

Quadmed DYND8023SS Each $0.6900 48 $33.12

Bound Tree Medical Each $0.4300 SO $21.50

Nashville Med. & EMS Each $0.8900 SO $44.50

Moore Medical 88903 Each $0.4800 SO $24.00

32 Disposable sterile burn sheets

Nashville Med. & EMS 888111 Each $1.4900 24 $35.76 1
Midwest Medical Supply MSOMS-B50033 Each $1.6400 SO S82.OO 2
Henry Schein, Inc. 4993574 Each $1.7300 1 $1.73 3
Bound Tree Medical I Each $2.100Q SO $105.00 4
Quadmed 3520 Each $2.1800 12 $26.16 5
Moore Medical 634S6 Each $5.6800 24 $136.32 6

n Criterion powder-free nitrile Ikwes; small No 5ubstJtutions

Henry SChein, Inc. 1118535 100 Each $3.5400 1000 $35.40 1
Nashville Med. & EM$ No bid-
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Quadmed Nobid

Moore Medical Nobid

Midwest Medical Supply Nobid

Bound Tree Medical Nobid

34 Criterion powder-free nitrile gloves; medium No substitutions

Henry Schein, Jnc. 1118536 I 100 Each $3.5400 1000 $35.40 1
Quadmed Nobid

Nashville Med. & EMS Nobid

Moore Medical 1 Nobid

Midwest Medical Supply Nobid

Bound Tree Medical I Nobid

35 CrIterion powder.free nltrll~gloves; large No substitutions

Henry Schein, Jnc. 1118537 100 Each $3.5400 1000 $35.40 1
Quadmed No bid

Nashville Med. & EMS Nobid

Moore Medical Nobid

Bound Tree Medical No bid

Midwest Medical Supply No bid

3. Criterion powder.free nltril~gloves; x.large No substitutions

Henry Schein, Jnc. 1118539 1 100 Each $3.5400 1000 $35.40 1
Nashville Med. & EMS No bid

Quadmed Nobid

Moore Medical No bid

Bound Tree Medical No bid

Midwest Medical Supply No bid

37 Powder·free nitrile medical ~xam gloves; xx-large

Moore Medical 20087 100 Each $5.3100 1000 $53.10 1
Midwest Medical Supply INNI82400 100 Each $7.0000 1000 $70.00 2
Henry Schein, Inc. 5654216 100 Each $8.6500 1000 $86.50 3
Quadmed No bid

Nashville Med. & EMS No bid

Bound Tree Medical I No bid

38 Blo-Hazardous red bags; 5 gallon

Nashville Med. & EMS 09801 Each $0.0750 250 $18.75 1
Bound Tree Medical Each $0.0800 500 $40.00 2
Midwest Medical Supply ACT116 Each $0.0900 500 $45.00 3
Henry Schein, Jnc. 609-1889 Each $0.1200 500 $60.00 4
Moore Medical 88720 Each $0.1370 200 $27.40 5
Quadmed EIC-544701 Each $0.1500 100 $lS.oo •

3. Bio-Hazardous red bags; 30 gallon

Bound Tree Medical I Each $0.1500 250 $37.50 1
Moore Medical 28856 Each $0.1619 250 $40.48 2
Henry Schein, Inc. 6024938 Each $0.1700 250 $42.50 3
Midwest Medical Supply ACT117 Each $0.2000 250 $50.00 4
Nashville Med. & EM5 195819 Each $0.2210 100 $22.10 5
Quadmed EIC-5465 Each $0.5200 100 $52.00 •.. StiffNeck cervical immobilizlttion device (elD); pediatric No substitutIons

Henry Schein, Inc. 2206020 I Each I $2.0700 1 $2.07 1

ITB1NJ24BLS
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Bound Tree Medical Each $4.2900 50 $214.S0 2
Moore Medical 48S30 Each $4.7200 50 $236.00 3

Midwest Medical Supply LAE980200 Each $4.8300 50 $241.50 4

Quadmed 260202 Each $5.9500 50 $297.50 5

Nashville Med. & EMS Nobid

41 StlffNeck cervicallmmobilizition device (CID)i regular No substitutions

Bound Tree Medical Each $4.2900 50 $214.50 1

Henry Schein, Inc. 2204171 Each $4.4900 1 $4.49 2
Moore Medical 15621 Each $4.7200 50 $236.00 3

Midwest Medical Supply LAE980S00 Each $4.8300 50 $241.S0 4

Quadmed 26020S Each $6.2900 50 $314.50 5

Nashville Med. & EMS No bid

42 StlffNeck cervical immobilization device (CID)i tall No substitutions

Henry Schein, Inc. 9806S0 Each $2.0700 1 $2.07 1
Bound Tree Medical Each $4.2900 50 $214.50 2

Moore Medical 161S8 Each $4.7200 50 $236.00 3

Midwest Medical Supply LAE980600 Each $4.8300 50 $241.50 4

Quadmed 260206 Each $S.9S00 50 $297.50 5

Nashville Med. & EMS No bid

43 StlffNeck cervical Immobilization device (CID); short No substitutions

Bound Tree Medical I Each $4.2900 50 $214.50 1

Henry Schein, Inc. 980400 Each $4.4900 1 $4.49 2

Moore Medical 15622 Each $4.7200 SO $236.00 3

Midwest Medical Supply LAE980400 Each $4.8300 50 $241.50 4

Quadmed 260204 Each $S.9500 50 $297.50 5
Nashville Med. & EMS No bid

44 StlffNeck cervlcallmmobllizftlon device (CID); no neck No substitutions

Bound Tree Medical Each $4.2900 50 $214.50 1
Henry Schein, Inc. 2202123 Each $4.4900 1 $4.49 2

Moore Medical 48535 Each $4.7200 50 $236.00 3
Midwest Medical Supoly LAE980300 Each $4.8300 50 $241.50 4

Quadmed 260201 Each $6.1000 50 $305.00 5
Nashville Med. & EMS NO bid

45 8k>Hoop collection bag wit~ hook No substitutions

Moore Medical 47681 Each $1.4958 480 $717.98 1
Henry Schein, Inc. Each $1.5000 480 $720.00 2
Bound Tree Medical Each $1.5200 480 $729.60 3
Quadmed Each $1.6250 480 $780.00 4
Midwest Medical Supply HTMBH1100H Each $1.6300 12 $19.56 5
Nashville Med. & EMS No bid

46 Posey doubk! strap foam IinPb holders, standard foam No substitutions

Henry Schein, Inc. 4490588 Each $3.3300 1 $3.33 1
Bound Tree Medical Each $4.5700 1 $4.57 2
Midwest Medical Supply POS2528 Each $4.6300 1 $4.63 3
Quadmed Each $5.8500 1 $S.8S 4
Nashville Med. & EMS Nobid
Moore Medical Nobid

47 Pediatric IV arm board, padded

fTB 17·024 BLS
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Midwest Medical Supply PRD45004-11-MPG' Each $0.5200 100 $52.00 1
Henry SChein, tnc. 4963343 Each $0.6400 50 $32.00 2
Bound Tree Medical E;och $0.8300 50 $41.50 3
Quadmed ESP-1008-S Each $0.8400 100 584.00 4
Moore Medical 55347 Each $0.8700 50 $43.50 5
Nashville Med. & EMS NO bid.. 12- cardboilrd SpUnts w/Foam Paddinl case

Midwest Medical Supply I DKM61012MCF E;och $0.7000 36 $25.20 1
Quadmed

I
ESP-I5D4 Each $0.8800 36 $31.68 2

Bound Tree Medical Each $1.1100 1 $1.11 3
Henry SChein, Inc. 2205482 E;och $1.6600 1 $1.66 4

Moore Medical 79686 Each $1.7700 1 $1.77 5
Nashville Med. & EM5 No bid

•• 24- cardboilrd Splints w/Foam Paddinl case

Midwest Medical Supply DKM61024MCF Each $1.1900 36 $42.84 1
Quadmed 61024MCF Each $1.5400 36 $55.44 2
Bound Tree Medical Each $1.6500 1 $1.65 3
Henry SChein, Inc. 2205819 Each $2.4300 1 $2.43 4
Moore Medical 79687 Each $3.0700 1 $3.07 5
Nashville Med. & EMS No bid

50 Sprape Rappaport5~ Stethoscope

Bound Tree Medical Each I $4.2500 50 $212.50 1
Midwest Medical Supply VRD05-11001 Each 1 $4.5500 50 $227.50 2
Nashville Med. & EMS 1104410 Each $4.6700 20 $93.40 3
Quadmed EOI-7370·8K Each $5.8800 1 $5.88 4
Moore Medical 66248 Each $6.1100 20 $122.20 5
Henry Schein, Inc. 1002892 Each $6.4600 1 $6.46 6

51 Dupont Tyvek CO\Ieralls wI Hood & Boots No substitutIons

Henry Schein, Inc. 7001053 Each $2.4900 25 $62.25 1
Moore Medical 76825 Each $4.8400 25 $121.00 2
Bound Tree Medical Each $5.5000 25 $137.50 3
Quadmed 1225 Each $6.9000 1 $6.90 4
Nashville Med. & EMS Nobid

Midwest Medical Supply Nobid

52 Antiseptic BioHand Sanitizer; 4 oz. No substitutions

Henry SChein, Inc. 4223880 I Each $0.9800 24 $23.52 1
Bound Tree Medical Each $0.9800 24 $23.52 1
Moore Medical 55123 Each $1.0100 24 $24.24 2
Midwest Medical Supply SAFl7350 Each $1.1800 245 $289.10 3
Quadmed 17350 Each $1.4000 24 $33.60 4
Nashville Med. & EMS , NO bid

" Blood pressure cuff; blue, adult No substitutions

Henry SChein, Inc. 4990742 Each $6.4200 1 $6.42 1
Bound Tree Medical Each $15.6500 1 $15.65 2
Midwest Medical Supply AME760-11AN Each $17.6000 1 $17.60 3
Quadmed

,
Each $19.9600 1 $19.96 4

Nashville Moo. & EMS No bid

Moore Medical No bid
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54 Blood pressure cuff; blue, c"lId No substitutions

Bound Tree Medical Each $14.8900 1 $14.89 1

Henry Schein, Inc. 4997943 Each $14.9300 1 $14.93 2

Midwest Medical Supply AME760-9CN Each $17.6000 1 $17.60 3
Quadmed Each $24.9900 1 $24.99 4

Nashville Med. & EMS No bid

Moore Medical No bid

55 Blood pressure cuff; blue, Infant No substitutions

Bound Tree Medical Each $14.8900 1 $14.89 1

Henry Schein, Inc. 4997943 Each $14.9300 1 $14.93 2

Midwest Medical Supply AME760-7IN Each $17.6000 1 $17.60 3
Quadmed Each $24.9900 1 $24.99 4

Nashville Med. & EMS No bid

Moore Medical Nobid.. Blood pressure cuff; blue, adutt large No substitutions I

Henry Schein, Inc. 4260018 Each $18.1500 1 $18.15 1

Bound Tree Medical Each $18.3200 1 $18.32 2

Midwest Medical Supply AME760-12xN Each $21.8600 1 $21.86 3
Quadmed Each $30.6100 1 $30.61 4

Nashville Med. & EMS Nobid

Moore Medical Nobid

57 Sterile Water, 1000 ml bottl~s

Bound Tree Medical Each $1.8000 1. $28.80 1
Midwest Medical Supply BBMR5000-01 Each $1.8800 1. $30.08 2

Moore Medical 13935 Each $2.4000 12 $28.80 3
Henry Schein, Inc. 5075000 Each $6.0000 1 $6.00 4

Quadmed No bid

Nashville Med. & EMS No bid.. Sterile Water, 500 ml bottle~

Midwest Medical Supply WEl6290 I Each $1.6400 18 $29.52 1
Bound Tree Medical Each $1.8000 1. $28.80 2
Moore Medical 15071 Each $2.2600 18 $40.68 3
Henry Schein, Inc. 1530102 Each $12.9600 1 $12.96 4
Quadmed Nobid

Nashville Med. & EMS Nobid

59 Sterile Water, 250 ml bottles

Midwest Medical Supply WEL6260 Each $1.3400 24 $32.16 1
Moore Medical 45311 Each $2.2400 24 $53.76 2
Bound Tree Medical Each $2.5000 24 $60.00 3
Henry Schein, Inc. 1536483 Each $13.4400 1 $13.44 4
Quadmed Nobid

Nashville Med. & EMS No bid

60 Technol PFR 9S Respirator -: Regular No substitutions

Moore Medical 73320 Each $0.5857 210 $123.00 1
Midwest Medical Supply KC46727 I Each $0.6050 210 $127.05 2
Quadmed EIC-515502 Each $0.6429 35 $22.50 3
Bound Tree Medical Each $0.6600 35 $23.10 4
Henry Schein, Inc. 1531074 LEach $0.6700 35 $23.45 5
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Nashville Med. & EMS Nobid

61 Technol PFR 9S Respirator-Small No Substitutions

Moore Medical 73270 Each $0.5857 210 $123.00 1

Midwest Medical Supply KC46827 Each $0.6050 210 $127.05 1

Quadmed EIC-515501 Each $0.6429 35 $22.50 3

80und Tree Medical Each $0.6600 35 $23.10 4

Henry Schein, Inc. 1534801 Each $0.6700 35 $23.45 5

Nashville Med. & EMS I Nobid

62 Back Boards- Ultravue IS" NP No substitutions

Bound Tree Medical Each $144.7500 1 $144.75 1

Moore Medical 75402 Each $145.0000 1 $145.00 2

Henry Schein, Inc. 3874094 Each $150.8800 1 $150.8B 3

Midwest Medical Supply IR03S7SS Each $162.6600 1 $162.66 4

Quadmed EBB-470900-Bl Each $189.5000 1 $189.50 5

Nashville Med. & EMS No bid.. Thermal Blankets I ,

Midwest Medical Supply DUK721 Each $0.4300 250 $107.50 1

Bound Tree Medical Each $0.4300 100 $86.00 2

Moore Medical 11584 I Each $0.5000 150 $75.00 3

Quadmed EFA-1170 Each $0.6000 120 $72.00 4

Nashville Med. & EMS 886658 I Each $1.1900 15 $29.75 5

Henry Schein, Inc. 5083902 1 Each $9.1000 1 $9.10 6

64 sam Splint, 36" roll No subsiltutions

Henry Schein, Inc. 3601359 Each $6.3500 1 $6.35 1
Moore Medical 53884 I Each $6.5900 1 $6.59 1
Bound Tree Medical Each $7.3000 1 $7.30 3
Quadmed E5P-6335-0R Each $7.9500 1 $7.95 4

Midwest Medical Supply SMM1121 Each $8.0500 60 $483.00 5
Nashville Med. & EMS No bid

6. OB Kits - Soft Pack

Quadmed EFA-540000099 Each $4.1500 1 $4.15 1
Nashville Med. & EMS 999700 Each $4.1900 10 $41.90 1
Bound Tree Medical Each $4.4900 1 $4.49 3
Midwest Medical Supply MMD1705 Each $4.7800 10 $47.80 4
Henry Schein, Inc. 3262005 , Each $5.8100 1 $5.81 •
Moore Medical 68221

,
Each $5.9300 10 $59.30 6.. Eye Wash, 4 0% I

Moore Medical 75519 Each $1.4700 48 $70.56 1
Henry Schein, Inc. 1101011 Each $1.7700 1 $1.77 1
Nashville Med. & EMS 19818 Each $1.8900 48 $90.72 3
Midwest Medical SupplV TEX198-18 Each $1.9300 48 $92.64 4
Quadmed EFA-4301 Each $2.4500 36 $88.20 •
Bound Tree Medical Each $2.5600 48 $122.88 6

67 CAT Toumlquet No substitutions

Henry Schein, Inc. 23140 Each $22.1700 1 $22.17 1
Moore Medical 23140 Each $23.6000 1 $23.60 1
Nashville Med. & EMS 23140 Each $24.1900 1 $24.19 3
Quadmed 23140 I Each $24.8400 1 $24.84 4
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Bound Tree Medical 23140 Each $24.9800 1 $24.9B 5
Midwest Medical Su~y 23140 Each $25.6200 1 $25.62 6

68 02 Max BlTrac ED Mask. w/~eb, Adult lG, w/3·S~valve No substitutions

Bound Tree Medical Each $39.9500 10 $399.50 1
Nashville Med. & EMS No bid

Henry Schein, Inc. No bid

Quadmed No bid

Moore Medical No bid

Midwest Medical Supply , No bid

6. 02 Max 8ITrac ED Mask, w/Neb, Adult MED, w/3·S~ valve No substitutions

Bound Tree Medical Each $39.9500 10 $399.50 1--
Moore Medical No bid

Quadmed No bid

Nashville Med. & EMS No bid

Midwest Medical Supply No bid

Henry Schein, Inc. I No bid

7. CPAP/capnolraphy Kit, OZMAX BITrac ED Mask, Adult lG, 3-S~Valve, DISS No substitutions

Moore Medical No bid

Quadmed No bid

Nashville Merl. & EMS No bid

Midwest Medical Supply No bid

Bound Tree Medical Each $46.3300 1 $46.33

Henry Schein, Inc. I No bid

71 CPAP/capnography Kit, OZMAX BlTrac ED Mask, Adult MED, 3·S~ Valve, DISS No substitutions
'-

Bound Tree Medical Each $46.3300 1 $46.33 1
-- -

Moore Medical No bid

Quadmed , NO bid

Nashville Med. & EMS No bid

Midwest Medical Supply Nobid

Henry Schein, Inc. No bid

72 Meea Movers Portable Transport Unit No Substitutions
.~

Bound Tree Medical Each $16.9900 10 $169.90 1
Midwest Medical Supoly GRA53376 Each $21.1800 10 $211.80 2
Henry Schein, Inc. Each $Z1.9200 1 $21.92 3
Moore Medical 81329 Each $22.4000 10 $224.00 4
Quadmed Each $24.8500 10 $248.50 5
Nashville Med. & EMS No bid

THE REMAINDER OF THIS PAGE WAS lEFT BLANK INTENTIONALLY

ITB 1'l.(J24 BU

PAGE 11 OF 12



VENDORS

BOUNDTREE MEDlCALLLC. 500 Tunle Crossin!!: Blvd. Dublin OH, 43016

HENRV SCHEIN,INC. PO BOl( 3227, Irmo, SC 29063

MOORE MEDICAL, LtC. 1690 New Britan Ave., Farmington, CT 03032

MIDWEST MEDICAL SUPPLY CO. 13400 lakefront Dr., Earth Gty, MO 63045

NASHVILLE MEDICAL & EMS PRODUCTS,INC. PO Box 64, Springfield, TN 37172

QUADMED,11210-1 Phillips Industrial Blvd., Jacksonville, Fl32256

PHONE If

800-533-0523

800-845-3350

800-234-1464

888-540-3232

61>-384-0576

904-880-2323

E-VERIFY

193018

204153

290841

199641

863032

400538

Local Vendors are Indicated by the desianation (LV). Award based off of Local Preference is indicated by the designation (LPA).

local Preference was not used to award this bid.

Minor discrepanices between the case price on the submitted bid and the award are due to roundinls.

RECOMMEND AWARDING TO AU VENDORS BASED ON PRICE AND AVAIlABILITY FOR THE BID PERIOD 04/01/2017 - 03/31/2018.

Date

RECOMMENDATION APPROVED BV:

DOl

tT8 lNU. 8t5
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