

Dry Goods Bid# SN-22-07								Vendor Name:	Gold star foods				Vendor Name:	Sysco				Vendor Name:	VALLEY FOOD SERVICE			
Description	Estimated Usage	Grain	M/MA	Bulk	IW	Acceptable Brands	Brand	Vendor ID#	Pack Size	Price Per Serving	Case Price	Brand	Vendor ID#	Pack Size	Price Per Serving	Case Price	Brand	Vendor ID#	Pack Size	Price Per Serving	Case Price	
1	BEANS, REFRIED, DEHYDRATED 6 bag case, low sodium	25			X		COOK QUIK	202680	6/30OZ	\$0.18	\$22.90	SANTAGO	82948	6 / 29.77Z	#VALUE!	\$26.49						
2	BEANS, GARBANZO 6 Can Case	56			X		TEASDALE	209788	6/#10	\$0.13	\$19.42	SYS CLS	4062337	6 / #10	#VALUE!	\$23.25	Our House	H5193	6/#10		\$20.22	
3	BEANS, PINTO 6 Can Case, low sodium	56			X		TEASDALE	209792	6/#10	\$0.14	\$19.87	CASACLS	3362274	6 / #10	#VALUE!	\$22.00	Bush's Best	1819	6/#10		\$26.87	
4	BEANS, VEGETARIAN 6 Can Case	56			X		TEASDALE	209795	6/#10	\$0.16	\$22.75	SYS CLS	7486510637	6 / #10	#VALUE!	\$23.94	Bush's Best	1637	6/#10		\$36.28	
5	BEANS, BAKED 6 Can Case, low sodium	56			X		TEASDALE	248480	6/108OZ	\$0.18	\$25.53	SYS CLS	8326607	6 / #10	#VALUE!	\$31.50	Bush's Best	1619	6/#10		\$36.28	
6	BEANS, BLACK 6 Can Case, low sodium	56			X		TEASDALE	209125	6/#10	\$0.13	\$19.08	CASACLS	CSO-ADB-0610	6 / #10	#VALUE!	\$24.54	Bush's Best	1885	6/#10		\$27.48	
7	CANNED, APPLESAUCE 6 Can Case, low sodium	56			X		CHERRY CENTRAL	249299	6/10#	\$0.17	\$24.47	SYS CLS	A191737	6 / #10	#VALUE!	\$28.06	Our House	H5145	6/#10		\$26.41	
8	CANNED, APPLESAUCE must equal 1/2 cup fruit per serving				X		MOTTS	209163	72/4.5OZ	\$0.24	\$17.04	MUSSLMN	FFASU8000MUS01	6 / #10	#VALUE!	\$34.36						
9	CANNED, GREEN BEANS 6 Can Case, low sodium	56			X		SENECA	239232	6/#10	\$0.18	\$26.23	SYS CLS	F3101583	6 / #10	#VALUE!	\$28.42	Our House	H5201	6/#10		\$22.83	
10	CANNED, CORN, KERNELS 6 Can Case, low sodium	56			X		SENECA	239230	6/#10	\$0.18	\$25.88	LIBBY	F003710003490	6 / #10	#VALUE!	\$27.36						
11	CANNED, ENCHILADA SAUCE, RED 6 Can Case, low sodium	56			X	Rosarita	LAS PALMAS	202666	6/#10	\$0.21	\$29.61	ROSARTA	4430010649	6 / #10	#VALUE!	\$39.59	Las Palmas	11050	6/#10		\$29.61	
12	CANNED, ENCHILADA SAUCE, GREEN 6 can case, low sodium	56			X		LAS PALMAS	202800	6/#10	\$0.24	\$34.07	LAS PAL	7411024	6 / #10	#VALUE!	\$33.34	Las Palmas	11024	6/#10		\$34.07	
13	CANNED, JALAPENO PEPPERS, SLICED 6 Can Case, low sodium	25			X		DEL SOL	209918	6/#10	\$0.15	\$20.99	SYS REL	950357	6 / #10	#VALUE!	\$26.83	Las Palmas	63348	6#10		\$31.40	
14	CANNED, MIXED FRUIT 6 Can Case, lite syrup	56			X		DEL MONTE	248565	6/#10	\$0.33	\$47.56	SYS CLS	2183368	6 / #10	#VALUE!	\$40.53	Our House	H5501	6/#10		\$28.26	
15	CANNED, PEACHES, SLICED 6 Can Case, lite syrup	56			X		DEL MONTE	248500	6/#10	\$0.30	\$43.00	SYS CLS	2181705	6 / #10	#VALUE!	\$39.79	Our House	H5717	6/#10		\$30.43	
16	CANNED, PEARS, DICED 6 Can Case, lite syrup	56			X		DEL MONTE	248501	6/#10	\$0.28	\$40.75	SYS CLS	734730425290	6 / #10	#VALUE!	\$42.47	Our House	H5753	6/#10		\$28.26	
17	CANNED, PEAS 6 Can Case, low sodium	56			X		SENECA	209063	6/#10	\$0.24	\$34.46	SYS REL	47215511	6 / #10	#VALUE!	\$34.54						
18	CANNED, BEEF RAVIOLI whole grain, 6 Can Case, low sodium	100	2	2	X	Chef Boyardee 64144-81080	CHEF BOYARDEE	201088	6/#10	\$0.40	\$57.30	CHEFBOY	6414481080	6 / #10	#VALUE!	\$58.34						
19	CANNED, SALSA 6 Can Case, low sodium	25			X	Salsa Mexicana	RED GOLD	401440	6/#10	\$0.23	\$32.44	DEL SOL	DS-00146	6 / #10	#VALUE!	\$27.76						
20	CANNED, TOMATO PASTE	112			X		CHH	210252	6/#10	\$0.18	\$25.44	SYS IMP	5096433	6 / 10#	#VALUE!	\$27.14	Our House	H6141	6/#10		\$19.57	
21	CEREAL, ASSORTED FLAVORS whole grain, low sugar, 2 oz	1000					MALT O MEAL	240239, 240173, 240172, 240171, 203173, 202851	48/2OZ	\$0.36	\$17.32	KELLOGG	3800012611	60 / EA	#VALUE!	\$51.49						
22	CEREAL, BOWL, CHERRIOS whole grain, low sugar, 2 oz, gluten-free	1000	2		X		GENERAL MILLS	203160	96/1OZ	\$0.22	\$20.99	GM	32262000	96 / 1 OZ	#VALUE!	\$21.52						
23	CEREAL, BOWL, CINNAMON TOASTERS whole grain, low sugar, 2 oz	1000	2		X		GENERAL MILLS	248634	60/2OZ	\$0.40	\$23.72	GM	31879000	96 / 1 OZ	#VALUE!	\$21.52	Malt-O-Meal	13820	48/2oz		\$17.86	
24	CEREAL, BOWL, CHERRIOS, HONEY NUT whole grain, low sugar, 2 oz, gluten-free	1000	2		X		GENERAL MILLS	248632	60/2OZ	\$0.40	\$23.72	GM	11918000	96 / 1 OZ	#VALUE!	\$21.52						

Dry Goods Bid# SN-22-07							Vendor Name:	Gold star foods				Vendor Name:	Sysco				Vendor Name:	VALLEY FOOD SERVICE					
Description	Estimated Usage	Grain	M/MA	Bulk	IW	Acceptable Brands	Brand	Vendor ID#	Pack Size	Price Per Serving	Case Price	Brand	Vendor ID#	Pack Size	Price Per Serving	Case Price	Brand	Vendor ID#	Pack Size	Price Per Serving	Case Price		
25	CEREAL, BOWL, COCO PUFFS whole grain, low sugar, 2 oz	1000	2			X	GENERAL MILLS	248633	60/2OZ	\$0.40	\$23.72	GM	31888000	96 / 1.063Z	#VALUE!	\$21.52							
26	CEREAL, BOWL, FROSTED FLAKES whole grain, low sugar, 2 oz	1000	2			X	MALT O MEAL	240239	48/2OZ	\$0.36	\$17.32	GM	11768000	96 / 1 OZ	#VALUE!	\$21.52	Malt-O-Meal	955	48/2oz			\$17.86	
27	CEREAL, BOWL, FROSTED SHREDDED WHEAT whole grain, low sugar, 2 oz	1000	2			X	MALT O MEAL	240171	48/2OZ	\$0.36	\$17.32	KELLOGG	3800004996	96 / 1 OZ	#VALUE!	\$24.19	Post	27149	48/2oz			\$17.86	
28	CEREAL, BOWL, RICE KRISPIES whole grain, low sugar, 2 oz gluten-free	1000	2			X	KELLOGGS	203151	96/1OZ	\$0.25	\$24.11	MALT OM	10905	48 / 2 OZ	#VALUE!	NO BID							
29	CEREAL, BOWL, HONEY SCOOTERS whole grain, low sugar, 2oz	1000	2			X	MALT O MEAL	203173	48/2OZ	\$0.36	\$17.32	MALT OM	8676	48 / 2 OZ	#VALUE!	\$17.37	Malt-O-Meal	8676	48/2oz			\$17.86	
30	CEREAL, BOWL, MARSHMALLOW MATEYS whole grain, low sugar, 2 oz	1000	2			X	MALT O MEAL	201560	48/2OZ	\$0.36	\$17.32	MALT OM	5940	48 / 2 OZ	#VALUE!	\$17.37	Malt-O-Meal	5940	48/2oz			\$17.86	
31	CEREAL, BOWL, CINNAMON CHEX whole grain, low sugar, 2 oz	1000	2			X	GENERAL MILLS	248631	60/2OZ	\$0.40	\$23.72	GM	16000-14883	60 / 2 OZ	#VALUE!	\$24.71							
32	CEREAL, BOWL, LUCKY CHARMS whole grain, low sugar, 2 oz	1000	2			X	GENERAL MILLS	248630	60/2OZ	\$0.40	\$23.72	GM	16000-14884	60 / 2 OZ	#VALUE!	\$24.71							
33	CEREAL, BOWL, CINNAMON TOAST CRUNCH whole grain, low sugar, 2 oz	1000	2			X	GENERAL MILLS	248634	60/2OZ	\$0.40	\$23.72	GM	11815000	96 / 1 OZ	#VALUE!	\$21.52							
34	CEREAL, BAR, CINNAMON TOAST CRUNCH whole grain, low sugar, low sodium	1000	1			X	General Mills	GENERAL MILLS	203135	96/1.42OZ	\$0.28	\$26.70	GM	16000-45576	96 / 1.42OZ	#VALUE!	\$26.40	General Mills	45576000	96/1.42oz			\$31.88
35	CEREAL, BAR, COCO PUFFS whole grain, low sugar, low sodium, 96 EA Case	1000	1			X	General Mills	GENERAL MILLS	203136	96/1.42OZ	\$0.28	\$26.70	GM	16000-45577	96 / 1.42OZ	#VALUE!	\$26.40	General Mills	45577000	96/1.42oz			\$31.88
36	CEREAL, BAR, GOLDEN GRAHAMS whole grain, low sugar, low sodium, 96 EA Case	1000	1			X	General Mills	GENERAL MILLS	203121	96/1.42OZ	\$0.28	\$26.70	GM	16000-31913	96 / 1.42OZ	#VALUE!	\$26.40	General Mills	31913000	96/1.42oz			\$31.88
37	CEREAL, BAR, TRIX whole grain, low sugar, low sodium, 96 EA Case	1000	1			X	General Mills	GENERAL MILLS	203123	96/1.42OZ	\$2.97	\$26.70	GM	16000-31915	96 / 1.42OZ	#VALUE!	\$26.40	General Mills	31915000	96/1.42oz			\$31.88
38	CHEESE, CUP low sodium, must be 2m/ma 4oz	1000		2		X	TABATCHNICK	406899	96/3.65OZ	\$0.78	\$74.95	LOL	39911000034500	140 / 3 OZ	#VALUE!	\$71.21							
39	CHIPS, DORITOS, COOL RANCH low sodium, must be smart snack compliance	25				X	DORITOS	200724	72/1OZ	\$0.30	\$21.39	DORITOS	36096	72 / 1 OZ	#VALUE!	\$21.63							
40	CHIPS, DORITOS, FLAMAS low sodium, must be smart snack compliance	25				X	DORITOS	239220	72/1OZ	\$0.30	\$21.39	DORITOS	62829	72 / 1 OZ	#VALUE!	\$21.63							
41	CHIPS, DORITOS, NACHO CHEESE low sodium, must be smart snack compliance	25				X	DORITOS	200720	72/1OZ	\$0.30	\$21.39	DORITOS	31748	72 / 1 OZ	#VALUE!	\$21.63							
42	CHIPS, DORITOS, SPICY SWEET CHILI low sodium, must be smart snack compliance	25				X	DORITOS	202527	72/1OZ	\$0.30	\$21.39	DORITOS	49093	72 / 1 OZ	#VALUE!	\$21.63							
43	CHIPS, CHEETOS, BAKED, CRUNCHY, FLAMIN HOT low sodium, must be smart snack compliance	25				X	CHEETOS	208586	104/.875OZ	\$0.30	\$30.89	CHEETOS	62984	104 / .875OZ	#VALUE!	\$31.24							
44	CHIPS, CHEETOS, BAKED, CRUNCHY, CHEESE low sodium, must be smart snack compliance	25				X	CHEETOS	208585	104/.875OZ	\$0.30	\$30.89	CHEETOS	62933	104 / .875OZ	#VALUE!	\$31.24							
45	CHIPS, LAYS, BAKED, BARBEQUE low sodium, must be smart snack compliance	25				X	LAYS	200760	64/1.125OZ	\$0.44	\$28.44	BKDLAYS	32078	60 / .875OZ	#VALUE!	\$18.34							
46	CHIPS, LAYS, BARBEQUE low sodium, must be smart snack compliance	25				X	LAYS	202892	60/.875OZ	\$0.30	\$17.83	LAYS	11044	104 / 1 OZ	#VALUE!	\$31.24							
47	CHIPS, LAYS, KETTLE, JALAPENO CHEDDAR low sodium, must be smart snack compliance	25				X	FRITO LAY	252589	64/1.375OZ	\$0.45	\$28.48	LAYS	25111	64 / 1.375Z	#VALUE!	\$28.69							
48	CHIPS, LAYS, PLAIN low sodium, must be smart snack compliance	25				X	LAYS	200762	64/1.125OZ	\$0.44	\$28.44	LAYS	28400443593	64 / 1.5 OZ	#VALUE!	\$30.34							
49	CHIPS, RUFFLES, BAKED, SOUR CREAM CHEDDAR	25				X																	

Dry Goods Bid# SN-22-07							Vendor Name:	Gold star foods				Vendor Name:	Sysco				Vendor Name:	VALLEY FOOD SERVICE						
49	Description	Estimated Usage	Grain	M/MA	Bulk	IW	Acceptable Brands	Brand	Vendor ID#	Pack Size	Price Per Serving	Case Price	Brand	Vendor ID#	Pack Size	Price Per Serving	Case Price	Brand	Vendor ID#	Pack Size	Price Per Serving	Case Price		
									low sodium, must be smart snack compliance					X		RUFFLES	203718	60/.8OZ	\$0.30	\$17.83	RUFFLES	36445	104 / 1 OZ	#VALUE!
50	CHIPS, SUN CHIPS, MULTIGRAIN low sodium,	200	1			X	Sun Chips	SUN CHIPS	200698	104/1OZ	\$0.30	\$30.89	SUNCHIP	36445	104 / 1 OZ	#VALUE!	\$30.88							
51	CHIPS, TORTILLA, ROUND 2oz, low sodium, must be 2gb	2000	2			X		LA VENCEDORA	209542	150/2OZ	\$0.19	\$28.70	TOSTITO	30103	64 / 1.45OZ	#VALUE!	\$27.95	Warnock	31146	120/1.5oz			\$30.39	
52	COFFEE, CLASSIC 6 Can Case	10				X		FOLGERS	248365	6/51OZ	\$0.31	\$64.28	NESCAFE	28000461232	6 / 7OZ	#VALUE!	\$34.41							
53	COFFEE, DECAFFEINATED 6 Can Case	5				X		FOLGERS	210123	6/33.9OZ	\$0.32	\$67.66	NESCAFE	28000471101	6 / 3.5OZ	#VALUE!	\$20.13							
54	CORNMEAL 25 Pound sack	5				X		THE LANGLOIS COMPANY	201408	25LB	\$0.17	\$19.49	QUAKER	30000570203	1 / 25 LB	#VALUE!	\$13.27							
55	CRAISINS 200 Ea Case	100				X		OCEAN SPRAY	203165, 203180, 239300, 249269	200/1.16OZ	\$0.22	\$44.09	OCNSPRY	22545	200 / 1.16OZ	#VALUE!	\$45.79							
56	CROUTON, SEASONED whole grain, 200 EA Case	5	0.25			X		SUGAR FOODS	201994	250/.25OZ	\$0.07	\$17.98	ELZBETH	HOMESTYLE	225 / .65OZ	#VALUE!	\$36.70							
57	CUP, APPLESAUCE must equal 1/2 cup fruit per serving	200				X		MOTTS	209163	72/4.5OZ	\$0.24	\$17.04	SYS CLS	FCASU8000SYS02	72 / 4 OZ	#VALUE!	\$22.27							
58	CUP, DICED PEACHES light syrup, must equal 1/2 cup fruit per serving	200				X		ZEE ZEE	406672	72/4.5OZ	\$0.58	\$41.77	SYS CLS	2603013	48 / 4 OZ	#VALUE!	\$22.49							
59	CUP, DICED PEARS light syrup, must equal 1/2 cup fruit per serving	200				X		ZEE ZEE	406674	72/4.5OZ	\$0.57	\$41.29	SYS CLS	889356056424	24 / 4OZ	#VALUE!	\$12.92							
60	CUPS, MARINARA 2.5 OZ, must equal 1/2 cup veg.	1500				X		RED GOLD	404036	84/2.5OZ	\$0.31	\$25.71	AREZCLS	5043478	72 / 2.5 OZ	#VALUE!	\$18.61							
61	CUPS, SOY BUTTER	25		1		X		SUNBUTTER	208125	200/1.1 OZ	\$0.29	\$58.60	SUNBUTR	19426	140 / 2.2 OZ	#VALUE!	\$65.53	Sunbutter	7.38E+11	200/1.1oz			\$58.70	
62	FLOUR, ALL PURPOSE 50 pound	5				X		GOLD MEDAL	100892	50LB	N/A	\$17.06	SYS CLS	52124000	1 / 50 LB	#VALUE!	\$16.41							
63	FLOUR, WHITE, WHOLE WHEAT 50 pound	5				X		GOLD MEDAL	209388	50LB	N/A	\$17.83	GOLDMDL	58072000	1 / 50 LB	#VALUE!	\$14.39							
64	GATORADE, LEMON LIME, G2 12OZ, must be smart snack compliance	50				X		GATORADE	TBD	24/12OZ	\$0.50	\$11.88 +CRV	GATRADE	12463	24 / 12 OZ	#VALUE!	12.2							
65	GATORADE, ORANGE, G2 12OZ, must be smart snack compliance	50				X		GATORADE	203298	24/12OZ	\$0.50	\$11.88 +CRV	GATRADE	12204	24 / 12 OZ	#VALUE!	12.2							
66	GATORADE, GRAPE, G2 12OZ, must be smart snack compliance	50				X		GATORADE	203299	24/12OZ	\$0.50	\$11.88 +CRV	GATRADE	12203	24 / 12 OZ	#VALUE!	12.2							
67	GATORADE, GLACIER FREEZE, G2 12OZ, must be smart snack compliance	50				X		GATORADE	203300	24/12OZ	\$0.50	\$11.88 +CRV	GATRADE	12007	24 / 12 OZ	#VALUE!	12.2							
68	GATORADE, FRUIT PUNCH, G2 12OZ, must be smart snack compliance	50				X		GATORADE	203301	24/12OZ	\$0.50	\$11.88 +CRV	GATRADE	10052000122029	24 / 12 OZ	#VALUE!	12.2							
69	GATORADE, MIXED BERRY, G2 12OZ, must be smart snack compliance	50				X							MFG DISC	GATRADE	13297	24 / 12 OZ	#VALUE!	NO BID						
70	GRAVY, POULTRY low sodium,	100				X	Trio	KENT PRECISION FOOD GROUP	208147	8/14.1OZ	\$0.06	\$34.88	TRIO	5000038282	8 / 22.6OZ	#VALUE!	\$35.50							
71	JUICE, APPLE, SHELF STABLE 100% fruit, 4OZ, 1/2 cup fruit per serving	5000				X		SUNCUP	239171	40/4.23OZ	\$0.16	\$6.31	APPLEVE	86000	40 / 125ML	#VALUE!	\$6.79	Suncup	400305	40/4.23oz			\$5.96	
72	JUICE, BERRY BERRY, SHELF STABLE 100% fruit, 4OZ, 1/2 cup fruit per serving	5000				X		SUNCUP	249259	40/4.23OZ	\$0.16	\$6.31	APPLEVE	84527	36 / 200ML	#VALUE!	\$8.35	Suncup	402505	40/4.23oz			\$5.96	
73	JUICE, CRANBERRY RASPBERRY, SHELF STABLE 100% fruit, 4OZ, 1/2 cup fruit per serving	5000				X		SUNCUP	248411	40/4.23OZ	\$0.16	\$6.31	APPLEVE	86006	40 / 125ML	#VALUE!	\$6.79	Suncup	402300	40/4.23oz			\$5.96	

Dry Goods Bid# SN-22-07								Vendor Name:	Gold star foods				Vendor Name:	Sysco				Vendor Name:	VALLEY FOOD SERVICE			
Description	Estimated Usage	Grain	M/MA	Bulk	IW	Acceptable Brands	Brand	Vendor ID#	Pack Size	Price Per Serving	Case Price	Brand	Vendor ID#	Pack Size	Price Per Serving	Case Price	Brand	Vendor ID#	Pack Size	Price Per Serving	Case Price	
74	JUICE, FRUIT PUNCH, SHELF STABLE 100% fruit, 4OZ, 1/2 cup fruit per serving	5000				X	SUNCUP	249239	40/4.23OZ	\$0.16	\$6.31	APPLEVE	86001	40 / 125ML	#VALUE!	\$6.79	Suncup	400805	40/4.23oz		\$5.96	
75	JUICE, GRAPE, SHELF STABLE 100% fruit, 4OZ, 1/2 cup fruit per serving	5000				X	SUNCUP	249257	40/4.23OZ	\$0.16	\$6.31	APPLEVE	86004	40 / 125ML	#VALUE!	\$6.79	Suncup	400505	40/4.23oz		\$5.96	
76	JUICE, PROPEL, GRAPE must be smart snack compliance	25					PROPEL	TBD	24/16.9OZ	\$0.56	\$13.39 +CRV	PROPEL		24 / 500ML	#VALUE!	13.67						
77	JUICE, PROPEL, BERRY must be smart snack compliance	25					PROPEL	209757	24/16.9OZ	\$0.56	\$13.39 +CRV	PROPEL	169	24 / 500 ML	#VALUE!	NO BID						
78	JUICE, PROPEL, LEMON must be smart snack compliance	25					PROPEL	209759	24/16.9OZ	\$0.56	\$13.39 +CRV	PROPEL	167	24 / 500 ML	#VALUE!	16.4						
79	JUICE, PROPEL, STRAWBERRY KIWI must be smart snack compliance	25					PROPEL	209758	24/16.9OZ	\$0.56	\$13.39 +CRV	PROPEL	171	24 / 500 ML	#VALUE!	NO BID						
80	MILK, DRY, INSTANT 25 lb sack	5			X		THE LANGLOIS COMPANY	249298	55LB	N/A	\$120.43	SYS CLS	4231528	1 / 25 LB	#VALUE!	\$58.19						
81	MILK, SHELF STABLE, CARTON case	25			X		GOSSNER	203000, 203029, 203476	27/8OZ	\$0.35	\$9.52	HERSHEY	259	27 / 8OZ	#VALUE!	\$17.29						
82	MILK, SOY, ULTRA 8 OZ, 24 EA Case, 10G Protein	500			X		KIKKOMAN INTERNATIONAL	207888, 207889	24/8OZ	\$0.71	\$17.12	PACIFIC	8311	24 / 8 OZ	#VALUE!	\$19.71						
83	MILK, LACTAID	100			X						NO BID	DARIGLD	340520	6 / .5 GAL	#VALUE!	20.02						
84	OIL, VEGETABLE all vegetable, 4 Gal Case	5			X		AVO	210233	6/1GAL	N/A	\$39.46	LAS SPAG	11238	6 / 1GAL	#VALUE!	\$38.83						
85	ORANGE, ZESTY SAUCE low sodium, 4 Gal Case	5			X		MINOR'S	201662	4/.5 GAL	\$0.06	\$36.70	MINOR	50000547425USL	4 / .5 GAL	#VALUE!	\$44.44						
86	PACKET, TAJIN, SEASONING low sodium	100			X		TAJIN	209157	1000/.035	\$0.04	\$40.20	TAJIN	28805	1000 / 1 GRAM	#VALUE!	\$47.43						
87	PACKET, SUGAR	5			X		C&H SUGAR	203551	2000/.10OZ	\$0.01	\$12.97	SYS CLS	4000899	2000 / 1/10OZ	#VALUE!	\$13.38						
88	PACKET, SUGAR SUBSTITUTE	5			X		SWEET & LOW	210162	1500CT	\$0.01	\$13.82	SWTPLUS	82051	2000 / 1 GM	#VALUE!	\$15.85						
89	PACKET, HOT SAUCE 9 grams	50			X	Del Sol	KRAFT HEINZ FOODS CO	TBD	500/9GR	\$0.04	\$21.27	FLVFRSH	76005	500 / 9 GM	#VALUE!	\$20.57	Del Sol	7.16E+11	500/9gm		\$16.37	
90	PACKET, KETCHUP low sodium	100			X		HEINZ	406611	1000/9GM	\$0.02	\$17.84	HEINZ	78004314	1000 / 9 GM	#VALUE!	\$17.97	Heinz	1.00E+13	1000/7gm		\$16.21	
91	PACKET, BBQ SAUCE	50			X	Heinz	PORTION PAC	201902	200/12GM	\$0.04	\$7.38	HSRCCLS	748656983600	500 / 12 GM	#VALUE!	\$17.77	Heinz	1.00E+13	200/12gm		\$12.64	
92	PACKET, MAYONNAISE	100			X		AMERICANA	202829	200/9GM	\$0.04	\$7.51	HEINZ	10013000531709	200 / 12 GM	#VALUE!	\$13.56	PPI	7.16E+11	200/12gm		\$9.68	
93	PACKET, MUSTARD	50			X		FOUR IN ONE	251281	500/5.5GR	\$0.01	\$7.23	HEINZ	10013000530504	500 / 1/5 OZ	#VALUE!	\$10.44	PPI	7.16E+11	500/5.5gm		\$8.32	
94	PACKET, RANCH DRESSING	100			X		AMERICANA	202633	200/12GM	\$0.03	\$6.09	HEINZ	10013000534502	100 / 1 OZ	#VALUE!	\$16.97	PPI	7.16E+11	200/12gm		\$8.11	
95	PAN COATING, AEROSOL 6 Can Case	25			X		PAM	209378	6/17OZ	\$0.00	\$16.22	SYS CLS	99955COM	6 / 17 OZ	#VALUE!	\$13.22	Pam	6414407263	6/17oz		\$24.17	
96	POP TARTS, STRAWBERRY whole grain, equal 1gb	500	1		X	Kellogs	KELLOGGS	202835	120/1.76OZ	\$0.31	\$37.44	KELLOGG	3800055130	120 / 1.69OZ	#VALUE!	\$37.64	Kellogg's	55130	120ct		\$40.08	
97	POTATO, MASHED, INSTANT LOW SODIUM	100				Idahoan 2970025313	IDAHOAN FOODS	406600	12/25.2OZ	\$0.11	\$41.98	IDAHOAN	2970025313	12 / 25.18Z	#VALUE!	\$41.98						
98	RAISELS, SOUR	100			X			249197, 249198,														

Dry Goods Bid# SN-22-07							Vendor Name:	Gold star foods				Vendor Name:	Sysco				Vendor Name:	VALLEY FOOD SERVICE				
Description	Estimated Usage	Grain	M/MA	Bulk	IW	Acceptable Brands	Brand	Vendor ID#	Pack Size	Price Per Serving	Case Price	Brand	Vendor ID#	Pack Size	Price Per Serving	Case Price	Brand	Vendor ID#	Pack Size	Price Per Serving	Case Price	
1/4 cup fruit equivalent	100				X		NATIONAL RAISIN CO.	249201, 249200	200/1.66OZ	\$0.27	\$53.99	RAISEL	5283	200 / 1.66OZ	#VALUE!	\$53.19						
98 RICE, BROWN, PAR BOILED	5			X			RICELAND	203005	25LB	\$0.12	\$11.73	PAREXCL	R2PX25QC0	1 / 25 LB	#VALUE!	\$13.13		1				
100 RICE, WHITE, PAR POILED	5			X			RICELAND	248582	1/25LB	\$0.13	\$12.50	SYS IMP	R1YK259Z0	1 / 25 LB	#VALUE!	\$14.57						
101 SALSA, DIPPING CUPS	1000				X		RED GOLD	404013	84/3OZ	\$0.37	\$31.42	REDGOLD	REDESC2ZC84	84 / 3 OZ	#VALUE!	\$30.49						
must meet .25 cup vegetable																						
102 SALT	5						UNITED SALT CORP.	210379	25LB	\$0.06	\$6.25	SYS CLS	100012377	1 / 25 LB	#VALUE!	\$4.90						
103 SNACK, ANIMAL, CRACKERS	5	1			X		KEEBLER	203304	150/1OZ	\$0.15	\$22.88	KEEBLER		150 / 1 OZ	#VALUE!	\$23.41						
must be 1gb/serving																						
104 SNACK, BUG BITE, CRAKERS	5	1			X		KEEBLER	202827	210/1OZ	\$0.20	\$42.03	KEEBLER	3010055644	210 / 1 OZ	#VALUE!	\$42.59	Keebler	55644	150ct			\$46.75
must be 1gb/serving																						
105 SNACK, GOLDFISH, CHEDDAR	5	1			X		PEPPERIDGE FARM	200290	300/.75OZ	\$0.17	\$52.03	PEPFARM	140004788	300 / .75 OZ	#VALUE!	\$50.52	Pepperidge Farms	140018105	300/.75oz			\$54.08
must be 1gb/serving																						
106 SNACK, GOLDFISH, GIANT CINNAMON	5	1			X		PEPPERIDGE FARM	248553	300/.9OZ	\$0.15	\$44.03	PEPFARM	15094	300 / .9 OZ	#VALUE!	NO BID	Pepperidge Farms	140026830	300/.9oz			\$45.28
must be 1gb/serving																						
107 SNACK, CHEX MIX, ASSORTED	5	1			X		GENERAL MILLS	CHEDRD, 200878-TRD CHEX,	60/1.03OZ	\$0.34	\$20.22-CHC, STR, CHE, \$20.86-TRD	GM	16000-31932	60 / .92 OZ	#VALUE!	20.1						
must be 1gb/serving																						
108 SNACK, CRACKERS, HONEY GRAHAM	5	1			X		MJM MARKETING	208146	150/1OZ	\$0.11	\$16.88	KEEBLER	3010091822	150 / 3 CT	#VALUE!	\$17.97	Keebler	91822	150ct			\$18.62
must be 1gb/serving																						
109 SNACK, GRAHAM, CHOCOLATE	5	1			X		MJM MARKETING	203017	300/1OZ	\$0.13	\$38.93	MJM	402001	300 / 1 OZ	#VALUE!	\$39.26	Keebler	40239	150ct			\$29.47
must be 1gb/serving																						
110 SNACK, GRAHAM, STRAWBERRY	5	1			X		MJM MARKETING	203020	300/1OZ	\$0.13	\$38.93	MJM	405001	300 / 1 OZ	#VALUE!	\$39.26						
must be 1gb/serving																						
112 SNACK, GRAHAM, VANILLA	100	1			X		MJM MARKETING	203019	300/1OZ	\$0.13	\$38.93	MJM	404001	300 / 2 CT	#VALUE!	\$39.26						
must be 1gb/serving																						
113 SNACK, FRUIT ROLL UP	5				X		GENERAL MILLS	239574	72/.5OZ	\$0.19	\$13.42	GM	11561000	96 / .5 OZ	#VALUE!	\$22.73						
100% fruit, must be smart snack compliance																						
114 SNACK, BAR, GRANOLA, OAT AND HONEY	5				X		NATURE VALLEY	200918	6-18/1.5OZ	\$0.41	\$44.39	NAT VLY	33530	108 / 1.5 OZ	#VALUE!	\$45.08						
must be smart snack compliance																						
115 SNACK, BAR, GRANOLA, CHOCOLATE CHUNK	5				X		QUAKER	209750, 202861	12/8CT	\$0.26	\$25.17	QUAKER	31186	12 / 8 CT	#VALUE!	\$24.88						
must be smart snack compliance																						
116 SNACK, RICE KRISPIES	5				X		KELLOGGS	203316	80/1.41OZ	\$0.40	\$31.65	KELLOGG	3800011052	80 / 1.41OZ	#VALUE!	\$32.15						
must be smart snack compliance																						
117 SNACK, SUNFLOWER SEEDS	250				X		SUNOPTA	5, 208261-HNY RSTD, 2	150/1OZ	\$0.17	\$33.48-HNY, \$35.50-HOT	SUNOPTA	1231780	150 / 1.2 OZ	#VALUE!	31.36						
1 OZ, 150 EA Case																						
118 SPICE, BAKING POWDER	5			X							NO BID	CHFCOMP	58001	6 / 5 LB	#VALUE!	45.16						
6 Pound																						
119 SPICE, BAKING SODA	5			X			RUMFORD	209265	24/1LB	N/A	\$16.44	CLABGIR	750	24 / 16 OZ	#VALUE!	\$16.09						
12 EA Case																						
120 SPICE, CELERY SALT	5			X			PACIFIC SPICE	202028	19OZ	N/A	\$4.59	IMP/MCC	974240	6 / 30 OZ	#VALUE!	\$36.67						
1 EA Case																						
121 SPICE, CHICKEN BASE	5			X			THE LANGLOIS COMPANY	209527	25LB	N/A	\$36.28	SYS IMP	72813SYS	2 / 8 LB	#VALUE!	\$59.69						
1 Pail																						
122 SPICE, CHILI POWDER	5			X			PACIFIC SPICE	209674	1LB	N/A	\$6.40	IMP/MCC	974250	6 / 18 OZ	#VALUE!	\$48.00						
1 EA Case																						
123 SPICE, CHOPPED ONION, DEHYDRATED	5			X			PACIFIC SPICE	202002	15LB	N/A	\$53.65	MC CORM	979608	1 / 15LB	#VALUE!	\$53.44						
15 pound																						

Dry Goods Bid# SN-22-07							Vendor Name:	Gold star foods				Vendor Name:	Sysco				Vendor Name:	VALLEY FOOD SERVICE			
Description	Estimated Usage	Grain	M/MA	Bulk	IW	Acceptable Brands	Brand	Vendor ID#	Pack Size	Price Per Serving	Case Price	Brand	Vendor ID#	Pack Size	Price Per Serving	Case Price	Brand	Vendor ID#	Pack Size	Price Per Serving	Case Price
124	SPICE, PAPRIKA 1 EA Case	5			X		PACIFIC SPICE	202072	1LB	N/A	\$6.55	SYS CLS	974086	6 / 1 LB	#VALUE!	\$22.06					
125	SPICE, TACO SEASONING MIX low sodium	5			X		KENT PRECISION FOOD GROUP	202903	25LB	N/A	\$95.40	LAWRYS	2150080110	6 / 9 OZ	#VALUE!	\$20.14					
126	STICKS, BEEF, HONEY PEPPERED 1.36oz, must be smart snack compliance	5		1		X	Highland	HIGHLAND BEEF FARMS	239641	24/0.5OZ	\$0.49	\$11.86	HGHBEEF	OW210	108 / 1 OZ	#VALUE!	NO BID				
127	STICKS, TURKEY, HONEY PEPPERED 1.36oz, must be smart snack compliance	5		1		X	Highland	HIGHLAND BEEF FARMS	239642	24/0.5OZ	\$0.46	\$11.02	HGHBEEF	211	108 / 1.2 OZ	#VALUE!	NO BID				
128	SUGAR, BROWN 50 pound sack	5			X		C&H SUGAR	210295	50LB	N/A	\$42.51	BKRSCLS	405504	1 / 50 LB	#VALUE!	\$43.16					
129	SUGAR, GRANULATED 50 pound sack	5			X		C&H SUGAR	210298	50LB	N/A	\$34.40	SYS CLS	403434	1 / 50 LB	#VALUE!	\$35.46					
130	SUGAR, POWDERED 25 Pound sack	5			X		C&H SUGAR	210299	25LB	N/A	\$20.29	BKRSCLS	405590	1 / 25 LB	#VALUE!	\$23.79					
131	TOSTADA, BOWL, SHELL whole grain	5	1		X		WARNOCK	202362	200/.077	\$0.12	\$23.60	WARNOCK	21300R	6 / 12 CT	#VALUE!	\$30.23	Warnock	2130R	144ct		\$35.45
132	TUNA, LIGHT CHUNK, YELLOW FIN	5			X		STARKIST	203863	6/66.5OZ	\$0.67	\$64.55	STRKIST	740110	6 / 43oz	#VALUE!	\$52.13	Starkist	123480	6/43oz		\$56.52
133	VINEGAR, WHITE 4 Gal Case	5			X		AVO	210234	4/1GAL	N/A	\$8.55	SYS CLS	SYS DG2508	4 / 1 GAL	#VALUE!	\$13.52	Rich N All	3604526001	4/1 gal		\$10.94
134	WATER, BOTTLED, DRINKING 16.9OZ, CASE	3500			X		NIAGARA BOTTLING	251288	40/16.9OZ	\$0.11	\$4.38 +CRV	NIAGARA	NDW05L40PSPPB	40 / 16.9OZ	#VALUE!	4.92	Crystal Geyser	24514	24/16.9oz		\$3.84

*estimated usage= annual projected usage subject to change without notice