BID TABULATIONS
ORANGE BEACH SEWER DEPARTMENT

OFFICE BUILDING
Project No. 20.03
MAY 7, 2020, 2:00 PM

o =k
THE HIGHLAND mstri'(ucnou BCM MORRING MW.ROGERS  [SUNCOAST PERSONS REED-HAYS D&B BUILDERs |GREEN-SIMMONS |C.ROBERDS A&R HARRIS TR CUNNINGHAM | BCM MORRING EMPIRE
GROUP e " |CONSTRUCTION  |CONSTRUCTION |CONSTRUCTION {SERVICES CONSTRUCTION CONSTRUCTION |[CONSTRUCTION [CONSTRUCTION [CONSTRUCTION DELANEY | CONSTRUCTION |BUILDERS GROUP

GENERAL

SEALED ENVELOPE - PROPOSAL X X X X X X X X X X

CONTRACTOR LICENSE NUMBER 42473 52287 49342 21886 26127 16313 38125 46677 22381 9322U

NOTATIONS ON ENVELOPE NA NA (815,815) ($29,000) NA NA NA NA ($31,000) (511,000)
SUPPLEMENT DOCUMENTS TO BID

004300 - Bid Supplements Cover Sheet X X X X X X X X X X

004102 - Attachment A - Bid Sales Tax X X X X X X X X X X

004310 - Statement of Compliance X X X X X X X X X X

004310.10 - Affidavit of Contractor X X X X X X X X X X

E-Verify Proof (Attachment to 004310.10) X X X X X X X X

A305-1986 Contractor’s Qualification X X X X X X X

004313 - Bid Bond X X X X X X X X X X

00610 - Disclosure Statement X X X X X X X
[ALLOWANCE

ALLOWANCE #1 $17.500.00 1$14,000.00 1$3,150.00 1$19,000.00 [s0.00 |$6,100.00 |s0.00 |$58.000.00 |$2.170.00 |$1.947.00 [s0.00 1$5.000.00 [$1,000.00 i $0.00 | $0.00 | s0.00 |
BASE BID

ACKNOWLEDGE ADDENDA 1-2 X X X X X X X X X X

BASE BID $733,123.00 $719,000.00 $633,300.00 $631,000.00 $0.00 $694,483.00 $0.00 $899,875.00 $700,830.00 $606,900.00 $0.00 $700,000.00 $732,830.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

NOTATIONS ON ENVELOPE - E ($15,815.00) ($29,000.00) . - E - E . - ($31,000.00) ($11,000.00) a = =

TOTAL BASE BID $733,123.00 $719,000.00 $617,485.00 $602,000.00 [NO BID $694,483.00 NO BID $899,875.00 $700,830.00 $606,900.00 NO BID $669,000.00 $721,830.00 NO BID NOBID_ NO BID

|

We hereby certify thajthe above is a true and accurate summary of bids for the above project.

pires 5/03/2021



