
HOTMIX

Vendor WILLIS B&C Duracap WILLIS B&C Duracap

TOP MIX 58.00$     58.00$  70.00$      68.00$      69.00$  No Bid

GRADING C MIX 56.00$     57.00$  70.00$      67.00$      68.00$  No Bid

GRADING CW MIX 61.00$     62.00$  70.00$      74.00$      72.00$  No Bid

GRADING BM MIX 56.00$     57.00$  70.00$      66.75$      68.00$  No Bid

STATE AID MIXES

Vendor WILLIS B&C Duracap WILLIS B&C Duracap

GRADING C MIX 56.00$     57.00$  No Bid 67.00$      68.00$  No Bid

GRADING CW MIX 61.00$     62.00$  No Bid 74.00$      72.00$  No Bid

GRADING 411D MIX 69.00$     67.00$  No Bid 79.00$      77.00$  No Bid

GRADING E 58.00$     58.00$  No Bid 68.00$      69.00$  No Bid

Awarded to B&F Hotmix

LAID IN PLACEPICKED UP

PICKED UP LAID IN PLACE

UNION COUNTY FINANCE
BID TABULATION

BID-0063 2019 HWY ASPHALT/FUEL/STRIPING/GUARD RAIL

1/16/2019
ASPHALT BID



VOLUNTEER HIGHWAY MARKINGS

COUNTY ROADS 340.00$         342.50$          

STATE AID -EVERYDAY 400.00$         385.00$          

STATE AID -5-7 DAYS 340.00$         362.50$          

Awarded to Volunteer Highway Supply
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BID-0063 2019 HWY ASPHALT/FUEL/STRIPING/GUARD RAIL

1/16/2019
STRIPING



HIGHWAY

MARKINGS

Guard Rail Used-12 gauge /LF 3.45$                 

Guard Rail New-12 gauge/LF 7.25$                     

Posts-New 6 foot /ea 45.25$                   

Used Flared Ends\ea 24.00$                   

Installation 6’3” 5.25$                     

Installation 12’6” 4.25$                     

Awarded to Highway Markings
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GUARDRAIL


