
ESCAMBIA COUNTY ENVIRONMENTAL ENFORCEMENT COMMERCIAL/RESIDENTIAL ABATEMENT PROJECTS

Vendor Registry Quote# EE LOT/DEMO 12/18/2020

Open Date:

Bids Due Close Date: 12/23/2020 2:00
Mandatory Walk-through 12/18/2020 8:30 a.m.

KMK Meadows JRH Custom
Maintenance Enterprises

Project Address Bid Amount Bid Amount Bid Amount Bid Amount Bid Amount Bid Amount Bid Amount

1 NO BID NO BID $8,000.00 NO BID NO BID $6,900.00 $7,654.00

2 2710 Midland Park Dr. PULLED PULLED PULLED PULLED PULLED PULLED PULLED

3 $600.00 $800.00 $500.00 $1,475.00 $1,750.00 NO BID NO BID

4 PULLED PULLED PULLED PULLED PULLED PULLED PULLED

5 $1,250.00 $2,500.00 $1,300.00 $1,375.00 $2,750.00 NO BID NO BID

6 $1,500.00 $650.00 $1,700.00 $1,175.00 $500.00 NO BID NO BID

7 $8,500.00 $3,500.00 $20,000.00 NO BID $2,650.00 NO BID $8,000.00

8 $880.00 $850.00 $950.00 $2,400.00 $1,950.00 NO BID NO BID

9 PULLED PULLED PULLED PULLED PULLED PULLED PULLED

10 $5,500.00 $2,000.00 $5,200.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $12,000.00

11 $7,000.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 NO BID NO BID $7,675.00 $6,500.00 NED

12 $6,900.00 $9,000.00 $7,000.00 $6,700.00 $5,950.00 NO BID $7,000.00

13 $2,200.00 $1,100.00 $2,000.00 NO BID $975.00 NO BID NO BID

14 $3,300.00 $2,000.00 $3,000.00 $4,275.00 $2,050.00 NO BID NO BID

15 $6,000.00 $4,800.00 $6,000.00 NO BID $3,450.00 NO BID NO BID

16 $3,500.00 $1,900.00 $3,000.00 $2,600.00 $1,450.00 NO BID $5,000.00

17 8465 Briese Ln. $4,700.00 $2,800.00 $5,000.00 NO BID $1,750.00 NO BID NO BID

19 8570 Argo Dr. NO BID NO BID $8,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $5,624.00

20 200 E Ten Mile Rd. PULLED PULLED PULLED PULLED PULLED PULLED PULLED

21 1961 N Roberts Cir. NO BID NO BID $8,000.00 NO BID NO BID $6,725.00 $5,462.00

22 8 E Ensley St. $1,900.00 $700.00 1,700.00 $725.00 1,650.00 NO BID NO BID

Vendor Totals $53,730.00 $38,600.00 $87,350.00 $20,725.00 $26,875.00 $21,300.00 $57,240.00

RESULTS ARE UNDER REVIEW AND NOT FINAL UNTIL ALL INSURANCE AND PERMITTING REQUIREMENTS HAVE BEEN 

CONFIRMED DO NOT COMMENCE ANY WORK OR OBTAIN ANY PERMITS UNITL YOUR PURCHASE ORDER HAS BEEN 

RECEIVED FROM ESCAMBIA COUNTY.

Collins Land 

Morris & 

Morris Welt Demolition Demolition Pros

7820 Stallworth Ln.

1011 Northview Dr.

1006 Kearny Dr.

34 Norwood Dr.

34 Randolph Dr.

33 Randolph Dr.

209 Lakewood Rd.

2203 W Lakeview Ave.

316 Rosalyn Way

6711 Flagler Dr.

22 Norwood Dr.

807 Arlington Dr.

503 Chaseville St.

106 Newman Ave.

9 Cousineau Rd.


