
Vendor Name and Address
Vulcan Signs
PO Box 1850
Foley Al 36535

Type Description In x in Unit Price w/out shipping
OM-3L Left Object 10 x 30 EA 12.92
OM-3R Right Object 10 x 30 EA 12.92
R1-1 Stop 30 x 30 EA 35.8
R1-2 Yield 30 x 30 EA 20.45
R2-1 Speed Limit XX 24 x 30 EA 31.05
R11-1 Road Closed 30 x 30 EA 38.81
R12-1 Weight Limit (Blank) Tons 24 x 30 EA 31.05
W1-1 90 Degree Curve 30 x 30 EA 38.81
W1-2 Gradual Curve 30 x 30 EA 38.81
W1-3 Reverse Curve 30 x 30 EA 38.81
W1-5 Winding Curve 30 x 30 EA 38.81
W1-6 Single Arrow 36 x 18 EA 27.94
W1-7 Double Arrow 36 x 18 EA 27.94
W1-8 Chevron 18 x 24 EA 18.63
W2-1 Cross Road Intersection 30 x 30 EA 38.81
W2-2 T Intersection 30 x 30 EA 38.81
W3-1 Stop Ahead (Symbol) 30 x 30 EA 40
W11-3 Deer (Symbol) 30 x 30 EA 38.81
W11-5 Tractor (Symbol) 30 x 30 EA 38.81
W13-1 XX MPH 18 x 18 EA 14.5
W14-1 Dead End 30 x 30 EA 38.81

No Passing Zones Unmarked 30 x 30 EA 38.81
Impassable During Highway Water 30 x 30 EA 38.81
Watch For Falling Rock 30 x 30 EA 38.81
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Very Dangerous Driveway 500 Foot 24 x 24 EA 24.84
Letters, White, Pressure Applied 2" Tall PK 12.8
Letters, White, Pressure Applied 4" Tall PK 15.5
Letters, White, Pressure Applied 5" Tall PK 18.5
Light Post - 7 Ft. with Tapered End 1.12 lb. EA 11.26
Medium Post - 4 Ft. with Tapered End EA 10.66
Break Away Type III Barricade EA 371.26
Type 1 Plasticade EA 74.66
24” Cones EA 30.97
36” x 36” Mesh/Roll up signs (various messages) EA 33.94
Mid-size stands for mesh/roll up signs EA 185.25
Medium Post – 8ft. with Tapered End EA 24.08
Medium Post – 10ft. with tapered End EA 30.1
5 ½” Flat Bracket-Channel post to aluminum sign EA 5.95
5 ½” Flat Bracket-U Post to aluminum sign  EA 5.95
5 ½” Flat Bracket-Cross EA 5.95
3 ¾” Flat Bracket- Universal Cross EA 7.95
Green Blanks 18 x 6 EA 6.81
Green Blanks 24 x 6 EA 9.87
Green Blanks 30 x 6 EA 11.28
Green Blanks 36 x 6 EA 13.42
Green Blanks 42 x 6 EA 15.71
No Parking Anytime 12 x 18 EA 11.16
No Parking Stopping Standing Anytime 18 x 18 EA 14.5
Stop Slow Hand Paddles  18 x 18 EA 21.17
Blanks that are Black 18 x 18 EA 14.5
Horse Symbol Signs 30 x 30 EA 38.81
Loose Gravel 30 x 30 EA 38.81
Fresh Oil 30 x 30 EA 38.81
Road Closed Due To Flooding 30 x 30 EA 38.81
30” Round RXR EA 36.21
RXR Intersection Symbol Signs 30 x 30 EA 38.81
One Lane Road Ahead 30 x 30 EA 38.81
Bridge Closed 30 x 30 EA 38.84



Franklin Co Maintenance Ends 6 x 9 EA 5.84
Franklin Co Maintenance Begins 6 x 9 EA 5.84
Type A, C, and 3-way Barricade Lights EA 38.87
Type A, C, and 3-way Solar Led Barricade Lights EA 61.8
Pedestrian Cross EA 42.3
Bus Stop EA 48.1
Red/Yellow Brite-May Post Reflectors, 36” EA No Bid
6” Blue Reflective Road Sign EA 27.68
9” Blue Reflective Road Sign EA 41.14
XX MPH 18 x 24 EA 18.63
Dangerous Intersection Sign 30 x 30 EA 38.81
No Passing Zones Unmarked 24 x 24 EA 24.84
Small Chevrons 18 x 18 EA 14.5
Slow Children Playing 18 x 24 EA 18.63
Slow Church Zone 30 x 30 EA 38.81
Uneven Lanes 24 x 24 EA 24.84
Uneven Lanes 30 x 30 EA 38.81
No Parking on Bridge 12 x 18 EA 11.16
No Dumping Violators will be prosecuted 12 x 18 EA 11.16
Horizontal Alignment 30 x 30 EA 38.81
Trucks Entering 24 x 24 EA 24.84
Brush Hog Ahead 30 x 30 EA 38.81
Dead End 24 x 24 EA 24.84
No Outlet 24 x 24 EA 24.84
2-way 6 x 12 EA 5.14
3-way 6 x 12 EA 5.14
4-way 6 x 12 EA 5.14
Cross Traffic does not Stop 12 x 24 EA 12.94
Road Closed Due to Flooding (Flip) 30 x 30 EA 192.28
Very Dangerous Driveway 500 Foot 30 x 30 EA 38.81
Cones 18" EA 13.96
Brackets Roll Up EA no bid
3.5 ft (2#) green Posts EA 10.4
Chevrons 18 x 18 EA 14.5



Chevron Brackets EA 41.5
Letters, Black. Pressure applied 2"tall EA 12.5
Letters, Black. Pressure applied 4"tall EA 15.5
Letters, Black. Pressure applied 5"tall EA 18.5
Mirror Image Chevron Double Faced Signs 18 x 18 EA 22.4
Mirror Image Chevron Double Faced Signs 18 x 24 EA 28.67
No Parking, Stopping, Standing anytime EA 11.16
W 1-10 L/R EA 55.89
6ft. 1.12# Delineator Post EA 9.41
Bump 24x24 EA 24.84
Bump 30x30 EA 38.81
Hidden entrance 30x30 EA 38.81
SMV Emblem Orange EA 13.91
Larger Brackets, 12", 90 degree EA 12.95
Larger Brackets, 12", 180 degree EA 12.95
Lager Brackets Crosspiece EA 12.95
Caution - Watch for Ice EA 24.84
Bridge Closed EA 24.84
One Lane Road EA 24.84
One Lane Bridge EA 24.84
Pavement Ends EA 24.84
Road Closed ___ Miles Ahead EA 38.81
Road Closed Ahead EA 38.81
Franklin County Property KEEP OUT EA 18.63
Hill Blocks View EA 38.81
Stop for Children in Crosswalk EA 18.63
Slow School Zone EA 24.84
Slow Curves Ahead EA 38.81
State law Yirld within Cross Walk EA 18.63
Fresh Oil EA 24.84
Loose Gravel EA 24.84
Yield EA 20.45
Yield to Oncoming Traffic EA 31.05
Yield EA 46.04



Do Not Block Driveway EA 11.16
No Loitering EA 11.16
No Parking Between Signs EA 11.16
No Parking Beyond This Point EA 11.16
No Littering EA 11.16
No Parking Anytime -> EA 11.16
No Parking Anytime <- EA 11.16
No Trespassing EA 11.16
All Way EA 6.13
Notice - This property is protected by Video Surveillance EA 18.63
Franklin County Property KEEP OUT EA 18.63
Slow Narrow Road Curves Ahead EA 38.81
No Box Van EA 24.84
No Tractor Trailer EA 38.81
Hidden Entrance EA 38.81
Markers both sides same way EA 20.28
Type I Barricades EA 74.66
Type II Barricades EA 89.15
Be Prepared to Stop EA 24.84
Yellow Blank EA 24.84
Yellow Blank EA 11.16
White Blank EA 24.84
White Blank EA 11.16

No Center Strip EA 38.81
Narrow Bridge EA 24.84
Slow EA 38.81
No Thru Trucks EA 18.63
Water Gauges EA 2.95
Slow Deaf Child EA 18.63

                                                  12' - 1'     72.47                                                     77.44



Franklin County Maintenance Ends EA 6.35
Franklin County Maintenance Begins EA 6.35
Pedestrian Traffic EA 38.81



Custom Products Corp Lightle Enterprises of OHIO
PO Box 54091 Po Box 320
Jackson MS 39288-4091 Frankfort, OH 45628

Price w/ shipping Price w/out Shipping 
45.61 14.42
45.61 14.42

53.6 42.7
28.49 24.22

45.1 39.6
54.87 43.25
51.21 43.25
54.87 43.25
54.87 43.25
54.87 43.25
54.87 43.25
45.05 31.14
45.05 31.14
27.05 20.76
54.87 43.25
54.87 43.25
64.73 43.25
54.87 43.25
54.87 43.25

22 15.57
54.87 43.25
67.78 43.25
59.97 43.25
67.78 43.25



53.44 27.68
5.02 6.6

11.51 9.4
36.25 11.3

No Bid 11.2
No Bid 10.4
No Bid 380
No Bid 53
No Bid 26.5

200 92.5
295 165

45 20.8
No Bid 26

7.35 3.3
7.35 3.3
7.85 3.3

No Bid 3.1
12.87 6.1
14.87 7.98

18.6 9.98
21.44 11.97
24.85 13.97
16.29 10.38
43.09 15.57

No Bid 15.57
No Bid 15.57
54.87 43.25
54.87 43.25
54.87 43.25
67.78 43.25
59.97 43.25
59.97 43.25

75 43.25
75 43.25



20 3.6
20 3.6
50 18.95
75 41.5

54.87 43.25
88 43.25

11.95 6.19
88.5 26.5

93 39.76
44.69 19.53
54.87 40.69
53.44 26.04

38.1 14.65
27.05 19.53
54.87 40.69
48.57 26.04
67.78 40.69
29.19 9.77
16.29 9.77
67.78 40.69
53.44 26.04
67.78 40.69
34.69 26.04
34.69 26.04
12.04 3.4
12.04 3.4
12.04 3.4

20 13.02
89 53.5

67.78 40.69
No Bid 13.98

45 37.1
14.88 7

35 14.65



32.95 35.6
5.46 6.5
8.54 9.3
18.5 11.2

55 18.9
68 25.5

16.29 9.77
88.15 58.59
17.75 9.7
34.69 26.04
54.87 40.69
54.87 40.69
17.02 27.1
14.95 11.3
14.95 11.3
14.95 11.3
48.57 26.04
48.57 26.04
48.57 26.04
48.57 26.04
48.57 26.04
74.48 40.69
58.87 40.69
44.69 19.53
54.87 40.69
52.85 19.53

65 26.04
74.48 40.69

80.9 19.53
48.57 26.04
34.69 26.09

No Bid 39.5
61.92 32.55

No Bid 57.5



29.19 9.77
16.29 9.77
16.29 9.77
29.19 9.77
16.29 9.77
16.29 9.77
16.29 9.77
29.19 9.77
10.44 5.05

49.5 19.53
49.5 19.53

67.78 40.69
48.57 26.09
67.78 40.69
54.87 40.69
69.88 13.57

No Bid 53.68
No Bid 57.1
59.97 26.04
37.69 26.04

17 9.77
37.69 26.04

17 9.77

67.78 40.69
48.57 26.04
54.87 40.69
29.81 19.53

No Bid 39.06
50.43 19.53

79.78    72.47                                                     77.44



23.02 6.2
23.02 6.2
54.87 40.69


