

Water and Wastewater Treatment Chemicals		
ADDENDUM # 1		
DATE	Wednesday, January 18, 2023	
BID NUMBER	2023-WP-04	
PRE-BID MEETING	Thursday, January 19, 2023, at 10:00 a.m. (local time)	
BID OPENING DATE	Tuesday, January 31, 2023, at 10:00 a.m. (local time)	

ADDENDUM MUST BE SIGNED AND INCLUDED IN YOUR RESPONSE TO THE RFB.

## **QUESTIONS**:

1. Would you also be able to send me a copy of the bid tabulation from the bid that opened March 4, 2022?

Answer: A tabulation from last year's bid is provided on page 3 of this addendum.

2. When is the latest date & time addenda will be issued after the 1/20 @ 10am ET deadline?

<u>Answer:</u> CCWA anticipates issuing the last addendum no later than 10:00 a.m. local time on Wednesday, January 25, 2023.

3. When is the earliest date we can mail our bid to make the 1/31 opening but have all addenda acknowledged?

<u>Answer:</u> This is discretionary to the bidders. Bidders must arrange accordingly to have their bid packages delivered prior to bid opening on Tuesday, January 31, 2023 at 10:00 a.m. local time to our offices, located at 1600 Battle Creek Road, Morrow, GA 30260 – Attention: Procurement.

4. Mississippi Lime Co. has been the incumbent supplier Hydrated Lime Ca(OH)2 to the Terry R Hicks WWP. I noticed in the recent bid request no line item for Hydrated Lime and just wanted to confirm if this material has been replaced or eliminated from your requirements. Can you please confirm?

<u>Answer:</u> The Terry R. Hicks WPP just recently went through an upgraded and added a liquid lime system. This liquid lime system will take the place of the hydrated lime system and we will no longer have a need for Hydrated Lime.

5. Are you willing to consider bids that guarantee a supply contract, but contain language allowing for price changes within the course of the contract period at the three, six and/or nine-month point?

<u>Answer:</u> The bid will be awarded for a 12-month period with no renewals and requires pricing to be firm during this time. Refer to the RFB documents on pricing.

6. I have tried to look for the bid tabulations from the 2022 Bid #2022-WP-07 on bidnet direct however I have not been able to find them. Could you send me a copy of these via email?

Answer: See answer to question No. 1 above.



Water and Wastewater Treatment Chemicals		
ADDENDUM # 1		
DATE	Wednesday, January 18, 2023	
BID NUMBER	2023-WP-04	
PRE-BID MEETING	Thursday, January 19, 2023, at 10:00 a.m. (local time)	
BID OPENING DATE	Tuesday, January 31, 2023, at 10:00 a.m. (local time)	

ADDENDUM MUST BE SIGNED AND INCLUDED IN YOUR RESPONSE TO THE RFB.

7.	Please confirm if a bid bond is required for price that exceeds \$100,00.00 per
	Division 2 Section 1 item 12.

Answer: A Bid Bond is not required.

8. To bid the proper coagulant, we will need to visit the plant and perform some jar testing. Could you please send the plant contact info so we can set this up?

<u>Answer:</u> The plants' main coagulants are displayed on the bid sheet. These coagulants must be bid on for this year's bid cycle. If you have a coagulant that you feel can make the plants run more efficient, please contact Coty Mcdaniel at <a href="mailto:coty.mcdaniel@ccwa.us">coty.mcdaniel@ccwa.us</a> to setup jar testing for next year's bid cycle.

Acknowledgment of receipt of this addendum must be signed and included in your bid response.	
COMPANY NAME	
SIGNATURE	
DATE	



Water and Wastewater Treatment Chemicals		
ADDENDUM # 1		
DATE	Wednesday, January 18, 2023	
BID NUMBER	2023-WP-04	
PRE-BID MEETING	Thursday, January 19, 2023, at 10:00 a.m. (local time)	
BID OPENING DATE	Tuesday, January 31, 2023, at 10:00 a.m. (local time)	
ADDENDUM MUST BE SIGNED AND INCLUDED IN YOUR RESPONSE TO THE RFB.		

## WATER AND WASTEWATER TREATMENT CHEMICALS Bid Opening: Tuesday, March 4, 2022 Final Bid Results

## -8 10 13 14 16 16 17 18 19 20 21 22 23 24 26 Sodium Copper Sulfate Med. Crystal Silica Fluoride (Prayon material COMPANY NAME OF BIDDER e 12.5% 55 gal dru drum / Ib of dry ton / Ib / gal / Ib / Ib / gal / gal / Ib / Ib / Ib / Ib / Ib / Ib / gal / Ib / Ib / Ib / Ib Affinity Chemical, LLC \$455.00 No Bld No Bld No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bld No Bld No Bld No Bid No Bld No Bid No Bld No Bld No Bld No Bid No Bld No Bld No Bld No Bid No Bld No Bid No Bid illed Universal Corporation Azure Water Services, LLC \$ 0.79 \$ 1.21 \$ 1.385 \$ 0.334 \$ 0.675 \$ 0.675 \$ 2.628 \$ 0.2178 \$ 0.365 \$ 3.00 \$ 1.85 \$ 0.1731 \$ 2.133 \$ 0.199 Brenntag Mid-South \$465.00 C&S Chemicals CarbPure Technologies \$ 1.25 \$ 6.901 Cedarchem, LLC \$ 1.61 \$ 1.81 Chemrite, Inc \$ 1.78 \$ 2.68 \$ 8.89 \$ 2.042 \$ 0.3365 Chemtrade Chemicals US, LLC Cheney Lime & Cement Co, Inc. Colonial Chemical Solutions, Inc. \$ 0.31 \$ 0.26 \$ 0.26 \$ 2.65 \$ 0.16 DPC Enterprises, L.P. \$ 1.745 \$538.81 \$ 0.409 G2O Technologies, LLC nternational Dioxide Inc. Resp. Kemira Water Solutions, Inc. \$ 1.614 \$ 0.1481 hoist North America Mississippi Lime Co. \$ 0.1366 Pencco \$ 1.60 \$ 1.60 \$ 1.60 Polydyne, Inc. Shannon Chemical Corporation \$ 12.74 Solenis LLC \$ 1.50 \$ 1.70 \$ 1.70 Southern States Chemical \$0.3279 \$ 0.283 Specialty Chemical Co. LLC \$ 0.5145 \$ 0.3585 \$ 3.64 \$ 4.8910 Sterling Water Technologies, LLC \$ 2,8393 \$1,2291 Thatcher Chemical of Florida, Inc. \$ 1.39 \$0.3611 \$1.1812 \$1.2700 \$ 2.9697 \$0.2560 \$0.2833 \$2.9700 \$ 0.1676 Jnivar Solutions Ineera Chemicals \$ 2.66 Lowest Bld Amounts: \$ 349,000 \$ 0.3279 \$ 0.283 \$ 0.1366 \$ 0.675 \$ 0.675 \$ 0.9453 \$ 2,628 \$ 4.8910 \$ 0.2178 0.26 \$ 2.65 1.745 \$ 0.16 \$ 1.50 \$ 1.60 \$ 1.61 \$ 1.70 \$ 1,2291 \$ 2.12 \$ 0.199 \$ 1.39 \$ 0.79 \$ 1.21 Colonial Chemical Solutions, Thatcher Chemical of Florida, Inc. Azure Water Services LLC Sterling Water Sterling Water DPC Southern States Chemical Specialty Chemical Co. LLC Lowest Bidders Mississippi Lime Co. Brenntag Mid-South Solenis LLC olydyne, inc. Solenis LLC LLC Co. LLC