
Porterville Unified School District Bid Solicitation 2020-2021 Solicitation is for Commodity Pricing Only

FROZEN FOOD 1

Commodity Bid
Vendor Name: GOLD STAR FOODS Vendor Name: Sysco Sysco Vendor Name: VALLEY FOOD SERVICE

Description
*Estimated 

Usage
Grain

M/
MA

Bulk IW Acceptable Brands
Brand Vendor ID# Pack SizePrice Per ServingCase Price Delivered Brand Vendor ID# Pack Size Price Per ServingCase Price Delivered Brand Vendor ID# Pack Size Price Per ServingCase Price Delivered Brand Vendor ID# Pack Size Price Per ServingCase Price Delivered

1
BAGEL, BREAKFAST SAUSAGE 100cs

1 1 X Ardella's, Schwan's, Beacon Street
ARDELLAS 406662 90/2.68OZ $0.53 $47.25 ARDELLA 80131 90 $0.54 $49.73 Integrated C80916 72/2.65oz $0.60 $43.34whole grain, beef or turkey sausage 

3
BAGEL, BREAKFAST SAUSAGE, SANDWICH 100cs

1.25 1.25 X
INTEGRATED 403850 72/2.65OZ $0.61 $43.90 ARDELLA 80131 90 $0.55 $49.73 Integrated C80916 72/2.65oz $0.60 $43.34whole grain, beef or turkey sausage 

5
BEEF, BURGER, MINI TWINS 1000cs

2 2 X
INTEGRATED TBD 250/1.2OZ $0.09 $23.72 DON LEE CB640 75 $0.86 $64.28whole grain, beef patty, mini twins, NO cheese

7
BEEF, CHEESEBURGER, MINI TWINS 1000cs

2 2 X
ADVANCE PIERRE 401356 80/5.5OZ $0.66 $52.55 DON LEE QCB655 72 $0.71 $51.70 Integrated C47220 75/4.35oz $0.73 $55.47whole grain, beef patty, mini twins

9
BEEF, PATTY 100cs

2 X
Don Lee, Integrated, JTM, Advance 

Pierre DON LEE FARMS 403572 240/2.25OZ $0.16 $39.29 DON LEE CN252603 192 $0.05 $9.59 AdvancePierre 10000013770 135 / 2.45 oz $0.13 $17.57 Integrated C32225B 140/2.25oz $0.21 $29.40low sodium >280mg

11
BEEF, RIB B QUE, PATTY 100cs

2 X JTM, Integrated, Advance Pierre
ADVANCE PIERRE 401372 100/3.25OZ $0.31 $31.02 USDA 100000013716 100 $0.31 $31.96 AdvancePierre 10000013716 100 / 3.25 oz $0.27 $26.81 Integrated C34225B 148/2.25oz $0.27 $40.14w/sauce

12
BEEF, RIB B QUE W/BUN 1000cs

2 2 X Integrated 
INTEGRATED 402027 75/4.36OZ $0.72 $54.03 USDA FP 10000003543 80 #VALUE! NO BID Integrated C46007 75/4.36oz $0.75 $56.394.71 oz, w/sauce, WG bun

13
BITES, BREAKFAST, CHICKEN SAUSAGE 25cs

 2 X   
RICH CHICKS 406757 4/5 LB $0.20 $46.82 TYSON 10195430928 4 #VALUE! 47.46 Tyson 10195430928 165 / 2.9 oz $0.26 $43.34 

14
BITES, NACHO, LIL BITES 25cs

2 2 X  The Fathers Table
FATHERS TABLE 406545 8/2.25LB $0.56 $40.20 FATHTBL 77044 72 $0.53 38.74whole grain corn flour, gluten free

15
BISCUIT & SAUSAGE 100cs

1 1 X
ADVANCE PIERRE 403461 100/3.1 OZ $0.42 $42.08 USDA 1331 100 #VALUE! NO BID Integrated C99018 100/3.1oz $0.52 $52.13turkey or beef sausage, whole grain Hawaiian

16
BREAD,  GARLIC CHEESE 25cs

2 2 X  
NO BID TONYS 68724 60 $0.51 31.19 Schwan's 68724 60ct $0.45 $32.542oz, whole grain

17
BREADSTICK, CHEESE STUFFED 25cs

1 1 X Bosco 
BOSCOS 405622 108CT $0.33 $35.98 TONYS 78359 60 $0.71 $42.73 Bosco 17020111120 144 / 2.141 oz $0.23 $32.462.86oz, whole grain, NO substitutions

18
BREADSTICK, CHEESE STUFFED 100cs

2 2  X The Max, Max Stick 
THE MAX 406461 84/3.86OZ $0.64 $54.01 THE MAX 7738712600 84 $0.64 54.08 Max Stick 77387-12600 84/3.6oz $0.64 $53.983.86oz, whole grain, NO substitutions

19
BURRITO, BEAN & CHEESE 1000cs

2 2 X
MCI FOODS/LOS CABOS 403406 96/5.20 OZ $0.58 $56.11 FRNANDO 5216 60 $0.58 35.25 Fernando's 33212 96/4.5oz $0.55 $53.74whole grain

20
CHEESE, QUESADILLA, BREAKFAST 1000cs

1 2  X
ROSE & SHORE 406705 72/2.2OZ $0.53 $38.05 IFS 362000 100 $0.61 61.41 Integrated C36400 100/1.95oz $0.46 $46.20 

21
CHEESE, QUESADILLA, GREEN SAUCE 1000cs

2 2  X  
MCI FOODS/LOS CABOS 403966 48/4.4OZ $0.74 $35.54 HOTOFFG 364000 100 $0.47 $47.44 

22
CHEESE, CUPS, JALAPENO 100cs

2 X Tabatchnick 
TABATCHNICK 406112 96/3.7OZ $0.34 $32.23 LOL 39911000034500 140 $0.39 55.483.7 oz. portion

23
CHICKEN, DRUMSTICK, BREADED 1000cs

2 X Tyson 
TYSON 405424 92/4.4OZ $0.65 $59.97 LOL 39911000034500 140 $0.39 $55.48 Tyson 16660100928 92 / 4.21-6.60 oz $0.60 $55.134.4oz, whole grain breading

24
CHICKEN, MANDARIN ORANGE 25cs

2 X Yang's 
YANGS 403886 1/43.5LB $0.54 $102.90 YANGS 15555-5 192 $0.54 104.07 Yang's 5th Taste 8-52724-15552-4 192 $0.59 $114.24low sodium, with sauce

25
CHICKEN, PATTIES, BREADED, CRISPY 100cs

2 X Tyson, Gold Kist, John Soule's
TYSON 404679 148/3.54OZ $0.29 $42.62 TYSON 10021540928 150 $0.27 41.16 Tyson 10703020928 132 / 3.75 oz $0.45 $58.79 John Soules 50415-WG 104 $0.32 $33.70white meat, whole grain breading

26
CHICKEN, PATTIES, SPICY, BREADED, CRISPY 100cs

2 X Tyson, Gold Kist, John Soule's
TYSON 404681 148/3.26OZ $0.29 $43.26 TYSON 10055670928 149 $0.28 42.17 Tyson 10703120928 132 / 3.75 oz $0.47 $61.80 John Soules 50011-WG 104 $0.32 $33.70white meat, whole grain breading

27
CHICKEN, MEATBALLS 25cs

 2 X   
TYSON 403441 2/5LB $0.27 $15.56 TYSON 10703140928 150 $0.27 $41.17 Tyson 10197770328 58 / 2.75 oz $0.24 $13.74

28
CHICKEN, NUGGETS 100cs

2 2  X Integrated
TYSON 404689 32.81LB $0.23 $42.31 USDA 10197770328 2 /5lb $0.26 $15.28 John Soules 40015-WG 104 $0.32 $33.70white meat, whole grain breading

29
CHICKEN, TENDERS, CRISPY 100cs

2 2 X
TYSON 403544 4/7.965 LB $0.26 $38.74 GLDKIST 615300 1 /30# $0.26 $41.55 Tyson 10703320928 117 / 4.23 oz $0.54 $63.53 John Soules 46015-WG 72 $0.48 $34.78white meat, whole grain breading

30
CHICKEN, SANDWICH, MAPLE 25cs

2 2  X  
BAKE CRAFTERS 139675 126/2.5OZ $0.65 $81.35 TYSON 10021550928 4 /BAGS $0.25 $34.97white meat, whole grain bun

31
CHICKEN, TENDERS, SPICY, CRISPY 100cs

2 X Tyson, John Soule's
TYSON 404688 31.86LB $0.28 $41.13 TYSON 10038590928 431 /1.13OZ $0.26 $38.52 Tyson 10703420928 119 / 4.14 oz $0.53 $63.53white meat, whole grain breading

32
CHICKEN, NUGGETS, SPICY 100cs

1 1 X
TYSON 403660 6/5.46LB $0.29 $43.72 TYSON 10703420928 4 /BAGS 0.38 69.61 Tyson 10703720928 126 / 3.8 oz $0.49 $61.50white meat, whole grain breading

33
CHICKEN, SWEET CHILI THAI 25cs

 2 X  Yangs 
YANGS 404027 1/43.5LB $0.60 $114.48 TYSON 10703440928 4 /BAGS 0.27 40.54 Yang's 5th Taste 8-52724-15550-0 6/5# 6/30oz $0.59 $114.24low sodium, peanut free, with sauce

34
CHICKEN, TERIYAKI AND BROWN RICE 100cs

1.5 2  X Yangs 
YANGS 409702 36/9OZ $0.29 $56.19 YANGS 15550 6 /5 LB #VALUE! 117.09 Yang's 5th Taste 8-52724-16667-4 36/9oz $56.788oz, whole grain rice, low sodium sauce

35
CORN DOG, CHICKEN 100cs

2 2 X
FOSTER FARMS 409658 72/4OZ $0.30 $21.95 0 /0 #VALUE! NO BID Foster Farms 94124 96/4oz $0.38 $36.82whole grain breading

36
DELI MEAT, TURKEY, HAM, SLICED, EXTRA LEAN 25cs

JENNIE O 400974 12/1LB $0.29 $28.01 FOSTRFM 94124 96 /4OZ 0.43 41.35

37
DELI MEAT, TURKEY, BREAST, SLICED 25cs

JENNIE O 405772 12/1.5LB $0.46 $43.89 FOSTRFM 95150 72 /4 OZ $0.31 $22.48

38
ENCHILADAS, CHEESE, RED SAUCE 2500cs

2 2 X
MICHAEL B'S BESTWAY 406591 35/7OZ $0.81 $28.44 JENNIEO 2099 12 /1 LB #VALUE! $26.99 Integrated C80944 42/5.6oz 1.02 $43.09whole grain

39
ENCHILADAS, CHEESE 100cs

2 2 X  
FERNANDOS 404664 112/2.35OZ $0.28 $31.66 HOTOFFG 809040 1 /120 CT 0.28 34.48 Integrated C80940 120/2.05oz 0.28 $34.26whole grain

40
PANCAKE, BREAKFAST, SANDWICH 1000cs

1 1 X Integrated
INTEGRATED 406778 42CT $1.27 $53.13 HOTOFFG C99120 100 /2.61OZ 0.56 56.06 Integrated C99120 100/2.61oz 0.55 $55.41whole grain

41
PASTA, ALFREDO SAUCE 500cs

1 2 X JTM
JTM 403777 6/5 LB $0.57 $45.82 JTM 5722 6 /5 LB 0.32 44.04 JTM 5722 6/5# 0.46 $61.90whole grain
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Commodity Bid
Vendor Name: GOLD STAR FOODS Vendor Name: Sysco Sysco Vendor Name: VALLEY FOOD SERVICE

Description
*Estimated 

Usage
Grain

M/
MA

Bulk IW Acceptable Brands
Brand Vendor ID# Pack SizePrice Per ServingCase Price Delivered Brand Vendor ID# Pack Size Price Per ServingCase Price Delivered Brand Vendor ID# Pack Size Price Per ServingCase Price Delivered Brand Vendor ID# Pack Size Price Per ServingCase Price Delivered

42
PASTA, RITTONI, WITH MEAT SAUCE 1000cs

2 X JTM 
JTM 401076 6/5LB $0.46 $37.15 JTM CP5501 30 /8 OZ #VALUE! 32.26 JTM CP5501 30/8oz $33.668oz, heat and serve, black tray, whole grain

43
PASTA, SPAGHETTI, WITH MEAT SAUCE 25cs

1 2 X JTM
JTM 401074 6/5LB $0.46 $37.06 JTM 5594CE 6 /5# #VALUE! 36.23 JTM CP5590 30# $37.02boil in a bag, whole grain

44
PASTA, SPAGHETTI, WITH MEAT SAUCE 1000cs

2 X JTM  
JTM 404722 30/8OZ $1.10 $32.97 JTM CP5502 30 /8oz #VALUE! 32.26 JTM CP5502 30/8oz $33.668oz, heat and serve, black tray, whole grain

45
PASTA, MACARONI AND CHEESE 25cs

1 2 X  Land O Lakes 
LAND O LAKES 401923 6/5LB $0.59 $45.71 LOL 43277 6 /5LB #VALUE! 44.74whole grain, low sodium, boil in a bag

46
PASTA, MACARONI AND CHEESE 1000cs

2 2 X
LAND O LAKES 401923 6/5LB $0.59 $45.71 LOL 43274 6 /5LB #VALUE! 42.52 JTM 5782 30/6oz $39.18whole grain

47
PASTA, CHEESEBURGER, MACARONI AND CHEESE 25cs

1 2  X  
JTM 401061 6/5LB $0.56 $43.75 ESFOODS 61854 48 /10.1OZ #VALUE! NO BID JTM CP5163 30/6oz $33.66whole grain

48
PIZZA, BREAKFAST, TURKEY SAUSAGE 1000cs

1 1.75 X Tony's
TONY'S 403948 100/3.67OZ $0.48 $48.15 TONYS 63912 1 /128 CT #VALUE! 37.22         whole grain

49
PIZZA, BREAKFAST, TURKEY SAUSAGE 25cs

1 1 X Tony's
TONY'S 403216 128/3.31OZ $0.29 $37.44 TONYS 63912 1 /128 CT #VALUE! 37.22 Tony's 63912 128ct $37.97whole grain, pre sliced

50
PIZZA, CHEESE 1000cs

2 2 X Tony's 
TONY'S 403232 72/4.56OZ $0.53 $38.26 TONYS 78697 96 /4.5 OZ 0.29 28.45 Tony's 78697 96ct $28.294.5oz, whole grain, low sodium

51
PIZZA, CALZONE 1000cs

2 2  X  
GILARDI 405433 60/4.69 OZ $0.70 $41.72 BUENVST 50721 80 /5.5 0.84 67.964.69oz, whole grain, low sodium

52
PIZZA, PINWHEEL, CHEESE 25cs

2 2 X  
EASTSIDE ENTREES 406802 96/4.1OZ $0.62 $59.05 EASTSID 25411 96 /4.1 OZ #VALUE! 54.55 Big Daddy's See Below 48ct4.69oz, whole grain, low sodium

53
PIZZA, TURKEY PEPPERONI 1000cs

2 2  X Tony's 
TONY'S 403233 72/4.56OZ $0.54 $38.92 TONYS 78314 60 /4.98OZ 0.71 42.74.69oz, whole grain, low sodium

54
PIZZA, TURKEY PEPPERONI 25cs

2 2 X Tony's 
TONY'S 403557 60/4.88OZ $0.67 $39.94 TONYS 78369 1 /60 CT $0.67 $40.07 Tony's 78314 60ct $43.685", whole grain, low sodium

55
PIZZA, 16" ROUND, PEPPERONI 25cs

2 2 X Big Daddy's 
BIG DADDY'S 405407 72/5.18OZ $0.81 $58.19 TONYS 78771 1 /96 CT $0.48 $46.935.18oz, whole grain, turkey pepperoni

56
PIZZA, SANDWICH, PEPPERONI 25cs

2 2 X Tony's 
TBD 48/4.46OZ $0.62 $29.93 0 /0 #VALUE! 36.14.46oz, whole grain, turkey pepperoni

57
POTATO, ROUNDS, (tater tots) 25cs

2 X
MCCAIN FOODS INC 405282 6/5LB $0.11 $21.80 MCCAIN 1000006188 6 /5 LB #VALUE! 24.9 Tony's 55290 48ct $29.17low sodium, >200mg

58
POTATO, FRIES, SPICY, SEASONED 25cs

2 X McCain 
MCCAIN FOODS INC 403283 6/5LB $0.11 $20.69 MCCAIN MCX04717 6 /5 LB #VALUE! 22.1 Simplot 1.01E+13 6/5# $14.76low sodium, >200mg

59
SANDWICH, GRILLED CHEESE, THREE CHEESE 1000cs

2 2 X  
INTEGRATED 406532 72/4.19OZ $0.54 $38.97 HOTOFFG 134000 72 /4.19OZ #VALUE! 39.24 Simplot 1.01E+13 6/5# $15.74whole grain

60
SANDWICH, PEANUT BUTTER W/JELLY 100cs

1 1 X Smuckers, Advanced Pierre
SMUCKERS 404615 72/2.6OZ $0.51 $36.56 SMUCKER 5150006961 72 /2.6OZ #VALUE! 37.79 Integrated C13400 72/4.19oz $39.85whole grain, strawberry, thaw & serve

61
SANDWICH, PEANUT BUTTER W/JELLY 100cs

1 1 X Smuckers, Advanced Pierre
SMUCKERS 404614 72/2.6 OZ $0.48 $34.89 SMUCKER 5150021028 72 /5.3 OZ #VALUE! $66.41 Smuckers 5150006961 72/2.6oz $36.95whole grain, grape, thaw & serve

62
SANDWICH, SOYBUTTER W/JELLY 100cs

1 1 X Albies 
ALBIES FOODS 134543 72/2.4OZ $0.68 $49.00 SMUCKER 5150021027 72 /5.3 OZ #VALUE! $63.12 Smuckers 5150006960 72/2.6oz $35.25whole grain, 2.4oz, thaw & serve

63
SANDWICH, CROISSANT, STEAK AND CHEESE 25cs

2 2 X  
NO BID USDA A594-03 107 /3 OZ #VALUE! NO BIDwhole grain, IW

64
SANDWICH, STUFFED CROISSANT, BACON/EGG 5cs

2 1  x Bakers Craft 
MFG DISC BAKCRFT 4708 48 /3.45EA #VALUE! NO BIDwhole grain, turkey bacon, 3.4oz

65
SANDWICH, TURKEY AND CHEESE 1000cs

1 1 X Integrated 
INTEGRATED 405420 100/3.1OZ $0.61 $61.10 HOTOFFG 130018 100 /3.4 OZ 0.6 60.013.4oz, whole grain Hawaiian roll, turkey ham

66
SANDWICH, TURKEY AND CHEESE, WEDGE 1000cs

2 2 X Tasty Brand 
TASTY BRANDS 406082 72/4.4OZ $0.94 $67.63 TASTY B 70513 40 /4.6 OZ 1.19 47.84 Integrated C13018 100/3.1oz 0.61 $61.79whole grain

67
SPAGHETTI, MEAT SAUCE, CHEESE 1000cs

2 2 X
JTM 401074 6/5LB $0.46 $36.21 JTM CP5590 6 /5# #VALUE! 35.48 Tasty Brand 70019 72/4.4oz $68.65whole grain pasta

68
TAMALE, CHICKEN 25cs

2 2 X
DEL REAL 138025 48/5OZ $0.87 $41.56 MICHL B TAC32 72 /5.5 OZ 1.05 76.13 JTM CP5360 30/8oz 1.23 $37.17must meet 2g & 2 m/ma

69
TAQUITO, BREAKFAST, CHORIZO AND CHEESE 25cs

1 1  X Integrated 
INTEGRATED 406514 100/2.4OZ $0.52 $51.86 USDA FP C18021 100 /2.4OZ 0.55 55.8 Integrated C18021 100/2.4oz 0.47 $47.892.4oz, whole grain

70
TACO, TOTALLY TACO 25cs

1.75 2 X The Max 
THE MAX 402030 96/4.09OZ $0.51 $49.25 THE MAX 7738712714 96 /4.09OZ $0.50 48.28 The Max 7787-12714 96/4.09oz 0.51 $49.044.09oz, whole grain

71
TACO, BEEF STICK 1000cs

2 2  X Integrated 
INTEGRATED 400930 50/4.6OZ $0.76 $37.88 IFS C45019 50 /4.7OZ #VALUE! 39.61 Integrated C45019 50/4.6oz $35.22whole grain, beef and cheese

72
TURKEY, CHUNKS IN GRAVY 500cs

2 X Jennie-O 
JENNIE O 400984 4/7LB $0.53 $59.54 JENNIEO 284728 4 /7 # #VALUE! 67.7low sodium, fully cooked, boil in bag

73
TURKEY, TACO FILLING 25cs

2 X Jennie-O 
JENNIE O 401834 4/7LB $0.41 $46.30 JENNIEO 285928 4 /7 LB #VALUE! 46.97fully cooked, no fillers, heat and serve

74
CHEESE, STICK, COLBY JACK 100cs

1  X
LAND O LAKES 401654 168/1OZ $0.21 $17.22 LOL 44878 168 /1OZ #VALUE! 20.16reduced fat, 1oz

75
CHEESE, STICK, STRING 100cs

1 X
LAND O LAKES 401174 168/1OZ $0.17 $14.44 LOL 59703000034500 168 /1OZ #VALUE! 13.91reduced fat, 1oz

76
CHEESE, SLICED, PEPPER JACK 5cs

X
LAND O LAKES 402004 8/1.5LB $0.87 $20.80 LOL 59701000034500 168 /1 OZ #VALUE! $12.94block

77
CHEESE, SHREDDED, CHEDDAR 5cs

X
LAND O LAKES 401146 4/5# PCH $0.19 $15.55 LOL 41749000034500 4 /5LB #VALUE! 13.3620lbs, 4 bags, reduced fat
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78
CHEESE, SHREDDED, MOZZARELLA 5cs

X
LAND O LAKES 401140 4/5# PCH $0.19 $15.33 LOL 41698000034500 4 /5 LB #VALUE! 13.1420lbs, 4 bags, reduced fat

79
CHEESE, SHREDDED, COLBY JACK 5cs

X
NO BID 0 /0 #VALUE! 14.5320lbs, 4 bags, reduced fat

80
CHEESE, SLICED, AMERICAN 100cs

X
LAND O LAKES 401166 6/5#-160CT $0.30 $24.36 LOL 46288000034500 6 /5 LB #VALUE! 24.87reduced fat

81
CHEESE, SLICED, CHEDDAR 5cs

X
LAND O LAKES 402003 8/1.5LB $0.87 $20.80 LOL 44224000034500 8 /1.5 LB #VALUE! 18.99reduced fat

82
CHEESE, SLICED, PEPPER JACK 5cs

X
LAND O LAKES 402004 8/1.5LB $0.87 $20.80 LOL 44238000034500 8 /1.5 LB #VALUE! 18.99reduced fat

*estimated usage= annual projected usage subject to change without notice

Big Daddy's 55291 48ct $30.70

Big Daddy's 55292 48ct $32.48

Big Daddy's 55293 48ct $32.17


