OFFICE OF THE PURCHASING AGENT

DATE: 10/16/2019 CITY OF KNOXVILLE TENNESSEE
BID TABULATION FORM

BID# 619679

BiD ON: Ammunition

DEPARTMENT: Police

AWARDED TO :
I Practice | Duty | Practice | Duty | Duty | Duty
| Remington 40 | Black Hills 45 | Remington .45 | BlackHills 5.56 | 556 mm NATO | Black Hilts .300

BIDDERS | ltem 1 [ ltem 2 | item 3 | ltem 4 | item 5 { item 6

| I ] [ | I

Craig's Firearms Supply ] $754.74 | No Bid i $22,218.75 | No Bid i No Bid | No Bid
| | I | I !

The Hunting Shack | $1,121.40 } No Bid | $29,580.00 | No Bid | No Bid i No Bid
I [ | ! J I

Accurate Law Enforcemen | $651.00 [ No Bid | $18,750.00 | No Bid ] No Bid | No Bid
! I | | f I

Guif States Dist. ] $687.00 | No Bid ] $20,175.00 | No Bid } $7.700.00 | No Bid
I l mssw— [ —— e ———

Elmer Arms South | No Bid | 52$24,000.001) No Bid | =$22,800.00 ] 1) ER540,800.000
| e | e m— | I

Precision  Delta | $627.00 00| No Bid | 27817:925.000 1| No Bid | No Bid | No Bid
I I | I I I
! I | I I |
i I I J I i
f ! I ! !
I i I ! ! |
I | | [ ! I
I I ! I [ I
! | [ I I !
I I I I | {
I I I I I I
I [ | ! ! I

/{/ﬂi} ) /"’7 //,‘} ) 5 /:g
| CERTIFY THAT THIS IS A TRUE AND ACCURATE //f{ s g?}:’ /,j ;’/ @:/
TABULATION OF THE BIDS THAT WERE RECEIVED -4 AL VA 7




OFFICE OF THE PURCHASING AGENT

DATE; 10/16/2019 CITYOF KNOXVILLE TENNESSEE
BID TABULATION FORM

PROJECT # 619679

BID ON: Ammuition

DEPARTMENT: Police

AWARDED TO:
| Duty | Duty ] Buty | Practice f i
| 300 Blackout | Federal 12 gauge| Biack Hills 9mm §{ Remington 9 mm | |

BIDDERS | ftem 7 | ftem 8 | lterm 9 i Hem 10 | Non-Collusion | Iran Divestment Form

! I | I I I

Craigs Firearm Supply } No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | $4,125.00 | X ] x
: I ! I I I

The Hunting Shack [ No Bid No Bid i No Bid | $7,830.00 | X | X
| - | I ————— l

Accurate Law Enforcemen|  $24,500.00 | No Bid | No Bid | #18407375 1 X | X
| | mrommmrmmerne e | I ! I

Guif States Dist. | $31,250.00 | £:$2,380.00 | No Bid | $4,725.00 | X H X
| i I : giad { !

Elmer Arms South i No Bid | No Bid | 286,000,005 | No Bid | X f X
| | I i I I

Precision Delta | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid I $4,200.00 | X | X
I I I | | |
I ! ! I ! |
| I ! I | I
! I i I I
[ I [ ! I I
[ | I I | J
I I I | ! !
I | | I I f
I | I | { f
! i | ! [ I
| ! ! i | I

f’/;‘;} 3 5 4
I CERTIFY THAT THIS IS A TRUE AND ACCURATE /,/’ /’,Q :/} ) / )
TABULATION OF THE BIDS THAT WERE RECEIVED R g, N il BT A PN




OFFICE OF THE PURCHASING AGENT
DATE: 10/16/2019 CITY OF KNOXVILLE TENNESSEE
BID TABULATION  FORM

REQUISITION # : 619679

BID ON: Ammuition

DEPARTMENT: Potice

AWARDED TO:
l
I

BIDDERS DBE Form |

|

Craigs Firearm Supply X |
!

The Hunting Shack b i
f

Accurate Law Enforcemen X |
I

Gulf States Dist. X |
|

Elmer Arms South X ]
I

Precision Delta X |
I
!
!

T
T 7 7 A7
| CERTIFY THAT THIS IS A TRUE AND ACCURATE i S / Vay
TABULATION OF THE BIDS THAT WERE RECEIVED  -poeieediiiigtizs gl gl oy




