Bid Date:|Th.02.Sep.21 Project: |WILLIAMSON INTY GOVERNMENT
Bid Time:|2:00 PM CST Visitor's Center & Improvements for
Budget|$1,342,691.00 PEACOCK HILL NATURE PARK
Duration]180 Calendar Days 6990 Giles Hill Road
College Grove, TN 37046
Design .
ClI Proj. No.:]18018.00
BID TABULATION FORM
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License List Addenda 2 Q é £ 1(1:; el S ‘g Mechanical License  JPlumbing License Electrical License Masonry License Alternate #01: Alternate #02: Alternate #03: Alternate #04: Total Construciton
BIDDER OF RECORD Number 11 2| 3] 4 g slElalol 8l E] O] | |subcontractor Number JSubcontractor Number JSubcontractor Number JSubcontractor Number  |BASE BID Rem. G.H. Over. Rem. R.P.B.P. Rem. Chapel Im. Rem. All. 2 & Pa. Cost w/Alternates
Fellowship Construction 49297 e (e (o0 (0] @ o|lojoejojeo]e Air Spcialist of Mid TN 43481Don Wood Plumb. Co. 23915]Mr. Electric 66199IN/A N/A] $1,930,419.00 ($75,000.00) ($2,100.00) ($20,350.00) ($91,000.00) $1,741,969.00
Baron Construction, LLC 66265 0|00 (0]o]e o|e o|e Interstate AC Serv. 53063fParthenon Plumb. LLC 61099)Extreme Elec., Inc. 50181}Jackson Masonry, LLC 41799 $2,980,000.00 ($25,000.00) ($1,800.00) ($21,345.00) ($55,000.00) $2,876,855.00
The Parent Company 220969 @ | o | o | e|oe|oe|o]jo]oe|e|e|e Total Group 43438[Total Group 43438jAnchor Electric, Inc. 25997IN/A N/A] $2,945,000.00 ($243,000.00) ($4,000.00) (§76,000.00) ($74,000.00) $2,548,000.00
1 1 1 B $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
- B - 1 1 1 B $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
- B - 1 1 1 B $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
- B - 1 1 1 B $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
- B - 1 1 1 B $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
- B - 1 1 1 B $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
- B - 1 1 1 B $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
- B - 1 1 1 B $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
- B - 1 1 1 B $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
- B - 1 1 1 B $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
- B - 1 1 1 B $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
- B - 1 1 1 B $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
- B - 1 1 1 B $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
- B - 1 1 1 B $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
- B - 1 1 1 B $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
- B - 1- 1- 1- B $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00




Bid Date:|Th.02.5ep.21 Project: |WILLIAMSON COUNTY GOVERNMENT
Bid Time:]2:00 PM CST Visitor's Center & Improvements for
Budget]$1,342,691.00 PEACOCK HILL NATURE PARK
Duration] 180 Calendar Days 6990 Giles Hill Road
Design College Grove, TN 37046
CI Proj. No.:}18018.00
BID TABULATION FORM
License Unit Price #01: Unit Price #02: Unit Price #03: Unit Price #04: Unit Price #05: Unit Price #06: Unit Price #07: Unit Price #08: Project Duration

BIDDER OF RECORD Number JExt. Sheath. Rep. Ext. Siding Rep. Rep. Unsuit. Soils Rock Excavation LPP Lat. Trench. 3" Sch. 40 PVC In. 6" Sch. 80 PVC In. Curtain Dr. In. (Calendar Days) Comments
Fellowship Construction $325.00/sheet $35.00/If $44.00/cu. yd. $55.00/cu. yd. $44.00/If $44.00/If $48.00/If $44.00/I 180 |-
Baron Construciton, LLC $103.00/sheet $1.335.00/If $103.00/cu. yd. $212.00/cu. yd. $424.00/If $424.00/If $424.00/If $484.00/If 180 |-
The Parent Company $275.00/sheet $14.25/If $125.00/cu. yd. $150.00/cu. yd. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid] 180 |-
- $/sheet $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. ol
- $/sheet $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. o] B
- $/sheet $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. ol
- $/sheet $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. o] B
- $/sheet $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. ol
- $/sheet $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. o] B
- $/sheet $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. ol
- $/sheet $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. o] B
- $/sheet $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. ol
- $/sheet $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. o] B
- $/sheet $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. ol
- $/sheet $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. o] B
- $/sheet $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. ol
- $/sheet $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. o] B
- $/sheet $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. ol
- $/sheet $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. $/cu. yd. (o] B




