



CITY OF KNOXVILLE

OFFICE OF THE PURCHASING AGENT
CITY OF KNOXVILLE, TENNESSEE

BID TABULATION FORM

DATE: 5/9/19 TITLE: Bulk Control Rock Salt

DEPARTMENT: Public Service

BIDDERS	Non-Collusion Affidavit	Drug Free Work Place Affidavit	Iran Divestment Act Form	DBE Form	City of Knoxville Price	City of Kingsport Price	City of Bristol Price
Morton Salt, Inc.	✓	✓	✓	✓	131.91	143.42	147.78
Cosmopuss Minerals	✓	✓	✓	✓	88.45	99.92	108.27
Detroit Salt Company	✓	✓	✓	✓	No bid	95.15	95.15
Cargill, Inc.	✓	✓	✓	✓	91.54	99.41	99.58



CITY OF KNOXVILLE

OFFICE OF THE PURCHASING AGENT
CITY OF KNOXVILLE, TENNESSEE

BID TABULATION FORM

BIDDERS	City of Elizabethton Price	City of Mt Carmel Price	City of Church Hill Price	East TN State Price	Town of Jonesborough Price	Town of Surgoinville Price
Morton Salt, Inc.	129.03	126.93	124.43	143.31	141.44	122.87
Compass Minerals	106.80	112.02	109.28	105.92	107.15	107.53
Detroit Salt Company	94.73	98.87	99.47	93.68	95.03	99.22
Cargill, Inc.	106.22	108.52	99.42	105.53	103.14	103.89



CITY OF KNOXVILLE

OFFICE OF THE PURCHASING AGENT
CITY OF KNOXVILLE, TENNESSEE

BID TABULATION FORM

BIDDERS	City of Johnson City Price	City of Newport Price	Knox County Price	City of Alcoa Price	City of Maryville Price	Blount County Price
Morton Salt, Inc.	143.81	135.16	121.91	116.74	133.48	116.99
Compass Minerals	106.12	99.22	88.45	100.45	91.93	100.83
Detroit Salt Company	93.37	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Cargill, Inc.	99.22	107.47	91.36	97.99	97.67	102.73

I CERTIFY THAT THIS IS A TRUE AND ACCURATE TABULATION OF THE BIDS THAT WERE RECEIVED