CHURCH ALLEY SEWER RECONSTRUCTION
BID #2019-666

BID DATE: OCTOBER 25, 2018 3:00PM
SCHEDULED AWARD DATE: NOVEMBER 13, 2018

RECOMMENDED AWARD: TRIMAN CONSTRUCTION, ALTERNATE BID 1 AND 1A

BASE BID - Open Cut ENGINEER ESTIMATE ADAME CONSTRUCTION TRC CONSTRUCTION TRIMAN CONSTRUCTION

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT | QUANTITY UNIT COST TOTAL UNIT COST TOTAL UNIT COST TOTAL UNIT COST TOTAL
1 |Sawcut and Remove Existing Pavement N 27 S 16.00 $ 432.00 | S 10.00 S 270.00 | S 31.80 S 858.60 NO BID
2 |Base Course SY 27 S 18.00 $ 486.00 | S 19.00 $ 513.00 | $ 434 S 117.18 NO BID
3 [HMASPII SY 27 S 40.00 S 1,080.00 | S 70.00 $ 1,890.00 | $ 115.00 $ 3,105.00 NO BID
4 |Remove and Replace Curb LF 10 S 30.00 $ 300.00 | S 80.00 S 800.00 | S 37.00 $ 370.00 NO BID
5 |Locate Service Lines LS 1 S 2,000.00 $ 2,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 $ 5,000.00 | $ 2,865.00 $ 2,865.00 NO BID
6 [Base Course - 3" Placed and Compacted Sy 1250 S 15.00 $ 18,750.00 | $ 16.00 $ 20,000.00 | $ 6.20 S 7,750.00 NO BID
7 |8" Sewer Line LF 1090 S 25.00 $ 27,250.00 | $ 11.00 $ 11,990.00 | S 52.85 S 57,606.50 NO BID
8 |4" Sewer Line 5' min. EA 29 S 350.00 S 10,150.00 | $ 700.00 S 20,300.00 | $ 613.00 S 17,777.00 NO BID
9 |4" Sewer Service Tap Saddle EA 29 S 300.00 S 8,700.00 | S 300.00 S 8,700.00 | S 12422 S 3,602.38 NO BID
10 |Trenching and Backfill LF 1380 S 25.00 $ 34,500.00 | S 19.00 $ 26,220.00 | $ 17.25 S 23,805.00 NO BID
11 |4" dia Type A Manhole with Collard EA 5 S 5,000.00 $ 25,000.00 [ $ 4,500.00 $ 22,500.00 [ $ 4,891.00 $ 24,455.00 NO BID
12 |Remove or Abandon Manhole EA 5 S 1,000.00 $ 5,000.00 | $ 500.00 $ 2,500.00 | $ 1,005.00 S 5,025.00 NO BID
13 |Pumping Sewage LS 1 S 4,000.00 $ 4,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 $ 5,000.00 | S 5,015.00 $ 5,015.00 NO BID
14 |lrrigation Repair LS 1 S 4,000.00 $ 4,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 $ 5,000.00 | S 1,895.00 S 1,895.00 NO BID
15 |Construction Staking by Contractor LS 1 S 4,000.00 $ 4,000.00 | $ 4,000.00 $ 4,000.00 | $ 6,700.00 S 6,700.00 NO BID
16 |[Traffic Control LS 1 S 1,000.00 $ 1,000.00 | S 20,000.00 $ 20,000.00 [ $ 2,500.00 $ 2,500.00 NO BID
ESTIMATE TOTAL $ 146,648.00 BID: S 154,683.00 BID: S 163,446.66 BID: NO BID

Total Comparison including 5% NM State Preference $ 146,948.85 S 155,274.33

Total Comparison including 10% (Maximum) Resident Veteran Preference




CHURCH ALLEY SEWER RECONSTRUCTION

BID #2019-666

BID DATE: OCTOBER 25, 2018 3:00PM

SCHEDULED AWARD DATE: NOVEMBER 13, 2018

RECOMMENDED AWARD: TRIMAN CONSTRUCTION, ALTERNATE BID 1 AND 1A

ALTERNATE BID 1 - Pipe Burst ENGINEER ESTIMATE ADAME CONSTRUCTION TRC CONSTRUCTION TRIMAN CONSTRUCTION

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT | QUANTITY UNIT COST TOTAL UNIT COST TOTAL UNIT COST TOTAL UNIT COST TOTAL
1 |sewer Main Cleaning LF 1075 |3 200 S 2,150.00 | $ 420 $ 4,515.00 180 S 1,935.00 9.00 $ 9,675.00
2 [sewer Manhole Cleaning EA 6 $ 500.00 $ 3,000.00 | $ 80.00 $ 480.00 17500 $ 1,050.00 160.00 $ 960.00
3 :;;ecfl?zguc“onCCTV'nSpeCtion of exising LF 1075 $ 200 S 2,150.00 | $ 420 $ 451500 $ 315 ¢ 3,386.25 | $ 545 $ 5,858.75
4 Spsvsfeﬁ:itrumonCCTVinSpeCtionOfmStaHEd LF 1075 $ 200 S 2,150.00 | $ 500 $ 5,375.00 | $ 315 ¢ 3,386.25 | $ 380 $ 4,085.00
5 [Bypass Sewage Pumping LF 1075 S 400 $ 4,300.00 | S 5.00 $ 5,375.00 | $ 5.00 $ 5,375.00 | $ 285 $ 3,063.75
6 |Pipe Burst with 8" HDPE Sewer Line LF 1075 |$ 2500 S 26,875.00 | $ 59.16 S 63,597.00 | $ 91.00 $ 97,825.00 | $ 4375 $ 47,031.25
7 |4" Sewer Service Line 5' min EA 29 $ 350.00 S 10,150.00 | $ 700.00 20,300.00 | $ 613.00 S 17,777.00 | $ 31800 S 9,222.00
8 [4" sewer Service Tap Saddle EA 29 $ 300.00 S 8,700.00 | $ 300.00 $ 8,700.00 | $ 12422 $ 3,602.38 | $ 767.00 S 22,243.00
9 |Epoxy Coating of Manhole LF 45 $ 800.00 S 36,000.00 | $ 42000 S 18,900.00 | $ 10000 $ 4,500.00 | $ 500.50 S 22,522.50
10 |Epoxy Coating of Invert and Bench EA 6 S 200.00 S 1,200.00 | $ 400.00 S 2,400.00 | $ 305.00 S 1,830.00 | $ 525.60 S 3,153.60
11 |Base Course - 3" Placed and Compacted N 1250 S 15.00 $ 18,750.00 | $ 16.00 $ 20,000.00 | $ 6.20 S 7,750.00 | $ 10.30 $ 12,875.00
14 |Irrigation Repair Ls 1 $ 4,000.00 $ 4,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 $ 5,000.00 | $ 1,895.00 $ 1,895.00 | $ 1,366.60 $ 1,366.60
16 |Traffic Control Ls 1 $ 1,000.00 $ 1,00000 | $  10,000.00 S 10,000.00 | $ 2,500.00 $ 2,500.00 | $ 1,912.80 $ 1,912.80
ESTIMATETOTAL $  120,425.00 BID: $  169,157.00 BID: §  152,811.88 BID: $§  143,969.25
Total Comparison including 5% NM State Preference $ 160,699.15 S 145,171.29 S 136,770.79

Total Comparison including 10% (Maximum) Resident Veteran Preference




CHURCH ALLEY SEWER RECONSTRUCTION
BID #2019-666

BID DATE: OCTOBER 25, 2018 3:00PM

SCHEDULED AWARD DATE: NOVEMBER 13, 2018

RECOMMENDED AWARD: TRIMAN CONSTRUCTION, ALTERNATE BID 1 AND 1A

ALTERNATE BID 1A - Pipe Burst ENGINEER ESTIMATE ADAME CONSTRUCTION TRC CONSTRUCTION TRIMAN CONSTRUCTION

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT | QUANTITY UNIT COST TOTAL UNIT COST TOTAL UNIT COST TOTAL UNIT COST TOTAL
1 [sewer Main Cleaning LF 275 3 200 S 550.00 | $ 420 $ 1,155.00 7.00 $ 1,925.00 | $ 9.00 $ 2,475.00
2 [sewer Manhole Cleaning EA 1 $ 500.00 S 500.00 | $ 800.00 S 800.00 20000 S 200,00 | $ 160.00 $ 160.00
3 :;;ecfl?zguc“onCCTV'nSpeCtion of exising LF 275 $ 200 S 55000 | ¢ 420 $ 1,155.00 | ¢ 700 $ 1,025.00 | ¢ 545 $ 1,498.75
4 Spsvsfeﬁ:itrumonCCTVinSpeCtionOfmStaHEd LF 275 $ 200 S 55000 | ¢ 500 $ 1,375.00 | ¢ 700 $ 1,925.00 | ¢ 380 $ 1,045.00
5 [Bypass Sewage Pumping LF 275 S 400 $ 1,100.00 | $ 3.64 S 1,000.00 | $ 727 S 1,999.25 | $ 285 S 783.75
6 |Pipe Burst with 8" HDPE Sewer Line LF 275 $ 2500 S 6,875.00 | $ 60.00 S 16,500.00 | $ 11975 $ 32,931.25 | § 4375 $ 12,031.25
7 |4" Sewer Service Line 5' min EA 2 $ 350.00 S 700.00 | $ 700.00 S 1,400.00 | $ 613.00 S 1,226.00 | $ 31800 S 636.00
8 [4" sewer Service Tap Saddle EA 2 $ 300.00 $ 600.00 | $ 30000 $ 600.00 | $ 12422 $ 248.44 | $ 767.00 S 1,534.00
9 |Epoxy Coating of Manhole LF 7 $ 800.00 S 5,600.00 [ $ 42000 S 2,940.00 | $ 3,565.00 $ 24,955.00 | $ 500.50 S 3,503.50
10 |Epoxy Coating of Invert and Bench EA 1 S 200.00 S 200.00 | $ 400.00 $ 400.00 | S 305.00 S 305.00 | $ 525.60 S 525.60
11 |Traffic Control Ls 1 $ 1,000.00 S 1,000.00 | 1,000.00 S 1,000.00 | $ 2,500.00 $ 2,500.00 | $ 30000 $ 300.00
12 |Sawcut and Remove Existing Pavement SY 12 S 16.00 $ 192.00 | S 10.00 S 120.00 | $ 31.80 S 381.60 | S 20.00 S 240.00
13 |Base Course sy 12 $ 1800 $ 216.00 | $ 16.00 $ 192.00 | 434 S 5208 | $ 1500 $ 180.00
14 |HMASPII sy 12 $ 4000 $ 480.00 | $ 80.00 $ 960.00 | $ 11500 $ 1,380.00 | $ 11000 $ 1,320.00
ESTIMATE TOTAL $ 19,113.00 BID: $ 29,597.00 BID: $ 71,953.62 BID: $ 26,232.85
Total Comparison including 5% NM State Preference $ 28,117.15 S 68,355.94 S 24,921.21

Total Comparison including 10% (Maximum) Resident Veteran Preference




