OFFICE OF THE PURCHASING AGENT

DATE: 6/8/2017 CITY OF KNOXVILLE TENNESSEE
8ID TABULATION FORM
BID DOC #:
BID ON: Digital Sign ~ Printing System
DEPARTMENT: tnformation  Systems
AWARDED TO:
| Extended Extended
64" Digital Traffic | Roll to Roll Fume Warranty Warranty
BIDDERS Sign Printer I Laminator Extractor 2nd year 3rd Year
{
Avery Dennison $35,352.00 $10,595.00 $2,995.00 $7,500.00 $7,500.00
Osburn Associates $45,858.00 $15,074.00 $3,893.00 $9,750.00 $9,750.00
ORAFOL $180,000.00 $25,000.00 N/A $25,000.00 $25,000.00
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I CERTIFY THAT THIS IS A TRUE AND ACCURATE
TABULATION OF THE QUOTES THAT WERE RECEIVED.
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OFFICE OF THE PURCHASING AGENT

DATE: 6/8/2017 CITY OF KNOXVILLE TENNESSEE
BID TABULATION FORM
BID BOC #:
BiD ON: Digital Sign  Printing System
DEPARTMENT: Information  Systems
AWARDED TO:
Engineering Engineering
Extended Warranty Grade Grade
BIDDERS 4th year Standarc Color Size Alternate Color Size
Avery Dennison $7,500.00 $420.00 48x50 yds $315.00 36x50 yds
Osburn Associates $9,750.00 $420.00 48x50 yds $315.00 36x50 yds
ORAFOL $25,000.00 $480.00 48x150 ft. N/A N/A
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| CERTIFY THAT THIS IS A TRUE AND ACCURATE
TABULATION OF THE QUOTES THAT WERE RECEIVED.
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OFFICE OF THE PURCHASING AGENT
DATE: 6/8/2017 CITY OF KNOXVILLE TENNESSEE
BID TABULATION FORM

BID DOC #:
BID ON: Digital Sign  Printing System
DEPARTMENT: information  Systems
AWARDED TO:
_ | _ _ |
| Engineering Grade | | HIP Grade | | HIP Grade
BIDDERS | Alternate Color | Size | Standard Color | Size | Alternate Color
| ! I [ _
Avery Dennison ] $262.50 30x50 ! $546.00 i 48x50 | $409.50
! _ ! { _
Oshurn Associates ] $262.50 | 30x50 yds i $684.00 § 48x50 yds | $513.00
| _ | i !
CRAFOL | N/A } N/A | $720.00 | 48x150 j N/A
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| CERTIEY THAT THIS IS A TRUE AND ACCURATE L \\
TABULATION OF THE QUOTES THAT WERE RECEIVED. __—=% i
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OFFICE OF THE PURCHASING AGENT
DATE: 6/8/2017 CITY OF KNOXVILLE TENNESSEE
BiID TABULATION FORM

BID DOC #:
BID ON: Digital Sign  Printing System
DEPARTMENT: Information  Systems
AWARDED T0O:
| HIP
| Alternate Diamond Grade
BIDDERS Size | Color Size Standard Color Size
f
Avery Bennison 36x50 yds $341.25 J0x50 yds $1,440.00 48x50 yds
Osburn Associates 36x50 yds $427.50 30x50 yds $1.,344.00 48x50 yds
All Standard Colors
ORAFOL N/A N/A N/A $1,560.00 48x150 ft.
Various

{ CERTIFY THAT THIS IS A TRUE AND ACCURATE
TABULATION OF THE QUOTES THAT WERE RECEIVED.




OFFICE OF THE PURCHASING AGENT

DATE: 6/8/2017 CITY OF KNOXVILLE TENNESSEE
BID TABULATION FORM

BID DOC #
BID ON: Digital Sign  Printing System
DEPARTMENT: information  Systems
AWARDED TO :

_

Diamond Grade | Diamond Grade
BIDDERS Alternate Color | Size Alternate Color Size

_
Avery Dennison $1,440.00 48x50 yds $1,080.00 36x50 yds
QOsburn Associates $1,344.00 48x50 yds $1,008.00 36x50 yds

FL Yeilow/F| Yeilow Green

ORAFOL N/A N/A N/A N/A
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1 CERTIFY THAT THIS IS A TRUE AND ACCURATE
TABULATION OF THE QUOTES THAT WERE RECEIVED.
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OFFICE OF THE PURCHASING AGENT

DATE: 6/8/2017 CITY OF KNOXVILLE TENNESSEE
BID TABULATION FORM

BID DOC #:
BID ON: Digital Sign  Printing System
DEPARTMENT: Information  Systems
AWARDED TO:

!

Anti-Graffitti | Anti-Graffitti
BIDDERS Standard Color | Size Alternate Color Size

_
Avery Dennison $600.00 48x50 yds $450.00 36x50 yds
Osburn Associates $882.00 48x50 yds $661.50 36x50 yds
ORAFOL $1,200.00 48x150 ft. N/A N/A
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FCERTIFY THAT THIS 1S A TRUE AND ACCURATE
TABULATION OF THE QUOTES THAT WERE RECEIVED.
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OFFICE OF THE PURCHASING AGENT
DATE: 6/8/2017 CiTY OF KNOXVILLE TENNESSEE
8ID TABULATION FORM

BID DOC #:
BID ON: Digital Sign  Printing System
DEPARTMENT: information  Systems
AWARDED TO :
f Standard
Anti-Graffitti i Protective
BIDDERS Alternate Color ] Size Laminate Size

Avery Dennison $375.00 | 30x50 yds $414.00 48x50 yds
Osburn Associates $551.25 30x50 yds $528.00 48x50 yds
ORAFOL N/A N/A $612.00 48x150 ft.
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| CERTIFY THAT THIS IS A TRUE AND ACCURATE e
TABULATION OF THE QUOTES THAT WERE RECEIVED. _ /-~




OFFICE OF THE PURCHASING AGENT

DATE: 6812017 CITY OF KNOXVILLE TENNESSEE
BiD TABULATION FORM
BID DoC #:
BID ON: Digitat Sign  Printing System
DEPARTMENT: Information  Systems
AWARDED TO:
Protective Laminate | “rotective Laminat
Qverlay | Overlay
BIDDERS Alternate _ Size Alternate Size
_

Avery Dennison $310.50 36x50 yds $258.75 30x50 yds
Osburn Associates $396.00 36x50 yds $330.00 30x50 vds
ORAFOL N/A NIA N/A NIA
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F CERTIFY THAT THIS IS A TRUE AND ACCURATE
TABULATION OF THE QUOTES THAT WERE RECEIVED.
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OFFICE OF THE PURCHASING AGENT

DATE: 6/8/2017 CITY OF KNOXVILLE TENNESSEE
BIb TABULATION FORM
BID DOC #:
BID ON: Digital Sign  Printing System
DEPARTMENT: tnformation  Systems
AWARDED TO:
Spot Colors | SpotColors |} Spot Colors Spet Colors Spot Colors
Translucent Yellow | Translucent Yeliow | Black Black Blue
BIDDERS Standard Size | HiCapacity | Standard Size Hi Capacity Standard Size
_
Avery Dennison $165.20 $240.80 $165.20 $240.80 $165.20
Osburn Associates $168.50 $24560 $168.50 $245.60 $168.50
ORAFOL $234.00 N/A $234.00 N/A $234.00
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| CERTIFY THAT THIS IS A TRUE AND ACCURATE
TABULATION OF THE QUOTES THAT WERE RECEIVED.
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OFFICE OF THE PURCHASING AGENT
DATE: 6/8/2017 CITY OF KNOXVILLE TENNESSEE
BID TABULATION  FORM

BID DOC #:
BtD ON: Digital Sign  Printing System
DEPARTMENT: information  Systems
AWARDED TO:
Spot Colors |  SpotColors Spot Colors Spot Colors Spot Colors
Blue [ Green Green Red Red
BIDDERS Hi-Capacity | Standard Size Hi Capacity Standard Size Hi Capacity
Avery Dennison $240.80 ! $165.20 $240.80 $165.20 $240.80
Osburn Associates $245.60 $168.50 $245.60 $168.50 $245.60
ORAFOL N/A $234.00 N/A $234.00 N/A

| I
_ !
_ |
_ _
| _
t _
f |
! |
_ _
_ _
_ _
_ |
_ _
| f
| |
| f
~ !
” !
~ {
| !
_ !
_ !
_ I
_ !
_ I
_ _

!
!
f
_
_
_
_
_
_
|
*
_
|
_
_
_
_
_
[
[
|

| CERTIFY THAT THIS IS A TRUE AND ACCURATE e \w\\ \\\
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OFFICE OF THE PURCHASING AGENT
DATE: 6/812017 CITY OF KNOXVILLE TENNESSEE
BiID TABULATION FORM

BID DOC #:
BID ON: Digitai Sign  Printing System
DEPARTMENT: information  Syslems
AWARDED TO:

Spot Colors {  Spot Colors Process Size Process Color

Brown | Brown Color Cartridge Process Color Cartridge-Cyan
BIDDERS Standard |  HiCapacity Cyan-Standard Cartridge-Standar Hi-Capacity

Avery Dennison $165.20 _ $240.80 $133.00 440ML $255.50
Osburn Associates $168.50 $245.60 $135.70 440ML No Bid
ORAFOL $234.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A
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| CERTIFY THAT THIS 1S A TRUE AND ACCURATE
TABULATION OF THE QUOTES THAT WERE RECEIVED. @\\/A




OFFICE OF THE PURCHASING AGENT
DATE: 6/8/2017 CITY OF KNOXVILLE TENNESSEE
BID TABULATION  FORM

BiD DOC #:
BID ON: Digitat Sign  Printing System
DEPARTMENT: information  Systems
AWARDED TO:
Process Color Process Color Process Color Process Coior
Process Color } Cartridge Cartridge Cartridge Carnridge
Cartridge-Cyan ! Magenta Magenta Magenta Magenta
BIDDERS Hi-Capacity Size | Stancard Size Hi-Capacity Size
I
Avery Dennison One (1) Liter $133.00 440ML. $255.50 One (1) Liter
Osburn Associates No Bid $135.70 440ML No Bid No Bid
ORAFOL N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
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{ CERTIFY THAT THIS 1S A TRUE AND ACCURATE
TABULATION OF THE QUOTES THAT WERE RECEIVED,




OFFICE OF THE PURCHASING AGENT

DATE: 6/8/2017 CITY OF KNOXVILLE TENNESSEE
BID TABULATION FORM
BID DOC #:
BiD ON: Digital Sign  Printing System
DEPARTMENT: Information  Systems
AWARDED YO :
_
Flush | Flush
BIDDERS Standard _ Size Hi-Capacity Size
_
Avery Dennison $75.60 440 ml $140.00 950mi
Osburn Associates $77.10 440mi $142.80 950mit
GRAFOL N/A N/A N/A N/A

| CERTIFY THAT THIS 1S A TRUE AND ACCURATE
TABULATION OF THE QUOTES THAT WERE RECEIVED.




OFFICE OF THE PURCHASING AGENT

DATE: 6/8/2017 CITY OF KNOXVILLE TENNESSEE
BID TABULATION FORM
BiD DOC #
BiD ON: Digital Sign  Printing System
DEPARTMENT: Information  Systems
AWARDED TO:
_
_
BIDDERS Non-Coliusion b Iran Divestment DBE
!
Avery Bennison Inc. Inc. inc.
Osburn Associates Inc. inc. Inc.
ORAFOL Inc. Inc. Inc.
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I CERTIFY THAT THIS IS A TRUE AND ACCURATE
TABULATION OF THE QUOTES THAT WERE RECEIVED.




