



HIGHLANDS COUNTY
BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

Purchasing Department

INTENT TO AWARD
AWARD TABULATION OF SEALED BIDS
ITB 18-016

ADVANCED LIFE SUPPORT DRUGS AND SUPPLIES

Bid opening: 2/13/18

**BASE FOR
AWARD**

	DESCRIPTION	BRAND	MFG ITEM #	Vendor #	UNIT / BASE FOR AWAR	PRICE PER UNIT	CASE PACK	PRICE PER CASE	RANK
1	Adenocard; 6 mg / 2 ml - Vial								
	Bound Tree Medical	Cardinal Health	4391611	0542-02	Each	\$3.6500	10	\$36.50	1
	Henry Schein, Inc.	Akorn	4391611	1238882	Each	\$5.7300	10	\$57.30	2
	Moore Medical, LLC.	Segent	2790632	24255	Each	\$19.1000	1	\$19.10	3
	Midwest Medical Supply					No bid			
	Nashville Med. & EMS					No bid			
2	Adenocard; 12 mg / 4 ml - Vial								
	Bound Tree Medical	Sagent	0301-68	0301-68	Each	\$27.6200	10	\$276.20	1
	Moore Medical, LLC.	Sagent	2578227	21347	Each	\$30.8900	1	\$30.89	2
	Henry Schein, Inc.	Fresenius Kabi	633230651	1181965	Each	\$43.8000	10	\$438.00	3
	Midwest Medical Supply					No bid			
	Nashville Med. & EMS					No bid			
3	Albuterol; 2.5 mg / 3 ml - Unit dose								
	Moore Medical, LLC.	Nephron Pharm	88283	88283	Each	\$0.1616	25	\$4.04	1
	Bound Tree Medical	Nephron Pharm	9501-01	379501	Each	\$0.1900	30	\$5.70	2
	Henry Schein, Inc.	Nephron Pharm	487950101	1161820	Each	\$0.3300	30	\$9.90	3
	Midwest Medical Supply					No bid			
	Nashville Med. & EMS					No bid			
4	Amiodarone; 150 mg / 3 ml - Vial								
	Moore Medical, LLC.	West-Ward	3643731	34510	Each	\$1.6800	1	\$1.68	1
	Bound Tree Medical	Fresenius	63323-0616-03	0616-03	Each	\$1.8500	1	\$1.85	2
	Henry Schein, Inc.	Mylan Institutional	67457015303	1047558	Each	\$6.9700	10	\$69.70	3

	Bound Tree Medical	Cardinal Health	0806-01	0426-12	Each	\$2,4800	10	\$24.80	2
	Moore Medical, LLC.	Sagent	2476398	35232	Each	\$4,8800	1	\$4.88	3
	Nashville Med. & EMS					No bid			
	Midwest Medical Supply					No bid			
18	Insta-Glucose; 31 g - Tube								
	Bound Tree Medical	Valeant	0746-31	464631	Each	\$3,4900	1	\$3.49	1
	Nashville Med. & EMS	Life Nutrition	6739	6739	Each	\$3,9900	12	\$47.88	2
	Moore Medical, LLC.	Valeant		13138	Each	\$4,0300	24	\$96.72	3
	Henry Schein, Inc.	Valcant Pharm	1758689	1235472	Each	\$4,7200	3	\$14.16	4
	Midwest Medical Supply					No bid			
19	Lasix; 40 mg / 4 ml - Luer								
	Bound Tree Medical	Pfizer	09631-04	1806063501	Each	\$10,1500	10	\$101.50	1
	Henry Schein, Inc.	Pfizer Injectionable	409963104	1047055	Each	\$15,6200	10	\$156.20	2
	Moore Medical, LLC.					No bid			
	Nashville Med. & EMS					No bid			
	Midwest Medical Supply					No bid			
20	Lidocaine; 100 mg / 5 ml - Luer								
	Bound Tree Medical	Pfizer	04903-34	374904	Each	\$2,9800	10	\$29.80	1
	Moore Medical, LLC.	International Med	15810	15810	Each	\$4,4100	1	\$4.41	2
	Henry Schein, Inc.	Pfizer Injectionable	409132305	1046865	Each	\$4,8200	10	\$48.20	3
	Midwest Medical Supply					No bid			
	Nashville Med. & EMS					No bid			
21	Lidocaine w/Dextrose; 2 gm/ Dextrose 5% / 500 ml - Pre-mix drip bag								
	Bound Tree Medical	Baxter	280973	280973	Each	\$6,4500	18	\$116.10	1
	Henry Schein, Inc.	Baxter Healthcare	280973	1536016	Each	\$10,3000	18	\$185.40	2
	Midwest Medical Supply					No bid			
	Moore Medical, LLC.					No bid			
	Nashville Med. & EMS					No bid			
22	Lopressor (Metoprolol); 5 mg / 5 ml - Vial								
	Henry Schein, Inc.	Claris Lifescience	36000003310	1219031	Each	\$1,1600	10	\$11.60	1
	Bound Tree Medical	Fresenius	303-05	660-05	Each	\$1,1700	10	\$11.70	2
	Moore Medical, LLC.	Hospira	177805	87402	Each	\$1,1760	10	\$11.76	3
	Midwest Medical Supply					No bid			
	Nashville Med. & EMS					No bid			
23	Magnesium Sulfate ; 5 gm / 10ml - Luer								
	Moore Medical, LLC.	Hospira	1754-10	83622	Each	\$18,5400	10	\$185.40	1
	Bound Tree Medical	Pfizer	01754-10	74491401	Each	\$20,0100	10	\$200.10	2
	Henry Schein, Inc.	Pfizer Injectables	409175410	2587918	Each	\$31,5200	10	\$315.20	3

	Henry Schein, Inc.	AMUSA	2T0805	7000698	Each	\$0.3500	100	\$35.00	2
	Bound Tree Medical	Aquabilti		600-10	Each	\$0.3600	400	\$144.00	3
	Nashville Med. & EMS	BD	306546		Each	\$0.3600	480	\$172.80	4
	Moore Medical, LLC.	B Braun	513576	69606	Each	\$0.4323	100	\$43.23	5
37	Solu-Medrol; 125 mg / 2 ml - Vial								
	Moore Medical, LLC.	Pfizer		11762	Each	\$10.0500	25	\$251.25	1
	Bound Tree Medical	Capital		0047-22	Each	\$12.3600	25	\$309.00	2
	Henry Schein, Inc.	GIV	9004725	2480254	Each	\$20.2800	100	\$2,028.00	3
	Midwest Medical Supply					No bid			
	Nashville Med. & EMS					No bid			
38	Succinylcholine; (200 mg / ml) 10 ml - Vial								
	Bound Tree Medical	Pfizer	06629-02	375204	Each	\$25.5200	25	\$638.00	1
	Moore Medical, LLC.	Hospira	6629-02	74625	Each	\$27.2900	25	\$682.25	2
	Henry Schein, Inc.	Pfizer Injectables	409662902	1046965	Each	\$36.4400	25	\$911.00	3
	Midwest Medical Supply					No bid			
	Nashville Med. & EMS					No bid			
39	Thiamine; 200 mg / 2 ml - Vial								
	Moore Medical, LLC.	American Pharmaceuticals		67046	Each	\$11.7100	25	\$292.75	1
	Bound Tree Medical	Freseus	1302	371651	Each	\$12.8000	1000	\$12,800.00	2
	Henry Schein, Inc.	Mylan Institutional	67457019602		Each	\$17.0700	25	\$426.75	3
	Midwest Medical Supply					No bid			
	Nashville Med. & EMS					No bid			
40	Tranexamic Acid; 1000 mg / 10 ml - Vial								
	Bound Tree Medical	Cardinal Health	5036546	0605-10	Each	\$20.9500	10	\$209.50	1
	Henry Schein, Inc.	Virtus Pharmac	17478021710	1290937	Each	\$22.5000	10	\$225.00	2
	Moore Medical, LLC.	X-Gen Pharmaceuticals		24198	Each	\$36.1200	10	\$361.20	3
	Midwest Medical Supply					No Bid			
	Nashville Med. & EMS					No bid			
41	Unistik 3 Extra Safety Lancets; 21G Depth 2.0 mm								
	Nashville Med. & EMS	Owen Mumford	AT1014		Each	\$0.1050	200	\$21.00	1
	Bound Tree Medical	Arkay	980121	2764-80121	Each	\$0.1097	100	\$10.97	2
	Midwest Medical Supply	Owen Mumford	AT1014		Each	\$0.1210	200	\$24.20	3
	Moore Medical, LLC.	Owen Mumford	AT1015	81002	Each	\$0.1556	100	\$15.56	4
	Henry Schein, Inc.	OwenMumford	AT1012	6684166	Each	\$0.1600	100	\$16.00	5
42	Vasopressin; 20 units / 1 ml - Vial								
	Bound Tree Medical	Capital	995933	0164-25	Each	\$219.0000	25	\$5,475.00	1
	Henry Schein, Inc.	Par Sterile Product	42023016425	8210091	Each	\$304.3600	25	\$7,609.00	2
	Moore Medical, LLC.					No bid			

	Bound Tree Medical	Curaplex	3066-01		1612-84240	Each	\$1.3600	200	\$272.00	1
	Nashville Med. & EMS	Curaplex	3066-01			Each	\$1.3950	200	\$279.00	2
	Henry Schein, Inc.	Curaplex	3066-01			Each	\$1.4500	200	\$290.00	3
	Midwest Medical Supply	Curaplex	3066-01			Each	\$1.6500	200	\$330.00	4
	Moore Medical, LLC.	Curaplex	3066-01			Each	\$1.7800	200	\$356.00	5
56	Protective IV Plus Catheters; 22 ga x 1" No substitutions									
	Bound Tree Medical	Curaplex	3060-01		1612-84250	Each	\$1.3600	200	\$272.00	1
	Nashville Med. & EMS	Curaplex	3060-01			Each	\$1.3950	200	\$279.00	2
	Henry Schein, Inc.	Curaplex	3060-01			Each	\$1.4500	200	\$290.00	3
	Midwest Medical Supply	Curaplex	3060-01			Each	\$1.6500	200	\$330.00	4
	Moore Medical, LLC.	Curaplex	3060-01			Each	\$1.7800	200	\$356.00	5
57	Protective IV Plus Catheters; 24 ga x 0.75" No substitutions									
	Nashville Med. & EMS	Curaplex	3063-01			Each	\$1.3950	200	\$279.00	1
	Bound Tree Medical	Curaplex	3063-01		1612-84260	Each	\$1.3600	200	\$272.00	2
	Henry Schein, Inc.	Curaplex	3063-01			Each	\$1.4500	200	\$290.00	3
	Midwest Medical Supply	Curaplex	3063-01			Each	\$1.6500	200	\$330.00	4
	Moore Medical, LLC.	Curaplex	3063-01			Each	\$1.7800	200	\$356.00	5
58	Acuvance Plus Safety I.V. Self-Blunting Needle Catheter; 14 ga X 2" No substitutions									
	Bound Tree Medical	Smiths Medical	3358		353358	Each	\$1.9500	200	\$390.00	1
	Henry Schein, Inc.	Smiths Medical	3358			Each	\$1.9800	200	\$396.00	2
	Midwest Medical Supply	Smiths Medical	3358			Each	\$2.1100	200	\$422.00	3
	Moore Medical, LLC.		3358			Each	\$2.7676	200	\$553.52	4
	Nashville Med. & EMS						No bid			
59	I.V. Solution Dextrose Injection D5W; 50 ml bag No substitutions									
	Bound Tree Medical	Baxter Heath Care	2B0086		600086	Each	\$2.1900	96	\$210.24	1
	Henry Schein, Inc.	Baxter Heath Care	2B0086			Each	\$3.1600	96	\$303.36	2
	Midwest Medical Supply						No bid			
	Moore Medical, LLC.						No bid			
	Nashville Med. & EMS						No bid			
60	I.V. Solution Sodium Chloride Injection; 100 ml bag No substitutions									
	Bound Tree Medical	Baxter Heath Care	2B1307		358437	Each	\$1.8400	96	\$176.64	1
	Moore Medical, LLC.	Baxter Heath Care	2B1307			Each	\$1.8500	96	\$177.60	2
	Henry Schein, Inc.	Baxter Heath Care	2B1307			Each	\$2.7800	96	\$266.88	3
	Midwest Medical Supply						No bid			
	Nashville Med. & EMS						No bid			
61	Cannula Dual Twinpak Syringe Filling Device No substitutions									
	Henry Schein, Inc.	B.D.	303390			Each	\$0.3800	100	\$38.00	1

	Moore Medical, LLC.	B.D.	303390				Each	\$0.3930	1000	\$393.00	2
	Midwest Medical Supply	B.D.	303390				Each	\$0.3933	1000	\$393.30	3
	Bound Tree Medical	B.D.	303390			04126 (10 boxes) 202-201	Each	\$0.4200	100	\$42.00	4
	Nashville Med. & EMS							No bid			
62	Hypodermic Syringe Needle; 25 ga x 5/8"	No substitutions									
	Nashville Med. & EMS	B.D.	305122				1000 E	\$42.7900	1000	\$42.79	1
	Henry Schein, Inc.	B.D.	305122				1000 E	\$84.7000	1000	\$84.70	2
	Midwest Medical Supply	B.D.	305122				1000 E	\$85.5000	1000	\$85.50	3
	Moore Medical, LLC.	B.D.	305122				1000 E	\$85.6000	1000	\$85.60	4
	Bound Tree Medical	B.D.	305122			132-305122BX	1000 E	\$94.3000	1000	\$94.30	5
63	Hypodermic Syringe Needle; 21 ga x 1 1/2"	No substitutions									
	Nashville Med. & EMS	B.D.	305167				1000 E	\$59.8900	1	\$59.89	1
	Henry Schein, Inc.	B.D.	305167				1000 E	\$84.7000	1	\$84.70	2
	Midwest Medical Supply	B.D.	305167				1000 E	\$85.5000	1	\$85.50	3
	Moore Medical, LLC.	B.D.	305167				1000 E	\$90.6000	1	\$90.60	4
	Bound Tree Medical	B.D.	305167			1641-16721	1000 E	\$96.0000	1	\$96.00	5
64	Hypodermic Syringe Needle; 18 ga x 1"	No substitutions									
	Nashville Med. & EMS	B.D.	305195				1000 E	\$47.6900	1	\$47.69	1
	Henry Schein, Inc.	B.D.	305195				1000 E	\$60.5000	1	\$60.50	2
	Midwest Medical Supply	B.D.	305195				1000 E	\$64.0000	1	\$64.00	3
	Moore Medical, LLC.	B.D.	305195				1000 E	\$64.7000	1	\$64.70	4
	Bound Tree Medical	B.D.	305195			18109 (100 ea bx)	1000 E	\$73.9000	1	\$73.90	5
65	Universal I.V Standard Pump Set	No substitutions									
	Bound Tree Medical	Medical Technology						No bid			
	Moore Medical, LLC.							No bid			
	Henry Schein, Inc.							No bid			
	Nashville Med. & EMS							No bid			
	Midwest Medical Supply							No bid			
66	ET Tube Flexi Set, Cuffed; 5.0 mm	No substitutions									
	Bound Tree Medical	Curaplex	504550			38011	Each	\$1.5000	10	\$15.00	1
	Nashville Med. & EMS	Curaplex	504550				Each	\$3.1900	10	\$31.90	2
	Midwest Medical Supply	Curaplex	504550				Each	\$3.3900	10	\$33.90	3
	Moore Medical, LLC.	Curaplex	504550				Each	\$3.5900	10	\$35.90	4
	Henry Schein, Inc.	Curaplex	504550				Each	\$4.4000	10	\$44.00	5
67	ET Tube Flexi Set, Cuffed; 5.5 mm	No substitutions									
	Bound Tree Medical	Curaplex	504555			38012	Each	\$1.5000	10	\$15.00	1
	Nashville Med. & EMS	Curaplex	504555				Each	\$3.1900	10	\$31.90	2
	Moore Medical, LLC.	Curaplex	504555				Each	\$3.5900	10	\$35.90	3

		Midwest Medical Supply	Curaplex	504555			Each	\$3.3900	10	\$33.90	4
		Henry Schein, Inc.	Curaplex	504555			Each	\$4.4000	10	\$44.00	5
68		ET Tube Flexi Set, Cuffed; 6.0 mm	No substitutions								
		Bound Tree Medical	Curaplex	504560		38013	Each	\$1.5000	10	\$15.00	1
		Nashville Med. & EMS	Curaplex	504560			Each	\$3.1900	10	\$31.90	2
		Midwest Medical Supply	Curaplex	504560			Each	\$3.3900	10	\$33.90	3
		Moore Medical, LLC.	Curaplex	504560			Each	\$3.5900	10	\$35.90	4
		Henry Schein, Inc.	Curaplex	504560			Each	\$4.4000	10	\$44.00	5
69		ET Tube Flexi Set, Cuffed; 6.5 mm	No substitutions								
		Bound Tree Medical	Curaplex	504565		38014	Each	\$1.5000	10	\$15.00	1
		Nashville Med. & EMS	Curaplex	504565			Each	\$3.1900	10	\$31.90	2
		Midwest Medical Supply	Curaplex	504565			Each	\$3.3900	10	\$33.90	3
		Moore Medical, LLC.	Curaplex	504565			Each	\$3.5900	10	\$35.90	4
		Henry Schein, Inc.	Curaplex	504565			Each	\$4.4000	10	\$44.00	5
70		ET Tube Flexi Set, Cuffed; 7.0 mm	No substitutions								
		Bound Tree Medical	Curaplex	504570		38015	Each	\$1.5000	10	\$15.00	1
		Nashville Med. & EMS	Curaplex	504570			Each	\$3.1900	10	\$31.90	2
		Midwest Medical Supply	Curaplex	504570			Each	\$3.3900	10	\$33.90	3
		Moore Medical, LLC.	Curaplex	504570			Each	\$3.5900	10	\$35.90	4
		Henry Schein, Inc.	Curaplex	504570			Each	\$4.4000	10	\$44.00	5
71		ET Tube Flexi Set, Cuffed; 7.5 mm	No substitutions								
		Bound Tree Medical	Curaplex	504575		38016	Each	\$1.5000	10	\$15.00	1
		Nashville Med. & EMS	Curaplex	504575			Each	\$3.1900	10	\$31.90	2
		Midwest Medical Supply	Curaplex	504575			Each	\$3.3900	10	\$33.90	3
		Moore Medical, LLC.	Curaplex	504575			Each	\$3.5900	10	\$35.90	4
		Henry Schein, Inc.	Curaplex	504575			Each	\$4.4000	10	\$44.00	5
72		ET Tube Flexi Set, Cuffed; 8.0 mm	No substitutions								
		Bound Tree Medical	Curaplex	504580		38017	Each	\$1.5000	10	\$15.00	1
		Nashville Med. & EMS	Curaplex	504580			Each	\$3.1900	10	\$31.90	2
		Midwest Medical Supply	Curaplex	504580			Each	\$3.3900	10	\$33.90	3
		Moore Medical, LLC.	Curaplex	504580			Each	\$3.5900	10	\$35.90	4
		Henry Schein, Inc.	Curaplex	504580			Each	\$4.4000	10	\$44.00	5
73		ET Tube Flexi Set, Cuffed; 8.5 mm	No substitutions								
		Bound Tree Medical	Curaplex	504585		38018	Each	\$1.5000	10	\$15.00	1
		Nashville Med. & EMS	Curaplex	504585			Each	\$3.1900	10	\$31.90	2
		Midwest Medical Supply	Curaplex	504585			Each	\$3.3900	10	\$33.90	3
		Moore Medical, LLC.	Curaplex	504585			Each	\$3.5900	10	\$35.90	4
		Henry Schein, Inc.	Curaplex	504585			Each	\$4.4000	10	\$44.00	5

	Nashville Med. & EMS	Curaplex	506550			Each	\$2,9500	10	\$29.50	2
	Midwest Medical Supply	Curaplex	506550			Each	\$3,2700	10	\$32.70	3
	Moore Medical, LLC.	Curaplex	506550			Each	\$3,3000	10	\$33.00	4
	Henry Schein, Inc.	Curaplex	506550			Each	\$1,7200	10	\$17.20	5
	Emergency Medical						No bid			
81	ET Tube Slick-Set, Uncuffed; 5.5 mm	No substitutions								
	Bound Tree Medical	Curaplex	150055	38012		Each	\$1,5000	10	\$15.00	1
	Henry Schein, Inc.	Curaplex	150055			Each	\$1,8700	10	\$18.70	2
	Nashville Med. & EMS	Curaplex	150055			Each	\$2,9500	10	\$29.50	3
	Midwest Medical Supply	Curaplex	150055			Each	\$3,3700	10	\$33.70	4
	Moore Medical, LLC.	Curaplex	150055			Each	\$3,7500	10	\$37.50	5
82	Meditrace Electrodes, Kendall 530 Foam Electrode, Adult	No substitutions								
	Henry Schein, Inc.	Covindien	3101326			600 ea	\$0,9863	600	\$91.80	1
	Bound Tree Medical	Covindien	3101326	E5910		600 ea	\$0,1600	600	\$96.00	2
	Midwest Medical Supply	Covindien	3101326			600 ea	\$0,1581	600	\$94.86	3
	Moore Medical, LLC.	Covindien	3101326			600 ea	\$0,1825	600	\$109.50	4
	Nashville Med. & EMS						No bid			
83	Meditrace Electrodes, Kendall 135 Foam Electrode, Pediatric	No substitutions								
	Henry Schein, Inc.	Covindien	31439766			Each	\$0,16675	600	\$100.05	1
	Midwest Medical Supply	Covindien				Each	\$0,1723	600	\$103.38	2
	Bound Tree Medical	Covindien	31439766	47-31439766pk		Each	\$0,1800	600	\$108.00	3
	Moore Medical, LLC.						No bid			
	Nashville Med. & EMS						No bid			
84	I.V. Extension set, 8", removable leur locking site,									
	Henry Schein, Inc.	Medsource	MS-83092			Each	\$0,9400	50	\$47.00	1
	Nashville Med. & EMS	Kentron	429018			Each	\$0,9400	50	\$47.00	2
	Bound Tree Medical	Curaplex		05-00812		Each	\$1,1500	50	\$57.50	3
	Midwest Medical Supply	B Braun	480206	BBM480206		Each	\$0,8800	100	\$88.00	4
	Moore Medical, LLC.						No bid			
85	Web Alcohol Preps	No substitutions								
	Moore Medical, LLC.	Curaplex	6818			4000 E	\$0,0073	4000	\$29.20	1
	Bound Tree Medical	Curaplex	6818	1330-85300		4001 E	\$0,0073	4000	\$29.20	1
	Henry Schein, Inc.	Curaplex	6818			4000 E	\$0,0075	4000	\$30.00	2
	Midwest Medical Supply	Curaplex	6818			4000 E	\$0,0078	4000	\$31.20	3
	Nashville Med. & EMS	Curaplex	6818				No bid			
86	Gallant Disposable Prep Razors	No substitutions								
	Midwest Medical Supply	Dynarex	4251 (50/box)			Each	\$0,3066	250	\$76.65	1

	Nashville Med. & EMS	Dynarex	4251			Each	\$0.3199	250	\$79.98	2
	Henry Schein, Inc.	Dynarex	4251			Each	\$0.3200	250	\$80.00	3
	Bound Tree Medical	Dynarex	4251		540047	Each	\$0.3400	250	\$85.00	4
	Moore Medical, LLC.	Dynarex	4251			Each	\$0.3420	250	\$85.50	5
87	Providine-Iodine Prep Pads	No substitutions								
	Moore Medical, LLC.	Dynarex	1108			Each	\$0.0316	1000	\$31.60	1
	Midwest Medical Supply	Dynarex	1108n(100/box)			Each	\$0.0330	1000	\$33.00	2
	Nashville Med. & EMS	Dynarex	1108			Each	\$0.0330	1000	\$33.00	2
	Bound Tree Medical	Dynarex	1108		609153	Each	\$0.0369	1000	\$36.90	3
	Henry Schein, Inc.	Dynarex	1108			Each	\$0.0400	1000	\$40.00	4
88	Transpore Surgical Tape; ½" x 10 yards	No substitutions								
	Bound Tree Medical	Medsource	1527-0		533-MS-TT1/2BOX	Each	\$0.2800	24	\$6.72	1
	Midwest Medical Supply	Medsource	1527-1		533-MS-TT1/2BOX	Each	\$0.4258	24	\$10.22	2
	Henry Schein, Inc.	Medsource	1527-2		533-MS-TT1/2BOX	Each	\$0.4500	24	\$10.80	3
	Nashville Med. & EMS	Medsource	1527-3		533-MS-TT1/2BOX	Each	\$0.4600	24	\$11.04	4
	Moore Medical, LLC.	Medsource	1527-4		533-MS-TT1/2BOX	Each	\$0.5883	24	\$14.12	5
89	Transpore Surgical Tape; 1" x 10 yards	No substitutions								
	Bound Tree Medical		1527-1			Each	\$0.5600	12	\$6.72	1
	Midwest Medical Supply		1527-1			Each	\$0.8517	12	\$10.22	2
	Henry Schein, Inc.		1527-1			Each	\$0.9000	12	\$10.80	3
	Nashville Med. & EMS		1527-1			Each	\$0.9200	12	\$11.04	4
	Moore Medical, LLC.		1527-1			Each	\$1.1175	120	\$134.10	5
90	Jamshidi Style Intraosseous Needles; 15 ga x 3/8" – 1 7/8" (adjustable length)	No substitutions								
	Bound Tree Medical	Medical	DIN1515X		621515	Each	\$8.5900	10	\$85.90	1
	Nashville Med. & EMS	Medical	DIN1515X		621516	Each	\$9.3900	10	\$93.90	2
	Henry Schein, Inc.	Medical	DIN1515X		621517	Each	\$18.5400	10	\$185.40	3
	Moore Medical, LLC.	Medical	DIN1515X		621518	Each	\$18.7300	10	\$187.30	4
	Midwest Medical Supply	Medical	DIN1515X		621519	Each	\$19.1500	10	\$191.50	5
91	Diagnostic Pen Light with Pupil Gauge	No substitutions								
	Bound Tree Medical	Curaplex	ADC351P		32762	Each	\$0.6200	6	\$3.72	1
	Moore Medical, LLC.	Curaplex	ADC351P		32763	Each	\$0.6250	6	\$3.75	2
	Midwest Medical Supply	Curaplex	ADC351P		32764	Each	\$0.8300	6	\$4.98	3
	Henry Schein, Inc.	Curaplex	ADC351P		32765	Each	\$0.8700	6	\$5.22	4
	Nashville Med. & EMS						No bid			
92	Interlink Injection Site, Male Luer Lock Adapter	No substitutions								
	Nashville Med. & EMS	Baxter	2N3395		353395	Each	\$0.8900	200	\$178.00	1
	Henry Schein, Inc.	Baxter	2N3396		353396	Each	\$1.4200	200	\$284.00	2
	Midwest Medical Supply	Baxter	2N3397		353397	Each	\$1.4672	200	\$293.44	3

	Moore Medical, LLC.	Baxter	2N3398	353398	Each	\$1.5000	200	\$300.00	4
	Bound Tree Medical	Baxter	2N3399	353399	Each	\$1.5200	200	\$304.00	5
93	Adult Veni-Guard	No substitutions							
	Midwest Medical Supply	Conmed	705-4428	354428	Each	\$0.3296	500	\$164.80	1
	Nashville Med. & EMS	Conmed	705-4429	354429	Each	\$0.3390	500	\$169.50	2
	Henry Schein, Inc.	Conmed	705-4430	354430	Each	\$0.3600	500	\$180.00	3
	Bound Tree Medical	Conmed	705-4431	354431	Each	\$0.3754	100	\$37.54	4
	Moore Medical, LLC.	Conmed	705-4432	354432	Each	\$0.4396	500	\$219.80	5
94	Sharps Container, red / white; 1 qt	No substitutions							
	Moore Medical, LLC.	Covidien	8900SA	298898	Each	\$1.5700	100	\$157.00	1
	Henry Schein, Inc.	Covidien	8900SA	298899	Each	\$1.6500	1	\$1.65	2
	Bound Tree Medical	Covidien	8900SA	298900	Each	\$1.6900	100	\$169.00	3
	Midwest Medical Supply	Covidien	8900SA	298901	Each	\$1.7000	100	\$170.00	4
	Nashville Med. & EMS					No bid			
95	Sharps Container, red / white; 5 qt	No substitutions							
	Moore Medical, LLC.	Covidien	31144010	47-31144008	Each	\$2.5300	30	\$75.90	1
	Henry Schein, Inc.	Covidien	31144010	47-31144008	Each	\$2.6400	30	\$79.20	2
	Midwest Medical Supply	Covidien	31144010	47-31144009	Each	\$2.7200	30	\$81.60	3
	Bound Tree Medical	Covidien	31144010	47-31144010	Each	\$2.7800	30	\$83.40	4
	Nashville Med. & EMS					No bid			
96	BD™ Multi-Use One-Piece Sharps Collector; 3.3 qt	No substitutions							
	Henry Schein, Inc.	B.D.	305488	295488	Each	\$4.2600	24	\$102.24	1
	Midwest Medical Supply	B.D.	305488	295488	Each	\$4.4000	20	\$88.00	2
	Moore Medical, LLC.	B.D.	305488	295488	Each	\$4.5500	24	\$109.20	3
	Bound Tree Medical	B.D.	305488	295488	Each	\$4.8500	24	\$116.40	4
	Nashville Med. & EMS					No bid			
97	Laryngoscope Blade, Miller; #0 Premature	No substitutions							
	Midwest Medical Supply	Medsource	MS-46420		Each	\$3.8100	1	\$3.81	1*
	Bound Tree Medical	Curaplex	004850050	2145-13501	Each	\$4.0900	20	\$81.80	2
	Moore Medical, LLC.					No bid			
	Henry Schein, Inc.					No bid			
	Nashville Med. & EMS					No bid			
98	Laryngoscope Blade, Miller; #1 Infant	No substitutions							
	Midwest Medical Supply	Medsource	MS-46421		Each	\$3.8100	1	\$3.81	1*
	Bound Tree Medical	Curaplex	004851100	2145-13502	Each	\$4.0900	20	\$81.80	2
	Henry Schein, Inc.					No bid			

	Midwest Medical Supply	Covidien	5-18435	218435	Each	\$40.0500	4	\$160.20	2
	Moore Medical, LLC.	Covidien	5-18436	218436	Each	\$42.0600	4	\$168.24	3
	Bound Tree Medical	Covidien	5-18437	218437	each	\$43.9800	4	\$175.92	4
	Nashville Med. & EMS					No bid			
111	Combitube Roll-up Kit 41fr. No substitutions								
	Henry Schein, Inc.	Covidien	5-18438	218438	Each	\$39.6500	4	\$158.60	1
	Midwest Medical Supply	Covidien	5-18439	218439	Each	\$40.0500	4	\$160.20	2
	Moore Medical, LLC.	Covidien	5-18440	218440	Each	\$40.5000	4	\$162.00	3
	Bound Tree Medical	Covidien	5-18441	218441	Each	\$43.9800	4	\$175.92	4
	Nashville Med. & EMS					No bid			
112	Coude Tip, Pediatric 10Fr x 70cm; 10 Fr x 70 cm No substitutions								
	Midwest Medical Supply	Sun Med	2120-17010	2120-17010	Each	\$3.6300	10	\$36.30	1
	Bound Tree Medical	Sun Med	2120-17010	2120-17010	Each	\$4.1700	10	\$41.70	2
	Henry Schein, Inc.	Sun Med	2120-17010	2120-17010	Each	\$4.8700	10	\$48.70	3
	Moore Medical, LLC.					No bid			
	Nashville Med. & EMS					No bid			
113	Coude Tip, Adult 15Fr x 70cm; 15 Fr x 70 cm No substitutions								
	Midwest Medical Supply	Sun Med	9-0212-69	9-01212-69		\$3.6300	10	\$36.30	1
	Bound Tree Medical	Sun Med	9-0212-70	9-01212-70	Each	\$4.2000	10	\$42.00	2
	Henry Schein, Inc.	Sun Med	9-0212-71	9-01212-71	Each	\$4.8700	10	\$48.70	3
	Moore Medical, LLC.					No bid			
	Nashville Med. & EMS					No bid			
114	30 ml Syringe No substitutions								
	Moore Medical, LLC.	B.D.	302830	1633-83228	Each b	\$17.4200	4	\$69.68	1
	Midwest Medical Supply	B.D.	302831	1633-83229	Each b	\$17.7500	56	\$17.75	2
	Bound Tree Medical	B.D.	302832	1633-83230	Each b	\$18.7500	56	\$18.75	3
	Henry Schein, Inc.	B.D.	302833	1633-83231	Each b	\$58.0000	100	\$58.00	4
	Nashville Med. & EMS					No bid			
115	10 ml Syringe Luer-lock Tip No substitutions								
	Henry Schein, Inc.	B.D.	309604	629604	box	\$10.2800	100	\$10.28	1
	Midwest Medical Supply	B.D.	309604	629604	box	\$10.3900	200	\$20.77	2
	Bound Tree Medical	B.D.	309604	629604	box	\$11.4100	400/cs	\$45.64	3
	Moore Medical, LLC.	B.D.	309604	629604	box	\$21.0000	2	\$42.00	4
	Nashville Med. & EMS					No bid			
116	1cc u-100 Insulin Syringe No substitutions								
	Henry Schein, Inc.	Covidien	329424	661083	box	\$0.2624	100	\$26.24	1
	Midwest Medical Supply	Covidien	329424	661083	box	\$0.2710	100	\$27.10	2

	Bound Tree Medical	Covidien	329424	661083	box	\$0.5400	240	\$129.60	3
	Nashville Med. & EMS					No bid			
	Moore Medical, LLC.					No bid			
117	1 ml Syringe No substitutions								
	Bound Tree Medical	B.Braun	309602	1633-40601	ea	\$0.0600	1800/cs	\$108.00	1
	Henry Schein, Inc.	B.Braun	309603	1633-40602	ea	\$0.1091	100	\$10.91	2
	Moore Medical, LLC.	B.Braun	309604	1633-40603	ea/ box	\$0.1102	8	\$176.32	3
	Midwest Medical Supply	B.Braun	309605	1633-40604	box	\$0.1130	200	\$22.60	4
	Nashville Med. & EMS					No bid			
118	3 ml Syringe Luer-Lok Tip No substitutions								
	Henry Schein, Inc.	B.D.	309654	132-309585EA	Each	\$0.0639	100	\$6.32	1
	Moore Medical, LLC.	B.D.	309655	132-309585EA	box 20	\$0.0639	4	\$0.26	1
	Midwest Medical Supply	B.D.	309656	132-309585EA	Each	\$0.0653	200	\$13.06	2
	Bound Tree Medical	B.D.	309657	132-309585EA	Each	\$0.0700	800/CS	\$56.00	3
	Nashville Med. & EMS					No bid			
119	Naso-gastric or Gastric sump tube; 42 inch L, 8								
	Bound Tree Medical	Curaplex	ME2208	14756MS	Each	\$2.2000	280	\$616.00	1
	Midwest Medical Supply	Covidien	8888268086	KEN8888268086		\$6.2900	10	\$62.90	2
	Henry Schein, Inc.	Covidien	8888268086	6366022	Each	\$10.0900	10	\$100.90	3
	Moore Medical, LLC.					No bid			
	Nashville Med. & EMS					No bid			
120	Naso-gastric or Gastric sump tube; 48 inch L, 12								
	Midwest Medical Supply	Covidien	8888264929	KEN8888264929	Each	\$1.8100	50	\$90.50	1
	Bound Tree Medical	Curaplex	ME2212-s	14758MS	Each	\$2.2000	280	\$616.00	2
	Henry Schein, Inc.		1217-12		Each	\$2.2900	50	\$114.50	3
	Moore Medical, LLC.	Medovations	1217-12		Each	\$2.5700	50	\$128.50	4
	Nashville Med. & EMS					No bid			
121	Naso-gastric or Gastric sump tube; 48 inch L, 14								
	Midwest Medical Supply	Covidien	8888264945	KEN8888264945	Each	\$1.8100	50	\$90.50	1
	Bound Tree Medical	Curaplex	ME2214-S	14759	Each	\$2.2000	280	\$616.00	2
	Henry Schein, Inc.	Diversatek	1217-14		Each	\$2.2900	50	\$114.50	3
	Moore Medical, LLC.	Medovations	1217-14		Each	\$2.5700	50	\$128.50	4
	Nashville Med. & EMS					No bid			
122	Naso-gastric or Gastric sump tube; 48 inch L, 16								
	Midwest Medical Supply	Covidien	8888264960	KEN8888264960	Each	\$1.8100	50	\$90.50	1
	Bound Tree Medical	Curaplex	ME2216-s	14761	Each	\$2.2000	280	\$616.00	2
	Henry Schein, Inc.	Diversatek	1217-16		Each	\$2.2900	50	\$114.50	3

	Moore Medical, LLC.	Medovations	1217-16			Each	\$2,5700	50	\$128.50	4
	Nashville Med. & EMS						No bid			
123	U.S.P., 10% Swabstick (1's)									
	Henry Schein, Inc.	James Alexander	822			Each	\$0.2200	100	\$22.00	1
	Moore Medical, LLC.	3M	C1544	92564		Each	\$0.8440	50	\$42.20	2
	Bound Tree Medical						No bid			
	Midwest Medical Supply						No bid			
	Nashville Med. & EMS						No bid			
124	Philips HeartStart MRX Monitor									
	Bound Tree Medical	Curaplex	38171	2746-10075		Each rd	\$0.9300	1	\$0.93	1
	Midwest Medical Supply	Skintact	13755	LEO13755		Each rd	\$1.4700	50	\$73.50	2
	Henry Schein, Inc.	Curaplex	40457C			Each rd	\$2.7700	10	\$27.70	3
	Moore Medical, LLC.						No bid			
	Nashville Med. & EMS						No bid			
125	Nail Polish Remover Pad									
	Moore Medical, LLC.	Dynarex	1501	96646		100 Ea	\$0.0340	1000	\$34.00	1
	Henry Schein, Inc.	NDC/MedPlus	B71200			100 Ea	\$0.0341	100	\$3.41	2
	Midwest Medical Supply	Dynarex	1501	DYN1501 Sold by 10		100 Ea	\$0.0366	1000	\$36.60	3
	Bound Tree Medical	Nice pak	1501	607120		100 Ea	\$0.0378	100	\$3.78	4
	Nashville Med. & EMS						No bid			
126	Adult/Child Pre-Connect Combo Defib Pd for Philips HeartStart MRX									
	Midwest Medical Supply	Conmed	3115-1751	CON3115-1751		Each	\$13.3300	10	\$133.30	1
	Bound Tree Medical	Curaplex		16250		Each	\$15.6900	10	\$156.90	2
	Nashville Med. & EMS	Heart Sync	T10020-PHILIPS			Each	\$16.6900	10	\$166.90	3
	Moore Medical, LLC.	Phillips	9.89803E+11	15846		Each	\$23.5000	10	\$235.00	4
	Henry Schein, Inc.		9.89803E+11			Each	\$24.2500	10	\$242.50	5
127	HeartStart Infant Combo Plus Pads for Philips HeartStart MRX									
	Midwest Medical Supply	Conmed	3115-1750	CON3115-1750		Each	\$13.3300	10	\$133.30	1
	Bound Tree Medical	Curaplex		16251		Each	\$16.4800	10	\$164.80	2
	Nashville Med. & EMS	Heart Sync	PHILIPS INFANT			Each	\$17.6900	10	\$176.90	3
	Henry Schein, Inc.		M3717A			Each	\$22.8500	5	\$114.25	4
	Moore Medical, LLC.	Phillips	M3717A	23075		Each	\$23.2500	10	\$116.25	5
128	Supraglottic Airway Kit									
	Nashville Med. & EMS	KING	KLTSD #423			Each	\$27.3900	5	\$136.95	1
	Bound Tree	Ambu		477-KLTSD413EA		Each	\$32.3200	5	\$161.60	2
	Henry Schein, Inc.		KLTSD433			Each	\$35.2000	5	\$176.00	3
	Midwest Medical Supply	KING	KLTSD423	MMSKING3		Each	\$35.7800	1	\$35.78	4
	Moore Medical, LLC	King	KLTSD433	37252		Each	\$37.3300	1	\$37.33	5

