Bid Tabulation Sheet

IFB #308-18 Emergency Medical Services Medical Supplies

Bid Opening: January 31, 2018

NATIONAL MEDICAL SUPPLIES

ITEM MANUFACTURER/PRODUCT
NUMBER ITEM DESCRIPTION UuoM NUMBER UNIT PRICE
Berman airway, 110 mm, size 6, x-large adult,
1 orange, disposable, individually packaged 1/EA Mercury Medical MCM1080010C $1.15
10ea/bx
Berman airway, 40 mm, size 00, newborn, pink, .
2 disposable, individually packaged 10ea/pk 1/EA Mercury Medical MCM1080040C $1.50
3 Berman airway, 50 mm, size 0, infant, blue, 1/EA Mercury Medical - Item $1.75
disposable, individually packaged 10ea/pk #MCM1080050C '
Berman airway, 60 mm, size 1, small child, .
: . 1/EA :
4 black, disposable, individually packaged 10ea/pk / Mercury Medical MCM1080060C $1.50
Berman airway, 70 mm, size 2, child, white, .
: T 1/EA :
> disposable, individually packaged 10ea/pk / Mercury Medical MCM1080070C $1.95
Berman airway, 80 mm, size 3, small adult, .
6 green, disposable, individually packaged 10ea/pk 1/EA Mercury Medical MCM1080080C $1.25
Berman airway, 90 mm, size 4, medium adult,
7 yellow, disposable, individually packaged 1/EA Mercury Medical MCM1080090C $1.25
10ea/pk
Berman airway, 100 mm, size 5, large adult, red, .
: l. 1/EA :
8 disposable, individually packaged 10ea/pk / Mercury Medical MCM1080000C $1.25
9 Supraglottic airway kit, LT-D, size 2.5, pediatric 1/EA AMBU 477-KLTD2125 $58.50

41-51 in., tube, 35cc syringe, lube jell




Supraglottic airway kit, LT-D, size 2, pediatric,

) . . 1/EA - .
10 35-45 in., tube, 35cc syringe, lube jelly 5ea/cs / AMBU 477-KLTD212 $58.50
Supraglottic Airway Kit, King LTS-D Size 3,
11 Yellow, Adult 4-5 ft, incl Tube, Syringe, Lube 1/EA AMBU 2114-44433 $60.00
oea
Supraglottic Airway Kit, King LTS-D Size 4,
12 Red, Adult 5-6 ft, 60cc syringe, lube jelly 5ea/cs 1/EA AMBU 2114-44434 $60.00
Supraglottic Airway Kit, King LTS-D Size 5,
. 1/EA - :
13 Purple, Adult over 6 ft, 60cc syringe, lube 5ea/cs / AMBU 2114-44435 $60.00
Berman airway set, 8 sizes per set, 40, 50, 60, 70,
14 80, 90, 100 and 110 mm airway 10ST/BG 1/EA Bound Tree 13027 $2.50
Nasopharyngeal airway kit NP, Robertazzi,
15 includes 20, 22, 24, 26, 28, 32 Fr, blue latex, w/ | /°° Sun Med 792-1-5076-06 $22.00
Nasopharyngeal airway kit NP, Robertazzi, incl
16 20,22, 24, 26, 28, 30, 32, 34 and 36 Fr, blue lat | /°° Sun Med 792-1-5076-09 $45.00
NASOPHARYNGEAL AIRWAY - NPA -
17 STERILE DISPOSABLE BLUE 20 FRENCH 1/EA Bound Tree 2021-18120 $3.50
10/PK
NASOPHARYNGEAL AIRWAY - NPA -
18 STERILE DISPOSABLE BLUE 22 FRENCH 1/EA Bound Tree 2021-18122 $3.48
10/PK
NASOPHARYNGEAL AIRWAY - NPA -
19 STERILE DISPOSABLE BLUE 24 FRENCH 1/EA Bound Tree 2021-18124 $3.77
10/PK
NASOPHARYNGEAL AIRWAY - NPA -
20 STERILE DISPOSABLE BLUE 26 FRENCH 1/EA Bound Tree 2021-18126 $3.48

10/PK




NASOPHARYNGEAL AIRWAY - NPA -

21 STERILE DISPOSABLE BLUE 28 FRENCH 1/EA Bound Tree 2021-18128 $3.00
10/PK
NASOPHARYNGEAL AIRWAY - NPA -
22 STERILE DISPOSABLE BLUE 30 FRENCH 1/EA Bound Tree 2021-18130 $3.48
10/PK
NASOPHARYNGEAL AIRWAY - NPA -
23 STERILE DISPOSABLE BLUE 32 FRENCH 1/EA Bound Tree 2021-18132 $3.48
10/PK
NASOPHARYNGEAL AIRWAY - NPA - Bound Tree
24 STERILE DISPOSABLE BLUE 34 FRENCH 1/EA $3.48
2021-18134
10/PK
NASOPHARYNGEAL AIRWAY - NPA - Bound Tree
25 STERILE DISPOSABLE BLUE 36 FRENCH 1/EA $3.48
2021-18136
10/PK
26 INTRAVENOUS (IV) ARMBOARD 1/EA Morrison Medical $2.50
DISPOSABLE 3 IN X 18 IN 100/CS 450002 '
I.VV. armboard, 2 in. X 4 in., corrugated core, Morrison Medical
27 foam padding covered in white vinyl, disp, 50 1/EA $2.25
56-1004
ea/c
Hamper biohazard bag, 23in x 23in, 7-10 gal, .
28 1.5mil, red w/black print Biohazardous Waste 1/EA Medegen Medical Product $0.29
520-116
500ea
29 BANDAGE ELASTIC LATEX FREE 2 IN 1/EA McKesson Medical $0.95
50RLS/CS 16-1033-2 '
BANDAGE ELASTIC LATEX FREE 3 IN McKesson Medical
30 50RLS/CS En 16-1033-3 $0.98
31 BANDAGE ELASTIC LATEX FREE 4 IN 1/EA McKesson Medical $1.99

10RLS/BX 5BX/CS

16-1033-4




BANDAGE ELASTIC LATEX FREE 6 IN

McKesson Medical

32 10RLS/BX 50RLS/CS L/EA 16-1033-6 $1.35
Curaplex Triangular Bandage, Polypropylene Bound Tree
> 240¢a/cs HEA 1124-03680 8035
BITE STICK PLASTIC 10/PK [USE 020010 Bound Tree
34 FOR SINGLES] L/EA 020010 $0.50
Little Rapids Cop/Graham
35 blanket, emergencyZ,Seé:;)/rCus)my, yellow, 54x84 1/EA Medical $3.15
11845
Curaplex Burn Sheet, 60 inch x 90 inch, Sterile Bound Tree
3 50ea/Cs L/EA 30061MS $4.25
37 BVM, SPUR Il, ADULT W/ MEDIUM ADULT 1/EA AMBU $13.57
MASK, INDIVIDUALLY BOXED 12/CS 520-211
BVM, SPUR I, Pediatric w/Toddler Mask, AMBU
38 Individually Boxed 12ea/cs 1/EA 530-213 $16.17
39 Oxygen nasal canpula, adult, 7 ft, 3 channel, soft, 1/EA Salter Labs 16Soft-7-50 $0.99
disposable 50/cs
Oxygen Nasal Cannula, Infant, 7 ft, 3 channel, Ventlab Cooperation
40 soft, disposable 50ea/cs 1/EA 2353-13079 $2.50
41 Oxygen nasal cannula, neonate, curved tapered 1/EA Ventlab Cooperation $1.25
nasal prongs, 7 ft supply tube, 3 channel 50ea/cs 87-1207 '
OXYGEN NASAL CANNULA, PEDIATRIC, 7 Medline Industries
42 FT, 3 CHANNEL, SOFT, DISPOSABLE, 1/EA HCSU4518S $2.14
50EA/CS
DRUG VIAL ADAPTER DUAL CANNULA
43 DEVICE 100/BX 10BX/CS TWINPAK 1/EA NOBID AOILEUS
Extrication Collar, Ambu Mini Perfit ACE, AMBU
e . ) 1/EA ,
44 Pediatric, Adjustable 12 Settings 30ea/cs / 260280 $6.75




Extrication Collar, Ambu Perfit ACE, Adult, AMBU
: . 1/EA ,
45 Adjustable 16 Settings 30ea/cs / 260281 $6.50
PATRIOT COLLAR ADULT MULTI HEIGHT Ossur
40 ADJUSTMENT 1/EA 70273000 $7.50
47 SHARPS CONTAINER TALL TRAY RED 1/EA Mckesson Medical $3.00
TOP 1.7 QUART 3.5IN X 3.5 IN X 10 IN 20/CS 101-185 '
48 SHARPS CONTAINER RED 2 QUART 7.25 IN 1/EA Covidien $3.30
X 4.75IN X 6.5 IN 60/CS SAGE 1522 681522SA '
SHARPS CONTAINER OLD STYLE SQUARE
49 RED 4.7 QUART 10 IN X6 IN X 7.75IN 12/CS| 1/EA NO BID NO BID
SHARPS TAINER
50 Sharps container, SHARPS-A-GATOR, 5 quart, 1/EA Covidien $3.90
translucent red, clear lid, in patient room 30ea/c 47-31143897 '
51 SHARPS CONTAINER STACKABLE 1 1/EA Medegen Medical Product $2.00
QUART 35IN X 3.5IN X 7 IN 72/CS 8702 '
SHARPS CONTAINER RED 2 GALLON W/ Covidien
52 HINGED LID 20/CS L/EA 1860-99019 $7.54
02 MAX BiTrac ED Mask, w/ Neb, Adult LG, Pulmodvne
53 w/3-SET Valve, Ohmeda Connector, Fixed Flow| 1/EA y $78.56
7555XN
10ea/cs
54 Blood Pressure Cuff BP, ComfortCheck, thigh, 1 1/EA Salter Labs Inc $6.89
tube, male slip luer connector, single pt use 10/b ZCC4001L '
55 Blood pressure cuff BP, ComfortCheck, large 1/EA Salter Labs Inc $4.85
adult, 1 tube, male slip luer, single pt use 10/bx ZCC4201L '
56 Blood pressure cuff BP, ComfortCheck, adult, 1 1/EA Salter Labs Inc $4.85

tube, male slip luer connector, single pt use 10/b

ZCCA4301HP




Blood pressure cuff BP, ComfortCheck, child, 1

Salter Labs Inc

> tube, male slip luer connector, single pt use 10/b 1/EA ZCC4401L $4.48
Tamper Evident Seal, Cynch-Lok, Red, Healthmark Industries
58 Numbered, 5 in 100/bg 1/EA HMK6323 $0.66
Tamper Evident Seal, Cynch-Lok, White, Healthmark Industries
> Numbered, 5 in 100/BG L/EA HMK6020 $0.20
CO2 DETECTOR, EASY CAP 6EA/BX Covidien
60 ABX/CS (24/CS) 1/EA 530024 $11.99
CO2 DETECTOR, PEDI-CAP, PEDIATRIC Covidien
61 BEA/BX 4BX/CS (24/CS) 1/EA 530025 $11.99
Curaplex Select Multi-Function Defib Pads, Bound Tree
62 Physio-Control Pediatric 10pr/cs 1/EA 16383 $22.50
Curaplex Select Multi-Function Defib Pads, Bound Tree
> Physio-Control Adult 10pr/cs Hen 16384 $23.99
64 ELECTRODE MEDI-TRACE ELECTROBLUE 1/EA Covidien $0.35
SF450, 50/PK 10PK/BX 4BX/CS JMISF450 '
65 ELECTRODES PEDIATRIC 3/PK 10PK/BX 1/EA Conmed Corporation $0.25
20BX/CS HUGGABLE 231620 '
Convenience Bag, 1000cc, Emesis, Sickness Medline Industries
1/E .
66 Clean-up, Standard 24/pk /EA NON80328H 30.75
*SEE NOTE Dispenser for Sickness Clean-up Medline Industries
67 Convenience Bags, HoI:jns upto 24 Bags,5inx5| 1/EA NONEMBGDISPH $29.00
Convenience Bag, BioHoop, 50cc-2000cc, Hartwell Medical
68 Emesis and Hazardous Waste Bag, No Hook 1/EA $1.95

12ea/pk 40pk/cs

4162




69 forceps, Magill, adult 1/EA Surgical Design Inc $4.99
BANDAGE CONFORMING STRETCH Mckesson Medical
70 GAUZE NON STERILE 2 IN X 4.1 YARDS 1/EA 16-017 $0.40
12RLS/BG 8BG/CS
BANDAGE CONFORMING STRETCH Mckesson Medical
71 GAUZE NON STERILE 3 IN X 4.1 YARDS 1/EA 16-018 $0.35
12RLS/BG 8BG/CS
BANDAGE CONFORMING STRETCH Mckesson Medical
72 GAUZE NON STERILE 4 IN X 4.1 YARDS 1/EA 16-019 $0.60
12RLS/BG 8BG/CS
BANDAGE CONFORMING STRETCH Mckesson Medical
73 GAUZE NON STERILE 6 IN X 4.1 YARDS 1/EA 16-020 $0.60
6RLS/BG 8BG/CS
74 GAUZE SPONGE, DERMACEA, NON 1/EA Covidien $4.73
STERILE 12 PLY 4 IN X 4 IN 200/PK 10PK/CS 441215 '
GAUZE SPONGE STERILE 12PLY 4IN X 4 Covidien
s IN 2/PK 25PK/TR 24TR/CS 1/EA 441000 $0.15
76 GAUZE SPONGE, DERMACEA, STERILE 8 1/EA Covidien $0.05
PLY 2 IN X 2 IN 2/PK 50PK/BX 30BX/CS 7770 441211 '
. . Mckesson Medical
77 Gauze, Petrolatum, 3 in x 9 in 12/bx 12bx/cs 1/EA 61-20056 $0.75
78 Safety Glasses, Nemesis V30, Black Frame, 1/EA MED PLUS SERVIVES USA $4.75
Clear Lens, Neck Cord included 12ea/bx 1022-25676 '
Gloves, Defender, MED, Standard 10 in Cuff, .. )
& Nitrile, Powder Free, Slate Blue 100/bx 10bx/cs 1/EA Digitcare Corporation 290102 $14.95
80 Gloves, Defender, LG, Standard 10 in Cuff, 1/EA Digitcare Corporation $14.95

Nitrile, Powder Free, Slate Blue 100/bx 10bx/cs

290103




Gloves, Defender, XL, Standard 10 in Cuff,

Digitcare Corporation

81 Nitrile, Powder Free, Slate Blue 100/bx 10bx/cs 1/EA 290104 $14.95
82 quves, Defender, 2XL, Standard 10 in Cuff, 1/EA Digitcare Corporation $14.95
Nitrile, Powder Free, Slate Blue 90/bx 10bx/cs 290105
83 .Gl'oves, Defender, SM, Standard 10 in Cuff, 1/EA Digitcare Corporation $14.95
Nitrile, Powder Free, Slate Blue 100/bx 10bx/cs 291010
84 CONTOUR BLOOD GLUCOSE TEST STRIPS 1/EA Ascensia Diabetes care $0.50
50/BX 24BX/CS 7099C '
*SEE NOTES * CONTOUR Blood Glucose Baver
85 Monitoring System, incl Pouch and User Guide 1/EA Y $21.99
567151
4ealcs
Glucose Gel, 15 gm, Strawberry Flavor 3/pk Life Nutrition
86 12pk/cs L/EA 662248 $13.99
Curaplex Cerviguard Head Immobilizer Blocks Bound Tree
87 Only 2/st 32st/cs 1/EA 260401 $7.50
. Dynarex
88 Ammonia Inhalant, Ampules 10/bx 1/EA 1360-07546 $3.50
89 LIFESHIELD CLAVE PORT MALE ADAPTER 1/EA ICU Medical $2.78
PLUG W/LUER LOCK 100/CS 11956-01 '
90 IV Catheter, Insyte Autoguard, 24 ga x 0.75 in, 1/EA Becton Dickinson $2.99
Notch Needle, Shielded, Vialon 50ea/bx 4bx/cs 381412 '
o1 IV Catheter, Insyte Autoguard, 22 gax 1in, 1/EA Becton Dickinson $2.99
Notch Needle, Shielded, Vialon 50ea/bx 4bx/cs 381423 '
92 IV Catheter, Insyte Autoguard, 18 ga x 1.16 in, 1/EA Becton Dickinson 381444 $2.99

Shielded, Vialon 50ea/bx 4bx/cs




IV Catheter, Insyte Autoguard, 20 ga x 1.16 in,

Becton Dickinson

%3 Notch Needle, Shielded, Vialon 50ea/bx bxics | /= 381433 $2.99
IV Catheter, Insyte Autoguard, 14 ga x 1.75in, Becton Dickinson
94 Shielded, Vialon 50ea/bx 4bx/cs L/EA 381467 $3.25
IV Catheter, Insyte Autoguard, 16 ga x 1.16 in, Becton Dickinson
% Shielded, Vialon 50ea/bx 4bx/cs L/EA 381454 $3.25
INTRAVENOUS (IV) DRESSING Conmed
96 TRANSPARENT ADULT 100/BX 5BX/CS 1/EA 730-4432 $0.68
VENI-GARD
IV ADMIN SET, 10 DROP, 88 IN, W/1 B.Braun Medical
97 SAFELINE INJ SITE AND 1SAFEDAY 1/EA ' 24035 $4.50
NEEDLEFREE VALVE 50EA/CS
LUBRICATING JELLY PDI STERILE, 2.7GM PDl.Inc
%8 144/BX 12BX/CS L/EA NPKT00137 $0.75
99 OB KIT DISPOSABLE IN BOX 10/CS 1/EA Dig%rzex $7.50
IV Solution, Lactated Ringers 1000ml Bag
100 12ea/cs BBraun L7500 L/EA NOBID NOBID
LANCET 2.8MM 100/BX 15BX/CS Medipurpose
101 SURGILANCE L/EA SLN300 2015
LANCET 2.2MM 21 GA 100/BX 15BX/CS Medipurpose
102 SURGILANCE L/EA SLN240 2015
Oxygen Mask, Adult, Med Conc w/7 ft safety Teleflex
103 tubing, Disp, Latex Free, DEHP-free 50ea/cs 1/EA 1041 $1.25
Curaplex Oxygen Mask, AdL_JIt, Elongated, ngh Bound Tree
104 Conc, Total NRB, Reservoir Bag, 7 ft Tubing 1/EA $1.63
301-181
50/cs
105 AEROSOL MASK, ADULT, WITH ELASTIC 1/EA McKesson Medical $0.63

STRAP, DISPOSABLE 50EA/CS

32631




AEROSOL MASK, PEDIATRIC, WITH

McKesson Medical

106 ELASTIC STRAP, DISPOSABLE 50EA/CS | Y/EA 32632 $0.80
MASK MEDIUM CONCENTRATION INFANT Teleflex
107 0-2 YEARS 50/BX 396218 HEA 396218 $2.15
Curaplex Oxygen Mask, Pediatric, Elongated,
108 High Conc, Total NRB, Reservoir Bag, 7 ft 1/EA Bound Tree $1.15
. 87-2202
Tubing 50/cs
Oxygen mask, pediatric, medium concentration, Teleflex
109 elastic style, with 7 ft safety tube 50/cs 1/EA 1035 $1.85
Particulate Respirator, N95 Mask, SM w/Nose Moldex-Metric
110 Flange, Latex Free 20/bx 8bx/cs 1/EA 1511 $1.35
Particulate Respirator, N95 Mask, MED w/Nose Moldex-Metric
111 Flange, Latex Free 20/bx 8bx/cs 1/EA 1512 $1.35
Particulate Respirator, N95 Mask, LG w/Nose Moldex-Metric
112 Flange, Latex Free 20/bx 8bx/cs 1/EA 1513 $1.35
MICRO MIST NEBULIZER W/TEE, Teleflex
113 MOUTHPIECE, 7 FT TUBING, RESERVOIR 1/EA 1882 $1.35
TUBE AND ST CONNECTOR 50EA/CS
. . Bound Tree
114 Curaplex Nebulizer w/Mask, Pediatric 50ea/cs 1/EA 30556 $1.67
115 Curaplex Nebulizer w/Mask, Adult 50ea/cs 1/EA Bogggs'l'?ree $1.10
116 Needle, Hypodermic, 18 ga x 1 inch, 100/bx 1/EA Medline Industries $0.08

10bx/cs

SYR100185Z




Filter needle, 20 ga x 1 1/2 in., 5 micron,

Mckesson Medical

117 polypropylene hub, sterile 100/bx 10bx/cs 1/EA 8881305018 $0.30
OB kit, cardboard box, incl gloves, scalpel, Dvnarex
118 underpad, sponges, clamps, OB pad, towels, 1/EA 1901 $10.00
apron
119 OXIMETER, PULSE, FINGERTIP 1/EA Mckesson Medical $13.00
16-2352
COLD PACK INSTANT KOOL-PRESS 6 IN X Mckesson Medical
120 8 1/4 IN 24/CS 1/eA 16-9703 $0.80
121 HOT PACKS 6 IN X 8 1/4 IN 24/CS 1/EA Mckesson Medical 3083 $0.63
Dressing, Abdominal, Combine Pad, Sterile, 8 in Mckesson Medical
122 x 10 in 24ealtr 15tr/cs L/EA 16-4254 $0.20
ABDOMINAL PADS STERILE5IN X 9 IN Mckesson Medical
123 25/TR 16 TR/ICS COMBINE 1/EA 16-4250 $0.20
Paper, LP11, LP12 and LP15, Size 108 mm x 23
124 m roll, 5rolls/pk 20pk/cs, LifePak 1/EA NO BID NO BID
PENLIGHT DISPOSABLE EACH WITH Graham Field
125 PUPIL GAUGE 300EA/CS 1/EA 4062 $1.00
PNEUMOTHORAX SET EMERGENCY Cook Medical
126 COOK 15 GAUGE NEEDLE 1/EA 278493 $157.00
Pressure Infuser, UNIFUSOR, 1000ml Infusion Spacelabs Healthcare
127 Cuff w/Aneroid Gauge and Stopcock Valve 1/EA P $14.95
1850-80424
24ealbx
SUCTION PUMP WITH 1 CANISTER AND 2 AMBU
128 SUCTION CATHETERS AMBU RES-CUE 1/EA 500277 $11.99

PUMP




129 RESTRAINT STRAPS LIMB DISPOSABLE 1/EA EM Adams Inc $3.99
DELUXE ADULT 48PR/CS 26-0616 '
. Bound Tree
130 Curaplex Ring Cutter 1/EA 61511 $5.99
Curaplex Ring Cutter Replacement Blade Bound Tree
131 100ea/bx L/EA 61512 $7.00
Buretrol Set NF, 105 in, Luer Lock, 2 Pre-pierced
182 Inj Sites, 150ml 48ea/cs 1/EA NO BID NOBID
. i Bound Tree
133 Curaplex Paramedic Shears, Blue, 7.5 in 50pr/bx | 1/EA 811-68009 $1.99
Flex-All splint, orange, bendable foam and Medsource International
134 aluminum splint, 4 in. x 36 in. rolled V/EA 533-MS-SPLINT $6.75
Folding splint, cardboard, center foam, 18 in OMS
135 long, features punch out holes for tie downs 1/EA $3.05
660002
25ea/
Folding splint, cardboard, center foam, 24 in . .
136 long, features punch out holes for tie downs 1/EA Morrison Medical Product 561 $2.50
1540
25ea/
137 Folding Splint, Cardboard, Center Foam, 34 in 1/EA Morrison Medical Product $3.99
long, Features punch out holes 25ea/cs 56-1573
Curaplex Sprague Rappaport Style Stethoscope, Bound Tree
138 Black 50ea/cs L/EA 36020 $5.9
STETHOSCOPE BLACK 22 IN 20/CS Graham Field
139 SPRAGUE 1/EA 602 $9.00
140 Stethoscope, AdScope Ninja, Sprague 22 in. 1/EA American Diagnostic $14.99

black

646ST




RESTRAINT STRAP ANTIBACTERIAL

OMS

141 METAL SEAT BELT BUCKLE BLACK 2 1/EA $10.99
PIECE 5 FT LOOP END S0622ABBK
IMPERV WEBBING SWIVEL SPEED CLIP OoMS
142 2PC 5 FT YELLOW L/EA 3171-25225 $35.00
Restraint Strap, Black, 2 pc, 5 ft, Nylon, Metal OMS
143 Push Button Buckle, Loop Ends 1/EA 50962SBK 31368
RESTRAINT STRAP DISPOSABLE ORANGE
144 2 PIECE 5 FT 36/CS LOOP END AND 1/EA OMS B0124 $3.75
PLASTIC SIDE RELEASE BUCKLE
STRAPS DISP 5 FT 2PC ORANGE PLASTIC OoMS
145 SR BUCKLE, PLASTIC SWIVEL SPEED CLIP 1/EA 1394-0R $10.50
RESTRAINT STRAP DISPOSABLE 2 PIECE
146 BLACK 5 FT LOOP ENDS PLASTIC SIDE 1/EA OMS B0139 $3.04
RELEASE
RESTRAINT STRAPS IMPERVIOUS OMS
147 YELLOW, PLAS SIDE REL BUCKLE, 5 FT 1/EA $25.00
2PC 3172-76525
RESTRAINT STRAP SIDE RELEASE
148 BUCKLE ORANGE 1 PIECE 9 FT NYLON- 1/EA B;%';'ZJ&EE $1.75
FASTEX
STRAP HEAD/CHIN DISPOSABLE FOR
149 KENDRICK EXTRICATION DEVICE 1/EA BOUNDTREE FER0819928 $59.50
**KED*, TAN
SURCH-LITE LIGHTED OROTRACHEAL
150 STYLETTE, NON-STERILE, ADULT, 40 CM 1/EA FERNO WASHINGTON 2100 $75.00
151 STYLETTE SLICK DISPOSABLE ADULT 1/EA TELEFLEX MEDICAL 20404 $7.55

LARGE 7.0 TO 10.0 25/BX




STYLETTE DISPOSABLE PEDIATRIC

152 MEDIUM 4.0 TO 6.5 25/BX SLICK 1/EA TELEFLEX MEDICAL 20405 $7.55
SUCTION CANISTER DISPOSABLE RED MCKEESON MEDICAL
153 TOP 800cc 100/CS L/EA 82794000 $4.12
154 SUCTION CANISTER DISPOSABLE RIGID 1/EA BEMIS MANUFACT CO $6.68
GREEN TOP 1200cc 48/CS HI-FLOW 598041 '
155 SUCTION TUBINGSSO-/I-CI:ESRILE 9/32 IN X6 FT 1/EA CONMED CORP 3243200 $4.44
156 Syringe Only, 10cc, Luer Lock, 100ea/bx 12bx/cs| 1/EA MCKESSON 16022800 $0.11
) MCKESSON

157 Syringe Only, 3cc, Luer Lock, 100ea/bx 24bx/cs | 1/EA 73262800 $0.08
IV Flush Syringe, Normal Saline 10ml Prefilled

158 12cc Syringe, Sterile 100ea/bx 4bx/cs 1/EA NOBID NO BID
TAPE ADHESIVE CLOTH 1IN X 10 YARDS MCKESSON

159 12/BX 12BX/CS L/EA 61102200 $1.08
TAPE ADHESIVE CLOTH 2 IN X 10 YARDS MCKESSON

160 6/BX 12BX/CS L/EA 62102200 $1.86
TAPE ADHESIVE CLOTH 3 IN X 10 YARDS MCKESSON

161 4/BX 12BX/CS L/EA 47132200 $3.15
TAPE ADHESIVE TRANSPARENT 1IN X 10

162 VARDS 12/BX 12BX/CS 1/EA MEDLINE PRM260201H- $1.86
TAPE ADHESIVE TRANSPARENT 2 IN X 10

163 YARDS 6/BX 12BX/CS 1/EA MEDLINE PRM260202H- $1.39

164 Thermometer, Tempa-DOT, Fahrenheit, oral and 1/EA TRIAD HP INDUSTRIES $0.18

axillary, single use, sterile 100/bx 20bx/cs TD5122 '
165 Tourniquet, Latex Free, 1 in x 18 in, Rolled, Blue 1/EA MCKESSON 16632500 $0.21

Color 250ea/bg 4bg/cs




Curaplex Endotracheal Tube, 3.0mm, Uncuffed,

BOUNDTREE

166 without Stylette 10ea/bx 10bx/cs 1/EA 36152 $2.31




Curaplex Endotracheal Tube, 7.5mm, Cuffed,

BOUNDTREE

L7 without Stylette 10ea/bx 10bx/cs 1/EA 36163 $2.43
Curaplex Endotracheal Tube, 8.0mm, Cuffed, BOUNDTREE
178 without Stylette 10ea/bx 10bx/cs 1/EA 36164 $2.43
Curaplex Endotracheal Tube, 8.5mm, Cuffed, BOUNDTREE
179 without Stylette 10ea/bx 10bx/cs 1/eA 36165 $2.43
Curaplex Endotracheal Tube, 9.0mm, Cuffed, BOUNDTREE
180 without Stylette 10ea/bx 10bx/cs 1/EA 36166 $2.43
Curaplex Endotracheal Tube, 2.5mm, Uncuffed, BOUNDTREE
181 without Stylette 10ea/bx 10bx/cs 1/EA 36151 $2.31
Endotracheal Tube Holder, Thomas,
182 |Pediatric/Child, for ET/SGA Tubes 4.3mm IDto| 1/ea BOUNDTREE $5.74
15.8 020400
Endotracheal Tube Holder, Thomas, Adult, for BOUNDTREE
183 ET/SGA Tubes 6.5mm ID to 21mm OD L/EA 020500 $5.74
Esophageal intubation detector, TubeChek-B, AMBU
184 bulb style, do not use in children less than5Syr 1/EA $4.39
172002
20ealcs
OXYGEN CONNECTING TUBING, 7 FT, 3
185 CHANNEL SAFETY TUBING, 3/16 IN I.D., 1/EA M%gésgzggl $0.39
50EA/CS
STERILE WATER FOR IRRIGATION 500ML
186 16/CS BBRAUN 1/EA B.BRAUN R5001-01 $2.44
187 WINDOW PUNCH WITH CLIP 1066 1/EA EM.I. $14.57
400022 '
SANI-HANDS ALC ANTIMICROBIAL
188 ALCOHOL GEL HAND WIPE 135 SHEETS 1/EA PROFESSIONAL DISPOSABLES $7.14

(12TB/CS)

P13472-




ALLIED HEALTHCARE

189 WRENCH CYLINDER METAL SMALL 20/CS| 1/EA 20642 $4.23
190 Cylinder wrench, plastlc, D/E cylinder, with 1/EA MADA MEDICAL MDM167WR- $1.33
chain 25ea/bx
191 Curaplex Yankauer with Vent 20ea/pk 1/EA BOUllgllDO'I;REE $1.62
192 UVEX UNISPEC II, CLEAR 1/EA KIMBERLY CLARK 16727H $3.43
King Vision Video Laryngoscope Blade, AMBU
193 Standard, Disp, 13mm, w/White LED, Digital 1/EA 9144-K\/031 $42.24
CMOS Camera 10ea/
IV Solution, Sodium Chloride 0.9% 1000ml Bag
194 12ea/cs ES000 1/EA NO BID NO BID
105 Sterile Water for Irrigation, 2000ml Plastic Pour 1/EA B.BRAUN RS000-01 $2.35
Bottle 12ea/cs
196 SPLINT FULL LEG ADD-A-SPLINT 4EA/BX 1/EA BOUé\I6[C))'7I'REE $95.84
197 SPLINT KIT ADD-A-SPLINT 4EA/BX 1/EA BOU?;SJREE $325.25
SPLINT SLING/SWATHE ADD-A-SPLINT BOUNDTREE
198 AEA/BX 1/EA 5601 $64.52
199 SPLINT FULL ARM ADD-A-SPLINT 4EA/BX 1/EA BOU;\IBIS;REE $71.54
200 SPLINT HALF ARM ADD-A-SPLINT 4EA/BX| 1/EA BOU;\QSIREE $40.49
SPLINT ANKLE/ELBOW ADD-A-SPLINT BOUNDTREE
201 AEA/BX 1/EA 5606- $76.94
FILTERLINE SET, NON HUMIDIFIED, COVIDIEN
202 ||NTUBATED, ADULT/PEDIATRIC 100EA/BX| Y/EA 174620 $16.05




SMART CAPNOLINE PEDIATRIC , NON

203 INTUBATED, ORAL NASAL, NO 02 1/EA COVIDIEN 177266 $19.97
DELIVERY 25/BX 007266
SMART CAPNOLINE PLUS NON COVIDIEN
204 INTUBATED, ORAL NASAL W/0O2 TUBING, 1/EA 177268 $18.89
ADULT/INTERMEDIATE 100EA/BX
SMART CAPNOLINE, PEDIATRIC, NON COVIDIEN
205 INTUBATED, ORAL NASAL W/OXYGEN 1/EA 177669 $24.69
TUBING 25/BX
Curaplex Manual Suction Pump, incl Pump, BOUND TREE
206 Adult Suction Canister, Two Catheters 1/EA 10369 $83.69
Curaplex Oxygen Regulator, All-Brass, 2 DISS, BOUND TREE
207 1 Barh, CGA870 L/EA 14288 $83.69
Curaplex Aneroid Sphygmomanometer, Infant, BOUND TREE
208 with Case 50ea/cs L/EA 36010 $91.79
Curaplex Aneroid Sphygmomanometer, Child, BOUND TREE
209 with Case 50ea/cs L/EA 36011 $11.46
Curaplex Aneroid Sphygmomanometer, Adult, BOUND TREE
210 with Case 50ea/cs L/EA 36013 $13.22
Curaplex Aneroid Sphygmomanometer, LG BOUND TREE
211 Adult, with Case 50ea/cs L/EA 36014 $14.70
BATTERY, LP500, LITHIUM, NON- R&D BATTERIES
212 RECHARGEABLE L/EA 14990 $344.24
213 DUCT TAPE WHITE, 2 INCH X 60 YDS 24/CS| 1/EA BRON;’;‘;)GES INC $13.76
214 MegaMover Select, 40 in x 80 in, 1/EA LITTLE RAPIDS CORP $38.22

White/Black/Green Pull Straps 8ea/cs

GRM66563




CABLE, MASIMO SET RED LNCS-4 LP15 20

215 PIN FOR USE WITH LNCS PATIENT 1/EA MASIMO CORP MMO02055 $329.74
SENSOR, 4 FT
. MEDLINE
216 Shave Prep Razor, 2 sided, Blue 100ea/cs 1/EA DYND70836 $0.49
NAIL POLISH REMOVER PAD, 1 1/4 INCH X
217 2 5/8 INCH, ACETONE FREE 100/BX 1/EA MEDLINE MDS090780 $0.42
10BX/CS
ONSITE AED AND FRX AED SOS TECHNOLOGIES
218 SPARE/REPLACEMENT BATTERY 1/EA DEF5070A- $183.82
HEARTSTART SMART PADS Il FOR FRx 1 SOS TECHNOLOGIES
219 SET EA DEF9898031313 - 87004
. . PHYSIC CONTROL INC
220 Suction Cups, for LUCAS 2, Disposable 3/pk 1/EA 4510-04676 $80.10
**Sensor, Masimo SET Rainbow R20, Ped, Disp
221 Adhesive, RC Patient Cable Cmptble, LifePak 15| 1/EA PHYSIC CONTROL INC $107.99
10/ 2712-34096
Sensor, Masimo SET M-LNCS, Adult, SpO2,
222 Reusable, RC Patient Cable Compatible 1/EA MASIMO CORP MM02501 $422.58
Patient Cable, Masimo SET RC, 4ft, for Use
223 w/M-LNCS or Rainbow R Sensors, LifePak 15 1/EA MASIMOCORP MMO3755 $409.83
MASIMO SET LNCS PEDIATRIC
224 DISPOSABLE SENSOR 20EA/BX 1/EA MASIMO CORP MMO01861 $24.48
Module, Deluxe King Vision Video Supply Bag PROPAK MANUFACT
223 wiPockets, Red, 9 in x 13 in x 3.25 in. HEA 2523-13512 $65.46
Battery, LP500, Non-rechargeable lithium, 12V, PHYSIO CONTROL INC
226 7.5 Ah, LifePak 500 1/EA 1141-000158 $449.90
997 Mucosal Atomization Device, MAD Nasal/Oral 1/EA TELEFLEX MEDICAL $9.52

wi/3cc Syringe, Latex Free 25ea/bx

MAD100




228 NASAL WITH SCC ORAL SYRINGE 1/EA TELEFLEX MEDICAL MAD140 $12.26
25EA/BX
999 02 nasal cannula, s_tralght, non-flare, adult, 7ft 1/EA MEDLINE HCS4514 $0.42
tubing 50ea/cs
Needleless IV set, 10 drops, 92 in, 1
230 INTERLINK splint septum, 1Clearlink luer 1/EA NO BID NO BID
activated valve 48/
. . - 5
931 IV Solution, Sodium Chloride 0.9% 1000ml Bag 1/EA NO BID NO BID
14eal/cs
232 G3 Airway Cell, Gree“’éz INHX6INWxe.5in e, STATPACKS KSIG31000GN $150.15
G3 Medicine Cell, Red, 12 in Hx 6 in W x 6.5 in STATPACKS
233 D L/EA KSIG31003RE $150.15
p34  |CG3Tidal Volume, Red, BBP Resistant, 22inHx| ) ., STATPACKS KSIG35002R $300.27
8iINWx9inD
. . . STATPACKS
235 G3 1V Cell, Blue, 12inHx6inWx3inD 1/EA KSIG3100BU $120.14
236 G3 Universal Cell, Black 1/EA STATPACKS KSIG31002BK $120.14
Percentage (%) discount for other medical supplies not Percentage (%) discount for other (10 - 15%
specifically listed in this IFB but may be needed. Percentage (%) medical supplies not specifically
off catalog or online pricing. listed in this IFB but may be needed.
Percentage (%) off catalog or online
pricing.
Vendor will accept Credit Card Payment? Yes No Vendor will accept Credit Card
Payment? YES
Vendor will accept invoice payment (net/30)? Yes No Vendor will accept invoice payment
(net/30)? YES
Vendor 's order processing /delivery time?
Vendor 's order processing / delivery
time? 2-3 WEEKS
Vendor's delivery fee? Vendor's delivery fee? NEGOTIABLE




Awarded To:
Awarded Date:

Nashville Medical & EMS Products/Bound Tree Medical
April 5, 2018

9 NO BID ITEMS

COMBINED TOTAL

$6,045.30

AVERAGE COST OF ITEM

$26.63




NASHVILLE MEDICAL & EMS
PRODUCTS, INC DBA NASHVILE EMS

MIDWEST MEDICAL SUPPLY CO, LLC

MANUFA%‘LU&EERI/QPRODUCT UNIT PRICE MANUFA(?\lTUUMRIBEERéPRODUCT UNIT PRICE
KENTRON 779110 $0.12 SUNMED 1-1506-11 $0.13
KENTRON 779940 $0.12 SUNMED 1-1506-40 $0.13
KENTRON 779950 $0.12 SUNMED 1-1506-50 $0.13
KENTRON 779960 $0.12 SUNMED 1-1506-60 $0.13
KENTRON 779970 $0.12 SUNMED 1-1506-70 $0.13
KENTRON 779980 $0.12 SUNMED 1-1506-80 $0.13
KENTRON 779990 $0.12 SUNMED 1-1506-90 $0.13
KENTRON 7799100 $0.12 SUNMED 1-1506-99 $0.13
KING KLTD KIT 2.5 $26.49 KING LTSD KING 25 $38.62




KING KLTSD KIT #2 $26.49 KING LTSD KING 2 $38.62
KING KLTSD KIT #3 $26.49 KING LTSD KING 3 $35.78
KING KLTSD KIT #4 $26.49 KING LTSD KING 4 $35.78
KING KLTSD KIT #5 $26.49 KING LTSD KING 5 $35.78
KENTRON #166671 $0.99 SUNMED 1-1508-00 $1.04
KENTRON #166776 $6.59 SUNMED 1-5076-06 $9.68
KENTRON #166779 $8.99 SUNMED 1-5076-09 $14.49
KENTRON #804420 $1.09 SUNMED 1-5076-20 $1.17
KENTRON #804422 $1.09 SUNMED 1-5076-22 $1.17
KENTRON #804424 $1.09 SUNMED 1-5076-24 $1.17
KENTRON #804426 $1.09 SUNMED 1-5076-26 $1.17




KENTRON #804428 $1.09 SUNMED 1-5076-28 $1.17
KENTRON #804430 $1.09 SUNMED 1-5076-30 $1.17
KENTRON #804432 $1.09 SUNMED 1-5076-32 $1.17
KENTRON #804434 $1.09 SUNMED 1-5076-34 $1.17
KENTRON #804436 $1.09 SUNMED 1-5076-36 $1.17
MORR;?SII\SI)_';AO%DICAL $1.39 PRECISION 45002-11-MPG $0.68
MORRISON MEDICAL $0.95 PRECISION 45002-11-MPN $0.63
#1004-50 SOLD 24/CS
KENTRON #098013 $0.12 MEDEGEN 116 $0.10
KENTRON #670722 $0.29 DYNAREX 3662 SOLD $0.27
24/CS
KENTRON #670723 $0.34 DYNAREX 3663 $0.38
KENTRON #670724 $0.22 DYNAREX 3664 $0.51




KENTRON #670726 $0.57 DYNAREX 3666 $0.73
KENTRON #404056 $0.26 MEDSOURCE MS-11050 $0.19
KENTRON #404075 $0.21 ADC 4010T $0.29
KENTRON #886657 $0.92 GRAHAM 54849 $0.99
KENTRON #888111 $1.39 MEDSOURCE MS-BS0033 $1.64
KENTRON #779500 $7.69 VENTLAB BVM900 $7.99
KENTRON #779501 $7.69 VENTLAB BVMS800 $7.99
KENTRON #999308 $0.238 VENTLAB 1007 $0.24
KENTRON #999310 $0.27 VENTLAB 1307 $0.59
KENTRON #999310 $0.27 VENTLAB 1407 SOLD 50/CS $0.64
KENTRON #999312 $0.245 VENTLAB 1207 $0.35
LEFT BLANK LEFT BLANK BD 303390 SOLD 1000/CS $0.3933
AMBU MINIPERFIT ACE $5.45 AMBER 000-281-106 $5.32

COLLAR




AMBU PERFIT ACE ADULT

COLLAR $5.45 AMBER 000-281-000 $5.32
LEFT BLANK LEFT BLANK PHILLY PATRIOT PAP-PA $4.32
KENTRSIIE\ID#MZZSJ' $1.69 MEDICAL ACTION 185 $2.20
KENTRON #412203R SHARP $2.39 COVIDIEN 1522SA $2.37
KENTRON #412275R SHARP $3.19 MEDEGEN 184R $5.90
KENTRON #412277R SHARP $3.29 COVIDIEN 31144010 $2.72
KENTRON #412272R SHARPS $1.39 MEDEGEN 8702 $1.09
KENTRON #412207R SHARP $3.39 COVIDIEN 8990SA $4.49
EXCLUSIVE TO BOUNDTREE
MEDICAL LEFT BLANK NO BID NO BID
SALTER ZCC4001L-10
KENAFLEXX #177713S $4.89 SOLD BY BOX $5.00
SALTER ZCC4101L-10
KENAFLEXX #177712S $3.99 SOLD BY BOX $3.51
KENAFLEXX #177711S $3.19 SALTER 2CC4201L-10 $3.51

SOLD BY BOX




SALTER ZCC4401L-10

KENAFLEXX #177709S $2.89 SOLD BY BOX $3.25
HEALTHMARK 6323-RD-NUM
KENTRON SEALS RED $0.09 SOLD BY BAG $0.1685
HEALTHMARK 6323-WHITE
KENTRON SEALS WHITE $0.09 SOLD BY BAG $0.1685
MALLINCKRODT
AMBU C02 DETECTOR ADULT $9.89 EASYCAP I $8.83
AMBU C02 DETECTOR MALLINCKRODT
PEDIATRIC $1019 PEDICAP ¥8.83
HEARTSYNC PHYSIO
PEDIATRIC PAIR $17.39 CONMED 3112-1730 $13.33
HEARTSYN%;TRYSIO ADULT $16.49 CONMED 3112-1731 $13.33
MEDI-TRACE SF450,50/BG COVIDIEN ES82650 SOLD
10 BGS/BX,4BXS/CS 30.21 BY 50/PK $0.1422
CONMED 1620-003,30/BX CONMED 1620-003 SOLD
10 BXS/CASE 30.27 BY BOX $0.1486
EMPHASIS EB100 SOLD
KENTRON #404085 $0.39 BY 25/PK $0.40
DISPENSER FOR 404085 $32.69 EMPHASIS EG-T111 $27.27
KENTRON ALL IN ONE BAG HARTWELL BH1100 SOLD
#201712 SOl 12/PK $1.44




KENTRON #KI298 $2.89 ADC 316 $4.06
KENTRON #440002 $0.11 DUKAL 602 SOLD $0.0792
12/BG
KENTRON #440003 $0.12 DYNAREX 3103 SOLD $0.0933
12/BG
KENTRON #440004 $0.135 DYNAREX 3104 SOLD $0.115
12/BG
KENTRON #440006 $0.23 DYNAREX 3106 SOLD $0.22
12/BG
EMPHASIS GA441220
KENTRON #441211 $0.02 SOLD BY 200/PK $0.01105
EMPHASIS GF441221
KENTRON #KS4412 $0.0333 SOLD BY 2/PK 25PK/BOX $0.0272
EMPHASIS GF22821
KENTRON #KS2280 $0.011 SOLD BY 2/PK 50PK/BOX $0.0098
COVIDIEN 8884423600
KENTRON #887339 $0.41 SOLD 12/BG $1.01
NEMESIS V30 $5.89 K/C 25676 $2.95
DEFENDER MEDIUM DIGITCARE DFR10-2 SOLD
100/BX $0.145 BY CASE $0.09878
DEFENDER LARGE $0.145 DIGITCARE DFR10-3 SOLD $0.09878

BY CASE




DIGITCARE DFR10-4

SOLD

DEFENDER XL $0.145 BY CASE $0.09878
DIGITCARE DFR10-5 SOLD
DEFENDER 2XL $0.145 BY CASE $0.1098
DIGITCARE DFR10-1 SOLD
DEFENDER SM $0.145 BY CASE $0.09878
BAYER CONTOUR 50/BOX $0.308 BAYER 06707245 SOLD $0.2888
BY BOX
NO CHARGE
BAYER CONTOUR MONITOR $4.99 BAYS%RL(E)G;OY?%A'S;(EMS W/STRIP
AWARD #84
LIFE NUTRITION $1.33 TRANSCEND 63799 $1.07
#6739
KENTRON #666610 $2.39 DICK MEDICAL 50200 $2.38
DYNAREX 1401
DYNAREX #1401 $0.19 SOLD BY BOX $1.86
KENAFLEXX #429000 $0.87 ICU C1000 $1.25
INSYTE AUTOGUARD
381412 $2.05 BD 381412 $2.05
INSYTE AUTOGUARD
381423 $2.01 BD 381423 $2.05
INSYTE AUTOGUARD $1.87 BD 381444 $2.05

381444




INSVTE AUTOGUARD

381434 $1.87 BD 381434 $2.05
INSVTE AUTOGUARD
381467 $2.09 BD 381467 $2.16
NSVTE AUTOGUARD
381454 $2.09 BD 381454 $2.16
DYNAREX 4609
CONMED 705-4431 $0.0335 SOLD BY BOX $0.20
KENAFLEXX #419010 $1.04 MEDSOURCE MS-83110 $1.17
DYNAREX 1250 SOLD
DUMAREX #1250 $0.0450 BY BOX $0.0393
MOTION 1702B SOLD

KENTRON #999700 $4.69 BY CASE $5.86

LEFT BLANK LEFT BLANK NO BID NO BID

SURGILANCE SLN300
SUGILANCE #SLN 300 $0.012 SOLD BY BOX $0.074
SURGILANCE SLN240

SUGILANCE #SLN240 $0.012 SOLD BY BOX $0.074
KENTRON #999810 $0.055 VENTLAB 2100 $0.45
KENTRON #999108 $0.0635 VENTLAB 2102 $0.66
KENTRON #333100 $0.035 VENTLAB 2110 $0.34




KENTRON #333110 $0.33 VENTLAB 2210 $0.42
KENTRON #999119 $0.73 VENTLAB 2300 $0.64
KENTRON #999109 $0.645 VENTLAB 2202 $0.66
KENTRON #999800 $0.55 VENTLAB 2200 $0.42
LEFT BLANK LEFT BLANK Mg)él?s)éiség;l(% $1.1215
LEFT BLANK LEFT BLANK Mg)él?s)éiség;l(% $1.1215
LEFT BLANK LEFT BLANK Mg)é.fg)éiSégl;l(% $1.1215
KENTRON #333759 $0.63 MED-TECH MS-22883 $0.62
KENTRON #333761 $0.77 MED-TECH MS-22886 $0.74
KENTRON #333760 $0.77 MED-TECH MS-22885 $0.62
NIPRO $0.04 DYNAREX 6960 $0.0277

SOLD BY BOX




COVIDIEN 8881305018

BRAUN $0.37 SOLD BY BOX $0.2104
KENTRON #999700B $4.89 MO-IL;,I\((-)EA{;(I)EZI?SAME AS #SQOLD $5.86
KENTRON $24.19 VERIDIAN 11-50D $21.53
KENTRON #561111 $0.39 Ig(\)(EIDA:\E()EA);\SSlé $9.36
KENTRON #562111 $0.49 ggsg:s()éfég $0.57
amoen | g o | o
o | g o | o
KENTRON #K12395 $2.19 Sslgtlgpégré:glg: $1.81
KENTRON #404060 $0.49 VERIDIAN 14-823 $0.55
#CC;?BE)?';Z $159.95 COOK C-TPTS-8-5-6-O-FSNS $127.34
KENTRON #888802 $7.39 VENTLAB VC410 $7.67
KENTRON #179900 $29.69 AMBU 276-000-001 $44.27




DICK MEDICAL #501100

DOUBLE D RINGS $3.19 DICK MEDICAL 501110 $3.16
KENTRON #RC101 $3.83 ADC 380 $11.64
KENTRON #RC101B $1.09 ADC 381 $4.50
BAXTER #2C7564 $11.99 NO BID NO BID
KENTRON #K114107 $0.61 MEDSOURCE MS-SH002BL $0.75
KENTRON #887722 $2.49 DYNAREX 3528 $2.99
MORRISON MEDICAL
#1530-25 $1.69 DICK MEDICAL 61018MCF $0.95
MORRISON MEDICAL
#1540-25 $2.39 DICK MEDICAL 61024MCF $1.19
MORRISON MEDICAL
#1573-25 $3.89 DICK MEDICAL 61036MCF $1.29
KENTRON #104410B $4.19 VERIDIAN 05-11001 $4.44
REPEAT #138
KENTRON #104410BK $4.19 VERIDIAN 05-11001 $544.00
ADSCOPE NINJA SPRAGUE $29.95 ADC 641BK $7.63




KENAFLEXX

333905BK $5.25 DICK MEDICAL 31152BK $6.32
K3§§%I:5|_YES>(<:X $6.99 DICK MEDICAL 31252YL $8.73
Kgg‘é:g;;)éx $4.65 DICK MEDICAL 11152BK $6.32
KEZSIQEEEF);X $1.39 DICK MEDICAL 471520R $1.52
2K92§(')A\5|E)LRES>(<3>|§ $3.29 DICK MEDICAL 475520R $3.63
KI;gNBA3SI5_§|><(X $1.39 DICK MEDICAL 47152BK $1.52
Kgglgggé_)féx $4.25 DICK MEDICAL 31152YL $6.32
I;IEQISIQZI&I%);X $4.25 DICK MEDICAL 110910R $6.32
KENTRON #881214 $3.99 MORRISON 1478TAN $6.22
LEFT BLANK LEFT BLANK AARON NLOT $30.40
KENTRON #729914 $0.99 TELEFLEX 1000R $2.87

20/BOX




KENTRON #729910

20/BOX $0.99 TELEFLEX 750R $2.66
KENTRON #810800
2A/CASE $1.69 BEMIS 424410 $2.25
BEMIS
4484410 $2.69 BEMIS 484410 $2.76
KENTRON
4668932 $0.67 DYNAREX 4693 $0.78
DYNAREX 6990 SOLD
LEFT BLANK LEFT BLANK BY BOX $0.0575
B BROWN 4610303-02
LEFT BLANK LEFT BLANK SOLD BY BOX $0.0417
NURSE ASSIST 1210-BP
LEFT BLANK LEFT BLANK SOLD BY BOX $0.286
DYNAREX 35262
KENTRON #705-211 $0.57 SOLD BY BOX $0.66
DYNAREX 35263
KENTRON #705-212 $1.14 SOLD BY BOX $1.32
DYNAREX 35264
KENTRON #705-213 $1.69 SOLD BY BOX $1.98
DUKAL T110
KENTRON #705-311 $0.46 SOLD BY BOX $0.5225
DUKAL T210
KENTRON #705-312 $0.91 SOLD BY BOX $1.05
TEMPADOT 5122
TEMPA-DOT $0.12 SOLD BY BOX $0.115
KENTRON #90110 $0.075 CRAHAM FIELD 4109-1LF $0.066

SOLD BY BAG




KENTRON #739930 $0.50 SUNMED 1-7330-30 $0.47
KENTRON #739935 $0.50 SUNMED 1-7330-35 $0.47
KENTRON #739940 $0.50 SUNMED 1-7330-40 $0.47
KENTRON #739945 $0.50 SUNMED 1-7330-45 $0.47
KENTRON #739950 $0.50 SUNMED 1-7330-50 $0.47
KENTRON #749955 $0.63 SUNMED 1-7333-55 $0.67
KENTRON #739955 $0.50 SUNMED 1-7330-55 $0.47
KENTRON #749950 $0.63 SUNMED 1-7333-50 $0.67
KENTRON #749960 $0.63 SUNMED 1-7333-60 $0.67
KENTRON #749965 $0.63 SUNMED 1-7333-65 $0.67
KENTRON #749970 $0.63 SUNMED 1-7333-70 $0.67




KENTRON #749975 $0.63 SUNMED 1-7333-75 $0.67
KENTRON #749980 $0.63 SUNMED 1-7333-80 $0.67
KENTRON #749985 $0.63 SUNMED 1-7333-85 $0.67
KENTRON #749990 $0.63 SUNMED 1-7333-90 $0.67
KENTRON #739925 $0.50 SUNMED 1-7330-2S $0.47
THOMAS $2.89 LAERDAL 600-20000 $2.65
KEGI\QI-IQ-QRQ(?LN $2.49 LAERDAL 600-10000 $2.65
AMBU $4.19 AMBU 000-172-002 $2.11
KESI\.II_;RROII_\IU#ISI?S 00 $0.12 VENTLAB 3007 $0.22
McKESSON $2.99 NURSE ASSIST 6290 $1.65
KENTRON #404061 $3.79 ADC 360 $4.97
PDI #P13472 $0.0555 PDIP134r2 SOLD $0.035

BY TUB




WESTERN $1.89 SUNMED 7-9900-02 $2.35
KENTRON #550025
WITHOUT CHAIN $0.39 WESTERN MCW - 3PC $2.62
KENTRON #887710 $0.34 DYNAREX 4690 $0.34
LEFT BLANK LEFT BLANK KS NEMESIS 25676 $2.95
KING KVL 03 SOLD
LEFT BLANK LEFT BLANK BY CASE $34.03
LEFT BLANK LEFT BLANK NO BID NO BID
NURSE ASSIST 6291
BRAUN $3.99 SOLD BY 6/CASE $2.05
KENTRON
444902 $28.95 NO BID NO BID
KENTRON
444903 $129.00 NO BID NO BID
LEFT BLANK LEFT BLANK NO BID NO BID
KENTRON
444902 $22.95 NO BID NO BID
KENTRON
444902 $18.69 NO BID NO BID
KENTRON
444902 $18.69 NO BID NO BID
PHYSIC CONTROL $11.49 PHYSIO 11996-000081 $10.37

#11996-000081




PHYSIC CONTROL

PHYSIO 11996-000120

#11996-000128 $16.99 SOLD BY BOX $1167
PHYSIC CONTROL
#11996-000163 $14.49 PHYSIO 11996-000167 $11.44
PHYSIC CONTROL PHYSIO 11996-000128
#11996-000128 $16.99 SOLD BY BOX $15.75
KENTRON
#179900 $29.69 NO BID NO BID
KENTRON $59.79 MERET EMSREG 8725 $131.19
#8710
KENTRON #777704 $4.69 VERIDIAN 02-1084 $4.83
KENTRON #777703 $4.69 VERIDIAN 02-1083 $4.83
KENTRON #777703 $4.69 VERIDIAN 02-1081 $4.83
KENTRON #777702 $4.89 VERIDIAN 02-1082 $4.99
LEFT BLANK LEFT BLANK NO BID NO BID
WHOLESALE TAPE
KENTRON #KT998877 $2.89 TDT60020000H SOLD $8.30
BY CASE
LEFT BLANK LEFT BLANK CRAHAM 72657 SOLD $25.97

BY CASE




KENTRON

#KU708-15(4) $69.00 MASIMO 2017 $144.15
DYNAREX #1501 $0.045 [;Z)T/[AD\RI;EYXB]-CS)())(:L $0.0366
LEFT BLANK LEFT BLANK NO BID NO BID
LEFT BLANK LEFT BLANK NO BID NO BID
LEFT BLANK LEFT BLANK PH\;%SJES\Z%—/%OQOLLG $4.07
MQSZIZI\;IO $72.00 NO BID NO BID
MQS;OI\:{IO $174.69 MASIMO 2501 $116.27
MQSSIZI\ZIO $169.00 NO BID NO BID
MASIMO #1860 $12.99 NO BID NO BID
LEFT BLANK LEFT BLANK NO BID NO BID
LEFT BLANK LEFT BLANK NO BID NO BID
MAD300 $3.95 TELEFLEX MAD100 $6.76




REPEAT #227

MAD301 $4.59 TELEFLEX MAD100 $6.76
KENTRON #999309 $0.24 VENTLAB 1007 $0.24
KENTRON #419010 MEDSOURCE MS-83110
50/CASE L 50/CASE $L.17
LEFT BLANK LEFT BLANK NO BID NO BID
LEFT BLANK LEFT BLANK STATPACKS G31000GN $78.75
LEFT BLANK LEFT BLANK STATPACKS G31003RE $78.75
LEFT BLANK LEFT BLANK STATPACKS G35002RE $157.50
LEFT BLANK LEFT BLANK STATPACKS G31001BU $63.00
LEFT BLANK LEFT BLANK STATPACKS G31002BK $63.00
Percentage (%) discount for other Percentage (%) discount for other
medical supplies not specifically medical supplies not specifically
listed in this IFB but may be needed. | LEFT BLANK listed in this IFB but may be needed. 28.00%
Percentage (%) off catalog or online Percentage (%) off catalog or online
pricing. pricing.
Vendor will accept Credit Card Vendor will accept Credit Card
NO YES
Payment? Payment?
Vendor will accept invoice payment YES Vendor will accept invoice payment VES
(net/30)? (net/30)?
Vendor 's order processing / delivery 3-5 DAYS Vendor 's order processing / delivery | 3 DAYS ARO
time? time?
Vendor's delivery fee? LEFT BLANK | [Vendor's delivery fee? 0




28 NO BID ITEMS

20 NO BID ITEMS

COMBINED TOTAL

$1,632.35

COMBINED TOTAL

$2,333.59

AVERAGE COST OF ITEM

$7.89

AVERAGE COST OF ITEM

$10.80

Clarified percentage and delivery fee: 40%

discount on non-contract items/zero delivery fee.

Midwest Medical has lowest combined pricing for items

#84 & 85




BOUNDTREE MEDICAL

MOORE MEDICAL

MANUFAC’\ITUUMRBEERF/{PRODUCT UNIT PRICE MANUFA(?\lTUUMRIBEERF/{PRODUCT UNIT PRICE
SUN MED BTI\E/I :f792-1-1508-11 $0.07 DUCAL MFGZE;‘;%—L‘MO; MOORE | ¢ 5500
SUN MED BTI\éI :f792-1-1508-40 $0.27 DUCAL MFG:882410216;40; MOORE | 5500
SUN MED BTI\éI :f792-1-1508-50 $0.27 DUCAL MFG:882410217-50; MOORE | 5500
SUN MED BTI\E/I A;/4%792-1-1508-60 $0.27 DUCAL MFG:8824$21€;6O; MOORE | o500
SUN MED BTI\E/I A#792-1-1508-70 $0.07 DUCAL MFG§8824$219—70; MOORE | o500
SUN MED BTI\éI :&792-1-1508-80 $0.27 DUCAL MFG;#882411();680; MOORE | 5500
SUN MED BTI\E/I A#792-1-1508-90 oy DUCAL MFG::;f;l-go; MOORE | o oco
SUN MED BTI\E/I A#792-1-1508-99 $0.27 DUCAL MDFG#ZEi(;lz-lOO; MOORE| ¢ ,c1g
AMBU BTM #477-KLTD2125EA $31.50 N/A N/A




AMBU BTM #477-KLTD212EA $31.50 N/A N/A
AMBU BTM #477-KLTD413EA $31.95 AMBU MFG#I;I?:7T2852433; MOORE $36.3600
AMBU BTM #477-KLTD414EA $31.95 AMBU MFG#KLTSD434; MOORE $36.3600
#37253
AMBU BTM #477-KLTD415EA $31.95 AMBU MFGHKLTSD435; MOORE $36.3600
#37254
SUN MED BTM#792-1-1508-00EA $2.20 DUKAL MFG#82135; MOORE $0.315
#82135
RUSCH, INC/TELEFLEX;
SUN MED BTM#792-1-5076-06-EA $2.827 MFG#1231: MOORE#89235 $5.4817
RUSCH, INC/TELEFLEX;
SUN MED BTM#791-1-5076-09-EA $2.718 MFG#1232: MOORE#89236 $3.4389
RUSCH, INC/TELEFLEX;
SUN MED BTM#027620 $2.04 MFEG#123120: MOORE#52482 $2.0500
RUSCH, INC/TELEFLEX;
SUN MED BTM#027622 $2.04 MFG#123122: MOORE#52483 $2.0500
RUSCH, INC/TELEFLEX;
SUN MED BTM#027624 $2.04 MFG#123124: MOORE#52484 $2.0500
SUN MED BTM#027626 $2.04 RUSCH, INC/TELEFLEX; $2.0500

MFG#123126; MOORE#52485




RUSCH, INC/TELEFLEX;

80866

SUN MED BTM#027628 $2.04 MFG#123128: MOORE#52486 $2.0500
RUSCH, INC/TELEFLEX;
SUN MED BTM#027630 $2.04 MFG#123130: MOORE#52487 $2.0500
RUSCH, INC/TELEFLEX;
SUN MED BTM#027632 $2.04 MFG#123132: MOORE#52488 $2.0500
RUSCH, INC/TELEFLEX;
SUN MED BTM#027634 $2.04 MFG#123134: MOORE#52489 $2.0500
RUSCH, INC/TELEFLEX;
SUN MED BTM#027636 $2.04 MFG#123136: MOORE#52490 $2.0500
MORRISON MEDICAL $0.86 MOORISON MEDICAL; $0.8700
PRODUCTS BTM#450002 ' MFG#1019M; MOORE#88744 '
MORRISON MEDICAL
PRODUCTS BTM#56-1004EA SU NIA NIA
MEDEGEN MEDICAL PRODUCTS $0.10 MEDEGEN MEDICAL ;MFG# $0.0800
BTM#520-116EA ' F116BX;Moore # 28853 '
Cypress Medical Products; MFG#
ADI MEDICAL BTM#080502 $0.29 80854;Moore # $0.4000
80854
Cypress Medical Products; MFG#
ADI MEDICAL BTM#080503 $0.34 80855; Moore# $0.4900
80855
Cypress Medical Products; MFG#
ADI MEDICAL BTM#080504 $0.47 80866;Moore# $1.2700




Cypress Medical Products; MFG#

ADI MEDICAL BTM#080506 $0.68 80857;Moore# $0.8260
80857
Dukal C; MFG# CTBA40;
CURAPLEX BTM#1124-03680 $0.19 Moore # 69397 $0.5300
AMERICAN DIAGNOSTIC CORP American Diagnostic
BTM#020010P $0.362 MFG#4010T MM#63076 Hl2ent
MEDICAL BTM#11845 ' ' '
29624
Med-Tech Resources Inc.; MFG#
CURAPLEX BTM#30061MS $1.61 MTR-27016-Z;Moore $1.9300
# 16940
Ambu I;MFG# 520-211-
AMBU BTM#520-211 $8.99 0OOB:Moore# 16502 $9.6375
AMBU BTM#530-213 $10.35 N/A N/A
Allied Healthcare Products ; MFG#
VENTLAB C;g?R EE(??RTION BTM $0.242 33239:Moore# $0.2800
49661
VENTLAB CORPPORTION BTM
#2353-13079 $0.97 N/A N/A
SALTER LABS, INC BTM#1611EA $2.56 N/A N/A
BTM#87-1207EA ' ' '
49660
BECTON DICKINSON Becton Dickinson ;MFG#
BTM#G4128 3044 303390; Moore# 11312 I
AMBU BTM#260280 $3.75 Ambu; MFG# 000 281106; Moore # | o a5

65666




Ambu ; MFG# 000 281000; Moore #

AMBU BTM#260281 $3.75 co807 $5.2800
0SSUR MEDICAL PRODUCTS Ossur Americas,Ortho ; MFG# PHP-
BTM#261213 $4.65 PA: Moore# $4.4900
74571
MEDEGEN MEDICAL PRODUCTS 6205 MEDEGEN MEDICAL :MFG# 621100
BTM#290185 : 93265:Moore# 93265 :
COVIDIEN BTM#291522 $2.75 Covidien ;MFG# 1522SA; Moore # | o, ;7
53650
MEDEGEN MEDICAL PRODUCTS 65,89 MEDEGEN MEDICAL:MFG# 53,5600
BTM#290184 : 93264:Moore # 93264 :
COVIDIEN BTM#31144010EA $2.69 Covidien ; MFG;#S%EMMO; Moore #| ¢ 5900
MEDEGEN MEDICAL PRODUCTS 5115 MEDEGEN MEDICAL : MFGH# 510414
BTM#605487 ' 8702; Moore# 10318 '
Covidien ;MFG# 1525SA;
COVIDIEN BTM#1860-99019 $4.79 Mocre 7 99930 $4.6500
PULMODYNE BTM#313-7555XN- Pulmodyne: MFG# 313-
EA $39.76 7555XN:Moore# 29234 $46.9500
SALTER LABS, INC BTM#967- Welch Allyn;MFG# SOFT-12; Moore
ZCC4001L #9520 # 10635 $6.2275
SALTER LABS, INC BTM#967- Welch Allyn;MFG# SOFT-
ZCC1001L $4.30 111;Moorett 29787 $7.0900
SALTER LABS, INC BTM#967- 53.90 Welch Allyn;MFG# SOFT-10; Moore| ¢ o

ZCC4201L

# 29305




SALTER LABS, INC BTM#967-

Welch Allyn;MFG# SOFT-09; Moore

7CCA4401L $3.60 # 29304 $4.5900
HEALTHMARK INDUSTRIES CO Healthmark Industries; MFG# 6323
STAAHOMA6 $0.136 RED NUM: $0.1685
Moore# 75310
Healthmark Industries; MFG# 6323
HEALTHMQTRMK #2'22818 TRIES CO $0.136 WH PKG-10: $0.1490
Moorett 47802
Nellcor Puritan Bennett; MFG#
COVIDIEN BTM#530024 $9.66 EASYCAP Il 6:Moore $9.1400
#56338
Nellcor Puritan Bennett; MFG#
COVIDIEN BTM#530025 $9.66 PEDICAP 6: Moore # $9.1400
56339
CURAPLEX BTM #16383 $16.61 Covidien ;MF;#;ZE’E’OP; Moore# | 457 6100
CURAPLEX BTM #16384 $13.32 Covidien ;MFS:S%%OA; Moore# $26.70
COVIDIEN BTM#C832113 $0.0150 Covidien ;MF(Z"’;ZESZSZ‘E’W; Moore # | ¢4 3220
CONMED CORPORATION
S TNI931600 $0.0164 N/A N/A
MEDILINE INDUSTRIES INC Dukal :MFG# 4331:Moore
BTM#1071-32801 $0.79 # 16993 $0.7500
MEDILINE INDUSTRIES INC
BTM#1071-32804 +0:00 NIA N

HARTWELL MEDICAL 6141 HARTWELL MEDICAL:MFG# 513547

BTM#4162

BHIIOO;Moore# 31239




SURGICAL DESIGN INC BTM

American Diagnostic Corp.; MFG#

#0129 $4.05 316:Moore# 12971 +3.2800
Cypress Medical Products; MFG#
DUKAL CORP BTM #080602 $0.103 80872: Moore # $0.1075
80872
Cypress Medical Products; MFG#
DUKAL CORP BTM #080603 $0.129 80873: Moore 480873 $0.1433
Cypress Medical Products; MFG#
DUKAL CORP BTM #080604 $0.15 80874:Moore# $0.1792
80874
Cypress Medical Products; MFG#
DUKAL CORP BTM #080606 $0.285 80875:Moore# $0.2683
80875
COVIDIEN BTM#087705 $0.015 Covidien ; MFSjgflzog; Moore# | ¢5.0194
DUKAL CORP BTM #2544 $0.085 Dukal ;MFG# 6412;Moore $0.0856
# 74390
COVIDIEN BTM#087770 $0.027 Covidien ; MFSSZ‘;HO& Moore # | ¢4 0085
Covidien :MFG#
INTEGRITY MEDICAL DEVICES ’
S TM#1213.08331 $0.486 8884413605 Moore# $0.6000
32025
MED PLUS SERVICES USA 53,63 KIMBERLY CLARK ; MFG# 52,9600
BTM#1022-25679 25676:Moore # 14332
DIGITCARE CORPORATION Microflex:MFG# SU-690-M: Moore#
BTM#290102 %0094 67314 $0.0881
DIGITCARE CORPORATION 50,094 Microflex; MFG# SU-690-L; Moore# | ¢ o0

BTM#290103

67315




DIGITCARE CORPORATION

Microflex; MFG# SU-690-XL; Moore

BTM#290104 HOEE # 67316 SO
DIGITCARE CORPORATION
BTM#290105 $0.105 N/A N/A
DIGITCARE CORPORATION Microflex;MFG# SU-690-S; Moore#
BTM#291010 R 67313 $0.0881
ASCENSIA DIABETES CARE US
ASCEE.IS.:\':\ ;%I:E)BEE?OCARE $0.316 INC; MFG# 7099C: $0.2888
Moore # 80658
ASCENSIA DIABETES CARE ASCENSIA DIABETES CARE US
$0.00 INC; MFG# 7189:Moore $9.0800
BTM #2761-95563
# 35462
LIFE NUTRITION LLC BTM LIFE NUTRITION LLC;MFG#
#662248 $1.177 6739;Moore # 29310 $1.0733
Compliance Medical Mfg.,
DMS BTM#260401 $1.27 INC.:MFG# 401-S/401SE; $6.2400
Moore # 41612
DYNAREX CORPORATION $0.109 e ot Momes | s0.2080
BTM#1360-07546 ' ! '
72977
HOSPIRA WORLDWIDE INC Hospira ;MFG# 1195601; Moore #
BTM #351956 $1.75 79096 $1.6136
MEDICAL SUPPLY SOLUTIONS $1.88 Becton Qlcklnson : MFG# $2.1000
INC BTM#353241 381412;:Moore # 66407
MEDICAL SUPPLY SOLUTIONS $1.88 Becton [?lcklnson MFG# $2.1000
INC BTM#354221 381423;Moore # 59566
MEDICAL SUPPLY SOLUTIONS $1.88 Becton Dickinson ;:MFG# $2.1000

INC BTM#355181

381444:Moore# 66410




MEDICAL SUPPLY SOLUTIONS

Becton Dickinson ;:MFG#

INC BTM#355201 $1.88 381434;Moore # 66408 $2.1000
BECTON DICKINSON Becton Dickinson ; MFG#
BTM#355141 $2.44 381467;Moore # 66412 $2.2160
BECTON DICKINSON Becton Dickinson ;MFG#
BTM#355161 $2.44 381454; Moore# 66411 $2.2160
CONMED CORPORATION Con Med;MFG# 705-4431; Moore #
BTM#354431 $0.377 40685 $0.4540
B. BRAUN MEDICAL INC B.Braun :MFG# 352239; Moore #
BTM #1712-23935 $1.39 95398 $1.4400
NICE-PAK BTM #440128 $0.063 Dy”&rszr:\fgﬁzfso; $0.0326
DYNAREX CORPORATION Busse ; MFG# 389:Moore #
BTM#1652 $6.35 68222 $7.1200
B. BRAUN MEDICAL INC Hospira Worldwide,; MFG#
BTM #357500 PR 795309;Moore# 54308 UL
MEDI PURPOSE (SURGILANCE) MediPurpose ;MFG#
BTM #E6255 $0.137 SLN300;Moore # 68663 $0.1258
MEDI PURPOSE (SURGILANCE) MediPurpose ;MFG#
BTM #E6254 $0.137 SLN240; Moore # 68662 $0.1258
Rusch,Inc. | Teleflex
VENTLAB CORPORATION $0.55 Medical;:MFG# 1040; Moore $1.4000
BTM#2356-21002 450796
Rusch,Inc. | Teleflex
CURAPLEX BTM#87-2102 $0.92 Medical; MFG# 1060;Moore $0.9600
# 50799
Allied Healthcare Products
VENTLAB CORPORATION $0.36 INC;:MFG# 64083;Moore # $0.5584

BTM#87-2110EA

94815




VENTLAB CORPORATION

Drive Medical Design &

BTM#87-2110EA $0.36 MFG; MFG# DL1050;Moore $1.3400
# 99051
Rusch,Inc. | Teleflex
TELEFLEX MEDICAL $0.92 Medical; MFG# 396218; Moore # $1.5000
BTM#416218
50948
Med-Tech Resources Inc.; MFG#
CURAPLEX BTM #87-2202EA $0.68 MTR-25158;Moore# $0.7400
15049
Rusch,Inc. | Teleflex
VENTLAB CORPORATION $0.55 Medical; MFG# 1035;Moore $0.9900
BTM#87-2200
# 50795
MOLDEX-METRIC Moldex Metric,INC.:MFG#
BTM#1511 AU 1511;Moore# 63328 0805
MOLDEX-METRIC Moldex Metric,INC..MFG#
BTM#1512 A 1512; Moore # 77077 0805
MOLDEX-METRIC Moldex Metric,INC.;MFG#
BTM#1513 AU 1513;:Moore# 72161 0805
Rusch,Inc. | Teleflex
TELE.T_kAE#)le\{Ig;gCAL $0.81 Medical; MFG# 1883; Moore $0.8400
# 63464
Allied Healthcare Products
CURAPLEX BTM #30556 $1.16 INC;:MFG# 64095;Moore# $1.6400
49657
Covidien ; MFG#
CURAPLEX BTM #30557 $0.78 8881540111; Moore # $0.1580
79658
Exellnternational,Inc.; MFG# EXE
B. BRAUN MEDICAL, INC $0.025 26419;:Moore# $0.0474

BTM#1641-12018

79583




COVIDIEN BTM#47-

Covidien ;MFG#

8881305018BX $0.22 8881305018;Moore # $0.2005
79534
MORRISON MEDICAL $8.88 Busse Hospital Disposables; MFG# $7.1200
PRODUCTS BTM#56-0967 ' 389;Moore # 68222 '
AMERICAN DIAGNOSTIC CORP American Diagnostic Corp.; MFG#
BTM#66181 34850 2200;Moore# 25149 $30.0200
Cypress Medical Products; MFG#
CURAPLEX BTM#1431-16002 $0.26 79451;Moore# $0.3900
79451
CURAPLEX BTM#1431-16012 $0.34 NDEC.Inc;MPGH COL 30104; $0.9158
Moore # 89988
DYNAREX CORPORATION | g5 15 e oores | 01660
BTM#279-3503EA ' ’ '
13877
DUKAL CORPORATION Cypress Medical Products; MFG#
$0.09 13876;Moore# $0.0856
BTM#085590
13876
Precision Charts,Inc.;MFG#
CURAPLEX BTM#2745-10108 $1.30 9402-023 MMC;Moore # $2.1400
82831
American Diagnostic Corp.; MFG#
CURAPLEX BTM#32762 $0.64 351PMM; Moore# $0.6150
81238
COOK MEDICAL Cook;MFG# 449498;Moore
INCORPORATED BTM #62101 il # 16790 $143.1000
SPACELAB HEALTHCARE
BTM#1850-80419 $13.78 N/A A/
AMBU BTM#590276 $36.95 Ambu INC.; MPG# 276 000 $39.3800

001;Moore # 65667




Dick Medical Supply;MFG#

DMS BTM#501100 $3.42 501110MM:Moore # 58718 $3.3700
Med-Tech Resources Inc.; MFG#
CURAPLEX BTM #61511 $4.09 MTR-227:Moore# $5.4000
34996
Med-Tech Resources Inc.; MFG#
CURAPLEX BTM #61512 $1.53 MTR-227-1;Moore# $1.5400
35000
BAXTER HEALTHCARE - DMG $8.21 Baxter H.ealthcare; MFG# $9.1800
BTM#G4538 2C7564;Moore # 86722
CURAPLEX BTM#2811-68009 $0.74 Dukal; MF(js#gitoo; Moore# $1.8200
Seaberg Co.;MFG#
MEDSOURCE INTERNATIONAL i
BTM#533-MS-SPLINT $4.72 SP1121RMM;Moore# $6.8200
37155
MORRISON MEDICAL $1.46 Morrison Medical Products; MFG# $1.5300
PRODUCTS BTM#56-1530 ' 1530;Moore # 89958 '
PRODUCTS BTM#56-1540 ' ' '
15392
MORRISON MEDICAL $3.52 MOFFISOf\lg/l?e;lZC;' I\F;Ir;:ruecitis; vrer $3.8384
PRODUCTS BTM#56-1573 ' ’ '
15393
American Diagnostic Corp.; MFG#
CURAPLEX BTM#36020 $4.02 640BKMM;Moore# $6.2500
66245
American Diagnostic Corp.; MFG#
AMERICAN DIAGNOSTIC CORP $7.12 641BKMM:Moorett $6.2500
BTM#540220
66248
AMERICAN DIAGNOSTIC CORP $9.95 N/A N/A

BTM#066-646ST




Dick Medical Supply;MFG#

DMS BTM#50622ABBK $7.34 516520RM:Moore# 84515 $16.5900
Morrison Medical Products; MFG#
DMS BTM#1360XYL $9.27 1310XYL;Moore# $10.2400
83385
Dick Medical Supply;MFG#
DMS BTM#506022BK $7.19 11152MAM:Moore# 55900 $8.1700
Dick Medical Supply;MFG#
DMS BTM#60124 $1.80 471520RM: Mooret 82352 $1.7900
Dick Medical Supply; MFG#
DMS BTM#1394-OR $4.48 475520RM:Moore# 48333 $4.2100
Dick Medical Supply; MFG#
DMS BTM#B0139 $1.77 17152YLM:Moore# 77068 $6.5700
Dick Medical Supply;MFG#
DMS BTM#D062426 $5.91 576520RM:Moore # 84516 $14.5500
Dick Medical Supply;MFG#
DMS BTM#5036010 $6.21 111520RM: Moore# 73130 $8.0000
FERNO WASHINGTON Ferno Washington;MFG#
BTM#FER0819928 $35.23 0390201; Moore# 47667 $9.2375
EMERGENCY MEDICAL
PRODUCTS BTM#02100 $33.79 NIA N
Rusch,Inc. | Teleflex
TELEFLEX MEDICAL $3.05 Medical;MFG# IOOOR; Moore # $2.8700

BTM#020404

52294




TELEFLEX MEDICAL

Rusch, Inc. | Teleflex

$2.97 Medical;MFG# 750;Moore $2.6600
BTM#020404 50
BEMIS MANUFACTURING CO Bemis Healthcare; MFG#
BTM#592041 $2.76 424410;Moore # 66098 $2.5900
BEMIS MANUFACTURING CO Bemis Healthcare: MFG#
BTM#598041 $2.83 484410: Moore # 53554 $2.9700
Covidien ;MFG#
CONMET CORPORATION $1.02 8888301705:Moore# $1.0712
BTM#3243200
86895
B. BRAUN MEDICAL, INC $0.09 = |ntern2ag|206n5§|,|v||r:g;e¥ TOREXE $0.1278
BTM#1633-10010 : ’ :
79567
BTM#1633-30303 : : :
79561
AQUABILITI BTM#600-10 $0.34 B.Braun ; MFggigé%m; Moore# | 05100
DUKAL CORP BTM#080110 $0.693 Dukal ; M#Ff;gz"o;'v'oore $0.7167
DUKAL CORP BTM#080210 $1.387 Dukal ;MTBZES?O; Moore $1.4333
DUKAL CORP BTM#080310 $2.08 Dukal ;M;(gglgglo;Moore $2.1500
Dukal :MFG# HP81LL;
DUKAL CORP BTM#081110 $0.549 ore & 71550 $0.6008
Dukal :MFG# HP8112;
DUKAL CORP BTM#081210 $1.008 N eoroit 1570 $1.2017
MEDLINE INDUSTRIES INC Medical Indicators :MFG#
BTM#536-MMM51222 50.016 5122:Moore # 15444 50.1106
CURAPLEX BTM#1841-14000 $0.11 Dynarex ;MFG# 3139; Moore # $0.0886

32069




CURAPLEX BTM#136152

$0.45

Smiths Medical ;MFG#
100/101/030; Moore #
88162

$0.8500

CURAPLEX BTM#136153

$0.45

Smiths Medical :MFG#
100/101/035;Moorett
88163

$0.8500

CURAPLEX BTM#136154

$0.45

Smiths Medical ; MFG#
100/101/040;Moore#
88164

$0.8500

CURAPLEX BTM#136155

$0.45

Smiths Medical ;MFG#
100/101/045;Moore #
88165

$0.8500

CURAPLEX BTM#136156

$0.51

Smiths Medical ;MFG#
100/101/050;Moore#
88166

$0.8500

CURAPLEX BTM#136159

$0.59

Smiths Medical ;MFG#
100/100/055;Mooret
88135

$0.9700

CURAPLEX BTM#136157

$0.51

Smiths Medical ; MFG#
100/101/055;Moore#
88167

$0.8500

CURAPLEX BTM#136187

$0.59

Smiths Medical ; MFG#
100/100/050;Moore #
88134

$0.9700

CURAPLEX BTM#136160

$0.59

Smiths Medical :MFG#
100/100/060;Moore #
88136

$0.9700

CURAPLEX BTM#136161

$0.59

Smiths Medical ; MFG#
100/100/065;Moore#
88140

$0.9700

CURAPLEX BTM#136162

$0.59

Smiths Medical ; MFG#
100/100/070;Moore#
88137

$0.9700




Smiths Medical ;MFG#

CURAPLEX BTM#136163 $0.59 100/100/075;Moore # $0.9700
88138
Smiths Medical :MFG#
CURAPLEX BTM#136164 $0.59 100/100/080;Moore# $0.9700
88139
Smiths Medical ;MFG#
CURAPLEX BTM#136165 $0.67 100/100/085;Moore# $0.9700
88141
Smiths Medical ;MFG#
CURAPLEX BTM#136166 $0.59 100/100/090; Moore# $0.9700
88142
Rusch,Inc. | Teleflex Medical; MFG#
CURAPLEX BTM#36151 $0.45 100382025: Mooret 47683 $1.4900
LAREDAL MEDICAL CORP Laerdal Medical ;MFG# 600
BTM#020400 $2.12 20000;Moore # 54288 ST
LAREDAL MEDICAL CORP Laerdal Medical ;MFG# 600
BTM#020500 $2.12 10000;Moore# 54246 $2.6700
Ambu INC.; MFG# 000172
AMBU BTM#065-000172002EA $1.99 002:Moore # 54521 $2.5600
Allied Healthcare Products
CURAPLEX BTM#87-3007EA $0.23 INC; MFG# 64230;Moore# $0.2900
49663
B. BRAUN MEDICAL B.Braun ; MFG# R5001-01;
BTM#355001 ks Moore # 69383 +0:0056
Med-Tech Resources Inc.; MFG#
EMI BTM#400022 $4.95 MTR-WINBR;Moore $3.8600
# 33545
Professional Disposables Inti |
NICE-PAK BTM #Q20372 $0.039 NicePak; MFG# P13472; Moore # $0.0345

75248




ALLIED HEALTHCARE

Cramer Decker Medical, Inc.;MFG#

$1.58 MCW-2B;Moore $1.9000
PRODUCTS BTM#020642 # 20466
Cramer Decker Medical, Inc.;MFG#
MES INS BTM#553-1601 $0.57 MCW-010-B; $0.5700
Moore # 77734
Amsino International, INC.; MFG#
CURAPLEX BTM#16107 $0.33 AS835;:Moore# $0.4700
82309
CALOLYMPIC SAFETY MCR Safety/ Crews,INC.; MFG#
BTM#20269 $1.18 9800;Moore# 62167 #1100
Ambu INC.:MFG#
AMBU BTM#2144-KV031 $32.95 KVLABKIT3:Moore # 36531 $2,312.5000
B. BRAUN MEDICAL INC B.Braun ;:MFG# E8000;
BTM#7800-09 $2.39 Moore# 31061 $0.0052
BAXTER HEALTHCARE - DMG Baxter Healthcare;MFG#
BTM#607114 $2.48 2F7114;Moore# 13935 $0.0050
DAROC INTERNATIONAL INC Dukal ;MFG# 15335;Moore
BTM5607 $21.29 4 15335 $27.6600
DAROC INTERNATIONAL INC Dukal:MFG# MM37159;
BTM5600 $104.46 Moore # 37159 $95.4500
DAROC INTERNATIONAL INC Dukal ; MFG# 74205; Moore
BTM5601 $15.77 474205 $12.2000
DAROC INTERNATIONAL INC Dukal ;MFG# 15337; Moore
BTM5603 $18.08 4 15337 $18.6000
DAROC INTERNATIONAL INC Dukal ;MFG# 15338; Moore
BTM5604 $13.96 4 15338 $17.0900
DAROC INTERNATIONAL INC
BTM5606 $18.58 N/A N/A
COVIDIEN BTM#174620 $7.98 Physio Control; MFG# 11996 $8.6500

000166; Moore# 10512




Physio Control; MFG# 11996

COVIDIEN BTM#177266 $9.38 000120 (007266);Moore# $9.5100
10514
Physio Control; MFG# 11996
COVIDIEN BTM#177268 $8.88 000167 (009822);Moore# $9.3100
10513
Physio Control; MFG# 11996
COVIDIEN BTM#177669 $10.23 000128:Moore # 10661 $12.8200
Repro-Med Systems | RMS;
CURAPLEX BTM#10369 $21.08 MFG# P1F1S110NE;Moore $52.0000
#84904
Cramer Decker ;MFG#
CURAPLEX BTM#14288 $41.84 EMSREG8725-B2D;Moore # $72.6700
95188
MEDSOURCE ;MFG# MS-
CURAPLEX BTM#36010 $4.50 BP400:Moore # 17806 $7.1000
MEDSOURCE ;MFG# MS-
CURAPLEX BTM#36011 $4.50 BP300:Moore# 17805 $7.1000
MEDSOURCE ; MFG# MS-
CURAPLEX BTM#36012 $4.62 BP100:Moore # 17801 $6.8200
MEDSOURCE ; MFG# MS-
CURAPLEX BTM#36013 $5.65 BP200:Moore # 17802 $7.1000
CARDIO PARTNERS, INC Physio Control;MFG# 11141
BTM#0660-6019 Sles 000158;Mooret# 89810 $290.3400
Baumrucker Co;MFG#
FLEXPAK, INC BTM#080891 $5.83 DTC00941048;Moore # $5.9000
10362
Graham Medical Products; MFG#
CURAPLEX BTM#324-12345 $15.29 72657;Moore# $27.1000

34110




Physio Control;MFG# 11996

MASIMO BTM#661433 $161.00 000323: Mooret 11289 $163.8600
MEDLINE INDUSTRIES INC Medline ;MFG# DYND70836;Moore#
BTM#2744-70837 $0.23 78589 $0.4800
NICE-PAK BTM#607120 $0.037 Dynarex ;MFG# 1501; Moore # 96646 $0.0343
PHILLIPS MEDICAL SYSTEMS Philips Medical ;MFG#
HSB - BTM#139261 $104.87 M5070A;Moore # 90871 e
Philips Medical ;MFG#
PHYSIO-CONTROL INC N
BTM#4510-04676 $34.71 989803139261;Moore # $31.8200
90872
PHYSIO-CONTROL INC Physio Control; MFG# 11576
BTM#4510-04677 $40.333 000046;Moore# 14317 e
PHYSIO-CONTROL INC MASIMO; MFG# 2510; Moore #
BTM#2712-34096 $57.829 21539 Lo
PHYSIO-CONTROL INC MASIMO;MFG# 2501; Moore #
BTM#2712-04671 $252.17 21497 ALY
PHYSIO-CONTROL INC MASIMO; MFG# 2406; Moore#
BTM#2712-03711 $220.00 21511 e
PHYSIO-CONTROL INC MASIMO; MFG# 1860;
BTM#2712-02020 31437 Moore # 25677 $13.8070
Ambu;MFG#
PROPAK MANUFACTURING ’ _
BTM#2523-13512 $32.94 KVIS01ADCASE;Moore # $56.8200
36535
Physio Control; MFG# 11141
R&D BATTERIES BTM#14990 $120.99 000158: Moore # 89810 $290.3400
Rusch,Inc. | Teleflex
TELEFLEX MEDICAL $7.25 Medical;MFG# MAD300; Moore # $5.9400

BTM#400124

74042




TELEFLEX MEDICAL

Rusch,Inc. | Teleflex

$9.97 Medical;MFG# MAD100; $6.7648
BTM#660754 Moore # 74016
VENTALB CORPORATION Med-Tech Resources;MFG# MTR-
BTM#14645 $0.27 24002;Moore # 15046 $0.3000
BAXTER HEALTHCARE DMG $2.35 Baxter Healthcare;MFG# $2.3200
BTM#118-EMS3110EA ' EMS3110;Moore# 81839 '
BAXTER HEALTHCARE DMG Baxter Healthcare;MFG#
BTM#601324X e 2B1324X;Moore # 77886 O
STATPACKS, INC BTM#2523- StatPacks ;MFG# G31000GN;Moore#
03107 $78.13 97138 $75.0000
STATPACKS, INC BTM#2524- StatPacks ;MFG# G31003RE;Moore#
03108 $78.13 97140 $75.0000
STATPACKS, INC BTM#2521- StatPacks ;MFG# G35002RE;Moore #
00219 $160.00 97124 $150.0000
STATPACKS, INC BTM#2524- StatPacks ;MFG# G31001BU;Moore#
03402 $62.49 97503 $60.0000
STATPACKS, INC BTM#2530- StatPacks ;MFG# G31002BK;Moore#
03122 $62.49 97141 $60.0000
Percentage (%) discount for other Percentage (%) discount for other
medical supplies not specifically 28% - VENDOR | [medical supplies not specifically listed
listed in this IFB but may be needed. | LETTER WITH | |in this IFB but may be needed. LEFT BLANK
Percentage (%) off catalog or online [ EXCLUSIONS* | |Percentage (%) off catalog or online
pricing. pricing.
Vendor will accept Credit Card VES Vendor will accept Credit Card VES
Payment? Payment?
Vendor will accept invoice payment VES Vendor will accept invoice payment VES
(net/30)? (net/30)?
2-3 DAYS ARO 9.3 DAYS
Vendor 's order processing / delivery | FOR IN STOCK | [Vendor 's order processing / delivery
: : ARO
time? ITEMS time?
Vendor's delivery fee? NO CHARGE Vendor's delivery fee? NONE




*Manufacturers Excluded from discount - Ferno
Washington, Laerdal, Simulaids, Cardio Partners,
Thermal Angel, KingFisher Medical, Z-Medica
(QuikClot) and Sscor. Product Cateegories Excluded
from discount - Custom Kits, Preventative Maintenance,
Service Contracts, Capital Equipment, King Vision,
Rescue Buddies, Inventory and Secure Storage Systems
and Supraglottic Airways & Kits.

Submitted exceptions to the insurance requirement.

13 NO BID ITEMS

COMBINED TOTAL

$5,201.8424

AVERAGE COST PER ITEM

$23.33

Stated prices could increase during initial contract
period. If County does not agree, Bidder will submit an
alternate product.

ZERO NO BID ITEMS

COMBINED TOTAL $2,853.63

AVERAGE COST PER ITEM $12.09

Bound Tree Medical has lowest combined pricing for

items #66 & 67




HENRY SCHEIN EMS

MEDCO SUPPLIES

MANUFACTURER/PRODUCT
NUMBER

UNIT PRICE
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NUMBER
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Percentage (%) discount for other
medical supplies not specifically listed
in this IFB but may be needed.
Percentage (%) off catalog or online

Percentage (%) discount for other
medical supplies not specifically
listed in this IFB but may be needed.
Percentage (%) off catalog or online

pricing. pricing.
Vendor will accept Credit Card Vendor will accept Credit Card
Payment? Payment?

Vendor will accept invoice payment
(net/30)?

Vendor will accept invoice payment
(net/30)?

Vendor 's order processing / delivery
time?

Vendor 's order processing / delivery
time?

Vendor's delivery fee?

Vendor's delivery fee?




DID NOT SUBMIT RESPONSE ON THE AMENDED PRICE
PROPOSAL FORM - DID NOT ACKNOWLEDGE ADDENDA #2
RELEASED ON 1/23/2018.

DID NOT SUBMIT RESPONSE ON THE AMENDED PRICE
PROPOSAL FORM -ACKNOWLEDGED ADDENDA AS NONE
BUT, THERE WERE TWO RELEASED. FIRST ON 1/16/2018

AND THE SECOND ON 1/23/2018. THE SECOND CONTAINS
A NEW PRICE PROPOSAL FORM.




