
Porterville Unified School District Bid Solicitation 2020-2021 Solicitation is for Commercial Pricing Only

FROZEN FOOD 1

Frozen Bid #SN-22-02
Vendor Name: Edna's Bakery Vendor Name: GOLD STAR FOODS Sysco

Description

*Estimated 
Usage Grain M/MA Bulk IW Acceptable Brands Brand Pack Size Price Per Serving Case Price Brand Pack Size Price Per Serving Case Price Pack Size Price Per Serving Case Price

1
BAGEL, BREAKFAST SAUSAGE

100 1 1 X
Ardella's, Schwan's, 

Beacon Street NO BID TONY ROBERTS 96/2.75OZ $0.49 $47.20 72 / 2.65OZ $0.73 53.24whole grain, beef or turkey sausage 

2
BAGEL, STRAWBERRY AND CREAM CHEESE

100 2 X Pillsbury 
NO BID PILLSBURY 72/2.43OZ $0.44 $31.68 72 / 2.43OZ $0.43 31.15whole grain, 2.43oz, heat and serve

3
BAGEL, PLAIN

25 2 X
NO BID TONY ROBERTS 72/3OZ $0.35 $25.32 12 / 6CT $0 20.04whole grain, 3", sliced

4
BAR, Apple, Breakfast

100 2 X Dave's 
NO BID DAVES 64/3OZ $0.50 $31.88 64 / 3 OZ $0.52 33.47whole grain, 3oz, half cup fruit equivalent

5
BAR, HONEY WHEAT

100 2 X Sky Blue 
NO BID SKY BLUE FOODS 72/2.8OZ $0.41 $29.65 72 / 2.5 OZ $0.41 302.8oz, whole grain

6
BAR, BENEFIT, CHOCOLATE CHIP

1500 2  X  
NO BID J & J SNACK FOODS 48/2.5OZ $0.38 $18.02 48 / 2.5 OZ $0.38 18.58 

7
BEEF, ALL AMERICAN BURGER

100 2 2 X Integrated
NO BID INTEGRATED 50/4.25OZ $0.87 $43.48 75 / 4.25 OZ $0.87 65.65     whole grain, beef patty

8
BEEF, CHEESEBURGER, MINI TWINS

1000 2 2 X
NO BID ADVANCE PIERRE 80/5.5OZ $1.04 $83.29 72 / 6.54OZ $0.71 51.7whole grain, beef patty

9
BEEF, PATTY

100 2 X
Don Lee, Integrated, 
JTM, Advance Pierre NO BID ADVANCE PIERRE 90/2.50OZ $0.47 $41.93 192 / 2.6 OZ $0.50 96.47low sodium >280mg

10
BEEF, RIB B QUE

100 2 X
JTM, Integrated, 
Advance Pierre NO BID ADVANCE PIERRE 100/3.25OZ $0.56 $56.04 100 / 3.25OZ $0.56 56.98Patty w/sauce

11
BEEF, RIB B QUE W/BUN

1000 2 2 X Integrated 
NO BID INTEGRATED 75/4.36OZ $1.02 $76.67 75/ 4.36 $0.72 54.614.71 oz, w/sauce, WG bun

12
BERRY, PULL APART

1000 2 x
NO BID NO BID 32 / 7.64 OZ NO BID heat and serve

13 BITES, BREAKFAST, CHICKEN SAUSAGE 25  2 X   
NO BID RICH CHICKS 4/5 LB  $96.23 4 / 7.5lb $0.42 68.73turkey or chicken sausage

14
BITES, NACHO, BITES

25 2 2 X  The Fathers Table
NO BID FATHERS TABLE 8/2.25LB $0.66 $47.31 8 / 72 CT $0.63 45.85whole grain corn flour, gluten free

15
BISCUIT & SAUSAGE

100 1 1 X
NO BID ADVANCE PIERRE 100/3.1 OZ $0.68 $67.53 100 / 3.1 OZ NO BIDturkey or beef sausage, whole grain Hawaiian roll

16
BREAD,  CORN MUFFIN

25 2 2  X Muffin Town
NO BID MUFFIN TOWN 72/2OZ $0.25 $17.67 72 / 2OZ $0.23 16.982oz, whole grain

17
BREAD,  CINNAMON ROLL

1000 2   X  Ednas, Shannons
Edna's 60 $0.49 $29.55 BAKE CRAFTERS 72/2.8OZ $0.44 $32.00 60 / 3 OZ $0.54 32.62oz, whole grain

18
BREAD,  GARLIC CHEESE

25 2 2 X Schwans
NO BID TONY'S 60/4.3OZ $0.76 $45.75 60 / 4.29OZ $0.72 43.712oz, whole grain

19
BREAD, HOAGIE ROLL

25 2 X
Edna's 6 $0.40 $2.35 GOLD STAR FOODS 120/2OZ $0.14 $16.84 108 / 2.5 OZ $0.34 37.57whole grain

20
BREAD, HONEY WHEAT

10 Max's
NO BID WHEAT MONTANA 12/27OZ $0.24 $29.31 6 / 30 OZ $0.27 23.27w/oats. Artisan, sliced

21
BREAD, DINNER ROLL 

10 1 X
Edna's 120 $0.17 $20.85 GOLD STAR FOODS 144/1 OZ $0.19 $27.29 6 / 30 OZ $0.13 23whole grain 

22
BREAD, DINNER ROLL

10 2 X
Edna's 24 $0.18 $4.20 GOLD STAR FOODS 144/2OZ $0.17 $23.91 8 / 24CT $0.14 27.62whole grain, 2oz

23
BREAD, HAMBURGER, BUN

100 2 X  
Edna's 12 $0.23 $2.80 GOLD STAR FOODS 144CT $0.20 $28.11 192 / 1 OZ $0.14 27.47WHOLE GRAIN

24
BREAD, TELERA ROLL

10 2 X Shannons
NO BID SHANNONS 144/2OZ $0.29 $41.23 12 / 12 CT $0.30 43.57whole grain, 12 EA Bag

25
BREADSTICK 

10 2 X
NO BID RICHS 240/1OZ $0.16 $38.70 180 / 1 OZ $0.18 33.79whole grain

26
BREADSTICK, CHEESE STUFFED

25 1 1 X Bosco 
NO BID BOSCOS 108CT $0.45 $48.45 108 / 7" $0.44 47.932.86oz, whole grain, NO substitutions

27
BREADSTICK, CHEESE STUFFED

1000 2 2  X The Max, Max Stick 
NO BID THE MAX 84/3.86OZ $0.88 $73.60 84 / 3.86OZ $0.85 72.143.86oz, whole grain, NO substitutions

28
BURRITO, BEAN & CHEESE 

1000 2 2 X
NO BID MCI FOODS/LOS CABOS 96/5.20 OZ $0.64 $61.60 48 / 5.85OZ $0.75 36.16whole grain

29
BURRITO, BEAN & CHEESE 

1000 2 2 X
NO BID MCI FOODS/LOS CABOS 48/5.20 OZ $0.62 $29.62 60 / 6.1 OZ $0.77 46.63whole grain

30
CHEESE, QUESADILLA, BREAKFAST

1000 1 2  X  
NO BID FOSTER FARMS 144/2.4OZ $0.41 $59.34 100 / 1.98OZ $0.58 58.66 

31
CHEESE, QUESADILLA, GREEN SAUCE

1000 2 2  X  
NO BID MCI FOODS/LOS CABOS 60/2.2OZ $0.56 $33.58 80 / 5.98OZ $0.95 76.55low sodium

32
CHEESE, CUPS

1000 2 X
NO BID TABATCHNICK 96/3.65OZ $0.72 $69.03 140 / 3 OZ $0.50 70.014oz, low sodium

33
CHEESE, PULL APART

1000 2 2 X
NO BID PILLSBURY 72/3.88OZ $0.74 $53.17 72 / 3.88OZ $0.73 53.03whole grain

34
CHICKEN, DRUMSTICK, BREADED

1000 2 X Tyson
NO BID TYSON 92/4.4OZ $0.89 $81.96 1 / 30 LB $0.94 86.97light or dark meat

35
CHICKEN, MANDARIN ORANGE

25 2 X Yang's
NO BID YANGS 1/43.5LB $0.63 $120.12 6 / 5 LB $0.63 121.29low sodium, with sauce

36
CHICKEN, PATTIES, BREADED, CRISPY

100 2 X
Tyson, Gold Kist, 

John Soule's NO BID JOHN SOULES FOODS 53/3OZ $0.34 $18.04 4 / BAGS $0.36 54.74
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36
white meat, whole grain breading

100 2 X
Tyson, Gold Kist, 

John Soule's NO BID JOHN SOULES FOODS 53/3OZ $0.34 $18.04 4 / BAGS $0.36 54.74

37
CHICKEN, PATTIES, SPICY, BREADED, CRISPY

100 2 X
Tyson, Gold Kist, 

John Soule's NO BID JOHN SOULES FOODS 4/5LB $0.33 $34.98 4 / BAGS $0.36 53.82white meat, whole grain breading

38
CHICKEN, MEATBALLS

25  2 X   
NO BID TYSON 2/5LB $0.45 $25.88 2 / 5# $0.44 25.33

39
CHICKEN, NUGGETS

100 2 2  X Integrated
NO BID TYSON 32.81LB $0.30 $55.93 4 / 27#BAGS $0.34 47.47white meat, whole grain breading

40
CHICKEN, TENDERS, CRISPY

100 2 2 X
NO BID TYSON 4/7.965 LB $0.35 $52.59 431 / 1.13OZ $0.39 56.75whole grain breading

41
CHICKEN, SANDWICH, MAPLE

100 2 2  X  
NO BID BAKE CRAFTERS 168/2.5OZ $0.68 $114.51 144 / 2.79OZ $0.52 75.53whole grain bun

42
CHICKEN, SLIDERS

100 2 2  X Integrated
NO BID INTEGRATED 75/5OZ $1.05 $78.93 75 / 4.25OZ NO BIDwhole grain bun

43
CHICKEN, TENDERS, Spicy, CRISPY

100 2 X Tyson, John Soule's
NO BID TYSON 31.86LB $0.37 $54.98 4 / BAGS 101.4whole grain breading

44
CHICKEN, SWEET CHILI THAI

25  2 X  Yangs
NO BID YANGS 1/43.5LB $0.69 $131.70 6 / 5 LB $0.70 134.31low sodium, peanut free, with sauce

45
CHICKEN, TERIYAKI AND BROWN RICE

1000 1.5 2  X Yangs 
NO BID YANGS 36/9OZ $1.65 $59.31 36 / 9OZ $1.64 59.19whole grain rice, low sodium sauce

46
CHIMICHANGA, BEEF

25 X Posada 
NO BID POSADA 24/5OZ $0.93 $22.29 80 / 5.16OZ $0.91 71.245oz, Smart Snack Compliant

47
CHIMICHANGA, MINI, BEAN AND CHEESE

25 X El Monterey 
NO BID BELL TASTY 60/4.5 OZ $0.59 $35.38 8 / 8 CT $0.36 23.594oz, whole grain, 8 pack, Smart Snack Compliant

48
CINNAMON, APPLE NADA, TASTY NADA

1000 2 X Bell Tasty Nada
NO BID BELL TASTY 60/4OZ $0.66 $39.51 60 / 4 OZ $0.66 39.74   4oz, whole grain

49
CINNAMON, CRUMB CAKE

1000 2 X
NO BID SKY BLUE FOODS 72/3OZ $0.37 $26.87 72 / 3.4 OZ $0.49 35.42 3 oz whole grain

50
CINNAMON ROLL, BREAKFAST SQUARE

100 2 X Shannons
NO BID MFG DISC 72 / 3 OZ NO BID3oz, whole grain

51
CINNAMON ROLL, APPLE CINNAMON, BEAR PAW

100 2 X Shannons
NO BID SHANNONS 72/3OZ $0.54 $39.02 72 / 3 OZ $0.55 39.623oz, whole grain

52
CORN DOG, CHICKEN

500 2 2 X
NO BID FOSTER FARMS 72/4OZ $0.42 $29.97 72 / 4 OZ $0.42 30.5whole grain breading

53
CORN DOG, CHICKEN, MINI

500 2 2 X  
NO BID FOSTER FARMS 2/5LB $0.58 $23.25 2 / 5LB $0.37 22.31whole grain breading

54
DELI MEAT, HONEY HAM, BUFFET

5 Farmland
NO BID NO BID 2 / 9-11# 4.1420 pound case

55
DELI MEAT, TURKEY BOLOGNA

10
NO BID JENNIE O 12/1LB $0.31 $29.48 2 / 10#AVG $0.18 26.6

56
DELI MEAT, TURKEY BREAST, SMOKED

10 Butterball
NO BID JENNIE O 12/1LB $0.42 $40.70 2 / 7-9 # $0.59 66.26

57
DELI MEAT, TURKEY, HAM

10
NO BID JENNIE O 4/5.25LB $0.63 $69.17 12 / 1LB $1.07 67.6

58
DELI MEAT, TURKEY, HAM, SLICED, EXTRA LEAN

10
NO BID JENNIE O 12/1LB $0.44 $42.53 12 / 1 LB $1.08 67.69

59
DELI MEAT, TURKEY, BREAST, SLICED

10
NO BID JENNIE O 12/1.5LB $0.67 $64.77 12 / 1 LB $0.62 39.41

60
DOUGH, COOKIE, CHOCOLATE CHIP

10
Edna's 1.5oz puck 252 $0.26 $66.00 BUENA VISTA 216/1.5OZ $0.18 $38.92 240 / 1.33OZ $0.29 70.511.5 oz. puck

61
DOUGH, COOKIE, MACADAMIAN 

10
NO BID OTIS SPUNKMEYER 240/1.33OZ $0.39 $93.17 210 / 1.5 OZ $0.30 61.991.5 oz. puck

62
DOUGH, COOKIE, OATMEAL CRANBERRY

10
NO BID NO BID 240 / 1.33OZ $0.27 65.041.5 oz. puck

63 DOUGH, COOKIE, OATMEL RAISIN 10
NO BID OTIS SPUNKMEYER 240/1.5OZ $0.25 $59.02 240 / 1.33oz $0.29 70.511.5 oz. puck

64
DOUGH, COOKIE, SUGAR

10
NO BID OTIS SPUNKMEYER 240/1.5OZ $0.25 $59.02 240 / 1.33OZ $0.29 70.511.5 oz. puck

65
DOUGH, COOKIE, SB-12

10
NO BID BUENA VISTA 216/1.5OZ $0.18 $38.92 No Bid1.5 oz. puck

66
EGGS, SCRAMBLED, BOIL IN BAG 

10     
NO BID SUNNY FRESH 4/5LB $0.16 $51.28 6 / 5LB 54.22 

67
ENCHILADAS, CHEESE, RED SAUCE

1000 2 2 X
NO BID MCI FOODS LOS CABOS 36/7.65OZ $1.77 $63.73 1 / 120CT $0.39 46.95whole grain

68
ENCHILADAS, CHEESE

25 2 2 X  
NO BID FERNANDOS 112/2.35OZ $0.35 $39.02 1 / 120CT $0.39 46.95whole grain

69
FRENCH TOAST, STICKS

1000 2 X
NO BID BAKE CRAFTERS 88/3OZ $0.53 $46.65 88 / 3OZ $0.57 50.06whole grain

70
FRUDEL, APPLE, STICK

500 2 X Pillsbury 
NO BID PILLSBURY 72/2.29OZ $0.43 $31.18 72 / 2.29OZ $0.43 31.152.29oz, whole grain

71
FRUDEL, CHERRY, STICK

500 2 X Pillsbury 
NO BID PILLSBURY 72/2.29OZ $0.43 $31.18 72 / 2.29OZ $0.43 31.152.29oz, whole grain

72
FRUIT, STRAWBERRIES, CUPS

10 X  
NO BID WAWONA 96/4.5OZ $0.63 $60.09 96 / 4.5 OZ $0.65 62.494oz, 1/2 cup fruit equivalent, 100% fruit
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73
FRUIT, MIXED BERRY, CUPS

10 X
NO BID WAWONA 96/4OZ $0.56 $54.03 96 / 4 OZ $0.58 55.934oz, 1/2 cup fruit equivalent, 100% fruit

74
JUICE, SORBET, CUPS

10 X
NO BID J & J SNACK FOODS 96/4.4OZ $0.31 $29.52 96 / 4.4 OZ $0.28 27.161/2 cup fruit equivalent, 100% fruit

75
JUICE, PEACH, CUPS

10 X
NO BID WAWONA 96/4.4OZ $0.55 $52.47 96 / 4.4 OZ $0.56 54.171/2 cup fruit equivalent, 100% fruit

76
MUFFIN, BANANA

1000 2 X
NO BID DAVES 60/3.15OZ $0.43 $25.86 60 / 3.15OZ $0.43 25.693oz,  whole grain

77
MUFFIN, DOUBLE CHOCOLATE

1000 2 X Dave's 
NO BID DAVES 60/3.15OZ $0.43 $25.86 60 / 3.15OZ $0.45 27.143.1oz, whole grain

78
PANCAKE, BOWL

1000 2 x
NO BID BUENA VISTA 72/3.8OZ $0.68 $48.94 / NO BID3.8 oz, whole grain

79
PANCAKE, MINI PANCAKES

100 2 X De Wafflebakkers 
NO BID DEWAFELBAKKER 72/3OZ $0.40 $28.55 72 / 3.17OZ $0.39 28.063oz, whole grain

80
PANCAKE, SANDWICH, BEEF SAUSAGE

100 1.25 1 X Integrated 
NO BID INTEGRATED 42CT $1.59 $66.77 100 / 2.61OZ $0.57 57.26whole grain, 2.6OZ

81
PANCAKE, SAUSAGE ON A STICK

1000 1 1 X
NO BID DON LEE FARMS 72/2.83OZ $0.40 $28.66 48 / 2.5OZ $0.32 15.32turkey or chicken,whole grain

82
PANCAKE, WRAPS, MINI MAPLE, TURKEY

1000 1 1 X Foster Farms
NO BID FOSTER FARMS 2/5LB $0.40 $24.26 2 / 5 LB $0.38 22.95    2.55oz, whole grain

83
PASTA, PENNE, PRE COOKED, THAW AND HEAT

500 2  X  
NO BID MARZETTI COMPANY 4/3LB $0.45 $17.06 1 / 20 LB $0.50 29.43fully cooked noodles, thaw and heat

84
PASTA, ROTINI, WITH ALFREDO SAUCE

500 2 2 JTM
NO BID JTM (WRONG ITEM) 6/5LB $0.68 $54.15 30 / 8 OZ $1.09 32.68oz, heat and serve, black tray, whole grain

85
PASTA, ROTTONI, WITH MEAT SAUCE

1000 2 X JTM  
NO BID JTM (WRONG ITEM) 6/5LB $0.85 $68.08 40 / 8 OZ $0.81 32.268oz, heat and serve, black tray, whole grain

86
PASTA, SPAGHETTI, WITH MEAT SAUCE

1000 2 X JTM
NO BID JTM 30/8OZ $1.49 $44.82 6 / 5LB 62.138oz, heat and serve, black tray, whole grain

87
PASTA, MACARONI AND CHEESE

25 1 2 X  Land O Lakes 
NO BID LAND O LAKES 6/5LB $0.71 $56.93 48 / 10.1OZ NO BIDwhole grain, low sodium, boil in a bag

88
PASTA, CHEESEBURGER, MACARONI AND CHEESE

25 1 2  X  
NO BID JTM 6/5LB $0.93 $74.33 60 / 4.5 OZ $0.71 42.48whole grain

89
PIZZA, BELL TASTY NADA

100 2 2 X Bell Tasty Nada
NO BID BELL TASTY 60/4OZ $0.63 $37.54 1 / 128 CT $0.35 44.88whole grain, turkey and cheese

90
PIZZA, BREAKFAST, TURKEY SAUSAGE 

25 1 1 X Tony's 
NO BID TONY'S 128/3.31OZ $0.35 $44.17 1 / 128 CT $0.35 44.88whole grain, pre sliced

91
PIZZA, CHEESE

1000 2 2 X Tony's 
NO BID TONY'S 96/4.5OZ $0.48 $45.86 96 / 4.5 OZ $0.48 46.224.5oz, whole grain, low sodium

92
PIZZA, CALZONE, PRETZEL, NACHO

25 2 2  X  
NO BID NO BID / NO BID4.69oz, whole grain, low sodium

93
PIZZA, ROUND, CHEESE, 6"

25 2 2 X Gilardi 
NO BID GILARDI 60/4.69 OZ $0.88 $52.93 60 / 4.9 OZ $0.87 51.914.69oz, whole grain, low sodium

94
PIZZA, PINWHEEL, CHEESE

25 2 2 X  
NO BID EASTSIDE ENTREES 96/4.1OZ $0.78 $75.12 96 / 4.1 OZ $0.74 71.14.69oz, whole grain, low sodium

95
PIZZA, TURKEY PEPPERONI

1000 2 2  X Tony's 
NO BID TONY'S 60/4.8OZ $0.90 $53.72 1 / 60 CT $0.54 50.554.69oz, whole grain, low sodium

96
PIZZA, TURKEY PEPPERONI

25 2 2 X Tony's 
NO BID TONY'S 60/4.88OZ $0.84 $50.42 1 / 96 CT $0.49 46.935", whole grain, low sodium

97
PIZZA, 16" ROUND, PEPPERONI

25 2 2 X Big Daddy's 
NO BID BIG DADDY'S 72/5.18OZ $1.02 $73.30 3 / 3 PK $0.96 69.175.18oz, whole grain, turkey pepperoni

98
PIZZA, SANDWICH, PEPPERONI

25 2 2 X Tony's 
NO BID BEACON STREET 48/4.46OZ $0.88 $42.03 / 36.354.46oz, whole grain, turkey pepperoni

99
POTATO, ROUNDS, (tater tots)

25 2 X
NO BID MCCAIN FOODS INC 6/5LB $0.15 $28.96 6 / 5 LB $0.21 34.22low sodium, >200mg

100
POTATO, FRIES, SPICY, SEASONED

25 2 X McCain 
NO BID MCCAIN FOODS INC 6/4LB $0.12 $22.69 6 / 5 LB $0.18 29.26low sodium, >200mg

101
SANDWICH, GRILLED CHEESE, THREE CHEESE

1000 2 2 X  
NO BID INTEGRATED 72/4.19OZ $0.77 $55.13 72 / 4.19OZ $0.77 55.4whole grain

102
SANDWICH, PEANUT BUTTER W/JELLY

100 1 1 X
Smuckers, 

Advanced Pierre NO BID SMUCKERS 72/2.6OZ $0.55 $39.46 72 / 2.6OZ $0.55 40.69whole grain, strawberry, thaw & serve

103
SANDWICH, PEANUT BUTTER W/JELLY

100 1 1 X
Smuckers, 

Advanced Pierre NO BID SMUCKERS 72/2.6 OZ $0.52 $37.79 72 / 2.6OZ $0.54 39.03whole grain, grape, thaw & serve

104
SANDWICH, SOYBUTTER W/JELLY

100 1 1 X Albies 
NO BID ALBIES FOODS 72/2.4OZ $0.68 $49.00 72 / 2.4 OZ $0.65 46.91whole grain, 2.4oz, thaw & serve

105
SANDWICH, CROISSANT, BEEF AND CHEESE

100 2 2 X  
NO BID TASTY BRANDS 72/4.6OZ $1.07 $77.24 107 / 3 OZ NO BIDwhole grain, IW

106
SANDWICH, ITALIAN

100 2 2 X Tasty Brand
NO BID TASTY BRANDS 72/4.5OZ $1.07 $76.73 72 / 4.5 OZ $1.13 81.2whole grain, IW

107
SANDWICH, TURKEY AND CHEESE, WEDGE

1000 2 2 X Tasty Brand
NO BID TASTY BRANDS 72/4.4OZ $1.04 $74.67 40 / 4.6 OZ $1.20 47.84whole grain, IW, wedge

108
SAUCE, ALFREDO 

300 2 JTM
NO BID JTM 6/5 LB $0.75 $60.38 6 / 5 LB $0.44 58.6   boil in a bag

109
SAUCE, GENERAL TSO

300 JTM
NO BID JTM 6/5LB $0.70 $56.26 6 / 5 LB $0.11 54.6
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109
boil in a bag

300 JTM
NO BID JTM 6/5LB $0.70 $56.26 6 / 5 LB $0.11 54.6

110
SAUCE, SWEET TERIYAKI

100 JTM
NO BID JTM 6/5LB $0.71 $56.82 6 / 5 LB $0.11 55.72boil in a bag

111
SCONES, BLUEBERRY

10 X
NO BID FAT CAT BAKERY 96/3OZ $0.39 $37.49 96 / 3.75OZ $0.61 58.393.75oz, 96 each per case

112
SCONES, CHOCOLATE CHUNK

10 X
NO BID FAT CAT BAKERY 96/3OZ $0.39 $37.49 96 / 3.75 Z $0.56 53.723.75oz, 96 each per case

113
SCONES, CINNAMON

10 X
NO BID FAT CAT BAKERY 96/3OZ $0.39 $37.49 96 / 3.75OZ $0.61 58.393.75oz, 96 each per case

114
SCONES, CRANBERRY

10 X
NO BID FAT CAT BAKERY 96/3OZ $0.39 $37.49 96 / 3.75OZ $0.61 58.393.75oz, 96 each per case

115
SCONES, LEMON

10 X
NO BID FAT CAT BAKERY 96/3OZ $0.39 $37.49 96 / 3.75OZ $0.61 58.393.75oz, 96 each per case

116
SANDWICH, STUFFED CROISSANT, BACON/EGG

25 2 1  x Bakers Craft 
NO BID MFG DISC 48 / 3.4 OZ NO BIDwhole grain, turkey bacon, 3.4oz

117
SANDWICH, TURKEY AND CHEESE

100 1 1 X Integrated
NO BID INTEGRATED 100/3.1OZ $0.66 $65.59 100 / 3.4 OZ $0.67 65.873.4oz, whole grain Hawaiian roll, turkey ham

118
SPAGHETTI, MEAT SAUCE, CHEESE

1000 2 2 X
NO BID JTM 6/5LB $0.91 $72.64 6 / 5LB $0.53 32.26whole grain pasta

119
SWEET BREAD, CONCHA

1000 2 X
NO BID LUPITAS 84/2.25OZ $0.48 $39.92 85 / 2.25OZ $0.50 42.52.25oz, whole grain

120
TAMALE, CHICKEN, GREEN SAUCE

25 2 2 X
NO BID DEL REAL 48/5OZ $0.86 $41.11 72 / 5.5 OZ $1.20 86.34must meet 2g & 2 m/ma

121
TAQUITO, BREAKFAST, CHORIZO AND CHEESE

25 1 1  X Integrated 
NO BID INTEGRATED 100/2.4OZ $0.58 $57.64 100 / 2.4OZ $0.56 55.82.4oz, whole grain

122
TAQUITO, CHICKEN AND CHEESE

25 2 1 X Posada 
NO BID POSADA 140/1.74OZ $0.32 $44.72 140 / 1.74OZ $0.32 45.273.48oz, whole grain, fully cooked

123
TAQUITO, CHICKEN AND CHEESE

1000 2 2  X Michael B's 
NO BID MICHAEL B'S BESTWAY 50/4.4OZ $1.00 $49.96 50 / 4.4OZ $1.01 50.584.4oz, whole grain, fully cooked

124
TORNADO, BEEF, STEAK AND CHEESE

25 1 1 X Ruiz 
NO BID RUIZ 144/2.79OZ $0.54 $78.01 144 / 2.79OZ $0.52 75.532.79oz, whole grain

125
TORNADO, MAPLE EGG & SAUSAGE

25 1 1 X  Ruiz 
NO BID MFG DISC 144 / 2.79OZ NO BID2.79oz, whole grain

126
TORNADO, CHICKEN AND CHEDDAR

25 1 1 X Ruiz 
NO BID RUIZ 144/2.79OZ $0.54 $78.01 144 / 2.79OZ $0.52 75.532.79oz, whole grain

127
TACO, TOTALLY TACO

25 1.75 2 X The Max 
NO BID THE MAX 96/4.09OZ $0.56 $53.63 96 / 4.09OZ $0.55 52.664.09oz, whole grain

128
TACO, BEEF STICK

1000 2 2  X   
NO BID INTEGRATED 50/4.6OZ $0.87 $43.64 50 / 4.7OZ $0.64 32.22whole grain, beef and cheese

129
TACO, EGG AND CHEESE ROLLED

25 1 1  X Ruiz 
NO BID RUIZ 50/2.5OZ $0.46 $23.03 50 / 2.5OZ $0.46 22.792.5oz, whole grain

130
TURKEY, CHUNKS IN GRAVY

500 2 X Jennie-O 
NO BID JENNIE O 4/7LB $0.73 $82.22 4 / 7 # $0.71 79.87low sodium, fully cooked, boil in bag

131
TURKEY, TACO FILLING

25 2 X Jennie-O
NO BID JENNIE O 4/7LB $0.78 $87.37 4 / 7 LB $0.57 82.81fully cooked, no fillers, heat and serve

132
VEGETABLE, CALIFORNIA BLEND

10 X
NO BID READY FIX 1/20LB $0.21 $21.89 1 / 30 LB $0.26 31.05

133
WAFFLES, MINI

100 2 X Kellogs
NO BID EGGO 72/2.64OZ $0.39 $28.17 72 / 2.65OZ $0.38 27.37whole grain, heat in bag
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Frozen Bid #SN-22-02

Description

1
BAGEL, BREAKFAST SAUSAGE

whole grain, beef or turkey sausage 

2
BAGEL, STRAWBERRY AND CREAM CHEESE

whole grain, 2.43oz, heat and serve

3
BAGEL, PLAIN

whole grain, 3", sliced

4
BAR, Apple, Breakfast

whole grain, 3oz, half cup fruit equivalent

5
BAR, HONEY WHEAT

2.8oz, whole grain

6
BAR, BENEFIT, CHOCOLATE CHIP

 

7
BEEF, ALL AMERICAN BURGER

     whole grain, beef patty

8
BEEF, CHEESEBURGER, MINI TWINS

whole grain, beef patty

9
BEEF, PATTY

low sodium >280mg

10
BEEF, RIB B QUE

Patty w/sauce

11
BEEF, RIB B QUE W/BUN

4.71 oz, w/sauce, WG bun

12
BERRY, PULL APART

heat and serve

13 BITES, BREAKFAST, CHICKEN SAUSAGE

turkey or chicken sausage

14
BITES, NACHO, BITES

whole grain corn flour, gluten free

15
BISCUIT & SAUSAGE

turkey or beef sausage, whole grain Hawaiian roll

16
BREAD,  CORN MUFFIN

2oz, whole grain

17
BREAD,  CINNAMON ROLL

2oz, whole grain

18
BREAD,  GARLIC CHEESE

2oz, whole grain

19
BREAD, HOAGIE ROLL

whole grain

20
BREAD, HONEY WHEAT

w/oats. Artisan, sliced

21
BREAD, DINNER ROLL 

whole grain 

22
BREAD, DINNER ROLL

whole grain, 2oz

23
BREAD, HAMBURGER, BUN

WHOLE GRAIN

24
BREAD, TELERA ROLL

whole grain, 12 EA Bag

25
BREADSTICK 

whole grain

26
BREADSTICK, CHEESE STUFFED

2.86oz, whole grain, NO substitutions

27
BREADSTICK, CHEESE STUFFED

3.86oz, whole grain, NO substitutions

28
BURRITO, BEAN & CHEESE 

whole grain

29
BURRITO, BEAN & CHEESE 

whole grain

30
CHEESE, QUESADILLA, BREAKFAST

 

31
CHEESE, QUESADILLA, GREEN SAUCE

low sodium

32
CHEESE, CUPS

4oz, low sodium

33
CHEESE, PULL APART

whole grain

34
CHICKEN, DRUMSTICK, BREADED

light or dark meat

35
CHICKEN, MANDARIN ORANGE

low sodium, with sauce

36
CHICKEN, PATTIES, BREADED, CRISPY

Vendor Name: TYSON VALLEY FOOD SERVICE

Brand Pack Size Price Per Serving Case Price Pack Size Price Per Serving Case Price

90/2.68oz $0.54 $48.53

72/2.43oz $0.47 $34.09

64/3oz $0.54 $32.93

72/2.8oz $0.44 $31.75

48/2.5oz $0.37 $17.82

50/4.25oz $0.86 $43.21

75/4.35oz $0.99 $74.60

AdvancePierre 200 / 2.47 oz $0.40 $79.81 90/2.5oz $0.47 $42.15

AdvancePierre 100 / 3.21 oz $0.58 $58.00 148/2.25oz $0.75 $111.25

75/4.36oz $1.00 $74.77

Tyson 165 / 2.9 oz $0.39 $64.61

100/3.1oz $0.62 $62.04

72/2oz $0.25 $18.11

60/3oz $0.54 $32.34

60ct $0.77 $46.15

144/1.8oz $0.25 $36.61

192/1oz $0.19 $36.61

120/2oz $0.28 $34.02

144/1.8oz $0.21 $30.37

144/2.74oz $0.29 $41.67

Bosco 144 / 2.141 oz $0.33 $47.12 144/2.286 $0.37 $53.73

84/3.86oz $0.88 $73.67

60/4oz $0.57 $34.15

54/5.75oz $0.65 $34.84

100/1.95oz $0.57 $57.15

72/3.88oz $0.77 $55.41

Tyson 92 / 4.21-6.60 oz $0.84 $77.12 72-113 Serv $0.87 $82.04

6/5# 6/36oz $0.69 $132.96

Tyson 52 / 3.14 oz $0.40 $20.91 107/3oz $0.31 $33.70
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FROZEN FOOD 6

Frozen Bid #SN-22-02
Vendor Name: TYSON VALLEY FOOD SERVICE

36
white meat, whole grain breading

37
CHICKEN, PATTIES, SPICY, BREADED, CRISPY

white meat, whole grain breading

38
CHICKEN, MEATBALLS

39
CHICKEN, NUGGETS

white meat, whole grain breading

40
CHICKEN, TENDERS, CRISPY

whole grain breading

41
CHICKEN, SANDWICH, MAPLE

whole grain bun

42
CHICKEN, SLIDERS

whole grain bun

43
CHICKEN, TENDERS, Spicy, CRISPY

whole grain breading

44
CHICKEN, SWEET CHILI THAI

low sodium, peanut free, with sauce

45
CHICKEN, TERIYAKI AND BROWN RICE

whole grain rice, low sodium sauce

46
CHIMICHANGA, BEEF

5oz, Smart Snack Compliant

47
CHIMICHANGA, MINI, BEAN AND CHEESE

4oz, whole grain, 8 pack, Smart Snack Compliant

48
CINNAMON, APPLE NADA, TASTY NADA

   4oz, whole grain

49
CINNAMON, CRUMB CAKE

 3 oz whole grain

50
CINNAMON ROLL, BREAKFAST SQUARE

3oz, whole grain

51
CINNAMON ROLL, APPLE CINNAMON, BEAR PAW

3oz, whole grain

52
CORN DOG, CHICKEN

whole grain breading

53
CORN DOG, CHICKEN, MINI

whole grain breading

54
DELI MEAT, HONEY HAM, BUFFET

20 pound case

55
DELI MEAT, TURKEY BOLOGNA

56
DELI MEAT, TURKEY BREAST, SMOKED

57
DELI MEAT, TURKEY, HAM

58
DELI MEAT, TURKEY, HAM, SLICED, EXTRA LEAN

59
DELI MEAT, TURKEY, BREAST, SLICED

60
DOUGH, COOKIE, CHOCOLATE CHIP

1.5 oz. puck

61
DOUGH, COOKIE, MACADAMIAN 

1.5 oz. puck

62
DOUGH, COOKIE, OATMEAL CRANBERRY

1.5 oz. puck

63 DOUGH, COOKIE, OATMEL RAISIN

1.5 oz. puck

64
DOUGH, COOKIE, SUGAR

1.5 oz. puck

65
DOUGH, COOKIE, SB-12

1.5 oz. puck

66
EGGS, SCRAMBLED, BOIL IN BAG 

 

67
ENCHILADAS, CHEESE, RED SAUCE

whole grain

68
ENCHILADAS, CHEESE

whole grain

69
FRENCH TOAST, STICKS

whole grain

70
FRUDEL, APPLE, STICK

2.29oz, whole grain

71
FRUDEL, CHERRY, STICK

2.29oz, whole grain

72
FRUIT, STRAWBERRIES, CUPS

4oz, 1/2 cup fruit equivalent, 100% fruit

Tyson 52 / 3.14 oz $0.40 $20.91 107/3oz $0.31 $33.70

Tyson 132 / 3.75 oz $0.71 $93.08 107/3oz $0.31 $33.70

Tyson 58 / 2.75 oz $0.42 $24.24

Tyson 98 / 3.75 oz $0.62 $60.53 64/3oz $1.05 $67.26

Tyson 150 / 3.39 oz $0.33 $48.90

75/5oz $1.05 $78.65

Tyson 119 / 4.14 oz $0.80 $95.32

6/5# 6/30oz $0.69 $132.96

36/9oz $1.64 $58.89

$22.91

60/4oz $0.68 $40.80

72/3.4oz $0.52 $37.23

60/3oz $0.55 $33.04

72/3oz $0.55 $39.43

96/4oz $0.50 $48.20

Tyson 120 / 4 oz $0.54 $64.82 239/.67oz $0.63 $24.57

168/1.5oz $0.12 $20.54

168/1.5oz $0.12 $20.54

168/1.5oz $0.12 $20.54

4/5# $51.27

42/5.6oz $1.24 $52.20

120/2.05oz $0.41 $48.90

12/2# $0.40 $38.46

72/2.29oz $0.47 $34.09

72/2.29oz $0.47 $34.09
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Frozen Bid #SN-22-02
Vendor Name: TYSON VALLEY FOOD SERVICE

73
FRUIT, MIXED BERRY, CUPS

4oz, 1/2 cup fruit equivalent, 100% fruit

74
JUICE, SORBET, CUPS

1/2 cup fruit equivalent, 100% fruit

75
JUICE, PEACH, CUPS

1/2 cup fruit equivalent, 100% fruit

76
MUFFIN, BANANA

3oz,  whole grain

77
MUFFIN, DOUBLE CHOCOLATE

3.1oz, whole grain

78
PANCAKE, BOWL

3.8 oz, whole grain

79
PANCAKE, MINI PANCAKES

3oz, whole grain

80
PANCAKE, SANDWICH, BEEF SAUSAGE

whole grain, 2.6OZ

81
PANCAKE, SAUSAGE ON A STICK

turkey or chicken,whole grain

82
PANCAKE, WRAPS, MINI MAPLE, TURKEY

    2.55oz, whole grain

83
PASTA, PENNE, PRE COOKED, THAW AND HEAT

fully cooked noodles, thaw and heat

84
PASTA, ROTINI, WITH ALFREDO SAUCE

8oz, heat and serve, black tray, whole grain

85
PASTA, ROTTONI, WITH MEAT SAUCE

8oz, heat and serve, black tray, whole grain

86
PASTA, SPAGHETTI, WITH MEAT SAUCE

8oz, heat and serve, black tray, whole grain

87
PASTA, MACARONI AND CHEESE

whole grain, low sodium, boil in a bag

88
PASTA, CHEESEBURGER, MACARONI AND CHEESE

whole grain

89
PIZZA, BELL TASTY NADA

whole grain, turkey and cheese

90
PIZZA, BREAKFAST, TURKEY SAUSAGE 

whole grain, pre sliced

91
PIZZA, CHEESE

4.5oz, whole grain, low sodium

92
PIZZA, CALZONE, PRETZEL, NACHO

4.69oz, whole grain, low sodium

93
PIZZA, ROUND, CHEESE, 6"

4.69oz, whole grain, low sodium

94
PIZZA, PINWHEEL, CHEESE

4.69oz, whole grain, low sodium

95
PIZZA, TURKEY PEPPERONI

4.69oz, whole grain, low sodium

96
PIZZA, TURKEY PEPPERONI

5", whole grain, low sodium

97
PIZZA, 16" ROUND, PEPPERONI

5.18oz, whole grain, turkey pepperoni

98
PIZZA, SANDWICH, PEPPERONI

4.46oz, whole grain, turkey pepperoni

99
POTATO, ROUNDS, (tater tots)

low sodium, >200mg

100
POTATO, FRIES, SPICY, SEASONED

low sodium, >200mg

101
SANDWICH, GRILLED CHEESE, THREE CHEESE

whole grain

102
SANDWICH, PEANUT BUTTER W/JELLY

whole grain, strawberry, thaw & serve

103
SANDWICH, PEANUT BUTTER W/JELLY

whole grain, grape, thaw & serve

104
SANDWICH, SOYBUTTER W/JELLY

whole grain, 2.4oz, thaw & serve

105
SANDWICH, CROISSANT, BEEF AND CHEESE

whole grain, IW

106
SANDWICH, ITALIAN

whole grain, IW

107
SANDWICH, TURKEY AND CHEESE, WEDGE

whole grain, IW, wedge

108
SAUCE, ALFREDO 

   boil in a bag

109
SAUCE, GENERAL TSO

96/4.4oz $0.31 $29.67

48/3.1oz $0.39 $18.48

60/3.15oz $0.44 $26.41

72/3.8oz $0.71 $51.06

72/3oz $0.40 $28.70

100/2.61oz $0.66 $66.49

68/2.85oz $0.43 $29.01

63/3ct $0.51 $32.17

30/8oz $1.61 $48.21

30/8oz $1.61 $48.21

30/8oz $1.61 $48.21

128ct $0.35 $45.28

96ct $0.49 $46.60

96/4.67oz $0.53 $50.76

60ct $0.90 $53.90

60ct $0.85 $50.71

9/16" $0.97 $70.12

48ct $0.76 $36.52

6/5# $22.54

6/5# $23.52

72/4.19oz $0.78 $56.19

72/2.6oz $0.57 $40.10

72/2.6oz $0.53 $38.40

72/4.5oz $1.09 $78.40

72/4.4oz $1.06 $76.30

6/5# $0.47 $61.90

6/5# $0.13 $61.97
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Frozen Bid #SN-22-02
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109
boil in a bag

110
SAUCE, SWEET TERIYAKI

boil in a bag

111
SCONES, BLUEBERRY

3.75oz, 96 each per case

112
SCONES, CHOCOLATE CHUNK

3.75oz, 96 each per case

113
SCONES, CINNAMON

3.75oz, 96 each per case

114
SCONES, CRANBERRY

3.75oz, 96 each per case

115
SCONES, LEMON

3.75oz, 96 each per case

116
SANDWICH, STUFFED CROISSANT, BACON/EGG

whole grain, turkey bacon, 3.4oz

117
SANDWICH, TURKEY AND CHEESE

3.4oz, whole grain Hawaiian roll, turkey ham

118
SPAGHETTI, MEAT SAUCE, CHEESE

whole grain pasta

119
SWEET BREAD, CONCHA

2.25oz, whole grain

120
TAMALE, CHICKEN, GREEN SAUCE

must meet 2g & 2 m/ma

121
TAQUITO, BREAKFAST, CHORIZO AND CHEESE

2.4oz, whole grain

122
TAQUITO, CHICKEN AND CHEESE

3.48oz, whole grain, fully cooked

123
TAQUITO, CHICKEN AND CHEESE

4.4oz, whole grain, fully cooked

124
TORNADO, BEEF, STEAK AND CHEESE

2.79oz, whole grain

125
TORNADO, MAPLE EGG & SAUSAGE

2.79oz, whole grain

126
TORNADO, CHICKEN AND CHEDDAR

2.79oz, whole grain

127
TACO, TOTALLY TACO

4.09oz, whole grain

128
TACO, BEEF STICK

whole grain, beef and cheese

129
TACO, EGG AND CHEESE ROLLED

2.5oz, whole grain

130
TURKEY, CHUNKS IN GRAVY

low sodium, fully cooked, boil in bag

131
TURKEY, TACO FILLING

fully cooked, no fillers, heat and serve

132
VEGETABLE, CALIFORNIA BLEND

133
WAFFLES, MINI

whole grain, heat in bag

6/5# $0.13 $61.97

6/5# $0.13 $62.58

96/3.75oz $0.63 $60.87

96/3.75oz $0.63 $60.87

96/3.75oz $0.63 $60.87

96/3.75oz $0.63 $60.87

96/3.75oz $0.63 $60.87

100/3.1oz $0.67 $66.67

30/8oz $1.60 $48.21

48ct $1.01 $48.48

100/2.4oz $0.59 $58.91

140/1.74oz $0.33 $46.57

50/4.4oz $1.01 $50.50

18/8/2.79oz $0.54 $77.17

18/8/2.79oz $0.54 $77.17

18/8/2.79oz $0.54 $77.17

96/4.09oz $0.56 $53.80

50/4.6oz $0.89 $44.70

50/2.5oz $0.44 $22.01

20# $0.23 $19.16

72ct $0.44 $31.51


