
Robertson County Finance Dept., 523 S. Brown Street, Springfield, TN 37172
(615)384-0202 

Robertson County Finance Department
Bid Tab #1320

CRS-2, RS-2 and AEP Prime, AE3 /Highway Dept.
March 16, 2016 / 10:15 AM

Bidder CRS-2
RS-2 
Seal

AEP - 
Prime AE 3 Notes

Marathon Petroleum No Bid 1.4900 2.3000 2.4000 AE-3 Mixing included

Blacklidge Emulsions 1.5900 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions 1.8000 1.8000 2.1000 2.9500
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		Bidder		CRS-2		RS-2 Seal		AEP - Prime		AE 3		Notes

		Marathon Petroleum		No Bid		1.4900		2.3000		2.4000		AE-3 Mixing included

		Blacklidge Emulsions		1.5900		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid

		Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions		1.8000		1.8000		2.1000		2.9500
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