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Sysco Inland Supply P&R Paper Brady Plus Gold Star Premier Property Quilt Corporation

Line
Est. 

Usage
Item Name Description Preferred brand or Equal

Commercial Bid Pricing Commercial Bid Pricing Commercial Bid Pricing Commercial Bid Pricing Commercial Bid Pricing Commercial Bid Pricing Commercial Bid Pricing

Case $ Pack Size Serving $ Brand Case $ Pack Size Serving $ Brand Case $ Pack Size Serving $ Brand Case $ Pack Size Serving $ Brand Case $ Pack Size Serving $ Brand Case $ Pack Size Serving $ Brand Case $ Pack Size Serving $ Brand

1 5 ALL TEMP RINSE two- 2.5gal case Ecolab PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$214.52 2 / 2.5 LB $107.26 ECOLAB No Quote $32.00 2 gal/cs N/A Belco WWRA2 NO BID N/A N/A N/A "NO BID" NO BID

2 25 BAG, TRASH CAN, CLEAR 45 gallon PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$55.87 250 / 40-45G $0.22 SYS CLS 25.8 250 0.1 Inchco 60.15 250/CS 0.2406REPUBLIC BAG INC.$29.90 250/cs N/A Allstate Plastics PC-404816NNO BID $24.52 250 $0.10 GENUINE JOE $15.40 80/CS BERRY, WHD4046

3 25 BASH, TRASH CAN, CLEAR 32 gallon PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$39.61 250 / 33 GAL $0.16 SYS CLS 19.22 250 0.07 Inchco 40.8 250/CS 0.1632REPUBLIC BAG INC.$23.00 250/cs N/A Allstate Plastics REP-3339 NO BID $48.65 100 $0.49HERITAGE BAG COMPANY$53.18 200/CS COASTWIDE, 472380

4 50 BLEACH, LIQUID six- 1 gallon case PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$20.05 6 / 128OZ $3.34 SYS CLS 17.5 6/CS 2.91666667KIK INTERNATIONAL LLC

$18.90

6 gal/cs N/A Klk CF1041 $23.08 6/1GAL $3.85KIK CUSTOM PRODUCTS$21.55 6 $3.59KIK CUSTOM PRODUCTS$42.11 6/CT PURE BRIGHT, 815745

5 25 CITRUS CLEANER, SPRAY 6 bottles case, NO Substitutions PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$25.08 4 / 32OZ $6.27 KEYSTON No Quote

$29.90

12 qts/cs N/A

Betco Chap14

$21.50 6/19OZ $3.58 COMPANION $32.87 6 $5.48SC JOHNSON & SON, INC.$26.92 6/CT PURELL, 24317043

6 25 CLEANSER, CHLORINATED 24 CT case PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$116.19 12 / 32 OZ $9.68 ECOLAB 37.8 24/21oz 1.54 Ajax No Quote $29.00 24 21oz/cs 1.2 Ajax 14278IFS NO BID $44.81 24 $1.87PROCTER & GAMBLE NO BID

7 5 CONVI OVEN, SOLBLE TABLET 90 CT pail PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
NO BID / 123.2 1/PL 123.2 RATIONAL USA INC No Bid No Bid NO BID N/A N/A N/A "NO BID" NO BID

8 10 DEGREASER four- 1 gallon case PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$223.98 4 / 1 GAL $56.00 ECOLAB 25.5 4gl/cs 6.38 Inchco 27.4 4/CS 6.85 VICTORIA BAY $28.00 4 gal/cs 7 Betco CHDE5 $49.26 4/128OZ $12.32 $28.04 4 $7.01SC JOHNSON & SON, INC.$75.94 4/CT CLEAN REPUBLIC, 24581062

9 100 ECOLAB POT AND PAN SOLID 2 CT case Ecolab 6101350 PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$37.27 2 / 1GAL $18.64 KEYSTON No Quote $59.50 2 Spint jars/cs N/A Betco 25671-00 NO BID N/A N/A N/A "NO BID" NO BID

10 100 ECOLAB SANITIZER, QUAT 2 CT case Ecolab 6100176 PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$96.28 2 / 2LB $48.14 KEYSTON No Quote

$24.65 2 gal/cs N/A Belco WWSA3

NO BID N/A N/A N/A "NO BID" NO BID

11 25 GREEN PAD, HEAVY DUTY heavy duty, 20 CT box PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$7.45 1 / 20 CT $0.37 SUPPCLS 3.75 15/CS 0.25 3M $4.92 15/cs 0.32 3M Niagra DK9507 $17.51 6/10CT $0.29 3M SCOTCHBRITE $21.96 20 $1.10 3M $10.25 20/CT 0.51 PREMIER, PAD188LAG

12 100 HAND WIPES 1000 CT case PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$44.40 6 / 300 CT $7.40 NICEPAK 68.25 6/CS 11.375GOJO INDUSTRIES INC.$32.00 1000/cs N/A Diamond Wipes 15137 $54.84 1000 CT $0.05 PURRELL $55.94 1000 $0.06GOJO INDUSTRIES INCORPORATED$46.77 100/CT PURELL, 800791

13 25 LAUNDRY DETERGENT 40 pound pail PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$126.56 1 / 45LB $126.56 ECOLAB 26.85 1/EA 26.85DIAMOND CHEMICAL CO INC$41.90 50 lb N/A Exsl B-2007-50 $17.86 25LB $17.86CHEMCOR CHEMICAL$30.46 1 $30.46 GENUINE JOE NO BID

14 10 LAUNDRY DETERGENT, LIQUID PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$246.84 1 / 5 GAL $246.84 ECOLAB 47.9 4/CS 11.975 VICTORIA BAY

$64.00 4 gal/cs N/A Betco CG9511

$36.08 4/92 FL OZ $9.02 ERA $32.39 6 $5.40PROCTER & GAMBLE$10.35 EA TIDE, 1910472

15 5 LIME DESCALER four- 1 gallon case PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$46.32 2 / 1 GAL $23.16 KEYSTON 43.25 4/CS 10.8125 VICTORIA BAY

$33.00 4 gal/cs N/A Betco WWMD3

NO BID $59.82 6 $9.97SUNSHINE MAKERS, INC. NO BID

16 10 OVEN CLEANER 6 each case PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$105.78 6 / 32 OZ $17.63 ECOLAB 39.6 6/CS 6.6ESSENDANT RECEIVABLES LLC$42.00 12 20oz/cs N/A Claire CE8240 NO BID $54.94 12 $4.58RECKITT BENCKISER PLC$40.17 6/CT BREAK-UP, 2750870

17 10 POT AND PAN SOAP four- 1 gallon case PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$143.15 4 / 1 GAL $35.79 ECOLAB 21.7 4/CS 5.425 VICTORIA BAY $26.80 4 gal/cs N/A Betco WWDS2 NO BID $60.07 4 $15.02 GENUINE JOE $75.19 4/CT DAWN, 57445Q

18 25 POT AND PAN SOAP 5 gallon pail Palmolive PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$83.70 1 / 5 GAL $83.70 KEYSTON 30.1 1/PL 30.1 VICTORIA BAY

$79.00 5 Gal pail

N/A

Palmolive CPC04917

NO BID $66.30 1 $66.30COLGATE-PALMOLIVE COMPANY NO BID

19 5 SANITIZER TABLET 100 CT case PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$40.66 6 / 100CT $6.78 STERAMN No Quote $9.50/bottle 150/bottle N/A Betco 21000200 NO BID N/A N/A N/A "NO BID" NO BID

20 10 SOAP, FLLED PADS 10 each case PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$31.51 12 / 10 CT $2.63 SUPPCLS 46.15 12/CS 3.84583333ESSENDANT RECEIVABLES LLC$4.33 10/box N/A Brillo P-HOTEL NO BID $51.80 180 $0.29THE CLOROX COMPANY NO BID

21 20 STAINLESS STEEL SPONGE 12 CT case PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$71.27 6 / 12 CT $11.88 SUPPCLS 3.25 12/BX 0.27083333VICTORIA BAY$5.57 12/box N/A rand A International SS-SPONGEIF!NO BID $39.47 72 $0.55THE CLOROX COMPANY$30.40 12/CS SCOTCH BRITE, 1968216

22 5 STAINLESS STEEL, CLEANER, AEROSOL 6 each case PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$62.86 6 / 15OZ $10.48 KEYSTON 35.65 12/CS 2.97083333NPPC C/O CLAIRE MANUFACTURING

$42.00 12 lSoz/cs N/A Claire CO1025

NO BID $65.24 12 $5.44THE CLAIRE MANUFACTURING COMPANY$25.17 6/CT COASTWIDE, 2611678

23 100 WIPES, CLOROX, SANITIZER 1000 CT case PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$32.87 6 / 75 CT $5.48 CLOROX 36.15 700/CS 0.05164286ESSENDANT RECEIVABLES LLC$62.00 !0 cs 960 wipt N/A Progressive Prod. 37701 $41.76 6/95CT $0.07SANI PROFESSIONAL$46.10 700 $0.07THE CLOROX COMPANY NO BID



Porterville Unified School District  Bid Solicitation 2024-2025 School YearJanitorial  Solicitation SN-25-07 Equal Opportunity Employer

Brady Plus

Line
Est. 

Usage
Item Name Description Preferred brand or Equal

Commercial Bid Pricing Est

Case $ Pack Size Serving $ Brand Ann $

No Awards #REF!

*
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Gold Star

Line
Est. 

Usage
Item Name Description Preferred brand or Equal

Commercial Bid Pricing Est 

Case $ Pack Size Serving $ Brand Ann $

5
Janitori

al
25 CITRUS CLEANER, SPRAY 6 bottles case, NO Substitutions PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL

Gold Star $21.50 6/19OZ $3.58 COMPANION $537.50

13
Janitori

al
25 LAUNDRY DETERGENT 40 pound pail PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL

Gold Star $17.86 25LB $17.86 CHEMCOR CHEMICAL $446.50

$984.00
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Inland Supply

Line
Est. 

Usage
Item Name Description Preferred brand or Equal

Commercial Bid Pricing Est

Case $ Pack Size Serving $ Brand Ann $

3
Janitori

al
25 BASH, TRASH CAN, CLEAR 32 gallon PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL

Inland Supply 19.22 250 0.07 Inchco $480.50

8
Janitori

al
10 DEGREASER four- 1 gallon case PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL

Inland Supply 25.5 4gl/cs 6.38 Inchco $255.00

$735.50
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P&R Paper

Line
Est. 

Usage
Item Name Description Preferred brand or Equal

Commercial Bid Pricing Est

Case $ Pack Size Serving $ Brand Ann $

4
Janitori

al
50 BLEACH, LIQUID six- 1 gallon case PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL

P&R Paper 17.5 6/CS 2.91666667 KIK INTERNATIONAL LLC $875.00

7
Janitori

al
5 CONVI OVEN, SOLBLE TABLET 90 CT pail PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL

P&R Paper 123.2 1/PL 123.2 RATIONAL USA INC $616.00

11
Janitori

al
25 GREEN PAD, HEAVY DUTY heavy duty, 20 CT box PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL

P&R Paper 3.75 15/CS 0.25 3M $93.75

12
Janitori

al
100 HAND WIPES 1000 CT case PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL

P&R Paper 68.25 6/CS 11.375 GOJO INDUSTRIES INC. $6,825.00

16
Janitori

al
10 OVEN CLEANER 6 each case PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL

P&R Paper 39.6 6/CS 6.6 ESSENDANT RECEIVABLES LLC $396.00

18
Janitori

al
25 POT AND PAN SOAP 5 gallon pail Palmolive PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL

P&R Paper 30.1 1/PL 30.1 VICTORIA BAY $752.50

21
Janitori

al
20 STAINLESS STEEL SPONGE 12 CT case PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL

P&R Paper 3.25 12/BX 0.27083333 VICTORIA BAY $65.00

22
Janitori

al
5 STAINLESS STEEL, CLEANER, AEROSOL 6 each case PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL

P&R Paper 35.65 12/CS 2.97083333 NPPC C/O CLAIRE MANUFACTURING $178.25

23
Janitori

al
100 WIPES, CLOROX, SANITIZER 1000 CT case PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL

P&R Paper 36.15 700/CS 0.05164286 ESSENDANT RECEIVABLES LLC $3,615.00

$13,416.50
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Premier Property

Line
Est. 

Usage
Item Name Description Preferred brand or Equal

Commercial Bid Pricing Est

Case $ Pack Size Serving $ Brand Annual $

2
Janitori

al
25 BAG, TRASH CAN, CLEAR 45 gallon PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL

Premier Property $24.52 250 $0.10 GENUINE JOE $613.00

14
Janitori

al
10 LAUNDRY DETERGENT, LIQUID PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL

Premier Property $32.39 6 $5.40 PROCTER & GAMBLE $323.90

15
Janitori

al
5 LIME DESCALER four- 1 gallon case PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL

Premier Property $59.82 6 $9.97 SUNSHINE MAKERS, INC. $299.10

17
Janitori

al
10 POT AND PAN SOAP four- 1 gallon case PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL

Premier Property $60.07 4 $15.02 GENUINE JOE $600.70

$1,836.70
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Quilt Corporation

Line
Est. 

Usage
Item Name Description Preferred brand or Equal

Commercial Bid Pricing

Case $ Pack Size Serving $ Brand

No Awards
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Sysco

Line
Est. 

Usage
Item Name Description Preferred brand or Equal

Commercial Bid Pricing Est

Case $ Pack Size Serving $ Brand Ann. $

1
Janitori

al
5 ALL TEMP RINSE two- 2.5gal case Ecolab PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL

Sysco $214.52 2 / 2.5 LB $107.26 ECOLAB $1,072.60

9
Janitori

al
100 ECOLAB POT AND PAN SOLID 2 CT case Ecolab 6101350 PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL

Sysco $37.27 2 / 1GAL $18.64 KEYSTON $3,727.00

10
Janitori

al
100 ECOLAB SANITIZER, QUAT 2 CT case Ecolab 6100176 PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL

Sysco $96.28 2 / 2LB $48.14 KEYSTON $9,628.00

20
Janitori

al
10 SOAP, FLLED PADS 10 each case PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL

Sysco $31.51 12 / 10 CT $2.63 SUPPCLS $315.10

$14,742.70


