Robertson County, Tennessee
Bid Tab #1371

New and Recap Tires / Robertson County Schools
September 26, 2017 / 10:30 AM

d o Jennings
GO(.) year . Raben Tire =R O3 . American Tire dba | McGriff Tire
Vendor Tire & Bestone Tire Fleet Dean Oil . . .
Co. . Mobile Fleet| American Service
Rubber Co Service Tire
PLY or Includes Includes Includes Includes Includes Includes Includes Includes
LOAD $1.35 New $1.35 New $1.35 New $1.35 New $1.35 New $1.35 New $1.35 New $1.35 New
ITEM TYPE SIZE RANGE DESCRIPTION Tire Tax Tire Tax Tire Tax Tire Tax Tire Tax Tire Tax Tire Tax Tire Tax
1 |[STEER 225/75/R16 10/E 111.35 116.00 111.35 112.35 112.35 109.00 111.35 116.00
80,000
2 |VAN 225/65/R17 MILE TIRE 116.00 82.44 116.02 105.00 89.95 106.00 116.00 105.14
3 |STEER 255/70/R22.5 16 276.35 283.06 276.35 240.00 252.92 325.00 291.35 265.00
minimum 22/32
tread depth. 9"
STEER BUS wide tread w/ 294.26 290.83
4 |TIRE 11/22.5 - AH12 16 closed shoulder 302.35 306.93 302.35| & 295.00 Alt| & 320.21 Alt 400.00 316.35 284.00
minimum 22/32
tread depth. 9"
wide tread w/
5 |RECAP LUG [11/22.5 16 closed shoulder 125.00 136.00 149.00 136.00 110.00 no bid 125.00 135.75
CLASS "A"
CASING
6 |CREDIT 11/22.5 16 50.00 65.00 35.00 25.00 50.00 no bid 60.00 30.00
For tires that
can't be
DISPOSAL repaired or Small $3.00
7 |FEE 11/22.5 ALL SIZES |retreaded. 10.00 |Large $5.00 10.00 10.00 10.00 5.00 8.00 7.00
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										Vendor		Goodyear Tire & Rubber Co		Bestone Tire		Raben Tire Co.		Best One Fleet Service		Dean Oil		American Mobile Fleet		Jennings Tire dba American Tire		McGriff Tire Service

		ITEM		TYPE		SIZE		PLY or LOAD RANGE		DESCRIPTION		Each Price - Includes $1.35 New Tire Tax		Each Price - Includes $1.35 New Tire Tax		Each Price - Includes $1.35 New Tire Tax		Each Price - Includes $1.35 New Tire Tax		Each Price - Includes $1.35 New Tire Tax		Each Price - Includes $1.35 New Tire Tax		Each Price - Includes $1.35 New Tire Tax		Each Price - Includes $1.35 New Tire Tax

		1		STEER		225/75/R16		10/E				111.35		116.00		111.35		112.35		112.35		109.00		111.35		116.00

		2		VAN		225/65/R17		80,000 MILE TIRE				116.00		82.44		116.02		105.00		89.95		106.00		116.00		105.14

		3		STEER		255/70/R22.5		16				276.35		283.06		276.35		240.00		252.92		325.00		291.35		265.00

		4		STEER BUS TIRE		11/22.5 - AH12		16		minimum 22/32 tread depth. 9" wide tread w/ closed shoulder		302.35		306.93		302.35		294.26                 & 295.00 Alt		290.83                 & 320.21 Alt		400.00		316.35		284.00

		5		RECAP LUG		11/22.5		16		minimum 22/32 tread depth. 9" wide tread w/ closed shoulder		125.00		136.00		149.00		136.00		110.00		no bid		125.00		135.75

		6		CLASS "A" CASING CREDIT		11/22.5		16				50.00		65.00		35.00		25.00		50.00		no bid		60.00		30.00

		7		DISPOSAL FEE		11/22.5		ALL SIZES		For tires that can't be repaired or retreaded. 		10.00		Small $3.00 Large $5.00		10.00		10.00		10.00		5.00		8.00		7.00
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