[BID NO. 4366
Inmate Hygiene Items

|Opened March 10, 2012

Contact:
Phone:
Fax:

| Fluoride Toothpaste

[ Toothbrushes-Max 3 1/2" length
Disposable Razors-Single Blade
3 .oap-Face & Antibacterial/Deo
....cary Napkins-Ind Wrapped

Second Year:
Third Year:

Payment Terms:
Bid Basis:

| Additional Purchases:

Bob Baker Company

PO Box 429|

Fuquay-Varina, NC 27526 |

Connie Kincade
(800)334-9880
(800)322-7537

conniekincade@bobbarker.com|

BRAND QTY/SIZE | TOTAL
Nature Mint 1000/cs $53.17
Bob Barker 144/cs $5.18
Bob Barker 600/cs $25.46
Bob Barker 1000/cs $36.14
Bob Barker 500/cs $26.94

3.00%
3.00%
Net 30
Low Item
Yes
60 days
3-21 ARO

Santa Ana, CA 92705

; ~ Comade, Inc.
1920 E Warner Ave Ste N

~_lcs
PO Box 21056

Waco, TX 76702

~ 1618 Coney Island Ave
Brooklyn, NY 11230 |

Charm-Tex

____ Acme Supply Co
10 Cedar Swamp Rd Ste 7
~ Glen Cove, NY 11542

Emed Medical

12163 Bridgeton Sq
Bridgeton, MO 63044

Yamee Arias J.M. Bogan, Jr ~ Ben Danzger | Zaheer Sheik ] Carol Harting |
714-389-9600 (800)524-5427 | (718)252-8100 | 800-567-8025 o 314-739-6815
714-389-9696 (254)751-0299 | (718)258-8303 _ ~ 800-567-8026 | 3143444303
icswaco@hotmail.com stan@charm-tex.com _ bn@acmesupply.biz
BRAND QTY/SIZE | TOTAL || BRAND |QTY/SIZE| TOTAL || BRAND |QTY/SIZE| TOTAL || BRAND [QTY/SIZE| TOTAL || BRAND | QTY/SIZE
Freshmint 1000/cs | $59.40  Freshmint | 1000/cs = $57.00 Charmtex | 1000/cs | $50.90 Acme 1000/cs = $65.00 Colgate 1000/cs
Noved 720 ealcs | $48.75 ICS | 144ics = $4.96  Charmtex | 144/cs = $5.18 Acme 144/cs | $6.00 Donovan 144/cs
Noved 2000/cs | $116.10 ICS 100/bx | $4.02  Charmtex | 600/cs | $24.72 Acme 600/cs  $45.00 Personna 500/cs
Freschscent 1000/cs | $37.42  Freshmint | 1000/cs = $34.00  Charmtex | 1000/cs = $32.90 Acme 1000/cs | $34.00 Donovan 1000/cs
No Bid Sanitex 288/cs = $18.00 Charmtex | 500/cs J $25.18 Acme 500/cs $30.00 Maxithin 500/CS
\ :
4.00% 5.00% | 3.00% ) 0.00% | 2.00%
8.00% 5.00% i 5.00% | 0.00% ; 3.00%
Net 30 days Net 30 days Net 30 days ; Net 30 days Net 30 days |
Low Item Low Item Low Item : All or None ‘ Allornone |
Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
60 days 90 days 360 Blank 30 days
10 3-5 days 7-30 days | 5 3-5 days




~ 845-639-9788

— ~ Dentserve
43 secont Street T,
New City, NY 10956

S. Jaggi
845-639-9690

~ Phoenix
160-1st SE Ste 5

New Brighton, MN 55112

Paul Olson

888-454-2296
866-687-6165

Supply, LLC
 SUPPLY, LY

PO Box 120 |

Kentron Health Care

Springfield, TN 37172

=l

Nari Sadarangani

615-384-0573
615-384-0574

~ Supreme Medical
PO Box 850247
Mobile, AL 36685

Nancy Klein
800-461-1370
800-461-1277

~ Pacific Care Products
540Howard St
‘San Francisco, CA 94105

susan Lee |
415-543-4999 .
415-543-4994 |

Home Aid Healthcare

POBox 801764
Sta. Clarita, CA 91380

Roland Hinds
661-367-6404
661-208-8598

I I

TOTAL | BRAND | QTY/SIZE | TOTAL | BRAND | QTYISIZE ’ TOTAL | BRAND | QTV/SIZE | TOTAL | BRAND | QTY/SIZE | TOTAL | BRAND | QTY/SIZE | TOTAL | BRAND | QTYISIZE | TOTAL
$28792 NewWorld | 1000/cs | $8361  Freshmint | 1000/cs = $64.25 No bid 1000/cs No bid 1000/cs APl | T1000/cs | $48.00 Nobid | 1000/cs
$39.02  Donovan | 1440/cs I$94.36 Freshmint 144ics | $6.05 ~ No bid 144/cs Donovan 144/cs | $97.00 APl | 144lcs  $675 Dawn Mist | 144/cs $7.86
$49.28  Donovan | 200/cs | $117.17  Freshmint 500/cs | $30.71 No bid 500/cs \ Donovan 600/cs | $4230 APl | 600/cs $31.50 Dawn Mist | 2000/cs  $138.61
)43f ~ Donovan | 1000/cs { $61.55 Freshmint | 1000/cs | $41.51 No bid 1000/cs | Donovan 1000/cs | $51.83 APl 1000/cs | $42.50 Dawn Mist | 1000/cs  $72.15
W,”zjss ~ Nopbid 500CS Sanitex 288/cs | $2347  Kenton | 500/cs | $49.00  1istQualty | 288lcs | $2970 APl | 500/cs | $29.00  Hospeco | 250/cs  §91.47
- 7.00% 200% | 5.00% i 5.00% | T300% | ’ 500%
7.00% 4.00% 5.00% ‘ 5.00%  500% | ' 500%
B Net30days =~ | Net 30 days | Net 30 days ‘ ‘ Net 30 days 1 - Net 30 days f Net 30 days -
Low Item Lowitem Low Item Low Item i Low ltem ‘ B Low Item | B
~ Yes Yes l Yes ‘ Yes Yes o ~ Yes i -
N 30 days 90 days 365days | 1 60 days 90 days 90 days -
| ‘
10-15 days B 7 days 10-15days | 2-14 days 7-14 days 7-14 days o
- | | | I
? : | Ti -




