HIGHLANDS COUNTY
BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
Purchasing Division

NOTICE OF INTENT TO AWARD

ITB 21-015
Basic & Advanced Life Support Pharmaceuticals & Supplies
LOCAL
Bidder Name VENDOR TOTAL
AGNI Enterprises NO See attached itemized bid form
Bound Tree Medical, LLC NO See attached itemized bid form
Florida Discount Drugs dba Taylor's Pharmacy NO See attached itemized bid form
Henry Schein NO See attached itemized bid form
Life-Assist, Inc. NO See attached itemized bid form
Medline Industries, Inc NO See attached itemized bid form
QuadMed, Inc NO See attached itemized bid form

Local Preference was not used to award this project; none of the Bidders qualify.
Notice of Intent to Award is posted to Highlandsfl.gov at 3:00 PM on 07/16/2021.

End of protest period: 4 P.M. on 07/21/2021.

Award shall be made to the lowest bidder for each line item in accordance with the attached spreadsheet.
Should the item not be available and/or in the time required Highlands County reserves the right to obtain
the item from the next lowest bidder until the item can be purchased. This agreement will be utilized on
an as-needed basis.

The term of this agreement is one year from the date of the Recommendation for Award. Prices are to
remain firm for the term of the contract.

FAILURE TO FOLLOW THE PURCHASING PROTEST PROCEDURE REQUIREMENTS WITHIN
THE TIME FRAMES PRESCRIBED IN SECTION 24 OF THE HIGHLANDS COUNTY BOARD OF
COUNTY COMMISSIONERS PURCHASING MANUAL SHALL CONSTITUTE A WAIVER OF
YOUR PROTEST AND ANY RESULTING CLAIMS. THAT PURCHASING MANUAL IS
AVAILABLE FOR PUBLIC INSPECTION IN THE PURCHASING DIVISION ANDON THE
HIGHLANDS COUNTY BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS” WEBSITE
(WWW.HCBCC.NET) AND MAY BE OBTAINED FROM THE HIGHLANDS COUNTY BOARD OF
COUNTY COMMISSIONERS PURCHASING DIVISION.

i . Digitally signed by Christine Davis
Christine Davis Date: 2021.07.16 13:40:13 -04'00'
Christine Davis, Purchasing Manager Date
Wechadd Healy 7-16-2021
. /4
Michael Healy, Quartermaster Date
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BID SUBMITTAL FORM

21-015 Itemized Bid Form

Florida
Agni Enterprises, Discount
LLC (dba) Head to Drugs, Inc dba Medline

VENDOR Heels Safety Bound Tree Taylors HENRY Industries  QuadMed,
Name: Supplies Medical LLC Pharmacy  SCHEIN, INC Life Assist Inc. Inc.
Bid :em ITEM DESCRIPTION BRAND: MFG ITEM # Price each item Price each item Price each item Price each item | Price each item | Price each item| Price each item

1 MED |Adenocard; 6 mg /2 ml - Vial (XH 25.000 (D) $ 6.980 |@$ 3.780 |0$ 15.000 (@5 3.480

2 MED |Adenocard; 12 mg /4 ml - Vial @$ 2762000 $ 31.880 |@$ 6.830 |( 28.900 (@5 23.059

3 MED |Albuterol; 2.5 mg/ 3 ml - Unit dose DS 5.700|D S 4.250 (@S 0.138 |@5 0.200 |@5 0.263

4 MED |Amiodarone; 150 mg / 3 ml - Vial (xH 24.740|0) $ 3.750 |@$ 1.690 (@5 0.990 |@5 1.646

5 MED |Atropine; 1 mg /10 ml - Luer (xH 110.000 () $ 12.750 @5 7.990 | @5 10.000 [@% 10.983

6 MED |Benadryl ; 50 mg - Vial @3 0.270 |@ $ 30.500 () $ 1.750 |@$ 0.660 |( 1.250 |@$ 1.159

7 MED |[Brethine; 1 mg - Vial DS 50.200 () S 25.000 (@S 23.510 | @5 1.850 No Bid

8 MED |Dextrose; 50 % 25 gm - Luer (xH 113.800 () $ 14.500 (% 14.860 |( 13.750 (@5 10.343

9 MED [Diazepam; 10 mg/ 2 ml - Luer locking DS 496.600 (@ $ 40.920 (@S 36.570 |08 57.600 No Bid

10 | MED |Diltiazem; 25 mg (Smg /ml) - Vial (xH 36.200 () $ 5.950 |@$ 3.570 |@5 3.650 |@$ 4.087

11 | MED |Dopamine; 200 mg /5 ml - Vial (xXH 90.750 | $ 9.500 |@$ 4,000 |D% 6.600 @5 3.268

12 | MED |Epinephrine 1:1,000; 30 mg /30 ml - Vial DS 322600(@ $ 270.000 | 334.100 (@5 284.850 |@$  282.170

13 | MED |Epinephrine 1:10,000; 1 mg / 10 ml - Luer B 66.500 (@ $ 9.650 | % 10.170 (35 9.050 |5 9.235

14 MED (Amidate); 40 mg / 20 ml - Vial DS 77.900 | $ 12.550 | @S 5.870 |@5 5.750 |@5 4.894

15 MED ;vegst:;y/lés‘-f:gl;ng/S mi - Vial Vendors quoting O 3 33.000 (@ S 89.810 (@S 1.780 (@S 3.000 No Bid

16 | MED |Glucagon; 1 mg (1 unit) vH 174.000 () $ 180.130 | 223.390 [ 199.000 (3%  289.800

17 | MED |Haloperidol; 5 mg/ 1 ml - Vial (xXH 41.000|D $ 7.450 | @5 1.110 | @5 0.360 (0% 5.581

18 | MED |Insta-Glucose; 31 g - Tube @5 11.550 |@ $ 3.490|@ $ 13.500 (D% 5.720 |@5 3.200 |(0$ 4.847 |(0% 5.680

19 | MED |Lasix (same as Furosemide?); 40 mg /4 ml - Luer (XH 123.700 | $ 11.150 ¢ 13.660 |@5 3.950 |@5 3.263
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LOWEST BID

3.48

6.83

0.14

0.99

0.27

10.34

36.57

3.57

270.00

4.89

174.00

3.20



BID SUBMITTAL FORM

21-015 Itemized Bid Form

Florida
Agni Enterprises, Discount
LLC (dba) Head to Drugs, Inc dba Medline

VENDOR Heels Safety Bound Tree Taylors HENRY Industries  QuadMed,
Name: Supplies Medical LLC Pharmacy  SCHEIN, INC Life Assist Inc. Inc.
Bid :em ITEM DESCRIPTION BRAND: MFG ITEM # Price each item Price each item Price each item Price each item | Price each item | Price each item| Price each item

20 | MED [Lidocaine; 100 mg /5 ml - Luer (XH 374100 $ 7.150 | @3 4.510 |@5 3.360 |@S 3.411

21 | MEeDp ::‘?:;ar::eb:g')e“msa 2gm/ Dextrose 5% / 500 mi - Pre- ©s  120800(@ $ 11750 |@$ 7.070 |@5 6.150 |@5 7.189

22| MED |Lopressor (Metoprolol); 5 mg /5 ml - Vial (XH 15.900 [ $ 2.880 @ 0.900 |@5 1.300 @5 0.849

23 MED [Magnesium Sulfate ; 5 gm / 10ml - Luer DS 225.300|@ $ 28.500 |@S 26.260 NO BID v3 21.141

24 | MED |Magnesium Sulfate ; 5 gm / 10ml - Vial (XH 61.500 (@ $ 4.450 @S 2.220 |0% 6.500 @S 2.054

25 MED |Midazolam; 10 mg / 2 ml - Vial @] 14300 |Q $ 19.500 |@$ 1.520 (@3 2.400 No Bid

26 MED [Morphine Sulfate; 10 mg / 1 ml - Pre-filled O 3 16.850 |@ S 35.000 (@S 1.280 [(OS 8.350 No Bid

27 | MED |Narcan; 2 mg/2 ml - Luer @$ 3320000 $ 42.000 |@3 5.070 |( 35500 (% 34.616

28 | MED |Narcan; 2 mg/2ml- Vial @S 198500 NOTAVAILABLE NO BID @ 34616

29 | mMED Z‘:it;"g‘yce""‘ 50me /250 ml 200 meg / mi - Pre-mix @s  261370[@ ¢ 30.750 |@% 22.920 (@8 22500 |@ 23833

30 MED |Nitrolingual; 8.5 gm spray @H 186.300 [@ $ 203.900 @3 164.750 |@5 141110

31 MED [Norcuron (Vecuronium Bromide); 20 mg / 25 ml - Vial DS 87.900 |@ S 12.880 23.500 |@5 10.721

32 | MED |Odansetron; 4 mg /2 ml - Vial D s 9.250|D $ 0.950 |@5 0.390 |@5 0.500 |@% 0.487

33 | MED |Procainamide; 1000 mg /2 ml - Vial @$ 2,217.250| NOTAVAILABLE (@5 93.760 |@5 135.000 (@5 78935

34 MED [Rocuronium (Zemuron); 50 mg /5 ml - Vial DS 35.600 () S 4.750 (@S 2.950 |@5 2.550 (@S 3.527

35 | MED |Sodium Bicarbonate; 50 MEQ - Luer s  121750|@ S 14.450 | @5 15.850 @5 11.880 (@5  10.855

36 | MED |Sodium Chloride Flush; 10 ml - Luer ©H 0.320| $ 0.750 | @5 0.280 |@$ 0.320 |@% 0.516

37 | MED [Solu-Medrol; 125 mg/ 2 ml - Vial @S 255.000(@ $ 14.450 | @5 10.600 (@5 9.000 |@5 8.457

38 | MED [Succinylcholine; (200 mg / ml) 10 mi - Vial DS 624.000(@ $ 30.450 |@5 11.370 |@5 20000 (@5 21.227
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BID SUBMITTAL FORM 21-015 Itemized Bid Form Page 3 of 12

Florida
Agni Enterprises, Discount
LLC (dba) Head to Drugs, Inc dba Medline
VENDOR Heels Safety Bound Tree Taylors HENRY Industries QuadMed,
Name: Supplies Medical LLC Pharmacy  SCHEIN, INC Life Assist Inc. Inc.
5
id ::e"' ITEM DESCRIPTION BRAND: MFG ITEM # Price each item Price each item | Price eachitem | Price eachitem | Price each item | Price each item| Price eachitem | LOWEST BID
39 MED [Thiamine; 200 mg /2 ml - Vial DS 320.000|@ S 15.000 |@5 9.010 |@5 18.000 |@5 10.477 $ 9.01
40 | MED |Tranexamic Acid; 1000 mg / 10 ml - Vial @S 506.500(@ $ 16.500 |@5 5.340 | @5 7.150 |@5 11819 $ 5.34
41 | MED |Unistik 3 Extra Safety Lancets; 21G Depth 2.0 mm @3 0.190 |@ $ 7.600 NO BID @ 0.156 |@5 0.150 |@5 0.089 |@5 0.215 | $ 0.09
42 | MED |Vasopressin; 20 units / 1 ml - Vial DS 7,576.460|@ $ 295.440 (@5 283170 |@6 271.000 @5  221.839 $ 221.84
43 MED [Xoponex; 0.63 mg/ 3 ml - Unit dose x 18350 () S 2.250 |@s 0.650 |(S 1.560 @S 1.528 $ 0.65
4 | MED ';;::p'“m Bromide / Albuterol (DuoNeb), 0.5mg / s 11.100|0 $ 0.950 |@8 0240 |@s 0350 |@5 0281 $ 0.24
45 | MED |Ketamine, Class lll, 50mg / ml, 10ml Vial (xXH 74.200 (O $ 15.000 (@5 7.400 |0 15.000 No Bid $ 7.40
46 | MED |Levophed, 0.1%, 4mg/4ml Vial @S 253.900(@ $ 10.500 @5 11.650 (@5 10500 (@5 10744 $ 10.50
47 | MED |M.A.D. (Mucosal Atomization Device); (%3 14.490 |@ $ 3.500 NO BID s 6.670 |($ 6.500 |@$ 7.450 | @5 3614 | $ 3.50
48 IV [Sodium Cloride N.S.; 0.9%, 1000 ml bag Qs 2.200 NO BID (@3 2.770 |@% 3.100 |08 2.816 $ 2.20
49 IV [Sodium Cloride N.S.; 0.9%, 500 ml bag v 1.750 NO BID @ 2.710 |0% 3.000 |@$ 3.243 $ 175
Micro Drip Sets; Primary Gravity IV Set with SafeLine® B. BROWN PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM
50 IV [Split Septum Injection Site and ULTRASITE® Injection  [# US1160, US1160 (x3 4150 |@ $ 1.490 NO BID (@3 1.580 1.690 @5 1.417 |0 3.280 | $ 1.42
Site; 15 drops / ml (86" long) NO SUBSTITUTIONS
Micro Drip Sets; Primary Gravity IV Set with SafeLine® |B. BROWN PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM
51 IV |Split Septum Injection Site and ULTRASITE® Injection Site |# US1165, US1165 ©H 1.430 NO BID s 1.500 % 1550 |@5 1347 (@ 2975 | $ 135
; 60 drops / ml (86" long) NO SUBSTITUTIONS
SMITH'S MEDICAL PRODUCT
52 IV |Protective IV Plus Catheters; 14 ga x 1.25" ONLY; ITEM # 3068-01; 3068-01 (x3 3270 |@ S 1330 NO BID @s 1330 1500 |@% 25519 | 1429 | $ 133
NO SUBSTITUTIONS
SMITH'S MEDICAL PRODUCT
53 IV |Protective IV Plus Catheters; 16 ga x 1.25" ONLY; ITEM # 3062-01; 3062-01 (3 3.270 |@ $ 1330 NO BID @3 1330 (% 1.500 |@% 2,519 (0% 1429 [ § 133
NO SUBSTITUTIONS
SMITH'S MEDICAL PRODUCT
54 IV |Protective IV Plus Catheters; 18 ga x 1.25" ONLY; ITEM # 3065-01; 3065-01 (@3 3270 |@ $ 1330 NO BID (x3 13.330 (@S 1.500 [@$ 2519 |@ 1429 | $ 133
NO SUBSTITUTIONS
SMITH'S MEDICAL PRODUCT
55 IV |Protective IV Plus Catheters; 20 ga x 1.25" ONLY; ITEM # 3066-01; 3066-01 (3 3.270 |@ $ 1330 NO BID @5 1330 (05 1.500 |@% 2,519 (0% 1.429 | § 133
NO SUBSTITUTIONS
SMITH'S MEDICAL PRODUCT
56 IV |Protective IV Plus Catheters; 22 ga x 1" ONLY; ITEM # 3060-01; 3060-01 (x3 3270 |@ S 1330 NO BID @3 1330 1.500 [@$ 2,519 (0% 1429 | $ 133
NO SUBSTITUTIONS
SMITH'S MEDICAL PRODUCT
57 IV |Protective IV Plus Catheters; 24 ga x 0.75" ONLY; ITEM # 3063-01; 3063-01 (3 3.270 |@ $ 1330 NO BID @3 1330 (% 1.500 |@% 2,519 (0% 1429 | $ 1.33
NO SUBSTITUTIONS

21-015 ITB NOIA Page 4 of 13

ITB 21-015 Basic and Advanced Life Support Pharmaceuticals and Supplies



BID SUBMITTAL FORM

21-015 Itemized Bid Form

Florida
Agni Enterprises, Discount
LLC (dba) Head to Drugs, Inc dba Medline
VENDOR Heels Safety Bound Tree Taylors HENRY Industries  QuadMed,
Name: Supplies Medical LLC Pharmacy  SCHEIN, INC Life Assist Inc. Inc.
Bid It
! M em ITEM DESCRIPTION BRAND: MFG ITEM # Price each item Price each item Price each item | Price each item | Price each item | Price each item| Price each item
SMITH'S MEDICAL PRODUCT
Acuvance Plus Safety L.V. Self-Blunting Needle Catheter; - . .
58 L o ONLY; ITEM # 3358; 3358 (3 3.110 | $ 1.950 NO BID @5 1.330 |08 2.130 (@8 2.397
8 NO SUBSTITUTIONS
BAXTER PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM #
59 IV [LV. Solution Dextrose Injection D5SW; 50 ml bag 2B0086; 2B0086 @ S 2.030 NO BID @S 2.060 2.080 |BS 2.884
NO SUBSTITUTIONS
BAXTER PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM #
60 IV |L.V. Solution Sodium Chloride Injection; 100 ml bag 281307; 281307 (X3 4470 |@ $ 2,020 NO BID @s 2,010 |@5 1.900 |(0$ 2.657
NO SUBSTITUTIONS
BECKTON-DICKINSON PRODUCT
61 IV [Cannula Dual Twinpak Syringe Filling Device ONLY; ITEM # 303390; 303390 (%3 0510 | $ 0.420 NO BID v3 0.400 |D$ 0.420 |@$ 0.415 |08 0.449
NO SUBSTITUTIONS
BECKTON-DICKINSON PRODUCT
62 IV [Hypodermic Syringe Needle; 25 ga x 5/8" ONLY; ITEM # 305122; 305122 @ 0120 [ $ 4.400 NO BID @5 0.088 (@S 0.110 (@S 0.090
NO SUBSTITUTIONS
BECKTON-DICKINSON PRODUCT
63 IV |Hypodermic Syringe Needle; 21 ga x 1 1/2" ONLY; ITEM # 305167; 305167 @ 0120 [ $ 5.370 NO BID @3 0.875 |@5 0.100 (@S 0.090
NO SUBSTITUTIONS
BECKTON-DICKINSON PRODUCT
64 IV |Hypodermic Syringe Needle; 18 ga x 1" ONLY; ITEM # 305195; 305195 X3 0.09 (@ $ 0.060 NO BID s 0.063 [(S 0.070 @8 0.065
NO SUBSTITUTIONS
Nurnbus Il Flex Adm\ms.trat\on Set with Tip Prot.ector, |NIMBUS PRODUCT ONLY;
Spike Cap, Cassette, Anti-free-flow Clamp, 1.2 micron Air| - )
65 o N N Manufacturer #HS006; HS006 ©H 8.720 NO BID (x3 9.000 No Bid @ 8430
Eliminating Baby Filter, Slide Clamp, Backcheck Valve, NO SUBSTITUTIONS
Male Luer Lock Adaptor, Luer Cap, 90.5in, Full Set
RUSCH CORPORATION PRODUCT 1.72 non
66 AIR |ET Tube Flexi Set, Cuffed; 5.0 mm ONLY; ITEM # 170050; 170050 re‘s osive NO BID 4.550 |@5 4.400 |5 5.103 |0 4.975
NO SUBSTITUTIONS P
RUSCH CORPORATION PRODUCT 1.72 non
67 AIR |ET Tube Flexi Set, Cuffed; 5.5 mm ONLY; ITEM # 170055; 170055 re‘s onsive NO BID 4.550 NO BID (%3 5.083 |@5 3.253
NO SUBSTITUTIONS P
RUSCH CORPORATION PRODUCT 1.72 non
68 AIR |ET Tube Flexi Set, Cuffed; 6.0 mm ONLY; ITEM # 170060; 170060 (%3 11.960 re‘s onsive NO BID 4.550 |@5 4.400 |8 5.216 |@5 4.036
NO SUBSTITUTIONS P
RUSCH CORPORATION PRODUCT 1.72 non
69 AIR |ET Tube Flexi Set, Cuffed; 6.5 mm ONLY; ITEM # 170065; 170065 (%3 11.960 re; onsive NO BID 4.550 4.400 |08 5.259 @5 3.253
NO SUBSTITUTIONS P
RUSCH CORPORATION PRODUCT 1.72 non
70 AIR |ET Tube Flexi Set, Cuffed; 7.0 mm ONLY; ITEM # 170070; 170070 (%3 11.150 re‘s onsive NO BID 4.550 4.400 |8 5.259 | @5 3.253
NO SUBSTITUTIONS P
RUSCH CORPORATION PRODUCT 1.72 non
71 AIR |ET Tube Flexi Set, Cuffed; 7.5 mm ONLY; ITEM # 170075; 170075 (%3 9.770 re‘s onsive NO BID 4.550 4.400 |8 5.259 |@5 3.253
NO SUBSTITUTIONS P

ITB 21-015 Basic and Advanced Life Support Pharmaceuticals and Supplies

21-015 ITB NOIA Page 5 of 13

Page 4 of 12

LOWEST BID

133

2.03

0.40

0.09

0.09
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BID SUBMITTAL FORM

21-015 Itemized Bid Form

Florida
Agni Enterprises, Discount
LLC (dba) Head to Drugs, Inc dba Medline
VENDOR Heels Safety Bound Tree Taylors HENRY Industries  QuadMed,
Name: Supplies Medical LLC Pharmacy  SCHEIN, INC Life Assist Inc. Inc.
Bid It
! M em ITEM DESCRIPTION BRAND: MFG ITEM # Price each item Price each item Price each item Price each item | Price each item | Price each item| Price each item
RUSCH CORPORATION PRODUCT S
72 AR |ET Tube Flexi Set, Cuffed; 8.0 mm ONLY; ITEM # 170080; 170080 (x3 1as0 | e NO BID 4.550 4.400 @ 5.083 |@5 3.253
NO SUBSTITUTIONS P
RUSCH CORPORATION PRODUCT 172 non
73 AR |ET Tube Flexi Set, Cuffed; 8.5 mm ONLY; ITEM # 170085; 170085 (x3 13640 | e NO BID 4.550 NO BID s 5.083 |@5 4.036
NO SUBSTITUTIONS P
RUSCH CORPORATION PRODUCT 172 non
74 AR |ET Tube Flexi Set, Cuffed; 9.0 mm ONLY; ITEM # 170090; 170090 remonsive NO BID 4.540 NO BID (x3 4.840 @5 3.253
NO SUBSTITUTIONS P
RUSCH CORPORATION PRODUCT 172 non
75 AR |ET Tube Flexi Set, Uncuffed; 2.5 mm ONLY; ITEM # 150025; 150025 3 1299 NO BID @ 4.100 |@5 1520 |@6 582222 |@ 4.036
NO SUBSTITUTIONS P
RUSCH CORPORATION PRODUCT R
76 AR |ET Tube Flexi Set, Uncuffed; 3.0 mm ONLY; ITEM # 150030; 150030 @ 12990 NO BID @3 4.100 | @5 1520 |@6 581498 |@ 4.036
NO SUBSTITUTIONS P
RUSCH CORPORATION PRODUCT 172 non
77 AR |ET Tube Flexi Set, Uncuffed; 3.5 mm ONLY; ITEM # 150035; 150035 remonsive NO BID (x3 4.100 |@5 1520 NoBid |6 4.036
NO SUBSTITUTIONS P
RUSCH CORPORATION PRODUCT 172 non
78 AR |ET Tube Flexi Set, Uncuffed; 4.0 mm ONLY; ITEM # 150040; 150040 reonsive NO BID @3 4.100 |@5 1520 (@  581.509 |@5 4.036
NO SUBSTITUTIONS P
RUSCH CORPORATION PRODUCT 172 non
79 AR |ET Tube Flexi Set, Uncuffed; 4.5 mm ONLY; ITEM # 150045; 150045 (x3 12340 NO BID 4.100 |@5 1520 NoBid  |@% 3.253
NO SUBSTITUTIONS P
RUSCH CORPORATION PRODUCT 172 non
80 AR |ET Tube Flexi Set, Uncuffed; 5.0 mm ONLY; ITEM # 150050; 150050 3 1299 NO BID @ 4.100 | @5 1520 |@6  582.349 |@ 4.036
NO SUBSTITUTIONS P
RUSCH CORPORATION PRODUCT 3.8 non
81 AR |ET Tube Slick-Set, Uncuffed; 5.5 mm ONLY; ITEM # 150055; 150055 remonsive NO BID 3 1.520 NoBid |6 3.855
NO SUBSTITUTIONS P
COVIDIEN PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM
82 | CAR |Meditrace Electrodes, Kendall 530 Foam Electrode, Adult|# 31013926; 31013926 (@5 0.220 |@ $ 3.200 NO BID @3 0.160 |@5 0.160 |@5 0.186 |5 0.118
NO SUBSTITUTIONS
COVIDIEN PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM
Meditrace Electrodes, Kendall 135 Foam Electrode, ’
83 | AR P;‘,;t":cce ectrodes, Fenca ©oam Electroce 4 31439766; 31439766 |@$ 0260 @ $ 2.330 NO BID @3 0199 @3 0.200 |@5 0235 |@ 0.205
NO SUBSTITUTIONS
V. Extension set, 8", removable leur locking site, pinch ~ N
84 v , ) ) 0.960 NO BID ( 0.940 1.700 0.839 ¢ 0.952
clamp, spin lock connection O3 @s ©s @ @
COVIDIEN PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM
85 | MSC |Web Alcohol Preps 1 6818; 6818 @5 0.010 | $ 1.900 NO BID @3 1550 |@5 0.010 (@5 0.010 |@5 0.008
NO SUBSTITUTIONS
DYNAREX PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM
86 | MSC |Gallant Disposable Prep Razors #4251; 4251 (x3 0550 [ $ 0.340 NO BID @s 0.307 |@% 0.340 % 0.395 |05 0.352
NO SUBSTITUTIONS
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BID SUBMITTAL FORM 21-015 Itemized Bid Form Page 6 of 12

Florida
Agni Enterprises, Discount
LLC (dba) Head to Drugs, Inc dba Medline
VENDOR Heels Safety Bound Tree Taylors HENRY Industries QuadMed,
Name: Supplies Medical LLC Pharmacy  SCHEIN, INC Life Assist Inc. Inc.
Bid ::e"' ITEM DESCRIPTION BRAND: MFG ITEM # Price each item Price each item | Price eachitem | Price eachitem | Price each item | Price each item| Price eachitem | LOWEST BID

DYNAREX PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM

87 | MSC |Providine-lodine Prep Pads i 1108; 1108 3 0070 @ $ 4.000 NO BID 3 0.031 |@5 0.040 | @5 0.040 | @5 0.036 | $ 0.03
NO SUBSTITUTIONS
3M PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 1527

88 MSC |Transpore Surgical Tape; %" x 10 yards 0; 1527-0 @3 0.850 |@ S 7.950 NO BID @S 0.500 |@S 0.600 (@S 0.630 |@5 0417 | $ 0.42
NO SUBSTITUTIONS
3M PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 1527-

89 MSC |Transpore Surgical Tape; 1” x 10 yards 1 1527-1 @ 1630 (@S 7.950 NO BID @5 1.000 (S 1.150 |08 1.196 (@5 0.767 | $ 0.77
NO SUBSTITUTIONS

. . CARDINAL HEALTH PRODUCT

%0 v J;/g'5:‘;:']::2;:‘::‘;:"”5 Needles; 15gax3/8" =1 |\ v. 1Tem # DINI515X; DIN1515X 93 9.500 NO BID s 20.880 12250 |@ 21669 |05 14285 | $ 9.50
NO SUBSTITUTIONS

91 | MSC |Diagnostic Pen Light with Pupil Gauge (x3 11.190 [© $ 5.100 NO BID 3 0.600 | @5 0.720 |@$ 0.620 | @5 0695 | $ 0.60
BAXTER PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM #

92 IV [Interlink Injection Site, Male Luer Lock Adapter 2N3399; 2N3399 (x3 3330 @S 1.650 NO BID (@3 1510 NO BID s 2.033 |@ 1402 | $ 1.40
NO SUBSTITUTIONS
CONMED PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM #

93 IV |Adult Veni-Guard 705-4431; 705-4431 @S 0.001 | $ 36.000 NO BID @5 0.420 |@5 0380 | @5 0.466 | @5 0329 $ 0.00
NO SUBSTITUTIONS
COVIDIEN PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM

9 IV [Sharps Container, red / white; 1 gt # 8900SA; 8900SA (3 2180 [@ $ 1.780 NO BID @s 1.720 | @5 1.750 @S 2544 | 1785 | $ 172
NO SUBSTITUTIONS
COVIDIEN PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM

95 IV [Sharps Container, red / white; 5 qt i 31144010; 31144010 | 4540 |© S 4.270 NO BID @3 4.070 | 4.200 | 4.209 | @5 3571 (8 3.57
NO SUBSTITUTIONS
BECKTON-DICKINSON PRODUCT

9% IV [BD™ Multi-Use One-Piece Sharps Collector; 3.3 qt ONLY; ITEM # 305488; 305488 (x5 6.110 [D $ 4.800 NO BID @5 4.400 | 4.500 % 4.542 |08 5642 | $ 4.40
NO SUBSTITUTIONS
CURAPLEX PRODUCT; ITEM #

97 AIR |Laryngoscope Blade, Miller; #0 Premature 2145-13501 (3 7530 |@ S 4.450 NO BID ‘QS 3.270 |@3 4.000 |5 50.410 |@5 4.761 | $ 3.27
OR EQUIVALENT
CURAPLEX PRODUCT; ITEM #

98 | AR |Laryngoscope Blade, Miller; #1 Infant 2145-13502 @3 649 |@ $ 4.450 NO BID ‘os 3.270 |@s 4000 [@ 50410 |@5 4821 $ 3.27
OR EQUIVALENT

_ ; CURAPLEX PRODUCT; ITEM # n

99 | AR |Laryngoscope Blade, Miller; #2 Child 2145.13503 OR EQUIVALENT @ 43930 |@ $ 4.450 NO BID ‘os 3.270 |@s 4000 (@ 51410 |@ 4761 $ 3.27
CURAPLEX PRODUCT; ITEM #

100 | AIR |Laryngoscope Blade, Miller; #3 Medium Adult 2145-13504 (3 649 |@ $ 4.450 NO BID ‘os 3.270 |@s 4.000 [@ 32950 |08 4761 $ 3.27
OR EQUIVALENT
CURAPLEX PRODUCT; ITEM #

101 | AIR |Laryngoscope Blade, Macintosh; #2 Child 2145-13402 (x3 6.490 [ $ 4.450 NO BID ‘os 3.270 4.000 @ 4.023 |08 4761 $ 3.27
OR EQUIVALENT
CURAPLEX PRODUCT; ITEM #

102 | AIR |Laryngoscope Blade, Macintosh; #3 Medium Adult 2145-13403 (x3 6.490 [ $ 4.450 NO BID ‘os 3.270 | 4.000 @ 4.023 |08 4761 $ 3.27
OR EQUIVALENT
CURAPLEX PRODUCT; ITEM #

103 | AIR [|Laryngoscope Blade, Macintosh; #4 Large Adult 2145-13404 @ 6.490 |@ $ 4.450 NO BID @3 3.270 |@s 4.000 (@5 4023 @5  4,821.000 | $ 3.27
OR EQUIVALENT
FOUGERA PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM

104 | AIR [Surgilube Lubricant; Foilpac; 5 g i 0281-0205-45; 0281-0205-45 053 0.170 NO BID (x5 0.180 |@5 0.040 | 0.187 [ 0.084 | § 0.04
NO SUBSTITUTIONS
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BID SUBMITTAL FORM

21-015 Itemized Bid Form

Florida
Agni Enterprises, Discount
LLC (dba) Head to Drugs, Inc dba Medline
VENDOR Heels Safety Bound Tree Taylors HENRY Industries  QuadMed,
Name: Supplies Medical LLC Pharmacy  SCHEIN, INC Life Assist Inc. Inc.
Bid It
! M em ITEM DESCRIPTION BRAND: MFG ITEM # Price each item Price each item Price each item Price each item | Price each item | Price each item| Price each item
Detector Bulb Model, Tube Chek- |12V PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM i
105 | AR |o 000172002; 172002 (x3 9.640 |@ S 1.870 NO BID @5 2.100 |@5 2.782
NO SUBSTITUTIONS
SALTER LABS PRODUCT ONLY;
Full Kit Nebulizer Set w / Mouthpiece, Tee Adapter, .
106 | AR ster'vmv: ;,' izer Set w / Mouthpiece, Tee Adapter, ITEM # 8900; @3 0540 NO BID @ 0620 |8 1.070 @ 0.630 |6 3595
. OR EQUIVALENT
Lsp Circuit Valve, B ve, Exhal ALLIED HEALTHCARE PRODUCT-
Disp; ;
107 | AR |Fitter-Adult Cuffed Mask, | +or FOR ONLY: FTEMH-21-L599-130EA:
AUTOVENT3999 NO-SUBSTITUTIONS
LAERDAL PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM #
108 | AIR |Thomas Endotrachael Tube Holder, Adult 600-10000; 600-10000 7.660 |@ $ 2.650 NO BID @3 2,670 |@5 2.650 |@S 2.666 3.273
NO SUBSTITUTIONS
LAERDAL PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM #
109 | AIR [Thomas Endotrachael Tube Holder, Child 600-20000; 600-20000 51.990 |@ $ 2.650 NO BID @3 2670 |@$ 2.650 |@5 3.679 | @ 3.809
NO SUBSTITUTIONS
COVIDIEN PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM
110 AIR |Combitube Roll-up Kit 37fr. #5-18437; 5-18437 51.990 |( 42.870 NO BID “3 40.970 |@5 41.450 % 67.988 |5 42,917
NO SUBSTITUTIONS
COVIDIEN PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM
111 | AR |Combitube Roll-up Kit 41fr. 1 5-18441; 5-18441 03 42.870 NO BID @5 40970 |@5 41450 | @5 67.988 [0S 42917
NO SUBSTITUTIONS
SUN MED PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM
112 | AIR |Coude Tip, Pediatric 10Fr x 70cm; 10 Fr x 70 cm, Bougie |# 2120-17010; 2120-17010 4.250 NO BID @5 3.830 | 6.750 |@5 3.720 | 6.909
NO SUBSTITUTIONS
SUN MED PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM
113 | AIR |Coude Tip, Adult 15Fr x 70cm; 15 Fr x 70 cm, Bougie [ 9-0212-70; 9-0212-70 03 4.250 NO BID @3 3.830 | 6.750 |@5 3.720 | @ 7.119
NO SUBSTITUTIONS
BECKTON-DICKINSON Leur Lock
114 | MSC |30 ml Syringe; Tip ; ITEM # 301626; (3 0.450 NO BID @3 0.180 0.225 0.226
OR EQUIVALENT
BECKTON-DICKINSON Leur Lock
115 | MSC |10 ml Syringe Luer-lock Tip Tip; ITEM # 309604; 13 0.160 @ $ 0.170 NO BID @s 0.078 |0 0.100 |8 0.093 |@5 0.081
OR EQUIVALENT
BECKTON-DICKINSON PRODUCT
116 | MSC |1cc u-100 Insulin Syrenge ONLY; ITEM # 329424; 329424 0.370 0.540 NO BID 3 0.271 |@5 0.280 |@5 0.280
NO SUBSTITUTIONS
BECKTON-DICKINSON Leur Lock
117 | MSC |1 ml Syringe Tip; ITEM # 309602; 0.080 NO BID 0.110 0.120 |@3 0.058 |@ 0.127
OR EQUIVALENT
BECKTON-DICKINSON PRODUCT
118 | MSC |3 ml Syringe Luer-Lok Tip ONLY; ITEM # 309657; 309657 (x3 0.100 | 0.080 NO BID 0.065 0.070 |@5 0.058 |@5 0.060
NO SUBSTITUTIONS
Naso-gastric or Gastri tube; 42 inch L, 8 French, . .
119 | AR |\ 2so-gastricorGastric sump tube; 42 inc renc E 6.920 NO BID @ 1.380 |0 6300 |0$ 1.963 | @ 6.595
2.7 mm OD
Naso-gastric or Gastric sump tube; 48 inch L, 12 French,
120 AR 1. NO BID 1.7 2. 1.905
0 4.0 mm 0D 930 @s 80 | @5 088
Naso-gastric or Gastri tube; 48 inch L, 14 French, . .
121 | AR |\2sOBastricorGastric sump tube; 48 Inc rend 3940 |0 $ 1.930 NO BID @3 1.780 | @5 1.800 [@$ 2.088 |05 1.905
4.7 mm OD
1 | ar gzs;rg:ségc or Gastric sump tube; 48 inch L, 16 French, 1930 NOBID o 1740 |@s 2053 |@s 1905
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$ 1.87
$ 0.54
$ 2.65
$ 265
$ 40.97
$ 40.97
$ 3.72
$ 3.72
$ 0.18
$ 0.08
$ 0.27
$ 0.06
$ 0.06
$ 1.38
$ 1.78
$ 1.78
$ 1.74
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Florida
Agni Enterprises, Discount
LLC (dba) Head to Drugs, Inc dba Medline
VENDOR Heels Safety Bound Tree Taylors HENRY Industries  QuadMed,
Name: Supplies Medical LLC Pharmacy  SCHEIN, INC Life Assist Inc. Inc.
5
id ::e"' ITEM DESCRIPTION BRAND: MFG ITEM # Price each item Price each item | Price eachitem | Price eachitem | Price each item | Price each item| Price eachitem | LOWEST BID
123 | msc (cl",gp"”"d Tinture of Benzoin U.5.P., 10% Swabstick s 34.000 NO BID @3 0240 | @5 0390 |@6 0.240 |@ 0386 | $ 0.24
Curaplex ECG Chart Paper Thermal 108mm Red Grid . - .
124 | CAR oo Control LP15 or equivalent © s 1.380 NO BID (@3 1.590 1.600 @S 2.668 |5 1580 | $ 138
125 | MSC |Nail Polish Remover Pad @3 0.070 |@ $ 4.000 NO BID @3 0.024 |@5 0.030 |@$ 0.030 |5 0014 | $ 0.01
126 | cap |Curaplexselect Multifunction Defib Pads Physio Control | ;oo 3 128.700 |@ $ 17.250 NO BID @ 15.100 |@5 17750 |@8 13750 |@  14,117.000 | $ 13.75
Pediatric 10 PR/CS
127 | cap |Curaplex Select Multifunction Defib Pads Physio Control | | ooy x3 70.140 |@ $ 16.080 NO BID @3 15.100 |06 17.750 (@6 13.750 (@ 14117 | $ 13.75
Adult 10 PR/CS
Supraglottic Airway Kit, King LTS-D Adult, incl Tube, 60cc . . .
128 | AR | Lube, Yellow, Size 3 (x3 90610 (D $ 30.000 NO BID @3 6.670 34.800 (@6 39.588 |($ 35714 | $ 6.67
Supraglottic Airway Kit, King LTS-D Adult, incl Tube, 60cc - . .
12 AR 90.610 | . NO BID 670 | 34.800 ¢ .588 | 35.714 X
9 syringe, Lube, Red, Size 4 (x3 (] 30.000 3 6.670 (06 D5 39.588 (DS $ 6.67
Supraglottic Airway Kit, King LTS-D Adult, incl Tube, 60cc . . .
B0 | AR | e Lube, Purple, Size 5 (x3 90610 (D $ 30.000 NO BID @3 6.670 34.800 (@8 39.588 |($ 34.714 | $ 6.67
ETT Capnography Filterline Set Nonhumidified,
131 | AR . NO BID ! 1250 |( . 6.950 e
3 Intubated, Adult/Pediatric s 60.000 @s 6050 |@5 5250 /@5 9900 |@6 $ 228
Nasal Capnography Smart Capnoline Plus Non-intubated,| o
132 | AR o el W/02 Tubing, Adult/intermediate (X 72.000 NO BID @3 5.220 | @5 5750 |($ 20344 |@5 6.090 | $ 5.22
133 | TMA | 3" Conforming Stretch Gauze Bandage @9 0.650 |@ $ 0.840 NO BID @5 0.090 |@s 0.100 |@$ 0.161 |@5 0.063 | $ 0.06
TMA | 1" hypo-allergenic cloth tape 3 1.020 (@ $ 8.350 NO BID @S 0.670 |@5 0.700 |@5 0.496 |@5 0533 | $ 0.50
134
135 | TMA | 3" hypo-allergenic cloth tape Qs 3.060 |@ $ 8.350 NO BID @3 2,010 |D% 2.030 |@S 1.488 (@ 1.600 | $ 1.49
TMA | 1" Band-Aids 3 0030 | $ 1300 NO BID @3 0.013 |@5 0.020 (@5 0.012 |@ 0032 $ 0.01
136
TMA | 2" Band-Aids @3 0.070 |@ $ 5.000 NO BID @3 0.054 |@5 0.060 |@S$ 0.048 |@5 0.051 | $ 0.05
137
TMA | 5"x9" sterile ABD pads @ 0.190 | $ 2.400 NO BID @3 0.080 |@5 0.080 |@5 0.087 |@5 0.09 | $ 0.08
138
TMA | 4"x4", 4-ply sterile sponges @3 0.070 |@ $ 37.000 NO BID @3 0.024 |@5 0.070 |@5 0.024 | @ 0.052 | $ 0.02
139
TMA | 4"x4", 8-ply unsterile sponges @5 0.020 | $ 2.800 NO BID @5 0.013 NO BID 3 0.010 (&5 0.009 | $ 0.01
140
TMA | 2”x2”,12 ply sterile gauze pads @5 0110 | $ 2.600 NO BID @9 2.030 | @5 0.020 (@S 0.021 |@5 0017 | $ 0.02
141

21-015 ITB NOIA Page 9 of 13

ITB 21-015 Basic and Advanced Life Support Pharmaceuticals and Supplies



BID SUBMITTAL FORM 21-015 Itemized Bid Form Page 9 of 12

Florida
Agni Enterprises, Discount
LLC (dba) Head to Drugs, Inc dba Medline
VENDOR Heels Safety Bound Tree Taylors HENRY Industries  QuadMed,
Name: Supplies Medical LLC Pharmacy  SCHEIN, INC Life Assist Inc. Inc.
5
id ::e"‘ ITEM DESCRIPTION BRAND: MFG ITEM # Price each item Price each item | Price eachitem | Price eachitem | Price each item | Price each item| Price eachitem | LOWEST BID
TMA | Triangular bandages-indiv. Wrapped @ 0510 |@ $ 4.600 NO BID @ 0.340 | @5 0.290 |@5 0.222 | @ 0.295 | $ 0.22
142
TMA | Adult multigrip head immobilizer 1-TEC PRODUCT ONLY; (3 7.530 |@ S 4.290 NO BID @3 4.330 |@5 4150 (@ 65.159 |@ 4.166 | $ 415
143 NO SUBSTITUTIONS
TMA | Child multigrip head immobilizer I-TEC PRODUCT ONLY; (X3 7.530 | $ 4.190 NO BID s 4.330 |0% 4.150 |@5 3.898 |(0% 4.166 | $ 3.90
144 NO SUBSTITUTIONS
7 ft. Oxygen cannula - adult with curved tip (%3 9.480 |@ $ 0.240 NO BID @5 0.400 | @5 0.250 |@S 0.300 |@5 0381 $ 0.24
145 | AR
7 ft. Oxygen cannula - pediatric with curved tip (%3 9.480 |@ S 0.270 NO BID @5 0.390 | @5 0.500 (@S 0.650 |@5 0305 | $ 0.27
146 | AR
7 ft. Non-rebreathing mask with check valve - adult O s 0.700 NO BID %3 0.820 0.670 (% 0.730 |@5 0659 | $ 0.66
147 | AR
Single use restraint straps; 2 piece 2" x 5' (xXH 5.600 NO BID @s 1.440 (@3 1.720 |0% 2.050 @5 1607 | § 1.44
148 | MsC
ALLCARE PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM #
Disposable fitted sheets for stretcher; 30"x72" EF600; x5 38.000 NO BID @5 1210 NO BID @ 0.831 |@ 1209 | $ 0.83
149 | MsC NO SUBSTITUTIONS EF600
Fluid resistant flat sheets; dask-blue @5 1.350 (@ $ 24.500 NO BID @5 0.600 |@5 1.230 (@S 1.620 (@5 0.564 | $ 0.56
150 | MsC
Multi-trauma dressing 10x30 %3 3.000 | $ 0.850 NO BID @3 0.710 0.800 |@5 0.572 |08 0833 $ 0.57
151 | TMA
Regulator Brass w/2 50psi ports 1-25 lpm LSP Rhino Qs 110340 (@ $  194.940 NO BID @ 24.940 (08 149.500 NoBid  |@5 27.987 | $ 24.94
152 | AR
7 ft. non-rebreathing mask with check valve - child O s 0.800 NO BID %3 1.200 0.820 @5 0.710 |08 0771 $ 0.71
153 | AR
7 ft. oxygen mask - high concentration infant Curaplex Itemi 30058 93 0950 NO BID s 1.180 1.260 % 4384 |08 1.500 | § 0.95
154 AR or equivalent
AMBU PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM #
Ambu-Spur Il resuscitator mask, adult 520-211-000; @ 19.160 (@ $ 8.700 NO BID @3 9.170 | @5 8.850 (@5 11416 |@5  9,836.000 | $ 8.70
155 | AR NO SUBSTITUTIONS 520-211-000
AMBU PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM #
Ambu-Spur Il resuscitator mask, infant/child 530-212-000; %3 22.470 |@ S 9.550 NO BID @3 11.670 |05 14.250 |@$ 16.160 |()S 13.590 | $ 9.55
156 | AR NO SUBSTITUTIONS 530-212-000
Disposable economical blanket @ 1.750 NO BID @3 1.110 (@S 3.800 [0S 3.258 @ 0878 | $ 0.88
157 | MsC
BEMIS PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM #
Disposable suction canisters, 1200 CC 484410; X3 13.610 | $ 2.750 NO BID @3 2.620 | 2.600 |@S 1.996 |0$ 269 | $ 2.00
158 | AR NO SUBSTITUTIONS 484410
Universal suction tubing 1/4" x 100" @ 17.440 (@S 112.000 NO BID @3 11.400 12.390 |@% 8270 @ 0952 $ 0.95
159 | AR
Large- i h ith th I-
arge-bore suction catheter with thumb contro o 0.4%0 NOBID o 0340 | @5 0.360 |6 1001 |8 178 | 8 nen
160 AR Yankaur only
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BID SUBMITTAL FORM

21-015 Itemized Bid Form

Florida
Agni Enterprises, Discount
LLC (dba) Head to Drugs, Inc dba Medline
VENDOR Heels Safety Bound Tree Taylors HENRY Industries  QuadMed,
Name: Supplies Medical LLC Pharmacy  SCHEIN, INC Life Assist Inc. Inc.
B
id :em ITEM DESCRIPTION BRAND: MFG ITEM # Price each item Price each item Price each item | Price each item | Price each item | Price each item| Price each item
Cold packs (3 2.750 |@ $ 0.200 NO BID s 0.430 |0$ 0.400 |@% 0.609 |5 0.347
161 MSC
Latex-free Tourniquets @5 0.140 | $ 20.000 NO BID @5 0.090 |@5 0.100 (@S 0.100 (&5 0.084
162 \Y%
Plastic urinals (X3 1230 |@ $ 0,540 NO BID 3 0380 (@5 0.170 |0$ 0.400 | 1204
163 MsC
Disposable sterile burn sheets (%3 15.820 |@ $ 1.900 NO BID @S 1.370 (@S 1.900 (@S 1.896 (@5 2.012
164 TMA
Powder-free nitrile medical exam gloves; small @ 0.180 | $ 20.000 NO BID @ 0.134 |@s 0.270 |@$ 0.168
165 PPE
Powder-free nitrile medical exam gloves; medium @5 0.180 | $ 20.000 NO BID @S 0.134 | @S 0.270 |@S 0.201
166 PPE
Powder-free nitrile medical exam gloves; large 3 0180 (@ $ 20.000 NO BID @ 0.134 (@5 0.270 | @ 0.201
167 PPE
Powder-free nitrile medical exam gloves; x-large @5 0.180 | $ 20.000 NO BID @S 0.149 |@5 0.270 |@S 0.223
168 PPE
Powder-free nitrile medical exam gloves; xx-large V3 0180 (@ $ 13.500 NOBID @5 0.270 | @ 0.279
169 PPE
Bio-Hazardous red bags; 5 gallon (%3 0310 |@ $ 0.090 NO BID @5 0.100 |@5 0.100 No Bid @3 0.138
170 PPE
Bio-Hazardous red bags; 30 gallon (3 0.350 |@ $ 0.190 NO BID s 0.200 |D% 0.210 NoBid |08 0.210
171 PPE
SstiffNeck cervical Immobilization device {CID); Baby N LAERDAL PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM #
N;ck eck cervicalimmobilization device {CID); Baby No1gg109 ; (x3 8320 | $ 5.450 NO BID s 4910 @5 4350 |(0% 5578 |08 5204
172 TMA NO SUBSTITUTIONS 980100
LAERDAL PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM #
StiffNeck cervical immobilization device (CID); pediatric|980200; (x5 8180 [0 $ 5450 NO BID 3 4910 (@5 4350 |(0% 5585 |05 5.142
173 T™MA NO SUBSTITUTIONS 980200
LAERDAL PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM #
stiffNeck cervical immobilization device (CID); regular |980500; (x3 8.180 | $ 5.450 NO BID @3 4.910 |@5 4.350 |08 5.585 [0 5.142
174 TMA NO SUBSTITUTIONS 980500
LAERDAL PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM #
StiffNeck cervical immobilization device (CID); tall 980600; (x3 8370 |0 $ 5.450 NO BID s 4910 (@5 4350 |(0$ 6.095 |5 5204
175 T™MA NO SUBSTITUTIONS 980600
LAERDAL PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM #
stiffNeck cervical immobilization device (CID); short ~ |980400; (xS 8320|D S 5.450 NO BID @3 4.910 |@5 4.350 |8 5.585 (06 5.204
176 T™MA NO SUBSTITUTIONS 980400
LAERDAL PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM #
StiffNeck cervical immobilization device (CID); no neck [980300; (x3 8320 |0 S 5.450 NO BID 3 4910 (@5 4350 |(0$ 5.585 |05 5.268
177 T™MA NO SUBSTITUTIONS 980300
Bio-Hoop collection bag with hook 3 2780 |@ $ 10.200 NO BID @S 1.670 (@S 1.600 (@5 1.560 (@5 1.718
178 MsC
POSEY PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM #:
Posey double strap foam limb holders, standard foam [2530; (X3 9.340 | $ 5.970 NO BID 3 5.560 [(S 6.100 @8 4.922 | @ 3.939
179 MsC NO SUBSTITUTIONS 2530
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0.20

0.08

0.17
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0.13

0.13

0.13

0.15

0.18

0.09

0.19

4.35

4.35

4.35

1.56



BID SUBMITTAL FORM

21-015 Itemized Bid Form

Florida
Agni Enterprises, Discount
LLC (dba) Head to Drugs, Inc dba Medline
VENDOR Heels Safety Bound Tree Taylors HENRY Industries  QuadMed,
Name: Supplies Medical LLC Pharmacy  SCHEIN, INC Life Assist Inc. Inc.
B
id :em ITEM DESCRIPTION BRAND: MFG ITEM # Price each item Price each item Price each item | Price each item | Price each item | Price each item| Price each item
Pediatric IV arm board, padded (%3 2400 |D S 0.910 NO BID @9 0.630 |5 1.150 @S 0.305 |@5 0.293
180 \Y%
12" Cardboard Splints w/Foam Padding Case O S 1.150 NO BID 0.670 1.100 (@S 1.264 |05 1.036
181 T™MA
24" Cardboard Splints w/Foam Padding Case @©F 1.680 NO BID &5 1.130 |@$ 1.950 (@S 2,097 |05 1.464
182 T™MA
Sprague Rappaport Style Stethoscope (%3 12.040 |@ $ 4.100 NO BID @3 7.100 8.350 |($ 7.560 |@5 4.083
183 MsC
Dupont Tyvek Coveralls w/ Hood & Boots (%3 7.940 6.550 NO BID 7.360 No Bid
184 PPE Sizes S through XXL
Antiseptic BioHand Sanitizer; 4 oz. Qs 1.160 [@ $ 1.250 NO BID @3 1.100 |@% 1.000 (@5 0.622
185 msC
ADC PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 760-
Blood pressure cuff; blue, adult 11AN; (%3 67.030 (@ $ 15.950 NO BID 15.780 |@5 17.250 |@$ 22.506 |@5 17.166
186 MsC NO SUBSTITUTIONS 760-11AN
ADC PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 760-
Blood pressure cuff; blue, child 9CN; B 15.950 NO BID 15.780 @ 15850 [@  22.816 | 17.166
187 MsC NO SUBSTITUTIONS 760-9CN
ADC PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 760-
Blood pressure cuff; blue, infant 7IN; @3 15.950 NO BID @ 15.780 |@5 15.850 | 23.334 |08 17.373
188 MsC NO SUBSTITUTIONS 760-7IN
ADC PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 760-
Blood pressure cuff; blue, adult large 12XN; (%3 86.010 |@ $ 19.320 NO BID &5 19.220 (@5 19.250 (@$ 27.761 | @5 21.168
189 | MsC NO SUBSTITUTIONS 760-12XN
Sterile Water, 1000 ml bottles x3 17.820 |@ $ 2.150 NO BID s 1.600 2.700 (@S 2.250
190 MsC
Sterile Water, 500 ml bottles (%3 3210 |@ S 1.500 NO BID @5 1.510 |@% 2.600 |08 1.734
191 MsC
Sterile Water, 250 ml bottles 3 2710 (@ $ 34.050 NO BID @s 1.240 |@s 2.800 |@5 1.160
192 MsC
Technol PFR 95 Respirator — Regular (X8 109.990 NO BID @5 1.490 |@5 2.460 |@5 1.440 | @5 2.142
193 PPE
Technol PFR 95 Respirator — Small X8 109.990 NO BID @s 1.490 |@3 2.460 |@S 1.401 @ 2.349
194 PPE
[IRON DUCK PRODUCT ONLY;
Back Boards- Ultravue 18” NP ITEM # 35755; 364.540 |@ S 128.500 NO BID 3 136.250 NO BID @S 137161 |0 167.144
195 T™MA NO SUBSTITUTIONS 35755
Thermal Blankets 15450 |@ $ 0.410 NO BID @5 0.420 | @5 0.430 (@8 7.040 (@5 0.366
196 MsC
SAM MEDICAL PRODUCT ONLY;
Sam Splint, 36" roll ITEM # W-SP1121; W-SP1121 vH 7.050 NO BID V3 6.540 (@5 7.500 |@6  479.826 (@5 8.130
197 T™MA NO SUBSTITUTIONS
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Florida
Agni Enterprises, Discount
LLC (dba) Head to Drugs, Inc dba Medline
VENDOR Heels Safety Bound Tree Taylors HENRY Industries  QuadMed,
Name: Supplies Medical LLC Pharmacy  SCHEIN, INC Life Assist Inc. Inc.
Bid Ite
! . em ITEM DESCRIPTION BRAND: MFG ITEM # Price each item Price each item | Price eachitem | Price eachitem | Price each item | Price each item| Price eachitem | LOWEST BID
0B Kits - Soft Pack 6.250 NOBID @ 4.620 @3 8520 @ 4940 | $ 262
198 | msc
Eye Wash, 4 0z <3 2670 @ $ 2.680 NO BID @ 1.790 |( 2.050 |@% 2.320 |6 2730 | $ 179
199 | msc
NORTH AMERICAN PRODUCT
CAT Tourniquet ONLY; ITEM 23140; 23140 23.690 NO BID @S 21.140 | @5 21.000 |5 26.163 |(S 23330 | $ 21.00
200 | T™A NO SUBSTITUTIONS
PULMODYNE PRODUCT ONLY;
02 MAX BiTrac ED Mask, w/Neb, Adult LG, w/3-SET .
o iTrac ED Mask, w/Neb, Adult LG, w/ ITEM # REF 313-7555XN; REF 313-7555XN 03 39.860 NO BID 3 30.940 |0 30,000 |@ 41000 |05 37.950 | $ 30.94
201 | AR v NO SUBSTITUTIONS
PULMODYNE PRODUCT ONLY;
02 MAX BiTrac ED Mask, w/Neb, MED LG, w/3-SET ’ .
e iTrac ED Mask, w/Neb, - w/ ITEM # REF 313-7556XNEA; 313-7556XNEA 39.860 NO BID @5 35.700 39.000 |@ 41000 |0% 37.950 | $ 35.70
202 | AR | NO SUBSTITUTIONS
CPAP/Capnography Kit, O2MAX Bitrac ED Mask, Adult |" - 00V NE PRODUCT ONLY;
3 , N ) ! ! ) : y
Large 36T valve, DISS ITEM # REF 677555; . REF 677555 s 48.950 NO BID V3 38.000 NoBid  |@5 37.950 | § 37.95
[no-suBsTUTIONS
203 | AR
CPAP/Capnography Kit, O2MAX Bitrac ED Mask, Adult |" - 00 YNE PRODUCTONLY;
Mied, 3.56T Vol DISS TEM # REF 677556; . REF 677556 s 48.950 NO BID 38.000 NoBid  |@5 37.108 | $ 37.11
[no-suBSTUTIONS
204 | AR
GRAHAM MEDICAL PRODUCTS
Mega Movers Portable Transport Unit ONLY; ITEM # 53376; 53376 <3 31740 |@ $ 16.000 NO BID s 25.200 |(0$ 23850 |06 25.116 |0% 27.449 | $ 16.00
205 | msc NO SUBSTITUTIONS
Ventilator Circuit LSP Ventilation Circuit Valve, Disp, f;':;g;"_mm'e Product; ltem #
w/valve, Exhalation Filter, Adult Cuffed Mask, Swivel | =0 1o o 800148 7.350 NO BID @ 7.300 @5 7.250 | 9.950 @ 7250 | $ 7.25
206 AR Connector FOR AUTOVENT 4000’
CPAP Ventilator Circuit ttem # 8300148, -
207 | AR OREQUIVALENT
Aliied Healthcare Product Only;
Internal Air Filter for Autovent 4000 Item # 800149; 800149 @3 4180 NO BID @ 1.340 | @5 1580 |@$  18.000 |@ 1838 | $ 134
208 | AR OR EQUIVALENT
xH 17.990 NOBID @ 0220 @8 0100 NoBid |O$ 1289 | $ 0.10
209 | PPE |Medical Grade Procedure Masks
Teleflex £%-EZ-10 Intraosseous Vascular Needles 15mm |Arrow EXEZ-I0 PRODUCTS ONLY )
o | Poneedte set (pink ), 156 O SUBSTITUTIONS @3 135000 NO BID NO BID NoBid  |@ 111190 $ 11119
Teleflex £%-EZ-10 Intraosseous Vascular Needles 25 mm - [Arrow EX-EZ-10 PRODUCTS ONLY
135.4 NO BID NO BID No Bi 134.52 3
s | |ADNeedie Set (Blue Hub), 156 NO SUBSTITUTIONS O3 35000 oBid @6 s | 22822
Teleflex £X-EZ-10 Int Vascular Needles 45 MM |Arrow EXEZ-I0 PRODUCTS ONLY
eletiex niraosseous Yascular Meedles row @3 135000 NO BID NO BID NoBid  |@6 134520 | $ 134.52
) v |LO Needle set (Yellow Hub), 156 NO SUBSTITUTIONS

* Substituted Items are declared "non-responsive" and ineligible for award when the item is identified "no substitutions."
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