BID TABULATION SHEET

#304-17 EMERGENCY MANAGEMENT SERVICES UNIFORMS

BID OPENING DATE: 11/28/2017

ITEM DESCRIPTION

UNIFORMS SALES OF AMERICA, INC.

PRICE - PRICE - PRICE - PRICE -

STATION WEAR PROPOS_EE?AI\:ANF & MALE MALE PRO;‘OI‘_SI_EE%I\QANF FEMALE FEMALE
UNIFORM OVERSIZED UNIFORM | OVERSIZED

Workright Fire Chief Shirt, Short Sleeve -
Items #700NX45 (Men's) 701N X45 Workright 700N X45 $106.34 $129.00 Workright 701N X45 $106.34 $129.00
(Women's) or approved equal
Workright Uniform Pants - Items
#402NX75 (Men's) 401NX75 (Women's) Workright 402NX75 $96.00 $123.50 Workright 401NX75 $96.00 $123.50
or approved equal
Tru-Spec Quarter Zip Performance Fleece
Job Shirt - Unisex - Item #2077 or Atlanco Tru 2077 $54.95 $61.95 Atlantaco Tru 2077 $54.95 $61.95
approved equal
Carhart Fire Resistant Base Layer Shirt,
Short Sleeve - Item #FRK008 or approved Carhart 102903 $54.95 $58.95 Carhart 102903 $54.95 $58.95
equal
Carhart Fire Resistant Base Layer Shirt,
Long Sleeve - Item #FK009 or approved Carhart 102904 $58.95 $62.50 Carhart 102904 $58.95 $62.50
equal
Total Bid for This Category $371.19 $435.90 $371.19 $435.90

ITEM DESCRIPTION

UNIFORMS SALES OF AMERICA, INC.
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PRICE - PRICE -
PRICE - PRICE -
PROPOSED MANF & MALE PROPOSED MANF FEMALE
CLASS A UNIFORM ITEM # UIlIVII)IS\IC;FEQM OVERSIZED & ITEM# UFNEII\IQQIF_QE/I OVERSIZED
UNIFORM UNIFORM

Flying Cross Class A Uniform Coat -ltems
#178696 (Men's) or 4800SDC (Women's) Anchor 726BL $238.00 $260.00 Anchor 226BL $238.00 $260.00
or approved equal
Flying Cross Dress Uniform Shirt, Short
Sleeve - Items #78A54 (Men's) 278A54 Elbeco P867 $37.50 $37.50 Elbeco P8IILC $37.50 $37.50
(Women's) or approved equal
Flying Cross Dress Uniform Shirt, Long
Sleeve - Items #28A54 (Men's) 228A54 Elbeco P877 $37.50 $37.50 Elbeco P80166 $37.50 $37.50
(Women's) or approved equal
I_I_yll Iy CITUSOS ITSS UTITTUTTIT T arits =I1tclrio
# 28P8696 (Men's) 4800S (Women's) or Anchor 229BL $90.00 $99.75 Ancor 729BL $90.00 $99.75
Hankins Brothers Class A Uniform Hat or HBC 5-11 52-11E $120.00 $120.00 HBC5-152-11E |  $120.00 $120.00
approved equal
Total Bid for This Category $523.00 $554.75 $523.00 $554.75
POLOS WITH NAME AND RANK
EMBROIDERY UNIFORMS SALES OF AMERICA, INC.
Tru-Spec Performance Polo - Items #
4336, 4342, 4488 and 4493 (Men's) 4375,
4484, 4516 and 61165 (Women's) or Atlanco Tru Spec $39.95 $44.95 Atlanco Tru Spec $39.95 $44.95
approved equal
Total Bid for This Category $39.95 $44.95 $39.95 $44.95

TACTICAL PANTS




12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

True-Spec 24/7 Tactical Pants - Iltems #

1060, 1061 and 1062 (Men's) 1095,1096 Atlanaco Tru Spec $38.50 $47.50 Atlanaco Tru Spec $38.50 $47.50
and 1097 (Women's) or approved equal
Total Bid for This Category $38.50 $47.50 $38.50 $47.50
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIFORMS SALES OF AMERICA, INC.
PRICE - PRICE -
PRICE - PRICE -
PROPOSED MANF & MALE PROPOSED MANF FEMALE
WORKOUT WEAR ITEM # UIlIVII/IS\ICSIEM OVERSIZED & ITEM# LlJ:NEII\IéIgII;E/I OVERSIZED
UNIFORM UNIFORM
Gildan Workout Wear T-Shirts - Unisex - . .
Item #G200 or approved equal Gildan G200 $11.00 $13.95 Gildan G200 $11.00 $13.95
Augusta Sportswear Workout Wear
Shorts - Unisex - Item #915 or approved Augusta 915 $16.25 $19.25 Augusta 915 $16.25 $19.25
equal
Jerzees Workout Wear Sweatpants -
Unisex - Item #973M or approved equal Jerzees 973M $16.25 $19.25 Jerzees 973M $16.25 $19.25
Jerzees Workout Wear Sweatshirt -
Unisex - Item #562 or approved equal Jerzees 562 $17.95 $21.50 Jerzees 562 $17.95 $21.50
Otto Flex Workout Wear Hat - Item #11-
1168 or approved equal Oto 11-1168 $12.25 $12.25 Oto 11-1168 $12.28 $12.28
Flexfit Workout Wear Wool Blend Hat -
Item #6477 or approved equal Alpha 6477 $14.50 $14.50 Alpha 6477 $14.50 $14.50
Port Authority Fleece Beanie - Item . .
#C918 or approved equal Port Authority C918 $11.00 $11.00 Port Authority C918 $11.00 $11.00
Total Bid for This Category $99.20 $111.70 $99.23 $111.73

ITEM DESCRIPTION

UNIFORMS SALES OF AMERICA, INC.
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PRICE - PRICE -
BELTS PROPOSED MANF & PI\F/IQ)IACI:_EE- MALE PROPOSED MANF FPERI\I/IC,;IIE_I-E FEMALE
ITEM # UNIFORM OVERSIZED & ITEM# UNIFORM OVERSIZED
UNIFORM UNIFORM
Dutyman Floral Ranger Belt O ltem Vogel 154 $27.50 $27.50 Vogel 154 $27.50 $27.50
#1761 or approved equal
Boston Leather Dress Belt - ltem #6606 or Boston 6606 $29.95 $36.95 Boston 6606 $29.95 $36.95
approved equal
, .
Black Hawk! CQB/Rescue (Rigger) Belt Black Hawk CQB 001 $38.50 $3850 | Black Hawk CQB 001 |  $38.50 $38.50
or approved equal
Total Bid for This Category $95.95 $102.95 $95.95 $102.95
MISCELLANEOUS
Samuel Broom Necktie - Item #90078 or Samuel Broom 90078 $4.50 $4.50 Samuel Broom 90078 $4.50 $4.50
approved equal
Ringers Extrication Hybrid Gloves - Item . .
#337 or approved equal Witners 337 $74.50 $74.50 Witners 337 $74.50 $74.50
Rothco MA-1 Flight Jacket - [tem #7324 Rothco 7324 $36.95 $39.95 Rothco 7324 $36.95 $39.95
or approved equal
Total Bid for This Category $115.95 $118.95 $115.95 $118.95
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIFORMS SALES OF AMERICA, INC.
PRICE - PRICE -
PRICE - PRICE -
PROPOSED MANF & MALE PROPOSED MANF FEMALE
BOOTS AND SHOES ITEM # UliIVII’I:\IO_FEQM OVERSIZED & ITEM # UFNEII\IQQIF_QE/I OVERSIZED
UNIFORM UNIFORM
Danner Striker 1| EMS Boot - Item . Bellville
#42930 or approved equal Bellville TR9182WPCT $126.95 $126.95 TRO182WPCT $126.95 $126.95
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Thorogood 6" Composite Toe Boot - Item
14804-6034 or approved equal Thorogood 804-6034 $106.95 $106.95 Thorogood 804-6034 $106.95 $106.95
Thorogood 6" Quick Release Station Boot i i
- Item #834-6034 or approved equal Thorogood 834-6034 $97.45 $97.45 Thorogood 834-6034 $97.45 $97.45
Thorogood High Gloss Oxford Shoe -
Items #531-6303 (Men's) / 831-6027 Thorogood 831-6027 $104.95 $104.95 Thorogood 531-6303 $104.95 $104.95
(Women's) or approved equal
Thorogood Uniform Oxford ASR - Item Thorogood 834-6522 $79.95 $79.95 Thorogood 830-6522 $79.95 $79.95
#834-655 or approved equal
Under Armour Valsetz RS Boot - Item Under Armour
#1250234 or approved equal Under Armour 1250234 $105.95 $105.95 1250234 $105.95 $105.95
Magnum Stealth Force 8" Boot - Item . .
#5198 or approved equal Bellville Max 82 $129.50 $129.50 Bellville Max 82 $129.50 $129.50
Magnum Stealth Force 6" Boot - Item . .
#5226 or approved equal Bellville Max 62 $124.95 $124.95 Bellville Max 62 $124.95 $124.95
Rocky 87 Alpha Force Boot - ltem #2165 Rocky 2165 $94.95 $94.95 Rocky 2165 $94.95 $94.95
or approved equal
Rocky 10 Paratrooper Size Zipper Boot -
Item #2090 or approved equal Rocky 2090 $129.75 $129.75 Rocky 2090 $129.75 $129.75
Belleville Tactical Research 8" Boot -Item . .
#TRIGOZWP or approved equal Bellville TR9602ZWP $137.50 $137.50 Bellville TR9602ZWP $137.50 $137.50
Total Bid for This Category $1,238.85 $1,238.85 $1,238.85 $1,238.85
Overall Bid Total Overall Bid Total $2,522.59 $2,655.55 $2,522.62 $2,655.58

Notes regarding bid submission.

Note: Bidder had multi

ple substitutions.

ITEM DESCRIPTION

UNIFORMS SALES OF

AMERICA, INC.

Delivery Time (Time from Order to Shipping): 30 - 45 days
Set up Fees: 0
Standard Shipping Fees: 0




Rush Shipping Fees: 0
Warehouse Location: Lithia Springs, GA
Discount on Catalog Pricing: 20%
Do you accept Net 30 payment terms? If not, state terms: Yes
NUMBER OF
COMPANY NAME NUMBER OF LOW BID
LOW BID MALE FEMALE
NUMBER OF LOW |OVERSIZED NUMBER OF LOW BID  |OVERSIZED
BID MALE ITEMS [ITEMS FEMALE ITEMS ITEMS
GALLS 7 7 5
NAFECO 17 17 18
T & T UNIFORMS - SOUTH 6 5 5
T & T UNIFORMS - SMYRNA 5 3 6 4
Awarded To: NAFECO UNFORMS OF AMERICA 5 5 4

Awarded Date: January 18, 2018

NOTE: FIVE ITEMS RECEIVED SAME PRICING WITHIN THE RESPONSES.
EXAMPLE: $96.00 WAS SUBMITTED BY THREE BIDDERS FOR THE WORKRIGHT UNIFORM PANTS.

Average Cost per Item

COMPANY NAME Male Female
UNIFORM SALES OF AMERICA, INC S 339.84 | S 339.84
T & T UNIFORMS, INC. S 326.00 | $ 326.00
NAFECO S 324.00 | S 324.00
T & T UNIFORMS SOUTH, INC. S 347.00 | S 347.00
GALLS, INC. S 374.00 | $ 374.00
Average Cost per Item
COMPANY NAME Male |Fema|e




UNIFORM SALES OF AMERICA, INC S 68.18 | S 68.18
T & T UNIFORMS, INC S 68.46 | S 68.46
NAFECO S 66.84 | S 66.84
T & T UNIFORMS SOUTH, INC S 67.46 | S 20.28
GALLS, INC S 65.88 | S 65.88




T & T UNIFORMS, INC. (Not affiliated with T & T Uniforms South of Jonesboro, GA)

NORTH AMERIC/

PROPOSED MANF &|  "RICE - PRICE - PROPOSED MANF | T RICE- PRICE - PROPOSED MANF PRICE -
ITEM # MALE MALE & ITEM # FEMALE FEMALE & ITEM # MALE
UNIFORM OVERSIZED UNIFORM OVERSIZED UNIFORM
Workright 700N X45 $95.00 $118.00 Workright 701NX45 $95.00 $118.00 Workright 700NX45 $99.00
Workright 402NX75 $96.00 $120.00 Workright 401NX75 $96.00 $120.00 Workright 402NX75 $102.00
Atlanco Tru 2077 $60.00 $72.00 Atlantaco Tru 2077 $60.00 $72.00 Truspec 2077 $49.00
Carhart 100234-410 $66.00 $79.00 Carhart 100234-410 $66.00 $79.00 Carhart FRK008 $48.00
Carhart 100235-410 $69.00 $82.00 Carhart 100235-410 $69.00 $82.00 Carhart FRK009 $52.00
$386.00 $471.00 $386.00 $471.00 $350.00

T & T UNIFORMS, INC. (Not affiliated with T & T Uniforms South of Jonesboro, GA)

NORTH AMERIC/




PRICE -

PRICE -

PROPOSED MANF & PI\F;LCI:_EE MALE PROPOSED MANF FPERI\I/IC,::_I-E FEMALE PROPOSED MANF Pl\lj/lb\cﬁz
ITEM # UNIFORM OVERSIZED & ITEM# UNIFORM OVERSIZED & ITEM # UNIFORM
UNIFORM UNIFORM
Flying Cross 17886906 |  $345.00 $415.00 Flying Cross 4800SDC|  $345.00 $415.00 Hf;gg(;%g?s $370.00
Flying Cross 78A54 $36.00 $43.00 Flying Cross 278A54 $36.00 $43.00 Flying Cross 78A54 $34.00
Flying Cross 228A54 $38.00 $45.00 Flying Cross 228A54 $38.00 $45.00 Flying Cross 228A54 $36.00
Flying Cross 28P8696 $110.00 $132.00 Flying Cross 4800S $110.00 $132.00 Flying Cross 28P8696 $85.00
Left Blank Left Blank Left Blank Left Blank Left Blank Left Blank Baylys 9807 $120.00
$529.00 $635.00 $529.00 $635.00 $645.00
T & T UNIFORMS, INC. (Not affiliated with T & T Uniforms South of Jonesboro, GA) NORTH AMERIC/
Truspec 4336, 4342, Truspec 4375, 4484, Truspec 4336, 4488,

4493, 4488 $50.00 $60.00 4516 $50.00 $60.00 4342, 4493 $39.95
$50.00 $60.00 $50.00 $60.00 $39.95




Truspec 1060,1061,

Truspec 1095, 1096,

Truspec 1060,1061,

1062 $39.00 $47.00 1097 $39.00 $47.00 1062 $34.00
$39.00 $47.00 $39.00 $47.00 $34.00
T & T UNIFORMS, INC. (Not affiliated with T & T Uniforms South of Jonesboro, GA) NORTH AMERIC/
PRICE - PRICE -
PROPOSED MANF & PI\F/T'IA\CLEE MALE PROPOSED MANF FPERI\I/IC,:AIIE_I-E FEMALE PROPOSED MANF PI\F/T’IA\CI:_EE
ITEM# UNIFORM OVERSIZED & ITEM# UNIEORM OVERSIZED & ITEM # UNIFORM
UNIFORM UNIFORM
Gildan G200 Min 12 $8.50 $10.50 Gildan G200 Min 12 $8.50 $10.50 Gildan G200 $14.00
Augusta 915 Min 12 $16.50 $20.00 Augusta 915 Min 12 $16.50 $20.00 Augusta 915 $14.00
Jerzees 973M Min 12 $15.00 $18.00 Jerzees 973M Min 12 $15.00 $18.00 Jerzees 973M $15.00
Jerzees 562 Min 12 $16.00 $19.50 Jerzees 562 Min 12 $16.00 $19.50 Jerzees 562 $15.00
Otto 11-1168 Min 12 $13.00 $13.00 Otto 11-1168 Min 12 $13.00 $13.00 Otto 11-1168 $14.00
Alpha 6477 Min 12 $16.50 $16.50 Alpha 6477 Min 12 $16.50 $16.50 Flexfit 6577 $16.00
Port Authority C918 $12.00 $12.00 Port Authority C918 $12.00 $12.00 Port Authority C918 $12.00
Min 12 Min 12
$97.50 $109.50 $97.50 $109.50 $100.00

T & T UNIFORMS, INC. (Not affiliated with T & T Uniforms South of Jonesboro, GA)

NORTH AMERIC/




PRICE - PRICE -
PROPOSED MANF & PI\F/IQ'IACI:_EE MALE PROPOSED MANF FPERI\I/IC,:AT:_I-E FEMALE PROPOSED MANF Pl\lj)lb\cﬁz
ITEM # UNIEORM OVERSIZED & ITEM# UNIEORM OVERSIZED & ITEM # UNIFORM
UNIFORM UNIFORM
Dutyman 1761 $23.00 $25.00 Dutyman 1761 $23.00 $25.00 Dutyman 1761 $21.00
Boston 6606 $17.50 $20.00 Boston 6606 $17.50 $20.00 Boston 6606 $15.00
Black Hawk CQB 001 $39.99 $39.99 Black Hawk CQB 001 $39.99 $39.99 Black Hawk CQB 001 $39.00
$80.49 $84.99 $80.49 $84.99 $75.00
Samuel Broom 90078 $5.00 $5.00 Samuel Broom 90078 $5.00 $5.00 Samuel Broom 90078 $5.00
337 $50.00 $50.00 337 $50.00 $50.00 Shelby 2500 $50.00
Rothco 7324 $37.00 $45.00 Rothco 7324 $37.00 $45.00 Rothco 7324 $35.00
$92.00 $100.00 $92.00 $100.00 $90.00
T & T UNIFORMS, INC. (Not affiliated with T & T Uniforms South of Jonesboro, GA) NORTH AMERIC/
PRICE - PRICE -
PROPOSED MANF & PS’IA\CLEE- MALE PROPOSED MANF FPERI\I/IC/;T:_I-E FEMALE PROPOSED MANF PI\IZIA\(I:_EE-
ITEM # UNIEORM OVERSIZED & ITEM# UNIEORM OVERSIZED & ITEM # UNIEORM
UNIFORM UNIFORM
Danner 42930 $192.00 $192.00 Danner 42930 $192.00 $192.00 Danner 42930 $190.00




Thorogood 804-6034 $108.00 $108.00 Thorogood 804-6034 $108.00 $108.00 Thorogood 804-6034 $89.00
Thorogood 834-6034 $104.00 $104.00 Thorogood 834-6034 $104.00 $104.00 Thorogood 834-6034 $89.00
Thorogood 531-6303 $101.00 $101.00 Thorogood 831-6027 $101.00 $101.00 Thorogood 531-6027 $91.00
Thorogood 834-6522 $70.00 $70.00 Thorogood 834-6522 $70.00 $70.00 Thorogood 834-6522 $63.00
Under Armour Under Armour
Under Armour 1250234 $108.00 $108.00 1250234 $108.00 $108.00 1250234 $96.00
Magnum 5870 $110.00 $110.00 Magnum 5870 $110.00 $110.00 Magnum 5870 $99.00
Magnum 5226 $105.00 $105.00 Magnum 5226 $105.00 $105.00 Magnum 5226 $89.00
Rocky 2165 $101.00 $101.00 Rocky 2165 $101.00 $101.00 Rocky 2165 $89.00
Rocky 2090 $125.00 $125.00 Rocky 2090 $125.00 $125.00 Rocky 2090 $121.00
Bellville TR9602ZWP $135.00 $135.00 Bellville TR9602ZWP $135.00 $135.00 Bellville TR9602ZWP $123.00
$1,259.00 $1,259.00 $1,259.00 $1,259.00 $1,139.00
Overall Bid Total $2,532.99 $2,766.49 $2,532.99 $2,766.49 Overall Bid Total $2,472.95
Note: Bidder did not enter a cost for every item. Note:
T & TUNIFORMS, INC. (Not affiliated with T & T Uniforms South of Jonesboro, GA) NORTH AMERIC/
Delivery Time (Time from Order to Shipping): 45 days (based on supplier inventory for backorders) Delivery Time (Time from Order to Shipp
Set up Fees: Screens - $22.00 each, DST files - $65.00 each Set up Fees:
Standard Shipping Fees: Dollars based on size and weight Standard Shipping Fees:




Rush Shipping Fees:

N/A

Rush Shipping Fees:

Warehouse Location:

Smyrna, GA

Warehouse Location:

Discount on Catalog Pricing:

Based on Bid Price, Off Bid - Yes

Discount on Catalog Pricing:

Do you accept Net 30 payment terms? If not, state terms:

Yes

Do you accept Net 30 payment terms? If n

Bid clarification - Item







AN FIRE EQUIPMENT COMPANY, INC (NAFECO)

T & T UNIFORMS SOUTH, INC (Not affiliated with T & T Uniforms of Smyrna, G,

PRICE - PRICE - PRICE - PRICE - PRICE - PRICE -
maLE  |PROPOSEDMATEE) cemae FEMALE PROZLOIS%ELKA'\;ANF MALE MALE PROPOSEDNANT &) FEMALE
OVERSIZED UNIFORM | OVERSIZED UNIFORM | OVERSIZED UNIFORM
$102.00 $127 50
$119.00 | Workright 70INX45 |  $99.00 $119.00 700NX Completely | 701NX $102.00
52 t0 60
Patched
$12500 | Workright 40INX75 |  $102.00 $125.00 402NX so00 P92 ea 401INX $96.00
$54.00 Truspec 2077 $49.00 $54.00 2077 $65.00 N/A 2077 $65.00
$54.00 Carhart FRK008 $48.00 $54.00 Spall Garden BL110 $45.00 N/A Spall Garden $45.00
$58.00 Carhart FRK009 $52.00 $58.00 Garden BL120 $49.00 N/A Garden BL120 $49.00
$410.00 $350.00 $410.00 $255.00 $246.75 $255.00

AN FIRE EQUIPMENT COMPANY, INC (NAFECO)

T & T UNIFORMS SOUTH, INC (Not affiliated with T & T Uniforms of Smyrna, G,




PRICE - PRICE - PRICE -
MALE PROPOSED MANF & FPERI\I/IC;::_I-E FEMALE PROPOSED MANF PI\Ij,IACI:_EE- MALE PROPOSED MANF & FPERI\I/IC,;IIE_I-E
OVERSIZED ITEM # UNIEORM OVERSIZED & ITEM# UNIFORM OVERSIZED ITEM # UNIFORM
UNIFORM UNIFORM UNIFORM
$440.00 Flying Cross 4800SDC $370.00 $440.00 Flying Cross 17886906 $310.00 $372.00 Flying Cross 4800SDC $229.00
. . $38.94 19 .
$41.00 Flying Cross 278A54 $34.00 $41.00 Flying Cross 78A54 $29.95 up Flying Cross 278A54 $29.95
. . $38.94 19 .
$42.00 Flying Cross 228A54 $36.00 $42.00 Flying Cross 228A54 $29.95 up 37 sleeve Flying Cross 228A54 $29.95
. $126.50 - 44 - 52
$101.00 Left Blank $85.00 $101.00 Flying Cross 28P8696 $115.00 $138.00 - 54 - 58 Left Blank Left Blank
Bayly Hat Black - $85.00
$120.00 Baylys 9807 $120.00 $120.00 Bell Crown Cap White - $115.00 Left Blank Left Blank Left Blank
$744.00 $645.00 $744.00 $569.90 $576.38 $288.90
AN FIRE EQUIPMENT COMPANY, INC (NAFECO) T & T UNIFORMS SOUTH, INC (Not affiliated with T & T Uniforms of Smyrna, G,
$48.00 Trusepe $39.95 $48.00 Truspec (Spec) | $42.00 S-XL | $46.00 2XL-4XL |  Truspec (Spec) | $42.00 S- XL
' 4375,4516,4484 ' ' pecisp ' ' pecisp '
$48.00 $39.95 $48.00 $42.00 $46.00 $42.00




Truspec 1095, 1096,

$39.00 1097 $34.00 $39.00 Truspec (Spec) $40.00 - 28-42 $45.00 - 44 - 50 Truspec (Spec) $40.00-4 - 12
$39.00 $34.00 $39.00 $40.00 $45.00 $40.00
AN FIRE EQUIPMENT COMPANY, INC (NAFECO) T & T UNIFORMS SOUTH, INC (Not affiliated with T & T Uniforms of Smyrna, G,
PRICE - PRICE - PRICE -
MALE PROPOSED MANF & FPERI\I/IC;\IIE_I-E FEMALE PROPOSED MANF PI\F/T)IACI:_EE_ MALE PROPOSED MANF & FPERI\I/IC,;IIE_I-E
OVERSIZED ITEM # UNIFORM OVERSIZED & ITEM# UNIFORM OVERSIZED ITEM # UNIFORM
UNIFORM UNIFORM UNIFORM
$16.00 Gildan G200 $14.00 $16.00 Gildan G200 $11.50 $13.50 - 2X - 4X Gildan G200 $11.50
$16.00 Augusta 915 $14.00 $16.00 Augusta 915 $15.00 N/A Augusta 915 $15.00
Russell Athletic
$17.50 Jerzees 973M $15.00 $17.50 506 HBMD $24.00 N/A Left Blank Left Blank
Russell Athletic
$17.50 Jerzees 562 $15.00 $17.50 598 HBMD $24.00 N/A Left Blank Left Blank
$14.00 Left Blank $14.00 $14.00 Flexfil 6580 $16.00 N/A Left Blank Left Blank
$16.00 Left Blank $16.00 $16.00 Flexfit 6477 $16.00 N/A Left Blank Left Blank
$12.00 Port Authority C918 $12.00 $12.00 Port Authority C918 $10.00 N/A Left Blank Left Blank
$109.00 $100.00 $109.00 $116.50 $13.50 $26.50

AN FIRE EQUIPMENT COMPANY, INC (NAFECO)

T & T UNIFORMS SOUTH, INC (Not affiliated with T & T Uniforms of Smyrna, G,




PRICE - PRICE - PRICE -
MALE PROPOSED MANF & FPERI\I/IC;::_I-E FEMALE PROPOSED MANF PI\IE/IA\CI:_EE- MALE PROPOSED MANF & FPERI\I/IC,;IIE_I-E
OVERSIZED ITEM# UNIEORM OVERSIZED & ITEM# UNIFORM OVERSIZED ITEM # UNIFORM
UNIFORM UNIFORM UNIFORM
$25.00 Dutyman 1761 $21.00 $25.00 Dutyman 1761 $29.00-28-42 | $34.80-44-54 Left Blank Left Blank
$16.00 Boston 6606 $15.00 $16.00 Boston 6606 $25.00 - 28 - 42 $31.25-44-54 Left Blank Left Blank
$48.00 Left Blank $39.00 $48.00 Black Hawk CQB 001 $36.00 N/A Left Blank Left Blank
$89.00 $75.00 $89.00 $90.00 $66.05
$5.00 Samuel Broom 90078 $5.00 $5.00 Samuel Broom 90078 $4.50 N/A Left Blank Left Blank
$50.00 Left Blank $50.00 $50.00 Ringer 337 $69.00 N/A Left Blank Left Blank
$40.00 Rothco 7324 $35.00 $40.00 Rothco 7325 Navy $50.00 $60.00 - 2XL - 5XL Left Blank Left Blank
$95.00 $90.00 $95.00 $123.50 $60.00
AN FIRE EQUIPMENT COMPANY, INC (NAFECO) T & T UNIFORMS SOUTH, INC (Not affiliated with T & T Uniforms of Smyrna, G,
PRICE - PRICE - PRICE -
MALE PROPOSED MANF & FPERI\I/IC/;T:_I-E FEMALE PROPOSED MANF PI\IZIA\CLEE- MALE PROPOSED MANF & FPERI\I/I(;IIE_I-E
OVERSIZED ITEM # UNIEORM OVERSIZED & ITEM# UNIEORM OVERSIZED ITEM # UNIEORM
UNIFORM UNIFORM UNIFORM
$190.00 Danner 42930 $190.00 $190.00 Danner 42930 $195.00 N/A Left Blank Left Blank




$89.00 Thorogood 804-6034 $89.00 $89.00 Thorogood 804-6034 $115.00 N/A Left Blank Left Blank
$89.00 Thorogood 834-6034 $89.00 $89.00 Thorogood 834-6034 $105.00 N/A Left Blank Left Blank
531-6303 Discontinued {
$91.00 Thorogood 831-6303 $91.00 $91.00 Thorogood 831-6027 $89.00 $89.00 Replacement BATES $98.00
742
$63.00 Thorogood 830-6522 $63.00 $63.00 Thorogood 834-6522 $80.00 N/A Left Blank Left Blank
$96.00  |Under Armour 1250234  $96.00 $96.00 Under Armour $109.00 N/A Left Blank Left Blank
' ' ' 1250234-001 '
$99.00 Magnum 5870 $99.00 $99.00 BATES E02261 $89.00 N/A Left Blank Left Blank
$89.00 Magnum 5226 $89.00 $89.00 Bates E02262 $89.00 N/A Left Blank Left Blank
$89.00 Rocky 2165 $89.00 $89.00 Rocky 2165 $104.00 N/A Left Blank Left Blank
$121.00 Rocky 2090 $121.00 $121.00 Rocky 2090 $135.00 N/A Left Blank Left Blank
$123.00 Bellville TR9602ZWP $123.00 $123.00 Bellville TR9602ZWP $149.00 N/A Left Blank Left Blank
$1,139.00 $1,139.00 $1,139.00 $1,259.00 $89.00 $98.00
$2,673.00 $2,472.95 $2,673.00 Overall Bid Total $2,495.90 $1,142.68 $750.40
Bidder did not enter a cost for every item. Note: Bidder did not enter a cost for every item.
AN FIRE EQUIPMENT COMPANY, INC (NAFECO) T & T UNIFORMS SOUTH, INC (Not affiliated with T & T Uniforms of Smyrna, G,
inQ): 30 - 45 days Delivery Time (Time from Order to Shipping): 45 days - 90 days
20% Set up Fees: $25.00 to $50.00
20% Standard Shipping Fees: $10.00 to $50.00 depending on weight




20% Rush Shipping Fees: FED EX Next Day - $100.00 or more dep:
Decatur, AL Warehouse Location: Jonesboro, GA
N/A Discount on Catalog Pricing: N/A

ot, state terms: |Yes Do you accept Net 30 payment terms? If not, state terms: Yes

s left blank for all sizes are marked in the male/female boxes.

The set up fee which represents 20% are as follows regarding
embroidery and screenprint - One time set-up charge $30 per
screen - $50 per hour art charge and $10 reset screens. One
time embroidery is $50 to $100 for digitizing logo based on stitch
count, up to 20% of first order cost. Standard and Rush Fees are
20% based on orders outside the scope of this bid. Contracted
items do not have a Standard or Rush Fee charge.







a) GALLS, INC.
PRICE - PRICE - PRICE - PRICE - PRICE -
FEMALE PROZLOIiEEIi/II\zANF MALE MALE PROPOIiEEIi/II\::ANF & FEMALE FEMALE
OVERSIZED UNIFORM OVERSIZED UNIFORM | OVERSIZED
$127.E:)03XL X Workright 700N X45 $138.00 $160.00 Workright 701N X45 $138.00 $160.00
$119.25 Workright 402NX75 $111.00 $130.00 Workright 401NX75 $111.00 $130.00
N/A Atlanco Tru 2077 $56.00 $60.00 Atlantaco Tru 2077 $56.00 $60.00
N/A Carhart FRK008 $49.00 $53.00 Carhart FRK008 $49.00 $53.00
N/A No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$246.75 $354.00 $403.00 $354.00 $403.00
a) GALLS, INC.




PRICE - PRICE - PRICE - PRICE - PRICE -
FEMALE PROPOSED MANF MALE MALE PROPOSED MANF & FEMALE FEMALE
OVERSIZED & ITEM# UNIFORM OVERSIZED ITEM # UNIFORM OVERSIZED
UNIFORM UNIFORM UNIFORM
$358.00 18- : :

24 Flying Cross 17886906|  $330.00 $330.00 Flying Cross 4800SDC $330.00 $330.00
$38.94 up 44 Flying Cross 78A54 $42.00 $42.00 Flying Cross 278A54 $42.00 $42.00
$38.94 44 . .

up Flying Cross 228A54 $44.00 $44.00 Flying Cross 228A54 $44.00 $44.00

Left Blank Flying Cross 28P8696 | $118.00 $118.00 Flying Cross 4800S $118.00 $118.00
Left Blank No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$435.88 $534.00 $534.00 $534.00 $534.00
a) GALLS, INC.
Truspec 4836, 4342, Truspec 4375, 4484,
$46.00 2XL 4488, 4493 $44.00 $46.00 4516, 61165 $44.00 $46.00
$46.00 $44.00 $46.00 $44.00 $46.00




$45.00-14-1g | | 1"uspec 1060,1061, $37.00 $39.00 Truspec 1095, 1096, $37.00 $39.00
1062 1097
$45.00 $37.00 $39.00 $37.00 $39.00
a) GALLS, INC.
PRICE - PRICE - PRICE -
FEMALE PROPOSED MANF PI\F/T/IA\CLEE MALE PROPOSED MANF & FPERI\I/IC,:AIIE_I-E FEMALE
OVERSIZED & ITEM# UNIFORM OVERSIZED ITEM # UNIEORM OVERSIZED
UNIFORM UNIFORM UNIFORM
$13.50 - 2X - 4X Gildan G200 $14.00 $16.00 Gildan G200 $14.00 $16.00
N/A Augusta 915 $22.00 $22.00 Augusta 915 $22.00 $22.00
Left Blank Jerzees 973M $21.00 $23.00 Jerzees 973M $21.00 $23.00
Left Blank Jerzees 562 $20.00 $22.00 Jerzees 562 $20.00 $22.00
Left Blank Otto 11-1168 $14.00 $14.00 Otto 11-1168 $14.00 $14.00
Left Blank Flexfit 6477 $18.00 $18.00 Flexfit 6477 $18.00 $18.00
Left Blank Port Authority C918 $13.00 $13.00 Port Authority C918 $13.00 $13.00
$122.00 $128.00 $122.00 $128.00
) GALLS, INC.




PRICE - PRICE - PRICE - PRICE - PRICE -
FEMALE PROPOSED MANF MALE MALE PROPOSED MANF & FEMALE FEMALE
OVERSIZED & ITEM # UNIEORM OVERSIZED ITEM # UNIEORM OVERSIZED
UNIFORM UNIFORM UNIFORM
Left Blank Dutyman 1761 $25.00 $27.00 Dutyman 1761 $25.00 $27.00
Left Blank Boston 6606 $32.00 $34.00 Boston 6606 $32.00 $34.00
Left Blank Black Hawk CQB 001 $29.00 $31.00 Black Hawk CQB 001 $29.00 $31.00

$86.00 $92.00 $86.00 $92.00
Left Blank Samuel Broom 90078 $3.50 $3.50 Samuel Broom 90078 $3.50 $3.50
Left Blank Ringer 337 $52.00 $52.00 Ringer 337 $52.00 $52.00
Left Blank Rothco 7324& 7325 $32.00 $35.00 Rothco 7324 & 7325 $32.00 $35.00
$87.50 $90.50 $87.50 $90.50

a) GALLS, INC.

PRICE - PRICE - PRICE -
FEMALE PROPOSED MANF PS'IA\CLEE- MALE PROPOSED MANF & FPER|\I/|C,:A\I|E_|-5 FEMALE
OVERSIZED & ITEM# UNIEORM OVERSIZED ITEM # UNIEORM OVERSIZED
UNIFORM UNIFORM UNIFORM
Left Blank Danner 42930 $210.00 $210.00 Danner 42930 $210.00 $210.00




Left Blank Thorogood 804-6034 $95.00 $95.00 Thorogood 804-6034 $95.00 $95.00
Left Blank Thorogood 834-6034 $90.00 $90.00 Thorogood 834-6034 $90.00 $90.00
$98.00 Thorogood 531-6303 $99.00 $99.00 Thorogood 831-6027 $99.00 $99.00
Left Blank Thorogood 834-655 $99.00 $99.00 Thorogood 834-655 $99.00 $99.00
Under Armour
Left Blank $69.00 $69.00 Under Armour 1250234 $69.00 $69.00
1250234
Left Blank Magnum 5198 $96.00 $96.00 Magnum 5198 $96.00 $96.00
Left Blank Magnum 5226 $86.00 $86.00 Magnum 5226 $86.00 $86.00
Left Blank Rocky 2165 $94.00 $94.00 Rocky 2165 $94.00 $94.00
Left Blank Rocky 2090 $110.00 $110.00 Rocky 2090 $110.00 $110.00
Left Blank Bellville TR9602ZWP |  $125.00 $125.00 Bellville TR9602ZWP $125.00 $125.00
$98.00 $1,173.00 $1,173.00 $1,173.00 $1,173.00
$871.63 Overall Bid Total $2,437.50 $2,505.50 Overall Bid Total $2,437.50 $2,505.50
Note: Bidder did not enter a cost for every item.
a) GALLS, INC.
Delivery Time (Time from Order to Shipping): 30 days (ARO)
Set up Fees: None
Standard Shipping Fees: None




ending on weight | |Rush Shipping Fees: $30 per order

Warehouse Location: Lexington, KY

Discount on Catalog Pricing: 10%

Do you accept Net 30 payment terms? If not, state terms: |Yes

| Bid clarification - shoes for all sizes are marked in the male/female boxes.




