
Galls
Artwork and Screening Requirements

A. No Bid
B. No Bid
C. No Bid
D. No Bid

5.
No Bid

Tactical Polo          
(Navy Blue and White) 5:11 Tactical

Model: 71182 (Men's) 250 35.00$       8,750.00$      41.99$         10,497.50$       No Bid
Model: 61164 (Women's) 250 42.00$       10,500.00$    45.99$         11,497.50$       No Bid

Tactical Polo
Long sleeve duty polo with sleeve pocket – Screen Print 
(Navy Blue and White)  Model: 72360 Men's 5:11 Tactical

 Model: 72360 S – XXL 40 40.00$       1,600.00$      45.99$         1,839.60$         No Bid
 Model: 72360 XXXL 40 45.00$       1,800.00$      50.99$         2,039.60$         No Bid

Pro  T-Shirt
Short sleeve duty T-Shirt with sleeve pocket – Screen 
Print (Navy Blue and Red) 5:11 Tactical

Model: 71309 S – XXL 100 24.32$       2,432.00$      25.99$         2,599.00$         No Bid
Model: 71309 XXXL 100 27.50$       2,750.00$      29.99$         2,999.00$         No Bid

Pro  T-Shirt (long sleeve)
5:11 Tactical

S – XXL 40 26.00$       1,040.00$      29.99$         1,199.60$         No Bid
XXXL 40 35.00$       1,400.00$      33.99$         1,359.60$         No Bid

Apex Pant
Duty Pants, Dark Navy, Model:74434 5:11 Flex Tec

30-44 100 58.00$       5,800.00$      63.99$         6,399.00$         No Bid
Stryke Pants

Duty Pants, Dark Navy (724) 5:11 Tactical
Model: 64386 0-22 Women's 40 60.00$       2,400.00$      59.99$         2,399.60$         No Bid
Model: 74369 28-44 Men's 40 60.00$       2,400.00$      59.99$         2,399.60$         No Bid
Model: 74369 46-54 Men's 40 68.50$       2,740.00$      59.99$         2,399.60$         No Bid

Company Pants
G. Duty Pant, Dark Navy, Model:74508 5:11 Tactical 40 50.00$       2,000.00$      51.99$         2,079.60$         No Bid

Tac Lite Pro Shorts
H. Duty Short, Dark Navy, Model: 63071Women's 5:11 Tactical 40 42.00$       1,680.00$      38.49$         1,539.60$         No Bid

IFB FD20-023 Fire and Medical Department Uniforms                                         
Bid Deadline February 6, 2020

Long sleeve duty T-Shirt with sleeve pocket – Screen 
Print (Navy Blue and Red) Model: 72318

No Bid

Avondale Maltese Cross logo on left front chest  
Rank centered above the logo on the left front chest
Individual’s name
Full size “Avondale Fire & Medical” on back  

Paramedic logo on right sleeve – with top of patch 1 ½” from shoulder seam  

8.00$                                 
8.00$                                 
8.00$                                 
8.00$                                 

3.00$                                       
3.00$                                       
3.00$                                       
3.00$                                       

3.00$                                       

Item Description
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Item Description
 Creative Images FX Tactical

Utility Job Shirt
Outerwear – Screen Print, Dark Navy 5:11 Tactical

Model: 72441 S – XXL 40 40.00$       1,600.00$      41.99$         1,679.60$         No Bid
Model: 72441 3XL, 4XL 40 46.00$       1,840.00$      46.59$         1,863.60$         No Bid

Taclite Reversible Jacket
Outerwear - Embroidery, Dark Navy 5:11 Tactical

Model: 48159 S – XXL 40 80.00$       3,200.00$      79.99$         3,199.60$         
Model: 48159 3XL, 4XL 40 85.00$       3,400.00$      87.99$         3,519.60$         

Response Jacket
Outerwear - Embroidery, Dark Navy 5:11 Tactical

 Model: 48016 S – XXL 40 62.00$       2,480.00$      47.99$         1,919.60$         No Bid
 Model: 48016 3XL, 4XL 40 65.00$       2,600.00$      56.49$         2,259.60$         No Bid

Chameleons Softshell Jacket
Outerwear – Embroidery, Dark Navy 5:11 Tactical

Model: 48099 S – XXL 40 92.00$       3,680.00$      95.99$         3,839.60$         No Bid
Model: 48099 3XL 40 102.00$     4,080.00$      111.99$       4,479.60$         No Bid

Packable Operator Jacket
Outerwear – Screen Print, Dark Navy 5:11 Tactical

Model: 48169 S – XXL 40 48.00$       1,920.00$      57.99$         2,319.60$         No Bid
Model: 48169 3XL, 4XL 40 54.00$       2,160.00$      64.99$         2,599.60$         No Bid

Hooded Sweatshirt Pullover

Outerwear – Screen Print, Dark Navy Independent Trading 
Co.

Model: IND4000 S – XL 40 32.00$       1,280.00$      32.99$         1,319.60$         No Bid
Model: IND4000 XXL, XXXL 40 36.00$       1,440.00$      35.99$         1,439.60$         No Bid

Hooded Sweatshirt Zipper

Outerwear – Screen Print, Dark Navy Independent Trading 
Co.

Model: IND 4000Z S – XL 40 32.00$       1,280.00$      37.99$         1,519.60$         No Bid
Model: IND 4000Z XXL, XXXL 40 36.00$       1,440.00$      40.99$         1,639.60$         No Bid

Utility PT Shorts
Physical Training, Dark Navy 5:11 Tactical

Model: 43061 (Men's) 40 No Bid No Bid 26.99$         1,079.60$         No Bid
Model: 33509 (Women's) 40 No Bid No Bid 30.99$         1,239.60$         No Bid

Tactical Polo

Q.
Short Sleeve Polo with Sleeve Pocket, Screen Print, Dark
Navy, Model 61164 (Women's) 5:11 Tactical 40 38.00$       1,520.00$      41.99$         1,679.60$         No Bid

Fast-Tac Cargo Pants
Duty Pants, Dark Navy 5:11 Tactical

Model: 74339 (Men's) 40 70.25$       2,810.00$      39.99$         1,599.60$         No Bid
Model: 94419 (Women's) 40 75.50$       3,020.00$      45.99$         1,839.60$         No Bid
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IFB FD20-023 Fire and Medical Department Uniforms                                         
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Item Description
 Creative Images FX Tactical

Fast-Tac Urban Pants
Duty Pants, Dark Navy 5:11 Tactical

Model: 64420 0-20 Women's 40 70.25$       2,810.00$      31.99$         1,279.60$         No Bid
Model: 74461 28-54 Men's 40  $      70.25  $     2,810.00 31.99$         1,279.60$         No Bid
Model: 74461 46-54 Men's 40 75.50$       3,020.00$      36.49$         1,459.60$         No Bid

Class "A" Utility T-Shirt
Utility T-Shirt Short Sleeve, Dark Navy Blue  5:11 Tactical

Model: 40016 S – XL 40 28.00$       1,120.00$      27.99$         1,119.60$         No Bid
Model: 40016 XXL 40 34.50$       1,380.00$      33.49$         1,339.60$         No Bid
Model: 40016 XXXL 40 34.50$       1,380.00$      33.49$         1,339.60$         No Bid

Class "A" Short Sleeve
Class “A” Short Sleeve, Dark Navy Blue & White – Sewn
Patches Elbeco

Model: TexTrop2 14.5-25.5 Men's 40 24.75$       990.00$         37.99$         1,519.60$         No Bid
Model: TexTrop2 30-50 Women's 40 29.00$       1,160.00$      37.99$         1,519.60$         No Bid

Class “A” Long Sleeve
Class “A” Long Sleeve, Dark Navy Blue and White –
Sewn Patches Elbeco

Model: TexTrop2 14.5-25.5 Men's 40 42.00$       1,680.00$      42.99$         1,719.60$         No Bid
Model: TexTrop2 30-50 Women's 40 48.00$       1,920.00$      42.99$         1,719.60$         No Bid

4 Pocket Polyester Pant
Class “A” Uniform Pant, Navy, Elbeco

Model: TexTrop2 E314R 28-60 Men's 40 50.25$       2,010.00$      39.99$         1,599.60$         No Bid
Model: TexTrop2 E314R 2-32 Women's 40 46.00$       1,840.00$      39.99$         1,599.60$         No Bid

Class “A” BELT, Black to match Brass
X. Class “A” BELT, Black (N/A) (AKER) 40 42.00$       1,680.00$      20.99$         839.60$            No Bid

High Gloss Class "A" Shoe
Y. Class “A” SHOE, Black, High Gloss (N/A) (BATES) 40 54.00$       2,160.00$      No Bid No Bid No Bid

Utility PT-Shirt
Physical Training Utility T-Shirt - Screen Print 5:11 Tactical

Model: 41017 S-3XL (Men's) 40 26.00$       1,040.00$      29.99$         1,199.60$         No Bid
Model: 31006 S-XL (Women's) 40 29.00$       1,160.00$      29.99$         1,199.60$         No Bid
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IFB FD20-023 Fire and Medical Department Uniforms                                         
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Item Description
 Creative Images FX Tactical

Stryke Shorts Men
AA. Duty Shorts, Model: 73327 5:11 Tactical 40 58.00$       2,320.00$      55.99$         2,239.60$         No Bid

Apex Shorts Men
BB. Duty Shorts, Model: 73334 5:11 Tactical 40 58.00$       2,320.00$      55.99$         2,239.60$         No Bid

Fast-Tac Urban Shorts Men
CC. Duty Shorts, Model: 73342 5:11 Tactical 40 36.00$       1,440.00$      30.49$         1,219.60$         No Bid

Maverick Assaulters TDU Belt
Uniform Belt, Model: 59569 5:11 Tactical

S-XL 40 70.00$       2,800.00$      71.99$         2,879.60$         No Bid
XXL 40 70.00$       2,800.00$      82.99$         3,319.60$         No Bid
4XL 40 70.00$       2,800.00$      82.99$         3,319.60$         No Bid

Operator TDU Belt
Uniform Belt, Model: 59405 5:11 Tactical

40 38.00$       1,520.00$      31.99$         1,279.60$         No Bid
40 38.00$       1,520.00$      36.49$         1,459.60$         No Bid
40 38.00$       1,520.00$      36.49$         1,459.60$         No Bid

ARC Leather Belt
Uniform Belt, Model: 59493 5:11 Tactical

S-XL 40 42.00$       1,680.00$      39.99$         1,599.60$         No Bid
XXL 40 42.00$       1,680.00$      45.99$         1,839.60$         No Bid
4XL 40 42.00$       1,680.00$      45.99$         1,839.60$         No Bid

 Leather Casual Belt
Uniform Belt, Model: 59501 5:11 Tactical

S-XL 40 36.00$       1,440.00$      31.99$         1,279.60$         No Bid
XXL 40 36.00$       1,440.00$      36.49$         1,459.60$         No Bid
4XL 40 36.00$       1,440.00$      36.49$         1,459.60$         No Bid

Year-Round Socks
Uniform Sock, Model: 10013 5:11 Tactical

S-XL 40 12.00$       480.00$         11.99$         479.60$            No Bid
Cupron 3 Pack Crew Sock

Uniform Sock,  Model:10038 5:11 Tactical
S-XL 40 16.00$       640.00$         19.99$         799.60$            No Bid

ABR Training Sock
Uniform Sock, Model:10031 5:11 Tactical

S-XL 40 12.00$       480.00$         10.39$         415.60$            No Bid
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IFB FD20-023 Fire and Medical Department Uniforms                                         
Bid Deadline February 6, 2020

Item Description
 Creative Images FX Tactical

Range Ready Short Sleeve T-Shirt
TRT Uniform Shirt Screen Print, Model: 40168 5:11 Tactical

S-XXL 40 29.00$       1,160.00$      23.99$         959.60$            No Bid
Range Ready Long Sleeve T-Shirt

TRT Uniform Shirt – Screen Print, Model: 40161 5:11 Tactical
S-XXL 40 29.00$       1,160.00$      27.99$         1,119.60$         No Bid

Vandal Shorts TRT Swift Water
TRT Uniform Shorts – Screen Print, Model: 73340 5:11 Tactical

28-44 40 54.00$       2,160.00$      47.99$         1,919.60$         No Bid
Softshell Fleece Pullover

Outerwear – Screen Print Model: 4605 Blauer
S-XXL 40 42.00$       1,680.00$      74.99$         2,999.60$         No Bid

Job Shirt Zip Front
Outerwear –Navy Blue Screen Print Model: 4640X Blauer

S-5XL 40 64.00$       2,560.00$      84.99$         3,399.60$         No Bid
3,311.07$  153,922.00$  3,223.29$    154,005.60$     No Bid
3,225.07$  151,762.00$  3,150.31$    151,686.40$     No Bid

Catalog or Product Category Discounts

N/A

N/A

15%
15%
10%
10%
20%
15%

Procurement Administrator: 

Subtotals
Totals (Non-Bid items excluded)

Bags
Duty Gear

Catalog % Discount Offered

Catalog % Discount Offered

Catalog or Product Category Discounts

KK.

NN.

OO.

LL.

MM.

N/A

N/A

6.

Not Offered.Not offered.Apparel
Footwear

Vehicle Equipment
Flashlight

5.11 Tactical Spring 2020 20% Off MAP

Blauer 2020 20% Off Retail

ONLINE ORDERING AND DIRECT SHIP TO AVONDALE LOCATION(S)
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