
IFB # 318-18 Hot Asphaltic Mix
Bid Tabulation Sheet

October 18, 2018

Recycled 
Material 

Total

Recycled 
Material Total

Recycled 
Material Total

Recycled 
Material Total

Recycled 
Material Total

 Bid Price  
Per Ton

Bid Price  Per 
Ton

 Bid Price  Per 
Ton

 Bid Price  Per 
Ton

 Bid Price  Per 
Ton

25mm/19mm
Base/Binder

B-Mod per ton N/A $54.67 No Bid No Bid $66.68 $56.25 $66.71 $56.47 $69.00 $58.56
12.5mm (65) E 

Mix per ton N/A $56.02 $59.75 No Bid $66.68 $56.25 $66.71 $56.47 $69.00 $58.56

9.5mm (65-2) F 
Mix per ton N/A $57.62 $60.50 No Bid $67.95 $56.21 $70.99 $58.37 $70.13 $62.79

9.5mm (65-2) F 
Mix with Lime per ton N/A $61.23 $62.50 No Bid $67.95 $56.21 $70.99 $58.37 $70.13 $62.79

9.5mm (65-10 H 
Mix per ton N/A $59.90 No Bid No Bid $69.59 $58.97 $72.80 $60.10 $71.80 $61.77

Awarded To:  Not awarded at this time.
Awarded Date: 

$51.81

0%

No

1 Hour

1149 Red Oaks Flats Rd    
Dahlonega, GA 30533

17 Miles

C W Matthews - Ball 
Ground Plant

Virgin 
Material 
Total Bid 
Price Per 

Ton

$63.57 $53.97

0%

No

1 Hour

950 Old Nelson Road        
Ball Ground, GA  30153

24 Miles

C W Matthews -       Long 
Branch Plant

Virgin 
Material 
Total Bid 
Price Per 

Ton

$61.73

22 Miles

C W Matthews - 
Cumming Plant

Virgin 
Material 
Total Bid 
Price Per 

Ton

$61.30 $51.40

0%

No

1 Hour

475 Ronald Reagan Blvd    
Cumming, GA  30140

$1.00 Off of List Price

Yes

1 Day

911 Canton Highway       
Cumming, GA  30040

19.9 Miles 

$50.88

Baldwin Paving Co Blount Construction Co
Virgin 

Material 
Total Bid 
Price Per 

Ton

$56.50 No Bid

Gravel Type Unit of 
Measure

Virgin 
Material 
Total Bid 
Price Per 

Ton

per ton N/A

Plant Location

Mileage from Dawsonville, GA

1535 Ronald Reagan Blvd   
Cumming, GA  30041

21 Miles

g ( )
products not specifically listed in 
this IFB but may be needed. 
Percentage (%) off of published 

5% Off of List Price

Vendor will accept invoice 
payment (net/30)?  Yes

Vendor’s order processing time? 24 Hours


