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Wallis Lubricant 15W40 API CJ-4 N/A $84.50 $618.75 $10.75 N/A N/A Energy Petroleum Co. 15W40 API CJ-4 $58.30 $596.75 $9.34 87.50(6/1 gal) Huels Oil Co. 15W40 API CJ-4 $62.00 $627.00 $10.53
1 Midwest Dr. 5W30 API Sm N/A $49.66 $456.50 $7.80 N/A N/A 2130 Kienlen Ave 5W30 API Sm $438.90 $6.96 $37.95 65 Mel Goers Ct. 5W30 API Sm $556.18 $9.20 $53.95
Pacific, MO. 63069 5W20 N/A N/A N/A St. Louis, MO. 63121 5W20 $438.90 $6.96 $37.95 Union, MO. 63084 5W20 $556.18 $9.20 $53.95

Universal Tractor Fluid (equal to J20C) N/A $52.30 $493.53 $8.43 N/A N/A Universal Tractor Fluid (equal to J20C) $54.40 $534.60 $8.70 Universal Tractor Fluid (equal to J20C) $13.26 $61.00 $616.00 $10.30

Allison Transynd TES-295 N/A $200.36 $1,999.40 N/A N/A Allison Transynd TES-295 $117.74 $1,298.52 Allison Transynd TES-295 $35.00 $169.15 $1,593.70

ATF D/M3 N/A $52.50 $495.76 $8.47 N/A N/A ATF D/M3 $54.05 $553.30 $9.36 $40.30 ATF D/M3 $60.00 $605.00 Qts $57.00

Diesel Exhaust Fluid $224.15 $1.51 $19.38 N/A Diesel Exhaust Fluid $205.70 Diesel Exhaust Fluid $16.25 $130.63 $1.60

Hydraulic Oils-AW68 N/A N/A N/A Hydraulic Oils-AW68 $50.00 $471.19 $8.00 Hydraulic Oils-AW68 $49.65 $491.00 $8.05

Grease NLGI #2 N/A $161.12 $1,748.28 N/A $43.38 4.34 Grease NLGI #2 Total Multis Complex EP 2 24 Pack $102.65 Grease NLGI #2 $131.75 3.00 per 10 pk  $        3.30 

Gear Oil 80W90 N/A $64.03 $615.04 1.43/LB N/A N/A Gear Oil 80W90 $88.75 $877.50 Gear Oil 80W90 $18.12 $73.96 $779.24 Qt. 65.28

330 Gallon Diesel Exhaust Fluid Tote

N/A

330 Gallon Diesel Exhaust Fluid Tote

$2.30

330 Gallon Diesel Exhaust Fluid Tote

16.25 130.63 $1.60

85W140 Gear Oil 85W140 Gear Oil

100 1248.58 18.73$      82.1 875.6 Qts. 68.88

Delo GRS ESI HD Moly 3% EP2-TB N/A 145.49 1445.76 3.54/LB  N/A N/A Delo GRS ESI HD Moly 3% EP2-TB Total Multis Complex HV Moly 3% 10 pack 48.79 Delo GRS ESI HD Moly 3% EP2-TB 2,296.45$   52.00 per 10 pk 5.20$         
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Safety-Kleen Systems, Inc. 15W40 API CJ-4 $9.35 PetroChoice LLC 15W40 API CJ-4 No Bid $62.40 $583.55 $10.41 $77.93 case of 6 No Bid
42 Longwater Drive 5W30 API Sm $7.45 $460.00 $32.55 5602 Anglum Court 5W30 API Sm No Bid No Bid $467.50 $8.75 32.24 case of 12 No Bid
Norwell, MA. 02061 5W20 $7.45 $460.00 $32.55 St. Louis, MO. 63042 5W20 No Bid No Bid $467.50 $8.75 24.83 case of 6 No Bid

Universal Tractor Fluid (equal to J20C) $7.95 $492.76 Universal Tractor Fluid (equal to J20C) No Bid $58.00 $510.95 $9.54 56.80 two 2.5 gal jugs No Bid
Allison Transynd TES-295 $1,095.00 Allison Transynd TES-295 No Bid $119.73 $1,133.55 $22.21 No Bid No Bid

ATF D/M3 $504.69 $36.12 ATF D/M3 No Bid $104.93 $1,003.20 $17.58 37.44 cases of 6 No Bid

Diesel Exhaust Fluid $3.90 Diesel Exhaust Fluid No Bid No Bid $204.25 $2.03 10.06 two 2.5 gal jugs No Bid
Hydraulic Oils-AW68 $7.15 $446.63 Hydraulic Oils-AW68 No Bid $57.25 $536.25 $9.66 No Bid No Bid

Grease NLGI #2 $39.75 Grease NLGI #2 No Bid $151.20 $1,652.00 No Bid No Bid 4.03
Gear Oil 80W90 $67.17 $763.51 Gear Oil 80W90 No Bid $71.09 $639.47 $11.52 23.27 cases of 6 No Bid

330 Gallon Diesel Exhaust Fluid Tote 330 Gallon Diesel Exhaust Fluid Tote No Bid 924.40 per tote
85W140 Gear Oil 73.55 793.08 85W140 Gear Oil No Bid $130.70 $1,346.75 $24.09 No Bid No Bid
Delo GRS ESI HD Moly 3% EP2-TB 66.75 Delo GRS ESI HD Moly 3% EP2-TB No Bid $234.05 2,240.00$   No Bid No Bid 5.93
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