
BID TABULATION SHEET

CITY OF CONROE                        
PW Lift Stations      
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Public Works Lift Stations No Bid $72,030.00 $72,030.00 $69,300.00 $102,540.90 $51,450.00 $61,014.15 $61,740.00 $64,100.00 $154,350.00

TOTAL BID $0.00 $72,030.00 $72,030.00 $69,300.00 $102,540.90 $51,450.00 $61,014.15 $61,740.00 $64,100.00 $154,350.00



BID TABULATION SHEET

 MOWING  SERVICES                               
ROW and WATER WELLS                                          

BID 18-19                       
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WATER WELLS $35,800.00 $46,800.00 $62,400.00

RIGHT OF WAY $184,575.00 NO BID $474,978.70

COST PER ACRE NO BID NO BID $120.00

TOTAL BID $220,375.00 $46,800.00 $537,378.70



BID TABULATION SHEET

CITY OF CONROE                    
0819-2021 Mowing Service 

Center & WWTP 1 &2 
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Program #1 $121,800.00 136,080.00$ 93,619.49$    135,561.72$  140,070.00$  175,263.92$  123,900.00$  197,400.00$  58,296.00$    147,000.00$  199,000.00$  

Program #2 $750.00 825.00$        1,400.00$      1,400.00$      2,848.00$      614.32$         800.00$         1,200.00$      950.00$         4,200.00$      2,500.00$      

Program #3 $3,600.00 3,600.00$     3,200.00$      7,089.99$      1,548.00$      1,199.49$      9,300.00$      9,300.00$      4,440.00$      12,000.00$    2,500.00$      

Total Bid $126,150.00 140,505.00$ 98,219.49$    144,051.71$  144,466.00$  177,077.73$  134,000.00$  207,900.00$  63,686.00$    163,200.00$  204,000.00$  
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