

Bid #2308 – Supplies for Anderson County Emergency Medical Services

Questions & Answers

1. Upon review, if there are bid terms and conditions Vendor may not be able to agree to, will Anderson County, Tennessee allow Vendor to include clarifications or exceptions as part of its bid submission?

Answer: The County may consider exceptions. Decisions will be the sole discretion of the County.

2. Specifically, if there are insurance requirements that Vendor may not be able to agree to will Anderson County, Tennessee consider exceptions to insurance terms and conditions?

Answer: The County may consider exceptions. Decisions will be the sole discretion of the County.

3. Will Anderson County, Tennessee agree to remove the language found in General Terms and Conditions section 1.11 State of Tennessee Contractor's License Law (T.C.A 62-6-119)b? Vendor believes it is not applicable to this bid.

Answer: This requirement is not applicable to this bid.

4. Will Anderson County, Tennessee waive the notary requirement?

Answer: Yes.

5. Does Anderson County, Tennessee consider electronic signatures to be valid "original" signatures (i.e.: DocuSign)?

Answer: Original signatures are preferred but electronic signatures are acceptable.

6. Can Anderson County, Tennessee please provide vendors with the most recent bid tabulation for awarded pricing and Unit of Measure for the items in the current bid?

Answer: This information is attached.

7. Renewals

- Are renewals available?
- If there are renewal terms available, are they at the sole discretion of Anderson County, Tennessee or by mutual consent of Anderson County, Tennessee and Vendor?
- Are price increases permitted? If so, at what frequency?

Answer: The County anticipates establishing a one-year contract with four, one-year renewal options. Price changes are not built into this bid. Vendors may opt out of renewal terms. The County may elect to re-bid instead of renew.

Bid #2007 - Itemized Pricing

Item	Dose	Ever Dixie USA EMS Supply	Bound Tree Medical, LLC	R&S Northeast	Life-Assist	Safe Chain Solutions	McKesson
D-50	.5 gr/ml 50ml vial	14.33	3.31	No Bid	2.917	No Bid	3.5
Acetaminophen Liquid	4 fl oz	1.63	1.18	2.65	2.21	4.7	3.02
Adenocard	6mg/2ml vial	4.54	2.5	No Bid	4.79	4.02	5.5
Adenocard	Pre-filled syringe & Vials, 6 & 12 mg	34.09	18.03	No Bid	DR0301-67: 16.24, DR-0301-68: 25.20, DR-0542-02: 4.79, DR0651-04: 26.68	No Bid	2ML SYR - 21.128, 4ML SYR -34.333, 2ML SDV - 5.500, 4ML SDV - 6.735
Albuterol	0.083% 3ml unit dose	0.17	0.13	0.11	0.4	0.11	0.16
Amiodarone	150mg/3ml ampule	2.47	1.81	No Bid	1.93	2.4	1.86
Aspirin	81 mg	0.025	0.021	0.0078	0.024	0.0116	0.0266
Atropine	1mg/10ml pre-filled/needleless syringe	10.73	11.2	No Bid	9.85	6.94	11.88
Atrovent	2.3ml unit dose vial	0.26	0.127	No Bid	0.1888	0.148	0.209
Bumetanide	0.25 mg/ml vial	5.64	3.069	No Bid	3.6	3.56	No Bid
Calcium Chloride	100mg/ml pre-filled/needleless syringe	10.24	11.24	No Bid	9.51	10.73	11.885
Calcium Gluconate	10 ml vial	No Bid	11.44	No Bid	10.61	12.31	12.08
Children's Ibuprofen Suspension	120 ml 100 mg per 5 ml	4.15	3.99	4.11	4.08	3.45	4.01
Dexamethasone	4mg/1 ml vial	1.51	2.75	2.64	2.92	1.39	79.23
Dextrose 50%	25g in 50ml pre-filled/needleless syringe	14.44	14.69	No Bid	13.51	12.9	17.497
Diastat	10mg universal	No Bid	199.3	No Bid	250	205.19	No Bid
Diphenhydramine	50mg/1 ml vial	1.14	1.24	1.17	1.39	0.04	1.27
Dopamine	400mg in 250ml D5W	16.88	13.76	No Bid	13.89	No Bid	9.39
Dopamine	400mg/10 ml vial	3.69	2.34	No Bid	2.7	No Bid	No Bid
Epi 1:1000	1mg/1ml ampule	14.49	13.3	No Bid	12	21.08	14.136
Epi 1:1000	1mg/1ml 30ml vial	18.02	261	No Bid	225.09	244.3	14.136
Epi 1:10000	1mg/10ml pre-filled/needleless syringe	9.28	9.52	No Bid	8.75	6.91	11.55
Etomidate	2mg/ml 40ml pre-filled/needleless syringe	7.69	34.66	No Bid	6.92	9.04	No Bid
Fentanyl	0.5 mg/10 ml vial	No Bid	3.16	No Bid	6	No Bid	No Bid
Furosemide	40mg/4ml vial	4.48	3.55	No Bid	3.68	4.45	No Bid
Glucagon Kit	1 unit dose/kit	212	358.77	294.84	297.19	328.53	225.15
Ibuprofen Tablets blister packs	800 mg	0.1081	0.068	0.082	0.15	No Bid	0.09
Instant Glucose	24gm tube	5.86	3.27	No Bid	3.16	No Bid	4.93

Lidocaine	100mg/10ml prefilled/needleless syringe	6.52	3.16	No Bid	2.64	No Bid	3.96
Lidocaine	1 gram/250ml D5W	7.47	6.57	No Bid	7.72	No Bid	7.54
Magnesium Sulfate	500mg/ml 10ml prefilled/needleless syringe	2.36	203.7	No Bid	18.5	24.55	No Bid
Mapap Children Acetaminophen	Liquid 4fl oz	1.73	6.09	No Bid	2.21	2.73	3.37
Morphine	10mg/1ml vial	No Bid	2.425	No Bid	3.52	No Bid	No Bid
Mucosal Atomization Device		4.84	6.84	No Bid	6.45	No Bid	7
Naloxone	4mg/10ml vial	180.69	146.44	No Bid	130.13	128.95	16.47
Narcan	2 mg prefilled/needleless syringe	39.06	35.55	152.18	35	52.06	42.31
Nitro stat tabs	0.4mg tablets-25 per bottle	0.84	1.597	1.31	0.75	5.95	No Bid
Ondansetron Injection	4 mg / 2 ml	0.89	0.8152	26.13	2.55	0.45	6.54
Ondansetron Tablets	4 mg	0.3087	0.1643	4.57	0.23	0.06	0.17
Pediatric Atropine	0.25mg/5ml prefilled/needleless syringe	12.8	10.187	No Bid	No Bid	18.8	No Bid
Pediatric Bicarb.	8.4% 10ml prefilled/needleless syringe	12.28	14.35	No Bid	14	18.9	No Bid
Pediatric D-25	10ml prefilled/needleless syringe	10.59	10.42	No Bid	9.83	12.4	No Bid
Sodium Bicarbonate	50ml prefilled/needleless syringe	14.53	14.44	No Bid	9.75	16.6	No Bid
Sodium Chloride Prefilled	10 mg	0.29	0.31	No Bid	0.39	0.72	0.59
Solu Medrol	125mg vial	11.88	12.1	254.30, 25x2ml	11.39	11.56	1.59
Thiamine	100mg/ml vial	14.07	12.82	No Bid	20.35	15.69	13.14
Toradol	30mg/1ml vial	No Bid	1.69	137.50, 25x1ml	1.87	1.26	1.43
Tylenol Extra Strength Rapid Release gel tablets	500 mg	0.1709	0.0355	No Bid	0.0357	0.01	0.016
Valium	10mg/2ml vial	No Bid	34.083	No Bid	58	No Bid	No Bid
Versed	10mg/1ml vial	No Bid	1.277	No Bid	28	No Bid	No Bid
Racemic EPI 2.25%		No Bid	1.94	No Bid	1.11	No Bid	1.98
Online Ordering Available?		Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes