Bid #4953
Guardrail (New & Used)

Question & Answer

1. Could you please send me a bid tab for the line items on the last contract awarded for
the Guardrail Bid?

Answer: Please see the attached.



BID NO. 4466 Highway Markings, Inc. TN Guardrail, Inc.
Guardrail (New & Used) 9510 Maynardville Hwy. 2620 Pickel Ln
Opened May 19,2016 Maynardville, Tn 37807 _ Knoxville, TN 37914 |
Contact: |Gary Hibben | Craig Wells] | Kristie C. Cavin
Phone:[865-922-9229 865-522-9734 §1865-922-4488
Fax:|865-922-9238 865-637-8629 11865-381-1717
Email:|gary@highwaymarkings.com cwells@tenneseeguardrail.com | | Kristie@roadwaysolutions.com

Gauge New . New Used New Used
Guard Rail (Per L.F.) $7.27 $3.35 $5.50 $3.00 $6.00 $4.00
Guard Rail 12.5 CC AAS HH 180 Spacers $5.98 $3.45 $5.00 $5.00 $6.00 $4.00
Standard End Sections $38.75 $27.25 $33.25 $33.25 $50.00 $25.00
Post 8.5 (per foot) 5°9” $39.45 $14.25 $42.25 $7.00 $8.00 $5.00
Labor Charges (per L.F.) $3.75 $3.75 $12.00 $12.00 $5.00 $5.00
Based on post spacing @12°6” Centers
Labor Charge (per L.F.) Based on Post Spacing @ $4.57 $4.57 $12.00 _ 1$12.00 $8.00 $8.00

d
Guard Rail — Metal Deep Beam, Single-Bridge Post, Post
Spacing 3" 1.5:Item 705-02.05 (per L.F.) Installed
$74.50 $49.85 $24.00 $12.00 $90.00 [N/A

Not Installed $49.50 $38.25 $18.25 $12.00 £ $50.00 [N/A
Guard Rail-Terminal Anchor Type II $1,150.00 [No Bid $850.00 |No Bid N/A N/A
Item #705-04.01 Installed
Not Installed $875.00 |No Bid $650.00 |No Bid N/A N/A
Guard Rail-Terminal Anchor Type 12: $750.00 [No Bid $650.00 [No Bid $500.00 |N/A
Item #705-04.02 Installed
Not Installed $565.00 [No Bid $250.00 |No Bid $250.00 |[N/A
Guard Rail-Terminal Anchor Type 13: $595.00 |No Bid $625.00 |No Bid $400.00 |N/A
Iltem #705-04.03-Installed
Not Installed $525.00 [No Bid $480.00 |No Bid $250.00 |N/A
Metal Deep Beams-Single Guard Rail Post 12 $17.25 $10.75 $20.00 $10.00 $28.00  |$23.00
Spacing 6'3" Item #705-02.02 LF-Installed
Not Installed 12 $13.92 $7.23 $12.50 $3.50 $14.00 |$9.00
Protective Guard Rail @ Bridge Ends 12 $64.50 $46.75 $75.00 No Bid $75.00 N/A
Iltems 705-01.01 LF-Installed i
Not Installed $42.25 $27.50 $47.00 $35.00 |N/A




BID NO. 4466

Highway Markings, Inc.

| | TN Guardrail, Inc.

Roadway Solutions, LLC.

Guardrail (New & Used)

9510 Maynardville Hwy.

112620 Pickel Ln

6829 Tice Lane

Opened May 19,2016

Maynardville, Tn 37807

Knoxville, TN 37914

Knoxville, TN 37918

Contact: |Gary Hibben Craig Wells| | Kristie C. Cavin
Phone:|865-922-9229 865-522-9734 865-922-4488
Fax:|865-922-9238 865-637-8629 865-381-1717 I
Email:| gary@highwaymarkings.com cwells@tenneseeguardrail. ysolutions.com
Gauge New New Used New | Used
Guard-Terminal Anchor Type 14 Mod; (type 13) |$585.00 $575.00 |No Bid $500.00 |N/A
Iltem 705-04.05 ea-Installed
Not Installed (type 13) [$425.00 $480.00 |No Bid $250.00 |N/A
Metal Deep Beams-Guard Rail (Bridge Rail) $58.25 $50.00 $35.00 $60.00 N/A
Post Spacing 6'3" Item 705-06 LF-Installed $31.75
Not Installed $36.40 $25.00 |N/A
Guardrail Termial Anchor-Type 21 $1,685.00 $1,338.00 |No Bid $2,400.00|N/A
Item #705-04.04
Payment Terms: Net 30 Net 30
Bid Basis: all or none or none All or none
Delivery Within: 3 days { As Required
Additional Purchases: Yes i |Yes
Pricing Stable: 60 days |60 days




