
HIGHLANDS COUNTY
BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

Purchasing Department

AWARD TABULATION OF SEALED BIDS

ITB 17-026

CONCRETE CULVERTS

Bid opening: 3/15/17

Bidder: County Materilals Corp.

PRICE/FT

$10.64

$14.98

$22.82

$32.41

545.29

$56.49

571.47

$19.38

$23.37

$37.91

No bid

$53.49

$76.57

$100.54

No bid

5122.65

$25.77

$31.46

$41.43

$107.66

5140.93

$177.70

5218.12

$31.46

ed concrete culvert, Class III, 24" X 38", Oval

ed concrete culvert, Class III, 29" X 45", Oval

ed concrete culvert. Class 111,19'" x 30", Oval

ed concrete culvert, Class III, 29" X 18", Oval

ed concrete culvert, Class III, IS", Round

ed concrete culvert. Class Ill, 18", Round

ed concrete culvert, Class III, 24", Round

ed concrete culvert, Class III, 42", Round

ed concrete culvert. Class III, 48", Round

ed concrete culvert, Class III, 30", Round

ed concrete culvert, Class III, 36", Round

ed concrete culvert. Class III, 12" X 18", Oval

ed concrete culvert, Class III, 14N X 2r, Oval

TION

ced concrete culvert, Class lit, 38" X 60", Oval

ced concrete culvert, Class III, 15", Mitered Round

ced concrete culvert, Class III, 36", Mitered Round

ced concrete culvert, Class III, 36" x 22", Oval

ced concrete culvert, Class Ill, 18", Mitered Round

ced concrete culvert, Class Ill, 24", Mitered Round

ced concrete culvert, Class Ill, 30", Mitered Round

ced concrete culvert, Class III, 42", Mitered Round

ced concrete culvert, Class Ill, 48", Mitered Round

ced concrete culvert, Class III, 12" X 18", Mitered Oval

14 Remforced concrete culvert, Class III, 34" X 53", Oval

NUM DE5CRIP

1 IReintorc

2 Reintorc

3 Reintorc

4 Reinterc

5 Reintorc

6 Reintorc

7 TReinforc

8 Reintorc

9 Reinferc

10 Reintorc

11 Reintorc

12 Reinferc

13 Reintorc

15 Reinfor

16 Reinfor

17 !Reinfor

18 Reinfor

19 Reinfor

20 Reinfor

21 Reinfor

22 IReinfor

23 Reinfor

24 Reinfor
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PRICE/FT

$35.17

$60.74

$46.37

No bid

$171.63

$216.23

No bid

$260.09

$13.58

$19.74

$26.81

$38.92

$53.76

$84.56

$106.96

$24.41

$30.02

$47.69

No bid

$67.26

$96.99

$119.98

No bid

$147.25

$25.77

$31.46

$41.43

$107.66

$140.93

$177.70

$218.12

$31.46

$35.17

$60.74

$46.37

ced concrete culvert, Class IV, 14" X 23", Oval

ced concrete culvert, Class IV, 19" x 30", Oval

ced concrete culvert, Class IV, 12" X IS", Oval

ced concrete culvert, Class IV, 30", Mitered Round

ced concrete culvert, Class IV, IS", Mitered Round

ced concrete culvert, Class IV, 24", Mitered Round

ced concrete culvert, Class IV, IS", Mitered Round

ced concrete culvert, Class IV, 3S" X 60". Oval

ced concrete culvert, Class IV, 34" X 53", Oval

ced concrete culvert, Class IV, 36" x 22", Oval

ced concrete culvert, Class III, 3S" X GO". Mitered Oval

ced concrete culvert, Class IV, IS". Round

ced concrete culvert, Class IV, 29" X IS". Oval

ced concrete culvert, Class IV, 24" X 3S". Oval

ced concrete culvert, Class IV, 29" X 45", Oval

ced concrete culvert, Class IV, IS", Round

ced concrete culvert, Class IV, 19" X 3D", Mitered Oval

ced concrete culvert, Class IV, 24", Round

ced concrete culvert, Class IV, 3D", Round

ced concrete culvert, Class IV, 36", Round

ced concrete culvert, Class IV, 42", Round

ced concrete culvert, Class IV, 4S". Round

ced concrete culvert, Class IV, 36", Mitered Round

ced concrete culvert. Class IV, 42", Mitered Round

ced concrete culvert, Class IV, 4S", Mitered Round

ced concrete culvert. Class IV, 12" X IS", Mitered Oval

ced concrete culvert, Class III, 29" X 45", Mitered Oval

ced concrete culvert, Class III, 34" X 53", Mitered Oval

ted concrete culvert, Class III, 36" X 22", Mitered Oval

ced concrete culvert, Class IV. 14" X 23", Mitered Oval

ced concrete culvert, Class IV, 24" x "3S. Mitered Oval

ced concrete culvert, Class III, 24" x "38, Mitered Oval

ted concrete culvert, Class III, 19" X 3D", Mitered Oval

ced concrete culvert, Crass Ill, 29")( 18", Mitered Oval

ced concrete culvert, Class III, 14- X 2r, Mitered Oval

PTIONNUM OESCRI

2S Reintor

26 Reintor

27 Reintor

28 Reintor

29 Reintor
I

30 Reintor

31 Reinter

32 Reintor

33 Reintor
I

34 Reintor

35 Reinfar

36 Reinter

37 Reintor

38 Reinter

39 Reintor

40 Reintor

41 Reintor

42 Reintor

43 Reinfer

44 Reintor

45 Reintor

46 Reinfer

47 Reintor

48 Reintor

49 Reintor

50 Reinfor

51 Reintor

52 Reintar

53 1Reinfor

54 Reinfor

55 Reinfor

56 Reintor

57 Reintor

58 Reintor

59 Reintor
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NUM DESCRIPTION

60 Reinforced concrete culvert, Class IV, 29" x 1S", Mitered Oval

61 Reinforced concrete culvert, Class IV, 29" X45", Mitered Oval

62 Reinforced concrete culvert, Class IV, 34" X 53", Mitered Oval

63 Reinforced concrete culvert, Class IV, 36" X22", Mitered Oval

64 Reinforced concrete culvert. Class IV, 38" X 60", Mitered Oval

PRICE/FT

No bid

$171.63

$216.23

No bid

$260.09

VENDORS

County Materials Corp. 27571 CR 561, Astatula, Fl3470S

Delivery: 5-6 days; 3 weeks for Class IV

PHONE

941-915-3671

E-VERIFY

Confirmed

local Vendors are indicated by the designation (LV). Award based off of local Preference is indicated by the

designation (lPA). local Preference was not used to award this bid.

RECOMMEND AWARDING TO THE SOLE BIDDER, COUNTY MATERIALS CORP. BASED ON

FOR THE BID PERIOD 04/01/2017 - 03/31/2018.

Kyle Green

RECOMMENDATION APPROVED BY:

,1·,/1/-/1•
Date
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