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Cold Bid School Year 2022-2023 Bid# SN-23-01
Vendor Name: Sysco GOLD STAR FOODS ePallet, Inc. Edna's

ITEM NAME DESCRIPTION
EST.Preffered Brand

Brand Vendor ID

Case PACK/SIZE Price

Brand Vendor ID

Case Serving Price

Brand Vendor ID

Case Serving Price

Brand Vendor ID

Case Serving Price

Usageor equivelent Price in Case Per Serving Price in Case Per Serving Price in Case Per Serving Price in Case Per Serving

1 BUTTER, 1LB PRINTS no salt, zero trans fat 5 WHLFIMP 7485170 $100.70 30 $3.36 PACKER LABEL, #171335, 30/1LB 305761 $112.74 90 $1.25 No Bid $ - #DIV/0! $ - No Bid

2 BUTTER, BULK, SALTED 5 WHLFIMP 7475999 $100.43 30 $3.35 PACKER LABEL, #4759, 30/1LB TBD $112.74 90 $1.25 No Bid $ - #DIV/0! $ - No Bid

3 BUTTER, PATS, SALTED 5 WHLFIMP 3029404 $69.08 5 $13.82 NO BID #VALUE! No Bid #DIV/0! No Bid

4 BUTTERMILK, CARTON 5 WHLFCLS 7160697 $15.56 6 $2.59 NO BID #VALUE! No Bid #DIV/0! No Bid

5 CHEESE, CREAM, BULK, TUB 5 WHLFCLS 4755821 $38.78 4 $9.70 PHILADELPHIA, #40532, 3LB TBD $15.09 44 $0.34 No Bid #DIV/0! No Bid

6 CHEESE, CREAM, CUP 1oz portion, low fat 5 PHILA 3717279 $28.93 100 $0.29 KRAFT HEINZ FOODS CO, #377674/61095, 100/1OZ 300066 $38.82 100 $0.39 No Bid #DIV/0! No Bid

7 CHEESE, SHREDDED, CHEDDAR 20lbs, 4 bags, reduced fat 10 CASAIMP 2406163 $64.31 4 $16.08 BONGARDS, #755711, 4/5LB 406609 $75.16 80 $0.94 No Bid #DIV/0! No Bid

8 CHEESE, SHREDDED, COLBY JACK 20lbs, 4 bags, reduced fat 10 GD NATR 154300 NO BID NO BID #VALUE! LAND O LAKES, #41485, 4/5LB 405802 $57.61 80 $0.72 No Bid #DIV/0! No Bid

9 CHEESE, SHREDDED, MOZZARELLA 20lbs, 4 bags, reduced fat 10 AREZIMP 20402 $87.60 6 $14.60 LAND O LAKES, #41698, 4/5# PCH 401140 $57.35 80 $0.72 No Bid #DIV/0! No Bid

10 CHEESE, SLICED, AMERICAN reduced fat 10 BBRLCLS 5132244 $57.46 4 $14.37 LAND O LAKES, #46253, 6/5#-160CT 401166 $75.41 160 $0.47 No Bid #DIV/0! No Bid

11 CHEESE, SLICED, CHEDDAR reduced fat 10 BBRLIMP 3546369 $43.05 8 $5.38 LAND O LAKES, #44224, 8/1.5LB 402003 $51.89 24 $2.16 No Bid #DIV/0! No Bid

12 CHEESE, SLICED, PEPPER JACK block 10 BBRLIMP 7881352 $46.53 8 $5.82 LAND O LAKES, #44238, 8/1.5LB 402004 $51.90 24 $2.16 No Bid #DIV/0! No Bid

13 CHEESE, SLICED, PEPPER JACK reduced fat 10 BBRLIMP 7881352 $46.53 8 $5.82 NO BID #VALUE! No Bid #DIV/0! No Bid

14 CHEESE, STICK, COLBY JACK reduced fat, 1 oz 10 LOL 7816103 DISC DISC #VALUE! NO BID #VALUE! No Bid #DIV/0! No Bid

15 CHEESE, STICK, STRING reduced fat, 1 oz 10 AREZIMP 4384214 $36.29 168 $0.22 LAND O LAKES, #59703, 168/1OZ 401174 $40.72 168 $0.24 No Bid #DIV/0! No Bid

16 CINNAMON ROLL whole grain, fresh 700 PILLSBY 5336716 $30.31 100 $0.30 PILLSBURY, #100-94562-11111-0, 100/2.7OZ 141214 $31.90 100 $0.32 No Bid #DIV/0! Edna's 1595 $36.50 60 $0.61

17 CREAMER, NON DAIRY, cups 5 CITVCLS 7100285 $14.22 384 $0.04 COFFEEMATE, #350107/356549, 360/.38OZ 249891 $21.35 360 $0.06 No Bid #DIV/0! No Bid

18 CREAMER, NON DAIRY, ASSORTED FLAVORS cups 5 CITVCLS 7100252 $16.15 288 $0.06 INTERNATIONAL DELIGHT, #817534b, 192CT 239870 $14.09 192 $0.07 No Bid #DIV/0! No Bid

19 EGGS, HARD BOILED 5 ABBTSFD 7033374 $44.96 144 $0.31 SUNNY FRESH, #51039, 12/6CT 406919 $28.01 72 $0.39 No Bid #DIV/0! No Bid

20 EGGS, LIQUID, CARTON 5 ABBTSFD 5169004 $60.58 15 $4.04 SUNNY FRESH, #10081, 12/2LB 409713 $60.44 216 $0.28 No Bid #DIV/0! No Bid

21 EGGS, SHELLED, LARGE, USDA AA 15 dozen case 5 WHLFIMP 7180341 $58.48 15 $3.90 NO BID #VALUE! No Bid #DIV/0! No Bid

22 RELISH, PICKLE 4 one gallon 5 BBRLCLS 4369363 $28.38 4 $7.10 MRS KLEIN PICKLE, #62041, 4/1GAL 249296 $34.18 128 $0.27 No Bid #DIV/0! No Bid

23 SOUR CREAM, BULK 32LB Bucket 5 WHLFCLS 4021044 $53.73 1 $53.73 UPSTATE FARMS, #364388/9352, 4/5LB TBD $39.07 76 $0.51 No Bid #DIV/0! No Bid

24 YOGURT, BANANA-STRAWBERRY 4oz portion, non fat 1500 YOPLAIT 5076611 $14.95 48 $0.31 DANNON COMPANY INC, #73558/524822, 48/4OZ 300454 $13.00 48 $0.27 Danone / Danimals 73558 $12.96 48 $0.27 No Bid

25 YOGURT, RASPBERRY 4oz portion, non fat 1500 YOPLAIT 5076627 $14.73 48 $0.31 DANNON COMPANY INC, #91582, 48/4OZ TBD $13.00 48 $0.27 No Bid #DIV/0! No Bid

26 YOGURT, STRAWBERRY 4oz portion, non fat 1500 DANNON 8653952 $11.23 48 $0.23 DANNON COMPANY INC., #73463/524821, 48/4OZ 300453 $13.00 48 $0.27 Danone / Danimals 73463 $12.96 48 $0.27 No Bid

27 YOGURT, VANILLA, LITE 32oz tub, low fat 5 WHLFCLS 4360893 $16.67 6 $2.78 YOPLAIT, #439, 6/32OZ 300345 $16.82 24 $0.70 No Bid #DIV/0! No Bid


