Orange Beach

UNIT PRICE BID TABULATION SHEET

Project Name:
Requisition No.

POLICE VEHICLE EMERGENCY EQUIPMENT
2017-0505

Bid Date: May 4, 2017
Bid Opening Time: 11:00 AM

Bidder's Name Custom Order Police Specialties Dana Safety Supply Emergency Lighting by Haynes Firehouse Sales and Service Gulf States Distributors Richardson Communications Sunbelt Fire Team One Communications
City, State Loxley, AL Greensboro, NC Montgomery, AL Loxley, AL Montgomery, AL Thomasville, AL Fairhope, AL Mobile, AL
;i; Unit Price Extended Total Unit Price Extended Total Unit Price Extended Total Unit Price Extended Total Unit Price Extended Total Unit Price Extended Total Unit Price Extended Total Unit Price Extended Total

A. Whelen Legacy Solo WC 54” Light Bar (GS2SP1B) GS2BBBB 6 NO BID $ 1,425.00 | $ 8,550.00] $ 1,410.00 | $ 8,460.00] $ 2,350.00 | $ 14,100.00| $ 1,469.00 | $ 8,814.00| $ 1,596.00 | $ 9,576.00| $ 1,349.95 | $ 8,099.70| $ 1,567.50 | $ 9,405.00
B. Whelen Siren/Control Center 295SLSA6 8 NOBID S 285.00 | $ 2,280.000 $ 300.00 | $ 2,400.00 Included S 299.00 | $ 2,392.00( $ 299.99 | $ 2,399.92( $ 44352 [ S 3,548.16| $ 31350 | $ 2,508.00
C. Whelen Speaker, Black Plastic SA315P 8 NOBID s 129.00 | $ 1,032.000 $ 125.00 | $ 1,000.00 Included s 149.00 | $ 1,192.00( $ 118.00 | $ 944.00| $ 21648 | S 1,731.84( S 14190 | $ 1,135.20
D. Whelen Universal/Swivel Bail Type Mounting Bracket SAK9 8 NO BID Included s 10.00 | $ 80.00 Included Included s 40.00 | $ 320.00| $ 27.06 | S 216.48| S - S -
E. Whelen M4 LED Flasher Blue, Clear Lens M4BC 12 NO BID S 98.00 [ $ 1,176.00] $ 95.00 [ $ 1,140.00] $ 135.00 | $ 1,620.00( $ 109.00 | $ 1,308.00( $ 45.00 | $ 540.00| $ 124.08 [ $ 1,488.96( $ 107.80 | $ 1,293.60
F. Whelen M4 Fog Lt Mt 2017 Tahoe Blk-Pa M4CT15B 6 NO BID S 37.00( $ 222.000 $ 36.50 [ $ 219.000 $ 24.00 | $ 144.00| $ 115.00 | $ 690.00| $ 21.60 | $ 129.60| $ 46.86 | $ 28116 $ 4070 | $ 244.20
G. Whelen Dominator 2 Super LED B/B D2BB 16 NO BID s 124.00 | $ 1,984.000 $ 119.00 | $ 1,904.00] $ 101.00 | $ 1,616.00( $ 115.00 | $ 1,840.00( $ 12000 | $ 1,920.00( $ 153.78 [ $ 2,460.48( S 13640 | S 2,182.40
H. Whelen Dominator 8 Super LED Blue D808000 8 NO BID S 355.00 | $ 2,840.000 $ 345.00 | $ 2,760.00] $ 270.00 | $ 2,160.00( $ 295.00 | $ 2,360.00( $ 289.00 | $ 2,312.00( $ 44550 | $ 3,564.00( $ 390.50 | $ 3,124.00
I. Whelen Dominator 6 Super LED Blue D6BBBBBB 6 NO BID s 276.00 | $ 1,656.00] $ 270.00 | $ 1,620.000 $ 270.00 | $ 1,620.00( $ 290.00 | $ 1,740.00( $ 289.00 | $ 1,734.00( $ 349.14 | $ 2,094.84( S 303.60 | $ 1,821.60
J. Whelen Tahoe Rear Window BKT THBKT 8 NOBID S 1200 | $ 96.00] $ 20.00 [ $ 160.00] $ 40.00 | $ 320.00| $ 799.00 | $ 6,392.00| $ 39.95 | $ 319.60| $ 1584 | $ 126.72| $ 1320 $ 105.60
K. Whelen Tracer DUO 5-Lamp Housing TCRHDS Blue/White 16 NO BID $ 689.00 | $ 11,024.00] $ 540.00 | $ 8,640.00] $ 764.00 | $ 12,224.00 NO BID $ 789.99 | $ 12,639.84| $ 87450 | $ 13,992.00| $ 757.90 | $ 12,126.40
L. Sound Off Tahoe Wig Wag ETHTAHO for 2017 Chevy Tahoe 8 NOBID S 42.00 | $ 336.00] s 46.00 | $ 368.00] $ 6235 $ 498.80 NO BID S 69.99 [ $ 559.92| $ 68.20 [ $ 545.60 | $ 46.20 | $ 369.60
M. Cannon Hide-A-Way 12 LED H-2209BW 16 NO BID S 57.50 [ $ 920.004 $ 55.00 [ $ 880.00] $ 76.00 [ $ 1,216.00( $ 75.00 [ $ 1,200.00( $ 7599 | $ 1,215.84( S 7590 | $ 1,214.40( $ 63.25 (S 1,012.00
N.2017 Tahoe (PPV) 23” Console C-VS-1013-TAH 8 NOBID S 269.90 | $ 2,159.200 $ 275.00 | $ 2,200.000 $ 339.40 | $ 2,715.20( $ 435.00 | $ 3,480.00( $ 396.00 | $ 3,168.00( $ 37332 | $ 2,986.56| $ 296.89 | $ 2,375.12
0. Arm Rest Hinged w/ Pad C-ARM-103 8 NO BID S 79.21 | $ 633.68] $ 74.00 [ $ 592.000 $ 7337 $ 586.96| $ 65.00 [ $ 520.00| $ 105.00 | $ 840.00| $ 95.45 | $ 763.60| S 8712 $ 696.96
P. 4” Plate w/ Two Cup Holder C-CUP2-1 Internal Cup Holders 8 NOBID S 3020 $ 241.600 $ 26,50 [ $ 212.000 $ 3112 $ 248.96 | $ 29.00 [ $ 232,00 $ 34.96 | $ 279.68| $ 33.96 | $ 271.68| $ 3322 $ 265.76
Q. Accessory Pocket 6” High & 4 C-AP-0645 8 NO BID $ 4438 S 355.04] $ 41.00| S 328.000 $ 39.28 | $ 314.24 Included S 3590 | $ 287.20( $ 5259 | $ 42072| $ s -
R. 1-p Equ Mounting Bkt, 4” Deep C-EB40-WS2-1P 8 NOBID Included Included Included Included Included Included S - S -
S. 1-p Equ Mounting Bk, 2.5” Mou C-EB25-MMT-1P 8 NO BID Included Included Included Included Included Included S S -
T. 1-1/2” Filler Plate C-FP-15 8 NO BID Included Included Included Included Included Included S - S -
U. 3” Filler Plate C-FP-3 8 NO BID Included Included Included Included Included Included S S -
V. Havis 8.5” Heavy Duty Telescoping Pole, C-HDM-204 8 NO BID $ 108.44 | $ 867.52) $ 106.50 | $ 852.00f $ 12525 $ 1,002.00| $ 219.00 | $ 1,752.00( $ 33741 $ 2,699.28( $ 13665 | $ 1,093.20( $ 119.28 | $ 954,24
W. Havis Swing Arm w/ Motion Adapter 8 NOBID S 15152 | $ 1,212.16] $ 76.00 [ $ 608.00] $ 23338 S 1,867.04 Included Included s 25460 | S 2,036.80( $ 166.67 | S 1,333.36
X. Havis Universal Laptop Platform UT-101 8 NOBID $ 17433 | $ 1,394.64] $ 17375 | $ 1,390.00] $ 20451 $ 1,636.08 Included Included $ 22310 $ 1,784.80( $ 19176 | $ 1,534.08
Y. Go Rhino 5000 Series Alum Push Bumper 5165A 6 NO BID s 264.50 | S 1,587.000 $ 255.00 | $ 1,530.000 $ 310.00 | $ 1,860.00( $ 319.00 | $ 1,914.00( $ 385.00 | $ 2,310.00( $ 357.50 | $ 2,145.00( $ 29095 | $ 1,745.70
Z. L Bracket LBKT 16 NOBID S 6.00 | $ 96.00] $ 250 | $ 40.00Q $ 1200 | $ 192.00 $ 300($ 48.00 Included S 20.00 [ $ 320.00 $ 6.60 [ $ 105.60
AA. Pro-Gard P5704T15A Partition 8 NO BID s 436.13 [ S 3,489.04] $ 435.00 | S 3,480.000 $ 53117 | $ 4,24936| $ 479.00 | $ 3,832.00| $ 525.00 | $ 4,200.00| $ 499.00 | $ 3,992.00| $ 479.74 | S 3,837.92
BB. Pro-Gard RP57T15 Recessed Panel 8 NOBID S 7734 $ 618.72] $ 70.00 [ $ 560.000 $ 86.47 | $ 691.76 | $ 79.00 [ $ 632.00 Included S 77.00 | $ 616.00| $ 85.07 [ $ 680.56
CC. Pro-Gard SP57BS15 Lower Extension Panel 8 NO BID S 62.57 | $ 500.56 $ 56.00 [ $ 448.00] $ 67.52 | $ 540.16 | $ 59.00 [ $ 472.00| $ 85.00 [ $ 680.00| $ 64.90 [ $ 519.20| $ 68.83 [ $ 550.64
DD. Pro-Gard S5705T15 Abs Seat and Cargo Barrier 8 NOBID S 74839 | $ 5,987.12 $ 752.00 | $ 6,016.00] $ 929.76 | $ 7,438.08| $ 829.00 | $ 6,632.00| $ 977.50 | $ 7,820.00| $ 878.90 | $ 7,031.20| $ 823.78 | $ 6,590.24
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Project Name: POLICE VEHICLE EMERGENCY EQUIPMENT Bid Date: May 4, 2017
Requisition No. 2017-0505 Bid Opening Time: 11:00 AM
Bidder's Name Custom Order Police Specialties Dana Safety Supply Emergency Lighting by Haynes Firehouse Sales and Service Gulf States Distributors Richardson Communications Sunbelt Fire Team One Communications
EE. Pro-Gard WB57NPT15 Steel Window Barriers NO BID s 160.57 | $ 1,284.56] S 155.75 | $ 1,246.00] $ 19270 [ $ 1,541.60( $ 169.00 | $ 1,352.00( $ 169.00 | $ 1,352.00( $ 18150 | $ 1,452.00( $ 176,57 | $ 1,412.56
FF. Pro-Gard Tri Lock Gun Rack GVPM5715D-H NOBID S 34516 | $ 2,761.28] $ 335.00 | $ 2,680.000 $ 435.64 S 3,485.12( $ 369.00 | $ 2,952.00( $ 223.00 | $ 1,784.00( $ 394.90 | $ 3,159.20( $ 379.68 | $ 3,037.44
GG. K-9 Equipment: Hotdog Plus Temperature Monitor NO BID S 1,041.95| S 1,041.95] $ 1,075.00 | $ 1,075.000 $ 481.00 | $ 481.00 NO BID s 450.00 | $ 450.00| $ 74162 | S 741.62| $ 1,146.15 | $ 1,146.15
HH. K-9 Equipment: MIM Safe Variocage Single NOBID S 1,041.09 | $ 1,041.09] $ 1,075.00 | $ 1,075.00] $ 1,425.00 | $ 1,425.00 NO BID S 735.00 | $ 735.00| $ 1,095.00 | $ 1,095.00( $ 1,145.20 | $ 1,145.20
Il. Whelen Inner Edge XLP Low Current DUO+ ID45UFX NO BID s 975.00 | $ 1,950.00] $ 650.00 | $ 1,300.00] $ 650.00 | $ 1,300.00( $ 665.00 | $ 1,330.00( $ 667.20 | $ 1,334.40( $ 1,098.24 | $ 2,196.48 $ 1,072.50 | $ 2,145.00
Equipment Subtotal NOBID $ 59,337.16 | $ 55,263.00 ] $ 67,093.36 | $ 53,076.00 | $ 62,550.28 | $ 71,989.40 | $ 64,884.13
Delivery, Equipment Only NO BID Included Included $ 395.00 Included $ 1,231.21 | $ 600.00 Included
OPTION 1 - Equipment Only, No Installation NO BID $ 59,337.16 | $ 55,263.00 | $ 67,488.36 | $ 53,076.00 | $ 63,781.49 | $ 72,589.40 | $ 64,884.13
Installation, Including Pickup and Drop-Off of Vehicle $  1,200.00|$  9,600.00 | $ 990.00 | $  7,920000]$  1,200.00 | $  9,600.00] $ 700.00 [ $  5,600.00 NOBID $ 217890 |$ 1743120 |$  1,650.00 [ $ 13,200.00 | $ 950.00 | $  7,600.00
OPTION 2 - Equipment and Installation NO BID $ 67,257.16 | $ 64,863.00 | $ 73,088.36 NO BID $ 79,981.48 | $ 85,789.40 | $ 72,484.13
OPTIONAL ITEMS, INSTALLATION ONLY:
). 4RE In-Car Camera System $ 250.00| $ 450.00 ] $ 145.00 Included NO BID S 150.00 | $ 187.50 | $ 450.00
KK. Bee Ill Radar Unit S 125.00( $ 17500 $ 50.00 Included NOBID S 11250 | $ 75.00 [ $ 175.00
LL. Motorola Radio and Antenna $ 95.00( $ 175.000 $ 60.00 Included NOBID $ 75.00 | $ 187.50 | $ 175.00
MM. Sierra Wireless Mobile Gateway and Timer S 125.00 $ 95.00] S 60.00 Included NO BID $ 11250 [ $ 150.00 | $ 95.00
NN. Headrest Printer and Scanner $ 75.00( $ 75.001 $ 60.00 Included NOBID $ 75.00 | $ 75.00 | $ 75.00
00. Vehicle decal graphics, with Materials S 600.00| $ 970.00 $ 375.00§ $ 650.00 NO BID $ 1,367.50 | $ 953.80 | $ 1,050.00
OPTIONAL ITEMS TOTAL $ 1,270.00 | $ 1,940.00 | $ 750.00 f $ 650.00 NO BID $ 1,892.50 | $ 1,628.80 | $ 2,020.00
Days to Deliver 20 Days 30-45 Days 30 Days 30 Days 60 Days 45-60 Days 6 Weeks 6 Weeks
W " Lifeti Installati 5-Year Installation, 5-Yrs on LED, 2-Yrs on Siren, Manufact W " Manufact W " 5-Year Installation, 1-Year Parts and Labor on All,
arranty ffetime on Instaflation Manufacturers Warranty 1-Yr on Speaker, 5-Yrs on Labor anufacturers Warranty anufacturers Warranty Manufacturers Warranty 5-Years Parts Only on LED
PARTIAL BID - Substitutions on Items A-K, M-Il
Corrected extended total, Item Y. Corrected total for PARTIAL BID Corrected extended subtotals.
Notes INSTALLATION ONLY Cartied through to toal Ootional It Substitutions on tems AL, M-2 Corrected equipment subtotal Carried through to total
Add $225 to install K-9 Equip arried through fo totals. prionatitems ubstitut . Carried through to totals. arried through tototals.

Tabulated by R. Eberly 5/8/2017




