
CITY OF WILSON

WATER CHEMICALS

BID #2022-19

May 31, 2022 @ 2 PM

ITEM 1 ITEM 2 ITEM 3 ITEM 4 ITEM 5 ITEM 6 ITEM 7

LIQUID POLYPHOSPHATE POWDERED HYDRATED LIQUID LIQUID LIQUID 

HYDROFLUOSILICIC SILICATE ACTIVATED LIME SODIUM FERRIC CHLORINE

ACID CARBON HYDROXIDE SULFATE

$ PER CWT. $ PER CWT. $ PER TON $ PER TON $ PER TON $ PER TON $ PER CWT.

VENDOR

KEMIRA WATER SOLUTIONS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $545.00 3 MTHS NO BID

$545.00 1 YR

PENCCO INC $27.10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $488.76 3 MTHS NO BID

$803.08 1 YR

JCI JONES CHEMICALS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,125.00 3 MTHS NO BID $85.00

$1,125.00 1 YR

CHEMTRADE CHEMICALS US LLC NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,133.33 3 MTHS NO BID

$1,133.33 1 YR 

CARMEUSE LIME & STONE INC NO BID NO BID NO BID $438.93 NO BID NO BID NO BID

LHOIST NORTH AMERICA NO BID NO BID NO BID $506.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID

CARBON ACTIVATED CORP NO BID NO BID $2,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

GREER LIME COMPANY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

SHANNON CHEMICAL CORP NO BID $174.14 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

USALCO/G20 TECHNOLOGIES NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

BRENNTAG MID-SOUTH INC NO BID NO BID $1,799.99 NO BID NO BID 3 MTHS NO BID NO BID

$1,019.00 1 YR

UNIVAR SOLUTIONS $23.50 NO BID $2,180.00 $380.00 $995.00 3 MTHS NO BID NO BID

$975.00 1 YR

David Staab will review and make recommendation(s) awarding.

____________________________________________________________

Ricky Wilson, Purchasing Manager


