
VENDOR 
Name: A2 23-041 Itemized Bid Form rev 9/27/2023

Bid Item # OP IQ# ITEM DESCRIPTION Price each item Price each item Price each item Price each item Price each item Price each item Price each item Price each item Price each item

1
Airway 1234

ET Tube Flexi Set, Uncuffed; 2.5 mm
3.81 4.6741 No Bid 3.3 3.5 3.61

2 Airway 1235 ET Tube Flexi Set, Uncuffed; 3.0 mm 3.81 4.6741 4.48 3.3 3.5 3.61

3 Airway 1236 ET Tube Flexi Set, Uncuffed; 3.5 mm 11.16 3.81 4.6741 4.48 3.3 3.5 3.61

4 Airway 1237 ET Tube Flexi Set, Uncuffed; 4.0 mm 13.41 3.81 4.6741 4.48 3.3 3.5 3.61

5 Airway 1238 ET Tube Flexi Set, Uncuffed; 4.5 mm 26.99 3.81 4.6741 4.48 3.3 3.5 3.61

6 Airway 1239 ET Tube Flexi Set, Uncuffed; 5.0 mm 3.81 4.6741 4.48 3.3 1.196 3.73

7 Airway 1240 ET Tube Slick-Set, Uncuffed; 5.5 mm 6.40 No Bid N/A 3.25

8 Airway 1241 ET Tube Flexi Set, Cuffed; 5.5 mm 11.52 3.98 4.97 3.63 3.625 3.25

9
Airway 1242

ET Tube Flexi Set, Cuffed; 6.0 mm
3.98 4.97 3.63 3.625 3.25

10 Airway 1243 ET Tube Flexi Set, Cuffed; 6.5 mm 3.98 4.97 3.63 3.625 3.49

11 Airway 1244 ET Tube Flexi Set, Cuffed; 7.0 mm 3.98 4.97 3.63 3.625 5.42

12 Airway 1245 ET Tube Flexi Set, Cuffed; 7.5 mm 31.79 3.98 4.97 3.63 3.625 3.37

13 Airway 1246 ET Tube Flexi Set, Cuffed; 8.0 mm 31.79 3.98 4.97 3.63 3.625 5.42

14 Airway 1247 ET Tube Flexi Set, Cuffed; 8.5 mm 3.98 4.97 3.63 3.625 5.42

15 Airway 1248 ET Tube Flexi Set, Cuffed; 9.0 mm 3.98 4.97 3.63 3.625 4.07

16

Airway 1249 37 F COMBITUBE 61.58 42.96 42.65 44.14 39.5 41.8875 43.87

17
Airway 1250 41 F COMBITUBE 61.58 42.96 93.9222 56.44 44.14 39.5 41.8875 45.17

18 Airway 1251 Laryngoscope Blade, Macintosh; #2 Child 4.02 5.8356 4.44 3.51 23.54 3.16 4.22

19 Airway 1252 Laryngoscope Blade, Macintosh; #3 Medium Adult 30.35 4.02 25.4633 4.44 3.51 23.11 3.16 4.22

20 Airway 1253 Laryngoscope Blade, Macintosh; #4 Large Adult 30.35 4.02 89.0785 4.44 3.51 23.11 3.16 4.22

21 Airway 1254 Laryngoscope Blade, Miller; #0 Premature 4.02 8.6772 4.44 3.51 38.75 3.16 4.22

22 Airway 1255 Laryngoscope Blade, Miller; #1 Infant 4.02 58.5538 4.44 3.51 40.54 3.16 4.22

23 Airway 1256 Laryngoscope Blade, Miller; #2 Child 30.35 4.02 186.7860 4.44 3.51 53.89 3.16 4.22

24 Airway 1257 Laryngoscope Blade, Miller; #3 Medium Adult 30.35 4.02 25.4633 4.44 3.51 53.89 3.16 4.22

25

Airway 1258 BOUGIE STYLETTE, Coude Tip, Adult 15Fr x 70cm; 15 Fr x 70 cm 4.57 4.65 7.9 8.677 8.75

26

Airway 1259
BOUGIE STYLETTE, Coude Tip, Pediatric 10Fr x 70cm; 10 Fr x 70 
cm 22.41 4.57 7.7978 4.65 7.9 9.128 8.75
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ENTERPRISES
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Medical, LLC
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Healthcare 
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Industries, LP
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& EMS Products, 

Inc. Quadmed, Inc.
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27
Airway 1260 NPA 12 29.89 3.20 1.94 2.16 2.2 6.166 1.39 2.17

28 Airway 1261 NPA 14 29.89 1.56 1.94 2.16 2.2 6.312 1.39 2.17

29
Airway 1262 NPA 16 29.89 1.56 1.94 2.16 2.2 6.357 1.39 2.17

30
Airway 1263 NPA 18 29.89 1.56 1.94 2.16 2.2 6.366 1.39 2.17

31 Airway 1264 NPA 20 30.93 1.56 1.94 1.95 1.8 2.375 1.39 1.95

32 Airway 1265 NPA 22 30.93 1.56 1.94 1.95 1.8 2.369 1.39 1.95

33 Airway 1266 NPA 24 30.93 1.56 1.94 1.95 1.8 2.37 1.39 1.95

34 Airway 1267 NPA 26 30.93 1.56 1.94 1.95 1.8 2.364 1.39 1.95

35 Airway 1268 NPA 28 30.93 1.56 1.94 1.95 1.8 2.366 1.39 1.95

36 Airway 1269 NPA 30 30.93 1.56 1.94 1.95 1.8 2.373 1.39 1.95

37 Airway 1270 NPA 32 30.93 1.56 1.94 1.95 1.8 2.373 1.39 1.95

38 Airway 1271 NPA 34 30.93 1.56 1.94 1.95 1.8 2.369 1.39 1.95

39 Airway 1272 NPA 36 30.93 1.56 1.94 1.95 1.8 2.373 1.39 1.95

40
Airway 1273 OPA PEDIATRIC (40MM) 23.99 0.14 11.63 0.21 0.26 0.2866667 0.13 0.28

41
Airway 1274 OPA PEDIATRIC (50MM) 23.75 0.14 0.21 0.26 0.2725 0.13 0.28

42
Airway 1275 OPA 70MM (WHITE) 4.05 0.20 0.21 0.26 0.2666667 0.13 0.28

43
Airway 1276 OPA 80MM (GREEN) 1.03 0.20 11.63 0.24 0.26 0.2308333 0.13 0.28

44

Airway 1277 OPA 90MM (YELLOW) 1.03 0.20 11.63 0.24 0.26 0.21 0.13 0.28

45
Airway 1278 OPA 100MM (PINK/RED) 1.03 0.14 11.63 0.24 0.26 0.2066667 0.13 0.28

46 Airway 1279 OPA 110MM (ORANGE) 23.75 0.14 10.45 0.24 0.26 0.2541667 0.13 0.28

47 Airway 1280 BITE STICK 2.91 0.40 0.4366 0.43 0.275 0.31 0.78 0.27 4.29

48

Airway 1281 Endotrachael Tube Holder (ADULT) 2.86 1.5095 3.55 2.95 2.5 2.9385 3.11

49

Airway 1282 Endotrachael Tube Holder (PEDIATRIC) 2.86 1.5095 3.68 2.95 2.5 2.948 3.11
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50 Airway 1283 6F SUCTION CATH 1.38 0.13 0.5410 0.27 0.2 0.25 0.5858 0.12 0.34

51 Airway 1284 8F SUCTION CATH 1.38 0.13 0.5409 0.27 0.2 0.25 0.4733 0.12 0.34

52
Airway 1285 10F SUCTION CATH 1.38 0.13 0.5410 0.3 0.2 0.25 0.485 0.12 0.34

53 Airway 1286 12F SUCTION CATH 1.38 0.13 45.1696 0.3 0.2 0.25 0.5372 0.12 0.34

54 Airway 1287 14F SUCTION CATH 1.38 0.13 39.8765 0.3 0.2 0.25 0.4733 0.12 0.34

55 Airway 1288 16F SUCTION CATH 1.38 0.13 36.3104 0.3 0.2 0.25 0.6309 0.12 0.34

56 Airway 1289 18F SUCTION CATH 1.38 0.13 0.3655 0.3 0.2 0.25 0.5694 0.12 0.34

57 Airway 1290 YANKAUER 1.65 0.43 1.3884 1.27 0.43 0.42 6.62 0.12 0.71

58
Airway 1291 SUCTION CANISTER/LID, Disposable, 1200 CC 17.39 3.66 3.9997 4.07 3.23 3.15 4.165 4.71

59
Airway 1292 8F SALEM SUMP (NG TUBE) 13.2 7.74 9.2998 7.94 7.4 9.684 8.33

60
Airway 1293 12F SALEM SUMP (NG TUBE) 13.83 2.17 14.3105 2.22 2.06 2.709 2.33

61
Airway 1294 14F SALEM SUMP (NG TUBE) 3.3 2.17 23.9390 2.22 2.06 2.5562 2.33

62
Airway 1295 16F SALEM SUMP (NG TUBE) 3.26 2.17 5.0484 2.19 2.06 2.5126 2.29

63 Airway 1296
ETCO2, ETT Capnography Filterline Set Nonhumidified, 
Intubated, Adult/Pediatric 24.72 6.29 5.29 5 8.1416 5.29

64
Airway 1297

ETCO2 Nasal Capnography Smart Capnoline Plus Non-
intubated, Oral Nasal W/O2 Tubing, Adult/Intermediate 36.75 5.50 5.22 5.92 7.276 6.66

65 Airway 1298 AMBU TUBE CHECK 3.8816 Discontinued 0 N/A N/A

66

Airway 1299 NASAL CANNULA (ADULT), 7 ft. w/curved tip 1.28 0.28 0.5141 0.5 0.3 0.3 0.4388 0.24 0.43

67
Airway 1300 NASAL CANNULA (PEDIATRIC), 7 ft. w/curved tip 12 0.28 1.5776 0.6 0.49 0.72 0.4636 0.24 0.51

68
Airway 1301 NEBULIZER KIT 2.82 0.75 1.26 1.1452 0.67 n/a

69
Airway 1302 NRB MASK (ADULT) 2.23 0.75 1.7199 1.16 0.9 0.92 1.0884 0.69 0.86

70
Airway 1303 NRB MASK (PED) 2.23 0.68 1.8310 1.24 1.22 1.36 1.2024 0.69 1.13

71 Airway 1304 BVM (ADULT) 22.95 8.75 16.6992 11.3 9.11 9.58 11.423333 1.46

72 Airway 1305 BVM (PEDIATRIC) 30.33 3.48 19.0748 10.67 12.34 15.200833 13.86

73 Airway 1306 BVM Mask, Infant Size 1, Pink 2.35 52.3874 1.5 1.9 13.108333 0.95 1.67

ITB 23-041-KSB ALS/BLS 09/16/2023



VENDOR 
Name: A2 23-041 Itemized Bid Form rev 9/27/2023

Bid Item # OP IQ# ITEM DESCRIPTION Price each item Price each item Price each item Price each item Price each item Price each item Price each item Price each item Price each item

Dealmed Medical 
Supplies 

AGNI 
ENTERPRISES

Bound Tree 
Medical, LLC

Concordance 
Healthcare 
Solutions Henry Schein Life Assist

Medline 
Industries, LP

Nashville Medical 
& EMS Products, 

Inc. Quadmed, Inc.

74
Airway 1307 BVM Mask, Toddler, Size 2, Yellow 9.35 19.6659 1.5 1.9 11.788333 0.95 1.76

75
Airway 1308 C-PAP 43.14 51.18 41 61.5 50.36

76 Airway 1309 VENT CIRCUIT 10.52 12.12 11.5 10.61 11.28

77

Airway 1334 NRB Mask (Infant) 3.28 1.00 9.3353 1 1.34 3.7296 0.89 1.15

78 Airway 1348 Laryngoscope Handle, Adult 84.35 10.80 19.0319 10.49 5.68 5.643 8.99 12.05

79 Airway 1349 Laryngoscope Handle, Pediatric 84.35 26.24 189.3968 10.66 5.68 5.643 8.99 12.05

80

Airway 1691 SUCTION Bubble TUBING, 1/4" x 100' Roll 66.75 0.85 14.1202 12.84 35 10.76 16.99 15.33

81 Airway 1693 Meconium Suction 27.71 4.65 21.4157 5.04 5.42 4.25 5.21 4.7

82
Airway 1694 Neo-Tee 2.18 29.8292 No Bid 21 30.717 22.33

83
Airway 1697 Oxygen Wrench - Small 6.09 1.05 2.0488 0.98 1.32 0.718 0.29 0.58

84
Airway 1698 Oxygen Wrench - Large 47.99 5.38 9.0569 0.64 14.31 3.9 0.613 1.99 5.08

85 Airway 1699 Oxygen Regulator - D cylinder w/2 50psi ports 1-25 lpm 99.55 37.88 32.95 138.38 24.49 36.08

86 Airway 1701 Magill Forceps - small 331.56 3.84 145.0903 8.89 4.69 4.24 30.73 3.69 4.39

87 Airway 1702 Magill Forseps - Large 310.17 3.06 23.5791 8.88 4.69 4.24 32.19 3.89 4.39

88 Airway 1896 Vent/CPAP Circuit 51.04 23.43 25.1544 26.13 26.275 140.54

89 Airway 1907 Laryngoscope Blade, Miller; #4 Large Adult 188.81 4.00 Delete per addendum #2 22.02 3.16 n/a

90 Airway 1910 Suction, Manual 256.11 116.84 133.7598 120.87 107 125.65 118.1

91 Airway 1911 Suction, Manual Refill 75.59 25.10 33.3304 26.15 23 26.93 25.3

92 Airway 1919 Oxygen Regulator - M cylinder 60.35 2.03 143.9524 70.52 42.85 135.85 28.69 N/A

93 Airway 1965 Battery, Suction Unit 2110.26 464.96 1111.11 128.55 120 1026.82 969.04

94 Airway 2420 Ohmeda® Oxygen Quick Connect, DISS Male 71.99 17.77 56.7286 21.99 20.76 30 19.63 15.6

95 Airway 2421 Ohmeda Quick Connect Pigtail, Female 74.41 168.7375 No Bid 27 83.84 22.95

96

Cardiac 1336 BP Cuff, Disposable w/Bayonet, Large Adult 42.35 5.08 13.52 4.1 2.42 3.99 13.01

97

Cardiac 1337 BP Cuff, Disposable w/Bayonet, Adult 42.35 4.25 13.56 4.1 2.094 3.19 15.32
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98

Cardiac 1338 BP Cuff, Disposable  w/Bayonet, Child 39.95 4.25 12.49 3.25 1.954 2.99 12.08

99

Cardiac 1339 BP Cuff, Disposable  w/Bayonet, Infant 60.35 3.20 11.45 3.1 1.934 2.49 11.15

100

Cardiac 1319 ELECTRODES (ADULT) 0.29 0.15 0.174 0.19 0.2568 4.53

101

Cardiac 1320 ELECTRODES (PEDIATRIC) 0.38 0.23 0.178 0.265 0.30128 1.06

102 Cardiac 1323 ECG PAPER 0.36 1.60 0.0610 2.47 2.2 2.74 2.26

103
Cardiac 1360 BP Cuff, Manual - Adult 121.29 8.10 6.1498 5.24 7.27 17.5 4.99 7.65

104 Cardiac 1361 BP Cuff, Manual - Infant 18.08 8.35 6.1498 4.92 7.27 17.18 4.89 7.78

105 Cardiac 1362 BP Cuff, Manual - Child 34.79 8.80 6.1498 5.06 7.27 17.92 4.85 7.78

106 Cardiac 1363 BP Cuff, Manual - Large Adult 39.35 8.79 6.1498 5.44 8.1 20.8 5.29 8.33

107 Cardiac 1364 BP Cuff, Manual - Thigh 167.24 8.18 6.4251 6.45 7.73 24.1 6.09 8.33

108
Cardiac 1365 BP Cuff, Reusable w/Bayonet, Adult 4.25 34.32 35 9.44 8.99 23.53

109
Cardiac 1366 BP Cuff, Reusable w/Bayonet, Infant 3.20 31.94 24.94 25 9.62 5.99 17.65

110
Cardiac 1367 BP Cuff, Reusable w/Bayonet, Large Adult 4.25 48.67 38.56 39 11.06 12.19 25.65

111
Cardiac 1368 BP Cuff, Reusable w/Bayonet, Pediatric 63.95 4.25 33.45 27.64 28 9.85 8.19 17.65

112
Cardiac 1369 BP Cuff, Manual, Small Adult 4.9 8.80 6.1498 5.06 27.73 11.04 4.89 17.88

113
Cardiac 1370 BP Cuff, Manual Bladder - Adult 39.59 8.10 14.5777 5.24 27.73 8.34 3.99 23.53

114
Cardiac 1371 BP Cuff, Manual Bladder - Large Adult 61.5 8.79 19.7840 5.44 33.12 8.34 4.99 25.65

115 Cardiac 1372 Stethoscope 86.75 31.42 73.7237 40.41 34.37 107.3 33.52 6.95 4.94

116 Cardiac 1700 Thermometer, Electronic, Welch Allyn 488.83 320.08 325.72 347.73 274.89 2.78

117 Cardiac 1703 Pulse Ox - Finger 35.4 94.89 19.6683 21.39 15.75 35.3 34.71 14.39 17.59

118 Cardiac 1704 Pen Light 5.2 0.64 1.1870 3.48 0.74 0.71 1.0532333 0.65 5
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119

Cardiac 1321 QUICK COMBO PADS (ADULT) 75.78 29.11 45.65 19.45 28.81 63.7238 15.29

120

Cardiac 1322 QUICK COMBO PADS (PEDIATRIC) 35.79 48.67 19.45 35.28 67.3368 15.29

121 IV Supplies 188 IV EXTENSIONS 8", removable leur locking site, pinch clamp, spin 2.75 1.63 0.939 2.27 2.1733 0.85 0.94

122

IV Supplies 195 3CC SYRINGE 0.17 0.10 0.0960 21.54 0.1025 0.11 0.08125 n/a

123

IV Supplies 199 BULB SYRINGE 1.03 0.8792 0.8 0.34 0.79 0.5874 0.59 0.54

124

IV Supplies 176 14G 2" IV Catheter 1.75 1.67 3.1174 1.69 99.41

125 IV Supplies 175 14G 1 1/4" IV Catheter 3.71 1.56 2.6565 1.45 1.34 1.6677 1.49 73.85

126
IV Supplies 177 16G IV Catheter 3.71 1.56 2.6565 1.45 1.34 1.6677 1.49 73.85

127
IV Supplies 178 18G IV Catheter 3.71 1.56 2.6565 1.45 1.34 1.6677 1.49 73.85

128
IV Supplies 179 20G IV Catheter 3.71 1.56 2.6565 1.45 1.34 1.6677 1.49 73.85

129
IV Supplies 180 22G IV Catheter 3.71 1.56 2.6565 125.29 1.45 1.34 1.6677 1.49 73.85

130
IV Supplies 181 24G IV Catheter 3.71 1.56 2.6565 125.29 1.45 1.34 1.6677 1.49 73.85

131
IV Supplies 182 18G 1 IN HYPO NEEDLE 0.07 0.24 0.0740 4.48 0.0283 0.04 0.03099 3.53

132
IV Supplies 183 21G 1 1/2 IN HYPO NEEDLE 0.07 0.36 0.1040 4.48 0.0147 0.04 0.03469 3.53

133 IV Supplies Decompression/Pneumothorax Needles 14g x 3.25 29.23 16.6096 366.3 8.7 8 7.7 8.25

134 IV Supplies 185 BLUNT TIP FILTERED NEEDLE 0.40 0.3945 0.174 0.37 0.17033 298.13

135 IV Supplies 200 MACRO 15 GTTS IV SET 1.53 1.05 1.67 1.59 1.9874 2.52

136 IV Supplies 202 NORMAL SALINE 500CC BAG 3.10 4.6301 2.78 4.1 4.9522222 n/a

137 IV Supplies 1901 IV Pump Drip Set No Bid No Bid 11.466 n/a
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138 IV Supplies 184 25G 5/8 HYPO NEEDLE 0.07 0.36 4.48 0.0306 0.04 0.03136 3.53

139 IV Supplies 187 BLUNT FILL NEEEDLE 18ga 1.5" (REPLACING THE TWIN PACK) 0.58 0.40 7.75 0.0782 0.29 0.17086 13.52

140 IV Supplies 189 4 WAY STOP COCKS 0.61 5.8339 123.01 0.73 2.04 0.7084 n/a

141 IV Supplies 190 TOURNIQUETS, Latex free 0.17 0.07 27.5 0.072 0.106 0.1674 0.09 9.13

142 IV Supplies 193 INSULINE SYRINGE No Bid 0.2776 0.292 0.13 0.1641 n/a

143 IV Supplies 194 1CC PEDIATRIC CODE SYRINGE 0.59 0.1943 0.14 0.1053 38.74

144 IV Supplies 196 10CC SYRINGE 0.19 0.12 0.1550 0.0978 0.12 0.225 n/a

145 IV Supplies 197 30CC SYRINGE 0.23 0.45 0.5829 0.264 0.28 0.3996875 14.35

146 IV Supplies 198 60CC SYRINGE 0.69 0.77 12.67 0.43 0.44 0.3996875 11.53

147 IV Supplies 201 MICRO 60 GTTS IV SET 1.69 1.56 4.583 6.35

148 IV Supplies 1690 Jamshidi IO Needle 38.84 28.09 27.2730 28.59 26 30.81 29.22

149 IV Supplies 186 VENI GUARD 0.78 1.08 0.4715 42.66 0.3776 0.37 0.52292 36.14

150 IV Supplies 203 Sodium Chloride Flush; 10 ml - Luer 0.36 0.328 0.3 0.33 #N/A

151 IV Supplies TELEFLEX EZIO 25mm TIBIAL NEEDLE (BLUE) No Bid 121.9680 No Bid n/a #N/A

152 IV Supplies TELEFLEX EZIO 45mm HUMERUS NEEDLE (YELLOW) No Bid 141.6800 No Bid n/a #N/A

153 IV Supplies TELEFLEX EZIO 15mm PEDIATRIC NEEDLE (PINK) No Bid 121.9680 No Bid m/a #N/A

154 Medications 136 Adenocard; 6 mg / 2 ml - Vial 17.75 79.11 7.17 3.7 33.94 #N/A

155 Medications 140 Succinylcholine; (200 mg / ml) 10 ml - Vial 23.90 106 2.73 6 12.9376 #N/A

156 Medications 143 Diltiazem (Cardizem); 25 mg (5mg  /ml) - Vial 3.91 43.95 3.65 3.5 3.848 #N/A

157 Medications 158 Magnesium Sulfate ; 5 gm / 10ml - Luer 35.01 70.14 39.89 31.7 4.1732 #N/A
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158 Medications 163 Sodium Bicarbonate; 50 MEQ - Luer 20.13 193.47 20.67 17 22.652 #N/A

159 Medications 164 Solu-Medrol; 125 mg / 2 ml - Vial 9.82 11.3034 221.94 11.37 8.84 8.4568 #N/A

160 Medications 144 Dextrose 5%, 50 cc bag 2.18 2.15 2.24 17.27 #N/A

161 Medications 145 Dextrose 10% 250cc Bag 6.11 105.72 2.61 2.98 7.0711111 #N/A

162 Medications 146 Dextrose; 50 % 25 gm - Luer 17.10 164.33 22.43 15.3 17.27 #N/A

163 Medications 148 Dopamine; 200 mg / 5 ml - Vial 4.20 106.66 3.71 6.2 2.938 #N/A

164 Medications 150 Epinephrine 1:1,000; 1 mg  / (1cc AMP) 13.33 13.1841 19.34 15.68 11.7 13.83 #N/A

165 Medications 153 Glucagon; 1 mg (1 unit) 193.75 352.9606 226.11 310.27 210.6 186.995 #N/A

166 Medications 157
Lidocaine w/Dextrose; 2 gm/ Dextrose 5% / 500 ml - Pre-mix 
drip bag 7.38 263.42 8.35 7.59 7.0770833 #N/A

167 Medications 159 Naloxone; 2 mg / 2 ml - Luer 16.13 18.31 16.53 15.96 14.65 #N/A

168 Medications 173 Glucometer Strips; Assure Prism Multi Blood 0.3 0.18 10.99 0.211 10.31 12.37 11.39

169 Medications 174 M.A.D. (Mucosal Atomization Device); 12.14 3.09 2.0247 5.84 7.21 5.06 10.99 6.49 4.22

170 Medications 1439 Glucometer Test Solution, Assure® Prism Multi Control Solution 60.11 12.59 10.36 10.14 9.71 12.37 10.72

171 Medications 137 Adenocard; 12 mg / 4 ml - Vial 7.31 119.29 16 7.48 33.94 #N/A

172 Medications 138 Albuterol; 2.5 mg / 3 ml - Unit dose 0.42 0.2423 8.13 0.24 0.12 1.3016667 #N/A

173 Medications 142 Atropine; 1 mg / 10 ml - Luer 12.30 10.9513 13.47 12.15 11.02 8.182 #N/A

174 Medications 147 Diphenhydramine (Benadryl) ; 50 mg - Vial 0.98 18.8479 1.11 1.04 1.24 1.318 #N/A

175 Medications 149 Ipratropium Bromide / Albuterol (DuoNeb), 0.5mg / 3.0mg 0.37 0.2977 4.89 0.181 0.242 0.3851667 #N/A

176 Medications 162 Odansetron; 4 mg / 2 ml - Vial 0.33 12.93 0.452 0.8 1.3528 #N/A
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177 Medications 166 Thiamine; 200 mg / 2 ml - Vial 12.62 150.61 5.92 10.15 6.25 #N/A

178 Medications 139 Amiodarone; 150 mg / 3 ml - Vial 2.21 38.24 1.77 0.89 0.1506 #N/A

179 Medications 151 Epinephrine 1:10,000; 1 mg / 10 ml - Luer 9.71 10.4777 99.01 13.66 10.97 13.83 #N/A

180 Medications 152 Etomidate (Amidate); 40 mg / 20 ml - Vial 7.96 82.09 5.81 5.04 2.4416667 #N/A

181 Medications 154 Insta-Glucose; 31 g - Tube 3.65 12.4201 No Bid 3.02 12.09 3.19

182 Medications 156 Lidocaine; 100 mg / 5 ml - Luer 6.46 21.6505 10.01 6.82 7.11 41.36 #N/A

183 Medications 165 Terbutaline/Brethine; 1 mg - Vial 193.75 2.1548 52.75 24.76 3 4.5 #N/A

184 Medications 161 Nitrolingual; 8.5 gm spray 151.30 227.6159 205.23 150.67 122.85 #N/A

185 Misc Medical 1964 Pediatric Length Based Tape 87.35 15.60 23.88 4.64 24.95 15.69 5.49

186 Misc Medical 640 Posey restraint, double strap foam limb holders, standard foam 31.55 6.46 5.3047 6.89 26 6.0685417 #N/A

187 Misc Medical 643 Sterile Water, 250 ml bottles 2.97 1.42 1.9970 120.9 1.75 3.21 3.135 1.99 #N/A

188 Misc Medical 613 Transpore Surgical Tape; 1” x 10 yards 1.77 0.88 1.2121 16.26 1.04 1.16 1.333 0.79 10.24$                                

189 Misc Medical 614 1 IN SILK TAPE 1.31 0.74 1.4133 0.69 1.2 0.6683333 0.65 7.45

190 Misc Medical 615 Transpore Surgical Tape; ½" x 10 yards 0.93 0.45 0.6383 17.13 0.53 0.62 0.7019167 10.12

191 Misc Medical 617 2" Cloth Tape,  hypo-allergenic 2.38 0.74 5.3203 1.37 1.54 1.1605556 1.3 12.76

192 Misc Medical 618 3" Cloth Tape,  hypo-allergenic 3.57 2.22 7.9532 2.06 2.31 0.5055556 1.95 15.71

193 Misc Medical 619 ADHESIVE DRESSING/BANDAID (LARGE) 1.01 9.9552 1.12 0.0115 0.06 0.1052 0.06 1.71

194 Misc Medical 620 ADHESIVE DRESSING/BANDAID (SMALL) 0.18 6.0191 1.21 0.01 0.016 0.1196 0.012 1.69

195 Misc Medical 625 BIOHAZARD BAGS - 30 Gal 0.35 11.02 2.6570 58.56 0.232 0.23 0.15892 51.07

196 Misc Medical 626 BIOHAZARD BAGS - 5 Gal 0.36 0.09 30.94 0.1105 0.12 0.24896 0.14
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197 Misc Medical 631 EYE COVERS (GAUZE) 0.17 0.93 0.1528 4.78 0.078 0.12 4.5416667 3.6

198 Misc Medical 634 Blanket, Foam (YELLOW) 3.22 3.87 1.86 2.12 2.4666667 1.39 2.22

199 Misc Medical 636 ICE PACKS 1.35 0.41 1.0846 9.77 0.74 0.34 0.355 0.45 15.66

200 Misc Medical 638 Mega Movers Portable Transport Unit 26.82 13.44 22.05 12.22 16.43 20.712 15.24

201 Misc Medical 639 Stretcher Sheets, fitted;  30"x72"; Disposable 3.3 0.71 1.2135 1.66 1.2376 #N/A

202 Misc Medical 641 PRESSURE INFUSER, 500ml 30.54 6.45 11.1839 56.56 7.08 17.61 13.131 6.09 #N/A

203 Misc Medical 642 RAZORS 1.25 0.25 0.4063 21.2 0.35 0.36 0.48868 21.87

204 Misc Medical 644 THERMAL BLANKET/MYLAR BLANKET 20.65 0.43 14.8140 0.66 0.45 0.47 0.5717 0.39 0.46

205 Misc Medical 1232 Fingertip Bandaid 0.05 0.03 0.0463 0.0278 0.035 0.035375 0.03 3.54

206 Misc Medical 1233 Trauma Shears 22.19 2.14 2.2999 1.04 0.62 0.84 0.96 0.61 0.83

207 Misc Medical 1345 Cover Sheet 0.48 21.8 No Bid 0.64 0.9555 0.69 #N/A

208 Misc Medical 1893 Bed Pan 1.89 1.43 1.7880 1.56 1.53 1.01 0.9945833 1.71

209 Misc Medical 2525 Body Bag 16.02 20.10 16.7054 115.84 9.75 9.3 11.087 146.67

210 Misc Medical 623 BENZION SWABS 1.31 0.4460 24.71 0.2886 0.43 0.4276 22.34

211 Misc Medical 624 Providine-Iodine Prep Pads 0.33 0.94 0.0427 4.46 0.0372 0.04 0.28 4.16

212 Misc Medical 627 BIOHAZARD BOX (OVAL) 0.12 5.69 0 4.7505 4.92

213 Misc Medical 633 EYE WASH 39.95 2.40 9.0584 2.58 2.25 2.16 15.58 2.13

214 Misc Medical 637 LANCETS, Incision Device Lancet 21g x 2.2mm Safety 0.36 0.06 0.1093 8.53 0.046 0.1 0.0895 7.65

215 Misc Medical 1890 Urinal, Plastic Disposable 1.56 0.57 0.5736 0.7 0.62 0.67 1.4 1.2

216 Misc Medical 622 Alcohol Prep Pads 0.03 0.01 0.0138 2.48 0.0059 0.01 0.01693 0.0065 2.33

217 Misc Medical 630 EMESIS BAGS 0.91 0.44 0.8133 12.59 0.42 0.36 0.3888889 0.39 0.43
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218 Misc Medical 632 EYE COVERS (METAL) 1.6 0.93 0.75 0.83 0.7044 9.99

220 Misc Medical 645 WATER SOLUBLE GEL (LUBE) 2.06 0.05 2.2953 0.035 0.04 0.2 6.31

221 Misc Medical 1705 Nail Polish Remover Pads 0.82 0.06 0.0357 6.16 0.032 0.03 0.02185 1.43

222 Misc Medical 1959 Glucometer, Assure Prism Multi Blood 32.75 12.59 6.46 0 5.81 12.37 6.39

223 Misc Medical 1960 Glucometer Case 0.00 0 0 10.78 #N/A

224 Misc Medical 2526 2" Coban Wrap 1.82 2.2337 11.72 0.52 1.66 1.395 0.69 17.9

225 Misc Medical 2600 Ring Cutter 22.61 6.03 197.9288 17.65 5.32 6.16 11.79 6.49 6.08

226 Misc Medical 2601 Ring Cutter Blades 30.95 2.39 20.4944 1.47 1.73 4.06 1.19 1.6

227 Misc Medical 628 BIOHAZARD BOX (SMALL) 4.1157 2.1 2.06 1.89 2.07

228 Misc Medical 629 Sterile burn sheets, Disposable 2.36 3.0970 2.33 1.83 2.05 2.1808 1.45 1.71

229 Misc Medical Thermometer Probe Sleeves 0.05 0.04 0.0378 14.73 0.038 0.049264 0.045 10.95

230 Misc Medical Aqua 100 - Ultrasound Transmission Gel 1.99 0.9350 1.53 1.16 1.0602 #N/A

231 Narcotics 168 Fentanyl Citrate Inj SDV 5ml 50mcg/ml 2.82 3.91 3.2 n/a #N/A

232 Narcotics 169 Midazolam; 10 mg / 2 ml - Vial 1.46 15.39 1.77 3.5 n/a #N/A

233 Narcotics 170 Morphine Sulfate Injection SDV 10mg/mL 25/Bx 0.83 105.89 3.16 3.32 n/a #N/A

234 Narcotics Morphine Sulfate; 10 mg / 1 ml - Pre-filled 2.21 2.57 3.9 n/a #N/A

235 Narcotics 171 Diazepam; 10 mg / 2 ml - Luer locking 32.87 403.96 32.83 44.5 n/a #N/A

236 Narcotics 172 Ketamine, Class III, 50mg / ml, 10ml Vial 7.63 235.3 8.28 7.85 n/a #N/A

237 PPE 1316 Isolation Gown 1.55 0.86 1.2379 23.33 0.8 1.34 0.5408 48.19

238 PPE 1317 Boot Covers, Nonskid Fluid Proof 1.43 0.65 11.7872 1.38 1.24 0.8096667 55.82

240 PPE 1324 Exam gloves, Powder-free nitrile medical; (SMALL)

241 PPE 1325 Exam gloves, Powder-free nitrile medical; (MEDIUM)

242 PPE 1326 Exam gloves, Powder-free nitrile medical; (LARGE)

243 PPE 1327 Exam gloves, Powder-free nitrile medical; (X-LARGE)

244 PPE 1328 Exam gloves, Powder-free nitrile medical; (XX-LARGE)

A-240 PPE 1324 Exam gloves, Powder-free nitrile medical; (SMALL) 0.06 No Bid 0.0677 0.0539 0.057 0.09 61.22

ITB 23-041-KSB ALS/BLS 09/16/2023



VENDOR 
Name: A2 23-041 Itemized Bid Form rev 9/27/2023

Bid Item # OP IQ# ITEM DESCRIPTION Price each item Price each item Price each item Price each item Price each item Price each item Price each item Price each item Price each item

Dealmed Medical 
Supplies 

AGNI 
ENTERPRISES

Bound Tree 
Medical, LLC

Concordance 
Healthcare 
Solutions Henry Schein Life Assist

Medline 
Industries, LP

Nashville Medical 
& EMS Products, 

Inc. Quadmed, Inc.

A-241 PPE 1325 Exam gloves, Powder-free nitrile medical; (MEDIUM) 0.06 No Bid 0.0677 0.0539 0.057 0.09 61.22

A-242 PPE 1326 Exam gloves, Powder-free nitrile medical; (LARGE) 0.06 No Bid 0.0677 0.0539 0.057 0.09 61.22

A-243 PPE 1327 Exam gloves, Powder-free nitrile medical; (X-LARGE) 0.06 No Bid 0.0677 0.0599 0.057 0.1 61.22

A-244 PPE 1328 Exam gloves, Powder-free nitrile medical; (XX-LARGE) 0.06 No Bid 0.1120 No Bid 0.072 10.8 61.22

245 PPE 1329 PROCEDURE/Surgical Mask 0.16 0.14 0.0694 2.73 0.095 0.245 0.4852083 0.09 1.29

246 PPE 1335 N95 Mask 1.77 1.13 1.0838 24.21 0.8 0.63 0.4852083 103.31

247 Trauma 204 Extrication Collar, Pediatric 41.15 5.80 12.4989 5.97 4.9 6.1334 5.65

248 Trauma 205 Extrication Collar, Baby No-Neck 15.02 5.80 12.4989 5.97 4.9 6.1334 5.65

249 Trauma 206 Extrication Collar, No-Neck 25.46 5.80 12.4989 6.38 5.97 4.9 6.1334 5.65

250 Trauma 207 Extrication Collar, Short 25.46 5.80 12.4989 5.97 4.9 6.1334 5.65

251 Trauma 208 Extrication Collar, Regular 41.15 5.80 12.4989 5.97 4.9 6.1334 5.65

252 Trauma 209 Extrication Collar, Tall 14.6 5.80 5.97 4.9 6.1334 5.65

253 Trauma ADJUSTABLE C-COLLAR 19.89 5.55 6.79 5.66 4.65 5.558 5.6

254 Trauma 210 HEAD BLOCKS (PEDIATRIC) 27.59 No Bid 19.4429 4.78 4.55 6.73 5.05

255 Trauma 211 HEAD BLOCKS (ADULT) 27.59 No Bid 4.74 4.55 6.73 5.35

256 Trauma 212 Restraint Strap, Disposable, Loop-Lock, 5FT 2pc, Org 2.02 7.5 1.73 1.85 13.51 1.29 2.21

257 Trauma 213 Cardboard Splints 12" w/Foam Padding 1.96 1.09 0.61 1.47 1.88 0.83 0.81

258 Trauma 214 Cardboard Splints 24" w/Foam Padding 3.7 2.84 3.13 1.35 2.2 3.97 1.29 1.81

259 Trauma 215 ARMBOARD (PEDIATRIC) 3.86 6.4888 0.51 0.49 0.3528 0.89 0.47

260 Trauma 216 Sam Splint, 36" roll 7.51 7.41 6.33 9.5633333 10.07

261 Trauma 217 Multi-trauma dressing 10x30 2.62 0.97 1.8493 0.94 0.69 0.8 0.9538 0.69 1.09

262 Trauma 218 ABD PADS, 5"x9" sterile 0.2 0.13 0.2187 2.67 0.094 0.1 0.116 0.095 2.29

263 Trauma Hyfin Chest Seals w/ Vent Twin Packs 19.67 7.30 27.13 13.45 12.61 12.67 14.49 14.42

264 Trauma 219 Triangular Bandages - Indivually  Wrapped 0.72 0.36 0.2632 4.73 0.34 0.4 0.4935833 0.29 4.82

265 Trauma 220 Gauze Pads, 2” x 2”, 12 ply Sterile 0.04 0.04 0.1160 2.43 0.0203 0.03 0.0154 0.025 2.72

266 Trauma 221 Gauze Pads, 4"x4", 4-ply Sterile 0.03 0.0657 1.76 0.0228 0.072 0.0566333 0.029 1.89

267 Trauma 222 Gauze Sponge, 2" x 2", 12-Ply, Nonsterile 0.01 0.03 0.0056 3 0.005 0.007 0.0076 0.0045 0.92

268 Trauma 223 Gauze Sponge, 4" x 4", 8-Ply, Nonsterile 0.03 0.02 0.0225 2.87 0.0116 0.027 0.0181825 0.0125 2.59

269 Trauma 224 Conforming Stretch Gauze Bandage, 3"  Roll 0.48 0.21 0.3142 1.2 0.095 0.17 0.198125 0.09 1.2

270 Trauma 4.5"x 4.1yd 6 PLY NON-STERILE GAUZE ROLLS 0.99 0.85 0.7760 0.53 0.72 0.5047 0.59 1.90$                                  

271 Trauma 225 Vaseline™ Petrolatum Gauze Strip, 3in x 9in 1.32 0.99 1.5306 14.26 0.42 0.6 0.5270833 0.41 6.02

272 Trauma 226 OB Kit - Soft Pack 7.34 7.75 4.83 6.5 8.4 4.49 7.08
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273 Trauma 227 CAT TOURNIQUET 24.62 23.92 21.43 30.32 22.19 24.9

274 Trauma 233 Tactical CricKit 136.19 65.1 116.1729 63.53 64 30.32 65.06

275 Trauma TRACTION SPLINT 150.3 Exclusive 123.75 119 n/a

276 Trauma BACKBOARDS 124.6 160.5238 140.27 125.8 139 126.97 84.79 154.95

277 Trauma COMBI-CARRIERS II BACKBOARD/SPLIT LITTER 263.07 935.47 1088.48 890 1182.47 545 1280.46
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