CITY OF MYRTLE BEACH

PROJECT NO.: 17-B0064
OPENING TIME: 2:00 PM May 24, 2017

All Star Sports BSN Riddell
ITEM# DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

1 |lron Pigs minor team replica t-shirt - 15 ea $ 14.80 | $ 222.00 | $ 1272 | $ 190.80 | $ 1047 | $ 157.05
youth

2 |Mauraders minor team replica t-shirt - 15 ea $ 8.60 | $ 129.00 | $ 598 | $ 89.70 | no bid no bid
youth
Mauraders minor team rep"ca t-shirt - 2 ea $ 8.60 | $ 1720 | $ 598 | $ 11.96 | no bid no bid
adult

3 |Mud Hens minor team replica t-shirt - 13 ea $ 14.80 | $ 192.40 | $ 1272 | $ 165.36 | $ 1047 | $ 136.11
youth
Mud Hens minor team replica t-shirt - 2 ea $ 1550 | $ 31.00 | $ 13.72 | $ 2744 | $ 1250 | $ 25.00
adult

4 | Grasshoppers minor team replica t-shirt - 13 ea $ 1480 | $ 192.40 | $ 1272 | $ 165.36 | $ 1047 | $ 136.11
youth
Grasshoppers minor team replica t-shirt - 2 ea $ 1550 | $ 31.00 | $ 13.72 | $ 2744 | $ 1250 | $ 25.00
adult

5 |Dragons minor team replica t-shirt - youth 13 ea $ 14.80 | $ 19240 | $ 1272 | $ 165.36 | $ 1047 | $ 136.11
Dragons minor team replica t-shirt - adult 2 ea $ 1550 | $ 31.00 | $ 13.72 | $ 2744 | $ 1250 | $ 25.00

6 |Hooks minor team replica t-shirt - youth 13 ea $ 1480 | $ 19240 | $ 1272 | $ 165.36 | $ 1047 | $ 136.11
Hooks minor team replica t-shirt - adult 2 ea $ 1550 | $ 31.00 | $ 13.72 | $ 2744 | $ 1250 | $ 25.00

7 |Fireflies - minor team replica t-shirt - 13 ea $ 1480 | $ 19240 | $ 1272 | $ 165.36 | $ 1047 | $ 136.11
youth
Fireflies - minor team replica t-shirt - 2 ea $ 1550 | $ 31.00 | $ 13.72 | $ 2744 | $ 1250 | $ 25.00
adult

8 |Emeralds minor team replica t-shirt - 13 ea $ 1480 | $ 19240 | $ 1272 | $ 165.36 | $ 1047 | $ 136.11
youth
Emeralds minor team replica t-shirt - 2 ea $ 1550 | $ 31.00 | $ 1372 | $ 2744 | $ 1250 | $ 25.00
adult

9 |Hooks minor team replica hat - youth 15 ea $ 8.60 | $ 129.00 | $ 598 | $ 89.70 | no bid no bid
Hooks minor team replica hat - adult 2 ea $ 8.60|$ 1720 | $ 598 | $ 11.96 | no bid no bid

10 |Fireflies minor team replica hat - youth 15 ea $ 8.60 | $ 129.00 | $ 598 |$ 89.70 | no bid no bid
Fireflies minor team replica hat - adult 2 ea $ 8.60 | $ 17.20 | $ 598 | $ 11.96 | no bid no bid

11 |Emeralds minor team replica hat - youth 15 ea $ 8.60|$ 129.00 | $ 598 | $ 89.70 | no bid no bid
Emeralds minor team replica hat - adult 2 ea $ 860 | $ 17.20 | $ 598 |$ 11.96 | no bid no bid

12 |Pirates major league replica jersey - youth 1 ea $ 24.25 | $ 266.75 | $ 2177 | $ 239.47 | no bid no bid
Pirates major league replica jersey - adult 4 ea $ 2765 | $ 110.60 | $ 2177 | $ 87.08 | no bid no bid

13 |Pirates major league replica cap - youth 15 ea $ 8.60 | $ 129.00 | $ 598 | $ 89.70 | no bid no bid
Pirates major league replica cap - adult 2 ea $ 8.60 | $ 17.20 | $ 598 | $ 11.96 | no bid no bid




14 |Reds major league replica jersey - youth 1 ea $ 24.25 | $ 24.25 | $ 2177 | $ 21.77 | no bid no bid
Reds major league replica jersey - adult 14 ea $ 2765 $ 387.10 | $ 2177 | $ 304.78 | no bid no bid
15 |Brewers major league replica jersey - 1 ea $ 24.25 | $ 2425 | $ 2177 | $ 21.77 | no bid no bid
youth
Brewers major league replica jersey - 14 ea $ 2765 | $ 387.10 | $ 2177 | $ 304.78 | no bid no bid
adult
16 |Reds major league replica cap - adult 17 ea $ 8.60 | $ 146.20 | $ 598 | $ 101.66 | no bid no bid
17 |Brewers major league replica cap - adult 17 ea $ 8.60 | $ 146.20 | $ 598 | $ 101.66 | no bid no bid
18 |Gamecocks college softball replica jersey - 6 ea $ 16.60 | $ 99.60 | $ 1594 | $ 95.64 | $ 19.27 | $ 115.62
youth
Gamecocks college softball replica jersey - 9 ea $ 17.85 | $ 160.65 | $ 16.99 | $ 15291 | $ 2057 | $ 185.13
adult
19 |Gamecocks college softball replica visor - 15 ea $ 9.70 | $ 14550 | $ 6.62 | $ 99.30 | no bid no bid
youth
Gamecocks college softball replica visor - 2 ea $ 9.70 | $ 19.40 | $ 6.62 | $ 13.24 | no bid no bid
adult
20 |Rawlings - OSFM Catcher's helmet 6 ea $ 7555 | $ 453.30 | $ 3298 | $ 197.88 | no bid no bid
combo, black
21 |Rawlings - Coolflo Batting helmet 10 ea $ 1575 | $ 15750 | $ 16.74 | $ 167.40 | no bid no bid
22 |Wilson - Throat Protector Black Snap 4- 4 ea $ 940 | $ 37.60 | $ 239 (% 9.56 | no bid no bid
inch only
23 |Rawlings - Chin Straps CS1 30 pks $ 225 $ 67.50 | $ 26.88 | $ 806.40 | no bid no bid
24 |Rawlings - RCM30 Catcher's Glove left 2 ea $ 4855 | $ 97.10 | $ 4732 | $ 94.64 | no bid no bid
hand
25 |Rawlings - RCM 30 Catcher's Glove right 4 ea $ 48.55 | $ 19420 | $ 4732 | $ 189.28 | no bid no bid
hand
26 |Practice Baseballs 26 doz $ 37.00 | $ 962.00 | $ 2532 | $ 658.32 | $ 25.00 | $ 650.00
27 |Rawlings - RLLBL1 Dixie Youth Baseballs 12 doz $ 6175 | $ 741.00 | $ 3812 | $ 457.44 | no bid no bid
28 |Practice 12-inch softballs 6 doz $ 42.00 | $ 252.00 | $ 2339 | $ 140.34 | $ 27.00 | $ 162.00
29 [NFHS - 12-inch Fast Pitch Softballs 10 doz $ 51.00 | $ 510.00 | $ 3478 | $ 34780 | $ 45.00 | $ 450.00
30 |Catcher's Knee Support - youth size 2 ea $ 16.50 | $ 33.00 | $ 728 | $ 1456 | $ 1119 | $ 22.38
TOTAL $ 91765 | $ 7,716.20 | $ 72243 | $ 6,483.58 | $ 296.32 | $ 2,708.84




Star Sports

ITEM# DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
1 |lron Pigs minor team replica t-shirt - 15 ea $ 15.00 | $ 225.00 $
youth
2 |Mauraders minor team replica t-shirt - 15 ea $ 7.00 | $ 105.00 $
youth
Mauraders minor team replica t-shirt - 2 ea $ 750 | $ 15.00 $ $
adult
3 [Mud Hens minor team replica t-shirt - 13 ea $ 15.00 | $ 195.00 $ $
youth
Mud Hens minor team replica t-shirt - 2 ea $ 16.00 | $ 32.00 $ $
adult
4 | Grasshoppers minor team replica t-shirt - 13 ea $ 15.00 | $ 195.00 $ $
youth
Grasshoppers minor team replica t-shirt - 2 ea $ 16.00 | $ 32.00 $ $
adult
5 |Dragons minor team replica t-shirt - youth 13 ea $ 15.00 | $ 195.00 $ $
Dragons minor team replica t-shirt - adult 2 ea $ 16.00 | $ 32.00 $ $
6 |Hooks minor team replica t-shirt - youth 13 ea $ 15.00 | $ 195.00 $ $
Hooks minor team replica t-shirt - adult 2 ea $ 16.00 | $ 32.00 $ $
7 |Fireflies - minor team replica t-shirt - 13 ea $ 15.00 | $ 195.00 $ $
youth
Fireflies - minor team replica t-shirt - 2 ea $ 16.00 | $ 32.00 $ $
adult
8 |Emeralds minor team replica t-shirt - 13 ea $ 15.00 | $ 195.00 $ $
youth
Emeralds minor team replica t-shirt - 2 ea $ 16.00 | $ 32.00 $ $
adult
9 |Hooks minor team replica hat - youth 15 ea $ 7.00 | $ 105.00 $ $
Hooks minor team replica hat - adult 2 ea $ 750 | $ 15.00 $ $
10 |Fireflies minor team replica hat - youth 15 ea $ 7.00 | $ 105.00 $ $
Fireflies minor team replica hat - adult 2 ea $ 750 | $ 15.00 $ $
11 |Emeralds minor team replica hat - youth 15 ea $ 7.00 | $ 105.00 $ $
Emeralds minor team replica hat - adult 2 ea $ 750 | $ 15.00 $ $
12 |Pirates major league replica jersey - youth 11 ea $ 25.00 | $ 275.00 $ $
Pirates major league replica jersey - adult 4 ea $ 29.00 | $ 116.00 $ $
13 |Pirates major league replica cap - youth 15 ea $ 8.00 | $ 120.00 $ $
Pirates major league replica cap - adult 2 ea $ 850 | % 17.00 $ $
14 |Reds major league replica jersey - youth 1 ea $ 25.00 | $ 25.00 $ $
Reds major league replica jersey - adult 14 ea $ 29.00 | $ 406.00 $ $
15 |Brewers major league replica jersey - 1 ea $ 25.00 | $ 25.00 $ $

youth




Brewers major league replica jersey - 14 ea $ 29.00 | $ 406.00
adult
16 |Reds major league replica cap - adult 17 ea $ 850 | $ 144.50
17 |Brewers major league replica cap - adult 17 ea $ 850 | $ 144.50
18 |Gamecocks college softball replica jersey - 6 ea $ 18.50 | $ 111.00
youth
Gamecocks college softball replica jersey - 9 ea $ 19.00 | $ 171.00
adult
19 |Gamecocks college softball replica visor - 15 ea $ 6.00 | $ 90.00
youth
Gamecocks college softball replica visor - 2 ea $ 6.50 | $ 13.00
adult
20 |Rawlings - OSFM Catcher's helmet 6 ea $ 75.00 | $ 450.00
combo, black
21 |Rawlings - Coolflo Batting helmet 10 ea $ 12.00 | $ 120.00
22 |Wilson - Throat Protector Black Snap 4- 4 ea $ 550 | $ 22.00
inch only
23 |Rawlings - Chin Straps CS1 30 ea $ 250 | $ 75.00
24 |Rawlings - RCM30 Catcher's Glove left 2 ea $ 50.00 | $ 100.00
hand
25 |Rawlings - RCM 30 Catcher's Glove right 4 ea $ 50.00 | $ 200.00
hand
26 |Practice Baseballs 26 ea $ 22.00 | $ 572.00
27 |Rawlings - RLLB1 Dixie Youth Baseballs 12 ea $ 48.00 | $ 576.00
28 |Practice 12-inch softballs 6 ea $ 45.00 | $ 270.00
29 |NFHS - 12-inch Fast Pitch Softballs 10 ea $ 75.00 | $ 750.00
30 |Catcher's Knee Support - youth size 2 ea $ 15.00 | $ 30.00
TOTAL $ 90450 | $ 7,296.00




