
10685 - BID TAB - Video Streaming Upgrade PNHS & CHS
11/11/2020 @ 10:30 am

Vendor: TPC TECHNOLOGIES PARKWAY ELECTRIC AND COMMUNICATIONS DIGITAL AGE TECHNOLOGIES SOUND PRODUCTIONS

Contact: MARTY GOLOB TODD BILLIN JAMESON LAYMON SHAWN TALLARD

Legal Forms? YES YES YES YES

Vlountary Alternates 
Submitted? YES NO NO YES

10685- Video Streaming Upgrades for PNHS & PCHS

Qty Part # Desc
Proposed Alternate Items 
Description Unit Price Total Cost

Proposed Alternate Items 
Description Unit Price Total Cost

Proposed Alternate Items 
Description Unit Price Total Cost

Proposed Alternate Items 
Description Unit Price Total Cost

2 VHUBSMART6G1212
Black Magic Design Smart Hub 12 
x 12 TO SPEC $1,274.68 $2,549.36 TO SPEC $1,252.16 $2,504.32 TO SPEC $1,473.12 $2,946.24 TO SPEC $1,312.94 $2,625.88

4 MFR #PT30X-SDI-GY-G2
PTZOptics 30x-sdi Gen 2 Camera 
(Grey) TO SPEC $1,504.16 $6,016.64 TO SPEC $1,568.63 $6,274.52 TO SPEC $1,897.85 $7,591.40 TO SPEC $1,693.18 $6,772.72

1 PT-JOY-G3
PTZOptics 4D IP Joystick 
Controller TO SPEC $542.64 $542.64 TO SPEC $566.45 $566.45 TO SPEC $721.67 $721.67 TO SPEC $610.82 $610.82

2 2217C002 Cannon XA15 TO SPEC $1,933.93 $3,867.86 TO SPEC $1,789.02 $3,578.04 TO SPEC $1,989.37 $3,978.74 NO BID $0.00

2 SWATEMTVSTU/HD
Black Magic ATEM Televsion 
Studio HD TO SPEC $909.18 $1,818.36 TO SPEC $893.12 $1,786.24 TO SPEC $1,050.72 $2,101.44 TO SPEC $936.47 $1,872.94

2 HYPERD/STM Black Magic Hyperdeck Studio TO SPEC $635.06 $1,270.12 TO SPEC $623.83 $1,247.66 TO SPEC $733.92 $1,467.84 TO SPEC $650.29 $1,300.58

2 BDLKWEBPTR Black MagicWeb Presenter TO SPEC $452.31 $904.62 TO SPEC $444.31 $888.62 TO SPEC $522.72 $1,045.44 TO SPEC $463.16 $926.32

2 CONVNTRM/YA/SMTPN
Black Magic Teranex Mini Smart 
Panel TO SPEC $77.67 $155.34 TO SPEC $76.30 $152.60 TO SPEC $88.94 $177.88 TO SPEC $79.53 $159.06

2 CONVCMIC/HS
Blackmagic HDMI to SDI mini 
converter TO SPEC $35.64 $71.28 TO SPEC $35.01 $70.02 TO SPEC $42.31 $84.62 TO SPEC $36.71 $73.42

4 CONVNTRM/YA/RSH Teranex Mini Rack Shelf 1U TO SPEC $77.67 $310.68 TO SPEC $76.30 $305.20 TO SPEC $88.94 $355.76 TO SPEC $79.53 $318.12

2 SMARTVIEW-DUO Blackmagic Smartview Duo TO SPEC $452.31 $904.62 TO SPEC $444.31 $888.62 TO SPEC $522.72 $1,045.44 SMARTVIEW DUO 2 $463.16 $926.32

2 CONVMCAUDS2 Blackmagic Design Audio to SDI TO SPEC $178.18 $356.36 TO SPEC $175.03 $350.06 TO SPEC $205.92 $411.84 TO SPEC $182.46 $364.92

4 N10P-ID-1 Lowell N10P-ID-1 TO SPEC $30.96 $123.84 TO SPEC $28.55 $114.20 TO SPEC $38.27 $153.08 TO SPEC $33.70 $134.80

2 M-8x2 Furman M-8x2 TO SPEC $60.20 $120.40 TO SPEC $50.98 $101.96 TO SPEC $72.46 $144.92 TO SPEC $59.63 $119.26

10 NAHDMI-W-B Neutrik HDMI pass-thru TO SPEC $11.99 $119.90 TO SPEC $14.25 $142.50 TO SPEC $14.66 $146.60 NO BID $0.00

8 NBB75DFIB Neutrik BNC pass-thru TO SPEC $7.69 $61.52 TO SPEC $8.97 $71.76 TO SPEC $9.41 $75.28 NO BID $0.00

8 NE8FDY-C6-B Neutrik Cat6 TO SPEC $23.49 $187.92 TO SPEC $27.96 $223.68 TO SPEC $29.83 $238.64 NO BID $0.00

6 NAUSB-W-B Neutrik USB TO SPEC $5.11 $30.66 TO SPEC $5.93 $35.58 TO SPEC $5.99 $35.94 NO BID $0.00

12 1.5ft SDI cables TO SPEC $18.08 $216.96 RAPCO $10.35 $124.20 TO SPEC $18.73 $224.76 TO SPEC $18.30 $219.60

2 25ft SDI Cable TO SPEC $33.23 $66.46 RAPCO $35.10 $70.20 TO SPEC $37.91 $75.82 TO SPEC $40.28 $80.56

2 1694A-1000-BLACK
Belden 1694A RG6 Coaxial cable 
1000' TO SPEC $306.38 $612.76 WEST PENN $335.16 $670.32 TO SPEC $487.97 $975.94 NO BID $0.00

1 1694ABHD1-50
Belden HD BNC Compression 
Connector for 1694A 50ct TO SPEC $110.19 $110.19 WEST PENN $107.84 $107.84 TO SPEC $151.80 $151.80 NO BID $0.00

2 CS-XA15 Porta Brace carry case for XA15 TO SPEC $145.20 $290.40 TO SPEC $132.88 $265.76 TO SPEC $150.12 $300.24 NO BID $0.00

2 G-PROR-6U-19 Gator 6U case w/wheels TO SPEC $186.70 $373.40 TO SPEC $184.92 $369.84 TO SPEC $235.12 $470.24 TO SPEC $217.08 $434.16

2 Dell Optiplex 3070 MFF Computer to run OBS TO SPEC $643.93 $1,287.86 OPTIPLEX 3070 MLK $657.22 $1,314.44 DELL OPTIPLEX 3070 MFF $780.00 $1,560.00 NO BID $0.00

4 40" TV Monitor TO SPEC $399.90 $1,599.60 PANASONIC $625.10 $2,500.40
VIZIO - 40" CLASS D-SERIES LED 
FULL HD SMARTCAST TV $240.00 $960.00 40" DISPLAY (NO TV TUNER) $407.19 $1,628.76

SHIPPING & HANDLING CHARGES $500.00 $741.75 $300.00 $0.00

GRAND TOTAL $24,469.75 $25,466.78 $27,741.57 $18,568.24


