
Vendor Name and Address
 

Central Stone Comp Capital Quarries Co Riverstone Quarry Iron Mountain Trap Fred Weber Inc Barrett Materials, Inc. Mid Mo

1195 Smizer Mill Rd PO Box 105050 8554 Hwy O VR 2320 Creve Coeur Mill Rd 2320 Creve Coeur Mill Rd 3880 Boeuf Creek Rd 2604 N Stadium blvd

Fenton, Mo 63026 Jefferson City Mo 65110 5662 Hwy 47, Un Maryland Hgts Mo 63043 Maryland Hgts Mo 63043 New Haven, Mo 63068 Columbia Mo 65202
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½” Clean $11.20 Antonia, $6.25 Potosi will vary by milage $14.00 Available on request $10.95 price upon request No bid No bid 0-6 miles 3.80/ ton N/A
3/8 Clean $11.20 Antonia, $6.25 Potosi to site $14.00 Available on request $10.95 distance No bid no bid .15/ ton per mile N/A
1” Minus $5.95 Antonia, $5.80 Morse Mill $7.00 Available on request $6.05 Sensitive No bid $5.00 Quoted on request $7.75 thereafter 1" base $6.65
1” Minus (Wet Base) $6.3 Antonia, $6.00 Morse Hill, $5.00 Potosi N/A N/A $6.25 No bid No bid 7.75 N/A
1” Clean $10.05 Antonia, $ 8.65 Morse Hill, $6.25 Potosi $10.35 Available on request $10.95 No bid $10.00 Quoted on request $11.00 $11.00

2” Minus $5.95 Antonia, $ 5.80 Morse Hill, $4.75 Potosi $7.00 Available on request $6.05 No bid $5.00 Quoted on request $7.75 2" Base $6.65
2” Clean $9.3 Antonia, $7.90 Morse Hill, $6.25 Potosi $8.85 Available on request $9.30 No bid $9.00 Quoted on request $8.75 $9.00
3” Clean $9.30 N/A N/A No bid No bid 8.75 $9.00
3”-5” Clean (Gabion) $8.85 Available on request $9.30 No bid No bid 11 N/A
4"-6" Clean $11.85 (gab) Antonia, $9.85 Morse Mill $8.85 No bid 11 $11.85
4” Minus $7.00 Available on request $6.05 No bid No bid 7.75 $8.00
Gabion/Rip Rap $11.85 Antonia, $8.00 Butler Hill, $8.25 Potosi $11.75 Available on request $16.50 No bid $16.00 Quoted on request $11.50 N/A
8” Clean $11.85 $11.75 Available on request $13.75 No bid No bid 11 N/A
Type 1 Rock Blanket $14.60 $14.35 Available on request $14.50 No bid No bid 12.5 $13.00
Type 2 Rock Blanket $14.60 $14.35 Available on request $14.50 No bid No bid 12.5 $13.00
Type 5 Base/Blanket $6.10 $8.35 Available on request $6.30 No bid No bid 12.5 $7.50
Quarry Rock/Shot Rock $5.8 Antonia, $5.80 Morse Mill, $5.70 Potosi $5.85 Available on request $5.50 No bid No bid 5.5 $5.65
Trap Rock $11.50 N/A N/A $11.00 Quoted on request No bid N/A
Road Rock $8.85 No bid No bid 1" Road Rock $9.75
Pea Gravel N/A N/A No bid No bid N/A
Fill Dirt $75.00 per load Available on request No bid No bid N/A
Eco Sand N/A N/A No bid No bid N/A
Sand $6.00 N/A N/A No bid No bid N/A
Cinders N/A N/A $10.50 Quoted on request No bid N/A
Screenings $1.10 $4.60 Available on request $2.00 No bid $1.00 Quoted on request $5.50
Top Soil N/A N/A No bid No bid N/A

dirty shot rock 4.00/ ton 
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