Orange Beach

UNIT PRICE BID TABULATION SHEET

Project Name: HOLIDAY DECORATIONS

Requisition No. 2018-1015

Bid Date:
Bid Opening Time:

October 15, 2018
11:00 AM

Bidder's Name Display Sales Dixie Decorations Holiday Lights & Magic Mosca Design Universal Concepts Winterland
City, State Bloomington, MN Montevallo, AL Cave City, KY Raleigh, NC Cumming, GA Marion, IN

(E)ji; Unit Price Extended Total Unit Price Extended Total Unit Price Extended Total Unit Price Extended Total Unit Price Extended Total Unit Price Extended Total
E-1: 25' Self-Standing Tree of Lights 2 5,094.00 | $ 10,188.00 NO BID 4,744.25 | S 9,488.50 3,000.00 | $ 6,000.00( $ 5,050.00 | $ 10,100.00] $ 2,645.00 | $ 5,290.00
E-2: 21' Self-Standing Tree of Lights 2 3,864.00 | $ 7,728.00 NO BID 3,885.65 | $ 7,771.30 2,500.00 | $ 5,000.00( $ 3,950.00 | $ 7,900.00] $ 1,895.00 | S 3,790.00
E-3: 17' Self-Standing Tree of Lights 2 3,409.00 | $ 6,818.00 NO BID 3,413.75| $ 6,827.50 1,775.00 | S 3,550.00( $ 2,695.00 | $ 5,390.00] $ 1,425.00 | S 2,850.00
E-4: "Merry Christmas" Sign 2 2,529.00 | $ 5,058.00 NO BID 2,985.00 | $ 5,970.00 825.00 | S 1,650.00| $ 1,750.00 | S 3,500.00] $ 1,250.00 | $ 2,500.00
BID TOTAL $29,792.00 NO BID $30,057.30 $16,200.00 $26,890.00 $14,430.00
Days to Deliver 3-4 Weeks 35 Days 20 Days 45 to 50 Days 14 Business Days

Notes

Corrected bid total for
extended totals

Tabulated by R. Eberly 10/15/2018




