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PRICE

TOTAL UNIT 

PRICE

TOTAL

1 10 EA. #TMS511-00-UN-RHS-KG IV Pro 

Adapter with Knee Gatch

NO  BID  NO  BID NO BID 308.00       3,080.00      299.00        2,990.00    223.00      2,230.00   428.50      4,285.00   

2 50 EA. Stat Pack #G35011TK G3 

Medslinger Black 747531949735 

Black in Color

        94.25     4,712.50           95.00       4,750.00 88.29          4,414.50     86.25         4,312.50      95.00         4,750.00    83.00        4,150.00   87.00        4,350.00   

3 12 EA. #STATG35005RE G3 Perfusion 

Red

      248.79     2,985.48         235.00       2,820.00 241.00        2,892.00     227.13       2,725.56      255.00        3,060.00    221.00      2,652.00   233.17      2,798.04   

4 28 EA. #STATG35005BU G3 Perfusion 

Blue

      248.79     6,966.12         235.00       6,580.00 241.00        6,748.00     227.13       6,359.64      255.00        7,140.00    221.00      6,188.00   223.17      6,248.76   

5 40 EA. #STATG36005RE G3 Foldaway 

Pharmacy Kit

        84.73     3,389.20           90.00       3,600.00 83.55          3,342.00     NO BID 100.00        4,000.00    76.00        3,040.00   80.05        3,202.00   

6 40 EA. #STATG39011GR G3 Narx Kit Gray         62.65     2,506.00           72.45       2,898.00 61.76          2,470.40     NO BID 75.00         3,000.00    56.00        2,240.00   59.16        2,366.40   

7 40 EA. Misc. Parts G3100GN G3 Airway 

Cell Green 747531900705

        98.98     3,959.20         116.00       4,640.00 97.12          3,884.80     NO BID 120.00        4,800.00    89.00        3,560.00   93.97        3,758.80   

TOTAL 24,518.50  25,288.00    23,751.70   16,477.70    29,740.00  24,060.00 27,009.00 

BID TAB
CPR SAVERS HENRY SCHEIN LIFE-ASSIST MASTER MEDICAL 

EQUIPMENT

QUADMED

30 DAYS 2-3 DAYS IN STOCK 

ITEMS 

DATE: 5/18/23                                                                                       

DEPT.: HEALTH                                                                                   

REQ.# 11723366KD)                                                                                                                                                                            

FOR: EMS CRITICAL CARE EQUIPMENT BAGS

BOUND TREE

3-5 DAYS

PENN CARE, INC.

30 DAYS30 DAYS7-14 DAYS5-10 DAYS


