CITY OF LAURINBURG
FLEET MAINTENANCE FACILITY

CERTIFIED BID TABULATION

Date: WEDNESDAY, JUNE 20, 2018

4:00 PM
COMM. NO. 4497 503 HALL STREET, LAURINBURG, NC 28352
BIDDER LICENSE | BID* | CON*| E* TOTAL ADD ADD ADD / DEDUCT / ADD ADD ADD ADD TOTAL
NAME & ADDRESS NO. SEC | QUAL] VER BASE BID ALTERNATE | ALTERNATE NO CHANGE |ALTERNATE | ALTERNATE | ALTERNATE ALTERNATE UNIT PRICES
STA. | REQ G-1 G-2 ALTERNATE G-4A G4B G4C G-4D A1-A2
G-3
METAL SIDE | 3/4" PLYWOOD OVERHEAD LABOR & | SEPARATE | 20% CASH 25% IRR.
END PANELS LINER DOORS PERF. BOND BONDS ESCROW | LETTER OF CREDIT
DRIVEN CONTRACTORS |#73604 Y Y Y |Shown: $192,367.00 $ 46,000.00 | $ 8,000.00 | $ 4,00000 | $ 2,500.00 | $ - $ $ - 5,500.00
MAXTON, NC #1 Calculated: $192,367.50
HAWKS BUILDERS, INC. |#56182 Y Y Y |$ 193,351.00 | § 52,552.00 | $ 4,800.00 | $ (6,340.00)] $ 2,614.00 | NO BID NO BID NO BID 8,500.00
|ROCKINGHAM, NC #2
PRECISION CONTRACTORS, INC. |#36277 Y Y N |$ 191,135.00 | $ 33,900.00 | $ 6,355.00 | § (8,000.00)| $ 3,400.00 | NO BID NO BID NO BID 4,750.00

LAURINBURG, NC

STOGNER ARCHITECTURE, PA.

615 E. Broad Avenue

Rockingham, North Carolina

#1 The Block Allowance sum is shown as $1 ,867.00. The calculation of the shown 415 Blocks x $4.50/Block is equal to $1,867.50 for a difference of $0.50.
#2 The Transcriber wrote down ($6,343.00) at the Bid Opening on the pencil draft tabulation. The Form of Bid actually shows ($6,340.00).

| hereby certify that the tabulation of bids shown hereon was prepared by me on this date and that all information
shown hereon is true, correct and complete to the best of my knowledge.

NAME

DATE




