
Bid Received
Addendums 

Acknowledged

COMPANY NAME: LED 1 LED 2 LED 3 LED 4 LED 5 LED 6 LED 7
 Total Cost (1-7) 

(May also include 

delivery fees)

Total Cost (Calculated 

with Wilson County, NC. 

Tax Rate)

Y / N or No Bid Y / N

Daybreak LED LLC $367,806.00 $262,196.00 $114,180.00 $187,248.00 $390,075.00 $616,160.00 $147,000.00 $2,084,665.00 $2,225,379.89
Y   Y

Wheeler Electrical Co. $235,872.00 $204,336.00 $92,880.00 $151,632.00 $315,900.00 $505,440.00 $283,500.00 $1,789,560.00 $1,910,355.30
Y   Y

Triune Electric Inc. $432,540.00 $307,395.00 $139,725.00 $233,280.00 $486,000.00 $777,600.00 $1,006,992.00 $3,383,532.00 $3,611,920.41
Y Y

Trastar Inc. $262,416.00 $151,448.00 $68,840.00 $122,256.00 $254,700.00 $407,520.00 $181,440.00 $1,448,620.00 $1,546,401.85
Y Y   

Anixter Inc. $425,004.00 $201,564.00 $92,000.00 $137,496.00 $286,450.00 $458,320.00 $109,935.00 $1,710,769.00 $1,826,245.91
Y Y   

Watson Electrical $358,800.00 $226,600.00 $103,000.00 $150,000.00 $312,500.00 $500,000.00
Included in price of 

fixture $1,650,900.00 $1,838,238.75
Y N

** Evluma Inc. ** No Bid No Bid No Bid $248,400.00 No Bid $828,000.00 No Bid $1,076,400.00 $1,149,057.00
Y N

**Shealy Electrical 

Wholesalers**(Border States $402,000.00 $202,400.00 $94,250.00 $182,400.00 $380,000.00 $556,000.00 No Bid $1,817,050.00 $1,939,700.88
Y Y

Shealy Electrical Wholesalers 

(Border States Electric) Alternate $207,350.00 $166,800.00 $347,500.00 $1,773,900.00 $1,893,638.25
Y Y

Helios Energy $390,600.00 $277,750.00 $58,750.00 $141,000.00 $293,750.00 $470,000.00 $105,000.00 $1,736,850.00 $1,854,087.38
Y Y

**Solarmax LED, Inc.** $198,624.00 $140,085.00 $63,675.00 $112,872.00 $235,150.00 No Bid $117,390.00 $867,796.00 $926,372.23
Y Y

**PowerTech LLC.** $440,880.00 No Bid $2,020,374.00 $2,156,749.25
Y Y

IBA LED $311,400.00 $213,950.00 $97,250.00 $182,400.00 $380,000.00 $608,000.00 $168,000.00 $1,961,000.00 $2,093,367.50
Y N

WESCO - American Electric $356,170.21 $209,468.09 $95,212.77 $130,656.00 $272,200.00 $435,520.00 $134,042.55 $1,633,269.62 $1,743,515.32
Y Y

WESCO - Cooper $354,840.00 $198,715.00 $90,325.00 $126,672.00 $263,900.00 $422,240.00 $132,300.00 $1,588,992.00 $1,696,248.96
Y Y

Wesco - Leotek $352,260.00 $196,680.00 $89,360.00 $129,036.00 $268,825.00 $430,120.00 $134,085.00 $1,600,366.00 $1,708,390.71
Y Y

Wesco - Leotek Alternate $129,036.00 $268,825.00 $1,439,071.00 $1,536,208.29
Y Y

Signature:    Ricky Wilson Title:     Purchasing Manager Date:    07/09/20

Comments: When looking at total price  (**Evluma is a partial bid** ; Shealy/Border States is a partial bid; SolarMax is a Partial Bid; **PowerTech is a partial bid, also LED's 1 through 5 priced as a total ($1,579,494.00) LED 6 priced individually. Please note 4.0 

the Evaluation Process and 5.0 Project Implementation in Original RFP. Selected LED's will be evaluated by technical specifications, cost, lumen output, efficacy, and field testing.

CITY OF WILSON RFP-2020-04 - LED ROADWAY AND AREA LUMINAIRES
Bid Tabulation for BID OPENING on 7/6/2020 @ 2:00 pm

LOCATION: CITY OF WILSON OPERATIONS CENTER

B I D   S C H E D U L E (BASE PRICING)

$1,579,494.00


