Covina-Valley Unified School District
Board of Education Regular Meeting

5/8/2023 05:30 PM
Dr. Mary Hanes Professional Development Center
220 West Puente Avenue, Covina, CA 91723

N. Acceptance of RFP - RFP Summary No. 22-23-107, Nutrition Services
Paper, Plastic, and Film Products

Quick Summary / Abstract

Recommendation is made that RFP Summary No. 22-23-107 for Nutrition Services paper,
plastic and film products be accepted and awarded to P & R Paper Supply Company, Inc. for
paper and plastic items and Individual Food Service as the backup vendor. Platinum
Packaging Group for film item numbers 15, 19, 22 and 23, and tray item numbers 24, 28
through 30, 32, and 35 through 41 and Plastic Connections for film item numbers 1 through
14, 16 through 18, and item 20 and 21 as listed in the RFP summary. The second lowest
bidder will be considered the backup vendor for those film items. The tray items will not
have a backup vendor.

Description

Covina-Valley Unified School District is the lead District for RFP 22-23-107 Nutrition
Services Paper, Plastic and Film Products on behalf of the San Gabriel Valley Cooperative
Purchasing Group (SGV Co-Op) which consists of thirty (30) member districts; the District
received RFPs for Nutrition Services paper products for the 2023- 24 school year. The
following RFP summary indicates the low RFPs received that met District specifications and
quality standards. It is estimated that the District will purchase approximately $350,000 of
paper products. The cost for this purchase will be paid from Cafeteria Special Revenue
Funds. This RFP also allows for renewal clauses for up to a total of three years.

Per the RFP documents, the paper and plastic will be awarded to one bidder based on

the majority of items with the lowest price. The apparent low bidder must bid on a minimum
of fifty percent of the items to be considered and the awarded bidder must supply all items
on the list.

To determine the apparent low bidder, a committee consisting of District personnel and
personnel from four other member districts created a spreadsheet of the RFP responses for
paper and plastic items. The committee reduced the price down to the per each cost to
compare all items regardless of case quantity. P & R Paper Supply Company had the majority
of low prices with a total of sixty-three percent of the one hundred fifty-five items listed in
the RFP summary. There were two bidders on the paper and plastic items as follows:

e P & R Paper Supply Company awarded all items
o Individual Food Service is a backup vendor for all items



Per the RFP documents, the film will be awarded on a line-item basis. The lowest bidder per
line item will be awarded the item unless there is an unreasonable minimum order
requirement. There were two bidders on the film items, The Platinum Packaging Group and
Plastic Connections. The Platinum Packaging Group was low bidder on Line item 15, 19, 22
and 23. Plastic Connections was the low bidder on Line item 1 through 14, 16 through 18,
and item 20 and 21. The second lowest bidder will be considered the backup vendor for

those film items. All items listed on the RFP summary.
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MANUFACTURER
NO.

LIG-2846

HND-RP8052
HND-FB37
COB-VB-BFP-CHIC
COB-VB-BFP-CHB
COB-VB-BFPHG-PLAIN
COB-VB-BFP-PLAIN
AJM-6LB

PPC-300202
KAN-R4048K22
PAN-42008
PAN-42001
PAN-42002
PPC-300097
CLB-N20/25

ELK-12G-084012
ELK-10G-084018
ELK-DP5555
ELK-DP0710
ELK-HO7
FDH-21-6709
HND-FB24
ELK-F20810

RFP SUMMARY LIST

PAPER AND PLASTIC ITEMS

DESCRIPTION

28x46 1mil PLASTIC APRON 10/100

52x80 6mil BUN RACK COVERS 50/CS

27x37 BUN PAN BAG 200/CS

PRINTED FOIL CHICKEN BAG 1M/CS
PRINTED FOIL CHEESEBURGER BAG 1M/CS
PLAIN FOIL HOT DOG BAG 1M/CS

PLAIN FOIL SANDWICH BAG 1M/CS
GBO6NP5C - #6 BROWN GROCERY BAG 500

6# "SCHOOL BUS" DBL WAX LUNCH BAG 500/CS
40x46 45gal 17.7 MIC BLACK LINER 150/CS
21x29 PANSAVER BUN PANS 100

4" DEEP PANSAVER-FULL PAN 34x12 100/CS

6" DEEP PANSAVER-FULL PAN 50

*1/2 SUB DUBLVIEW W/TRAY 250

#25 KRAFT PASTRY/COOKIE BAG 2M

8x4x12 .00125mil POLY BAG/ICE BUCKET LINER
1M

8x4x18 1mil POLY BAG 10/100

5.56x5.5 CLEAR SADDLE BAG 2M/CS

7x10 PLAIN DELI BAG 2M/CS

7x7x1.5 PLASTIC SAND BAG 1M/CS

6.5x7 FLIP TOP SADDLEPACK 2M/CS

18x24 FREEZER/FOOD BAG 250/CS

8x10 .002 ZIPLOC BAG 10/100

UNIT

CS
CS
CS
CS
CS
CSs
CS
BD

CS
CS
CSs
CS
CS
CS
CS

CS
CS
CS
CS
CSs
CS
CS
CS

PACK

10/100/cs
50/cs
200/cs
1,000/cs
1,000/cs
1,000/cs
1,000/cs
500/cs

500/cs
150/cs
100/cs
100/cs
50/cs
250/cs
2,000/cs

1,000/cs
10/100
2,000/cs
2,000/cs
1,000/cs
2,000/cs
250/cs
10/100

SINGLE CUSTOM MULTI-
DROP  ADDN'L

hH A P hH D N P

&P H A P hH hH H P

PRICE

42.00 $
12.19
13.15
45.80
45.80
45.80
45.80
13.25

58.95
2330 §
29.25
52.90
3215 §
7525 $
39.40

28.50
32.00
6.55
13.40
8.20
7.09
9.25
36.05

PRICE

0.04

0.16

0.64
0.30

DROP
PRICE

$43.47
$12.62
$13.61
$47.40
$47.40
$47.40
$47.40
$13.71

$61.01
$24.12
$30.27
$54.75
$33.28
$77.88
$40.78

$29.50
$33.12
$6.78
$13.87
$8.49
$7.34
$9.57
$37.31
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31
32
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34
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37
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41

42

43

44

45
46

COM-F11GP
APP-46075
APP-46075

COB-12722-14

PAT-2446161-0000

PAT-SG01035
PAT-SG01035
PAT-SG01035
DRT-6B12
DRT-8B20
DNW-CT757-100
DNW-CT757-050

DNW-PL257-1001H3-1
DNW-CT757-125-1
DNW-CT757-160-1

DNW-PL257-2001H3-1

SAB-52016A500

SAB-12012A500

DOP-DPZAGW

ACS-S096

COB-12/32PLC

COB-12HFCW
COB-8PLC

RFP SUMMARY LIST

11x10 PRINTED GRAB & GO BAG 500/CS
11x10 PLAIN GRAB & GO BAG 500/CS
11x10 PLAIN GRAB & GO BAG 500/CS

12x7x22 WHITE T-SHIRT BAG W/WARNING 1M/CS

SG01034 / 16x24 ECO-BAKE NATURAL PAN LINER
1M/CS

SG01035 / 16-3/8x24-3/8 #GPQ PAN LINER 1M/CS
16x24 WHITE QUILION PAN LINER 1M/CS
16-3/8x24-3/8 #GPQ WHITE PAN LINER 1M/CS
60z FOAM BOWL 1M/CS

8oz FOAM BOWL 1M/CS

100z - 4.75" BLACK MICRO BOWL 500/CS

50z - 4.75" BLACK MICRO BOWL 500/CS

4.75" PP MICRO DOME LID FOR 5-100z BOWL
500/CS

120z - 5.75" BLACK MICRO BOWL 500/CS
160z - 5.75" BLACK MICRO BOWL 500/CS

5.75" PP MICRO DOME LID FOR 12-240z BOWLS
500/CS

8-160z SMALL ROUND BOWL CLEAR DOME LID
500/CS

120z CLEAR SMALL ROUND BOWL 500/CS

6" PIZZA CLAMSHELL W/ PAD 250/CS

6x9 THIN GREEN SCOURING PAD 6/10

120z FLAT TRANSLUCENT PP LID FOR PAPER
CONT 1M/CS

120z WHITE PAPER FOOD CONTAINER 1M/CS
8oz FLAT LID TRANSLUCENT PP 1M/CS

CS
CS
CS

CS

CS

CS
CS
CS
CSs
CS
CS
CS

CS
CSs
CS

CS

CS

CS

CS

PKG

CS

CS
CS

500/cs
500/cs
500/cs

1,000/cs

1,000/cs

1,000/cs
1,000/cs
1,000/cs
1,000/cs
1,000/cs
500/cs

500/cs

500/cs
624/cs
624/cs

624/cs
500/cs
500/cs
250/cs
10/pkg

500/cs

1,000/cs
1,000/cs
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-

15.60
13.95
13.95

21.00

47.50

42.74
42.74
42.74
48.35
58.00
36.20
33.40

24.80
60.90
54.95

45.25

51.85

84.30

49.70

1.20

21.15

40.20
31.25

0.02

0.07
0.07

0.05
0.10
0.09

0.07

0.20

0.04

$16.15
$14.44
$14.44

$21.74

$49.16

$44.24
$44.24
$44.24
$50.04
$60.03
$37.47
$34.57

$25.67
$63.03
$56.87

$46.83
$53.66
$87.25
$51.44

$1.24

$21.89

$41.61
$32.34
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70
71
72

LLC-KDP4W
COB-8HFCW
COB-12HFCW
COB-8HFCW
LLC-KDP4W
LLC-KDL76PP
DRT-4J6
DRT-8SJ20
APP-16FP-DMW
DOP-DFRY5BW
VBY-BPSW837

VBY-PPREC12

VBY-PPREC16

DNW-PL257-2001H3-1
DNW-CT757-160-1

VBY-PPRND16

VBY-PPRND24

SAB-36582FMG390

ANC-4511019
DRT-8J8
IMV-9DCP
AJM-DC5MW
IMV-R12PC-K

COB-DF98
EES-PTINS-D98
COB-AC16

RFP SUMMARY LIST

40z WHITE PAPER FOOD CONTAINER 1M/CS
8oz WHITE PAPER FOOD CONTAINER 1M/CS
120z WHITE FOOD CONTAINER 20/50 1M

8oz WHITE FOOD CONTAINER 1M

40z WHITE FOOD CONTAINER 1M 20/50

FLAT PP LID FOR 40z PAPER CONTAINER 20/50
40z SQUAT FOAM CONTAINER 20/50

80z SQT FOAM CONTAINER 20/50

PINT MICRO PAIL PAGODA 9/50 CS

LRG FRY SCOOP 3.75x3.5 25/40

MEDIUM PIZZA SLICE CLAMSHELL (16") 400/CS

120z BLACK RECTANGLE COMBO CONTAINER
150/CS

160z BLACK RECTANGLE MICRO COMBO 150/CS
LID FOR MEDIUM CRUISER BOWL 624/CS
160z MEDIUM CRUISER BOWL 624/CS

160z BLACK ROUND MICRO COMBO CONTAINER
150/CS

240z BLACK ROUND MICRO COMBO CONTAINER
150/CS

15.5/11.5 2 COMP RECTANGULAR TRAY 390/CS
DV1101 HINGED SANDWICH WEDGE 250/CS
8oz FOAM CUP 40/25

70z STOCK PRINT PAPER COLD CUP 40/50

50z PAPER WATER CUP 24/100

120z KRAFT RIPPLE HOT CUP 500

VB 12-240z FLAT LID / NO STRAW SLOT 98MM
1M/CS

40z/50z PARFAIT INSERT 20/50 PTINS-D98

160z CLEAR PET CUP (98mm) VB 1M/CS

CS
CS
CS
CS
CS
CS
CS
CS
CS
CS
CS

CS

CS
CS
CS

CS

CS
CS
CS
CSs
CS
CS
CS

CS
CSs
CS

1,000/cs
1,000/cs
1,000/cs
1,000/cs
1,000/cs
20/50
1,000/cs
20/50/cs
500/cs
25/40/cs
400/cs

150/cs

150/cs
624/cs
624/cs

150/cs

150/cs
390/cs
250/cs
1,000/cs
1,000/cs
24/100
500/cs

1,000/cs
1,000/cs
1,000/cs

S O P P D D P P h hH P
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23.55
39.95
40.20
39.95
23.55
29.85
32.85
59.00
356.25
48.45
42.60

18.50

23.80
45.25
54.95

18.45

26.05
185.00
41.80
30.15
37.75
84.55
54.25

19.20
18.60
38.35

0.07

0.07
0.09

0.04

$24.37
$41.35
$41.61
$41.35
$24.37
$30.89
$34.00
$61.07
$36.48
$50.15
$44.09

$19.15

$24.63
$46.83
$56.87

$19.10

$26.96
$191.48
$43.26
$31.21
$39.07
$87.51
$56.15

$19.87
$19.25
$39.69



73

74
75
76
77
78
79
80
81
82
83
84
85
86

87

88

89
90
91
92
93
94
95
96
97
98
99

COB-DF98H

COB-VG12CFS
COB-VBPCLID345
COB-VBPC551PP
COB-VBPC551PP
COB-VBPC201PP
COB-VBPCLID250
COB-VBPCLID345
COB-VBPC401PP
JRV-SSF21P
NTR-3642
NTR-3609
COB-SPORK-SK
COB-SPORK-MK

JRV-DUSSPF5

JRV-DUSSPT5

VBY-VB315
VBY-VB842
VBY-VB315
COB-51808-VB
COB-11805-VB
COB-51210-VB
COB-51210-VB
ANC-307008
ANC-307006
ANC-307005
ANC-E151414

RFP SUMMARY LIST

98mm CLEAR FLAT STRAW SLOT LID 1M/CS
12/140z CLEAR SQUAT PET CUP (98mm) VB
1M/CS

CLEAR LID - FITS (3.25-5.50z) 2500/CS

5.50z TRANS (PP) PORTION CUP 2500/CS
5.50z CLEAR (PP) PORTION CUP 2500/CS
20z CLR (PP) PORTION CUP 2500/CS

1.50z- 20z CLEAR PORTION LID 2500/CS
3.25/4/5.50z CLEAR PORTION LID 2500/CS
40z CLR (PP) PORTION CUP 2500/CS
SMART STOCK WHITE FORK (MW/PP) 960
MWPTS-102 MED WEIGHT SPOON 10/100
SPORK-NAPKIN KIT 1M/CS

SCHOOL LUNCH KIT W/SPIKE STRAW 1M/CS
SCHOOL LUNCH KIT W/MILK STRAW 1M/CS

T-SERIES SMARTSTOCK BLACK PP FORK 960/CS

T-SERIES SMARTSTOCK BLACK PP TEASPOON
960/CS

10-1/2x14 CHICKEN DESIGN CUSHION FOIL 2M/C
10-1/2x14 RED DESIGN CUSHION FOIL 2M/CS
10-1/2x14 CUSHION FOIL 5/500

18x500 HEAVY MEDALLION FOIL RL

18x1000 HEAVY MEDALLION FOIL

12x10.75 MEDALLION FOIL 2400/CS

12x10.75 JIF FOIL SHEETS 6/500

24x2000 METRO PVC FILM RL

VB 18x2000 CRYSTAL WRAP CLING FILM RL
VB 12x2000 CRYSTAL WRAP CLING FILM RL
14x14 PVC SHEETS 1200/RL

CS

CS
CS
CS
CS
CS
CS
CS
CS
CS
CS
CS
CS
CS

CS

CS

CS
CS
CS
RL
RL
CSs
CS
RL
RL
RL
RL

1,000/cs

1,000/cs
2,500/cs
2,500/cs
2,500/cs
2,500/cs
2,500/cs
2,500/cs
2,500/cs
960/cs
10/100/cs
1,000/cs
1,000/cs
1,000/cs

960/cs

960/cs

2,000/cs
2,000/cs
2,000/cs
1rl

1rl
6/500/cs
6/500/cs
1rl

1rl

1rl
1,200/l

S P P P hH D N A h h h AP &P

h N P P D D P P h hH P

19.20

36.80
17.60
28.40
28.40
16.70
12.20
17.60
27.70
24.70

5.45
10.15
10.85
10.85

34.85

34.85

75.65
75.65
75.65
26.50
39.95
46.75
46.75
17.75
13.50

9.30

8.30

$19.87

$38.09
$18.22
$29.39
$29.39
$17.28
$12.63
$18.22
$28.67
$25.56

$5.64
$10.51
$11.23
$11.23

$36.07

$36.07

$78.30
$78.30
$78.30
$27.43
$41.35
$48.39
$48.39
$18.37
$13.97

$9.63

$8.59



100
101
102
103
104
105

106

107

108
109
110
111
112
113

114
115

116

117
118
119
120
121
122
123
124

VBY-FDGNPRXL1M
VBY-FDGNPRS1M
VBY-FDGNPRL1M
VBY-FDGNPRM1M
ARD-2PX27BET
ARD-PT8BKBK-2

GOL-1526

GOL-1527

LIG-4003
IMP-64V3000PFXL
IMP-64V3000PFM
IMP-64V3000PFL
COB-HN400LB
COB-HN500BK

RFS-RPS12
DPI-COX-59-BB-BK

PCA-YCI8-1120

PCA-YCI8-1123
COB-DF98
DRT-20JL
PSC-ST273
SSI-90001V
COB-VB10BL
COB-AE1022BL
PRW-PCS4412Y

RFP SUMMARY LIST

X-LARGE BLUE P/F NITRILE GLOVE 1M/CS

VB SMALL BLUE P/F NITRILE GLOVE 10/100
LARGE BLUE P/F NITRILE GLOVE 1M/CS
MEDIUM BLUE P/F NITRILE GLOVE 1M/CS

17" PYROTEX OVEN MITT 72pr/CS

8" SQUARE PYRO/TERRY POT HOLDER BLACK

LARGE CLEAR POLY (CPE) HEAVY DUTY GLOVE
10/100

MEDIUM CLEAR POLY (CPE) HEAVY DUTY GLOVE
10/100

MEDIUM PLASTIC POLY DISP GLOVES 10/10/100
X-LARGE PF CLEAR VINYL GLOVE 10/100
MEDIUM PF CLEAR VINYL GLOVE 10/100

LARGE PF CLEAR VINYL GLOVE 10/100

22" LIGHT BROWN HAIRNET 10/144

STRING HAIRNET 26" BLACK 10/144

120z FLAT LID RPET CLEAR HINGED DELI CONT
2/100

5x9 BLACK/CLEAR HINGED CONTAINER 250/CS

8x8x3 1-COMP CLEAR HINGE SMART LOCK
200/CS

8x8x3 3 COMP CLEAR HINGE SMART LOCK 2/100
FLAT LID NO SLOT FOR 12-24 98MM 1M
TRANSLUCENT VENTED LID 10/100

MORNAP NAPKIN 13x12 12/500

LOW FOLD TIDYNAP NAPKIN 20/400

150z 1Ib OBLONG PAN 1M/CS

1Ib OBLONG FOIL LAMNTED BOARD LID 1M/CS
PRESSWARE 4.25x4.25x1.25 1500/CS

CS
CS
CS
CS
PR
PR

CS

CS

MCS
CS
CS
CS
CSs

BOX

CS
CS

CS

CS
CS
CSs
CS
CSs
CS
CS
CS

1,000/cs
1,000/cs
1,000/cs
1,000/cs
1pair
1pair

10/100/CS

10/100/cs

10/10/100/cs
10/100/cs
10/100/cs
10/100/cs
10/144/cs
10/144/cs

200/cs
250/cs

200/cs

200/cs

1,000/cs
1,000/cs
6,012/cs
8,000/cs
1,000/cs
1,000/cs
1,500/cs

hH A P hH hH P

&hH H P hH hH H

&

&hH H AP P h h N P

23.50
23.50
23.50
23.50
8.40
4.35

9.00

9.00

23.40
16.70
16.70
16.70
61.80

6.30

20.25
80.10

44.65

44.65
19.20
36.60
40.60
25.25
63.20
21.85
83.05

0.01
0.06

$24.32
$24.32
$24.32
$24.32
$8.69
$4.50

$9.32

$9.32

$24.22
$17.28
$17.28
$17.28
$63.96

$6.52

$20.96
$82.90

$46.21

$46.21
$19.87
$37.88
$42.02
$26.13
$65.41
$22.61
$85.96



125

126
127
128

129

130
131
132

133
134
135
136
137
138
139
140
141
142
143
144
145
146
147
148
149
150

WIN-TMT-RF2

LUS-QT-40

QSP-BS224-GRN
QSP-BS224-RED

QSP-MK652-2

MAP-HS8507
MAP-HS8240
CHX-8253

MAP-HS8240
PUR-D8-NH
CHI-R963CT
CHI-R963CT
CHI-FT500
CHI-FT100
CHI-FT300
CHI-FT300
CHI-FT040
CHI-FT200
CHI-FT500
CHI-FT500
PAC-51P902
PAC-51P902S
PAC-51P102S
CKF-4SW
DFI-GP561
RPP-71440

RFP SUMMARY LIST

2" DIAL FRIDGE/FREEZER -20/70 deg
THERMOMETER

QUAT TEST STRIP 0-500ppm 15' RLS APROX 120
TESTS

3/8"x180yd GREEN BAG SEALING TAPE 96/CS
3/8"x180yd RED BAG SEALING TAPE 96/CS

2"x60yd UTILITY GRADE MASKING TAPE (48MM)
24/C

"HARMONY SOFT" 11x24 MULTI-SHIFT TOWEL
200/CS

WYPALL x80 FOODSERVICE TOWEL 150/CS
13x21 BLUE/BLUE FOOD TOWEL 150
"HARMONY SOFT" 13x24 MULTI-DAY TOWEL
150/CS

8-5/8 SNAP UP TRAY KRAFT 500/CS

CALI SCHOOL KRAFT CARRY TRAY 500/cs
MP963 MY PLATE DESIGN CARRY TRAY 500/CS
5# NATURAL FOOD TRAY SUNBURST 500/CS
1# FOOD TRAY RED PLAID 4/250

3# FOOD TRAY RED PLAID 2/250

3# (#300) RED CHECK FOOD TRAY 500/CS
60z FOOD TRAY RED PLAID 4/250

2# FOOD TRAY RED PLAID 4/250

5# FOOD TRAY RED PLAID 2/250

5# (#500) RED CHECK FOOD TRAY 500/CS
CKF #2 BLACK TRAY 500/CS

CKF #2S BLACK TRAY 500/CS

PACTIV #2S WHITE TRAY 500/CS

CKF #4S WHITE TRAY 500/CS

1comp CLEAR TRAY 1M/CS

5comp WHITE FOAM TRAY 500/CS

EA

BOX

RL
RL

CS

CS
CS
CS

CS
CS
CS
CS
CS
CS
CS
CS
CS
CS
CS
CS
CSs
CS
CSs
CS
CSs
CS

1ea

1bx/10pkg
1rl
1rl

24/roll

200/cs
150/cs
150/cs

150/cs
500/cs
500/cs
500/cs
500/cs
1,000/cs
500/cs
500/cs
1,000/cs
1,000/cs
500/cs
500/cs
500/cs
500/cs
500/cs
500/cs
1,000/cs
500/cs

@ N

&H AP

P P P P hH D A P h P N A P h B A P &h

3.95

42.50
1.72
1.72

52.50

18.35
24.45
40.55

24 .45
32.15
25.35
25.35
24.35
21.25
19.35
19.35
19.75
23.80
24 .35
24.35
21.70
16.90
19.35
23.70
58.15
21.80

4.25

0.16

$4.09

$43.99
$1.78
$1.78

$54.34

$18.99
$25.31
$41.97

$25.31
$33.28
$26.24
$26.24
$25.20
$21.99
$20.03
$20.03
$20.44
$24.63
$25.20
$25.20
$22.46
$17.49
$20.03
$24.53
$60.19
$22.56



151
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154
155

ITEM
NO.
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- A A a
A W0 N -~ O

RPP-71440

MBL-YTHB0500SGBX

CHI-21114
SAV-4WHT
APP-16FP-DMW

MANUFACTURER
NO.

8CAL (COLD OVER)

1FCA (HOT OVER)
5GAC (HOT LIDDING)
1FCA (HOT OVER
1FCA (HOT OVER
1FCA (HOT OVER
1FCA (HOT OVER
5GAC (HOT LIDDING
5GAC (HOT LIDDING
5GAC (HOT LIDDING
5GAC (HOT LIDDING
5GAC (HOT LIDDING
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RFP SUMMARY LIST

5comp WHITE FOAM SCHOOL TRAY 500/CS CS 500/cs $ 21.80 $22.56
5comp BLACK FOAM TRAY HEAVY DUTY 500/CS CS 500/cs $ 25.15 $26.03
SLT5SW1 - 5comp NATURAL SCHOOL TRAY

240/CS CS 240/cs $ 20.15 $20.86
4"x3/16" PAPER TWIST TIE WHITE 2000/BX CASE 2,000/box $ 52.25 $54.08
#16 PLAIN WHITE FOODPAIL 400/CS CS 500/cs $ 3525 §$ 0.07 $36.48

FILM AND TRAY ITEMS

PRICE
LBS PER PER

DESCRIPTION ROLL ROLL
1MIL 10.75" W BOPP FILM TYPE 8ACL (3"IDX11"OD=1RL=7200LF/RL=~30LBS/RL) 30 $62.40
0.8MIL 10.125" W PET FILM TYPE 1FCA (3"IDX11"OD=1RL=5100LF/RL=~25LBS/RL) 25 $68.75
JMIL 7”7 W PET FILM TYPE 5GAC 1.5” ID X 3" OD = 1RL = ~1.7LBS/RL = 500 LF/RL 1.7 $12.07
0.8MIL 9.5"W PET FILM TYPE 1FCA (3"IDX11"OD=1RL=5100LF/RL=~23.5LBS/RL) 235 $64.63
0.8MIL 10.375"W PET FILM TYPE 1FCA (3"IDX11"OD=1RL=5100LF/RL=~25.6LBS/RL) 25.6 $70.40
0.8MIL 10.75"W PET FILM TYPE 1FCA (3"IDX11"OD=1RL=5100LF/RL=~26.6LBS/RL) 26.6 $73.15
0.8MIL 10.75"W PET FILM TYPE 1FCA (3"IDX11"OD=1RL=5100LF/RL=~26.6LBS/RL) 26.6 $73.15
IMIL 4.25" W PET FILM TYPE 5GAC-PRINT (3"IDX5"0OD=1RL=5100LF/RL=11LBS/RL) 11 $112.75
.7MIL 4.25" W PET FILM TYPE 5GAC-PRINT (3"IDX5"OD=1RL=5100LF/RL=11LBS/RL) 11 $112.75
JIMIL 5.25" W PET FILM TYPE 5GAC-PRINT (3"IDX5"0OD=1RL=5100LF/RL=13LBS/RL) 13 $133.25
.7MIL 5.25" W PET FILM TYPE 5GAC-PRINT (3"IDX5"OD=1RL=5100LF/RL=13LBS/RL) 13 $133.25
JMIL 9" W PET FILM TYPE 5GAC-PRINT (3"IDX5"OD=1RL=5100LF/RL=22LBS/RL) 22 $225.50
.7MIL 14.5" W PET FILM TYPE 5GAC-PRINT (3"IDX5"OD=1RL=5100LF/RL=36LBS/RL) 36 $369.00
0.8MIL 13.5"W PET FILM TYPE 1FCA (3"IDX11"OD=1RL=5100LF/RL=~33LBS/RL) 33 $107.25
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RFP SUMMARY LIST

CX 100 15-1/2" X 6000

FT ALL CX 100 MIN 20 ROLLS MiXED
1FCA (HOT OVER) 0.8MIL 4.75"W PET FILM TYPE 1FCA (3"IDX11"OD=1RL=5100LF/RL=~11.8LBS/RL)
1FCA (HOT OVER) 0.8MIL 5.25"W PET FILM TYPE 1FCA (3"IDX11"OD=1RL=2500LF/RL=~6.4LBS/RL)

5GAC (HOT LIDDING)  .7MIL 5.25" W PET FILM TYPE 5GAC (3"IDX5"0OD=1RL=1500LF/RL=4LBS/RL)
HSPET 6H 4-3/4" X 5100
FT ALL HSPET 75g 15 Rolls Mixed

5GAC (HOT LIDDING)  .7MIL 5.25" W PET FILM TYPE 5GAC (3"IDX5"0OD=1RL=5100LF/RL=11.8LBS/RL)

5GAC (HOT LIDDING)  .7MIL 5.25" W PET FILM TYPE 5GAC-PERF (3"IDX5"0OD=1RL=5100LF/RL=11.8LBS/RL)
CX 100 G 15-1/2" x 5500 Ft, Minimum Order 20 CX Rolls Mixed

CX 100 G 20" x 5500 Ft., Minimum Order 20 CX Rolls Mixed

38-38-18-1T-CL Platform Price Per Thousand, Minimum order is 120,000

TRAY, 5010-128500 - #5010 Dessert Dish 3 5/16" X 3 5/16" X 1 1/2", clear
TRAY, 5030-108500 - #5030 Dessert Dish 4 1/2" X 4 1/2" X 1", clear

TRAY, 5042-151700 - #5042 Salad/Pastry Tray 4 1/2" X 4 1/2" X 1 3/8", clear
65-50-19 1500/Case Minimum Order 2 Pallets

65-50-19 1500/Case Minimum Order 2 Pallets

65-50-19-2HB CET 600/Case

TRAY, 6297-404539 - #6297 2 Compt Hot Dog Tray 6 1/2" X 5" X 1 3/4", black
98-65-21; 3396 Priced Per Thousand, Minimum Order is 40,000

TRAY, 3914-128500 - #3914 Insert 4 Compartment 5 7/8" X 4 1/2" X 1 3/8", clear
TRAY, 6060-208500 - #6060 Tray 6 22/47 X 5" X 2 4/5", clear

65-50-19-1ST 600/Case, Minimum Order is 2 Pallets

Compostable CT85625W 1L 300/Case, 49 Cases Per Pallet, Minimum Order is 2 Pallets, TRAY, 6.50" X 8.50" X
1.50" 1-Compartment, 320z
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$70.00
$32.45
$17.60
$28.40

$84.00
$83.78

$90.86

$70.00

$84.00

$49.63
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
$149.04
$149.04
$109.15
NO BID
$181.33
NO BID
NO BID
$104.59

$75.21
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Compostable CT655K1L 500/Case, 56 Cases Per Pallet, Minimum Order is 2 Pallets, TRAY, 6.5" X 5" X 1.75"

Compostable Tray Fiber PLA Lining, 180z $85.62
Compostable CT85625K2L-D 300/Case, 49 Cases Per Pallet, Minimum Order is 2 Pallets, TRAY, 6.5" X 5" X 1.9" 2-

Compartment Compostable Fiber PLA Lining, 7/90z $87.95
38-38-18-1T-CL Platform Price Per Thousand, Minimum Order is 240,000, TRAY, 3.375" X 3.375" X 1.5" Deep Tray, 5.0 oz P3313-1 $36.29
PT 108 BR 900/Case 24 Cases Per Pallet, TRAY, 3-0108-444-000 Tray, 5x 6 1/2 x 1 3/8-Compartment Tray, Beige $89.21
PT 108 BR 900/Case 24 Cases Per Pallet, TRAY, 3-0108-444-000 Tray, 5 x 6 1/2 x 1 3/8-Compartment Tray, Beige $89.21
Spray Silicone # 700458 NO BID

Heat Seal Roller (Replacement) NO BID
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