

**19-027 BLS - Recommended Award**

HIGHLANDS COUNTY  
BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS  
PURCHASING DIVISION

BID No. 19-027 BASIC LIFE SUPPORT PRICE SHEET									
NUM	DESCRIPTION	ITEM ID	MFG ITEM #	VENDOR'S ITEM #	UNIT/ BASE FOR AWARD	PRICE PER UNIT	CASE PACK	PRICE PER CASE	RANK ORDER
0	Example	BRAND: Medical Supplies	ABC12345	DEF6789	Each	\$2.00	50/box 10 box/case	\$1,000.00	
1	3" Conforming Stretch Gauze Bandage	BRAND: Concordance Healthcare Solutions, LLC	MFG ITEM #: 603	VENDOR'S ITEM #: 785785	Each	\$0.09	12/bg, 8bg/cs	1.08/bg, 8.64/cs	1 tie
	Bound Tree Medical, LLC	BRAND: CURAPLEX BY BOUND TREE	MFG ITEM #: 1121-36559	VENDOR'S ITEM #: 1121-36559	Each	\$0.0900/Each	12/BG	\$1.08	1 tie
	Henry Schein, Inc	Henry Schein Inc	1048997	1048997	Each	\$0.09	96	\$8.64	1 tie
	Nashville Medical EMS Products, Inc	KENTRON	440003	K440003	Each	\$0.0922	96	\$8.85	2
	Medline Industries, Inc.	Medline	NON25493H	NON25493H	Each	\$0.09	12 EA / BX	\$1.08	1 tie
2	1" hypo-allergenic cloth tape	BRAND: Concordance Healthcare Solutions, LLC	MFG ITEM #: C110	VENDOR'S ITEM #: 660548	Each	\$0.59	12/bx, 12bx/cs	7.08/bx, 84.96/cs	3
	Bound Tree Medical, LLC	BRAND: CURAPLEX BY BOUND TREE	MFG ITEM #: 1841-14007	VENDOR'S ITEM #: 1110-14007	Each	\$0.6600/Each	144/CS	\$95.04	4
	Henry Schein, Inc	Henry Schein Inc	1012323	1012323	Each	\$0.69	144	\$99.36	5
	Nashville Medical EMS Products, Inc	KENTRON	705211	K705211	Each	\$0.57	144	\$81.36	2
	Medline Industries, Inc.	Curad	NON270001Z	NON270001Z	Each	\$0.33	12 RL / BX	\$3.96	1
3	3" hypo-allergenic cloth tape	BRAND: Concordance Healthcare Solutions, LLC	MFG ITEM #: C310	VENDOR'S ITEM #: 660563	Each	\$1.77	4/bx, 12bx/cs	7.08/bx, 84.96/cs	3
	Bound Tree Medical, LLC	BRAND: CURAPLEX BY BOUND TREE	MFG ITEM #: 1841-14009	VENDOR'S ITEM #: 1110-14009	Each	\$1.9800/Each	48/CS	\$95.04	5
	Henry Schein, Inc	Henry Schein Inc	200-030-048	1006296	Each	\$1.83	48	\$87.84	4
	Nashville Medical EMS Products, Inc	KENTRON	705213	K705213	Each	\$1.70	48	\$81.36	2
	Medline Industries, Inc.	Curad	NON270003Z	NON270003Z	Each	\$1.03	4 RL / BX	\$4.12	1
4	1" Band-Aids	BRAND: Concordance Healthcare Solutions, LLC	MFG ITEM #: CBD2019-017	VENDOR'S ITEM #: 183985	Each	\$0.01	100/bx, 12bx/cs	1.13/bx, 13.56/cs	2
	Bound Tree Medical, LLC	BRAND: Tempo Medical - Curaplex	MFG ITEM #: CBAF013	VENDOR'S ITEM #: 1122-14960	Each	\$0.0140/Each	6000/CS	\$84.00	3
	Henry Schein, Inc	Henry Schein Inc	1126133	1126133	Each	\$0.02	5400	\$108.00	4
	Nashville Medical EMS Products, Inc	KENTRON	880013	k880013	Each	\$0.01	100	\$0.99	1
	Medline Industries, Inc.	Curad	NON25660Z	NON25660Z	Each	\$0.30	100 EA / BX	\$3.00	5
5	2" Band-Aids	BRAND: Concordance Healthcare Solutions, LLC	MFG ITEM #: CBD2016-012	VENDOR'S ITEM #: 969097	Each	\$0.04	50/bx, 12bx/cs	2.11/bx, 25.32/cs	2
	Bound Tree Medical, LLC	BRAND: Tempo Medical - Curaplex	MFG ITEM #: CBAF024	VENDOR'S ITEM #: 1122-14964	Each	\$0.0400/Each	6000/CS	\$240.00	2

19-027 BLS - Recommended Award

HIGHLANDS COUNTY  
BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS  
PURCHASING DIVISION

Henry Schein, Inc	Aso Corporation	CBD4016	2610116	Each	\$0.05	600	\$30.00	3
Nashville Medical EMS Products, Inc	KENTRON	8800245	k8800245	Each	\$0.03	50	\$1.58	1
Medline Industries, Inc.	Curad	CUR00727RBH	CUR00727RBH	Each	\$1.37	1 BX / BX	\$1.37	4
6	5" x 9" sterile ABD pads	BRAND:	VENDOR'S ITEM #:	Each				
Concordance Healthcare Solutions, LLC	BRAND: Dukal	MFG ITEM #: 5590	VENDOR'S ITEM #: 660332	Each	\$0.08	25/ty, 16ty/cs	1.93/ty, 30.88/cs	3
Bound Tree Medical, LLC	BRAND: CURAPLEX BY BOUND TREE	MFG ITEM #: 1212-12110	VENDOR'S ITEM #: 1212-12110	Each	\$0.0840/Each	400/CS	\$33.60	4
Henry Schein, Inc	Dukal Corporation	5590	1202048	Each	\$0.09	400	\$36.00	5
Nashville Medical EMS Products, Inc	KENTRON	777590	k777590	Each	\$0.07	400	\$29.20	2
Medline Industries, Inc.	Caring	PRM21450Z	PRM21450Z	Each	\$0.07	25 EA / BX	\$1.77	1
7	4" x 4", 4-ply sterile sponges	BRAND:	VENDOR'S ITEM #:	Each				
Concordance Healthcare Solutions, LLC	BRAND: Emphasis	MFG ITEM #: H44421	VENDOR'S ITEM #: 732260	Each	\$0.02	2/pk, 25pk/bx	1.14/bx, 27.36/cs	3
Bound Tree Medical, LLC	BRAND: DUKAL CORP.	MFG ITEM #: 7454SP	VENDOR'S ITEM #: 276-7454SP	Each	\$0.0440/Each	800/CS	\$35.20	5
Henry Schein, Inc	Henry Schein Inc	1048665	1048665	Each	\$0.04	1200	\$48.00	4
Nashville Medical EMS Products, Inc	KENTRON	251444	k251444	Each	\$0.02	1200	\$26.40	2
Medline Industries, Inc.	Caring	PRM21224H	PRM21224H	Each	\$0.02	50 PK / BX	\$0.85	1
8	4" x 4", 8-ply unsterile sponges	BRAND:	VENDOR'S ITEM #:	Each				
Concordance Healthcare Solutions, LLC	BRAND: Emphasis	MFG ITEM #: GA44820	VENDOR'S ITEM #: 752230	Each	\$0.01	200/pk, 20pk/cs	1.60/pk, 32.00/cs	2
Bound Tree Medical, LLC	BRAND: DUKAL CORP.	MFG ITEM #: 8509	VENDOR'S ITEM #: 276-8509BG	Each	\$0.0130/Each	4000/CS	\$52.00	5
Henry Schein, Inc	Henry Schein Inc	1048194	1048194	Each	\$0.02	4000	\$80.00	4
Nashville Medical EMS Products, Inc	KENTRON	448111	k448111	Each	\$0.01	4000	\$30.80	1
Medline Industries, Inc.	Caring	PRM21408CZ	PRM21408CZ	Each	\$0.01	200 EA / BAC	\$2.00	3
9	2" x 2", 12 ply sterile gauze pads	BRAND:	VENDOR'S ITEM #:	Each				
Concordance Healthcare Solutions, LLC	BRAND: Dynarex	MFG ITEM #: 3352	VENDOR'S ITEM #: 749899	Each	\$0.02	100/bx, 24bx/cs	2.04/bx, 48.96/cs	3
Bound Tree Medical, LLC	BRAND: CURAPLEX BY BOUND TREE	MFG ITEM #: 1212-12100	VENDOR'S ITEM #: 1212-12100	Each	\$0.0240/Each	2400/CS	\$57.60	4
Henry Schein, Inc	Henry Schein Inc	1004380	1004380	Each	\$0.04	2400	\$96.00	5
Nashville Medical EMS Products, Inc	KENTRON	221211	k221211	Each	\$0.02	2400	\$42.00	2
Medline Industries, Inc.	Caring	PRM21212CZ	PRM21212CZ	Each	\$0.01	200 EA / BAC	\$0.78	1
10	Triangular bandages-indiv. Wrapped	BRAND:	VENDOR'S ITEM #:	Each				
Concordance Healthcare Solutions, LLC	BRAND: MedSource	MFG ITEM #: MS-11050	VENDOR'S ITEM #: 782329	Each	\$0.19	127/bx, 20bx/cs	2.28/bx, 45.60/cs	2
Bound Tree Medical, LLC	BRAND: CURAPLEX BY BOUND TREE	MFG ITEM #: 1124-32400	VENDOR'S ITEM #: 1124-32400	Each	\$0.2300/Each	240/CS	\$55.20	4
Henry Schein, Inc	Medsource International	MS-11050	4998403	Each	\$0.18	240	\$43.20	1
Nashville Medical EMS Products, Inc	KENTRON	405656	k405656	Each	\$0.19	240	\$45.10	3
Medline Industries, Inc.	Dynarex	DYA3672	DYA3672	Each	\$0.49	12 EA / BX	\$5.88	5

19-027 BLS - Recommended Award

HIGHLANDS COUNTY  
BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS  
PURCHASING DIVISION

11	Adult multigrip head immobilizer	I-TEC PRODUCT ONLY; NO SUBSTITUTIONS				Each			1	
	Concordance Healthcare Solutions, LLC	I-TEC PRODUCT ONLY; NO SUBSTITUTIONS				Each	\$4.29		20	\$85.80
	Bound Tree Medical, LLC	I-TEC PRODUCT ONLY; NO SUBSTITUTIONS				Each	\$3.2000/Each		1	\$3.20
	Henry Schein, Inc	I-TEC PRODUCT ONLY; NO SUBSTITUTIONS				Each	\$4.20		50	\$210.00
	Nashville Medical EMS Products, Inc	I-TEC PRODUCT ONLY; NO SUBSTITUTIONS				Each			1	
	Medline Industries, Inc	I-TEC PRODUCT ONLY; NO SUBSTITUTIONS				Each	\$5.65		1	\$5.65
12	Child multigrip head immobilizer	I-TEC PRODUCT ONLY; NO SUBSTITUTIONS				Each			1	
	Concordance Healthcare Solutions, LLC	I-TEC PRODUCT ONLY; NO SUBSTITUTIONS				Each	\$4.29		50	\$214.50
	Bound Tree Medical, LLC	I-TEC PRODUCT ONLY; NO SUBSTITUTIONS				Each	\$3.2000/Each		1	\$3.20
	Henry Schein, Inc	I-TEC PRODUCT ONLY; NO SUBSTITUTIONS				Each	\$4.20		50	\$210.00
	Nashville Medical EMS Products, Inc	I-TEC PRODUCT ONLY; NO SUBSTITUTIONS				Each			1	
	Medline Industries, Inc.	I-TEC PRODUCT ONLY; NO SUBSTITUTIONS				Each	\$5.59		1	\$5.59
13	7 ft. Oxygen cannula - adult with curved tip	BRAND:	MFG ITEM #:	VENDOR'S ITEM #:		Each				
	Concordance Healthcare Solutions, LLC	BRAND: Ventlab	MFG ITEM #: 1007	VENDOR'S ITEM #: 816688		Each	\$0.23		50	\$11.50
	Bound Tree Medical, LLC	BRAND: CURAPLEX BY BOUND TREE	MFG ITEM #: 30050	VENDOR'S ITEM #: 30050		Each	\$0.2400/Each		50	\$12.00
	Henry Schein, Inc	Henry Schein Inc	C0209	9007036		Each	\$0.25		50	\$12.50
	Nashville Medical EMS Products, Inc	KENTRON	999308	K999308		Each	\$0.18		50	\$8.75
	Medline Industries, Inc.	Medsource	CPEMS24004	CPEMS24004		Each	\$0.30		50 EA / CS	\$15.00
14	7 ft. Oxygen cannula - pediatric with curved tip	BRAND:	MFG ITEM #:	VENDOR'S ITEM #:		Each				
	Concordance Healthcare Solutions, LLC	BRAND: Ventlab	MFG ITEM #: 1207	VENDOR'S ITEM #: 816697		Each	\$0.34		50	\$17.00
	Bound Tree Medical, LLC	BRAND: CURAPLEX BY BOUND TREE	MFG ITEM #: 30056	VENDOR'S ITEM #: 30056		Each	\$0.2400/Each		50	\$12.00
	Henry Schein, Inc	Henry Schein Inc	C0202	9007034		Each	\$0.25		50	\$12.50
	Nashville Medical EMS Products, Inc	KENTRON	999312	K999312		Each	\$0.18		50	\$8.75
	Medline Industries, Inc.	Medsource	CPEMS24101	CPEMS24101		Each	\$0.54		50 EA / CS	\$27.00
15	7 ft. Non-rebreathing mask with check valve - adult	BRAND:	MFG ITEM #:	VENDOR'S ITEM #:		Each				
	Concordance Healthcare Solutions, LLC	BRAND: Ventlab	MFG ITEM #: 2101	VENDOR'S ITEM #: 183450		Each	\$0.61		50	\$30.50
	Bound Tree Medical, LLC	BRAND: CURAPLEX BY BOUND TREE	MFG ITEM #: 30051	VENDOR'S ITEM #: 30051		Each	\$0.6500/Each		50/CS	\$32.50
	Henry Schein, Inc	Medsource International	MS-25060	4996737		Each	\$0.66		50	\$33.00
	Nashville Medical EMS Products, Inc	KENTRON	999107	K999107		Each	\$0.59		50	\$29.50
	Medline Industries, Inc.	Medline	HCS4640B	HCS4640B		Each	\$0.78		50 EA / CS	\$39.00
16	Single use restraint straps; 2 piece 2" x 5'	BRAND:	MFG ITEM #:	VENDOR'S ITEM #:		Each				

**19-027 BLS - Recommended Award**

HIGHLANDS COUNTY  
BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS  
PURCHASING DIVISION

	Concordance Healthcare Solutions, LLC	BRAND: Dick Medical	MFG ITEM #: 471520R	VENDOR'S ITEM #: 746749	Each	\$1.52	1	\$1.52	2
	Bound Tree Medical, LLC	BRAND: CURAPLEX BY BOUND TREE	MFG ITEM #: 170330R	VENDOR'S ITEM #: 3172-73315	Each	\$1.9300/Each	1/EA	\$1.93	3
	Henry Schein, Inc	Medsource International	MS-ST612	7000693	Each	\$2.04	24	\$48.96	4
	Nashville Medical EMS Products, Inc	KENTRON	293305	K293305	Each	\$1.39	36	\$50.40	1
	Medline Industries, Inc	Medsource	CPEMSST393	CPEMSST393	Each	\$9.05	1 EA / EA	\$9.05	5
17	Disposable fitted sheets for stretcher; white; 30"x72"	ALLCARE PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # EF600; NO SUBSTITUTIONS			Each		50		
	Concordance Healthcare Solutions, LLC	ALLCARE PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # EF600; NO SUBSTITUTIONS			Each	\$0.93	50	\$46.50	3
	Bound Tree Medical, LLC	ALLCARE PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # EF600; NO SUBSTITUTIONS			Each	\$0.7000/Each	50	\$35.00	1
	Henry Schein, Inc	ALLCARE PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # EF600; NO SUBSTITUTIONS			Each	\$0.82	50	\$41.00	2
	Nashville Medical EMS Products, Inc	ALLCARE PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # EF600; NO SUBSTITUTIONS			Each		50		
	Medline Industries, Inc.	ALLCARE PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # EF600; NO SUBSTITUTIONS			Each	No Bid	50	No Bid	
18	Fluid resistant flat sheets; dark blue	BRAND:	MFG ITEM #:	VENDOR'S ITEM #:	Each				
	Concordance Healthcare Solutions, LLC	BRAND: Graham	MFG ITEM #: 322	VENDOR'S ITEM #: 760210	Each	\$0.39	50	\$19.25	2
	Bound Tree Medical, LLC	BRAND: CURAPLEX BY BOUND TREE	MFG ITEM #: 3271-44100	VENDOR'S ITEM #: 3271-44100	Each	\$0.4900/Each	50/CS	\$24.50	3
	Henry Schein, Inc	Medsource International	MS-001FL	4994553	Each	\$0.58	50	\$29.00	4
	Nashville Medical EMS Products, Inc	KENTRON	388401	K388401	Each	\$0.35	50	\$17.25	1
	Medline Industries, Inc.	Medline	NON33025	NON33025	Each	\$0.87	50 EA / CS	\$43.50	5
19	Multi-trauma dressing 10x30	BRAND:	MFG ITEM #:	VENDOR'S ITEM #:	Each				
	Concordance Healthcare Solutions, LLC	BRAND: Dynarex	MFG ITEM #: 3531	VENDOR'S ITEM #: 749977	Each	\$0.71	50	\$35.50	3
	Bound Tree Medical, LLC	BRAND: CURAPLEX BY BOUND TREE	MFG ITEM #: STORM-GZM00150	VENDOR'S ITEM #: 16353	Each	\$0.8500/Each	50/CS	\$42.50	4
	Henry Schein, Inc	Medsource International	MS-GZM00150	4995377	Each	\$0.86	50	\$43.00	5
	Nashville Medical EMS Products, Inc	KENTRON	771030	K771030	Each	\$0.59	50	\$29.50	2
	Medline Industries, Inc.	Medline	NON21459	NON21459	Each	\$0.54	50 EA / CS	\$27.00	1
20	Regulator Brass w/2 50psi ports 1-25 lpm LSP Rhino	BRAND:	MFG ITEM #:	VENDOR'S ITEM #:	Each				
	Concordance Healthcare Solutions, LLC	BRAND: Merret	MFG ITEM #: AREG8725-82D	VENDOR'S ITEM #: 776659	Each	\$27.38	1	\$27.38	2
	Bound Tree Medical, LLC	BRAND: ALLIED HEALTHCARE PRODUCTS INC	MFG ITEM #: L370-220-A	VENDOR'S ITEM #: 380021B	Each	\$194.9400/Each	1/EA	\$194.94	5
	Henry Schein, Inc	Medsource International	MS-010R25	1164408	Each	\$50.44	1	\$50.44	4
	Nashville Medical EMS Products, Inc	KENTRON	870A2CV25B	K870A2CV25B	Each	\$23.99	12	\$287.88	1
	Medline Industries, Inc.	Medline	CPR88725182C	CPR88725182C	Each	\$39.05	1 EA / EA	\$39.05	3
21	7 ft. non-rebreathing mask with check valve - child	BRAND:	MFG ITEM #:	VENDOR'S ITEM #:	Each				
	Concordance Healthcare Solutions, LLC	BRAND: Ventlab	MFG ITEM #: 2201	VENDOR'S ITEM #: 816715	Each	\$0.63	50	\$31.50	2
	Bound Tree Medical, LLC	BRAND: CURAPLEX BY BOUND TREE	MFG ITEM #: 30053	VENDOR'S ITEM #: 30053	Each	\$0.6400/Each	50/CS	\$32.00	3

19-027 BLS - Recommended Award

HIGHLANDS COUNTY  
BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS  
PURCHASING DIVISION

Henry Schein, Inc	Medsource International	MS-25058	4996154	Each	\$1.08	50	\$54.00	4
Nashville Medical EMS Products, Inc	KENTRON	999110	K999110	Each	\$0.59	50	\$29.50	1
Medline Industries, Inc.	Medline	HCS4542B	HCS4542B	Each	\$1.22	50 EA / CS	\$61.00	5
22	7 ft. oxygen mask - high concentration infant	BRAND:	VENDOR'S ITEM #:	Each				
		MFG ITEM #:						
	Concordance Healthcare Solutions, LLC	BRAND: Venlab	VENDOR'S ITEM # 816724	Each	\$0.64	50	\$32.00	1
	Bound Tree Medical, LLC	BRAND: CURAPLEX BY BOUND TREE	VENDOR'S ITEM #: 30058	Each	\$0.9100/Each	50/CS	\$45.50	3
	Henry Schein, Inc	Medsource International	4998044	Each	\$1.06	50	\$53.00	4
	Nashville Medical EMS Products, Inc	KENTRON	999119	Each	\$0.65	50	\$32.50	2
	Medline Industries, Inc.	Medline	HCSU4642B	Each	\$1.22	50 EA / CS	\$61.00	5
23	Ambu-Spur II resuscitator mask, adult	AMBU PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 520-211-000; NO SUBSTITUTIONS		Each		1		
	Concordance Healthcare Solutions, LLC	AMBU PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 520-211-000; NO SUBSTITUTIONS		Each	\$9.31	12	\$111.72	4
	Bound Tree Medical, LLC	AMBU PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 520-211-000; NO SUBSTITUTIONS		Each	\$9.0900/Each	1	\$9.03	3
	Henry Schein, Inc	AMBU PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 520-211-000; NO SUBSTITUTIONS		Each	\$9.23	12	\$110.76	2
	Nashville Medical EMS Products, Inc	AMBU PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 520-211-000; NO SUBSTITUTIONS		Each	\$8.98	12	\$107.76	1
	Medline Industries, Inc.	AMBU PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 520-211-000; NO SUBSTITUTIONS		Each	\$11.15	12	\$133.80	5
24	Ambu-Spur II resuscitator mask, infant/child	AMBU PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 530-212-000; NO SUBSTITUTIONS		Each		1		
	Concordance Healthcare Solutions, LLC	AMBU PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 530-212-000; NO SUBSTITUTIONS		Each	\$12.53	12	\$150.36	4
	Bound Tree Medical, LLC	AMBU PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 530-212-000; NO SUBSTITUTIONS		Each	\$11.9600/Each	1	\$11.96	1
	Henry Schein, Inc	AMBU PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 530-212-000; NO SUBSTITUTIONS		Each	\$12.38	12	\$148.56	3
	Nashville Medical EMS Products, Inc	AMBU PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 530-212-000; NO SUBSTITUTIONS		Each	\$11.98	12	\$143.76	2
	Medline Industries, Inc.	AMBU PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 530-212-000; NO SUBSTITUTIONS		Each	\$14.06	12	\$168.72	5
25	Disposable economical blanket	BRAND:	VENDOR'S ITEM #:	Each				
	Concordance Healthcare Solutions, LLC	BRAND: Graham	VENDOR'S ITEM # 760297	Each	\$0.99	25	\$24.75	2
	Bound Tree Medical, LLC	BRAND: CURAPLEX BY BOUND TREE	VENDOR'S ITEM #: 16570	Each	\$1.9000/Each	24/CS	\$45.60	3
	Henry Schein, Inc	Medsource International	4995710	Each	\$3.69	18	\$66.42	5
	Nashville Medical EMS Products, Inc	KENTRON	K886657-50	Each	\$0.92	50	\$46.00	1
	Medline Industries, Inc.	Medline	NONDB4080	Each	\$2.60	10 EA / CS	\$26.00	4
26	Disposable suction canisters, 1200 CC	BEMIS PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 484410; NO SUBSTITUTIONS		Each		48		
	Concordance Healthcare Solutions, LLC	BRAND: Conimed	VENDOR'S ITEM # 708286	Each	\$10.58	1	\$10.58	5
	Bound Tree Medical, LLC	BEMIS PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 484410; NO SUBSTITUTIONS		Each	\$2.7500/Each	48	\$132.00	3
	Henry Schein, Inc	BEMIS PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 484410; NO SUBSTITUTIONS		Each	\$2.50	48	\$120.00	1

19-027 BLS - Recommended Award

HIGHLANDS COUNTY  
BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS  
PURCHASING DIVISION

	Nashville Medical EMS Products, Inc	BEMIS PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 484410; NO SUBSTITUTIONS				Each	\$2.69	48	\$129.12	2
	Medline Industries, Inc.	BEMIS PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 484410; NO SUBSTITUTIONS				Each	\$3.30	48	\$158.40	4
27	Universal suction tubing 1/4" x 100'		MFG ITEM #:	VENDOR'S ITEM #:		Each				
	Concordance Healthcare Solutions, LLC	BRAND: Conmed	MFG ITEM #: 0048260	VENDOR'S ITEM #: 708286		Each	\$10.58	1	\$10.58	4
	Bound Tree Medical, LLC	BRAND: CARDINAL HEALTH	MFG ITEM #: 516500	VENDOR'S ITEM #: B010200		Each	\$0.2800/Each	400/CS	\$112.00	1
	Henry Schein, Inc	Medtronic MITG-Covidien	8888280412	8900941		Each	\$12.80	1	\$12.80	5
	Nashville Medical EMS Products, Inc	KENTRON	992224	K992224		Each	\$9.99	1	\$9.99	3
	Medline Industries, Inc.	Medline	OR610	OR610		Each	\$0.76	50 EA / CS	\$38.00	2
28	Large-bore suction catheter with thumb control - Yankaur only		MFG ITEM #:	VENDOR'S ITEM #:		Each				
	Concordance Healthcare Solutions, LLC	BRAND: Dynarex	MFG ITEM #: 4690	VENDOR'S ITEM #: 183414		Each	\$0.34	50	\$17.00	2
	Bound Tree Medical, LLC	BRAND: CURAPLEX BY BOUND TREE	MFG ITEM #: BT-YK10	VENDOR'S ITEM #: 535-MS-YK10EA		Each	\$0.5400/Each	50/CS	\$27.00	4
	Henry Schein, Inc	Medsource International	MS-YK10	4995371		Each	\$0.48	50	\$24.00	3
	Nashville Medical EMS Products, Inc	KENTRON	887710	K887710		Each	\$0.31	50	\$15.50	1
	Medline Industries, Inc.	SSCOR	BND594240	BND594241		Each	\$2.27	1 EA / EA	\$2.27	5
29	Cold packs		MFG ITEM #:	VENDOR'S ITEM #:		Each				
	Concordance Healthcare Solutions, LLC	BRAND: Dynarex	MFG ITEM #: 4512	VENDOR'S ITEM #: 220227		Each	\$0.43	24	\$10.32	5
	Bound Tree Medical, LLC	BRAND: Tempo Medical - Curaplex	MFG ITEM #: C5050	VENDOR'S ITEM #: 1431-55000		Each	\$0.1900/Each	50/CS	\$9.50	2
	Henry Schein, Inc	Henry Schein Inc	1126145	1126145		Each	\$0.38	24	\$9.12	3
	Nashville Medical EMS Products, Inc	KENTRON	560057	K560057		Each	\$0.18	48	\$8.64	1
	Medline Industries, Inc.	Medline	MDS137000	MDS137000		Each	\$0.41	24 EA / CS	\$9.84	4
30	Latex-free Tourniquets		MFG ITEM #:	VENDOR'S ITEM #:		Each				
	Concordance Healthcare Solutions, LLC	BRAND: Graham Field	MFG ITEM #: 4109-1LF	VENDOR'S ITEM #: 120120		Each	\$0.07	250	\$16.25	2
	Bound Tree Medical, LLC	BRAND: CURAPLEX BY BOUND TREE	MFG ITEM #: 1841-14000	VENDOR'S ITEM #: 1841-14000		Each	\$0.0780/Each	500/CS	\$39.00	3
	Henry Schein, Inc	Medsource International, LLC	MS-17301	4997340		Each	\$0.06	1000	\$60.00	1
	Nashville Medical EMS Products, Inc	KENTRON	901100	K901100		Each	\$0.07	1000	\$65.00	2
	Medline Industries, Inc.	Medsource	CPEMS17301	CPEMS17301		Each	\$0.08	1000 EA / CS	\$75.00	4
31	Plastic urinals		MFG ITEM #:	VENDOR'S ITEM #:		Each				
	Concordance Healthcare Solutions, LLC	BRAND: Medegen	MFG ITEM #: H140-01	VENDOR'S ITEM #: 505073		Each	\$0.34	50	\$17.00	1
	Bound Tree Medical, LLC	BRAND: MEDLINE INDUSTRIES, INC.	MFG ITEM #: DYND802355	VENDOR'S ITEM #: 1072-23519		Each	\$0.4800/Each	48/CS	\$23.04	3
	Henry Schein, Inc	Medegen Medical Products, LLC	H140-01	1004606		Each	\$0.48	50	\$24.00	4
	Nashville Medical EMS Products, Inc	KENTRON	201103	K201103		Each	\$0.49	50	\$24.50	5
	Medline Industries, Inc.	Medline	DYND802355	DYND802355		Each	\$0.39	48 EA / CS	\$18.72	2

19-027 BLS - Recommended Award

HIGHLANDS COUNTY  
BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS  
PURCHASING DIVISION

Item #	Brand	MFG ITEM #:	VENDOR'S ITEM #:	Each	Unit Price	Quantity	Unit Price	Quantity
32	Disposable sterile burn sheets			Each				
	Concordance Healthcare Solutions, LLC	MFG ITEM #: MS-BS0033	VENDOR'S ITEM #: 782716	Each	\$1.64	50	\$82.00	3
	Bound Tree Medical, LLC	MFG ITEM #: STORM-BS0033	VENDOR'S ITEM #: 30061MS	Each	\$2,100.00/Each	50/CS	\$105.00	5
	Henry Schein, Inc	MS-BS0033	4995379	Each	\$1.32	50	\$66.00	2
	Nashville Medical EMS Products, Inc	888111	K888111	Each	\$1.29	24	\$30.96	1
	Medline Industries, Inc.	CPMSBS0033	CPMSBS0033	Each	\$2.00	50 EA / CS	\$100.00	4
33	Criterion powder-free nitrile gloves; small			100 Each				
	HENRY SCHINE CRITERION PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 1118535; NO SUBSTITUTIONS			100 Each				
	Concordance Healthcare Solutions, LLC	HENRY SCHINE CRITERION PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 1118535; NO SUBSTITUTIONS		100 Each	NB	1000	Exclusive	
	Bound Tree Medical, LLC	HENRY SCHINE CRITERION PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 1118535; NO SUBSTITUTIONS		100 Each	\$0.0350/Each	1000	\$35.00	1
	Henry Schein, Inc	HENRY SCHINE CRITERION PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 1118535; NO SUBSTITUTIONS		100 Each	\$5.01	10	\$50.10	2
	Nashville Medical EMS Products, Inc	HENRY SCHINE CRITERION PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 1118535; NO SUBSTITUTIONS		100 Each		1000		
	Medline Industries, Inc.	HENRY SCHINE CRITERION PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 1118535; NO SUBSTITUTIONS		100 Each	No Bid	1000	No Bid	
34	Criterion powder-free nitrile gloves; medium			100 Each				
	HENRY SCHINE CRITERION PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 1118536; NO SUBSTITUTIONS			100 Each				
	Concordance Healthcare Solutions, LLC	HENRY SCHINE CRITERION PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 1118536; NO SUBSTITUTIONS		100 Each	NB	1000	Exclusive	
	Bound Tree Medical, LLC	HENRY SCHINE CRITERION PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 1118536; NO SUBSTITUTIONS		100 Each	\$0.0350/Each	1000	\$35.00	1
	Henry Schein, Inc	HENRY SCHINE CRITERION PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 1118536; NO SUBSTITUTIONS		100 Each	\$5.01	10	\$50.10	2
	Nashville Medical EMS Products, Inc	HENRY SCHINE CRITERION PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 1118536; NO SUBSTITUTIONS		100 Each		1000		
	Medline Industries, Inc.	HENRY SCHINE CRITERION PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 1118536; NO SUBSTITUTIONS		100 Each	No Bid	1000	No Bid	
35	Criterion powder-free nitrile gloves; large			100 Each				
	HENRY SCHINE CRITERION PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 1118537; NO SUBSTITUTIONS			100 Each				
	Concordance Healthcare Solutions, LLC	HENRY SCHINE CRITERION PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 1118537; NO SUBSTITUTIONS		100 Each	NB	1000	Exclusive	
	Bound Tree Medical, LLC	HENRY SCHINE CRITERION PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 1118537; NO SUBSTITUTIONS		100 Each	\$0.0350/Each	1000	\$35.00	1
	Henry Schein, Inc	HENRY SCHINE CRITERION PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 1118537; NO SUBSTITUTIONS		100 Each	\$5.01	10	\$50.10	2
	Nashville Medical EMS Products, Inc	HENRY SCHINE CRITERION PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 1118537; NO SUBSTITUTIONS		100 Each		1000		
	Medline Industries, Inc.	HENRY SCHINE CRITERION PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 1118537; NO SUBSTITUTIONS		100 Each	No Bid	1000	No Bid	
36	Criterion powder-free nitrile gloves; x-large			100 Each				
	HENRY SCHINE CRITERION PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 1118539; NO SUBSTITUTIONS			100 Each				
	Concordance Healthcare Solutions, LLC	HENRY SCHINE CRITERION PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 1118539; NO SUBSTITUTIONS		100 Each	NB	1000	Exclusive	
	Bound Tree Medical, LLC	HENRY SCHINE CRITERION PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 1118539; NO SUBSTITUTIONS		100 Each	\$0.0420/Each	1000	\$42.00	1
	Henry Schein, Inc	HENRY SCHINE CRITERION PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 1118539; NO SUBSTITUTIONS		100 Each	\$5.60	9	\$50.40	2
	Nashville Medical EMS Products, Inc	HENRY SCHINE CRITERION PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 1118539; NO SUBSTITUTIONS		100 Each		1000		
	Medline Industries, Inc.	HENRY SCHINE CRITERION PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 1118539; NO SUBSTITUTIONS		100 Each	No Bid	1000	No Bid	
37	Powder-free nitrile medical exam gloves; xx-large			100 Each				
	BRAND:	MFG ITEM #:	VENDOR'S ITEM #:	100 Each				

**19-027 BLS - Recommended Award**

HIGHLANDS COUNTY  
BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

PURCHASING DIVISION

	Concordance Healthcare Solutions, LLC	BRAND: Sempermed	MFG ITEM # : SSSC106	VENDOR'S ITEM # : 282173	100 Each	\$0.08	90/bx, 10bx/cs	7.065/bx, 70.65/cs	2
	Bound Tree Medical, LLC	BRAND: No Bid	MFG ITEM # : No Bid	VENDOR'S ITEM # : NO BID	100 Each	No Bid	1000	No Bid	
	Henry Schein, Inc	Ansell Healthcare Products LLC	USE-880-XXL	4993336	100 Each	\$10.73	10	\$107.30	3
	Nashville Medical EMS Products, Inc	BRAND:	MFG ITEM # :	VENDOR'S ITEM # :	100 Each		1000		
	Medline Industries, Inc	Medline	484805	484805	100 Each	\$6.25	800	\$50.00	1
		BRAND:	MFG ITEM # :	VENDOR'S ITEM # :	Each				
38	Bio-Hazardous red bags; 5 gallon	BRAND: Medegen	MFG ITEM # : 116	VENDOR'S ITEM # : 204057	Each	\$0.11	500	\$55.00	5
	Concordance Healthcare Solutions, LLC	BRAND: MEDEGEN MEDICAL PRODUCTS	MFG ITEM # : F116	VENDOR'S ITEM # : 290116	Each	\$0.0800/Each	500/CS	\$40.00	3
	Bound Tree Medical, LLC	Medegen Medical Products, LLC	RD650	1538555	Each	\$0.09	200	\$18.00	4
	Henry Schein, Inc	KENTRON	9801	K09801	Each	\$0.08	1000	\$77.00	2
	Nashville Medical EMS Products, Inc	Medline	NON151717	NON151717	Each	\$0.07	500	\$37.00	1
	Medline Industries, Inc.								
39	Bio-Hazardous red bags; 30 gallon	BRAND:	MFG ITEM # :	VENDOR'S ITEM # :	Each				
	Concordance Healthcare Solutions, LLC	BRAND: Medegen	MFG ITEM # : 117M	VENDOR'S ITEM # : 150768	Each	\$0.18	250	\$45.00	4
	Bound Tree Medical, LLC	BRAND: MEDLINE INDUSTRIES, INC.	MFG ITEM # : NONHDR43	VENDOR'S ITEM # : 290037	Each	\$0.1500/Each	250/CS	\$37.50	2
	Henry Schein, Inc	Medegen Medical Products, LLC	44-05	6024938	Each	\$0.16	250	\$40.00	3
	Nashville Medical EMS Products, Inc	KENTRON	313913	K313913	Each	\$0.13	250	\$32.50	1
	Medline Industries, Inc.	Medline	NON153044	NON153044	Each	\$0.23	100 EA / CS	\$23.00	5
40	StiffNeck cervical immobilization device (CID); pediatric	LAERDAL PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 260202; NO SUBSTITUTIONS			Each		1		
	Concordance Healthcare Solutions, LLC	LAERDAL PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 260202; NO SUBSTITUTIONS			Each	\$4.85	50	\$242.50	2
	Bound Tree Medical, LLC	LAERDAL PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 260202; NO SUBSTITUTIONS			Each	\$3.7500/Each	1	\$3.75	1
	Henry Schein, Inc	LAERDAL PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 260202; NO SUBSTITUTIONS			Each	\$5.05	20	\$101.00	3
	Nashville Medical EMS Products, Inc	LAERDAL PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 260202; NO SUBSTITUTIONS			Each	\$11.34	1 EA / EA	\$11.34	4
	Medline Industries, Inc.	LAERDAL PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 260202; NO SUBSTITUTIONS							
41	StiffNeck cervical immobilization device (CID); regular	LAERDAL PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 260205; NO SUBSTITUTIONS			Each		1		
	Concordance Healthcare Solutions, LLC	LAERDAL PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 260205; NO SUBSTITUTIONS			Each	\$4.85	50	\$242.50	3
	Bound Tree Medical, LLC	LAERDAL PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 260205; NO SUBSTITUTIONS			Each	\$3.7500/Each	1	\$3.75	1
	Henry Schein, Inc	LAERDAL PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 260205; NO SUBSTITUTIONS			Each	\$4.77	50	\$238.50	2
	Nashville Medical EMS Products, Inc	LAERDAL PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 260205; NO SUBSTITUTIONS			Each		1		
	Medline Industries, Inc.	LAERDAL PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 260205; NO SUBSTITUTIONS			Each	\$11.43	1 EA / EA	\$11.43	4
42	StiffNeck cervical immobilization device (CID); tall	LAERDAL PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 260206; NO SUBSTITUTIONS			Each		1		
	Concordance Healthcare Solutions, LLC	LAERDAL PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 260206; NO SUBSTITUTIONS			Each	\$4.85	50	\$242.50	3



19-027 BLS - Recommended Award

HIGHLANDS COUNTY  
BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS  
PURCHASING DIVISION

	Bound Tree Medical, LLC	LAERDAL PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 260206; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each	\$3.7500/Each	1	\$3.75	1
	Henry Schein, Inc	LAERDAL PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 260206; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each	\$4.77	50	\$238.50	2
	Nashville Medical EMS Products, Inc	LAERDAL PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 260206; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each		1		
	Medline Industries, Inc.	LAERDAL PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 260206; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each	\$12.00	1 EA / EA	\$12.00	4
43	StiffNeck cervical immobilization device (CID); short	LAERDAL PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 260204; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each		1		
	Concordance Healthcare Solutions, LLC	LAERDAL PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 260204; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each	\$4.85	50	\$242.50	3
	Bound Tree Medical, LLC	LAERDAL PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 260204; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each	\$3.7500/Each	1	\$3.75	1
	Henry Schein, Inc	LAERDAL PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 260204; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each	\$4.77	50	\$238.50	2
	Nashville Medical EMS Products, Inc	LAERDAL PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 260204; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each		1		
	Medline Industries, Inc.	LAERDAL PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 260204; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each	\$11.49	1 EA / EA	\$11.49	4
44	StiffNeck cervical immobilization device (CID); no neck	LAERDAL PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 260201; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each		1		
	Concordance Healthcare Solutions, LLC	LAERDAL PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 260201; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each	\$4.85	50	\$242.50	3
	Bound Tree Medical, LLC	LAERDAL PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 260201; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each	\$3.7500/Each	1	\$3.75	1
	Henry Schein, Inc	LAERDAL PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 260201; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each	\$4.77	50	\$238.50	2
	Nashville Medical EMS Products, Inc	LAERDAL PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 260201; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each		1		
	Medline Industries, Inc.	LAERDAL PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 260201; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each	\$11.38	1 EA / EA	\$11.38	4
45	Bio-Hoop collection bag with hook	HARTWELL MEDICAL PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # BH1100H; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each		480		
	Concordance Healthcare Solutions, LLC	HARTWELL MEDICAL PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # BH1100H; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each	\$1.66	480	\$796.80	3
	Bound Tree Medical, LLC	HARTWELL MEDICAL PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # BH1100H; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each	\$1.6100/Each	480	\$772.80	2
	Henry Schein, Inc	HARTWELL MEDICAL PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # BH1100H; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each	\$1.58	480	\$758.40	1
	Nashville Medical EMS Products, Inc	HARTWELL MEDICAL PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # BH1100H; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each		480		
	Medline Industries, Inc.	HARTWELL MEDICAL PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # BH1100H; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each	\$2.33	12 EA / PAK	\$27.96	4
46	Posey double strap foam limb holders, standard foam	POSEY PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM #: 2528; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each		1		
	Concordance Healthcare Solutions, LLC	POSEY PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM #: 2528; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each	\$4.73	1	\$4.73	3
	Bound Tree Medical, LLC	POSEY PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM #: 2528; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each	\$5.9700/Each	1	\$5.97	4
	Henry Schein, Inc	POSEY PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM #: 2528; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each	\$3.72	48	\$178.56	2
	Nashville Medical EMS Products, Inc	POSEY PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM #: 2528; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each		1		
	Medline Industries, Inc.	POSEY PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM #: 2528; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each	\$2.38	2 EA / PAA	\$4.76	1
47	Pediatric IV arm board, padded	BRAND: MFG ITEM #: VENDOR'S ITEM #:	Each				
	Concordance Healthcare Solutions, LLC	BRAND: PDC MFG ITEM #: 45004-11-VENDOR'S ITEM #: 665703	Each	\$0.51	100	\$51.00	2
	Bound Tree Medical, LLC	BRAND: MORRISON MEDICAL PRODUCTS MFG ITEM #: 1005-50 VENDOR'S ITEM #: 56-1005EA	Each	\$0.9100/Each	50/CS	\$45.50	3
	Henry Schein, Inc	Morrison Medical Product 1009-100 2205595	Each	\$1.04	100	\$104.00	4



19-027 BLS - Recommended Award

HIGHLANDS COUNTY  
BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS  
PURCHASING DIVISION

53	Blood pressure cuff; blue, adult	ADC PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 760-11AN; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each			1		
	Concordance Healthcare Solutions, LLC	ADC PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 760-11AN; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each	\$17.03		1	\$17.03	3
	Bound Tree Medical, LLC	ADC PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 760-11AN; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each	\$15.9500/Each		1	\$15.95	1
	Henry Schein, Inc	ADC PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 760-11AN; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each	\$16.35		1	\$16.35	2
	Nashville Medical EMS Products, Inc	ADC PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 760-11AN; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each			1		
	Medline Industries, Inc.	ADC PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 760-11AN; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each	\$24.20		1 EA / EA	\$24.20	4
54	Blood pressure cuff; blue, child	ADC PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 760-9CN; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each			1		
	Concordance Healthcare Solutions, LLC	ADC PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 760-9CN; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each	\$17.03		1	\$17.03	3
	Bound Tree Medical, LLC	ADC PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 760-9CN; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each	\$15.9500/Each		1	\$15.95	1
	Henry Schein, Inc	ADC PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 760-9CN; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each	\$16.35		1	\$16.35	2
	Nashville Medical EMS Products, Inc	ADC PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 760-9CN; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each			1		
	Medline Industries, Inc.	ADC PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 760-9CN; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each	\$26.98		1 EA / EA	\$26.98	4
55	Blood pressure cuff; blue, infant	ADC PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 760-7IN; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each			1		
	Concordance Healthcare Solutions, LLC	ADC PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 760-7IN; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each	\$17.03		1	\$17.03	3
	Bound Tree Medical, LLC	ADC PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 760-7IN; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each	\$15.9500/Each		1	\$15.95	1
	Henry Schein, Inc	ADC PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 760-7IN; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each	\$16.35		1	\$16.35	2
	Nashville Medical EMS Products, Inc	ADC PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 760-7IN; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each			1		
	Medline Industries, Inc.	ADC PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 760-7IN; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each	\$25.07		1 EA / EA	\$25.07	4
56	Blood pressure cuff; blue, adult large	ADC PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 760-12XN; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each			1		
	Concordance Healthcare Solutions, LLC	ADC PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 760-12XN; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each	\$20.72		1	\$20.72	3
	Bound Tree Medical, LLC	ADC PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 760-12XN; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each	\$19.6600/Each		1	\$19.66	1
	Henry Schein, Inc	ADC PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 760-12XN; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each	\$19.92		1	\$19.92	2
	Nashville Medical EMS Products, Inc	ADC PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 760-12XN; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each			1		
	Medline Industries, Inc.	ADC PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 760-12XN; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each	\$29.04		1 EA / EA	\$29.04	4
57	Sterile Water, 1000 ml bottles	BRAND: MFG ITEM #:	Each					
	Concordance Healthcare Solutions, LLC	BRAND: Nurse Assist MFG ITEM #: 6291	Each	\$1.91		6	\$11.46	1
	Bound Tree Medical, LLC	BRAND: B. BRAUN MEDICAL, INC MFG ITEM #: R5000-01	Each	\$1.0200/Each		16/CS	\$32.32	2
	Henry Schein, Inc	Baxter Healthcare 2F7114	Each	\$2.63		12	\$31.56	4
	Nashville Medical EMS Products, Inc						No Bid	
	Medline Industries, Inc.	Medline DYND1000MLW	Each	\$2.24		6 EA / CS	\$13.44	3
58	Sterile Water, 500 ml bottles	BRAND: MFG ITEM #:	Each					
	Concordance Healthcare Solutions, LLC	BRAND: Nurse Assist MFG ITEM #: 6290	Each	\$1.53		18	\$27.54	1
	Bound Tree Medical, LLC	BRAND: B. BRAUN MEDICAL, INC MFG ITEM #: R5001-01	Each	\$1.8000/Each		16/CS	\$28.80	3

**19-027 BLS - Recommended Award**

HIGHLANDS COUNTY  
BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS  
PURCHASING DIVISION

	Henry Schein, Inc	Baxter Healthcare	2F7113	1530102	Each	\$2.48	18	\$44.64	4
	Nashville Medical EMS Products, Inc							No Bid	
	Medline Industries, Inc.	Medline	DYND500MLW	DYND500MLW	Each	\$1.57	18 EA / CS	\$28.26	2
59	<b>Sterile Water, 250 ml bottles</b>	BRAND:	MFG ITEM #	VENDOR'S ITEM #:	Each				
	Concordance Healthcare Solutions, LLC	BRAND: nurse Assist	MFG ITEM # 6260	VENDOR'S ITEM # : 234037	Each	\$1.25	24	\$30.00	2
	Bound Tree Medical, LLC	BRAND: BAXTER HEALTHCARE-DMG	MFG ITEM # : 2F7112	VENDOR'S ITEM # : 607112	Each	\$2.5000/Each	24/CS	\$60.00	4
	Henry Schein, Inc	Baxter Healthcare	2F7112	1536483	Each	\$2.45	24	\$58.80	3
	Nashville Medical EMS Products, Inc							No Bid	
	Medline Industries, Inc.	Medline	PCS1550	PCS1550	Each	\$1.07	24 EA / CS	\$25.68	1
60	<b>Technol PFR 95 Respirator - Regular</b>	KIMBERLY CLARK PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 4672; NO SUBSTITUTIONS			Each		1		
	Concordance Healthcare Solutions, LLC	KIMBERLY CLARK PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 4672; NO SUBSTITUTIONS			Each	\$0.60	35/bx, 6bx/cs	21.14/bx, 126.84/cs	1
	Bound Tree Medical, LLC	KIMBERLY CLARK PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 4672; NO SUBSTITUTIONS			Each	\$0.6400/Each	1	\$0.64	2
	Henry Schein, Inc	KIMBERLY CLARK PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 4672; NO SUBSTITUTIONS			Each	\$0.69	210	\$144.90	3
	Nashville Medical EMS Products, Inc	KIMBERLY CLARK PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 4672; NO SUBSTITUTIONS			Each		1		
	Medline Industries, Inc.	KIMBERLY CLARK PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 4672; NO SUBSTITUTIONS			Each	\$0.78	210 EA / CS	\$163.80	4
61	<b>Technol PFR 95 Respirator - Small</b>	KIMBERLY CLARK PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 4682; NO SUBSTITUTIONS			Each		1		
	Concordance Healthcare Solutions, LLC	KIMBERLY CLARK PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 4682; NO SUBSTITUTIONS			Each	\$0.60	35/bx, 6bx/cs	21.14/bx, 126.84/cs	1
	Bound Tree Medical, LLC	KIMBERLY CLARK PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 4682; NO SUBSTITUTIONS			Each	\$0.6400/Each	1	\$0.64	2
	Henry Schein, Inc	KIMBERLY CLARK PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 4682; NO SUBSTITUTIONS			Each	\$0.69	210	\$144.90	3
	Nashville Medical EMS Products, Inc	KIMBERLY CLARK PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 4682; NO SUBSTITUTIONS			Each		1		
	Medline Industries, Inc.	KIMBERLY CLARK PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 4682; NO SUBSTITUTIONS			Each	\$0.78	210 EA / CS	\$163.80	4
62	<b>Back Boards- Ultravue 18" NP</b>	IRON DUCK PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 35755; NO SUBSTITUTIONS			Each		1		
	Concordance Healthcare Solutions, LLC	IRON DUCK PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 35755; NO SUBSTITUTIONS			Each	\$149.37	1	\$149.37	3
	Bound Tree Medical, LLC	IRON DUCK PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 35755; NO SUBSTITUTIONS			Each	\$139.0000/Each	1	\$139.00	2
	Henry Schein, Inc	IRON DUCK PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 35755; NO SUBSTITUTIONS			Each	\$128.53	1	\$128.53	1
	Nashville Medical EMS Products, Inc	IRON DUCK PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 35755; NO SUBSTITUTIONS			Each		1		
	Medline Industries, Inc.	IRON DUCK PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # 35755; NO SUBSTITUTIONS			Each	No Bid	1	No Bid	
63	<b>Thermal Blankets</b>	BRAND:	MFG ITEM #	VENDOR'S ITEM #:	Each				
	Concordance Healthcare Solutions, LLC	BRAND: Dynarex	MFG ITEM # : 3537	VENDOR'S ITEM # : 749989	Each	\$0.42	120	\$50.40	2
	Bound Tree Medical, LLC	BRAND: CURAPLEX BY BOUND TREE	MFG ITEM # : 12945	VENDOR'S ITEM # : 12945	Each	\$0.4300/Each	200/CS	\$86.00	3
	Henry Schein, Inc	Calderon Textiles Inc	301W-THER	5083902	Each	\$10.11	1	\$10.11	4
	Nashville Medical EMS Products, Inc	KENTRON	#886656	K886656	Each	\$0.39	250	\$97.50	1
	Medline Industries, Inc.	Medsource	CPMSB100	CPMSB100	Each	\$0.53	200 EA / CS	\$106.00	

19-027 BLS - Recommended Award

HIGHLANDS COUNTY  
BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS  
PURCHASING DIVISION

64	Sam Splint, 36" roll	SAM MEDICAL PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # W-SP1121; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each				1		
	Concordance Healthcare Solutions, LLC	SAM MEDICAL PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # W-SP1121; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each	\$6.83			60	\$409.80	2
	Bound Tree Medical, LLC	SAM MEDICAL PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # W-SP1121; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each	\$7,3000/Each			1	\$7.30	3
	Henry Schein, Inc	SAM MEDICAL PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # W-SP1121; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each	\$6.33			60	\$379.80	1
	Nashville Medical EMS Products, Inc	SAM MEDICAL PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # W-SP1121; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each				1		
	Medline Industries, Inc.	SAM MEDICAL PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # W-SP1121; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each	\$8.48			60 EA / CS	\$508.80	4
65	O8 Kits - Soft Pack	BRAND: MFG ITEM #: VENDOR'S ITEM #:	Each						
	Concordance Healthcare Solutions, LLC	BRAND: Motion Medical MFG ITEM #: 1702 VENDOR'S ITEM #: 778858	Each	\$4.73			10	\$47.30	3
	Bound Tree Medical, LLC	BRAND: OTHER MANUFACTURER MFG ITEM #: 1721 VENDOR'S ITEM #: 540-1721EA	Each	\$4.4900/Each			10/CS	\$44.90	2
	Henry Schein, Inc	DMS Holdings Inc 650-4001-000	Each	\$6.30			1	\$6.30	4
	Nashville Medical EMS Products, Inc	KENTRON 999700	Each	\$3.89			10	\$38.90	1
	Medline Industries, Inc.	Boundtree BND444001	Each	\$19.93			1 EA / EA	\$19.93	5
66	Eye Wash, 4 oz	BRAND: MFG ITEM #: VENDOR'S ITEM #:	Each						
	Concordance Healthcare Solutions, LLC	BRAND: Medique MFG ITEM #: 198-18 VENDOR'S ITEM #: 809827	Each	\$2.06			48	\$98.88	2
	Bound Tree Medical, LLC	BRAND: AFASSCO MFG ITEM #: 711 VENDOR'S ITEM #: 60711	Each	\$2.6800/Each			48/CS	\$128.64	3
	Henry Schein, Inc	Henry Schein Inc 1127198	Each	\$1.62			1	\$1.62	1
	Nashville Medical EMS Products, Inc	Medline OCT756588	Each	\$4.01			1 EA / EA	\$4.01	4
	Medline Industries, Inc.								
67	CAT Tourniquet	NORTH AMERICAN PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM 23140; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each						
	Concordance Healthcare Solutions, LLC	NORTH AMERICAN PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM 23140; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each	\$22.71			1	\$22.71	4
	Bound Tree Medical, LLC	NORTH AMERICAN PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM 23140; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each	\$21.9800/Each			25/CS	\$549.50	3
	Henry Schein, Inc	NORTH AMERICAN PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM 23140; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each	\$20.61			1	\$20.61	1
	Nashville Medical EMS Products, Inc	NORTH AMERICAN PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM 23140; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each	\$21.69			100	\$2,169.00	2
	Medline Industries, Inc.	NORTH AMERICAN PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM 23140; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each	\$24.91			1 EA / EA	\$24.91	5
68	O2 MAX BITrac ED Mask, w/Neb, Adult LG, w/3-SET Valve	PULMODYNE PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # REF 313-7555XN; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each						
	Concordance Healthcare Solutions, LLC	PULMODYNE PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # REF 313-7555XN; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each	NB				Exclusive	
	Bound Tree Medical, LLC	PULMODYNE PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # REF 313-7555XN; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each	\$41.4500/Each			10/CS	\$414.50	1
	Henry Schein, Inc	PULMODYNE PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # REF 313-7555XN; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each	\$0.00				No Bid	
	Nashville Medical EMS Products, Inc	PULMODYNE PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # REF 313-7555XN; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each					No Bid	
	Medline Industries, Inc.	PULMODYNE PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # REF 313-7555XN; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each	\$45.80			10 EA / CS	\$458.00	2
69	O2 MAX BITrac ED Mask, w/Neb, MIED LG, w/3-SET Valve	PULMODYNE PRODUCT ONLY; ITEM # REF 313-7556XNEA; NO SUBSTITUTIONS	Each						

